

DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION	VENDOR #1	VENDOR #2	VENDOR #3	VENDOR #4
<p>BID NO. 2009-032-4138</p> <p>Annual Contract for the Purchase of Safety Flares and Mace</p> <p>OPENING DATE: September 22, 2008</p> <p>BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437</p> <p>Dallas County Taxpayer NCTRCA Certified</p>	<p>Dallas Public Safety Supply 2206 Elm St. Dallas, Texas 75201 Gene Churchill 214-618-8469 214-618-8466 dpss_admin1@grandecom.net</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GST Public Safety 12092 Forestgate Dr. Dallas, Texas 75243 Gwen Prater 214-751-8301 214-751-8306 gwen.prater@gstpublicsafety.com</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GT Distributors, Inc. P.O. Box 16080 Austin, Texas 78761 Russell Faulkner 1-800-252-8310 1-800-480-5845 txbids@gtdist.com</p> <p>No No</p>	<p>Lawmen's & Shooters Supply 7750 9Th Street SW Vero Beach, FL. 32968 Gail Walker-Keen 772-569-8700 772-569-2955 bids@lawmens.net</p> <p>No No</p>
<p>DESCRIPTION</p> <p>Section I Safety Flares</p> <p>1. Safety Flares: Specify Brand/Product No:</p> <p>Section II Defense Spray</p> <p>1. Defense Spray MK-3 Specify Brand/Product No:</p> <p>2. Defense Spray MK-4 Specify Brand/Product No:</p> <p>TOTAL</p>	<p>Quantity</p> <p>No Bid</p> <p>25200</p> <p>No Bid</p> <p>100</p> <p>\$ 6.84 \$ 684.00</p> <p>Sabre Defense Part # SIH2010-NY or SIH2010</p> <p>500</p> <p>\$ 7.90 \$ 3,950.00</p> <p>Sabre Defense Part # SIH2030-NY or SIH2030</p> <p>\$ 4,634.00</p>	<p>No Bid</p> <p>No Bid</p> <p>\$ 9.50 \$ 950.00</p> <p>ALSOC15 - Stream</p> <p>\$ 11.65 \$ 5,825.00</p> <p>ALSOC31 - Stream</p> <p>\$ 6,775.00</p>	<p>\$ 1.01 \$ 25,452.00</p> <p>Orion 10730</p> <p>\$ 8.70 \$ 870.00</p> <p>Defense Tech 5039</p> <p>\$ 9.78 \$ 4,890.00</p> <p>Defense Tech 5049</p> <p>\$ 31,212.00</p>	<p>\$ 1.63 \$ 41,076.00</p> <p>Orion 0730</p> <p>\$ 9.42 \$ 942.00</p> <p>ALSOC15 - Stream</p> <p>\$ 10.62 \$ 5,310.00</p> <p>ALSOC31 - Stream</p> <p>\$ 47,328.00</p>

DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION	VENDOR #1	VENDOR #2	VENDOR #3	VENDOR #4
<p>BID NO. 2009-032-4138</p> <p>Annual Contract for the Purchase of Safety Flares and Mace</p> <p>OPENING DATE: September 22, 2008</p> <p>BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437</p> <p>Dallas County Taxpayer NCTRCA Certified</p>	<p>Dallas Public Safety Supply 2206 Elm St. Dallas, Texas 75201 Gene Churchill 214-618-8469 214-618-8466 dpss_admin1@grandecom.net</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GST Public Safety 12092 Forestgate Dr. Dallas, Texas 75243 Gwen Prater 214-751-8301 214-751-8306 gwen.prater@gstpublicsafety.com</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GT Distributors, Inc. P.O. Box 16080 Austin , Texas 78761 Russell Faulkner 1-800-252-8310 1-800-480-5845 txbids@gtdist.com</p> <p>No No</p>	<p>Lawmen's & Shooters Supply 7750 9Th Street SW Vero Beach, FL. 32968 Gail Walker-Keen 772-569-8700 772-569-2955 bids@lawmens.net</p> <p>No No</p>
<p>DESCRIPTION</p> <p>Quantity</p>				

DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION	VENDOR #1	VENDOR #2	VENDOR #3	VENDOR #4
<p>BID NO. 2009-032-4138</p> <p>Annual Contract for the Purchase of Safety Flares and Mace</p> <p>OPENING DATE: September 22, 2008</p> <p>BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437</p> <p>Dallas County Taxpayer NCTRCA Certified</p>	<p>Dallas Public Safety Supply 2206 Elm St. Dallas, Texas 75201 Gene Churchill 214-618-8469 214-618-8466 dpss_admin1@grandecom.net</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GST Public Safety 12092 Forestgate Dr. Dallas, Texas 75243 Gwen Prater 214-751-8301 214-751-8306 gwen.prater@gstpublicsafety.com</p> <p>Yes No</p>	<p>GT Distributors, Inc. P.O. Box 16080 Austin, Texas 78761 Russell Faulkner 1-800-252-8310 1-800-480-5845 txbids@gtdist.com</p> <p>No No</p>	<p>Lawmen's & Shooters Supply 7750 9Th Street SW Vero Beach, FL. 32968 Gail Walker-Keen 772-569-8700 772-569-2955 bids@lawmens.net</p> <p>No No</p>
<p>DESCRIPTION</p> <p style="text-align: right;">Quantity</p>				