Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423
cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Justrite Safety Drum Funnel - Justrite #
08207 Ea 2
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

187.03
8207

$374.06

Yes
NO

Letter

No Bid

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

135.09 $270.18

8207

Yes

NO

OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

No Bid

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

No Bid

Mercury Spill Absorbent Powder - EPS Ea 2

Chemicals Merconsorb Powder - 2-1/4
# Size - EPS #20 MSORB500
Specify Brand Being Bid:

No Bid

No Bid

33.90 $67.80

20MSORB500

No Bid

No Bid

Ansul Spill X Chemical Spill

Treatment Kit Ea 1
Multi-agent Kit - Ansul #78744

Specify Brand Being Bid:

No Bid

No Bid

360.66 $360.66

78774

No Bid

No Bid

Ansul Spill - X - Chemical Spill
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77255
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

No Bid

No Bid

14.66 $14.66

77255

No Bid

No Bid

Ansul Spill - X - C Chemical Spill
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77261
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

No Bid

No Bid

24.84 $24.84

77261

No Bid

No Bid

Ansul Spill - X - S Chemical Spill
Treatment

Agent - Ansul #77265

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

No Bid

No Bid

46.26 $46.26

77265

No Bid

No Bid

Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Ea 20
duoflex temples - red, white & blue

frames

gray UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

4.92

S1179

$98.40

No Bid

491 $98.20

S1179

4.96 $99.20

Uvex S1179

64.52 $1,290.40

SPRS1179

Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Ea 20
duoflex temples - red, white & blue

frames

amber UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

4.83

S1159

$96.60

No Bid

491 $98.20

S1159

4.96 $99.20

Uvex S1159

60.14 $1,202.80

SPRS1159




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116
safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A
West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922
Cyndi Dubrwealskie

cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter OTHER Daily Commercial Record Letter
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
9
Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Pkg/10 10 1.89 $189.00|No Bid 19.11 $191.10 19.33 $193.30 23.43 $234.30
replacement gray UD lens per each pk of 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: S536 S536 Uvex S536 SPRS536
10
Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectales  Pkg/10 10 1.89 $189.00|No Bid 19.11 $191.10 19.33 $193.30 23.43 $234.30
replacement amber UD lens per each pk of 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: S537 S537 Uvex S537 SPRS537
11 |Uvex safety cord - uvex #5497 Ea 25 1.29 $32.25|No Bid 1.30 $32.50|No Bid No Bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: S501 S501
12
Baush & Lomb Permanent Plastic Lens Ea 2 No Bid No Bid 20.82 $41.64|No Bid No Bid
Cleaning Station - B&L #8653
Specify Brand Being Bid: Uvex S461
13
Baush & Lomb Lens Cleaning Tissues Pkg/280 60 No Bid No Bid 1.42 $85.20|No Bid 4144 $24,864.00
B&L #8566
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8566 BAUS8566
14 |Baush & Lomb Sight Savers Liquid Cs/10 4 No Bid No bid 28.82 $115.28| No Bid 31.65 $126.60
Cleaner - B & L #68 - 16 oz Spray
Bottle - Silicone
Specify Brand Being Bid: 68 BAU68
15
Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash ~ Ea 10 5.41 $54.10|No Bid 5.50 $55.00 5.54 $55.40 6.70 $67.00
Goggles - Uvex #S345C
Specify Brand Being Bid: S345C S345C Uvex S345C SPR345C
16
Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash Ea 20 3.40 $68.00|No Bid 3.45 $69.00 3.49 $69.80 421 $84.20
Goggles - Replacement Lens - Uvex
#S780C
Specify Brand Being Bid: S780C S780C Uvex S780C SPRS780C
17
U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield Ea 5 No Bid No Bid 18.04 $90.20|No Bid No Bid
U. S. Safety #483000
Specify Brand Being Bid: 483000




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield Ea
Replacement Window - U.S. Safety
#494400

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

No Bid

Yes
NO

Letter

No Bid

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

3.48 $34.80

494400

Yes

NO

OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

No Bid

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

No Bid

Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove

size medium - Safeskin #55082
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/100

20

9.91

55082

$198.20

No Bid

9.47 $189.40

55082

10.05 $201.00

KC 55082

No Bid

20

Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove

size large - Safeskin #55083

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/100

100

9.91

55083

$991.00

No Bid

9.47 $947.00

55083

10.05 $1,005.00

KC 55082

No Bid

21

Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove

size X-large - Safeskin #55084
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/90

200

9.91

55084

$1,982.00

No Bid

9.47 $1,894.00

55084

10.05 $2,010.00

KC 55084

No Bid

22

Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, size 10 - Pr/12
Ansell #37 145 10
Specify Brand Being Bid:

20

No Bid

No Bid

10.85 $217.00

50-G26G/L

No Bid

12.99 $259.80

BES717-10

23

Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, Size 11
Ansell #37 145 11
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pr/12

20

No Bid

No Bid

10.85 $217.00

50-G266G/XL

No Bid

12.99 $259.80

BES717-11

24

Ansell Neox Gloves - size 10
Ansell #9 924
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pr/12

No Bid

No Bid

70.99 $141.98

6784R-10

No Bid

No Bid

25

Ansell Petroflex Gloves - size large Pr/12
Ansell # 12 254

Specify Brand Being Bid:

20

No Bid

No Bid

15.36 $307.20

58-8040R

No Bid

19.18 $383.60

GLB714R

26

Ansell PVA Gloves - size large
Ansell # 155529
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pr/12

No Bid

No Bid

218.72 $437.44

15-5529-9

No Bid

No Bid




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter OTHER Daily Commercial Record Letter
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
27 |North Silver Shield/4H Gloves
Laminate Pkg/10 1 30.84 $30.84|No Bid 37.98 $37.98 35.13 $35.13 216.59 $216.59
Gloves - size 10 - North #SSG 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: SSG10 SSG-10 North SSG NORSSG-10
28 |North Silver Shield/4H Gloves
Laminate Pkg/10 1 30.84 $30.84|No Bid 37.98 $37.98 35.13 $35.13 216.59 $216.59
Gloves - size 11/12 -
North #SSG 11
Specify Brand Being Bid: SSG11 SSG-11 North SSG NORSSG-11
29 |North Viton Gloves - Size 10 Ea 5 72.88 $364.40|No Bid 51.31 $256.55 76.24 $381.20 94.00 $470.00
North #F124 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: F124 892-10 North F124 NORF124-10
30 |North Viton Gloves - Size 11 Ea 5 72.88 $364.40|No Bid 51.31 $256.55 76.24 $381.20 94.00 $470.00
North #F124 11
Specify Brand Being Bid: F124 892-11 North F124 NORF124-11
31 |DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with Cs/25 10 58.84 $588.40|No Bid 53.25 $532.50 72.59 $725.90 66.18 $661.80
elastic wrists and ankles - size - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TG417-1g 3402-L DuPont NG1255 LAKCTL417-L
32 |DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with Cs/25 50 58.54 $2,927.00|No Bid 53.25 $2,662.50 72.59 $3,629.50 66.18 $3,309.00
elastic wrists and ankles - size - X-
large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Landlake TG417-xlg 3402-XL DuPont NG1255 LAKCTL417-XL
33 |DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with Cs/25 25 58.54 $1,463.50|No Bid 53.25 $1,331.25 72.59 $1,814.75 66.18 $1,654.50
elastic wrists and ankles - size - XX-
large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TG417-xxlg 3402-2X DuPont NG1255 LAKCTL417-2X
34 |DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with Cs/25 10 61.48 $614.80|No Bid 53.25 $532.50 76.93 $769.30 69.48 $694.80
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X -
large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TG417-xxxlg 3402-3X DuPont NG1255 LAKCTL417-3X
35 |DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with Cs/25 5 65.17 $325.85|No Bid 53.25 $266.25 83.1 $415.50 73.65 $368.25




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A
West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922
Cyndi Dubrwealskie

cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 4X -

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

Lakeland TG417-xxxxlg

Yes
NO

Letter

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

3402-4X

Yes
NO
OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

DuPont NG1255

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

LAKCTL417-4X

36

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

155.86

Lakeland 5428-1g

$779.30

No Bid

72.56 $362.80

QC127SXLLG001200

74.82

DuPont QC1225

$374.10

54.49 $272.45

LAK05428-L

37

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

155.86

Lakeland 5428-xlg

$779.30

No Bid

72.56 $362.80

QC127SXLXL001200

74.82

DuPont QC1225

$374.10

54.49 $272.45

LAK05428-XL

38

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

163.66

Lakeland 05428-xxlg

$818.30

No Bid

76.9 $384.50

QC127SXL2X001200

79.31

DuPont QC1225

$396.55

56.23 $281.15

LAK05428-2X

39

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

173.48

Lakeland 05428-xxxlg

$867.40

No Bid

81.34 $406.70

QC127SXL3X001200

84.07

DuPont QC1225

$420.35

59.66 $298.30

LAK05428-3X

40

DuPont Saranex - 23P - Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and

ankles - size - large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

152.94

Lakeland 44417-1g

$764.70

No Bid

139.7 $698.50

SL125BWHLG001200

129.48

DuPont SL235B

$647.40

$134.60 $673.00

LAKC44417-L

41

DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and

ankles - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

152.94

Lakeland 44417-xlg

$764.70

No Bid

139.7 $698.50

SL125BWHXL001200

129.48

DuPont SL125B

$647.40

$134.60 $673.00

LAKC44417-XL

42

DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek

Cs/12

160.59

$802.95

No Bid

148.09 $740.45

137.24

$686.20

141.33 $706.65




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423
cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter OTHER Daily Commercial Record Letter
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and
ankles - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland 44417-xxlg SL125BWH2X001200 DuPont SL125B LAKC44417-2X
43
DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek ~ Cs/12 5 170.22 $851.10|No Bid 156.98 $784.90 145.48 $727.40 149.82 $749.10
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and
ankles - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland 44417-xxxlg SL125BWH3X001200 DuPont SL125B LAKC44417-3X
44 [DuPont Proshield 3 Shoe Covers Cs/200 20 68.00 $1,360.00 |No Bid 74.56 $1,491.20 101.61 $2,032.20|No Bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland CTL901 CTL901L/XL DuPont NG4518
45
DuPont NexGen Protective Aprons Cs/100 25 70.49 $1,762.25|No Bid 77.29 $1,932.25 73.71 $1,842.75|No Bid
44" length
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TG603 TG603 DuPont NG273B
46
DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) Ea 1 603.68 $603.68|No Bid 668.66 $668.66 695.53 $695.53 920.43 $920.43
Suit - Size X-Large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TK650 RS562TBDXL000100 DuPont TK554T LAKTK64-XL
47
DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) Ea 1 633.87 $633.87|No Bid 700.77 $700.77 737.28 $737.28 966.46 $966.46
Suit - Size 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland TK650 RS562TDB2X000100 DuPont TK554T LAKTK640-2X
48
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with  Cs/12 1 118.03 $118.03|No Bid 147.91 $147.91 99.63 $99.63 72.86 $72.86
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist CASE OF 25
and bound seans - Size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C5428-xlg C55428-XL DuPont QC127B LAK055428-L




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A
West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922
Cyndi Dubrwealskie

cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter OTHER Daily Commercial Record Letter
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
49
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with ~ Cs/12 123.93 $123.93|No Bid 155.3 $155.30 105.61 $105.61 76.46 $76.46
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist CASE OF 25
and bound seans - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C5428-xxlg (C55428-2X DuPont QC127B LAK055428-2X
50
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with ~ Cs/12 131.38 $131.38|No Bid 164.62 $164.62 111.94 $111.94 81.09 $81.09
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist CASE OF 25
and bound seans - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C5428-xxxlg (C55428-3X DuPont QC127B LAK055428-3X
51
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 107.78 $107.78|No Bid 135.04 $135.04 130.92 $130.92 138.58 $138.58
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist
and bound seans - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C44428-x1 C4428-XL DuPont SL127B LAK044428-XL
52
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 113.17 $113.17|No Bid 141.8 $141.80 138.79 $138.79 145.5 $145.50
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist
and bound seans - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C44428-xxlg C4428-2X DuPont SL127B LAK044428-2X
53
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 119.96 $119.96|No Bid 150.31 $150.31 147.11 $147.11 154.23 $154.23
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist
bound seams - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lakeland C44428-xxxlg (C44428-3X DuPont SL127B LAK044428-3X




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply

2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

54

55

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and
wrist

and attached sock boots - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and

wrist

and attached sock boots - size - 2X-

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

162.23

Lakeland C3T150-xlg

170.34

Lakeland C3T150-xxlg

$162.23

$170.34

Yes
NO

Letter

No Bid

No Bid

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

203.29 $203.29

C3T150-XL

213.46 $213.46

C3T150-2X

Yes

NO

OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

234.49 $234.49

DuPont C3122T

248.56 $248.56

DuPont C3122T

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

269.83

LAKC3T160-XL

283.31

LAKC3T160-2X

$269.83

$283.31

56

DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and

wrist

and attached sock boots - size - 3X-

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

178.87

Lakeland C3T150-xxxlg

$178.87

No Bid

224.13 $224.13

C3T150-3X

263.48 $263.48

DuPont C3122T

297.47

LAKC3T160-3X

$297.47

57

DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with  Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and

wrist

and strapped seams - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

183.58

Lakeland 41130-xlg

$183.58

No Bid

230.04 $230.04

40130-XL

81.28 $81.28

case of 2

DuPont CU127T

226.33

LAK40130-XL

$226.33

58

DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with ~ Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and

wrist

and strapped seams - size - 2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

192.76

Lakeland 41130-2xlg

$192.76

No Bid

241.54 $241.54

40130-2X

86.16 $86.16

case of 2

DuPont CU127T

237.65

LAK40130-2X

$237.65

59

DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with  Cs/6
attached hood, elasticized ankles and

wrist

and strapped seams - size - 3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

202.40

Lakeland 41130-3xlg

$202.40

No Bid

253.61 $253.61

40130-3X

91.33 $91.33

case of 2

DuPont LVI27T

249.54

LAK40130-3X

$249.54




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

60

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Bata Hazmax Boots - 16: Knee boots
sizes 6-15 - Bata 870120600 -
870121500

Specify Brand Being Bid:

ca

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

59.02

87012

$295.10

Yes
NO

Letter

No Bid

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

67.43 $337.15

87012526-15

Yes

NO

OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

59.17 $295.85

DuPont 87012

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

No Bid

61

DSC Haz Mat Booteis - size X-large -
DSC #LB1250YD
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ca

50

No Bid

No Bid

3.57 $178.50

97591XL

No Bid

No Bid

62

DSC Haz Mat Booties - size 2X-large -
DSC #LB1250Y E
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ca

25

No Bid

No Bid

3.57 $89.25

975912X

No Bid

No Bid

63

MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea

silicone - size small - MSA #480263
Specify Brand Being Bid:

201.93

480263

$201.93

$214.00 $214.00

MSA # 480263

209.38 $209.38

480263

No Bid

257.36 $257.36

MSA480263

64

MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea

silicone - size medium - MSA #480259
Specify Brand Being Bid:

201.93

480259

$201.93

$214.00 $214.00

MSA # 480259

209.38 $209.38

480259

No Bid

257.36 $257.36

MSA480259

65

MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea

silicone - size large - MSA #480267
Specify Brand Being Bid:

201.93

480267

$403.86

$214.00 $428.00

MSA # 480267

209.8 $419.60

480267

No bid

257.36 $514.72

MSA480267

66

MSA Comfo Cartridges Cs/6
MSA #815182

Specify Brand Being Bid:

25

54.26

815182

$1,356.50

$57.00 $1,425.00

MSA # 815182

56.25 $1,406.25

815182

No Bid

69.15 $1,728.75

MSA815182

67

Msa Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815178 Cs/6
Specify Brand Being Bid:

48.88
815178

$97.76

$53.00
MSA# 815178

$106.00

51.69 $103.38

815178

No Bid

63.55
MSA815178

$127.10




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118
Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

68

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA

#815181
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/6

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

52.51
815181

$105.02

Yes
NO

Letter

$56.00
MSA#815181

$112.00

Yes
NO
OTHER
OTHER

54.45 $108.90

815181

Yes

NO

OTHER

Daily Commercial Record

No Bid

Yes

NO
DALLAS
Letter

66.94
MSA815181

$133.88

69

MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA
#815180
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/6

48.88
815180

$97.76

$53.00
MSA#815180

$106.00

51.69 $103.38

815180

No Bid

63.55
MSA815180

$127.10

70

MSA Confidence Plus Germicidal Ea
Cleaner - 32 oz. size - MSA

#10009971

Specify Brand Being Bid:

24

21.31

10009971

$511.44

$25.00 $600.00

MSA #10009971

22.54 $540.96

10009971

No Bid

27.71 $665.04

MSA10009971

71

EM Science - colorpHast - pH indicator Pkg/100
strips - pH range 0-14
Specify Brand Being Bid:

150

No Bid

No Bid

12.00 $1,800.00

9590-3EMD

No Bid

No Bid

72

Polyethylene Siphon Pump - 2 inch

NPT Ea
thread for 55 gal. Drums

Specify Brand Being Bid:

20

8.32

440

$166.40

No Bid

10.45 $209.00

4005

No Bid

No Bid

73

17 inch x 19 inch Universal Sorbent
Pads
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/100

50

30.14
GPB100H

$1,507.00

No Bid

28.43 $1,421.50

DB-72

No Bid

No Bid

74

Barrel Top Universal Sorbent Pad
22 inch diameter with 2 inch opening
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/25

33.09

GTOP

$132.36

No Bid

32.67 $130.68

No Bid

No Bid

75

Disposable Uncorded Earplugs
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/200

15.70
280205

$47.10

No Bid

12.89 $38.67

280003

14.02
North 280005

$42.06

No Bid

76

Cotton String Knit Glove - standard

weight Pr/12

with heat-sealed seam - men's size
Specify Brand Being Bid:

150

2.03

7065

$304.50

No Bid

1.85 $277.50

35-C104/L

No Bid

No Bid




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR # 5

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Aramsco, Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086
Richard Salerno
856-686-7723

Fax- 856-686-4423

cmassey(@aramsco.com

Casco Industries Inc

1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118

Grand Prairie, Tax. 75050
Amy Neeb

972-522-0800

Fax -972-522-0847

amy(@cascoindustries.com

Fischer Scientific Company, LLC
2000 Park Lane

Pittsburg, PA. 15275

Lynn Sabo

412-490-8300

Fax - 412-490-1116

safety.quotes@thermofisher.com

Global Protection

444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A

West Berlin, NJ 08091
1-800-957-8955

Fax- 1-856-768-2922

Cyndi Dubrwealskie
cyndi@globalprotectionusa.com

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Pam Smithson
214-357-3807

Fax 214-382-3401

psmithson@lonestarsafety.com

EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter OTHER Daily Commercial Record Letter
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
77
Potassium lodide Starch Test Paper Pkg/100 50 No Bid No Bid 14.89 $744.50|No Bid No Bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 260
78 |MSA Cover Lens for Ultravue Face
piece - MSA# 456975 Pkg/25 50 37.39 $1,869.50|No Bid 38.58 $1,929.00|No Bid 47.66 $2,383.00
Specify Brand Being Bid: 456975 456975
MSA456975
79
Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # J53122 Sizes Small-XXXL
Size: S-XL 5 29.59 $147.95|No Bid 31.31 $156.55 31.32 $156.60 36.25 $181.25
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 30.6 $153.00 32.69 $163.45 3243 $162.15 37.53 $187.65
Specify Brand Being Bid: J53122 J53122 J53122 TNG-153122
80
Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # 053122 Sizes Small-XXXL
Size: S-XL 5 13.66 $68.30|No Bid 14.58 $72.90 14.46 $72.30 16.73 $83.65
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 14.67 $73.35 15.66 $78.30 15.57 $77.85 18.02 $90.10
Specify Brand Being Bid: 053122 053122 53122 TNG-053122
TOTAL: $31,315.38 $3,205.00 $34,372.96 $24,241.18 $51,851.13
$9,035.72 $14,907.48 $2,708.40 $1,354.76




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419

Annual Contract for the Purchase of

Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

govbids@fastenal.com

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

txsales@gtdist.com

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418
emazurski@bordercorp.com

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

Justrite Safety Drum Funnel - Justrite #

08207
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Ea 2

Yes
NO
Dallas

180.51
11102-02380

$361.02

Yes
NO
NO
email from DC

No Bid

Yes
No
Dallas
Other

170.65 $341.30

08207

Yes

No
Other
Website

263.75
08207

$527.50

Mercury Spill Absorbent Powder - EPS Ea 2

Chemicals Merconsorb Powder - 2-1/4

# Size - EPS #20 MSORB500
Specify Brand Being Bid:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

83.94

$167.88

Ansul Spill X Chemical Spill
Treatment Kit

Multi-agent Kit - Ansul #78744
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Ea 1

798.9625

78774

$798.96

No Bid

No Bid

636.44

78774

$636.44

Ansul Spill - X - Chemical Spill
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77255
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

27.8979

77255

$27.90

No Bid

No Bid

133.75

77255

$133.75

Ansul Spill - X - C Chemical Spill
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77261
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

47.2937
77261

$47.29

No Bid

No Bid

226.06
77261

$226.06

Ansul Spill - X - S Chemical Spill
Treatment

Agent - Ansul #77265

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Csof6 1

54.6875

77265

$54.69

No Bid

No Bid

401.06

77265

$401.06

Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Ea 20

duoflex temples - red, white & blue
frames

gray UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

6.6071

0201055

$132.14

6.46 $129.20

Uvex- S1179

493 $98.60

S1179

5.44

S1179

$108.80

Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Ea 20

duoflex temples - red, white & blue
frames

amber UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

No Bid

6.46 $129.20

Uvex- S1159

493 $98.60

S1159

5.44

S1159

$108.80




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.
P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks

972-647-0836
Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
9
Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles Pkg/10 10 2.6979 $26.98 23.75 $237.50 1.92 $19.20 2.13 $21.30
replacement gray UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: 0201075 Uvex-S539 S536 S536
10
Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectales  Pkg/10 10 2.6979 $26.98 23.75 $237.50 1.92 $19.20 2.13 $21.30
replacement amber UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1003580 Uvex-S537 S537 S537
11 |Uvex safety cord - uvex #5497 Ea 25 1.7556 $43.89|No Bid 1.30 $32.50|No Bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 0203418 S505D
12
Baush & Lomb Permanent Plastic Lens Ea 2 151.42 $302.84|No Bid 65.06 $130.12|No Bid
Cleaning Station - B&L #8653 sold by case of 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8653 143060
13
Baush & Lomb Lens Cleaning Tissues Pkg/280 60 322 $193.20|No Bid 1.28 $76.80|No Bid
B&L #8566
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8566 8566
14 |Baush & Lomb Sight Savers Liquid Cs/10 4 5.096 $203.84|No Bid 2.65 $106.00|No Bid
Cleaner - B & L #68 - 16 oz Spray
Bottle - Silicone per each case of 10 per each/case of 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: 68 68
15
Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash ~ Ea 10 7.389 $73.89 6.99 $69.90 5.50 $55.00 60.9 $609.00
Goggles - Uvex #S345C
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1011543 Uvex-S345C S345C S345C
16
Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash Ea 20 5.0925 $101.85 5.14 $102.80 3.47 $69.40 3.83 $76.60
Goggles - Replacement Lens - Uvex
#S780C
Specify Brand Being Bid: S780C Uvex-S780C S780C S780C
17
U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield Ea 5 38.6922 $193.46|No Bid 15.98 $79.90 52.13 $260.65
U. S. Safety #483000
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1022592 483000 89011-774




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
18
U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield Ea 10 7.9707 $79.71|No Bid 3.12 $31.20 10.21 $102.10
Replacement Window - U.S. Safety
#494400
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1022594 494400 89011-773
19 |Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/100 20 18.38 $367.60|No Bid 11.75 $235.00 102.83 $2,056.60
size medium - Safeskin #55082
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55082 55082 55082
20 |Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/100 100 18.38 $1,838.00|No Bid 11.75 $1,175.00 102.83 $10,283.00
size large - Safeskin #55083
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55083 55083 55083
21 |Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/90 200 18.38 $3,676.00|No Bid 11.75 $2,350.00 102.83 $20,566.00
size X-large - Safeskin #55084
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55084 55084 55084
22
Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, size 10 - Pr/12 20 1.5321 $367.70|No Bid 0.92 $220.80 15.00 $300.00
Ansell #37 145 10 per each case of 12 per each case of 12 $11.04
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1000707 A-10#10 37145-10
23
Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, Size 11 Pr/12 20 1.5321 $367.70|No Bid 0.92 $220.80 15.00 $300.00
Ansell #37 145 11 per each case of 12 $18.39 per each case of 12 $11.04
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1000708 A-10#11 37145-11
24 |Ansell Neox Gloves - size 10 Pr/12 2 8.0753 $193.81|No Bid 4.67 $112.08 93.72 $187.44
Ansell #9 924 per each case of 12 $96.90 per each case of 12 $56.04
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1005968 6924 9924
25
Ansell Petroflex Gloves - size large Pr/12 20 2.4897 $597.53|No Bid 2.04 $489.60 33 $660.00
Ansell # 12 254 per each case of 12 $29.88 per each case of 12 $24.48
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1000639 688 12254
26 |Ansell PVA Gloves - size large Pr/12 2 26.4775 $635.46|No Bid 20.37 $488.88 272.28 $544.56
Ansell # 155529 per each case of 12 $317.73 per each case of 12 $244.44
Specify Brand Being Bid: 15-552-9 15552-9 15552-9




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

govbids@fastenal.com

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

txsales@gtdist.com

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418
emazurski@bordercorp.com

27

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

North Silver Shield/4H Gloves
Laminate

Gloves - size 10 - North #SSG 10
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Pkg/10

Yes
NO
Dallas

48.9936

1024621

$48.99

Yes
NO
NO
email from DC

No Bid

Yes
No
Dallas
Other

181.11 $181.11

SSG-10

Yes

No
Other
Website

No Bid

28

North Silver Shield/4H Gloves
Laminate

Gloves - size 11/12 -

North #SSG 11

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/10

48.9936

1024622

$48.99

No Bid

181.11 $181.11

SSG-11

No Bid

29

North Viton Gloves - Size 10
North #F124 10
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Ea

104.2908

1025471

$521.45

No Bid

78.60 $393.00

F124-10

99.74 $498.70

F124-10

30

North Viton Gloves - Size 11
North #F124 11
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Ea

104.2908

1025472

$521.45

No Bid

78.60 $393.00

F124-11

99.74 $498.70

F124-11

31

DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with

elastic wrists and ankles - size - large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/25

105.2625

1002434

$1,052.63

No Bid

62.41 $624.10

CTL417-L

96.88 $968.80

32

DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with
elastic wrists and ankles - size - X-

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/25

50

105.2625

1002435

$5,263.13

No Bid

62.41 $3,120.50

CLT417-XL

96.88 $4,844.00

33

DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with
elastic wrists and ankles - size - XX-

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/25

25

105.2625

1002436

$2,631.56

No Bid

62.41 $1,560.25

CLT417-2XL

96.88 $2,422.00

34

DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X -

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/25

111.5625

1002437

$1,115.63

No Bid

65.53 $655.30

CLT417-3XL

103.13 $1,031.30

35

DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls
with

Cs/25

120.5075

$602.54

No Bid

69.47 $347.35

112.50 $562.50




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012
Buyer: Debra Morris

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

govbids@fastenal.com

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

txsales@gtdist.com

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418
emazurski@bordercorp.com

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

elastic wrists and ankles - size - 4X -

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Yes
NO
Dallas

1002438

Yes
NO
NO
email from DC

Yes
No
Dallas
Other

CLT417-4XL

Yes

No
Other
Website

36

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -

large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

66.6672

202730

$333.34

No Bid

83.52 $417.60

05428-L

88.8

$444.00

37

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

66.6672

202731

$333.34

No Bid

83.52 $417.60

05428-XL

97.71

$488.55

38

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

70.6668

202732

$353.33

No Bid

87.69 $438.45

05428-2XL

108.00

$540.00

39

DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with
attached

hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size -
3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

74.904

202733

$374.52

No Bid

92.96 $464.80

05428-3XL

114.86

$574.30

40

DuPont Saranex - 23P - Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and

ankles - size - large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

187.7568

1016617

$938.78

No Bid

161.26 $806.30

44417-L

No Bid

41

DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and

ankles - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/12

187.7568

1016618

$938.78

No Bid

161.26 $806.30

44417-XL

No Bid

42

DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek ~ Cs/12

199.0188

$995.09

No Bid

169.32 $846.60

No Bid




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and
ankles - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016616 44417-2XL
43
DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek ~ Cs/12 200.898 $1,004.49 |No Bid 179.48 $897.40|No Bid
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists
and
ankles - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1093745 44417-3XL
44 [DuPont Proshield 3 Shoe Covers Cs/200 97.00 $1,940.00 |No Bid 24.78 $495.60 150.00 $3,000.00
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1049111 SC40L
45
DuPont NexGen Protective Aprons Cs/100 26.7225 $668.06|No Bid 57.10 $1,427.50 97.50 $2,437.50
quoted as each not
44" length per case
Specify Brand Being Bid: vendor withdrew bid CTL603
46
DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) Ea No Bid No Bid 754.80 $754.80 792.50
Suit - Size X-Large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TK640XL- front entry
47
DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) Ea No Bid No Bid 792.55 $792.55 792.50
Suit - Size 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 40130-2XL
48
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with  Cs/12 8.1072 $97.29|No Bid 124.45 $124.45 101.49
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and bound seans - Size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 0202605 C55428-XL




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100

Austin, TX 78758
Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298
Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
49
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with ~ Cs/12 8.592 $103.10|No Bid 130.67 $130.67 94.50 $94.50
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and bound seans - size - 2X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 0202606 C55428-2XL
50
DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with ~ Cs/12 9.1089 $109.31|No Bid 136.18 $136.18 114.86 $114.86
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and bound seans - size - 3X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 0202607 C55428-3XL
51
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 17.4389 $209.27|No Bid 110.78 $110.78 196.28 $196.28
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and bound seans - size - X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016611 C44428-XL
52
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 18.4848 $221.82|No Bid 116.32 $116.32 182.29 $182.29
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and bound seans - size - 2X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016607 C44428-2XL
53
DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with  Cs/12 18.6596 $223.92|No Bid 123.30 $123.30 193.50 $193.50
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
bound seams - size - 3X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1093741 C44428-3XL




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100

Austin, TX 78758
Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298
Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties

3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040
Erik Mazurski
877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEOLI form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
54
DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6 56.6723 $340.03 |No Bid 230.75 $230.75|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and attached sock boots - size - X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016589 C3T160-XL
55
DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6 60.0719 $360.43 |No Bid 242.28 $242.28|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and attached sock boots - size - 2X-
large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016586 C3T160-2XL
56
DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with  Cs/6 63.6783 $382.07|No Bid 254.39 $254.39|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and attached sock boots - size - 3X-
large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1016587 C3T160-3XL
57
DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with  Cs/6 73.1651 $438.99|No Bid 193.55 $193.55|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and strapped seams - size - X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1093637 40130-XL
58
DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with ~ Cs/6 77.5538 $465.32|No Bid 203.23 $203.23|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and strapped seams - size - 2X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1093634 40130-2XL
59
DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with  Cs/6 82.2186 $493.31|No Bid 213.40 $213.40|No Bid
attached hood, elasticized ankles and quoted as each not
wrist per case
and strapped seams - size - 3X-large vendor withdrew bid
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1093635 40130-3XL




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011
Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.
P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks

972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
60
Bata Hazmax Boots - 16: Knee boots  ea 5 93.18 $465.90|No Bid No Bid 117.50 $587.50
sizes 6-15 - Bata 870120600 -
870121500
Specify Brand Being Bid: 870120600-870121500
61
DSC Haz Mat Booteis - size X-large - ea 50 6.2525 $312.63|No Bid 430 $215.00 4.68 $234.00
DSC #LB1250YD
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1003377 LB1250Y-XL
62
DSC Haz Mat Booties - size 2X-large - ea 25 No Bid No Bid 4.30 $107.50 4.68 $117.00
DSC #LB1250Y E
Specify Brand Being Bid: LB1250Y-2XL
63
MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea 1 300.86 $300.86|No Bid 221.10 $221.10 261.79 $261.79
silicone - size small - MSA #480263
Specify Brand Being Bid: 480263 480263 480263
64
MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea 1 287.0817 $287.08|No Bid 221.10 $221.10 248.7 $248.70
silicone - size medium - MSA #480259
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1023518 480259 480259
65
MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black  ea 2 287.0817 $574.16|No Bid 221.20 $442.40 261.79 $523.58
silicone - size large - MSA #480267
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1023519 480267 480267
66 |MSA Comfo Cartridges Cs/6 25 75.5566 $1,888.92No Bid 59.40 $1,485.00 66.83 $1,670.75
MSA#815182
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1003189 815182 815182
67
Msa Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815178 Cs/6 2 70.8812 $141.76|No Bid 54.59 $109.18 61.4 $122.80
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1023574 815178 815178




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Buyer: Debra Morris

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

govbids@fastenal.com

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

txsales@gtdist.com

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski

877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418
emazurski@bordercorp.com

68

EEO1 form

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA

#815181
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/6

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
NO
Dallas

75.56
815181

$151.12

Yes
NO
NO
email from DC

No Bid

Yes
No
Dallas
Other

57.50 $115.00

815181

Yes

No
Other
Website

64.68
815181

69

MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA
#815180
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cs/6

70.8812
1003208

$141.76

No Bid

54.59 $109.18

815180

61.4
815180

70

MSA Confidence Plus Germicidal Ea
Cleaner - 32 oz. size - MSA

#10009971

Specify Brand Being Bid:

24

30.9066

1002601

$741.76

No Bid

23.80 $571.20

10009971

26.78

10009971

71

EM Science - colorpHast - pH indicator Pkg/100
strips - pH range 0-14
Specify Brand Being Bid:

150

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

24.46

72

Polyethylene Siphon Pump - 2 inch

NPT Ea
thread for 55 gal. Drums

Specify Brand Being Bid:

20

14.4704

426000

$289.41

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

73

17 inch x 19 inch Universal Sorbent
Pads
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/100

50

58.97
500111-131632

$2,948.50

No Bid

No Bid

92.5

74

Barrel Top Universal Sorbent Pad
22 inch diameter with 2 inch opening
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

104.63

75

Disposable Uncorded Earplugs
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/200

16.42
1017247

$49.26

No Bid

15.34 $46.02

LaserLite

No Bid

76

Cotton String Knit Glove - standard

weight Pr/12

with heat-sealed seam - men's size
Specify Brand Being Bid:

150

3.19

0202903

$478.50

No Bid

2.47 $370.50

84L

No Bid

$3,669.00

$4,625.00




Dallas County Bid Tabulation

VENDOR # 6

VENDOR # 7

VENDOR # 8

VENDOR # 9

Bid #2011-033-5419
Annual Contract for the Purchase of
Personal Protective Equipment

Opening Date: February 7, 2011

Contract Period: March 2, 2011 through March 1, 2012

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winina, MN 55987
Cory Jonsa
507-313-7206

Fax 507-494-3422

G T Distributors, Inc.

2545 Brockton Dr., Suite 100
Austin, TX 78758

Preston Wheeless
512-451-8298

Fax 512-453-6149

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

P.O. Box 535219

Grand Prairie, TX 75053
Michele Hughbanks
972-647-0836

Fax 972-641-6844

Border Construction Specialties
3880 E. Broadway Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85040

Erik Mazurski
877-386-4651

Fax 602-437-2418

Buyer: Debra Morris govbids@fastenal.com txsales@gtdist.com mhughbank@saf-t-glove.com emazurski@bordercorp.com
EEO1 form Yes Yes Yes Yes
M/WBE STATUS NO NO No No
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas NO Dallas Other
BID NOTIFICATION email from DC Other Website
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
77
Potassium lodide Starch Test Paper Pkg/100 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.36 $418.00
Specify Brand Being Bid:
78 |MSA Cover Lens for Ultravue Face
piece - MSA# 456975 Pkg/25 50 48.858 $2,442.90|No Bid 40.94 $2,047.00 46.04 $2,302.00
Specify Brand Being Bid: 1003192 456975 456975
79
Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # J53122 Sizes Small-XXXL No Bid No Bid
Size: S-XL 5 30.09 $150.45 48.05 $240.25
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 30.09 $150.45 49.68 $248.40
Specify Brand Being Bid: J53122 153122
80
Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # 053122 Sizes Small-XXXL No Bid No Bid
Size: S-XL 5 14.44 $72.20 22.17 $110.85
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 14.44 $72.20 23.8 $119.00
Specify Brand Being Bid: 053122 053122
TOTAL: $45,057.93 $906.10 $31,055.98 $75,889.13
$2,401.28 $418.00




