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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

7

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

No

No Response

No
No

No Response

No

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Certifed By Other Agency
EEO1 Form Completed

No

No

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

No

No

No

Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

Letter DC and Website

DC Website

No Response

Email

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications

Color: White

To be furnished in the following sizes:

88.00
88.00
330.00
5,500.00
11,682.00
11,682.00
11,660.00

11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $

13.57 $108.56
13.57 $108.56
13.57 $407.10

dz.

a. Size: 28

dz.

b. Size: 30
c. Size: 32
d. Size:34

dz.

30
500

13.57 $6,785.00

dz.

14.75 $15,664.50
14.75 $15,664.50
14.75 $15,635.00
14.75 $15,635.00
14.75 $7,375.00
14.75 $7,375.00
14.75 $4,425.00
14.75 $1,475.00
1593 $1,593.00
15.93 $796.50
15.93 $796.50
15.93 $796.50
18.40 $18.40

dz.

1,062
1,062

e. Size: 36
f. Size: 38

dz.

1,060 dz.

g. Size: 40

11,660.00

1,060 dz.

h. Size: 42
1. Size: 44
j. Size: 46

5,500.00
5,500.00
3,300.00
1,100.00
1,100.00

dz.

500
500
300

dz.

dz.

k. Size: 48
1. Size: 50

dz.

100
100
50
50
50

dz.

m. Size: 52
n. Size: 54
0. Size: 56
p. Size: 58

550.00

dz.

550.00

dz.

550.00

dz.

11.00

Acme # BX345

FMC

dz.

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

q. Size: 60
Total

$70.851.00

$94,659.12

$0.00

$0.00

No Bid This Item

2. Men’s Briefs, as per bid specifications

Color: White

Brand: Hanes, BVD, Fruit of the Loom or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

120.00

12.00 $

9.15 $91.50
9.15 $91.50

99.00
99.00

297.00

990 $

dz.

10
10
30
60
40

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

120.00

12.00 $

990 $

dz.

360.00

12.00 $

9.15 $274.50

9.15 $549.00
10.03 $401.20
10.03 $10.03

990 $

dz.

720.00

12.00 $

594.00

990 $
1090 $

dz.

480.00

12.00 $

436.00

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

12.00
12.00

12.00 $

12.90
13.90

1290 §$

dz.

12.00 $

$11.21

11.21

1390 §

dz.

g. Size: 4X-Large

Acme #76672

FMC

Charm Tex

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$1.824.00

$1,428.94

$1,551.80

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid

specifications

Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green,

Light Blue, Navy, Ash and Yellow

Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes:

38.94 $311.52

dz.

a. Size: Small
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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

7

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

38.94 $389.40
38.94 $778.80
38.94 $973.50
49.56 $99.12
4720 $94.40
64.90 $129.80

dz.

10
20
25

ze: Medium

b. S

dz.

ze: Large

c. Si
d. s
e. Si
f. Si
g Si

dz.

ze: X-Large

dz.

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

dz.

dz.

ze: 4X-Large

Major Brands

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$2,776.54

$0.00

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid

specifications
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

Color: White

2478 $198.24
24.78 $247.80
24.78 $495.60
24.78 $619.50
27.14 $54.28
27.14 $54.28
27.14 $54.28

dz.

ze: Small

a. S
b. S

dz.

10
20
25

ze: Medium

dz.

ze: Large

c. Si
d.S

dz.

ze: X-Large

dz.

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

e. Si
f. Si
g S

dz.

dz.

ze: 4X-Large

Major Brands

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$1,723.98

$0.00

$0.00

Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B
Men’s V-Neck T-Shirts will be awarded on all

none basis

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

4. Crew Neck Pullover Sweatshirts, as per bid

specifications.
Colors: Gold and Gray

7.49 $7.49
7.49 $7.49
7.49 $7.49
7.49 $7.49
8.08 $8.08
8.08 $8.08

each

ze: Small

a. S
b. S

each

ze: Medium

each

ze: Large

c. Si
d.S

each

ze: X-Large

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

e. Si
f. Si
g S

each

$8.91

891

each

ze: 4X-Large

FMC

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$55.03

$0.00

$0.00

No Bid This Item

5. Women’s Panties, as per bid specifications

Color: White
To be furnished in the following sizes:

1,400.00
1,400.00
1,400.00
1,400.00
1,400.00
1,400.00
1,000.00

10.00 $

8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
9.43 $1,320.20
9.43 $1,320.20

9.43 $943.00

966.00

690 $

dz.

140

ze: 5

a. S

10.00 $

966.00

690 $

dz.

140

ze: 6

b. S

10.00 $

966.00
1,005.20
1,005.20
1,005.20

690 $

dz.

140

ze: 7

c.S
d. s
e.S
fs
g S

10.00 $

718 $

dz.

140

ze: 8

10.00 $

718 $

dz.

140

ze: 9
ze: 10

10.00 $

718 $

dz.

140

10.00 $

718.00

718 $

dz.

100

ze: 11
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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

7

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

1,000.00
1,000.00
1,000.00

10.00 $

$1,061.00

10.61

718.00

718 $

dz.

100
100
100

h. Size: 12
i. Size: 13
j. Size: 14

10.00 $

$1,061.00

10.61

718.00

718 $

dz.

10.00 $

$1,061.00

10.61

718 $ 718.00

CL/Pant - Charm Tex

dz.

ACME #166PC

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid FMC

Total

$12.400.00

$11,386.40

$8,785.60

$0.00

No Bid This Item

6. Sport Bras, as per bid specifications

Color: White and/or Black

Brand: Champion or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes

36.00 $ 4,500.00
36.00 $ 4,500.00
36.00 $ 4,500.00
36.00 $ 4,500.00

36.00 $

$2,876.25
$2,876.25
$2,876.25
$2,876.25

23.01

19.54 § 244250
19.54 § 244250
19.54 § 244250
19.54 § 244250

19.54 §

dz.

125
125
125
125
300

a. Size: Small

b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large

d. Size: X-Large
e. Size: 2X- 3X

23.01

dz.

23.01

dz.

23.01

dz.

10,800.00

$6,903.00

23.01

5,862.00

dz.

ACME #72206

FMC

CT # CL/SBRA

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$28.800.00

$18.408.00

$15,632.00

$0.00

18,900.00

504 §

5.06 $18,975.00

17,025.00

454 $

45,000 pairs

7. Over the Calf Style (Tube) Socks, as per bid

specifications,

Color: White

Brand: Champion or equal

Price based on cost per
dozen not cost for per pair

Price based on cost per

Price based on cost per
dozen not cost for per pair

dozen not cost for per pair

ACME #3134X

Import

CT # Sck/Tube

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

: No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications

Colors: White and Gray

Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal

1,503.00

450 $
449 §

5.06 $1,690.04
5.06 $845.02

dz.

334

8A. Size (Men) 10-13

749.83

dz.

167

8B. Size (Women) 9-11)

ACME #3134X

Import

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$2,252.83

$2,535.06

$0.00

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

9A. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per

bid specifications

Color: Navy

To be furnished in the following sizes:

6.96 $167.04
6.96 $417.60

5.30 $127.20
5.30 $318.00

each

24
60

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

each

6.96 $2,088.00
6.96 $2,088.00
8.14 $814.00
8.14 $293.04
8.14 $97.68
9.32 $55.92
9.32 $55.92

5.30 $1,590.00
5.30 $1,590.00
5.30 $530.00
5.30 $190.80
5.30 $63.60
5.90 $35.40
5.90 $35.40

each

300
300

each

each

100
36
12

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large

each

each

each

each

Chatham

Rob Tex . RTEP

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$6,077.20

$0.00

$4,480.40

Page 3 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

g
3
=
B4
=
=
2
3
°
7z

No Bid This Item

9B. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications
Color: Gold

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S
b. S

6.96 $696.00
6.96 $696.00
6.96 $522.00

5.85 $585.00
5.85 $585.00
5.85 $438.75

each

100

ze: Small

each

100
75

ze: Medium

each

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

6.96 $1,218.00
8.14 $244.20
8.14 $244.20
8.14 $81.40
9.32 $93.20
9.32 $55.92

5.85 $1,023.75
5.85 $175.50
5.85 $175.50
6.50 $65.00
6.50 $65.00
6.50 $39.00

each

175
30
30

ze: X-Large
ize: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large
ize: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large

each

each

each

10
10

each

each

Chatham

Rob Tx RTEP

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$3.850.92

$0.00

$3,152.50

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

10. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Navy Blue

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S

6.96 $167.04
6.96 $417.60

5.30 $127.20
5.30 $318.00

each

24
60

ze: Small

each

ze: Medium

b. S

6.96 $2,088.00
6.96 $2,088.00
8.14 $814.00
8.14 $293.04
9.32 $111.84
9.32 $55.92
10.50 $63.00
10.50 $21.00
10.50 $10.50
10.50 $10.50
10.50 $10.50

5.30 $1,590.00
530 $1,590.00
5.30 $530.00
5.30 $190.80
5.90 $70.80
5.90 $35.40
5.90 $35.40
5.90 $11.80
5.90 $5.90
5.90 $5.90
5.90 $5.90

each

300
300

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

each

ze: X-Large
ize: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large
ize: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

each

100
36

each

each

12

each

each

each

each

k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large

each

each

m. Size: 10X-Large

Chatham

Rob Tex . RTEP

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$6,150.94

$0.00

$4,517.10

Note: Items 9 and 10 will be awarded on an all or

none basis to one supplier

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

11. Men’s V-Neck Work Shirts, as per bid

specifications

Color: Navy Blue

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S

6.49 $623.04
6.49 $623.04

4.30 $412.80
4.30 $412.80

each

96
96

ze: Small

each

ze: Medium

b. S

6.49 $1,947.00
6.49 $1,947.00
7.67 $767.00
7.67 $276.12
8.85 $106.20
8.85 $53.10
10.03 $60.18

430 $1,290.00
4.30 $1,290.00
4.30 $430.00
4.30 $154.80
4.30 $51.60
4.30 $25.80
4.30 $25.80

each

300
300
100
36

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

each

ze: X-Large

each

ize: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

each

each

12

ize: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large

each

each

Page 4 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

10.03  $20.06
10.03 $10.03
10.03 $10.03
10.03 $10.03

4.90 $9.80
4.90 $4.90
4.90 $4.90
4.90 $4.90

each

j- Size: 7X-Large

each

k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large

each

each

m. Size: 10X-Large

Chatham

Rob Tex . RTVS

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$6,452.83

$0.00

$4,118.10

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

12. Women’s Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S
b. S

6.96 $83.52

5.30 $63.60

each

12
26

ze: Small

6.96 $180.96
6.96 $417.60
6.96 $417.60
8.14 $293.04
8.14 $48.84
9.32 $55.92
9.32 $27.96
9.32 $9.32
9.32 $9.32
9.32 $9.32

5.30 $137.80
5.30 $318.00
5.30 $318.00
5.30 $190.80
5.30 $31.80
5.30 $31.80
5.90 $17.70
5.90 $5.90
5.90 $5.90
5.90 $5.90

each

ze: Medium

each

60
60
36

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

each

ze: X-Large

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

each

each

ze: 4X-Large

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

each

each

each

k. Size: 8X-Large

Chatham

Rob Tex. RTEP

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

$0.00

$1,553.40

$0.00

$1,127.20

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

13. Women’s Crew-Neck Work Shirt, as per bid

specifications

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S

6.49 $77.88

4.30 $51.60

each

12
26

ze: Small

6.49 $168.74
6.49 $389.40
6.49 $389.40
8.14 $293.04
8.14 $48.84
9.32 $55.92
9.32 $27.96
9.32 $9.32
9.32 $9.32
9.32 $9.32

4.30 $111.80

each

ze: Medium

b. S

4.30 $258.00
4.30 $258.00
4.30 $154.80
4.30 $25.80
4.30 $25.80
4.90 $14.70
4.90 $4.90
4.90 $4.90
4.90 $4.90

each

60
60
36

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

each

ze: X-Large

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

each

each

ze: 4X-Large

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large
k. Size: 8X-Large

each

each

each

Chatham

Rob Tex. RTCS

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$1.479.14

$0.00

$915.20

Note: Items 12 and 13 will be awarded on an all

or none basis to one supplier

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

14. Navy Knee Shorts

a. S

$63.72

531
531
531
531

3.75 $45.00
3.75 $97.50

each

12
26

ze: Small

$138.06
$318.60
$318.60
6.49 $233.64
6.49 $38.94
6.49 $38.94

each

ze: Medium

b. S

3.75 $225.00
3.75 $225.00
3.75 $135.00
425 $25.50
425 $25.50

each

60
60
36

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

each

ze: X-Large

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

each

each

ze: 4X-Large
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TABULATION SHEET

Acme Supply Co. Ltd.

Charm-Tex Comade Inc.

Robinson Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For

The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.

7

1920 E. Warner, Ste. N

1618 Coney Island Ave.

152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250

Glen Cove, NY 11542

Zaheer Sheik

Santa Ana, CA 92705

Deniz Erdinc
714.389.9600

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Stan Danzger

Gardena, CA 90248
Jennifer L. Kutsch

800.421.5582

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

800.567.8025

718.252.8100

800.567.8026 fax

714.389.9696 fax

718.258.8303 fax

800.370.7019 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

6.49 $38.94

425 $25.50

each

h. Size: 5X-Large

Chatham

Rob Tex. RTGS

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

$0.00

$1,189.44

$0.00

$804.00

No

No

No

No

Is this an all or none bid?

No Response

No Response

No Response

7-30 days

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County

Purchase order:

No Response

No Response

No Response

7-30 days

Slip on Pants and Shirts

No Response

No Response

No Response

We bid all or none on items 9A,

9B, 10, 11, 12,13

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included

with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Willing to accept future orders and solicitation via e-

mail?

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other

Governmental Entities decide to participate in this

contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agrees
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing

would apply to that entity?

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Does your firm/company have the required insurance

coverage stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE

REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these

requirements during the duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to acquire the required
coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of

contract award?

Sandra Barley,

Deniz Erdinc, 714.389.9600

Stan Darzger,

Pam Hurt 800.421.5582 ext 231

Specify the name and telephone number of the

800.567.8025x 52

718.252.8100

account representative who will be handling this

0%-Net 30 Days

.05%-10 days - Net 30 days

0%day-Net 30 days

0%-Net 30 days

Specify Payment Terms

Information on Provision of Health Insurance

Coverage for Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health

insurance coverage for employees in the bid

evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 5).

Please complete the information below to assist in

this evaluation.

Yes

Yes

Yes No

a) Does your company provide health insurance

coverage to its employees?

Page 6 of 21



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to
their employees that compares to Dallas County’s
health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For Robinson Textiles Charm-Tex Comade Inc. Acme Supply Co. Ltd.
The Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel
152 W. Walnut St. Ste 250 1618 Coney Island Ave. 1920 E. Warner, Ste. N 10 Cedar Swamp Rd., Ste.
Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011 2 Gardena, CA 90248 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Santa Ana, CA 92705 Glen Cove, NY 11542
Jennifer L. Kutsch Stan Danzger Deniz Erdinc Zaheer Sheik
2 800.421.5582 718.252.8100 714.389.9600 800.567.8025
=¥ 800.370.7019 fax 718.258.8303 fax 714.389.9696 fax 800.567.8026 fax
DESCRIPTION: Est.
Q.
b) If your company does provide health insurance No Yes Yes
coverage to its employees, does the company share
in the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only
coverage and 50% for family coverage?
¢) If your company provides health insurance No Yes No
coverage to its employees, is the coverage
comparable to the services provided by Dallas
County as described in the attached summary plan
description? (See Attachment - A)
d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in NA No No

Page 7 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

No

No Response

No

No Response

No

No Response

No

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

Certifed By Other Agency
EEO1 Form Completed

No

Yes

No Response

No

Yes

No -NA
Other:

No No

Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

Other: Prime Vendor

DC website

DC website

Governmentbids.com

1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications

Color: White

To be furnished in the following sizes:

158.00

1975 §

19.20 $153.60
19.20 $153.60
19.20 $576.00

96.80
96.80
363.00
6,050.00
12,850.20

12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
12.10 $
1475 $

12.04 $96.32
12.04 $96.32
12.04 $361.20

dz.

a. Size: 28

158.00

1975 §

dz.

b. Size: 30
c. Size: 32
d. Size:34

592.50
9,875.00

1975 §

dz.

30
500

1975 §

19.20 $9,600.00

12.04 $6,020.00

dz.

19.75 $ 20,974.50
19.75 § 20,974.50
19.75 $ 20,935.00
19.75 $ 20,935.00

21.00 $

19.20 $20,390.40
19.20 $20,390.40
19.20 $20,352.00
19.20 $20,352.00
21.20 $10,600.00
21.20 $10,600.00
23.20 $6,960.00
23.20 $2,320.00
24.20 $2,420.00
2420 $1,210.00

12.04 $12,786.48
12.04 $12,786.48
12.04 $12,762.40
12.04 $12,762.40
12.04 $6,020.00
12.60 $6,300.00
12.60 $3,780.00
13.16 $1,316.00
13.16 $1,316.00
13.72 $686.00
13.72 $686.00
14.28 $714.00
14.28 $14.28

dz.

1,062
1,062

e. Size: 36
f. Size: 38

12,850.20

dz.

1,060 dz.

12,826.00

g. Size: 40

12,826.00

1,060 dz.

h. Size: 42
1. Size: 44
j. Size: 46

10,500.00
10,500.00

7,375.00

dz.

500
500
300

21.00 $

7,375.00

1475 $

dz.

6,600.00

22.00 $

4,425.00

1475 $

dz.

k. Size: 48
1. Size: 50

2,200.00

22.00 $

1,475.00
1,625.00

1475 $

dz.

100
100
50
50
50

2,300.00
1,150.00
1,200.00
1,200.00

23.00 $

1625 $

dz.

m. Size: 52
n. Size: 54
0. Size: 56
p. Size: 58

23.00 $

812.50

1625 $

dz.

24.00 $

26.20 $1,310.00

812.50

1625 $

dz.

24.00 $

26.20 $1,310.00
28.20 $28.20

Care Apparel Item #620W

920.00

18.40 $

dz.

25.00

25.00 $

18.40

18.40 $

dz.

q. Size: 60

Manbhatten /31

BBC #EBXWHE

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$130,277.50

$128,726.20

$82,797.40

$78.,503.88

Color:

2. Men’s Briefs, as per bid specifications

White

Brand: Hanes, BVD, Fruit of the Loom or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

150.00

15.00 $

11.25 $112.50
11.25 $112.50
11.25 $337.50
11.25 $675.00
13.25 $530.00
14.25 $14.25
15.25 $15.25

Care Apparel Item #6250

101.80

10.18 $

8.79 $87.90
8.79 $87.90

dz.

10
10
30
60
40

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

150.00

15.00 $

101.80

10.18 $

dz.

450.00

15.00 $

305.40

10.18 $

8.79 $263.70
8.79 $527.40
9.89 $395.60
9.89 $9.89
9.89 $9.89

dz.

900.00

15.00 $

660.00

11.00 $
11.90 $
11.90 $
1290 $

dz.

660.00

1650 $

476.00

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

17.00
18.50

17.00 $

11.90
12.90

dz.

1850 §

dz.

g. Size: 4X-Large

Hanes 32

BBC #EBRLS

FM

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$2,345.50

$1,797.00

$1,669.80

$1,382.28

Page 8 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

No Bid This Item

Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green, Light Blue,

3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Navy, Ash and Yellow

Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes:

54.84 $438.72
54.84 $548.40

292.80

36.60 $

36.52 $292.16
36.52 $365.20
36.52 $730.40
36.52 $913.00
59.50 $119.00
59.50 $119.00
59.50 $119.00

Price above is for the Colored T-

dz.

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

366.00

36.60 $

dz.

10
20
25

54.84 $1,096.80
54.84 $1,371.00
79.99 $159.98
79.99 $159.98
79.99 $159.98

732.00

36.60 $

dz.

915.00

36.60 $

dz.

110.88

5544 $

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large

126.00

63.00 $

dz.

126.00

63.00 $

dz.

Shirts Only - For White Colored T-

Shirts: Sizes: Small -

-
Y

XLarge @

-4X-Large @
Total Cost $

$27.80/dz, 2X-Large

$44.97/dz.

Hanes 5180

Sanmar #ZPC61

Gildan -FOL

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$3.934.86

$2,668.68

$2,657.76

No Bid This Item

3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications

Color: White
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

37.18 $297.44
37.18 $371.80
37.18 $743.60
37.18 $929.50
59.64 $119.28
59.64 $119.28
59.64 $119.28

Care Apparel Item #5610

672.00

84.00 $

28.12 $224.96
28.12 $281.20
28.12 $562.40
28.12 $703.00

dz.

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

840.00
1,680.00
2,100.00

84.00 $

dz.

10
20
25

84.00 $

dz.

84.00 $

dz.

196.80

98.40 $
126.00 $

$71.42
39.30 $78.60

35.71

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large

252.00

dz.

141.60 $ 283.20

San Mar #ZDT1170

$0.00

dz.

FOL

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$2,700.18

$6,024.00

$1,921.58

Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B Men’s V-Neck T-

Shirts will be awarded on all none basis

No Bid This Item

4. Crew Neck Pullover Sweatshirts, as per bid specifications.

Colors: Gold and Gray

5.98 $263.12
5.98 $263.12
5.98 $263.12
5.98 $263.12
8.99 $395.56
8.99 $395.56
8.99 $395.56

286.00

6.50 $
6.50 $
6.50 $
6.50 $
11.10 $
11.10 $
11.10 $

7.54 $331.76
7.54 $331.76
7.54 $331.76
7.54 $331.76
8.20 $360.80
8.20 $360.80
8.79 $386.76

each

44
44
44
44

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

286.00

each

286.00

each

286.00

each

488.40

each

44
44
44

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large

488.40

each

488.40

each

Page 9 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

Price above is for the Color Gray
Only - For Color Gold Sizes: Small
- XLarge @ $7.89 each, 2X-Large
@ $10.64 each, 3X-Large @
$10.97 each, and 4X

@$11.27 each
64.44

-Large
Total Cost $

Care Apparel Item #5610

BBC #SSGY (Gray) and
Port & Company

Speedy

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

#ZPC61GOLD (Gold)

$0.00

$2,239.16

$2,609.20

$2,435.40

Total

5. Women’s Panties, as per bid specifications

Color: White
To be furnished in the following sizes:

1,470.00
1,470.00
1,470.00
1,470.00
1,540.00
1,540.00
1,100.00
1,100.00
1,150.00
1,150.00

10.50 $

9.98 $1,397.20
9.98 $1,397.20
9.98 $1,397.20
9.98 $1,397.20
9.98 $1,397.20
10.48 $1,467.20
10.48 $1,048.00
10.48 $1,048.00
10.48 $1,048.00
10.48 $1,048.00

Care Apparel Item #2410A

980.00

7.00 $
7.00 $
750 $
750 $
920 $
920 $
1030 $

8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
8.25 $1,155.00
9.79 $1,370.60
9.79 $979.00
9.79 $979.00
9.79 $979.00
9.79 $979.00

dz.

140

a. Size: 5
b. Size: 6

1050 $

980.00
1,050.00
1,050.00
1,288.00
1,288.00
1,030.00
1,030.00
1,030.00
1,060.00

dz.

140

10.50 $

dz.

140

c. Size: 7
d. Size: 8

10.50 $

dz.

140

11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.00 $
11.50 $
11.50 $

dz.

140

e. Size: 9
f. Size: 10

dz.

140

dz.

100
100
100
100

g. Size: 11

1030 $

dz.

h. Size: 12
i. Size: 13
j. Size: 14

1030 $

dz.

10.60 $

dz.

Might Hugs 35

BBC #ELBLCTN

FM

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$13.460.00

$12,645.20

$10,786.00

$11,061.60

6. Sport Bras, as per bid specifications

Color: White and/or Black

Brand: Champion or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes

3,687.50
3,937.50
4,187.50
4,437.50

29.50 $

33.00 $4,125.00
33.00 $4,125.00
33.00 $4,125.00
33.00 $4,125.00

2,375.00
2,375.00
2,375.00
2,375.00
6,570.00

19.00 $

21.45 $2,681.25
21.45 $2,681.25
21.45 $2,681.25
21.45 $2,681.25
21.45 $6,435.00

dz.

125
125
125
125
300

a. Size: Small

b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large

d. Size: X-Large
e. Size: 2X- 3X

31.50 $

19.00 $

dz.

3350 $

19.00 $

dz.

3550 $

19.00 $

dz.

11,250.00

3750 $

35.00 $10,500.00

2190 $

Note: Small (32-34), Med

(36-38), L(40-42), X-

dz.

Large (44-46), 2x-3x (48-

54)

Might Hugs 36

Care Apparel Item 2320C

BBC #EBASPLS

FM

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$27.500.00

$27,000.00

$16.070.00

$17.160.00

=)
<
=)
w
s
o
a
@
~
)

$22,050.00 550 $ 20,625.00

$0.49

5.56 $20,850.00

45,000 pairs

7. Over the Calf Style (Tube) Socks, as per bid specifications,

Color: White

Brand: Champion or equal

Price based on cost per pair Price based on cost per
not cost for per dozen

Price based on cost per

Price based on cost per dozen not

cost for per pair

dozen not cost for per pair
Quirinus USA 37

dozen not cost for per pair

BBC#1700-W

Care Apparel Item #2750

Carolina

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Page 10 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications

Colors: White and Gray

Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal

1,503.00

450 $
450 $

5.98 $1,997.32
5.98 $998.66

Care Apparel Item #2720

1,970.60

590 $
590 $

5.12 $1,710.08
4.84 $808.28

dz.

334

8A. Size (Men) 10-13

751.50

985.30

dz.

167

8B. Size (Women) 9-11)

Quirinus USA 38

BBC #M4595

Carolina

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$2,254.50

$2,995.98

$2,955.90

$2,518.36

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

9A. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Navy

To be furnished in the following sizes:

192.00

8.00 $

$0.00

130.56

544 $

$0.00

each

24
60

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

480.00
2,400.00

8.00 $

$0.00

346.20
1,887.00
1,887.00

577 $

$0.00

each

8.00 $

$0.00

629 $

$0.00

each

300
300
100
36
12

2,400.00

8.00 $

$0.00

629 $

$0.00

each

825.00

825 §$

$0.00

629.00

629 $

$0.00

each

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

297.00

825 §$

$0.00

226.44

629 $

$0.00

each

102.00

850 $

$0.00

79.32

$

730 $
775 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

6.61

$0.00

each

g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large

1. Size: 6X-Large

54.00
60.00

9.00 $
10.00 $

$0.00

43.80
46.50

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

Extreme Emergy 39A

BBC #JTNTBIDL4

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$6.810.00

$0.00

$5,275.82

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

9B. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications
Color: Gold

To be furnished in the following sizes:

800.00

8.00 $

$0.00

544.00

544 $

$0.00

each

100
100
75

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

800.00

8.00 $

$0.00

577.00

577 $

$0.00

each

600.00
1,400.00

8.00 $

$0.00

471.75
1,100.75

629 $

$0.00

each

8.00 $

$0.00

629 $

$0.00

each

175
30
30
10
10

255.00

850 $

$0.00

188.70

629 $

$0.00

each

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large

255.00

850 $

$0.00

188.70

629 $

$0.00

each

87.50
95.00

60.00

875 $

$0.00

66.10

$

730 $
775 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

6.61

$0.00

each

9.50 §
10.00 $

$0.00

73.00
46.50

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

Extreme Energy 39B

BBC #JTGDLTBIDL4

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$4,352.50

$0.00

$3,256.50

$0.00

No Bid This Item

g
3}
=
Z
=
=
2
3
°
z

10. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Navy Blue

To be furnished in the following sizes:

216.00

9.00 $

$0.00

130.56

544 $

$0.00

each

24

a. Size: Small

Page 11 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

401/404

127-09 91st Ave.

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

540.00
2,700.00

9.00 $

$0.00

346.20
1,887.00
1,887.00

577 $

$0.00

each

60
300
300

ze: Medium

b. S

9.00 $

$0.00

629 $

$0.00

each

c. Si
d. s
e. Si
f. Si
g S

ze: Large

2,700.00

9.00 $

$0.00

629 $

$0.00

each

ze: X-Large

900.00

9.00 $

$0.00

629.00

629 $

$0.00

each

100
36
12

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

324.00

9.00 $
10.00 $

$0.00

226.44

629 $

$0.00

each

120.00

$0.00

79.32

$

6.61
730 $
775 $

$0.00

each

ze: 4X-Large

60.00
60.00
24.00

$0.00 10.00 $

43.80
46.50

$0.00

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

10.00 $

$0.00

$0.00

each

12.00 $

$0.00

16.20
833
8.42
8.59

8.10 $
833 §

$0.00

each

12.00
12.00
12.00

12.00 $

$0.00

$0.00

each

k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large

12.00 $

$0.00

842 $

$0.00

each

12.00 $

$0.00

859 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

$0.00

each

m. Size: 10X-Large

Extreme Energy 310

BBC #JTNTBIDL4

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$7.680.00

$0.00

$5.317.36

$0.00

Note: Items 9 and 10 will be awarded on an all or none basis

to one supplier

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

11. Men’s V-Neck Work Shirts, as per bid specifications

Color: Navy Blue

To be furnished in the following sizes:

768.00

8.00 $

$0.00

398.40

415 §

$0.00

each

96
96

ze: Small

a. S
b. S

768.00
2,400.00

8.00 $

$0.00

427.20
1,407.00
1,434.00

445 §

$0.00

each

ze: Medium

8.00 $

$0.00

469 $

$0.00

each

300
300
100
36
12

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

ze: Large

2,400.00

8.00 $

$0.00

478 §

$0.00

each

ze: X-Large

850.00

850 $

$0.00

500.00

500 $
549 $

$0.00

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

306.00

850 $

$0.00

197.64

$0.00

each

108.00

9.00 $

$0.00

70.80
37.74

40.20

590 $
629 $

$0.00

each

ze: 4X-Large

54.00
54.00
24.00

9.00 $

$0.00

$0.00

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

9.00 $
12.00 $

$0.00

6.70 $
690 $

$0.00

each

$0.00

13.80
7.00
7.10
7.23

$0.00

each

12.00
12.00
12.00

12.00 $

$0.00

7.00 $
7.10 $
723 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

$0.00

each

k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large

12.00 $

$0.00

$0.00

each

12.00 $

$0.00

$0.00

each

m. Size: 10X-Large

Extreme Energy 311

BBC #JTNSSL

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$7.,768.00

$0.00

$4,548.11

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

12. Women’s Slip on Pants, as per bid specifications

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

To be furnished in the following sizes:

$0.00

76.80
166.40

6.40 $
6.40 $

$0.00

each

12
26
60
60
36

ze: Small

a. S

$0.00

$0.00

each

ze: Medium

b. S

$0.00

384.00

6.40 $

$0.00

each

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

ze: Large

$0.00

384.00

6.40 $
6.40 $
6.50 $
6.80 $

$0.00

each

ze: X-Large

$0.00

230.40

$0.00

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large
ze: 4X-Large

$0.00

39.00
40.80

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

Page 12 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

$0.00

22.95

7.65 $

$0.00

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

$0.00

8.40
8.60
8.70

840 $

$0.00

each

$0.00

8.60 $
870 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

k. Size: 8X-Large

BBC #JWTCGTLS4

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

$0.00

$0.00

$1,370.05

$0.00

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

13. Women’s Crew-Neck Work Shirt, as per bid

specifications

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

To be furnished in the following sizes:

a. S
b. S

$0.00

52.80
119.60
282.00

440 $
460 $
470 $
500 $
525 $

$0.00

each

12
26

ze: Small

$0.00

$0.00

each

ze: Medium

$0.00

$0.00

each

60
60
36

ze: Large

c. Si
d. s
e. Si
f. Si
g S

$0.00

300.00

$0.00

each

ze: X-Large

$0.00

189.00

$0.00

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

$0.00

36.60
39.60
2040

6.10 $
6.60 $
6.80 $
7.00 $
730 $

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

ze: 4X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

each

h. Size: 5X-Large
1. Size: 6X-Large
j- Size: 7X-Large

$0.00

7.00
7.30
7.50

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

each

$0.00

750 $

Note: Minimum Order six

(6) each per size

$0.00

each

k. Size: 8X-Large

BBC #JWTSCGCNL4

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$1,061.80

$0.00

Note: Items 12 and 13 will be awarded on an all or none

basis to one supplier

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

14. Navy Knee Shorts

a. S

5.75 $69.00
5.75 $149.50
5.75 $345.00
5.75 $345.00
6.25 $225.00
6.25 $37.50
6.75 $40.50
6.75 $40.50

48.00
104.00
Care Apparel Item #485K

400 $
400 $
400 $
400 $
415§

$0.00

each

12
26

ze: Small

$0.00

each

ze: Medium

b. S

240.00

$0.00

each

60
60
36

ze: Large

c.S
d. s
e.S
f. Si
g S

240.00

$0.00

each

ze: X-Large

149.40

$0.00

each

ze: 2X-Large
ze: 3X-Large

24.90

415 §

$0.00

each

27.00
31.50

450 $
525 $

$0.00

each

ze: 4X-Large

$0.00

each

h. Size: 5X-Large

BBC #623

Specity Brand/Product Number Being Bid

$0.00

$1,252.00

$864.80

$0.00

No

No

No

No

Is this an all or none bid?

No Response

30 Days ARO
No Bid

50-30 days aro

30 days
30 days

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchase order:

Slip on Pants and Shirts

No Response

30-60 days aro

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your

bid proposal, if applicable:

Page 13 of 21
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TABULATION SHEET

Holmdel Footware

Care Apparel Inc.

Bob Barker Company,

Inc.

Carolina Textiles

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

28 Harriosn Ave. , Ste.

127-09 91st Ave.
401/404

134 N. Main Street

PO Box 11211

Richmond Hill, NY 11418 Englishtown, NJ 07726

Fuquay Varina, NC

27526

Charlotte, NC 28220

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Wendy Zamkoff
877.901.3668

Gili Veg

Allison Wilmesmeier
800.334.9880

Bob Jones

800.326.6262

704.525.1272

732.851.7120 fax

718.577.0880 fax

800.322.7537 fax

704.525.0607 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Willing to accept future orders and solicitation via e-mail?

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities
decide to participate in this contract, would you, the awarded

and

Contractor agrees that all terms, conditions, specifications,

pricing would apply to that entity?

No

Yes

Yes

Yes

Does your firm/company have the required insurance coverage

stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and

agree to comply with these requirements during the duration of

this contract?

Yes

If No, will your firm be able to acquire the required coverage
within ten (10) days upon notification of contract award?

Mark Zamkoff

877.901.9668

Gil Veg, 718.577.0888 ext

205

Allison Wilmesmeier ,

Bob Jones, 704.525.1272

Specify the name and telephone number of the account
representative who will be handling this account:

800.334.9880 ext 2137

0%-Days Net 30 Days 0%-Net 30 Days

0%day-Net 30 days

0%-Net 30 days

Specify Payment Terms

I have no employees

Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage

for Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance

coverage for employees in the bid evaluation process (see page
4, paragraph 5). Please complete the information below to

assist in this evaluation.

No

Yes

Yes

a) Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its

employees?

NA

No

Yes

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to

its employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum
of 75% for employee only coverage and 50% for family

coverage?

NA

No

Yes

¢) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its

employees, is the coverage comparable to the services provided
by Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan

description? (See Attachment - A)

NA

No

NA

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the

fulfillment of this bid, does each of the subcontractors provide

health insurance coverage to their employees that compares to

Dallas County’s health insurance coverage and share in the

cost?
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TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

No Response

N

No Response

No

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Whe)

Certifed By Other Agency
EEO1 Form Completed

o

No Response

N

Yes

o

No

Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

Other: GovDirections.Gov

DC website

1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications

Color: White

To be furnished in the following sizes:

$0.00
24.34 $194.72
24.34 $730.20

0.60 $84.80
0.60 $84.80

0.60 $318.00

24.34 $12,170.00

0.99 $5,495.00
0.99 $11,671.38
1.38 $12,085.56
1.38 $12,062.80
1.70 $12,402.00
1.70 $5,850.00
2.09 $6,045.00
2.09 $3,627.00

24.34 $25,849.08

24.34 $25,849.08

24.34 $25,800.40

24.34 $25,800.40

24.34 $12,170.00

30.45 $15,225.00
30.45 $9,135.00
30.45 $3,045.00
30.45 $3,045.00

2.48 $1,248.00
2.48 $1,248.00
2.94 $647.00
2.94 $647.00
4.24 $712.00
4.24 $14.24

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

dz.

a. Size: 28

dz.

b. Size: 30

dz.

30
500

c. Size: 32
d. Size:34

dz.

1,062 dz.

e. Size: 36

1,062 dz.

f. Size: 38

1,060 dz.

g. Size: 40

1,060 dz.

500
500
300

h. Size: 42
i. Size: 44
j. Size: 46

dz.

dz.

dz.

k. Size: 48
1. Size: 50

dz.

100

dz.

100
50
50
50

m. Size: 52
n. Size: 54

dz.

dz.

o. Size: 56

dz.

p. Size: 58

dz.

q. Size: 60

Note: Must order in case

quantities - 6 dozen per case

595/595X

UMI #330-1 WT

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$159,013.88

$0.00

$74,242.58

2. Men’s Briefs, as per bid specifications

Color: White

Brand: Hanes, BVD, Fruit of the Loom or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

L.11 $111.10
L.11 $111.10
L.11 $333.30
L.11 $666.60
4.73 $589.20
4.73 $14.73

99.20
99.20
297.60
595.20
448.00
12.48
13.76

992 §
992 §
992 §
992 §
1120 $
1248 §

15.81 $158.10
15.81 $158.10
15.81 $474.30
15.81 $948.60
23.28 $931.20
23.28 $23.28
23.28 $23.28

dz
dz
dz.
dz
dz
dz

10
10
30
60
40
1

a. Size: Small

b. Size: Medium

c. Size: Large

d. Size: X-Large

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

$0.00

1376 §

dz.

g. Size: 4X-Large

Note: Must order in case

quantities - 7P7601 = 3.5 dozen
per case , 7P7601X

case

7 dozen per

7P76011/7P7601X

F.O.L. UMI 331-0-WT

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$1,826.03

$1,565.44

$2,716.86
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TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid

specifications

Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green, Light

Blue, Navy, Ash and Yellow

Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

30.58 $244.64
30.58 $305.80
30.58 $611.60
30.58 $764.50
48.80 $97.60
48.80 $97.60
48.80 $97.60

Price above is for the Colors (Other

than White or Ash ), Color: Ash
Sizes: Small - XLarge @

44.52 $356.16
44.52 $445.20
44.52 $890.40

dz.

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

dz.

10
20
25

dz.

44.52 $1,113.00
66.48 $132.96
66.48 $132.96
66.48 $132.96

dz.

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

dz.

dz.

g. Size: 4X-Large

Quantities - S-3xLarge = 6 dozen
per case, 4xLarge = 2 dozen per

28.45/dz., 2-4XL @ 43.44/dz.
case

Total Cost $ 2,052.99, Color:
White -Small - XLarge @
23.09/dz., 2-4XL @ 36.44/dz.

Total Cost $ 1,673.31
Note: Must Order in Case

3930R

Gildan G2000

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$2,219.34

$0.00

$3.203.64

3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications

Color: White

Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal

To be furnished in the following sizes:

24.46 $195.68
24.46 $244.60
24.46 $489.20
24.46 $611.50
31.57 $63.14
31.57 $63.14

29.28 $234.24
29.28 $292.80
29.28 $585.60
29.28 $732.00
29.28 $58.56
29.28 $58.56
29.28 $58.56

dz.

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

dz.

10
20
25

dz.

dz.

dz.

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large

dz.

$0.00

dz.

Note: Must be ordered in case
quantities - S-Xlarge = 12 dozen

6 dozen

per case , 2X-3X

2525V/2525VX

UMI WT 320-OWT (V-Neck)

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$1,667.26

$0.00

$2,020.32

Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B Men’s V-

Neck T-Shirts will be awarded on all none basis
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TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

Price is based on per dozen not

cost per pair

JS68006/WM68006

UMI #500-1WT

8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications
Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Colors: White and Gray

5.24 $1,750.16

4.55 $1,519.70
4.55 $759.85

dz.

334

8A. Size (Men) 10-13

$0.00

dz.

167

8B. Size (Women) 9-11)

JS18006 (Mens)

UMI #503-02 WT

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$1,750.16

$0.00

$2,279.55

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

9A. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Navy
To be furnished in the following sizes:

$0.00

5.85 $140.40
5.85 $351.00

each

24
60
300
300

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

each

$0.00

5.85 $1,755.00
5.85 $1,755.00
5.85 $585.00
5.85 $210.60
6.44 $77.28
6.44 $38.64
6.44 $38.64

each

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

100
36
12

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

$0.00

$0.00

UMI #64-10 NV

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$4,951.56

No Bid This Item

No Bid This Item

9B. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications

Color: Gold
To be furnished in the following sizes:

$0.00

5.85 $585.00
5.85 $585.00
5.85 $438.75

each

100

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

each

100
75

$0.00

each

$0.00

5.85 $1,023.75
5.85 $175.50
5.85 $175.50
6.44 $64.40
6.44 $64.40
6.44 $38.64

each

175
30
30
10
10

$0.00

each

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

$0.00

UMI #64-10 GD

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$3.150.94

No Bid This Item

10. Men’s Elastic Waist Slip on Pants, as per bid

specifications
To be furnished in the following sizes:

Color: Navy Blue

$0.00

5.85 $140.40
5.85 $351.00

each

24
60

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large

$0.00

each

$0.00

5.85 $1,755.00

each

300
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TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

coooooooooQ
e
P EEEEEEE]
P APRPD DD DA PP

P LB P B BB A LB AP

5.85 $1,755.00
5.85 $585.00
5.85 $210.60
6.44 $77.28
6.44 $38.64
6.44 $38.64
6.75 $13.50
7.10 $7.10
7.10 $7.10
7.10 $7.10

each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each

300
100
36
12

d. Size: X-Large
e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large
j. Size: 7X-Large
k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large

m. Size: 10X-Large

UMI #64-10NV

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$4,986.36

Note: Items 9 and 10 will be awarded on an all or

none basis to one supplier

No Bid This Item

11. Men’s V-Neck Work Shirts, as per bid

specifications
To be furnished in the following sizes:

Color: Navy Blue

$0.00

4.62 $443.52
4.62 $443.52

each

96

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

each

96

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

P AP B P PB AP BB A

4.62 $1,386.00
4.62 $1,386.00
4.62 $462.00
4.62 $166.32
4.85 $58.20
5.10 $30.60
5.35 $32.10
5.60 $11.20
5.90 $5.90
6.20 $6.20
6.20 $6.20

each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each

300
300
100
36
12

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large

j. Size: 7X-Large
k. Size: 8X-Large
1. Size: 9X-Large
m. Size: 10X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

$4,437.76

UMI #52-4 NV

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

No Bid This Item

12. Women’s Slip on Pants, as per bid specifications

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

To be furnished in the following sizes:

$0.00

5.55 $66.60

each

12
26

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

5.55 $144.30
5.55 $333.00
5.55 $333.00
5.55 $199.80
5.55 $33.30
6.10 $36.60

each

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

P B P PH A LB A BB

6.10 $18.30
6.41 $6.41
6.41 $6.41
6.41 $6.41

each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each
each

60
60
36

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large
g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large
j. Size: 7X-Large
k. Size: 8X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

$1,184.13

UMI #63-10CH'

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
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VENDOR #9

TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

No Bid This Item

13. Women’s Crew-Neck Work Shirt, as per bid

specifications
To be furnished in the following sizes:

Color: Charcoal Gray or Dark Gray

$0.00

4.33 $51.96

<=
3]
<
)

12
26

a. Size: Small
b. Size: Medium
c. Size: Large
d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

4.33 $112.58

each

$0.00

4.33 $259.80
4.33 $259.80
4.33 $155.88
4.33 $25.98
4.76 $28.56
4.76 $14.28
5.30 $5.30
5.30 $5.30
5.80 $5.80

each

60
60
36

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large
i. Size: 6X-Large
j. Size: 7X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

k. Size: 8X-Large

UMI #53-398CH

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$925.24

No Bid This Item

Note: Items 12 and 13 will be awarded on an all or

none basis to one supplier

14. Navy Knee Shorts
a. Size: Small

b. Size: Medium

c. Size: Large

d. Size: X-Large

$0.00

4.35 $52.20

each

12
26

$0.00

4.35 $113.10

each

$0.00

4.35 $261.00
4.35 $261.00
4.35 $156.60
4.35 $26.10
4.35 $26.10
4.35 $26.10

each

60
60
36

$0.00

each

$0.00

each

e. Size: 2X-Large
f. Size: 3X-Large

$0.00

$0.00

g. Size: 4X-Large
h. Size: 5X-Large

$0.00

UMI #64-123NV

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

$0.00

$0.00

$922.20

No Response

Yes

Is this an all or none bid?

No Response

30 days aro

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County

Purchase order:

45-60 days aro

Slip on Pants and Shirts

No Response

NA

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included

with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Yes

Yes

Willing to accept future orders and solicitation via e-

mail?

Yes

Yes

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental
Entities decide to participate in this contract, would
you, the awarded Contractor agrees that all terms,
conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?
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TABULATION SHEET

Fruit of the Loom

Uniforms

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

Bid No. 2011-084-5639 Annual Contract For The

Purchase Of Clothing & Apparel

Manufacturing Inc.

PO Box 90015

Po Box 12716

One Fruit of the Loom Dr.

Alternative Bid

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
Emily Pelligreen
480-368.9316

Opening Date: 20-Jun-2011

Bowling Green, KY 42102-9015

Gary Hatchel

1.888.492.0768

480.365.8556 fax

270.393.5309 fax

Est.

DESCRIPTION:

Qty.

Yes

Yes

Does your firm/company have the required insurance

coverage stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE

REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these

requirements during the duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to acquire the required
coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of

contract award?

Jessica Shell, 1.888.492.0768

Emily Pelligreen (Sales)/Alysha

Gartner (Cust Servc.),

480.368.9316

Specify the name and telephone number of the account
representative who will be handling this account:

0%-day, Net 30 days

0%-30 days, Net 30 days

Specify Payment Terms

Information on Provision of Health Insurance

Coverage for Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health

insurance coverage for employees in the bid evaluation

process (see page 4, paragraph 5). Please complete the

information below to assist in this evaluation.

Yes

Yes

a) Does your company provide health insurance

coverage to its employees?

Yes

Yes

b) If your company does provide health insurance

coverage to its employees, does the company share in
the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only

coverage and 50% for family coverage?

es

Yes

¢) If your company provides health insurance coverage
to its employees, is the coverage comparable to the

services provided by Dallas County as described in the

attached summary plan description? (See Attachment -

A)

es

Yes

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in

the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the

subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to

their employees that compares to Dallas County’s
health insurance coverage and share in the cost?
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