TABULATION SHEET		VEI	NDOR #1	VENI	OOR #2		VEN	IDOR #3	٦
Bid No. 2017-012-6636		Westway Ford		Howard Parts Distribution Center			AutoNation Fort Worth Motors LT		
Contract for the Purchase of Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Automotive Parts and Accessories for Passenger Vehicles and Light Duty Trucks		801 W Airport Frwy		3501 N. Santa Fe			7769 Grapevine		1
Accessories for Passenger Vehicles and Light Duty Trucks		Irving, Texas 75062		Oklahoma City, OK 73118			North Richland Hills, Tx		
		Mr. Kevin Hunter		Mr. Bruce Hoppe			Ms. Jennifer Solis		
		khunter@vtaig.com		bhoppe@bobhowardauto.com			solis@autonation.com		
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/19/2017 through 9/18/2018		Tel: 972-659-2366		Tel: 405-525-4456			Tel: 817-605-2470		
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS		Fax: 972-659-2271		Fax: 800-946-7278			Fax: 817-605-2470		
BUYER: James Gay (214) 653-7434									
CONTRACT MANAGER: Julio Cuin		Recommend Award (Section 1)					Recommend	Award (Section 2)	
									_
DESCRIPTION:	Est. MSRP List Price	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension		Unit Price	Extension	
Section 1 - Ford Motor Company OEM Automotive Parts and Accessories – Ford Motor Company Acceptable Brand: Ford (including Motorcraft, Lincoln and Mercury brands) <u>No Substitution</u> <u>Permitted</u>									
MSRP List price Plus (+)Minus(-)\$82,000Note: Dallas County Estimated Annual Purchase Volume (Ford OEM and Motorcraft): \$50,000/Net	\$82,000.00	List less 39%	\$ 50,020.00	List plus 9%	\$ 89,380.00		No Bid		
Is your firm a franchised OEM Ford Dealer?Yes No		Yes		Yes					
Is your firm a franchised Motorcraft Dealer or an Authorized Motorcraft Distributor?YesNo		Yes							
				Yes					
Published Price List Schedule Number		FPS3642		bhpdc.com					
Published Price List Date:		1-Apr-17		6-Apr-17					
How often is the pricing schedule updated (quarterly, semi-annually, or annually)		Quarterly		Quarterly					
How will the price list schedule be provided to Dallas County (Paper/Hard Copy or Electronically)		Flash drive		Electronically					
Enter Restocking Charge %, if applicable, for parts and accessories returned after 60 days:		0%		10%					
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid proposal, if applicable.				We have 8 different of million parts in inver					
Section 1 Subtotal			\$50,020.00		\$89,380.00	 		:	\$0

TABULATION SHEET		VENDOR #1	VENDOR #2		VENDOR #3	
Bid No. 2017-012-6636		Westway Ford	Howard Parts Distribution Center		AutoNation Fort Worth Motors LTD	
Contract for the Purchase of Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Automotive Parts and		•				
Accessories for Passenger Vehicles and Light Duty Trucks		801 W Airport Frwy	3501 N. Santa Fe		7769 Grapevine	
		Irving, Texas 75062	Oklahoma City, OK 73118		North Richland Hills, Tx	
		Mr. Kevin Hunter	Mr. Bruce Hoppe		Ms. Jennifer Solis	
		khunter@vtaig.com Tel: 972-659-2366	bhoppe@bobhowardauto.com Tel: 405-525-4456		solis@autonation.com Tel: 817-605-2470	
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/19/2017 through 9/18/2018						
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS		Fax: 972-659-2271	Fax: 800-946-7278		Fax: 817-605-2470	
BUYER: James Gay (214) 653-7434						
CONTRACT MANAGER: Julio Cuin		Recommend Award (Section 1)			Recommend Award (Section 2)	
DESCRIPTION:	Est. MSRP List Price	Unit Price Extension	Unit Price Extension		Unit Price Extension	
Section 2 - General Motors OEM Automotive Parts, AC Delco Parts and Accessories, Bell &	Lat. Marci List Thee	Chilt Filce Extension	Unit Filee Extension		Unit File Extension	
Howell IDB 2000 – General Motors Corporation						
Acceptable Brand: GM (including Chevrolet, Buick, Pontiac and Cadillac brands), AC Delco, Bell & Howell Automotive Parts OEM <u>No Substitution Permitted</u> )						
ben ee nowen matchinduye i and other <u>no bubshalaton i chinacar</u>						
Price for General Motors OEM parts and accessories, including AC Delco and Bell & Howell:	\$22,000.00	No Bid	List plus 9% \$23,980.00	Lis	st less 30% \$ 15,400.00	
List price Plus (+)Minus(-) mark-up/down amount	\$22,000.00	No Blu	Eist plus 976 \$25,980.00	1213	£1055 5070 \$15,400.00	
Price for AC Delco parts and accessories: MSRP List Price Plus(+)Minus(-)%mark-up/down						
amount Note: Dallas County Estimated Annual Purchase Volume: (GM, AC Delco and Bell &						
Howell: \$20,000 net						
Is your firm a franchised General Motors Dealer?			Yes	Ye	s	
YesNo						
Is your firm a franchised AC Delco Dealer or authorized AC Delco Distributor?YesNo			Yes	No		
Is your firm an authorized Bell & Howell Dealer or authorized Bell & Howell distributor?						
YesNo			No	No		
Published Price List Schedule Number:			bhpdc.com	N/A	۵	
			bipuc.com	102		
Published Price List Date:			April 6, 2017	4/1	/2017	
How often is the pricing schedule updated (quarterly, semi-annually, or annually):			Quarterly	M	onthly	
now orien is the prioring senerate updated (quarterly, senii-annually, of annually).			Qualitiny	M	sin y	
How will the price list schedule be provided to Dallas County (Paper/Hard Copy or Electronically)			Electronic	Ele	ectronic	
Enter Restocking Charge %, if applicable, for parts and accessories returned after 60 days			10%	0%		
Enter residenting entange 70, it appreaded, for pairs and accessories retained after 60 days			1070	070		
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid proposal, if applicable:						
arring and an approaches and a set of the set of the proposal, it approaches			We have 8 different car lines with ove	15	Restock if over 120 days for special order	
			million parts in inventory	1.5	parts not to exceed 20%	
Section 2 Subtotal:			\$23,98	0.00	\$15,400.00	
	<u> </u>					

TABULATION SHEET		VENDOR #1		VENDOR #2		VENDOR #3	
Bid No. 2017-012-6636	Westway Ford			Howard Parts Distribution Center		AutoNation Fort Worth Moto	
Contract for the Purchase of Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Automotive Parts and	801 W Airport Frwy			3501 N. Santa Fe		7769 Grapevine	
Accessories for Passenger Vehicles and Light Duty Trucks	Irving, Texas 75062			Oklahoma City, OK 73118		North Richland Hills, Tx	
	Mr. Kevin Hunter			Mr. Bruce Hoppe		Ms. Jennifer Solis	
		khunter@vtaig.com		bhoppe@bobhowardauto.com		solis@autonation.com	
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: 9/19/2017 through 9/18/2018		Tel: 972-659-2366		Tel: 405-525-4456		Tel: 817-605-2470	
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS	Fax: 972-659-2271			Fax: 800-946-7278		Fax: 817-605-2470	
BUYER: James Gay (214) 653-7434							
CONTRACT MANAGER: Julio Cuin		Recommend Award (Section 1)				Recommend Award (Section 2)	
DESCRIPTION:	Est. MSRP List Price	Unit Price Extension		Unit Price Extension		Unit Price Exte	ension
Section 3 - Chrysler, Dodge, Jeep and Mopar OEM Automotive Parts and Accessories – Chrysler							
LLC Acceptable Brand: Chrysler (including Dodge, Jeep and Mopar brands) OEM No Substitution							
Permitted							
Price for Chrysler OEM parts and accessories: MSRP list price Plus(+)Minus(-)mark-							
up/down amount	\$60,000.00	No Bid		Cost + 9%		No Bid	
Price for Mopar parts and accessories: MSRP List price Plus(+)Minus(-)mark-up/down		No Bid		Cost + 9%			
amount							
Note: Dallas County Estimated Annual Purchase Volume: \$60,000.00							
Is your firm a franchised Chrysler and Mopar Dealer?				Yes			
Published Price List Schedule Number:							
				bhpdc.com			
Published Price List Date:				April 6, 2017			
How often is the pricing schedule updated (quarterly, semi-annually, or annually):				Quarterly			
How will the price list schedule be provided to Dallas County (Paper/Hard Copy or Electronically)				Electronically			
Enter Restocking Charge %, if applicable, for parts and accessories returned after 60 days:				10%			
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid proposal, if applicable:				We have 8 different car lines with over 15			
opeen, and additional comments cosocie, metaded with your ord proposal, it applicable.				million parts in inventory			
Sector 2 Sector		¢0.		\$0			\$0
Section 3 Subtotal:		\$0	1	\$0			\$0