
1 of 15 Bid No. 2017-065-6689

TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3 Vendor #  4

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 800-287-4666 800-524-5427 800-524-5427 832-791-2535
Debra Morris, Buyer fax 800-724-0267 fax- 254-751-0299 fax- 254-751-0299 fax 915-845-8183
214-653-7933
debra.morris@dallascounty.org

Recommend for Award Section # 7 

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

Section I 

1 Soft Sweep Magnetic Brooms with Wooden Handle 2500 Each No Bid 10.21 $25,525.00 No Bid No Bid
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

2 Corn Warehouse Brooms 100 Each 11.61 $1,161.00 6.85 $685.00 No Bid 5.80 $580.00
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case 12 per case 12 6
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy # 1VAB5 ICS V040
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 

3 Correctional/Jail Facility Brooms 100 Each 8.88 $888.00 7.30 $730.00 No Bid 5.50 $550.00
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case 12 per case 12 100
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy 1VAC3 ICS JailBR
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 

4 Push Broom Heads 500 Each 13.74 $6,870.00 7.75 $3,875.00 No Bid 8.00 $4,000.00
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case 12 per case 12 1

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy 2PY50 ICS V24
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 

5.. Cut End Wet Mop Heads 53,000 Each 4.70 $249,100.00 5.04 $267,120.00 No Bid 3.94 $208,820.00
Brand: Zephyr Manufacturing Co. or equal  12 12
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Heads  per Case 12 per case Crystal Lake CL4032
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy 16W229 14-21 days 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

6 Quick Change Plastic Mop Head with 60” Wood Handle 500 Each 13.71 $6,855.00 6.15 $3,075.00 No Bid 5.30 $2,650.00
Plastic (No Metal or Aluminum Heads) 1
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Plastic Mop Heads  per Case 12 per case 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy 1TYZ8 ICS J12643
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 

Softsweep # softsweep

7-14 days 2 days

2 days 

7 days

14-21 days 

4-6 days

office@burgooncompany.com bids@icswaco.com bids@icswaco.com dale@liberholding.com

Galveston, Texas 77553 Waco, Texas 76702 Waco, Texas 76702 Cypress, Texas 77433

Sharon Plambeck J.M Bogan III J.M Bogan III Dale Betz

Evco Partners LP dba: Burgoon Company ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 1 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 2 Liber Holding LLC
PO Box 1168 PO Box 21056 PO Box 21056 19515 Gladewater Ct.

Performance Plus P33134

Abco BR-304SJAIL

Abco BH-11008EA

Performance Plus P10032
2 days 

Performance Plus P16070
2 days 

mailto:debra.morris@dallascounty.org
mailto:office@burgooncompany.com
mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:dale@liberholding.com
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3 Vendor #  4

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 800-287-4666 800-524-5427 800-524-5427 832-791-2535

Galveston, Texas 77553 Waco, Texas 76702 Waco, Texas 76702 Cypress, Texas 77433

Evco Partners LP dba: Burgoon Company ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 1 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 2 Liber Holding LLC
PO Box 1168 PO Box 21056 PO Box 21056 19515 Gladewater Ct.

7 Wavebrake Institutional Mop Bucket with Wringer-Combo No Substitution 150 Each 67.80 $10,170.00 133.00 $19,950.00 No Bid No Bid 
Brand: Rubbermaid Commercial FG759088YEL (No substitution) each

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Buckets   per Case 1 per case
Rubbermaid 
FG759088YEL

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number (No Substitution) 14-21 days 

Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 

8 Floor Squeegee 72 Each 21.33 $1,535.76 18.95 $1,364.40 No Bid 11.00 $792.00
Brand: Carlisle or equal  vendor extension $1650.00

Specify Colors Available Blue
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Squeegees per Case 1 per case 12 1
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Carlisle EG784722P
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  4-6 days 14-21 days 7

9 Tapered Wood Handle 72 Each 7.96 $573.12 3.15 $226.80 No Bid 2.55 $183.60

Brand: Carlisle or equal vendor extension $183.51

Specify Colors Available Tan brown/tan
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Tapered Wood Handle per Case 12 per case 12 1
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed ICS J026
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  4-6 days 14-21 days 2

10 Color Coded Fiberglass Handle - Self Locking 50 Each 12.56 $628.00 12.40 $620.00 No Bid No Bid 
 Brand: Carlisle or equal  
Specify Colors Available Blue
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Fiberglass Handles  per Case 12 per case 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  4-6 days 14-21 days

11 Broom Handles with Metal Threaded Tip  500 Each 8.67 $4,335.00 3.86 $1,930.00 No Bid 2.65 $1,325.00

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Broom Handles  per Case 12 per case 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed ABCO 01104-EA
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  4-6 days 14- 21 days 

Section I Total 
Did not quote on everything 
in section 1 $282,115.88 $325,101.20

Did not quote on everything 
in section 1 $218,350.60

Section II vendor extension $219,626.01

12 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each 7.44 $7,440.00 4.35 $4,350.00 No Bid 2.60 $2,600.00

Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400120 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case 1 per case 5 5
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

13 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each 6.76 $6,760.00 4.73 $4,730.00 No Bid 4.05 $4,050.00
Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400520 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case 1 per case 5 5
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

14 Red Buffing Pads 50 Each 6.17 $308.50 4.35 $217.50 No Bid 3.60 $180.00
Brand:  3M Niagara 5100N or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case 1 per case 5 5
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION II $14,508.50 $9,297.50 $6,830.00
TOTAL SECTION III

Norton 20RED Performance Plus PRED20
4-6 days 7-10 days 7 days 

Norton 20HIPRO Americo 400520
7-10 days 7 days 

Tough Guy 4RU87 Norton 20BLK Performance Plus PBLA20
7-10 days 7 days 

ICS CL12872

Ability One # 7910-00-820-9912 / sold in packs of 5

Tough Guy 1VAJ4 Carlisle KT40225

blue, red, green, yellow, brown, white

Vikan # 77543

Tough Guy 3A326

blue, red, green, yellow, brown, white 

* price quoted is either your earned price or contract price. This price may be 
subject to change without notice 

* price quoted is either your earned price or contract price. This price may be 
subject to change without notice 

* price quoted is either your earned price or contract price. This price may be 
subject to change without notice 

3M 5100 sold in pack of 5

Rubbermaid 5NY94

Tough Guy 3H384

4-6 days 

4-6 days 

Black

ABCO BH-14002-EA

Brown

1

2 days

ABCO 01113-EA
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2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 800-287-4666 800-524-5427 800-524-5427 832-791-2535

Galveston, Texas 77553 Waco, Texas 76702 Waco, Texas 76702 Cypress, Texas 77433

Evco Partners LP dba: Burgoon Company ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 1 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 2 Liber Holding LLC
PO Box 1168 PO Box 21056 PO Box 21056 19515 Gladewater Ct.

15 Natural Rubber Latex Disposable Gloves  
Brand: Prime Source Hands-Off Latex Disposable Gloves
15.1 Size: Small 250 Boxes 6.85 $1,712.50 4.35 $1,087.50 4.19 $1,047.50 4.00 $1,000.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 100863 AMMEX LX3 Aurelia Vibrant Empress ELPFS2001
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

15.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes 6.89 $3,445.00 4.35 $2,175.00 4.19 $2,095.00 4.00 $2,000.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100 100 vendor extension $1000.00

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 100864 AMMEX LX3 Aurelia Vibrant Empress ELPFS2002
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

15.3 Size: Large 3500 Boxes 6.91 $24,185.00 4.35 $15,225.00 4.19 $14,665.00 4.00 $14,000.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 100865 AMMEX LX3 Aurelia Vibrant Empress ELPFS2003
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

15.4 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes 6.95 $1,737.50 4.35 $1,087.50 4.19 $1,047.50 4.00 $1,000.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 100866 AMMEX LX3 Aurelia Vibrant Empress ELPFS2004
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

16 Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Impact Proguard Disposal Nitrile or equal 
16.1 Size: Large 100 Boxes 8.28 $828.00 4.70 $470.00 8.70 $870.00 4.50 $450.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 200
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 2,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 22LED3 AMMEX APFN Aurelia Transform Empress ENPFL2003
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

16.2 Size: X-Large 100 Boxes 7.51 $751.00 4.70 $470.00 8.70 $870.00 4.50 $450.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 90 200
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 2,000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 22LED4 AMMEX APFN Aurelia Transform Empress ENPFL2004
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 3-5 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 2 days

17 High Risk Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: West Chester PosiShield 2950 or equal 
17.1 Size: Large 250 Boxes No Quote 5.65 $1,412.50 No Bid 11.00 $2,750.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Ammex GWON46100
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 7-14 days 7 days

17.2 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes No Quote 5.65 $1,412.50 No Bid 11.00 $2,750.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Ammex GWON48100
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 7-14 days 7 days

TOTAL SECTION III 
Did not quote on everything 
in section 3 $32,659.00 $23,340.00

Did not bid on all item in 
section 3 $20,595.00 $24,400.00

100 100

Safety Zone GNEP-5T8
1000

100

100 100

1000 1000

100

100 100
100010

1000 1000
Safety Zone GNEP-5T8

100

1 1000 1000

100 100

1000

1 1000 1000

10

100 100
10 1000 1000

10 1000 1000
100

100

1000
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3 Vendor #  4

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 800-287-4666 800-524-5427 800-524-5427 832-791-2535

Galveston, Texas 77553 Waco, Texas 76702 Waco, Texas 76702 Cypress, Texas 77433

Evco Partners LP dba: Burgoon Company ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 1 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 2 Liber Holding LLC
PO Box 1168 PO Box 21056 PO Box 21056 19515 Gladewater Ct.

SECTION IV vendor extension $23,400.00

18 Gloves – Medical Examination 
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
18.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes 10.18 $3,054.00 5.77 $1,731.00 5.00 $1,500.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) Microflex CFG-900S Aurelia Vibrant 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

18.2 Size: Medium 300 Boxes 10.06 $3,018.00 5.77 $1,731.00 5.00 $1,500.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) Microflex CFG-900-M Aurelia Vibrant 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

18.3 Size: Large 500 Boxes 10.06 $5,030.00 5.77 $2,885.00 5.00 $2,500.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) Microflex CFG-900-L Aurelia Vibrant 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

18.4 Size: X-Large 500 Boxes 10.11 $5,055.00 5.77 $2,885.00 5.00 $2,500.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 1,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) Microflex CFG-900-XL Aurelia Vibrant 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

19 Gloves – Nitrile Exam Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) No Bid 
19.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes 22.16 $6,648.00 5.70 $1,710.00 12.40 $3,720.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 300 300
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 3,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) Microflex UF-524-S Aurelia Amazing 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

19.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes 22.18 $11,090.00 5.70 $2,850.00 12.40 $6,200.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 300 300
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 3,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) Microflex UF-524-M Aurelia Amazing 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

19.3 Size: Large 1000 Boxes 21.87 $21,870.00 5.70 $5,700.00 12.40 $12,400.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 300 300
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 3,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) Microflex UF-524-L Aurelia Amazing 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

19.4 Size: X-Large 300 Boxes 21.87 $6,561.00 5.70 $1,710.00 12.40 $3,720.00 No Bid 
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box: 250 300
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case 3,000
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) Microflex UF-524-XL Aurelia Amazing 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 14-21 days 

TOTAL SECTION IV $62,326.00 No Substitution $21,202.00 No Substitution $34,040.00
SECTION V

20 Multi-Purpose Plastic Spray Bottle 3000 Each 2.11 $6,330.00 2.38 $7,140.00 No Bid 2.10 $6,300.00
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Spray Bottle with Trigger Sprayer per Case 12 6.00 1.00
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Tough Guy 2ZWN8 Uline ULS-7272
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 14-21 days 7 days 

TOTAL SECTION V $6,330.00 $7,140.00 $6,300.00

Safety Zone GPPFT

1000

1000

1000

100

100
10 1000

10 1000
100

100

Safety Zone INPF

Safety Zone INPF
10

10

100

Safety Zone GPPFT

Safety Zone GPPFT

Safety Zone GPPFT
10 1000

100

Safety Zone INPF

1000

10 1000

100

100

10

10

Safety Zone INPF

Impact 6008-S and 5024WG-EA
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3 Vendor #  4

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 800-287-4666 800-524-5427 800-524-5427 832-791-2535

Galveston, Texas 77553 Waco, Texas 76702 Waco, Texas 76702 Cypress, Texas 77433

Evco Partners LP dba: Burgoon Company ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 1 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. - Bid # 2 Liber Holding LLC
PO Box 1168 PO Box 21056 PO Box 21056 19515 Gladewater Ct.

SECTION VI
21 Disposable Bouffant Hair Cap Net 100 Boxes 6.71 $671.00 2.75 $275.00 No Bid 3.15 $315.00

Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Bouffant Hair Cap Net in each dispenser box 100 100 100
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case 10
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Cellucap BIX4BM
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 7 days

22 Disposable Beard Cover with Elastic String 50 Boxes 4.15 $207.50 2.26 $113.00 No Bid 3.20 $160.00
Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Beard Cover  in each dispenser box 100 100 100
Specify Quantity/Number of  Dispenser Box per Case 10
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Condor 1TTV4
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 7-14 days 7 days

23 Rolled-Rim Paper Cone Cups for Igloo Cooler 1 Case 133.50 $133.50 44.95 $44.95 No Bid 45.00 $45.00
Specify Quantity/Number of Cone Cup in each sleeve 200 250 200
Specify Quantity/Number of  Cone Cups per Case 25 boxes 5000
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O 4-6 days 14-21 days

24 Facial Tissue (100 tissue per box) 50 Boxes 1.70 $85.00 2.75 $137.50 No Bid 76.00 $3,800.00
Brand: Kimberly Clark Kleenex 21606 (No substitution)
Specify Quantity/Number of Tissues in each dispenser box 125 125
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case 30 12 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed Georgia Pacific 48560 Kimberly Clark 21606 Kimberly Clark 21606
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  4-6 days 14-21 days

TOTAL SECTION VI $1,097.00 $570.45 $4,320.00

SECTION VII
25 Lysol Disinfectant Spray 10 Cans 6.68 $66.80 7.43 $74.30 No Bid 6.75 $67.50

Brand: Lysol REC 04675 (No substitution
Specify Number of Ounces per Aerosol Can 19 ounce
Specify Other Lysol Fragrance Available at the same price Fresh
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Aerosol Can per Case 12 12 12
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number ( (No Substitution) Lysol REC 04675 Lysol 04675 Lysol REC 04675
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  14-21 days 2 days 

TOTAL SECTION VII $66.80 $74.30 $67.50

GRAND TOTAL $399,103.18 $386,725.45 $54,635.00 $260,200.60
vendor extension $260,543.51

AWARD TOTAL $66.80

N/A

Primary Contact Person Sharon Plambeck 800-287-4666 x24 Maegan Eisenman 800-524-5427 Maegan Eisenman 800-524-5427 Dale Betz 713-338-1958
bids@icswaco.com bids@icswaco.com

Secondary Contact Person Dawn Ware 800-287-4666 x31 Eryn Putman 800-524-5427 Eryn Putman 800-524-5427 Elva Munoz 915-845-8188
bids@icswaco.com bids@icswaco.com

19 oz. 19 oz

125

Safety Zone CD1000

Generic WB374W42F
5000

dware@burgooncompany.com

office@burgooncompany.com dale@liberholding.com

emunoz@liberholding.com

Rofsan BP18L

Konie 4.5KR

Safety Zone CDB09-24 Rofsan BC2400FP

1000 1000

1000 1000

Fresh Lemon, Country and Crisp Linen

Graingered approved 25K814
7 days 

mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:bids@icswaco.com
mailto:dware@burgooncompany.com
mailto:office@burgooncompany.com
mailto:dale@liberholding.com
mailto:emunoz@liberholding.com
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

Debra Morris, Buyer
214-653-7933
debra.morris@dallascounty.org

Recommend for Award 

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

Section I 

1 Soft Sweep Magnetic Brooms with Wooden Handle 2500 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

2 Corn Warehouse Brooms 100 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

3 Correctional/Jail Facility Brooms 100 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

4 Push Broom Heads 500 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

5.. Cut End Wet Mop Heads 53,000 Each 
Brand: Zephyr Manufacturing Co. or equal  
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Heads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

6 Quick Change Plastic Mop Head with 60” Wood Handle 500 Each
Plastic (No Metal or Aluminum Heads)
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Plastic Mop Heads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

Vendor #  5 Vendor #  6 Vendor #  7 Vendor #  8

214-321-3314 972-930-0330 972-930-0330 972-930-0330
fax 214-935-1063 fax 972-248-6267 fax 972-248-6267 fax 972-248-6267

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

16.25 $40,625.00 4.48 $11,200.00 No Bid No Bid 
4.00 12

Zephyr 34061

20.21 $2,021.00 8.65 $865.00 No Bid No Bid 
12 12
Unisan BWK 932CEA Zephyr 33034

15.95 $1,595.00 7.50 $750.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 6

Zephyr 33030

25.34 $12,670.00 9.80 $4,900.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 12

Boardwalk BWK 20424 Zephyr 39624

6.13 $324,890.00 2.40 $127,200.00 2.55 $135,150.00 2.74 $145,220.00
12 12 12

12 ABC Mops CM-20325 Goldenstar AEW32 Continental A857122

No Bid 7.28 $3,640.00 No Bid No Bid 

6.00
Zephyr 16076

Section #1 (section 1/ item # 5 option # 3)  , #2,  
#3, #5 & #6 

Weaver's County Market various part #

Rubbermaid FG638300BLUE

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc.
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Sadhna Patel
sadhna@mans.us

1-5 days

1-5 days

marycrockhom@sbcglobal.net

1-5 days 

Dallas, Texas 75228

Mary Crockhom

M & R Medical Supply
6326 N. Jim Miller Rd.

10-14 day / or sooner

* after testing did not meet deparment needs 

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 2
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Sadhna Patel
sadhna@mans.us

* after testing did not meet deparment needs 

O'Cedar Commercial 93614 10-14 day / or sooner 10-14 day / or sooner

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 3
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Sadhna Patel
sadhna@mans.us

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner

mailto:debra.morris@dallascounty.org
mailto:sadhna@mans.us
mailto:marycrockhom@sbcglobal.net
mailto:sadhna@mans.us
mailto:sadhna@mans.us


7 of 15 Bid No. 2017-065-6689

TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

7 Wavebrake Institutional Mop Bucket with Wringer-Combo No Substitution 150 Each
Brand: Rubbermaid Commercial FG759088YEL (No substitution) 

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Buckets   per Case

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number (No Substitution)

Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

8 Floor Squeegee 72 Each
Brand: Carlisle or equal  
Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Squeegees per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

9 Tapered Wood Handle 72 Each

Brand: Carlisle or equal

Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Tapered Wood Handle per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

10 Color Coded Fiberglass Handle - Self Locking 50 Each
 Brand: Carlisle or equal  
Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Fiberglass Handles  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

11 Broom Handles with Metal Threaded Tip  500 Each

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Broom Handles  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Section I Total 
Section II

12 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each

Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400120 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

13 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each
Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400520 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

14 Red Buffing Pads 50 Each
Brand:  3M Niagara 5100N or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION II 
TOTAL SECTION III

Vendor #  5 Vendor #  6 Vendor #  7 Vendor #  8

214-321-3314 972-930-0330 972-930-0330 972-930-0330

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc.
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006Dallas, Texas 75228

M & R Medical Supply
6326 N. Jim Miller Rd.

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 2
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 3
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

117.55 $17,632.50 36.10 $5,415.00 No Bid No Bid 

1 1
Rubbermaid 
759088YEL

1-5 day depending on 
quantity requested 

3.43 $246.96 9.28 $668.16 No Bid No Bid 

Black/Gray Black Only
6 6
Libman 515 Zephyr 42224
1-5 days

5.35 $385.20 6.20 $446.40 No Bid No Bid 

Natural Finish Brown 
12 12

Zephyr 21660
1-5 days

13.39 $669.50 14.50 $725.00 No Bid No Bid 

Red Multiple
12 12

Carlisle 41664
1-5 days

No Bid 3.12 $1,560.00 No Bid No Bid 

12
Zephyr 21262

Did not quote on everything 
in section 1 $400,735.16 $175,389.56 $135,150.00 $145,220.00

vendor extension $400,734.66

4.60 $4,600.00 $1.996 $1,996.00 No Bid No Bid 

5 5

7.00 $7,000.00 2.02 $2,020.00 No Bid No Bid 

5 5

5.00 $250.00 $1.996 $99.80 No Bid No Bid 

5 5

$11,850.00 $4,115.80

Carlisle 4026200

Global Industrial 404420
1-5 days

Global Industrial 430520
1-5 days

Global Industrial 400120
1-5 days

Carlisle 4122505

Norton 60663380023
10-14 day / or sooner

Norton 66623380013
10-14 day / or sooner

Norton 66623380053
10-14 day / or sooner

Rubbermaid RCP759088YELFG759088YEL 

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

15 Natural Rubber Latex Disposable Gloves  
Brand: Prime Source Hands-Off Latex Disposable Gloves
15.1 Size: Small 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.3 Size: Large 3500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.4 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

16 Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Impact Proguard Disposal Nitrile or equal 
16.1 Size: Large 100 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

16.2 Size: X-Large 100 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

17 High Risk Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: West Chester PosiShield 2950 or equal 
17.1 Size: Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

17.2 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION III 

Vendor #  5 Vendor #  6 Vendor #  7 Vendor #  8

214-321-3314 972-930-0330 972-930-0330 972-930-0330

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc.
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006Dallas, Texas 75228

M & R Medical Supply
6326 N. Jim Miller Rd.

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 2
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 3
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

7.39 $1,847.50 3.48 $870.00 No Bid No Bid 

Comfitwear LA-PF-S
3-4 weeks

8.96 $4,480.00 3.48 $1,740.00 No Bid No Bid 

Comfitwear LA-PF-M
3-4 weeks 

8.96 $31,360.00 3.48 $12,180.00 No Bid No Bid 

Comfitwear LA-PF-L
3-4 weeks 

9.96 $2,490.00 3.48 $870.00 No Bid No Bid 

Comfitwear LA-PF-XL
3-4 weeks 

10.50 $1,050.00 3.99 $399.00 No Bid No Bid 

Ansell # 92-675

11.05 $1,105.00 3.99 $399.00 No Bid No Bid 

Ansell # 92-675

No Bid 6.99 $1,747.50 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 6.99 $1,747.50 No Bid No Bid 

Did not quote on everything 
in section 3 $42,332.50 $19,953.00

100

100
1,000

1,000

1,000

100
1,000

100

100
1,000

1,000
100

100
1000

100
1000

100
1000

100
1000

100
1000

100
1000

50

10-14 day / or sooner

50

Westchester 2905LG
10-14 day / or sooner

Westchester 2905XL
10-14 day / or sooner

Safety-Zone GRPR-L-1M
10-14 day / or sooner

Safety-Zone GRPR-L-1M

Safety-Zone GRPR-L-1-T
10-14 day / or sooner

Safety-Zone GRPR-XL-1-T
10-14 day / or sooner

Safety-Zone GRPR-SM-1-T
10-14 day / or sooner

Safety-Zone GRPR-MD-1-T
10-14 day / or sooner
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

SECTION IV 
18 Gloves – Medical Examination 

Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
18.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.2 Size: Medium 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.3 Size: Large 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.4 Size: X-Large 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19 Gloves – Nitrile Exam Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
19.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.3 Size: Large 1000 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.4 Size: X-Large 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION IV 
SECTION V

20 Multi-Purpose Plastic Spray Bottle 3000 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Spray Bottle with Trigger Sprayer per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION V 

Vendor #  5 Vendor #  6 Vendor #  7 Vendor #  8

214-321-3314 972-930-0330 972-930-0330 972-930-0330

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc.
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006Dallas, Texas 75228

M & R Medical Supply
6326 N. Jim Miller Rd.

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 2
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 3
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

10.73 $3,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex CFG-900-S

10.73 $3,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex CFG-900-M

10.73 $5,365.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex CFG-900-L

11.12 $5,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex CFG-900-XL

22.61 $6,783.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex UF-524-S

24.55 $12,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex UF-524-M

24.95 $24,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex UF-524-L

23.18 $6,954.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Microflex UF-524-XL

$68,325.00 $0.00

2.00 $6,000.00 1.21 $3,630.00 No Bid No Bid 
24 200
Boardwalk 512246 TDLCO
5-10 days 

$6,000.00 $3,630.00

300
3,000

3,000
300

300
3,000

100

3,000

100

1,000

1,000

300

1,000

100

100

1,000

10-11 day / or sooner
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

SECTION VI
21 Disposable Bouffant Hair Cap Net 100 Boxes

Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Bouffant Hair Cap Net in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

22 Disposable Beard Cover with Elastic String 50 Boxes
Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Beard Cover  in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Number of  Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

23 Rolled-Rim Paper Cone Cups for Igloo Cooler 1 Case
Specify Quantity/Number of Cone Cup in each sleeve
Specify Quantity/Number of  Cone Cups per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

24 Facial Tissue (100 tissue per box) 50 Boxes
Brand: Kimberly Clark Kleenex 21606 (No substitution)
Specify Quantity/Number of Tissues in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

TOTAL SECTION VI 

SECTION VII
25 Lysol Disinfectant Spray 10 Cans

Brand: Lysol REC 04675 (No substitution
Specify Number of Ounces per Aerosol Can 
Specify Other Lysol Fragrance Available at the same price
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Aerosol Can per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number ( (No Substitution)
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

TOTAL SECTION VII

GRAND TOTAL 

AWARD TOTAL 

Primary Contact Person

Secondary Contact Person

Vendor #  5 Vendor #  6 Vendor #  7 Vendor #  8

214-321-3314 972-930-0330 972-930-0330 972-930-0330

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc.
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006Dallas, Texas 75228

M & R Medical Supply
6326 N. Jim Miller Rd.

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 2
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

M.A.N.S. Distributors, Inc. - OPTION # 3
3120 Kellyway Dr.
Carrollton, Texas 75006

6.67 $667.00 1.925 $192.50 No Bid No Bid 
19.25 /cs

100 100

5.67 $283.50 1.698 $84.90 No Bid No Bid 
vendor extension $567.00 16.98/cs

100.00 100

1-5 days

60.00 $60.00 59.380 $59.38 No Bid No Bid 
200 200/sleeve

5 days 

1.88 $94.00 1.900 $95.00 No Bid No Bid 

48 48/cs
Kimberly Clark 21601 Kimberly Clark 21606
1-5 days 5 days 

$1,104.50 $431.78

vendor extension $1,388.00

10.33 $103.30 7.06 $70.60 No Bid No Bid 

Crisp Linen Fresh
12 12/cs
Lysol REC 04675 Lysol 04675

$103.30 $70.60

$530,450.46 $203,590.74 $135,150.00 $145,220.00
vendor extension $530,733.96

$203,520.14

Mary L Crockhom 214-321-3314 Sadhna Patel 972-930-0330 Sadhna Patel 972-930-0330 Sadhna Patel 972-930-0330

Ruth Gipson 214-320-9281 Purnima Kara 972-930-0330 Purnima Kara 972-930-0330 Purnima Kara 972-930-0330

19 oz

125

Konie Cup International KCI 4.5KR

marycrockhom@sbcglobal.net 

gipsonrw@sbcglobal.net 

CelluCap

5,000 / 25/pks

Cellucap B14HSDGRA

10

10 10
Westchester 24-100

10
Westchester 1000

5000/cs
Konie KC145KR

125/box

10-14 day / or sooner

10-14 day / or sooner

19oz

sadhna @mans.us

sadhna @mans.us

sadhna @mans.us

sadhna @mans.us

sadhna @mans.us

sadhna @mans.us

mailto:marycrockhom@sbcglobal.net
mailto:gipsonrw@sbcglobal.net
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

Debra Morris, Buyer
214-653-7933
debra.morris@dallascounty.org

Recommend for Award 

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

Section I 

1 Soft Sweep Magnetic Brooms with Wooden Handle 2500 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

2 Corn Warehouse Brooms 100 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

3 Correctional/Jail Facility Brooms 100 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

4 Push Broom Heads 500 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Brooms per Case

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

5.. Cut End Wet Mop Heads 53,000 Each 
Brand: Zephyr Manufacturing Co. or equal  
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Heads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

6 Quick Change Plastic Mop Head with 60” Wood Handle 500 Each
Plastic (No Metal or Aluminum Heads)
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Plastic Mop Heads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

Vendor #  9 Vendor #  10 Vendor #  11

682-503-4484 713-939-7788 972-596-3350
fax 682-503-6576 fax 713-939-7714 972-596-2817

Section # 4

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

21.43 $53,575.00 5.03 $12,575.00 20.25 $50,625.00
4 vendor extension $53,562.50 12 4

Soft Sweep

10.01 $1,001.00 8.63 $863.00 6.60 $660.00
sold Individually  6 12

7.11 $711.00 8.55 $855.00 8.40 $840.00
sold individually 6 12

13.50 $6,750.00 10.74 $5,370.00 9.85 $4,925.00
sold individually 12 12

2.75 $145,750.00 3.52 $186,560.00 4.50 $238,500.00
sold Individually 12 12 vendor extension $146,500.00

13.69 $6,845.00 7.79 $3,895.00 7.85 $3,925.00
sold individually 6 12

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 34061

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 33034

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 33030

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 39624

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 16076Tough Guy item # 1TYZ8
7-10 days

7-10 days

Tough Guy item # 1VAB5

Tough Guy item # 1VAC3

Tough Guy item # 16W229

Mavich LLC
525 Commerce Street
Southlake, Texas 76092

Kelsey Aslett
kelsey.aslett@mavich.com

7-10 days

7-10 days

7-10 days

7-10 days
Tough Guy item # 2PY50

Soft Sweep Mfg model # 550

3-10 days 

Orr Textile Company, Inc. 
4777 Blalock Rd.
Houston, Texas 77041

Phillip Francis
phillip@orrtextile.com

3-10 days 

3-10 days 

3-10 days 

3-10 days 

3-10 days 
Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 09007

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
P.O. Box 260399
Plano, Texas 75026-0399

Kasey Hollon
khollon@pascoinc.net

30 days 

30 days 

30 days 

30 days 

30 days 

30 days 

Rubbermaid FG6384000RAN

Rubbermaid FG638300BLUE

Rubbermaid FG9b0900BLA

Rubbermaid FGF21900WH00

Rubbermaid FGH516000000

mailto:debra.morris@dallascounty.org
mailto:kelsey.aslett@mavich.com
mailto:phillip@orrtextile.com
mailto:khollon@pascoinc.net
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

7 Wavebrake Institutional Mop Bucket with Wringer-Combo No Substitution 150 Each
Brand: Rubbermaid Commercial FG759088YEL (No substitution) 

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Mop Buckets   per Case

Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number (No Substitution)

Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

8 Floor Squeegee 72 Each
Brand: Carlisle or equal  
Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Squeegees per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

9 Tapered Wood Handle 72 Each

Brand: Carlisle or equal

Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Tapered Wood Handle per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

10 Color Coded Fiberglass Handle - Self Locking 50 Each
 Brand: Carlisle or equal  
Specify Colors Available
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Fiberglass Handles  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

11 Broom Handles with Metal Threaded Tip  500 Each

Specify Quantity/Total Number of Broom Handles  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Section I Total 
Section II

12 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each

Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400120 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

13 Black Stripping Floor Pads 1000 Each
Brand:  Americo Manufacturing Co. 400520 or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

14 Red Buffing Pads 50 Each
Brand:  3M Niagara 5100N or equal 
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Pads  per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION II 
TOTAL SECTION III

Vendor #  9 Vendor #  10 Vendor #  11

682-503-4484 713-939-7788 972-596-3350

Mavich LLC
525 Commerce Street
Southlake, Texas 76092

Orr Textile Company, Inc. 
4777 Blalock Rd.
Houston, Texas 77041

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
P.O. Box 260399
Plano, Texas 75026-0399

67.78 $10,167.00 122.27 $18,340.50 40.85 $6,127.50
1 

sold individually 1.00

30 days 

21.33 $1,535.76 10.20 $734.40 11.95 $860.40

sold individually 6
Vikan item # 77543

30 days 

2.62 $188.64 3.33 $239.76 3.20 $230.40

Tan
sold individually 12

30 days 

12.56 $628.00 15.55 $777.50 11.50 $575.00

sold individually 12

30 days 

2.49 $1,245.00 3.30 $1,650.00 4.05 $2,025.00

sold individually 12

30 days 

$228,396.40 $231,860.16 $309,293.30
vendor extension $228,383.90 vendor extension $219,293.30

12.60 $12,600.00 No Bid 7.00 $7,000.00

pkg of 5 5

33.71 $33,710.00 No Bid 13.05 $13,050.00

pkg of 5 5

30.84 $1,542.00 No Bid 5.95 $297.50

pkg of 5 5

$47,852.00 $20,347.50

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 42224
3-10 days 

Natural 

3-10 days 

Blue, Red, Green, Yellow, Brown, White

3-10 days 
Carlisle # 4022501

7-10 days

3M mfg. model # 5100
7-10 days

Rubbermain item # FG759088YEL

7-10 days

Tough Guy item # 1VAJ4
7-10 days

7-10 days

Blue, Red, Yellow, Green, Yellow, White 

7-10 days

Blue, Yellow, Green, Red

7-10 days

Ability One mfg model # 7910-00-820-9912

7-10 days
Tough Guy item # 3H384

Tough Guy item # 4RU87

Tough Guy item # 3A326

Cannot bid due to brand specs. / Rubbermaid Commercial 
FG759088YEL 

3-10 days 

Black Only 

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 21660

Zephyr Manufacturing CO. # 21262
3-10 days 

Rubbermaid FG636200NAT

Rubbermaid FG759088YEL

Black
6

Carlisle 4022501

12

3M 7200
30 days 

3M 7200
30 days 

Carlisle 4022501

3M 5100N
30 days 

Rubbermaid FG9C3200BLA

Natural Wood
12

Brown
12
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

15 Natural Rubber Latex Disposable Gloves  
Brand: Prime Source Hands-Off Latex Disposable Gloves
15.1 Size: Small 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.3 Size: Large 3500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

15.4 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

16 Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Impact Proguard Disposal Nitrile or equal 
16.1 Size: Large 100 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

16.2 Size: X-Large 100 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

17 High Risk Nitrile Disposable Gloves 
Brand: West Chester PosiShield 2950 or equal 
17.1 Size: Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

17.2 Size: X-Large 250 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION III 

Vendor #  9 Vendor #  10 Vendor #  11

682-503-4484 713-939-7788 972-596-3350

Mavich LLC
525 Commerce Street
Southlake, Texas 76092

Orr Textile Company, Inc. 
4777 Blalock Rd.
Houston, Texas 77041

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
P.O. Box 260399
Plano, Texas 75026-0399

6.85 $1,712.50 No Bid No Bid 
100 vendor extension $3,425.00

7-10 days

6.89 $3,445.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

6.87 $24,045.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

6.89 $1,722.50 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

8.28 $828.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

7.51 $751.00 No Bid No Bid 
90

7-10 days

21.94 $5,485.00 No Bid No Bid 
50

7-10 days

21.94 $5,485.00 No Bid No Bid 
50

7-10 days

$43,474.00

Condor mfr model # 22LE03

Condor mfr model # 10D863

Condor mfr model # 10D864

Condor mfr model # 10D865

Condor mfr model # 10D866

Condor mfr model # 22LE04

Mircoflex mfr model # DFK-608-L

Mircoflex mfr model # DFK-608-XL
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

SECTION IV 
18 Gloves – Medical Examination 

Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
18.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.2 Size: Medium 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.3 Size: Large 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

18.4 Size: X-Large 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Comfort Grip CFG-900 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19 Gloves – Nitrile Exam Disposable Gloves 
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
19.1 Size: Small 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.2 Size: Medium 500 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.3 Size: Large 1000 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

19.4 Size: X-Large 300 Boxes
Specify Quantity/Number of Gloves in each dispenser box:
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Gloves per Case
Brand: Microflex Medical Corporation Ultraform UF-524 (No Substitution) 
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION IV 
SECTION V

20 Multi-Purpose Plastic Spray Bottle 3000 Each
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Spray Bottle with Trigger Sprayer per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

TOTAL SECTION V 

Vendor #  9 Vendor #  10 Vendor #  11

682-503-4484 713-939-7788 972-596-3350

Mavich LLC
525 Commerce Street
Southlake, Texas 76092

Orr Textile Company, Inc. 
4777 Blalock Rd.
Houston, Texas 77041

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
P.O. Box 260399
Plano, Texas 75026-0399

vendor extension $38,676.50

10.15 $3,045.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

9.99 $2,997.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

9.98 $4,990.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

9.99 $4,995.00 No Bid No Bid 
100

7-10 days

22.16 $6,648.00 No Bid No Bid 
300

7-10 days

22.18 $11,090.00 No Bid No Bid 
300

7-10 days

21.83 $21,830.00 No Bid No Bid 
300

7-10 days

21.87 $6,561.00 No Bid No Bid 
250

7-10 days

$62,156.00

25.19 $75,570.00 No Bid No Bid 
Pkg of 12

7-10 days

$75,570.00

Mircoflex mfr model # CFG-900-XL

Mircoflex mfr model # UF-524-S

Mircoflex mfr model # CFG-900-S

Mircoflex mfr model # CFG-900-M

Mircoflex mfr model # CFG-900-L

Mircoflex mfr model # UF-524-XL

Tough Guy item # 2ZWN8

Mircoflex mfr model # UF-524-M

Mircoflex mfr model # UF-524-L
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TABULATION SHEET

2017-065-6689 Contract for the Purchase of Janitorial Supplies
Bid Open: August 28, 2017

Contract Period November 21, 2017  thru  November 20, 2018 with Three (3) 
additional options to extend 

SECTION VI
21 Disposable Bouffant Hair Cap Net 100 Boxes

Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Bouffant Hair Cap Net in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

22 Disposable Beard Cover with Elastic String 50 Boxes
Sanitation and quality in accordance with the FDA standards 
Specify Quantity/Number of Beard Cover  in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Number of  Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

23 Rolled-Rim Paper Cone Cups for Igloo Cooler 1 Case
Specify Quantity/Number of Cone Cup in each sleeve
Specify Quantity/Number of  Cone Cups per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
Specify Deliver:__________ DAYS A.R.O

24 Facial Tissue (100 tissue per box) 50 Boxes
Brand: Kimberly Clark Kleenex 21606 (No substitution)
Specify Quantity/Number of Tissues in each dispenser box
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Dispenser Box per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Being Proposed
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

TOTAL SECTION VI 

SECTION VII
25 Lysol Disinfectant Spray 10 Cans

Brand: Lysol REC 04675 (No substitution
Specify Number of Ounces per Aerosol Can 
Specify Other Lysol Fragrance Available at the same price
Specify Quantity/Total Number of Aerosol Can per Case
Specify Manufacturer Brand and Part Number ( (No Substitution)
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

TOTAL SECTION VII

GRAND TOTAL 

AWARD TOTAL 

Primary Contact Person

Secondary Contact Person

Vendor #  9 Vendor #  10 Vendor #  11

682-503-4484 713-939-7788 972-596-3350

Mavich LLC
525 Commerce Street
Southlake, Texas 76092

Orr Textile Company, Inc. 
4777 Blalock Rd.
Houston, Texas 77041

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
P.O. Box 260399
Plano, Texas 75026-0399

6.71 $671.00 No Bid 11.55 $1,155.00

Pkg of 100 Bag - 100

7-10 days 30 days

4.15 $207.50 No Bid 14.50 $725.00

Pkg of 100 100

7-10 days 30 days

5.34 $5.34 No Bid No Bid 
200
200

7-10 days

50.84 $2,542.00 No Bid No Bid 

30

$3,425.84 $1,880.00
Did not quote on all item in 
section 6

80.20 $802.00 No Bid No Bid 
vendor extension $80.20

12

$802.00
vendor extension $80.20

$460,874.24 $231,860.16 $331,520.80
vendor extension $456,144.44

$62,156.00

Faith Gordon 682-503-4484 Phillip Francis 713-939-7788 Kasey Hollon 972-596-3350

Kesley Aslett 682-503-4484 Hillary Orr Francis 713-939-7788 Kristin Mason 972-596-3350

Georgia Pacific mfr model # 48560

Lysol mfr model # REC 04675

Cellucap Mfr model # BIX4BM

Condor item # 1TTV4

Grainger approved item # 25K814

125

19 oz.

sales@mavich.com

sales@mavich.com

phillip@orrtextile.com

hilary@orrtextile.com 

100/bag x 10 = 1,000 per case
Chef Revival BC1000

khollon@pascoinc.net

100/bag x 10 = 1,000 per case
Chef Revival BCAP 110CW

kmason@pascoinc.net

mailto:sales@mavich.com
mailto:sales@mavich.com
mailto:phillip@orrtextile.com
mailto:hilary@orrtextile.com
mailto:khollon@pascoinc.net
mailto:kmason@pascoinc.net
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