
Bid #2022-016-6931 - Purchase of food trays

 

Creation Date   Jan 20, 2022 End Date Mar 10, 2022 2:00:00 PM CST

Start Date Jan 27, 2022 8:40:07 AM CST Awarded Date   Not Yet Awarded

 2022-016-6931--01-01   3 compartment hot disposable trays

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Oliver Packaging & Equipment Company   First Offer -  $0.00     4800 / case $0.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.   First Offer -  $0.00     4800 / case $0.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: **NO BID** 

 

Grady's Foodservice Equipment & Supplies   First Offer -  $0.00     4800 / case $0.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: NO BID

Supplier Notes:  

BAY PROMO LLC   First Offer -  $160.86     4800 / case $772,128.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

 

Pasco Brokerage Inc   First Offer -  $199.40     4800 / case $957,120.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

Minimum order 336 cases 

 

ConServ Flag Company [Ad]      First Offer -  $203.89     4800 / case $978,672.00     Y

Product Code: 51451 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TR-SC-U10TL-LF

Supplier Notes: 

29oz Fiber Container Lined 3-Compartment 400/case 

 

 2022-016-6931--01-02   3 compartment Entre'e Dish Trays

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Grady's Foodservice Equipment & Supplies   First Offer -  $0.00     750 / case $0.00     Y

Product Code: 630-410 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: NO BID

Supplier Notes:  

BAY PROMO LLC   First Offer -  $141.09     750 / case $105,817.50     Y

Product Code: 630-410 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

 

Cook's Direct Inc.   First Offer -  $184.50     750 / case $138,375.00   Y Y

Product Code: 630-410 Supplier Product Code: 630-410GR
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:  

ConServ Flag Company [Ad]      First Offer -  $238.89     750 / case $179,167.50     Y

Product Code: 630-410 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-410

Supplier Notes:  

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.   First Offer -  $323.16     750 / case $242,370.00     Y

Product Code: 630-410 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-410GR

Supplier Notes:  

 2022-016-6931--01-03   5 compartment Food Trays

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Pasco Brokerage Inc   First Offer -  $70.80     400 / case $28,320.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes:  

BAY PROMO LLC   First Offer -  $76.66     400 / case $30,664.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

 

Cook's Direct Inc.   First Offer -  $79.00     400 / case $31,600.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-445T

Supplier Notes:  

ConServ Flag Company [Ad]      First Offer -  $79.89     400 / case $31,956.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: T-500

Supplier Notes:  

Grady's Foodservice Equipment & Supplies   First Offer -  $92.23     400 / case $36,892.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TP-500

Supplier Notes:  

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.   First Offer -  $133.60     400 / case $53,440.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TP-500

Supplier Notes:  

 2022-016-6931--01-04   2 compartment Silicone Flex Trays

 Supplier Unit Price    Qty/Unit Total Price   Attch.  Docs

Grady's Foodservice Equipment & Supplies   First Offer -  $0.00     400 / case $0.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: NO BID

Supplier Notes:  

BAY PROMO LLC   First Offer -  $206.06     400 / case $82,424.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 

Supplier Notes: 

Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

 

Cook's Direct Inc.   First Offer -  $212.00     400 / case $84,800.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-412DB

Supplier Notes:  

ConServ Flag Company [Ad]      First Offer -  $238.89     400 / case $95,556.00     Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-221B

Supplier Notes:  

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.   First Offer -  $323.16     400 / case $129,264.00   Y Y

Product Code: 

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 630-412DB

Supplier Notes:  
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Supplier Totals

f   Grady's Foodservice Equipment & Supplies $36,892.00    (4/4 items)

 Bid Contact  Jamie Arguello 

sales@gogradys.com 

Ph 719-542-8853  

 Address  170 Greenhorn Dr

Pueblo, CO 81004

 Bid Notes   Please see attached quote for notes.

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Please see attached quote for notes. 

Head Attch:

 

f   ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. $425,074.00    (4/4 items)

 Bid Contact  Lacy Key 

biddesk@icswaco.com 

Ph 254-751-1566  

 Address  PO Box 21056

Waco, TX 76702

 Bid Notes   **PLEASE SEE ATTACHMENT- FULL BID**

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

**PLEASE SEE ATTACHMENT- FULL

BID** 

Head Attch:

 

f   BAY PROMO LLC $991,033.50    (4/4 items)

 Bid Contact  HUMBERTO ARGUELLO 

bids@baypromo.net 

Ph 813-439-9638  

 Address  6201 Johns Road, Suite 9

Tampa, FL 33634

 Bid Notes   Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Delivery 70-80 days after PO received. 

Head Attch:

 

f   ConServ Flag Company [Ad]    $1,285,351.50    (4/4 items)

 Bid Contact  emil assad 

conservflag@conservflag.com 

Ph 308-254-4720   

Fax 308-254-2419

 Address  1003 Illinois Street

Sidney, NE 69162

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:

 

  Pasco Brokerage Inc $985,440.00    (2/4 items)

 Bid Contact  Kasey Hollon 

khollon@pascoinc.net 

Ph 972-596-3350  

 Address  6465 Chase Oaks Blvd

Plano, TX 75023

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

  Cook's Direct Inc. $254,775.00    (3/4 items)

 Bid Contact  TERI TECLAW 

tteclaw@cooksdirect.com 

Ph 800-956-5571  

 Address  27725 DIEHL RD

WARRENVILLE, IL 60555

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

  Oliver Packaging & Equipment Company $0.00    (1/4 items)

 Bid Contact  Mindy Toner 

mtoner@oliverquality.com 

Ph 800-253-3893  

 Address  3236 Wilson Drive, NW

Walker, MI 49534

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet. However, the listing of the bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet
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shall not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being

responsive. The agency will make a determination as to the responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws,

purchasing guidelines and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The agency will notify the successful

vendor upon award of the contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received may be available for inspection at that time.
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