

IFB 2023-2024-014-6981 Refrigerant, Chemical and Battery Recycle and Disposal Service

Vendor 1
Green Planet, Inc
6371 State Highway 276
Royce City, TX 75189
972-636-3948
Virginia Belmont
vbelmont@greenplanetinc.com

Vendor 2
United Electronic Recycling
505 Airline DR
Coppell, TX 75019
972-632-0570
Elizabeth Keller
elizabethk@uer-team.com

Vendor 3
Ventrex Environmental Services LLC
P.O. Box 6202
Fort Worth, TX 76140
817-615-4080
John-David Rodriguez
jventressupport@ventrex.es.net

Vendor 4 - NO BID
The Clearing Guys, LLC dba CG Environmental
5255 Teague Road
Fort Worth, TX 76140
817-483-8181
Tash Kilgore
tash.kilgore@clearingguys.com

No.	Item Description	Unit of Measure	Five-Year Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Five-Year Extended Price	Unit Price	Five-Year Extended Price	Unit Price	Five-Year Extended Price	
Batteries										
1	1 NiCd (AAA-D Cell)	Pound	750	0.65	487.50	1.00	750.00	2.62	1,965.00	NO BID
2	2 NiCd (c/llr pack)	Pound	1,000	0.65	650.00	1.00	1,000.00	2.62	2,620.00	NO BID
3	3 Lithium Polymer	Pound	250	2.35	587.50	1.00	250.00	2.62	655.00	NO BID
4	4 Lithium Ion (AAA-D Cell and drill packs)	Pound	500	2.35	1,175.00	1.00	500.00	2.62	1,310.00	NO BID
5	5 Sealed Lead Acid	Pound	900	0.50	450.00	1.00	900.00	1.09	981.00	NO BID
6	6 Lead Acid	Pound	300	0.50	150.00	1.00	300.00	1.09	327.00	NO BID
7	7 8D Heavy Duty Battery	Each	35	0.50	18.00	150.00	5,400.00	10.00	360.00	NO BID
Radio Batteries										
8	8 Nickel Metal Hydride 98%	Pound	2,100	0.65	1,365.00	1.00	2,100.00	2.62	5,502.00	NO BID
9	9 Nickel Cadmium	Pound	300	0.58	174.00	1.00	300.00	2.62	786.00	NO BID
10	10 Lithium Ion	Pound	300	2.35	705.00	1.00	300.00	2.62	786.00	NO BID
Group Total					2,665.00		2,700.00		7,074.00	
Paint/Seal										
11	11 Oil Based Paint	Gallon	30	6.50	195.00	NO BID		8.00	240.00	NO BID
12	12 Water Based Paint	Gallon	30	4.00	120.00	NO BID		5.20	156.00	NO BID
13	13 Mineral Spirits	Gallon	30	4.00	120.00	NO BID		7.80	234.00	NO BID
14	14 Paint Strripper	Gallon	15	6.50	97.50	NO BID		13.33	199.95	NO BID
15	15 Primer	Ounce	180	0.50	90.00	NO BID		0.83	149.40	NO BID
16	16 Solvent	Ounce	40	0.50	20.00	NO BID		2.00	80.00	NO BID
Group Total					642.50				1,059.35	
Grease										
17	17 Synthetic Grease	Ounce	150	0.25	37.50	NO BID		0.80	120.00	NO BID
18	18 Non-synthetic Grease	Ounce	150	0.25	37.50	NO BID		0.80	120.00	NO BID
Group Total					75.00				240.00	
Oil										
19	19 Gear Oil	Gallon	60	1.54	92.40	NO BID		3.33	199.80	NO BID
20	20 Hydraulic Oil	Gallon	3,000	3.00	9,000.00	NO BID		7.00	21,000.00	NO BID
21	21 Motor Oil	Gallon	15	1.54	23.10	NO BID		8.00	120.00	NO BID
22	22 Used Oil Filters	Each	90	1.54	138.60	NO BID		3.00	270.00	NO BID
Group Total					3,254.10				2,689.80	
Refrigerant										
23	23 R22	Pound	90	2.50	225.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
24	24 R134A	Pound	90	2.50	225.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
25	25 R12	Pound	90	2.50	225.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
26	26 R408	Pound	90	2.50	225.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
27	27 R2502	Pound	90	2.50	225.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
Group Total					1,125.00					
Coolant										
28	28 Diesel Generator Antifreeze	Gallon	1,500	1.54	2,310.00	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
Group Total					2,310.00					
Lights										
30	30 Fluorescent Tube Lights- Less than 4 feet	Each	3,000	0.85	2,550.00	2.00	6,000.00	1.08	3,240.00	NO BID
31	31 Fluorescent Tube Lights- 4 feet and greater	Each	60,000	1.00	60,000.00	2.00	120,000.00	2.00	120,000.00	NO BID
32	32 Fluorescent Tube Lights- CFLS	Each	3,000	1.00	3,000.00	2.00	6,000.00	4.50	13,500.00	NO BID
33	33 Metal Halide	Each	60	1.00	60.00	2.00	120.00	4.50	270.00	NO BID
34	34 Mercury Vapor	Each	60	1.00	60.00	2.00	120.00	4.50	270.00	NO BID
35	35 High Pressure Sodium Lamps	Each	60	2.35	141.00	2.00	120.00	4.50	270.00	NO BID
36	36 LED	Each	30	1.00	30.00	2.00	60.00	1.05	31.50	NO BID
37	37 Ballasts	Each	1,500	2.50	3,750.00	1.00	1,500.00	2.10	3,150.00	NO BID
Group Total					69,591.00		133,920.00		140,731.50	
Televisions										
38	38 Televisions	Pound	8,000	0.45	3,600.00	0.25	2,000.00	1.05	8,400.00	NO BID
Group Total					3,600.00		2,000.00		8,400.00	
Other										
39	39 Pick up and mobilization fee	Each	20	350.00	7,000.00	250.00	5,000.00	NO BID		NO BID
Group Total					7,000.00		5,000.00			
Group Total					7,000.00		5,000.00			
+/- Discount (must be expressed as a percentage)										
Batteries not listed @										
\$0.65/pound										
+/- services for additional items not listed @										
\$1.54/gallon										
Grease waste not listed @										
\$1.54/gallon										
Grand Total					\$30,000		30,000.00		30,000.00	
Grand Total					123,380.60		182,720.00		198,412.65	
Total Recommendation by Group					\$		\$		\$	
+/- Discount (must be expressed as a percentage)										
Batteries not listed @										
\$1.00/dollar										
+/- services for additional items not listed @										
\$1.00/dollar										
Grease waste not listed @										
\$1.00/dollar										