
Item 
Number

Description Specify Brand and Item 
Number
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Unit of 
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Extended 
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Extended 
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1

Insulated Foam Cup - 8 oz. size
1000 per case Brand: Dart or 
equal
Item # 8J8

1,095 case

 $                         36.59 40,066.05$                    $                         37.25 40,788.75$                    NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

2
Lids for Insulated Foam Cup 8 
oz. size, 1000 per
carton Dart Item # 8SL

1,095 carton
 $                         29.56 32,368.20$                    $                         21.52 23,564.40$                    NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

3
Heavy-Duty Aluminum Foil Size: 
18” x 1000
Brand: Reynolds or equal
Reynolds Stock # 625

3,600 rolls

 $                         35.76 128,736.00$                  $                         62.14 223,704.00$                  NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

4

Poly Gloves, disposable, large, 
10/1000 ct.
Brand Food Service Essentials 
(FSE) No. 630- 520, Rofson 
Associates No.
DGB604L or equal

300 case

 $                         40.08 12,024.00$                    $                         27.54 8,262.00$                      NO BID NO BID  $                         55.50 16,650.00$                   

5

Aprons, large disposable, 28” X 
46”, 10/100 ct.
Brand Food Service Essentials 
(FSE) No. 630-
530 or equal

300 case

 $                         67.02 20,106.00$                    $                         47.63 14,289.00$                    NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

6

Pan Release Liners, regular 
bakery, 16-3/8” X 24-3/8” 1000 
sheets/case
Brand Bagcraft Papercon Stock # 
P032027 No. 25Q2
or equal

300 case

 $                         61.63 18,489.00$                    $                         44.76 13,428.00$                    NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

7

Re-closable Freezer Storage 
Bags, Microwavable and Kosher, 
Thickness:1.7 mil (minimum),
Size: Quart,
Brand: Zip Loc or equal

75 case

 NO BID NO BID  $                         14.33 1,074.75$                      NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

8

Plastic Polypropylene Spoons
Cutlery – Heavy Weight 1000 per 
case
Brand:  Dixie or equal  Item 
#PTH51

3,600 case

 $                         62.94 226,584.00$                  $                         15.28 55,008.00$                    NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID

9

Sandwich Bags
High Density Polyethylene Bags 
0.36 MIL
6.5 IN. x 7 IN. + 1 IN. FLIP
+ 1 IN. LIP 2000
BAGS/CASE International Platics 
Stock # FOD0607

2,400 case

12.43$                          29,832.00$                   8.83$                            21,192.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10

Plastic Polypropylene Forks 
Cutlery – Heavy Weight 1000 per 
case Brand:  Dixie or equal Stock 
# SSPH51

300 case

62.94$                          18,882.00$                   15.28$                          4,584.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

11

Plastic Polypropylene Knives
Cutlery – Heavy Weight
1000 per case Dixie Stock # 
PKH51

60 case

62.94$                          3,776.40$                     15.62$                          937.20$                        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

12

Plastic Polypropylene Cutlery – 
Medium Weight, Type: Spork, 
1000 per case, Brand:  Dixie or 
equal
Stock #CMP21C

1,095 case

10.39$                          11,377.05$                   10.15$                          11,114.25$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

13
Insulated Foam Cup - 14 oz. size, 
1000 per case, Brand:  Dart or 
equal Stock
# 14J16

45 case

67.16$                          3,022.20$                     54.83$                          2,467.35$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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14
Lids for Insulated Foam
Cup 14 oz. size Dart or Equal 
Stock #14/16/SL

45,000 each
0.03$                            1,529.55$                     0.03$                            1,190.25$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

15
Insulated Foam Cup - 10 oz. size, 
1000 per case, Brand:  Dart or 
equal Stock
#10J10

60 case

45.98$                          2,758.80$                     37.53$                          2,251.80$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

16
Lids for Insulated Foam Cup 10 
oz. size, 1000 per case Dart or 
Equal Stock #
10 SL

60,000 each

0.03$                            2,094.60$                     0.03$                            1,524.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

17

Paper Dinner Napkins Dixie 
Brand or Equal
10,800 per case
1-Ply, Universal dispenser 
napkins, 13"X8.5" Brown - Dixie 
Item # ID37604

120 case

67.73$                          8,127.60$                     74.86$                          8,983.20$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18

Foam 5-Compartment School 
Luncy Tray,Pactiv Brand or Equal 
Item # YTh10500- SGBX
Package/Bag Sleeve Wrap Color: 
WhitePS-Foan 
10.25X8.25X1.125 inch
500 per case

900 case

35.30$                          31,770.00$                   29.44$                          26,496.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

19

9” Dinner Plate – Heavy Duty 
Laminated Round Foam 
500/Case
Color: White Dart or Equal
Dart MFR # 9PWQR

15 case

38.83$                          582.45$                        30.93$                          463.95$                        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

20

Foam Hinged Lid Containers - 
Laminated 3 Compartments and 
Insulated
Size: 8X7X2.25 inch Color: White 
Package/Wrap
200 per case
brand: Dart or equal 
YHD38SS002000

60 case

28.81$                          1,728.60$                     19.38$                          1,162.80$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

21

Duro Brand #70208 or Equal  8 
lb. 6 1/8 X 41/8 X 12 7/16 Heavy 
Duty Lion Flat Bottom Paper 
Husky Bag Brown
500 per Bundle

6 case

21.26$                          127.56$                        18.18$                          109.08$                        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

593,982.06$                 462,594.78$                 -$                              16,650.00$                   

22

Teaspoon - h.d. polycarbonate, 
dishwasher safe, FDA approved, 
6” length, Color: Beige, Design 
Specialties Duralux No. BT- 212 
or equal, Case pack 432 each

250,000 each

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.08$                            20,000.00$                   0.11$                            27,500.00$                   

23
Oven Mitt - 15"
Winco Model# OMF-15 or equal 375 pair

NO BID NO BID 6.17$                            2,313.75$                     7.30$                            2,737.50$                     13.81$                          5,178.75$                     

24

Rubber Gloves - medium weight, 
regular cuff, Size: Large
Brand San Jamar No. 620-L
or equal 1dozen

3,870 dozen

17.56$                          67,957.20$                   6.14$                            23,761.80$                   8.48$                            32,817.60$                   22.20$                          85,914.00$                   

25
Polyethylene Sleeves, 18” length, 
Color: Emerald 5082 200/case 150 case

38.25$                          5,737.50$                     61.43$                          9,214.50$                     71.25$                          10,687.50$                   NO BID NO BID

26

Aprons, Vinyl,  Thickness: 6 Mil. 
Dimensions: 33" W x 44" L, 
Color: Blue, 6 dozen/case
Brand Ansell No. 56015 or
equal 12/case

2,700 dozen

140.23$                        378,621.00$                 11.17$                          30,159.00$                   19.95$                          53,865.00$                   NO BID NO BID

27

Clear Food Storage Boxes - full 
size, 18" x 26" x 15"
Brand Watson #035188, Carlisle 
#1062407 or equal
6 Each Per Case

3,000 each

86.48$                          259,440.00$                 29.67$                          89,010.00$                   69.54$                          208,620.00$                 50.80$                          152,400.00$                 

Group B Kitchen Supplies



28
Clear Food Storage Lids, Full 
size: 18” x 26” X 15” Brand  
Carlisle No. 1062707
or equal

1,500 each

24.10$                          36,150.00$                   14.77$                          22,155.00$                   28.50$                          42,750.00$                   14.10$                          21,150.00$                   

29

Tumbler, Sentry Series, poly-TPE-
29 material, 9-1/2 oz., color: 
orange, dishwasher and 
microwave safe Sentry Series 48 
Per Case
Brand Cook’s Direct #630-
310SSN or equal

45,000 each

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.00$                            45,000.00$                   1.45$                            65,250.00$                   

30

Bar Towel, 100% Cotton 
Herringbone Weave, Size: 16" x 
25", Color: White with Green 
Center Stripe 288
Per Case By Dozen

7,500 dozen

44.93$                          336,975.00$                 10.66$                          79,950.00$                   13.95$                          104,625.00$                 23.40$                          175,500.00$                 

31

Pansaver 3.0 mil multilayered 
clipped 10” x 30” bags M&Q 
Plastic #43105
400 bags per case

300 case

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 295.00$                        88,500.00$                   NO BID NO BID

32

Oven gloves - "Hi-Lo" 
temperature style, Neox, 
insulated lining, neoprene coated, 
12” gauntlet style Brand Ansell 
Edmont No. 9-
022 or equal

75 pair

NO BID NO BID 18.19$                          1,364.25$                     34.25$                          2,568.75$                     NO BID NO BID

33
Aluminum Sheet Pan, 14 gauge, 
18” X 26” X 2-1/2” Brand Vollrath 
No. 68357 or
equal

72 each

NO BID NO BID 14.97$                          1,077.84$                     47.98$                          3,454.56$                     62.65$                          4,510.80$                     

34
Aluminum Sheet Pan, 18 gauge, 
18” X 26” X 1” Brand Vollrath No. 
9002 or
equal

72 each

NO BID NO BID 10.37$                          746.64$                        12.98$                          934.56$                        20.50$                          1,476.00$                     

35
Perforated Turner, 8" x 3" Offset 
Blade,
Brand Winco No.PC7410 or
equal

36 each

NO BID NO BID 3.75$                            135.00$                        3.75$                            135.00$                        5.00$                            180.00$                        

36

Storage Containers, 
polypropylene, Color: Natural 
White, 8 quart Brand Carlisle No. 
0800 or
equal  PES-8 Packed 12

36 case

NO BID NO BID 59.36$                          2,136.96$                     79.85$                          2,874.60$                     74.40$                          2,678.40$                     

37

Storage Containers, 
polypropylene, Color: Natural 
White, 12 quart Brand Carlisle 
No. 1200 or
equal PES-12 Packed 12

36 case

NO BID NO BID 51.16$                          1,841.76$                     71.62$                          2,578.32$                     59.40$                          2,138.40$                     

38

Storage Containers, 
polypropylene, Color: Natural 
White, 18 quart Brand Carlisle 
#1800 or
equal  PES-18

36 case

NO BID NO BID 60.35$                          2,172.60$                     86.79$                          3,124.44$                     71.40$                          2,570.40$                     

39

Storage Containers, 
polypropylene, Color: Natural 
White, 22 quart Brand Carlisle 
#220002 or
equal Packed 6

36 case

NO BID NO BID 69.53$                          2,503.08$                     93.80$                          3,376.80$                     82.80$                          2,980.80$                     

40
Pocket dial thermometer, - 40 to 
160 degrees F, Winco Model 
#TMT-P2 or
equal

75 each

NO BID NO BID 3.28$                            246.00$                        3.81$                            285.75$                        4.00$                            300.00$                        

1,084,880.70$              268,788.18$                 628,935.38$                 549,727.55$                 

41

Clear Food Service Plastic (PVC)
Film Rolls with cutter box Roll 
Width: 18”
Size: 18” x 2000’
Brand: Reynolds or equal

2,700 case

25.99$                          70,173.00$                   14.46$                          39,042.00$                   NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

42

Polyester Tray Sealing Film 48 
gal OWF Mylar
Width : 19” / OD : 12” / Core : 3”  
110 lb. roll

3,000 rolls

NO BID NO BID 253.90$                        761,700.00$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Group C Wraps and Related Supplies Meal Process Sealing Machine



43

Stretch Wrap Film with build in 
dispenser
Size  20” x 1000’, 80 gauge 
thickness
Width : 18” / OD : 12” / Core : 3” 
10,000 rolls 110 lb. roll

30,000 rolls

40.68$                          1,220,250.00$              11.45$                          343,500.00$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

44

Vented Produce Bags Made By 
Elkay Plastics, Stock
/Item PBZ11104BG Size:11" 
X10"+4'' BG
Thickness: 2.5 Mil, 250 per
case

7,700 case

NO BID NO BID 26.50$                          204,050.00$                 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1,290,423.00$              1,348,292.00$              -$                              -$                              

45

Reckitt Benckiser Pro 
Commercial Use  Fume Free - 
Easy Off Max Oven Cleaner, 
Foam,Lemon, 6/24 oz./case Or 
Equal Item #
RAC85260

75 case

62.06$                          4,654.50$                     46.92$                          3,519.00$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

46

Commercial/Institutional Scouring 
Pads Type: Heavy Duty
Size: 6" x 9" Color: Green
Brand: 3M Scotch Brite
MCO86 or equal

300 case

4.85$                            1,455.00$                     51.16$                          15,348.00$                   NO BID NO BID 70.20$                          21,060.00$                   

47
Institutional Steel Wool Soap 
Pads
Brand: Clorox SOS 88320
or equal

45 case

51.07$                          2,298.15$                     51.69$                          2,326.05$                     NO BID NO BID 57.00$                          2,565.00$                     

48

Disinfectant Scouring Powder
Cleanser - Institutional Strength
Bottle Size: 24/ 21 oz./case 
Brand:  Ajax, Comet or equal  
MFR Model # 114278 60 case

37.27$                          2,236.20$                     36.66$                          2,199.60$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

49

All Purpose Cleaner and 
Degreaser 
Institutional/Commercial Strength
Ready to Use Formula Bottle 
Size: 12/ 32 oz per case. Trigger 
Bottle Brand: Professional 
Formula 409 or equal Item
# CLO35306

180 case

46.14$                          8,305.20$                     48.07$                          8,652.60$                     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18,949.05$                   32,045.25$                   -$                              23,625.00$                   

50

Sterno Brand Handi Fuel or 
Equal 5.99oz, 72/2 HRS Per 
Case, Sterno Stock #20660 6 each

1.41$                            8.46$                            1.04$                            6.24$                            NO BID NO BID 1.08$                            6.48$                            

8.46$                            6.24$                            -$                              6.48$                            

Total 2,988,243.27$              2,111,726.45$              628,935.38$                 590,009.03$                 

Group Vendor Amount
A Pollock Paper Distributors  $         462,594.78 
B Cook's Direct Inc  $         628,935.38 
C Pollock Paper Distributors  $      1,348,292.00 
D Empire Paper  $           18,949.05 
E Pollock Paper Distributors  $                    6.24 

Group E Kitchen Fuel

Group D Cleaning Supplies


