TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe) No No
Dallas County Taxpayer? No No
How were you notified? Currently Doing Business Dallas County Website
Addendum Returned?
Recommend for Award: Recommend for
Items: 1-6, 8-12, 14-16, 18, 20- Award: Items: 95, 96,
23, 30, 32, 43-51, 58063, 65-72, 121, 124, & 125
77-80, 82-83, 85-88, 92-94, 97-
104, 106-107, 109-113, 115-
116, 118, 120, 122-123, 126,
128, 130
Snack Products
1. Cracker - Ritz Type 1 case 14.91 14.91 No Bid
Size: 10-16 oz. box (maximum)
Specify Size Being Proposed 40z
Specify Quantity per Case 20
Specify Brand Being Bid Ritz 817411
2. Potato Chips — Plain - One serving bag |50 cases 27.30 1,365.00 No Bid
Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.5 0z
Specify Quantity per Case 64
Specify Brand Being Bid Lay's 816769
3. Potato Chips — BBQ, One serving bag - |70 cases 27.30 1,911.00 No Bid
Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.12 oz
Specify Quantity per Case 64
Specify Brand Being Bid Lay's 816777
4. Potato Chips — Sour Cream, One serving |20 cases 26.09 521.80 No Bid
bag - Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.5 0z
Specify Quantity per Case 64
Specify Brand Being Bid Lay's 816785
5. Potato Chips — Baked, One serving bag, |10 cases 27.30 273.00 No Bid

Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.12 oz
Specify Flavor Available: Regular
Specify Quantity per Case 64

Specify Brand Being Bid

Lay's 816819
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
6. Corn Chips — Plain, One serving bag - |20 cases 29.14) $ 582.80 No Bid
Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.125 oz
Specify Quantity per Case 104
Specify Brand Being Bid Fritos 816959
7. Corn Chips — BBQ, One serving bag, 20 cases | No Bid No Bid
Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed
Specify Quantity per Case
Specify Brand Being Bid
8. Cheese Twists or Cheetos Crunch, One |20 cases 29.97| $ 599.40 No Bid
serving bag - Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 10z
Specify Quantity per Case 104
Specify Brand Being Bid Cheetos 817002
9. Cheese Twists or Cheetos Baked, One |20 cases 24.23|'$ 484.60 No Bid
serving bag , Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.5 0z
Specify Quantity per Case 64
Specify Brand Being Bid Cheetos 818021
10. Tortilla Chips — Nacho Cheese Flavor, |20 cases 30.25) $ 605.00 No Bid
One serving bag, Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 10z
Specify Quantity per Case 104
Specify Brand Being Bid Doritos 816926
11. Tortilla Chips — Ranch Flavor, One 20 cases 30.25) $ 605.00 No Bid
serving bag , Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 10z
Specify Quantity per Case 104
Specify Brand Being Bid Doritos 816918
12. Tortilla Chips — Baked Nacho Cheese |10 cases 27.20| $ 272.00 No Bid
Flavor, One serving bag, Size: 1.5 oz. or
less bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed 1.37 oz
Specify Quantity per Case 64.00
Specify Brand Being Bid Doritos 816597
13. Tortilla Chips — Corn Plain, One serving|5 cases | No Bid No Bid

bag - Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2
Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer

4151 Blue Mound Rd.

18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify Brand Being Bid

14. Round or Triangle Nacho Chips
Size: 2-4 pound box (bulk package)

cases

13.94

139.40

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

2#

Specify Quantity per Case

6

Specify Brand Being Bid

Mission 908087

15. Pretzel — Twist, One serving bag - Size:

1.5 oz. or less bags

cases

17.08

85.40

No Bid

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

1oz

Specify Quantity per Case

88

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rold Gold 817049

16. Popcorn — Un-popped, Yellow Bulk
Size: 35-50 pounds (maximum)

cases

21.78

21.78

No Bid

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

50#

Specify Quantity per Case

1

Specify Brand Being Bid

Packer 875690

17. Popcorn — Plain Butter Flavor, One
serving bag, Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

18. Popcorn — Cheese Flavor, One serving
bag - Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags

cases

14.05

70.25

No Bid

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

0.5 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

72

Specify Brand Being Bid

Lay's 813445

19. Cracker Jacks - One serving bag
Size: 1.5 oz. or less bags

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

20. Crackers — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Peanut Butter, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 1.5 oz. or less package

cases

24.94

249.40

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

1.38 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

144

Specify Brand Being Bid

Frito 815960
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

21. Crackers — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Toast-Peanut Butter, One serving,
Individual Wrapped, Size: 1.5 oz. or less

cases

22.75

$

227.50

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

8 count

Specify Quantity per Case

24

Specify Brand Being Bid

Austin 817312

22. Crackers — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Cheese-Peanut Butter, One serving,
Individual Wrapped,Size: 1.5 oz. or less
package

cases

26.89

$

403.35

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

1.38 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

144

Specify Brand Being Bid

Frito 815894

23. Crackers — Honey Graham, One

serving, Individual Wrapped, Size: 1.5 oz.

or less bags

cases

12.46

$

24.92

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

2 count

Specify Quantity per Case

200

Specify Brand Being Bid

Keebler 818062

24. Crackers — Cheddar Cheese, One

serving, Individual Wrapped, Size: 1.5 oz.

or less bags

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

25. Granola Bar, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 1.6 oz. or less bar

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

26. Cookies — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Vanilla Créme, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 1.8 oz. or less package

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

27. Cookies — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Lemon Créme, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 1.8 oz. or less package

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc)

908.862.7570 (Ofc)

Annual Contract for the Purchase of

254.715.5004 (Cell)

908.862.9019 (Fax)

Staple and Non-Staple Food Items

817.626.2507 (Fax)

bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify Brand Being Bid

28. Cookies — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Chocolate w/Vanilla Créme, One serving,
Individual Wrapped, Size: 1.8 oz. or less
package

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

29. Cookies — Sandwich Type, Flavor:
Peanut Butter, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 1.8 oz. or less package

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

30. Cookies — Chocolate Chips, One
serving, Individual Wrapped, Size: 1.8 oz.
or less package

cases

15.62

$

156.20

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

4ct

Specify Quantity per Case

48

Specify Brand Being Bid

Chips Ahoy 817197

31. Cookies — Fig Newton, One serving,
Individual Wrapped, Size: 2.0 oz. or less
package

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

32. Cookies - Vanila Wafers in a moisture
proof lined container

case

No Bid

Size: 10-16 0z box (maximum)

Specify Size Being Proposed

13.3 oz

Specify Quantity per case

6

Specify Brand Being Bid

Keebler 816124

33. Snack Cake — Oatmeal Créme, One
serving, Individual Wrapped

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

34. Snack Cup Cake — Chocolate, One
serving, Individual Wrapped

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2
Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer

4151 Blue Mound Rd.

18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

35. Snack Cup Cake — Vanilla, One serving,
Individual Wrapped

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

36. Honey Bun, One serving, Individual
Wrapped

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

37. Pecan Pie, One serving, Individual
Wrapped

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

38. Cinnamon Roll, One serving, Individual
Wrapped

(8]

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

39. Donuts - Gems, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 3.0 oz. or less package

—

case

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

40. Donuts — Powdered, One serving,
Individual Wrapped, Size: 3.0 oz. or less
package

case

No bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

41. Donuts - Plain, One serving, Individual
Wrapped, Size: 3.0 oz. or less package

—

case

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
42. Donuts — Chocolate Covered, One 1 case No Bid No Bid
serving, Individual Wrapped,Size: 3.0 oz. or
less package
Specify Size Being Proposed
Specify Quantity per Case
Specify Brand Being Bid
43. Pastry - Muffins, One serving, 10 cases 16.69| $ 166.90 No Bid
Individual Wrapped, Size: 4.0 oz. or less
package, Otis Spinkmeyer or equal
Specify Flavor Available Chocolate Chip
Specify Size Being Proposed 40z
Specify Quantity per Case 24
Specify Brand Being Bid Otis Spunkmeyer 910554
44. Sugar Pure Cane — Individual Packets |60 cases 15.90 $ 954.00 No Bid
Specify Size Being Proposed 3 grams
Specify Quantity per Case 2000
Specify Brand Being Bid CD Hartnett 805473
45. Sugar Substitute - Individual Packets 20 cases 20.84 $ 416.80 No Bid
Specify Size Being Proposed 1 gram
Specify Quantity per Case 2000
Specify Brand Being Bid RPP/Sweet'N'Low 806166
46. Sugar Substitute - Individual Packets 5 cases 32.94 8 164.70 No Bid
Specify Size Being Proposed 1 gram
Specify Quantity per Case
Specify Brand Being Bid Splenda 808030
47. Creamer - Non Dairy 50 cases 37.94/$  1,897.00 No Bid
Individaul Packets
Specify Size Being Proposed 2.5 gram
Specify Quantity per case 2000
Specify Brand Being Bid Restaurant's Pride 845438
Beverages
48. Gatorade Thrist Quencher, Bottle Size: {400 cases 19.97|$  7,988.00 No Bid

20 oz. (maximum), Flavor: Assorted

Specify Bottle Size Being Proposed

20 oz

Specify Flavors Available:

Raspberry Blue 833699, Lemon
Lime 833715, Orange 833723,
Fruit Punch 833731, Fierce
Grape 834135

Specify Quantity per Case

24

Specify Brand Being Bid

Gatorade
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

49. Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered
Mix, Flavor: Lemonade
Yield: Two (2) Gallon

30

cases

23.73

$

711.90

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

24 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

12

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride 825919

50. Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered
Mix, Flavor: Pink Lemonade
Yield: Two (2) Gallon

70

cases

23.73

$

1,661.10

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

24 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

12

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride 825836

51. Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered
Mix, Flavor: Fruit Punch
Yield: Two (2) Gallon

70

cases

23.70

$

1,659.00

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

24 oz

Specify Quantity per Case

12

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride 82590

52. Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered
Mix, Flavor: Iced Tea
Yield: Two (2) Gallon

70

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

53. Drink Mix — Instant Gatorade Sport
Thrist Quencher Powdered Mix

Yield: Two and half (2.5) Gallons, Flavor:
Assorted

50

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Flavors Available:

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

54. Regular Ground Coffee — Urn, Size: 5
pounds

50

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

55. Oil - Corn 100% Pure

40

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Container Size: 35-50 pounds (maximum)
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

56. Shortening - All Vegetable

Case

No Bid

No Bid

Container Size: One (1) Gallon

Specify Size Being Proposed

Specify Quantity per Case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Non-Staple Food Items

57. Heavy-Duty Aluminum Foil Rolls - Roll

w

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

Specify the rolls per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

58. Heavy-Duty Aluminum Foil Rolls - Roll

cases

20.09

$

1,004.50

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

18" x 500

Specify the rolls per case

1 each

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride (western) 865568

59. Heavy-Duty Aluminum Foil Rolls - Roll

cases

41.94

$

12,582.00

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

18" x 1000

Specify the rolls per case

1 each

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride (western) 865600

60. Aluminum Interfolded Foil Sheets with
Self Dispensing Box, Sheets per box: 500,
Size: 9” x 10-3/4” , Brand: Reynolds or

cases

45.58

$

227.90

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

9" x 10-3/4"

Specify the number of sheets per case

3000 (6/500)

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest Pride (Reynolds)

61. Aluminum Interfolded Foil Sheets with
Self Dispensing Box, Sheets per box: 500,
Size: 12” x 10-3/4” , Brand: Reynolds or
equal

cases

52.69

$

263.45

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

12" x 10-3/4"

Specify the number of sheets per case

2400 (12/200)

Specify Brand Being Bid

Western 865410

62. Clear Food Service Plastic (PVC) Film

350

cases

12.29

$

4,301.50

No Bid

Specify Size Being Bid

18" x 2000

Specify the rolls per case

1 each

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rest. Pride (Western) 868018
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
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Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
63. Wax Paper Roll - FDA approved, 5 cases 37.67| $ 188.35 No Bid
Specify Size Being Bid 12" x 250
Specify the rolls per case 6
Specify Brand Being Bid Reynolds/Cot-Rite 847889
64. Kitchen Paper Towels - 1-Ply, White, |100 |cases | No Bid No Bid
Specify square feet per roll
Specify number sheet per roll
Specify the rolls per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
65. Paper Dinner Napkins, 1-Ply, 1/4 Fold, |40 cases 41.53] $ 1,661.20 No Bid
Specify Napkin Size 16.75 X 17
Specify number napkins per package 250
Specify the number napkins per case 4000
Specify Brand Being Bid Castaway 866723
66. Tall Fold Paper Dispenser Napkins - 1- |50 cases 30.64/$  1,532.00 No Bid
Specify Napkin Size 6" x 13" - folded: 3.78' x 6.75
Specify number napkins per package 250
Specify the number napkins per case 10000
Specify Brand Being Bid Castaway 866731
Cups and Plastic Lids
67. Insulated Foam Cup - 6 oz. size, 1000 |300 cases 12.34/$  3,702.00 No Bid
Specify the number of cups per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 859405
Specify cost for 6 oz. lids for the above $8.60
Specify the number of lids per case 1000 - 860809
68. Insulated Foam Cup - 8 oz. size, 1000 |300 cases 14.50/ $  4,350.00 No Bid
Specify the number of cups per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 859603
Specify cost for 8 oz. lids for the above $8.79
Specify the number of lids per case 1000 - 861005
69. Insulated Foam Cup - 10 oz. size, 1000 |2 cases 21.07| $ 42.14 No Bid
Specify the number of cups per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 859801
Specify cost for 10 oz. lids for the above $11.95
Specify the number of lids per case 1000 - 861203
70. Insulated Foam Cup - 14 oz. size, 1000 |60 cases 26.80 $ 1,608.00 No Bid
Specify the number of cups per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 860130
Specify cost for 14 oz. lids for the above 11.74
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
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Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify the number of lids per case

Dart 861401

71. Insulated Foam Cup - 16 oz. size, 1000

cases

29.53

$

885.90

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

1000

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 860353

Specify cost for 16 oz. lids for the above

11.74

Specify the number of lids per case

1000 - 861401

72. Clear Plastic Squat Cup - 9 oz. size,

cases

60.78

$

243.12

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

1000

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 863092

Specify cost for 9 oz. lids for the above

41.50

Specify the number of lids per case

1000 - 860072

73. Clear Plastic Cup - 10 oz. size, 1000 per

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Specify cost for 10 oz. lids for the above

Specify the number of lids per case

74. Clear Plastic Cup - 12 oz. size, 1000 per

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Specify cost for 12 oz. lids for the above

Specify the number of lids per case

75. Clear Plastic Cup - 16 oz. size, 1000 per

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Specify cost for 16 oz. lids for the above

Specify the number of lids per case

76. Plastic Tapered Cozy Cup Liner — 7 oz.

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of cups per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Paper, Foam and Plastic Dinnerware

77. 9” Dinner Plate — Non-Laminated,
Insulated, Deep Shoulders, Skid Proof
Surface, Color: White, Package/Bag Sleeve
Wrap, 500 per case, Brand: Dart or equal

cases

14.48

$

72.40

No Bid

Specify size being bid

o

Specify number of plates per package/bag:

125

Specify the number of plates per case

500

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 827261
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

78. 9” Dinner Plate — Laminated, Insulated,
Deep Shoulders, Skid Proof Surface, Color:
White, Package/Bag Sleeve Wrap, 500 per
case, Brand: Dart or equal

W

cases

21.25

106.25

No Bid

Specity size being bid

o

Specify number of plates per package/bag:

125

Specify the number of plates per case

500

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 867390

79. 9” Compartmented Dinner Plate — Non-
Laminated, Three (3) compartments,
Insulated, Deep Shoulders, Skid Proof
Surface, Color: White, Package/Bag Sleeve
Wrap, 500 per case, Brand: Dart or equal

cases

14.18

283.60

No Bid

Specity size being bid

o

Specify number of plates per package/bag:

125

Specify the number of plates per case

500

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 867267

80. 9” Compartmented Dinner Plate —
Laminated, Three (3) compartments,
Insulated, Deep Shoulders, Skid Proof
Surface, Color: White, Package/Bag Sleeve
Wrap, 500 per case, Brand: Dart or equal

cases

21.25

1,593.75

No Bid

Specity size being bid

o

Specify number of plates per package/bag:

125

Specify the number of plates per case

500

Specify Brand Being Bid

Dart 990135

81. 9” Compartmented Dinner Plate —

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify size being bid

Specify number of plates per package/bag:

Specify the number of plates per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

82. Foam 5-Compartment School Lunch
Tray with Deep Shoulders, Color: White,
Package/Bag Sleeve Wrap, 500 per case,
Brand: Pactiv TH1-500 or equal

40

cases

19.18

767.20

No Bid

Specify number of trays per package/bag

125

Specify the number of trays per case

500

Specify Brand Being Bid

Pactiv 826180

83. Foam 6-Compartment School Lunch

cases

23.40

234.00

No Bid

Specify number of trays per package/bag

125

Specify the number of trays per case

500
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
Specify Brand Being Bid Pactiv 820308
84. 9” Clear Dinner Plate — Heavy Duty, 5 cases | No Bid No Bid
Specity size being bid
Specify number of plates per package/bag:
Specify the number of plates per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
85. 10-12 oz. Bowls — Laminated, 35 cases 31.00/ $ 1,085.00 No Bid
Specity size being bid 12 oz
Specify number of bowls per package/bag: 125
Specify the number of bowls per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 852152
86. 10-12 0z. Bowls — Non-Laminated, 35 cases 16.70| $ 584.50 No Bid
Specity size being bid 12 oz
Specify number of bowls per package/bag: 125
Specify the number of bowls per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 852137
87. Foam Hinged Lid Containers - 20 cases 21.13/ 8 422.60 No Bid
Specify number of containers per 100
package/bag:
Specify the number of containers per case 200
Specify Brand Being Bid Dart 837518
Plastic Cutlery
88. Plastic Polypropylene Cutlery — Medium|450  |cases 7.50[$  3,375.00 No Bid
Specify the quantity per case 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Prime Source 990648
89. Plastic Polypropylene Cutlery — Heavy |[100 |cases | No Bid No Bid
Specify the quantity per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
90. Plastic Polypropylene Cutlery — Heavy |150 |cases | No Bid No Bid
Specify the quantity per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
91. Plastic Polypropylene Cutlery — Heavy |20 cases | No Bid No Bid

Specify the quantity per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Tooth picks
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
92. Wood Tooth Picks - Individual 2 cases 4.43 8.86 No Bid
Wrapped, 100 per box (minimum)
Specify the quantity per case 1000
Specify quantity per box: 1000
Specify Brand Being Bid Prime Source 831578
Kitchen Products and Chemicals
93. Reclosable Freezer Storage Bags, 10 cases 29.29 292.90 84.99 849.90
Specify the quantity per case 240 (12/20) 500/case
Specify Brand Being Bid Ziploc 848192 Central Poly
94. Reclosable Freezer Storage Bags, 10 cases 12.81 128.10 89.99 899.90
Specify the quantity per case 250 100/case
Specify Brand Being Bid Elkay 847038 Central Poly
95. Reclosable Freezer Storage Bags, 10 cases | No Bid 99.99 999.90
Microwavable and Kosher, Thickness: 2.7
mil (minimum), Size: Two Gallon, Brand:
Zip Loc or equal
Specify the quantity per case 100/case
Specify Brand Being Bid Central Poly
96. Reclosable Freezer Storage Bags, 5 cases | No Bid 109.99 549.95
Specify the quantity per case 250/case
Specify Brand Being Bid Central Poly
97. Sandwich Bags with dispensing box, 5 cases 13.85 69.25 No Bid
Bag Type: Fold Lock Top, Brand: Glad or
Specify the quantity per case 500
Specify Brand Being Bid Handgard 868232
98. Institutional Steel Wool Soap Pads, 15 cases 21.56 323.40 No Bid
Brand: Clorox SOS 88320 or equal
Specify the number of pads per case 12/10 ct
Specify Brand Being Bid S.0.S. 837138
99. Commercial/Institutional Scouring Pads, | 100 cases 18.00 1,800.00 No Bid
Specify the number of pads per case 60
Specify Brand Being Bid Royal 838417
100. Scrubbing Sponges - Type: Heavy 5 cases 38.93 194.65 No Bid
Specify the number of sponges per case 40
Specify Brand Being Bid Royal 838508
101. Stainless Steel Sponges - Type: Heavy |5 cases 31.12 155.60 No Bid

Specify the number of sponges per case

72
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
Specify Brand Being Bid Prime Source 837088
102. Griddle Cleaning Pads - Type: Heavy |2 cases 20.56 41.12 No Bid
Duty , Color: Green , Brand: 3M Scotch
Brite or equal
Specify the numer of pads per case 60
Specify Brand Being Bid Royal 838854
103. Heavy Duty Foam Oven Cleaner - 2 cases 47.88 95.76 No Bid
Bottle/Can Size: 16 oz. (minimum), Brand:
Easy —Off or equal
Specify the ounce per bottle/can 16
Specify the number bottles/cans per case 12
Specify Brand Being Bid Easy Off 835959
104. Liquid Griddle Cleaner - Ready to 2 cases 40.60 81.20 No Bid
Use, Bottle Size: One (1) Gallon
Specify the ounce per bottle 128
Specify the number bottles per case 4
Specify Brand Being Bid CMC/Oven Lov'n 836973
105. Furniture Polish - Aerosol Can, Lemon |2 cases | No Bid No Bid
Scent, Bottle/Can Size: 12 oz. (minimum),
Brand: Pledge or equal
Specify the ounce per bottle/can
Specify the number bottles/cans per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
106. Liquid Bleach - Bottle Size: 96 ounce |90 cases 12.14 1,092.60 No Bid
(minimum), Brand: Clorox or equal
Specify the ounce per bottle 96
Specify the number bottles per case 6
Specify Brand Being Bid Clorox Ultra 836726
107. Disinfectant Scouring Powder Cleanser|20 cases 26.73 534.60 No Bid
- Institutional Strength, Bottle Size: 21 oz.
(minimum), Brand: Ajax, Comet or equal
Specify the ounce per bottle 21
Specify the number bottles per case 24
Specify Brand Being Bid Ajax 837609
108. Disinfecting Spray and Glass Cleaner - |3 cases | No Bid No Bid

Ready to Use Formula, Bottle Size: 32 oz.
Trigger Bottle, Brand: Spic & Span 31240
or equal

Specify the ounce per bottle

Specify the number bottles per case
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
Specify Brand Being Bid
109. All Purpose Cleaner and Degreaser 60 cases 16.61| $ 996.60 No Bid
Institutional/Commercial Strength - Ready
to Use Formula, Bottle Size: 32 oz. Trigger
Bottle, Brand: Professional Formula 409 or
equal
Specify the ounce per bottle 32
Specify the number bottles per case 6
Specify Brand Being Bid CMC 836007
110. Pot & Pan Cleaner - Institutional 3 cases 47.50| $ 142.50 No Bid
Strength, Bottle Size: One (1) Gallon
Specify the ounce per bottle 128
Specify the number bottles per case 4
Specify Brand Being Bid CMC HD Blue 837013
111. Powdered Dish Detergent - 10 cases 27.75| 8 277.50 No Bid
Specify the box weight 25#
Specify the number bottles per case 1
Specify Brand Being Bid CMC 836460
112. Pink Dishwashing Soap - Institutional |50 cases 16.38) $ 819.00 No Bid
Specify the ounce per bottle 128 *Blue Dishwashing Soap
Specify the number bottles per case 4
Specify Brand Being Bid Valueline 835041
113. Liquid Lime Scale Remover/Cleaner |3 cases 41.00| $ 123.00 No Bid
(Delimer) for use dishwashing machine,
Bottle Size: One (1) Gallon
Specify the ounce per bottle 128
Specify the number bottles per case 4
Specify Brand Being Bid CMC Lime Boster 836874
114. Household Ammonia 2 cases | No Bid No Bid
Specify the ounce per bottle
Specify the number bottles per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
115. Pine Cleaner Disinfectant - Institutional|370 cases 16.38/ $  6,060.60 No Bid
Specify the ounce per bottle 128
Specify the number bottles per case 4
Specify Brand Being Bid Valueline 835686
116. Toilet Bowl Cleaner - 5 cases 26.20| $ 131.00 No Bid
Specify the ounce per bottle 24
Specify the number bottles per case 12
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
Specify Brand Being Bid Lysol 836205
117. Floor Cleaner Application Use: Food |2 cases | No Bid No Bid
Specify the ounce per bottle
Specify the number bottles per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
Bags and Liners
118. Heavy Duty #8 Brown Paper Grocery |2 cases 15.94| $ 31.88 No Bid
Specify the quantity per case 500
Specify Brand Being Bid Kraft 848580
119. Heavy Duty #10 Brown Paper Grocery|2 cases | No Bid No Bid
Bags - 500 per case (minimum)
Specify the quantity per case
Specify Brand Being Bid
120. Heavy Duty #25 Brown Paper Grocery|2 cases 25.60] $ 51.20 No Bid
Specify the quantity per case 500
Specify Brand Being Bid Kraft 848424
121. Linear Low Density Polyethylene 10 cases | No Bid 24.00 240.00
Specify the quantity per case 500.00
Specify Colors available Clear or Black
Specify Brand Being Bid Central Poly - #CP10-
13G
122. Linear Low Density Polyethylene 10 cases 14.37| $ 143.70 29.40 294.00
Specify the quantity per case 150 200
Specify Colors available White Black
Specify Brand Being Bid HB 850420 Central Poly #CP30-33
123. Linear Low Density Polyethylene 10 cases 11.43| $ 114.30 13.10 131.00
Specify the quantity per case 100 100
Specify Colors available White Black
Specify Brand Being Bid Restaurant's Pride 808778 Central Poly - #CP40-45
124. Linear Low Density Polyethylene 20 cases 1835 $ 367.00 17.80 356.00
Specify the quantity per case 100 100
Specify Colors available Black Black
Specify Brand Being Bid HB 850396 Central Poly #CP50-55
125. Linear Low Density Polyethylene 10 cases 24.60| $ 246.00 16.10 161.00
Specify the quantity per case 100 100
Specify Colors available Black Black

Specify Brand Being Bid

Rollpak 868869

Central Poly #CP60
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer
4151 Blue Mound Rd. 18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Safety and Miscellaneous Items

126. Disposable Plastic Polypropylene

250

cases

19.44

S 4,860.00

No Bid

Specify the number of gloves per box:

100

Specify the quantity per case

1000

Specify Brand Being Bid

Handgard 838086

127. Elbow Length Disposable Plastic

250

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of gloves per box:

Specify the quantity per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

128. Disposable Food Service Bouffant Cap

cases

37.14

$  3,714.00

No Bid

Specify the number of caps per box:

100

Specify the quantity per case

1000

Specify Brand Being Bid

Cellucap 836338

129. Disposable Food Service Beard Cover
with Dispenser Box, Size: One Size Fit All,
Boxed: 100 (minimum)

W

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of covers per box:

Specify the quantity per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

130. Soft Facial Tissue - Two (2) Ply
(minimum), Style: Cube Box, Sheet per
box: 100 (minimum), Brand: Puff, Kleenex

cases

20.78

$ 207.80

No Bid

Specify the number of tissues per box:

100

Specify the quantity per case

3000

Specify Brand Being Bid

Prime Source 869206

131. Shrink Wrap — Portable Stretch Film

cases

No Bid

No Bid

Specify the number of rolls per case

Specify Brand Being Bid

Specify the number of bottle per case

Specify Brand/Model Being Bid

Total Bid

$ 88,460.93

$

4,481.65

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc.
included with your bid proposal, if
applicable.

None
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2
Bid No. 2011-093-5690 CD Hartnett Co. Central Poly Corp.
Ed Lutton Andrew Hoffer

4151 Blue Mound Rd.

18 Donald Place

Opening Date: 08-AUG-2011

Ft. Worth, TX 76106

Linden, NJ 07036

800.580.0665 (Ofc) 908.862.7570 (Ofc)
Annual Contract for the Purchase of 254.715.5004 (Cell) 908.862.9019 (Fax)
Staple and Non-Staple Food Items 817.626.2507 (Fax) bids@centralpoly.com

Elutton@cd-hartnett.com

DESCRIPTION:

Est.

Qty.

Specify the name, telephone number and e-
mail address (if any) of the designated
account representative who will be
managing daily activities of this account.

Jerry Guinn - 254.715.2400
jguinn#cd-hartnett.com

Melissa Rodriguez -
Melissa@centralpoly.co
m

Does your firm/company have the required
insurance coverage stated under SECTION
3-INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and
agree to comply with these requirements
during the duration of this contract?

If no, will your film be able to acquire the
required coverage within ten (10) days upon
notification of contract award?

Information on Provision of Health
Insurance Coverage for Emplovees

a) Does your company provide health
insurance coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health
insurance coverage to its employees, does
the company share in the cost a minimum of|
75% for employee only coverage and 50%
for family coverage?

¢) If your company provides health
insurance coverage to its employees, is the
coverage comparable to the services
provided by Dallas County as described in
the attached summary plan description?

d) If your company plans to utilize
subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid,
does each of the subcontractors provide
health insurance coverage to their
employees that compares to Dallas county's
health insurance coverage and share in the

Does not apply.

N/A
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