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SYNOPSIS

BID NO. 2016-031-6568

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TELECOMMUNICATION PARTS AND EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2016@ 2:00PM (CT)
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD:  FEBRUARY 28, 2016 THROUGH FEBRUARY 27, 2017
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS
BUYER:  LENORA SEVILLIAN
CONTRACT MANAGER:  PAULETTE HUNTER

DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURERS PART 
NUMBER

ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY UNIT COST EXTENDED PRICE

33. Plantronic Headset – with quick disconnect & noise cancellation HW251N 100 $55.60 $5,560.00
34. Plantronic Headset with quick disconnect with noise cancellation H41N 50 $59.00 $2,950.00
35. Plantronics CS55 wireless headsets w/o lifter CS55 50 $169.00 $8,450.00
36. Plantronics Handset Lifter – Straight Plug HL10 30 $43.00 $1,290.00
37. Plantronics Headset Quick Disconnect cable 66268-03 - A10 100 $24.00 $2,400.00
38. Plantronics Sai Wireless Headsets  W740 15 $208.00 $3,120.00
39. Plantronics Wireless Headsets   CS540 15 $169.00 $2,535.00
40. Siemon 66 Block S66M2-5W 12 NO BID NO BID
41. APC UPSSmart-UPS RT 1500VA Rack Mount SURTA1500RMXL2U 4 NO BID NO BID
42. VXI CC Pro Headset  4021P – over the head 203515 100 $62.50 $6,250.00
43. VXI quick disconnect QD102P  20149 150 $9.50 $1,425.00
44. VXI Tria  P Headset – over the head/behind the ear 202792 100 $49.00 $4,900.00
GRAND TOTAL $38,880.00

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid proposal, if applicable.

* Any deviations to the Dallas County bid specifications may result in rejection of the Bidders Proposal 
if found unacceptable by Dallas County.
Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount terms (if any):____%____Days.  Payment terms with no discount are 
Net 30 days, upon receipt of proper invoice and verification that the services and products have been 
completed in accordance with specification requirements in the Dallas County Auditor's Office.  The award of 
this bid will not be based upon prompt/early payment discounts.
Note:  Any vendor that conducts business with Dallas County, whether it is for goods and/or services, 
must maintain lawful worker's compensation/self-insured employee coverage requirements and 
adequate liability limitations.  SEE Page 3, Paragraph 3.

Specify the name telephone number and e-mail address (if any) of the designated account representative who 
will be managing daily activities of this account.

Cooperative Purchasing:  Should other Government Entities decide to participate in this contract, would you , 
the awarded Contractor agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to that entity?

Michael Evans                                                     1-
800-749-3160 ext 142                                                                        

mevans@calloneonline.com                                                                      

YES

0% - 0 DAYS

40% Off MSRP for headsets and amps ONLY!!  
We cannot lock in pricing for CISCO product for 

a year, therefore we did no bid but we have 
items in stock, if you wish to inquire please 
contact Mike Evans at 800-749-3160 Ext. 142

CALL ONE INC.

JIM SCHWARZ
VP OF SALES

400 IMPERIAL BLVD.
CAPE CANAVERAL, FL
800-749-3160 EXT. 165

NO FAX LISTED
mhoover@calloneonline.com
RECOMMEND FOR AWARD
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