
TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

1 Full Synthetic 0W-20 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                 2 Drum 393.25 $786.50 461.00 $922.00 828.06 $1,656.12
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro Performance Plus Citgo 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 10

2 Full Synthetic 0W-20 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                             60 Quart 2.82 $169.20 2.82 $169.20 4.67 $280.20
  Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro Performance Plus Citgo 
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 020 6
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 10

3 Full Synthetic 0W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                        2 Drum 1,210.00 $2,420.00 no bid 1,587.50 $3,175.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Mobil 1 Total 
Specify Product Number/Order Code MB 1 030355
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 10

4 Full Synthetic 0W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                          60 Quart 6.50 $390.00 no bid 9.31 $558.60
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Castrol Total 
Specify Product Number/Order Code Edge 0W306
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 10

5..  Full Synthetic 0W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                         2 Drum 858.01 $1,716.02 no bid No bid   
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

6  Full Synthetic 0W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                                        60 Quart 6.00 $360.00 no bid No Bid 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Mobil 1
Specify Product Number/Order Code MB1 040 6
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

7 Full Synthetic 10W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                          2 Drum 383.26 $766.52 no bid 685.00 $1,370.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro Quantum X-5 Full Syn
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 10

8  Full Synthetic 10W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                             60 Quart 2.55 $153.00 no bid 4.73 $283.80
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro Citgo
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 10

9 Full Synthetic 10W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                   2 Drum 313.75 $627.50 no bid No Bid 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

10 Full Synthetic 10W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                            60 Quart 1.88 $112.80 no bid No Bid 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

11 Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                            3000 Gallons 5.45 $16,350.00 6.15 $18,450.00 14.50 $43,500.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 1540 SYN BL B CK-4 22D154X 311177

Synthetic Blend as this product not available in Full Synthetic. 
Attached sheet showing approved oks. All 15W40 are synthetic Blend. 

These brands do not offer Full Synthetic 10W40

Service Pro / Purus Performance Plus Total

SP 1040 SB 12

SP 1030 SYN 6 6.20863E+11

SP 1040 SB 55

SP 040 SYN 55

SP 1030 SYN 55 7935111

151520

166249

SP020 SYN 55 3101840 620860001001

3101870 620860001182

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 2

12  Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                  5 Drum 316.25 $1,581.25 416.90 $2,084.50 866.25 $4,331.25
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 3

13 Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                     60 Quart 2.24 $134.40 no bid No Bid
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

14 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                             4800 Gallon 6.15 $29,520.00 7.00 $33,600.00 11.75 $56,400.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 3

15 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                    5 Drum 349.25 $1,746.25 481.00 $2,405.00 706.75 $3,533.75
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 3

16 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                           60 Quart 2.72 $163.20 2.71 $162.60 4.08 $244.80
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 3

17  Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                             3000 Gallon 6.15 $18,450.00 7.00 $21,000.00 12.23 $36,690.00
 Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 3

18 Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 375.25 $1,876.25 481.00 $2,405.00 797.50 $3,987.50
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

19 Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart 2.85 $171.00 2.71 $162.60 4.23 $253.80
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

20 Full Synthetic 5W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 2 Drum 660.00 $1,320.00 400.00 $800.00 1,122.68 $2,245.36
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Purus
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 5

21 Full Synthetic 5W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart 3.28 $196.80 no bid 5.71 $342.60
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Purus Total
Specify Product Number/Order Code SPP 540 3 184621

Gallon Jugs 5
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

22 SAE  15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil 1500 Gallon 5.45 $8,175.00 5.95 $8,925.00 10.32 $15,480.00
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 1540 B

Performance Plus Total Rubia TIR 7900 15W40
3100297 311096

Performance Plus Total Quart 9000 Energy 
SP P 540 SYN 55 21B540S 184621

Performance Plus Total Quartz 90000 Future FGE
SP 530 SYN 6 3101927 -12/1 qt case 185673

Performance Plus Total Quartz 90000 Future FGE
SP 530 SYN 55 3101490 185715

Performance Plus Total
SP 530 SYN B 3101275 311272

Performance Plus Total
SP 520 SYN 6 3101927 -12/1 qt case 185642

Performance Plus Total 
SP 520 SYN55 3101490 182381

Performance Plus Total
SP 520 SYN B 3101275 182381

Service Pro / Purus
SP 1540 SYNBL 12 CK-4

Service Pro / Purus Performance Plus Total
SP 1540 SYNBL 55 CK-4 22D154X 187400
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

23 SAE 15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil , 55 gallon DRUM, as per bid product specifications 28 Drum 316.25 $8,855.00 400.00 $11,200.00 628.10 $17,586.80
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 1540 55
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

24 SAE 15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil, QUART SIZE, as per bid product specifications 12 Quart 2.24 $26.88 2.30 $27.60 3.37 $40.44
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 1540 12
Specify the number of quarts per case 12.00 12/1 qt case 12
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

Performance Plus Total Rubia TIR 7900 15W40
3101125 -12/1 qt case 184715

Performance Plus Total Rubia TIR 7900 15W40
3100391 184713
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

25 GEAR OIL - 80W90, 5 GALLON PAIL, as per bid product specifications 1 Pail 37.82 $37.82 38.50 $38.50 65.40 $65.40
Brand: Citgo Premium Gear Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 8090 5 265809X 181991
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 5

26 GEAR OIL - 80W-90, 55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications 2 Drum 402.20 $804.40 411.70 $823.40 673.75 $1,347.50
Brand: Citgo Premium Gear Oil or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 8090 55 265809X 181,991.00
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 5

27 GEAR OIL - HEAVY DUTY, 85W-140, 55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 409.10 $2,045.50 425.30 $2,126.50 664.00 $3,320.00
Brand: Citgo Milemaster GL-5 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP 85140 55 265851X 7915511
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7 5

28 Synthetic Gear Lubricant  SAE 50, 5 GALLON PAIL, as per bid product specifications 2 Pail 74.30 $148.60 No Bid 113.56 $227.12
Brand: Citgo Synthetic or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5

29 Tractor Fluid , BULK, as per bid product specifications 700 Gallon 4.55 $3,185.00 4.90 $3,430.00 8.43 $5,901.00
Brand: Citgo Transgard or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code 3101448 3110858
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

30 Tractor Fluid , 55 GALLON DRUM, , as per bid product specifications 1 Drum 266.75 $266.75 362.00 $362.00 518.65 $518.65
Brand: Citgo Transgard or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code 3101483 182635
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

31 Multipurpose Lithium   Lubricating - Grease   NO.2, 5 GALLON PAIL,  as per bid product specifications 2 Pail 68.70 $137.40 No Bid 95.15 $190.30
Brand: Citgo Lithoplex RT No. 2 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

32 Heat Transfer Oil  55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications  4 Drum 504.24 $2,016.96 345.00 $1,380.00 712.75 $2,851.00
Brand: Citgo Hytherm Oil 46 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Coastal
Specify Product Number/Order Code 31R46XX 231709981
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 7

33
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications requiring General Motors
Dexron III/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113), as per bid product specifications 400 Gallon 4.35 $1,740.00 5.11 $2,044.00 10.10 $4,040.00
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP ATF B 24DXXXR 226502990
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  7

34
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM,  shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications requiring 
General Motors Dexron III/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113), as per bid product specifications 3 Drum 255.75 $767.25 370.00 $1,110.00 616.00 $1,848.00
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SPATF 55 3101091 226502981
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3

35
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that require an ATF 
satisfying Ford Mercon V, as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon 7.15 $1,430.00 7.35 $1,470.00 No Bid
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro *vendor total $2,860.00

Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF B 3101773
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3

Performance Plus Chevron ATF MD-3

Performance Plus

Performance Plus Chevron Heat Transfer 46
Coastal Heat Transfer 46 55

Performance Plus Chevron ATF MD-3

Chevron Starplex EP #2
SP Prem Lith #25 277111451

SP Prem Trac B

Performance Plus Total Dynatrans MP
SP Prem Trac 55

SP SYN 50 Gear 5 7915914

Performance Plus Total Dynatrans MP

Performance Plus Calumet Gear Lube 85W140

Calumet Hyperion Syn Trans CD 50

Performance Plus Total Trans MDL NA 80W90

Performance Plus Total Trans MDL NA 80W90

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:rbarcum@team-cdi.com
mailto:kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com
mailto:national@suncoastresource.com


TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

36
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that
require an ATF satisfying Ford Mercon V, as per bid product specifications 2 Drum 409.75 $819.50 510.00 $1,020.00 No Bid
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF 55 # 3101874
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3

Performance Plus
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Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
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Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

37
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that require an ATF 
satisfying Ford Mercon SP XT6QSP requirements, as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon 7.15 $1,430.00 7.35 $1,470.00 No Bid
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF B 3101773
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3

38
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that 
require an ATF satisfying Ford Mercon SP XT6QSP requirements, as per bid  product specifications 2 Drum 409.75 $819.50 510.00 $1,020.00 No Bid 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF 55 3101874
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3

39
Automatic Transmission Fluid, SYNTHETIC AND LOW VISCOSITY, QUART SIZE, car and truck automatic
transmissions and other applications that require an automatic transmission fluid satisfying Ford  Mercon LV 4 Quart 2.90 $11.60 2.71 $10.84 4.59 $18.36
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro

Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF 6 3101872 12/1 qt case 226536481
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3
Specify the number of quarts per case 6 12/1 qt case 12

40

Automatic Transmission Fluid, UNIVERSAL SYNTHETIC, GALLON SIZE, shall meet or exceed performance 
application specifications for: Caterpillar Power Shift: TO-2; Chrysler: ATF+4(MS 9602), CVTF+4; Ford: MERCON, 
MERCON V, MERCON SP, MERCON LV, CVT WSS M2C933-A, WSS-M2C-910A, 922-A1, 924-A, General 
Motors: DEXRON III-H, DEXRON VI, DEX-CVT, Toyota: TYPE T-II, T-III, T-IV, WS, SUPER CVT FLUID TC, 
Vickers: M2950-S, 1-286-S, Allison: C3, C-4, TES-295, TES-389 36 Gallon 11.60 $417.60 No Bid No Bid 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF 6
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

Specify the number of quarts per case
6 quarts case/  does 
not come in gallon 

41

Automatic Transmission Fluid, ALLISON OEM APPROVED, GALLON SIZE, Allison transmission OEM
approved ATF that complies with TES 295 specifications. Brands: Castrol – TranSynd, International – Fleetrite
Synthetic AFT, ExxonMobil – Delvac Synthetic ATF, John Deere - HD Syn Tran, Volvo Trucks North America -
Bulldog Synthetic ATF 36 Gallon 29.90 $1,076.40 No Bid 43.00 $1,548.00
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Castrol
Specify Product Number/Order Code C Autran 295 6 BP Autran Syn 295
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 709732436
Specify the number of quarts per case 24 5

42 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK as per bid product specifications 3000 Gallon 7.15 $21,450.00 7.35 $22,050.00 11.20 $33,600.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF B 3101773 7921700
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

43 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 409.75 $2,048.75 510.00 $2,550.00 715.00 $3,575.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Global Syn ATF 55 3101874 7921511
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

44 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart 2.90 $174.00 2.71 $162.60 3.85 $231.00
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal Service Pro
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: SP Global Syn ATF 6 3101872 12/1qt case 7921701
Specify Product Number/Order Code 2 3 5
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

45 DEX-COOL GM Antifreeze Concentrate- (Red/Orange), GALLON as per bid product   specifications 200 Gallon 11.00 $2,200.00 No Bid 15.50 $3,100.00
Brand: Preston or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Shell
Specify Product Number/Order Code SH Dexcool 55 236,542,486.00
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

46 Antifreeze Concentrate - (Orange), GALLON as per bid product specifications 36 Gallon 11.25 $405.00 No Bid 15.50 $558.00
Brand: Preston, Motorcraft, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Shell Chevron Havoline Extended Life Antifreeze

Performance Plus Quantum TS Global Syn Trans

Havoline Extended Life AF/C

* Product not available in 1 Gallon Jugs - No Bid 

Performance Plus Quantum TS Global Syn Trans

Performance Plus Quantum TS Global Syn Trans

Performance Plus

Performance Plus Chevron Havoline Full Syn MV ATF

Performance Plus
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ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

Specify Product Number/Order Code SH Dexcool 6 236,542,486.00
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

47 Antifreeze Concentrate - (Yellow/Gold), GALLON as per bid product specifications 600 Gallon 6.56 $3,936.00 No Bid 11.50 $6,900.00
Brand: Preston, Motorcraft, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP all makes AFC 55 227062486
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

48 Universal Green Antifreeze - All Makes All Models Concentrate, GALLON as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon 6.35 $1,270.00 No Bid 12.95 $2,590.00
Brand: Preston or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SpGreen AFC 55 PKA0B3
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5

49 Organic Additive Technology Antifreeze Mopar - (Purple), GALLON as per bid product specifications 800 Gallon 8.98 $7,184.00 No Bid No Bid 
Brand: Mopar or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Preston
Specify Product Number/Order Code Pres Command 55
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

50 Universal Hydraulic Fluid, 5 GALLON PAIL as per bid product specifications 36 Pail 23.19 $834.84 22.75 $819.00 38.25 $1,377.00
Brand: Citgo or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Tech Select
Specify Product Number/Order Code SpGreen AFC 55 3102145/46/47 7910414
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 3 5

51 Mineral Spirits – Low-Odor, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 235.00 $1,175.00 361.00 $1,805.00 425.00 $2,125.00
Brand: Mineral Spirits or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Brairerd
Specify Product Number/Order Code CD Mineral SP 55 900099448
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5

52 Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 2.5 GALLON JUG as per bid product specifications 1000 Jug 7.90 $7,900.00 No Bid 7.50 $7,500.00
Brand: Peak or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Purus Old World
Specify Product Number/Order Code OWDEF 2/2.5 KLF 002
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

53 All Purpose Oil Absorbent, 25 LBS BAG as per bid product specifications 2000 Bag 5.18 $10,360.00 6.80 $13,600.00 No Bid 
Brand: Balcones Minerals Absorb-N-Dry or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro Safety-Kleen
Specify Product Number/Order Code SP Absorb 25 20 lb bag
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5
Specify the number of bags per pallet 80.00 20 lb bag

54 ALL PURPOSE OIL ABSORBENT, 50# BAG, as per bid product specifications 2700 Bag 5.96 $16,092.00 10.00 $27,000.00 6.56 $17,712.00
Brand: Balcones Minerals Absorb-N-Dry or approved equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Balcones Corn Cob Balcones Minerals
Specify Product Number/Order Code BAL 50# 40lb bag 150001111
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5
Specify the number of bags per pallet 40lb bag

55 B-12 Chemtool Fuel Treatment - Pour in, 15 oz. CAN / 12 PER CASE as per bid product specifications 600 Case 29.10 $17,460.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand: Berryman or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Service Pro
Specify Product Number/Order Code SPTFSC 16
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2

56
Industrial Strength Purple Cleaner and Degreaser - Super Concentrated, 5 GALLON PAIL as per bid product 
specifications 100 Pail 32.00 $3,200.00 34.00 $3,400.00 No Bid 
Brand: Purple Power or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: CDI Super Red Performance Plus
Specify Product Number/Order Code CDI Super Red 5
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5

57 Windshield Washer Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications  10 Drum 92.15 $921.50 440.00 $4,400.00 107.80 $1,078.00
Brand: Xtreme Blue or equal

Performance Plus Odorless Mineral Spirits 

Peak Conventional AF/C

Performance Plus Quantum Hydraulic AW

Havoline Universal AF/C Concentrate

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:rbarcum@team-cdi.com
mailto:kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com
mailto:national@suncoastresource.com


TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2 Vendor #  3

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 405-850-9301 972-265-2456 800-677-3835
Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist fax - 972-265-2947 fax - 
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

rbarcum@team-cdi.com kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com national@suncoastresource.com

Oklahoma City, OK 73129 Richardson, Texas 75080 Houston, Texas 77026

Robert Barcom Kevin Hayden Lisa Smith 

Commercial Distributing Incorporate Safety- Kleen Systems Sun Coast

2013 SE 18th 2600 N. Central Expressway, Suite 400 6405 Cavalcade, Building 1

Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Peak Performance Plus
Specify Product Number/Order Code OW WW 55 152368981
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5 5

58 Windshield Washer Fluid, GALLON as per bid product specifications 1000 Gallon 1.65 $1,650.00 7.50 $7,500.00 1.99 $1,990.00
Brand: Xtreme Blue or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: Peak Performance Plus
Specify Product Number/Order Code OW WW 20 6 305242497
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  2 5 5

TOTAL $211,482.94 $201,905.34 $296,171.35
AWARD TOTAL $147,284.01 $3,172.44 $0.00

Specify any additional discounts, cost, services not included

Specify additional comments

Primary Contact Person Daniel Hollingshed 817-600-5773 Rachel Watson 972-265-2454 Alyssa Lavin-Ewart 713-969-3518

Secondary Contact Person Monte Boyd 405-600-5773
National Sales and 
Supply Team 713-429-6702

mboyd@team-cdi.com

dhollingshead@team-cdi.com alavine@suncosatsources.com

lsmith@suncoastsources.com 

Denton Distribution Center, 2122 James Street , Denton, 
Texas 75205

Safety- Kleen Systems Inc. will not participate in the 
interlocal agreement.  Products listed at 5-7 day delivery 
time frame can be delivered sooner if Safety-Kleen is 
given an approximate forecasted schedule for products. 

Minimum 200 gallon deliveries. All orders under 200 
gallons will incur a $75.00 delivery charge. 

Peak WSWF Zero Degree

Peak WSWF Zero Degree

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:rbarcum@team-cdi.com
mailto:kevin.hayden@safety-kleen.com
mailto:national@suncoastresource.com
mailto:mboyd@team-cdi.com
mailto:dhollingshead@team-cdi.com
mailto:alavine@suncosatsources.com
mailto:lsmith@suncoastsources.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

1 Full Synthetic 0W-20 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                 2 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

2 Full Synthetic 0W-20 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                             60 Quart 
  Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

3 Full Synthetic 0W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                        2 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

4 Full Synthetic 0W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                          60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

5..  Full Synthetic 0W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                         2 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

6  Full Synthetic 0W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                                        60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

7 Full Synthetic 10W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                          2 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

8  Full Synthetic 10W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                             60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal.
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

9 Full Synthetic 10W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                   2 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

10 Full Synthetic 10W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                            60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

11 Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                            3000 Gallons
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

No Bid 459.99 $919.98

Preferred Choice 

3

9.99 $599.40 2.50 $150.00

Royal Purple Preferred Choice 

2-3 days 3

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 6.10 $366.00

Castrol Edge

3

No bid   No bid   

9.99 $599.40 6.10 $366.00

Royal Purple Castrol Edge
0-40 3737084
2-3 days 3

1,189.99 $2,379.98 No Bid 

O'Reilly
SYN10-30-55
2-3 days

5.69 $341.40 6.10 $366.00

Citgo Castrol Edge
SYN10-30 3737038
2-3 days 3

No Bid No Bid 

9.39 $563.40 No Bid 

Castrol

5

No Bid 13.99 $41,970.00

6237328
Castrol

SYNTEC10-40

3737094

3190136

0-20 3790136

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

12  Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                  5 Drum 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

13 Full Synthetic 15W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                     60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

14 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                             4800 Gallon
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

15 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications:                    5 Drum 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

16 Full Synthetic 5W-20 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications:                                           60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

17  Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, BULK as per bid product specifications:                                             3000 Gallon
 Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

18 Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

19 Full Synthetic 5W-30 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

20 Full Synthetic 5W-40 Motor Oil, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 2 Drum 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

21 Full Synthetic 5W-40 Motor Oil, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

22 SAE  15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil 1500 Gallon
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

3

1,799.99 $8,999.95 779.99 $3,899.95

5 3

9.99 $599.40 5.25 $315.00

5 5

No Bid 5.99 $28,752.00

3

No Bid 374.99 $1,874.95

3

5.69 $341.40 2.16 $129.60

5 4

No Bid 5.99 $17,970.00

3

1,189.99 $5,949.95 374.99 $1,874.95

5 3

5.69 $341.40 2.16 $129.60

5 4

1,898.99 $3,797.98 699.99 $1,399.98

5 3

9.69 $581.40 6.10 $366.00
*vendor extension $371.40

Castrol Castrol
EDGE5-40 3737058
5 4

No Bid 6.99 $10,485.00

Preferred Choice
6290100

Mobil 1 Preferred Choice
1-5-40-55 3125252

O'Reilly Preferred Choice
SYN5-30 3790074

O'Reilly Preferred Choice
SYN5-30-55 3190062

Preferred Choice
6290062

O'Reilly Preferred Choice
SYN5-20 3790050

Preferred Choice
390064

Preferred Choice
6290052

Royal Purple Castrol
15-40 2937328

Royal Drum Castrol
15-40-55 3137328

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

23 SAE 15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil , 55 gallon DRUM, as per bid product specifications 28 Drum
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

24 SAE 15W40 Diesel Engine Motor Oil, QUART SIZE, as per bid product specifications 12 Quart
Brand: Citigard 600 Motor Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
Specify the number of quarts per case
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

3

958.99 $26,851.72 384.45 $10,764.60

5 3

5.29 $63.48 2.10 $25.20

12 12
5 4

Shell Rotell Preferred Choice
T15-40-QT 3790014

Shell Rotella Preferred Choice
T15-40-55 3190101

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

25 GEAR OIL - 80W90, 5 GALLON PAIL, as per bid product specifications 1 Pail
Brand: Citgo Premium Gear Oil or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

26 GEAR OIL - 80W-90, 55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications 2 Drum 
Brand: Citgo Premium Gear Oil or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

27 GEAR OIL - HEAVY DUTY, 85W-140, 55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 
Brand: Citgo Milemaster GL-5 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

28 Synthetic Gear Lubricant  SAE 50, 5 GALLON PAIL, as per bid product specifications 2 Pail
Brand: Citgo Synthetic or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

29 Tractor Fluid , BULK, as per bid product specifications 700 Gallon
Brand: Citgo Transgard or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

30 Tractor Fluid , 55 GALLON DRUM, , as per bid product specifications 1 Drum
Brand: Citgo Transgard or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

31 Multipurpose Lithium   Lubricating - Grease   NO.2, 5 GALLON PAIL,  as per bid product specifications 2 Pail
Brand: Citgo Lithoplex RT No. 2 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

32 Heat Transfer Oil  55 GALLON DRUM, as per bid product specifications  4 Drum
Brand: Citgo Hytherm Oil 46 or equal 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

33
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications requiring General Motors
Dexron III/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113), as per bid product specifications 400 Gallon 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

34
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM,  shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications requiring 
General Motors Dexron III/ (F-30166) and Ford Mercon (M931113), as per bid product specifications 3 Drum 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

35
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that require an ATF 
satisfying Ford Mercon V, as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

64.99 $64.99 49.99 $49.99

80041 3425006
5 4

649.99 $1,299.98 429.99 $859.98

74155 3125006
5 3

643.99 $3,219.95 439.99 $2,199.95

74055 3125008
5 3

No Bid 89.99 $179.98

4

No Bid 5.29 $3,703.00

6225004
3

519.99 $519.99 329.45 $329.45

74255 3195004
5 3

174.99 $349.98 99.99 $199.98

5 4

No Bid 899.99 $3,599.96

3150096
4

No Bid 5.29 $2,116.00

6290012

849.99 $2,549.97 329.45 $988.35

D55 3190012
5 3

No Bid 7.99 $1,598.00

6298024
3

O'Reilly Preferred Choice

Preferred Choice

Chevron

Preferred Choice

Lucas Mystik
10027 3440408

O'Reilly Preferred Choice

3425206

Preferred Choice

O'Reilly Preferred Choice

Preferred Choice

MasterPro Preferred Choice

O'Reilly Preferred Choice

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

36
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that
require an ATF satisfying Ford Mercon V, as per bid product specifications 2 Drum
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

No Bid 494.45 $988.90

3198024
3

Preferred Choice

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

37
Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that require an ATF 
satisfying Ford Mercon SP XT6QSP requirements, as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

38
Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM, shall meet or exceed the requirements for applications that 
require an ATF satisfying Ford Mercon SP XT6QSP requirements, as per bid  product specifications 2 Drum 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

39
Automatic Transmission Fluid, SYNTHETIC AND LOW VISCOSITY, QUART SIZE, car and truck automatic
transmissions and other applications that require an automatic transmission fluid satisfying Ford  Mercon LV 4 Quart
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 

Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  
Specify the number of quarts per case

40

Automatic Transmission Fluid, UNIVERSAL SYNTHETIC, GALLON SIZE, shall meet or exceed performance 
application specifications for: Caterpillar Power Shift: TO-2; Chrysler: ATF+4(MS 9602), CVTF+4; Ford: MERCON, 
MERCON V, MERCON SP, MERCON LV, CVT WSS M2C933-A, WSS-M2C-910A, 922-A1, 924-A, General 
Motors: DEXRON III-H, DEXRON VI, DEX-CVT, Toyota: TYPE T-II, T-III, T-IV, WS, SUPER CVT FLUID TC, 
Vickers: M2950-S, 1-286-S, Allison: C3, C-4, TES-295, TES-389 36 Gallon 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

Specify the number of quarts per case

41

Automatic Transmission Fluid, ALLISON OEM APPROVED, GALLON SIZE, Allison transmission OEM
approved ATF that complies with TES 295 specifications. Brands: Castrol – TranSynd, International – Fleetrite
Synthetic AFT, ExxonMobil – Delvac Synthetic ATF, John Deere - HD Syn Tran, Volvo Trucks North America -
Bulldog Synthetic ATF 36 Gallon 
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  
Specify the number of quarts per case

42 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, BULK as per bid product specifications 3000 Gallon 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

43 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum 
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

44 Global Synthetic Automatic Transmission Fluid, QUART as per bid product specifications 60 Quart
Brand: Castrol, Citgo, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

45 DEX-COOL GM Antifreeze Concentrate- (Red/Orange), GALLON as per bid product   specifications 200 Gallon 
Brand: Preston or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

46 Antifreeze Concentrate - (Orange), GALLON as per bid product specifications 36 Gallon
Brand: Preston, Motorcraft, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 

7.69 $30.76 No Bid 

Mercon LV
1
12

25.99 $935.64 No Bid 
Valvoline
MAXLIFE-D-1
5

3

55.99 $2,015.64 33.99 $1,223.64
BP BP Autran
BP-ATFSYN-1 2937230
5 4
6 6 gal

No Bid 7.99 $23,970.00

6298024
3

No Bid 494.45 $2,472.25

3198024
3

No Bid 6.29 $377.40

3798024
4.00

15.99 $3,198.00 18.99 $3,798.00

ORDEX 4250010
5 4

15.99 $575.64 18.99 $683.64

O'Reilly Chevron

Preferred Choice

O'Reilly Chevron

Preferred Choice

Preferred Choice

Motorcraft

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

47 Antifreeze Concentrate - (Yellow/Gold), GALLON as per bid product specifications 600 Gallon
Brand: Preston, Motorcraft, or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

48 Universal Green Antifreeze - All Makes All Models Concentrate, GALLON as per bid product specifications 200 Gallon
Brand: Preston or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

49 Organic Additive Technology Antifreeze Mopar - (Purple), GALLON as per bid product specifications 800 Gallon
Brand: Mopar or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

50 Universal Hydraulic Fluid, 5 GALLON PAIL as per bid product specifications 36 Pail
Brand: Citgo or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

51 Mineral Spirits – Low-Odor, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications 5 Drum
Brand: Mineral Spirits or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

52 Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 2.5 GALLON JUG as per bid product specifications 1000 Jug
Brand: Peak or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

53 All Purpose Oil Absorbent, 25 LBS BAG as per bid product specifications 2000 Bag
Brand: Balcones Minerals Absorb-N-Dry or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  
Specify the number of bags per pallet

54 ALL PURPOSE OIL ABSORBENT, 50# BAG, as per bid product specifications 2700 Bag
Brand: Balcones Minerals Absorb-N-Dry or approved equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  
Specify the number of bags per pallet

55 B-12 Chemtool Fuel Treatment - Pour in, 15 oz. CAN / 12 PER CASE as per bid product specifications 600 Case
Brand: Berryman or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

56
Industrial Strength Purple Cleaner and Degreaser - Super Concentrated, 5 GALLON PAIL as per bid product 
specifications 100 Pail
Brand: Purple Power or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

57 Windshield Washer Fluid, 55 GALLON DRUM as per bid product specifications  10 Drum
Brand: Xtreme Blue or equal

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

ORDEX 6177778
3 4

13.99 $8,394.00 7.99 $4,794.00

AF2000 4277799
5 3

14.99 $2,998.00 7.79 $1,558.00

GAL 427777
5 3

14.99 $11,992.00 No Bid 
* 1.5L 
Pentofrost
PF-E1.5L
10

54.99 $1,979.64 29.99 $1,079.64

74209 3425004
5 4

No Bid 229.99 $1,149.95

3193072
3

14.99 $14,990.00 7.29 $7,290.00

Peak Peak 
2.5GAL 6194000
10 3

10.99 $21,980.00 5.99 $11,980.00

Floor Dry Balcones
9825 6193064
10 4
40 50

6.49 $17,523.00 5.99 $16,173.00

Thrifty Sorb Balcones
OD 40 6193064
10 3
40 50

55.08 $33,048.00 No Bid 

Berryman 
116.00
10

25.99 $2,599.00 No Bid 

Purple Power
4325P
10

124.99 $1,249.90 No Bid 

PC

O'Reilly Blue Mountain

O'Reilly Preferred Choice

Preston Blue Mountain LL

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com


TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2017-041-6665
Contract for the Purchase of Engine Motor Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-
Freeze and Other Related Automotive Chemicals and Products 
Bid Open: June 19, 2017

Contract Period August 19, 2017 thru  August 18, 2018 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 

Ruthie Simpkins, Assistant Contract Specialist
214-653-7437
ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity 

Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

58 Windshield Washer Fluid, GALLON as per bid product specifications 1000 Gallon
Brand: Xtreme Blue or equal
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed: 
Specify Product Number/Order Code
SPECIFY DELIVERY: / DAYS A.R.O.  

TOTAL 
AWARD TOTAL 

Specify any additional discounts, cost, services not included

Specify additional comments

Primary Contact Person

Secondary Contact Person

Vendor #  4 Vendor #  5

417-829-5879 800-332-7132
fax- 800-925-0899 fax- 817-336-7131

Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

probids@orillyauto.com kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com 

Springfield, MO 65802 Saginaw, Texas  76131

Vanessa Creech Kurt Ackerman

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts Western Marketing Inc.

233 S. Patterson 816 South Blue Mound Rd. 

GAL-0-55
10

2.79 $2,790.00 No Bid 

GAL
10

$113,997.50 $215,487.87
$57,837.30

Jason Bonds 214-398-9195 Kurt Ackerman 325-280-8536

Andrew Spain 214-398-9195 John Goodell 817-825-1744

kurtackerman@westmktg.com

johngoodell@westmktg.com

O'Reilly

O'Reilly

mailto:ruthie.simpkins@dallascounty.org
mailto:probids@orillyauto.com
mailto:kurt.ackerman@reladyne.com
mailto:kurtackerman@westmktg.com
mailto:johngoodell@westmktg.com

	Low bidder per item 

