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QTY

SECTION A
1A Glass Tubes Screw Top 14-959-35A Fisher 36 cs 182.21 6,559.56 No Bid 0.00 NO BID 0.00 191.28 6,886.08

1000/cs, 16 x 125mm with marking spot
GPI Thread 15-415
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Fisher Kimble 73750-16125
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 1000 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number: 14-959-35A 73750-16125*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

2A Conical Screw Cap Tubes 73785-5 (Kimble) 225 cs 85.10 19,147.50 118.55 26,673.75 NO BID 0.00 82.19 18,492.75
125/cs, disposable, 05-569-1 Fisher
13X110 borosilicate, GPI Thread 13-415
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: DWK Kimble 73785-5 Kimble 73785-5
Specify size bid: case CS CS
Specify quantity per case: 125 125 125/cs
Vendor catalog number: 73785-1 73785-5 73785-5*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 43660.00 7-10

3A Screw Caps, 13-415  73802-13415 (Kimble) 35 cs 87.62 3,066.70 98.50 3,447.50 NO BID 0.00 85.99 3,009.65
500/cs, 05-569-4 Fisher, PTFE faced liner
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: DWK Kimble 73802-13415 Kimble 73802-13415
Specify size bid: case CS CS
Specify quantity per case 500 500 500/cs
Vendor catalog number 73802-13415 73802-13415 73802-15415*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-14 7-10

4A Screw Caps, 15-415 73802-15415 (Kimble) 75 cs 97.14 7,285.50 105.10 7,882.50 NO BID 0.00 94.59 7,094.25
500/cs, 05-569-5 Fisher, PTFE faced liner
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid DWK Kimble 73802-15415 Kimble 73802-15415
Specify size bid case CS CS
Specify quantity per case 500 500 500/cs
Vendor catalog number 73802-15415 73802-15415 73802-15415*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-14 7-10

5A Pasteur Pipettes 13-678-30 (Fisher) 50 cs 55.41 2,770.50 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 53.21 2,660.50
1000/cs (must be identical in OD size) 5 ¾”, borosilicate
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Kimble 63A53
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 1000 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 13-678-30 63A53*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 1-2

6A WypAll L20 Kimtowels 47011 (Kimberly Clark) 64 cs 60.96 3,901.44 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 67.34 4,309.76
816 towels/cs, 15-235-82 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid KC Kimberly Clark 47011
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 816 68/pk, 12pk/cs, 816/cs
Vendor catalog number 47011 47011*KC

7A Kimwipes 34155 Kimberly Clark 15 cs 109.00 1,635.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 159.17 2,387.55
06-666-A Fisher
1 ply, 4.4 x 8.4 inches, 280/pack, 60 packs/case
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid KC Kimberly Clark  34155
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 60packs/case 280/ pk, 60pk/cs, 16,800/cs
Vendor catalog number 34155 34155*KC
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Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1-2

8A Kimwipes 34743 Kimberly Clark 8 cs 87.00 696.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 126.67 1,013.36
06-666-11D Fisher
3 ply, 12 x 12 inches, 119/pack, 15 packs/case
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid KC Kimberly Clark  34743
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 15packs/case 119/bx, 15bx/cs, 1785/cs
Vendor catalog number+A105 34743 34743*KC
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 1-2

9A Sleeve, tyvek, Isoclean, non-sterile 17-988-107 Fisher 2 cs 95.07 190.14 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 79.69 159.38
18" Long, covered elastic wrist and bicep
100/case
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid DuPont Sunrise / Tyvek TY 500SWH
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 100 100 pr / cs 
Vendor catalog number IC501BWH001000B TY500SWH*SV
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1 7-10

 
10A  Shoe Covers 19-047-787 Fisher 2 cs 21.00 42.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 59.99 119.98

Regular Sixe Fisher 19-138-575 This is discontinued part # that was for sleeves
Polylatex, waterproof 150/case (50/pack, 3 packs per case)
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Tians International Sunrise T1200-70-10
Specify size bid Case CS
Specify quantity per case 300 200 pr / cs 
Vendor catalog number: 723783-L TY1200-70-10*SV
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1 7-10

11A Gloves, Latex, powder free 19-058-801 A-E Fisher 325 cs 78.00 25,350.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 55.10 17,907.50
Safety Choice, 9.5" long, retains grip when wet 
1000/case (100/pack, 10 pack/case ): 900/case for XL
Various sizes:   Brand Bid: _______________ : # gloves/ case Case / 10 packs/case/(   Fox Brand / 100/box, 10bx/cs, 1000/cs
XS Product # 19-058-801A 982225*SM
S Product # 19-058-801B 6215-100
M Product # 19-058-801C 6215-101
L Product # 19-058-801D 6215-102
XL  Product #  (900/case) 19-058-801E 6215-103
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Fox Brand G215
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case (100/pack) 10 packs/case 100/bx, 10bx/cs, 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number: 19-058-801-A-E G215- (?) *FX
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1 1-2

12A Gloves SG-375 (Microflex) 19-048-575 A-D Fisher 124 cs 149.73 18,566.52 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 141.84 17,588.16
14 mil finger, 12" length, latex, powder free, retains grip when wet
Safegrip
500 gloves/case (50 gloves/pack, 10 pack/case)
Various sizes:   Brand Bid: _______________ : # gloves/ case: MicroFlex / 1000 case
XS Product # Not available SG-375-XS
S Product # 19-048-575A SG-375-S
M Product # 19-048-575B SG-375-M
L Product # 19-048-575C SG-375-L
XL  Product # 19-048-575D SG-375-XL
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid MicroFlex Microflex-SG-375
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case (100/pack) 10 packs/case 50/box, 10bx/cs, 500/cs
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Vendor catalog number: SG-375-A-D SG-375-(?) *MX
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

13A Syringe BD309604 61 cs 55.42 3,380.62 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 78.82 4,808.02
with luer-lock, 400/case (100/pack, 4 pack/case) Discontinued BD 309604
Beckton-Dickinson, 10 ML disposable
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid BD BD 302995
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 2 packs/ case (200/pack) 200/pk, 2 pk/cs, 400/cs
Vendor catalog number BD309604 BD302995
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

14A Syringe BD309632 2 cs 121.18 242.36 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 166.48 332.96
with luer-lock Disposable, 400/case (100/pack, 4 pack/case)
Beckton-Dickinson 5 mL, disposable  (21G x 1)
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid BD BD 309632
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 4 pack/ case (100/pk) 100pk/, 4pk/cs, 400/cs
Vendor catalog number BD309632 BD 309632
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

15A Needles BD305196 45 cs 80.98 3,644.10 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 115.92 5,216.40
Disposable, 1000/case (100/pack, 10 pack/case)
Beckton-Dickinson 18 gauge x 1.5 inches
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid BD BD 305196
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 10pack/case (100/pack) 100/pk, 10pk/cs, 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number BD305196 BD305196*NC
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

16A Vacutainer tubes BD366441 39 cs 278.47 10,860.33 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 394.66 15,391.74
Fisher 02-683-60  This part # is discontinued 
Sterile, red top,1000/case, (100/pack 10 pack/case)
Beckton-Dickinson: 10mL
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid BD BD 367820
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 10 pack/case (100 packs) 100/pk, 10pk/cs, 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number BD366441 BD 367820
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

17A Vacutainer Tubes 456020 Greiner 47  cs 178.78 8,402.66 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 497.40 23,377.80
Fisher 20-040-156
Sterile, gray top 6 mL
1200/case, (50/pack 10 pack/case)
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Greiner BD 367925
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 24 packs/ case (50pack) 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 456020 BD 367925
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

18A Faceshield, disposable 19-460-102 Fisher 2 cs 64.92 129.84 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 188.95 377.90
Full face,clear foam headband
100/case, (25/pack 4 pack/case)
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Scientific Sunrise 208D
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 4 packs / case (25/pack) 100/cs
Vendor catalog number 19-460-102 208D*SU
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19A Biohazard Bag  01-828C Fisher 24 pk 98.70 2,368.80 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 59.48 1,427.52
Red, disposable with biohazard emblem
2mil, 19" x 23" 200/pack
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Medegen 5013
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 200/case 200/cs
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Vendor catalog number 01-828C 5013
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1 7-10

20A Biohazard Bag 01-828E Fisher 80 pk 155.40 12,432.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 87.22 6,977.60
Red, disposable with biohazard emblem
2mil, 37" x 48" 100/pack
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Medegen 848
Specify size bid Case CS
Specify quantity per case 100/cse 100/cs
Vendor catalog number 01-828E 848*NC
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 1 7-10

21A Bags, sample transport 22-314-257 Fisher 38 cs 148.12 5,628.56 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 148.84 5,655.92
Self-sealing, tamper evident, 6" x 10" 1000/pack
Meets OSHA/NCCL requirement for liquid tight transport
Printed biohazard symbol, Paperwork pouch
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Speci-Gard VF95600B10
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 1000/ case 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 22-314-257 UF95-600B10
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

22A Kapak roll stock  TRS 95125-3 Kapak 93 rls 377.23 35,082.39 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
9.5" x 125', 1 roll/case, 4.5 mil.
Can be heat sealed
NC9383006 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid K-Pac
Specify size bid each
Specify quantity per case 125 foot roll/each
Vendor catalog number TRS-95125-3
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3

23A Kapak Heat Sealable Pouch  40624 Kapak 2 cs 470.00 940.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
9.5" x 16", 480/case,  can be heat sealed
NC9480532
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid K-Pak
Specify size bid case
Specify quantity per case 24 packs/ case (20/pack) 
Vendor catalog number 40624.00
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3

24A Hand Cleaner  21-032-06-001 Thermo 5 cs 109.86 549.30 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
12-544-09 Fisher
Softcide or equal, 6, 32 oz. containers/case
Mild, anti-mircobial for healthcare
Pump dispenser in each bottle
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher 
Specify size bid case
Specify quantity per case 6 each / case
Vendor catalog number 21-032-06-001
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3

25A QIAamp DNA Micro Kit (No substitution) 120 kits 289.14 34,696.80                     NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
includes QIAamp MinElute columns,
proteinase K, carrier RNA, buffers, 
2 mL collection tubes, 50 preps/kit
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Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Qiagen
Specify size bid each
Specify quantity per case 50 prep / kits
Vendor catalog number 56304
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 4
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26A Feather Disposable Scalpel #21 50 pks 27.25 1,362.50 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
EF7281E Andwin Scientific
NC9855170 Fisher
20/bxs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher
Specify size bid pack
Specify quantity per case 20 / pack 
Vendor catalog number 08-927-5D
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2

27A Versi-Dry  62060-00 Thermo Scientific 24 cs 193.18 4,636.32 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 249.92 5,998.08
Chemical resistant polyethylene backing
Cushioned surface
Roll size 20 in.x 150 ft., 2 rolls/case, (20" cx 300")
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Nalgene 620600-00
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 2 rolls /case 2/cs
Vendor catalog number 62060.00 62060-00
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

28A n-Butyl Chloride  B429-4 Fisher 18 cs 810.94 14,596.92 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
4, 4L bottles/case
HPLC grade, 99% min. purity
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher
Specify size bid case
Specify quantity per case 4Lx4 /case
Vendor catalog number B429-4
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3

29A Methanol A456-4 (Fisher) 100 ea 85.36 8,536.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 92.26 9,226.00
Optima LC/MS, >99.9% purity packed under nitrogen, suitable 
for organic residue analysis $L bottle
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher FoxBrand M370-4*FX
Specify size bid each ea
Specify quantity per case 1 each ea
Vendor catalog number A456-4 M370-4*FX
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 1-2

30A Ethel Ether, anhydrous   E138-4 Fisher 4 ea 85.53 342.12 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
>99.9% purity, meet or exceed ACS specifications, stabilized with BHT
4L container
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher 
Specify size bid each
Specify quantity per case 1 each 
Vendor catalog number E138-4
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2

31A Pipet tip, 2-200uL 05-403-41(Fisher) 35 cs 63.98 2,239.30 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 68.08 2,382.80
Eppendorf  022491539, (No Substitutions)
epTIPS
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960/cs
Refill trays
Specify manufacturer and product number Epprndorf Eppendorf 022491539
Specify size bid 960/ pack pk
Specify quantity per case 05-403-41 96 tips/rack, 10 racks/pk, 960/pk
Vendor catalog number 022491539
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

32A Pipet tip, 50-1000uL 05-403-20 (Fisher) 5 cs 155.00 775.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 164.90 824.50
Eppendorf  022491253
epTIPS filter tips
960/cs In trays
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Eppendorf Eppendorf 022491253
Specify size bid case pk
Specify quantity per case 960/case 96 tips/rack, 10racks,/pk, 960/pk
Vendor catalog number 05-403-20 022491253
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

33A Pipet tip, 2-200uL 04-987-420 (Fisher) 5 cs 149.58 747.90 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 159.15 795.75
Eppendorf  022491296 (No Substitutions)
epTIPS 
960/cs
In  trays  
Specify manufacturer and product numb     Eppendorf Eppendorf 022491296
Specify size bid:  case cs
Specify quantity per case 960/cse 96 tips/rack, 10racks,/pk, 960/pk
Vendor catalog number 04-987-420 022491296
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

34A Pipet tip, 50-1000uL 05-403-43 (Fisher) 5 cs 73.21 366.05 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 75.74 378.70
Eppendorf  022491555, (No Substitutions)
epTIPS 
960/cs  
Refill trays
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid:  Eppendorf Eppendorf 022491555
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 960/ case 96 tips/rack, 10racks,/pk, 960/pk
Vendor catalog number 05-403-43 022491555
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

35A Pipet tip, 50-1000uL 13-683-755 (Fisher) 15 cs 170.93 2,563.95 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 168.74 2,531.10
Eppendorf 0030077857, (No Substitutions)
epTIPS 
Ep Dualfilter T.I.P.S TM Sealmax Filter Pipet Tips 960/cs  
In trays
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid:  Eppendorf Eppendorf 0030077857
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 960/case 960/cs
Vendor catalog number 13-683-755 0030077857
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10

36A Pipet tip, 2-200uL 13-683-753 (Fisher) 10 cs 179.00 1,790.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 168.74 1,687.40
Eppendorf  0030077830, (No Substitutions)
Ep Dualfilter T.I.P.S TM Sealmax Filter Pipet Tips 
960/cs  
In trays
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid:  Eppendorf Eppendorf  0030077830
Specify size bid case CS
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Specify quantity per case 960/case 960/cs
Vendor catalog number 13-683-753 0030077830
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 7-10
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37A Ammonium hydroxide A669-500 (Fisher) 18 each 36.42 655.56 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 17.73 319.14
ACS plus
500mL container
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Fox Brand A751-2*FX
Specify size bid each 500 ml
Specify quantity per case 1 each each
Vendor catalog number A669-500 A751-2*FX
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 1-2

38A Culture tube, screw top 14-959-35AA(Fisher) 14 cs 192.50 2,695.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 191.28 2,677.92
Disposable, 16x100mm; ODxL is 16x100mm
Borosilicate with threaded end and round bottom
With marking spot
1000/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Scientific Kimble 73750-16100
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 1000/case 250/pk, 4pk/cs, 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 14-959-35AA 73750-16100*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

39A Culture tube, round bottom 14-958D(Fisher) 18 cs 37.49 674.82 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 39.83 716.94
Plain end
Flint glass
Annealed to prevent breakage
1000/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Kimble 73500-13100
Specify size bid case cs
Specify quantity per case 1000/case 250/pk, 4pk/cs, 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 14-958D 73500-13100*KG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 1-2

40A Sparkleen detergent 04-320-4 (Fisher) 10 each 15.97 159.70 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 27.66 276.60
3.3 lb/container
Manual detergentRemoves dried blood, proteins, fats, 
oils, organic and inorganic residues 
from glassware
Specify manufacturer and product 
number of item bid: Fisher Alconox 1104
Specify size bid each ea
Specify quantity per case: 1 each 9/cs
Vendor catalog number 04-320-4 1104*AX
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 1-2

 
41A Whatman FTA Cards 09-923-340 (Fisher) 15 pk 434.79 6,521.85 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 457.08 6,856.20

Whatman WB120205, (No Substitutions)
100/pk
For forensic samples
Non-indicating
125uL per sample area; 4 sample areas per card
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: GE Whatman WB120205
Specify size bid pack pk
Specify quantity per case 100/pack 100/pk
Vendor catalog number 09-923-340 WB120205*WH
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10
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42A Whatman FTA Cards 09-302-194 (Fisher) 10 cs No Bid - Discontinued 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 456.18 4,561.80
Whatman WB120314, (No Substitutions) Discontinued Fisher 09-302-194 
25/pk; 10 pk per case
For forensic samples
Non-indicating
75uL
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Whatman WB120208
Specify size bid pk 
Specify quantity per case 100/pk 
Vendor catalog number WB120208*WH
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 7-10

43A Whatman multi-barrier pouch 05-715-112 (Fisher) 5 pk 88.29 441.45 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 98.78 493.90
Whatman WB100037, (No Substitutions)
Tamper evident seal
100/pk
For FTA Classic cards
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: GE Whatman WB100037
Specify size bid: pack pk
Specify quantity per case: 100/pack 100/pk
Vendor catalog number: 05-715-112 WB100037*WH
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

44A Specimen container, 4 oz 16-320-731 (Fisher) 5 cs 188.60 943.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 71.22 356.10
Graduated in oz and mL
100/cs
Translucent polypropylene
Full turn screw thread cap with integrity seal
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Fisher Cardinal 8889207034
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 500/case 500/cs
Vendor catalog number 16-320-731 8889207034
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 2 1-2

45A Plastic centrifuge tube, 50mL 06-443-18 (Fisher) 20 cs 102.74 2,054.80 160.17 3,203.40 NO BID 0.00 59.13 1,182.60
Graduated from 5-50 mL
500/cs
Polypropylene with marking spot
Flat screw cap with leak-resistant seal
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Fisher Chrom Tech equiv-06-443-18 Celltreat 229422
Specify size bid: case CS CS
Specify quantity per case: 500/case 500 300/cs
Vendor catalog number 06-443-18 CNT500 229422*CL
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-14 7-10

46A Face shield 19-181-600A (Fisher) 32 cs 64.93 2,077.76 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 188.95 6,046.40
Disposable
Optically clear and distortion free
25/pk
Full face protection
Anti-fog and antistatic coating
Stretch strap headpiece
Latex-free foam band at forehead
Size: full
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Fisher Sunrise 208D
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 4 pack/cse (25/pack) 100/cs
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Vendor catalog number 19-181-600A 208D*SV
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 7-10
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47A Hood 01-361-75D (Fisher) 25 cs 87.02 2,175.50 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 90.42 2,260.50
DuPont TY657SWH00010000
Disposable
Provides complete coverage of head and shoulders
Inert and tear resistant
One size fits all, white
100/cs
Tyvek  
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Fisher Tyvek 317100539
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case 100/case 100/cs
Vendor catalog number 01-361-75D 31710539*RS
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

 
48A Mask, NIOSH 18-999-2453 (Fisher) 32 cs 328.17 10,501.44 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 275.17 8,805.44

Kimberly-Clark Professional 46767
35/pk, 6 pk/cs
N-95
Regular size
Universal fit
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: KC Kimberly Clark 46767
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 6 pack/ case (35pack) 210/cs
Vendor catalog number 18-999-2453 46767*KC
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

49A Sharps container 22-3701-150 (Fisher) 20 cs 166.34 3,326.80 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 167.63 3,352.60
BD 305344
24/cs
Nestable
Suitable for incineration or autoclaving
8 qt
Rigid sides with secure and safe sharps drop
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: BD BD 305344
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 24/case 24/cs
Vendor catalog number 22-3701-150 BD 305344
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

50A DistriTips Syringe, 1250uL F164140G (Fisher) 15 pk 91.6 1,374.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
Gilson F164140, (No Substitutions)
Mini ST
Sterile
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50/pk
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Gilson
Specify size bid: pack
Specify quantity per case: 50/pack
Vendor catalog number: F16414OG
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3

51A 96-Well twin.tec PCR plates E951020346 (Fisher) 10 cs 137.50 1,375.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 135.47 1,354.70
Eppendorf 951020346, (No Substitutions)
Yellow, semi-skirted
25/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Eppendorf Eppendorf 9510203446
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 25/case 25/cs
Vendor catalog number E951020346 951020346
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

52A 96-Well twin.tec PCR plates E951020320 (Fisher) 10 cs 128.01 1,280.10 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 135.47 1,354.70
Eppendorf 951020320, (No Substitutions)
Blue, semi-skirted
25/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Eppendorf Eppendorf 951020320
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 25/ case 25/cs
Vendor catalog number E951020320 951020320
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

53A 96-Well twin.tec PCR plates E951020362 (Fisher) 10 cs 137.50 1,375.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 135.47 1,354.70
Eppendorf 951020362, (No Substitutions)
Red, semi-skirted
25/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Eppendorf Eppendorf 951020362
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 25/case 25/cs
Vendor catalog number E951020362 951020362
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

54A 96-Well twin.tec PCR plates E951020389(Fisher) 10 cs 137.50 1,375.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 135.47 1,354.70
Eppendorf  951020389 (No Substitutions)
Red, semi-skirted
25/cs
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Eppendorf Eppendorf 951020389
Specify size bid: case CS
Specify quantity per case: 25/case 25/cs
Vendor catalog number E951020389 951020389
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10

55A MicroAmp Clear Adhesive Film 43-063-11 (Fisher) 10 pk 142.00 1,420.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 96.45 964.50
Applied Biosystems 4306311
100/pk
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Thermo Bradtech 781390
Specify size bid: each PK  
Specify quantity per case: 1 kit/ each (100 film/kit) 100/pk
Vendor catalog number: 43-063-11  781390*BS
Specify Delivery / Days A.R.O 3 7-10
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Total Section A: 285,951.46 41,207.15 NO BID 213,308.55
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SECTION B:  Categories of items which may be purchased from this contract

1B  Apparatus under $1000 NO BID 
Vendor must list six different examples of items that they consider covered within this group: N/A

1. _______________________________________________________________ Electrode Distillation Apparatus
2. _______________________________________________________________ Ph Meters Pippetor
3. _______________________________________________________________ Stirring Hotplates Drying Apparatus
4. _______________________________________________________________ Vortex Stirring Apparatus
5. _______________________________________________________________ Soxhlet
6. _______________________________________________________________ Pipiettes Heating Apparatus 

 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Eppendorf  15% 15% 0% 0%

Brand  15% 15% 0% 0%

Drummnd  15% 15% 0% 0%

Orion  20% 20% 20% 20%

Barnstead  20% 20% 15% 15%

Lab-Line  20% 20% 0% 0%

Wheaton  20% 20% 25% 25%

Techne  15% 15% 0% 0%

Corning  25% 25% 0% 0%

Kapak  20% 20% 0% 0%

Miles  0% 0% 0% 0%

Grumbacher  0% 0% 0% 0%

Becton Dickinson  10% 10% 0% 0%

Schleicher and Scheull 0% 0% 0% 0%

Justman 10% 10% 30% 30%

Private Label 30% 30% 0% 0%

Other manufacturers (please specify): 5% 5% 35% 35%
1._____________________  Therrmo Life Tech Therrmo Life Tech FoxBrand hot plate/stir
2. _____________________  10% 10% 20% 20%

 Bel-Art Bel-Art Brandtech

Mini Centrifuge

Vendor will specify percentage (%) off manufacturer list price as reflected in 
catalogs or price for each category:
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2B Vacutainer Tubes, Syringes, and Needles
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
N/A 

Becton Dickinson 15% 15% 0% 0%
Private Label 25% 25% 0% 0%

Other manufacturers (please specify):
1._____________________ 10% 10%

Excel Paper Excel Paper 
2. _____________________ 10% 10%  

Hamilton Greiner Hamilton Greiner 

3B Glassware:  Vendor must list six different examples of items that they NO BID 
consider covered within this group:

1. _______________________________________________________________ Beakers Beakers
2. _______________________________________________________________ Flask Flask
3. _______________________________________________________________ Bottle Bottles
4. _______________________________________________________________ Volumetrics Vials
5. _______________________________________________________________ Piptes Cylinders
6. _______________________________________________________________ Serologocal Pipets

 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Corning 20% 20% 0% 0%

Kimble 20% 20% 24.5% 24.5%

Qorpak 15% 15% 20% 20%

Kontes 15% 15% 24.5% 24.5%

Nalgene 20% 20% 0% 0%

Becton-Dickinson 20% 20% 0% 0%

National Scientific 20% 20% 0% 0%

Wheaton 20% 20% 20% 20%

Private Label 20% 20% 0% 0%

Other manufacturers (please specify):   
1._____________________ 10% 10% 0%

Chemglass Chemglass
2. _____________________ 5% 5% 0%

Wilmond Ace Glass Wilmond Ace Glass 
4B Specialty Glassware:  Vendor must list six different examples of items NO BID 

that they consider covered within this group: N/A 

1. _______________________________________________________________ Custom Glassware Condensers
2. _______________________________________________________________ Microkit Chemistry Flask Volumetric
3. _______________________________________________________________ Organic Chemistry Funnels
4. _______________________________________________________________ Distillation Glassware Distilling Apparatus
5. _______________________________________________________________ Custom Slides or Coverslips Connectors Tubes
6. _______________________________________________________________ Manifolds Concentrator

Non-Chromotographic vials and Tubes
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 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Corning 20% 20% 0% 0%

Kimble 20% 20% 24.5% 24.5%

Kontes 20% 20% 24.5% 24.5%

Qorpak 20% 20% 20% 20%

Nalgene 20% 20% 0% 0%

Becton-Dickinson/Falcon 20% 20% 0% 0%

Wheaton 20% 20% 20% 20%

Private Label 20% 20% 0% 0%

Other manufacturers (please specify):   
1._____________________ 20% 20% 0% 0%

Thermo Thermo
2. _____________________ 10% 10% 0% 0%
 Chemglass Chemglass

5% 5%
Wilmon or Ace Wilmon or Ace

5B Plasticware:  Vendor must list six different examples of items NO BID 
that they consider covered within this group: N/A 
1. _______________________________________________________________ Bottles
2. _______________________________________________________________ Carboys Beakers
3. _______________________________________________________________ Specimens Cups
4. _______________________________________________________________ Water Bottles Sampling Utensils
5. _______________________________________________________________ Tanks and Trays Petri Dish
6. _______________________________________________________________ Tissue Culture Transfer pippets

 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Wheaton 20% 20% 20% 20%

Nalgene 20% 20% 0% 0%

Bel-Art 20% 20% 12- 32% 12- 32%

Corning 20% 20% 0% 0%

Eppendorf 20% 20% 0% 0%

BD Falcon 20% 20% 0% 0%

Nunc 20% 20% 0% 0%

Private Label 25% 25% 25% 25%

Other manufacturers (please specify):   
1._____________________ 5% 5% 12-30% 12- 30%

Thermo/Lifetech Thermo/Lifetech Cell Treat Cell Treat

Sample Bottles/Specimen collection

Scintillation, Centrifuge tubes and vials
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               DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION 

BID NO:  2019-036-6800   Chrom Tech, Inc. Agilent Technologies, Inc. Fox Scientific Inc
3970 John Creek Ct., Suite 500 PO Box 240248 2850 Centerville Road 8221 East FM 917
Suwanee, GA 30024 Apple Valley, MN 55124 Wilmington, DE 19808 Alvarado, TX 76009

214-924-7932 952-431-6000
412-490-9237 Fax 952-431-6345 Fax 800-227-9770 800.369.5524

Debra Morris, Contracts Specialist Jim Var Jessica Kolsky 302-993-5941 Fax 817.783.3571(Fax)

jessica@chromtech.com lscabids@agilent.com paisleygfoxscientific.com

RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

2. _____________________ 15% 15% 30% 30%
GE GE Stockwell Stockwell
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               DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION 

BID NO:  2019-036-6800   Chrom Tech, Inc. Agilent Technologies, Inc. Fox Scientific Inc
3970 John Creek Ct., Suite 500 PO Box 240248 2850 Centerville Road 8221 East FM 917
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RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

6B High Volume Consumables (including paper goods) N/A NO BID 

1. _______________________________________________________________ Pipet Tips
2. _______________________________________________________________ Notebooks Wipes
3. _______________________________________________________________ Media Weigh Boats
4. _______________________________________________________________ Histology Supplies Sample Bottles
5. _______________________________________________________________ Petri Dishes Filter Paper
6. _______________________________________________________________ Centrifuge Tubes

 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Bard-Parker 5% 5% 0% 0%

Brinkman 10% 10% 0% 0%

Nalge 20% 20% 0% 0%

Labsystems 20% 20% 0% 0%

Becton Dickinson 15% 15% 0% 0%

Kimberly Clark 20% 20% 30% 30%

Scott 20% 20% 30% 30%

Texwipe 20% 20% 0% 0%

Wypall 20% 20% 30% 30%

Inverness Medical 0% 0% 0% 0%

Private Label 20% 20%

Other manufacturers (please specify):
1._____________________ 20% 20% 0% 0%

Thermo Thermo
5% 5%

2. _____________________ LifeTech LifeTech 0% 0%
20% 20%

3. _____________________ Corning Corning 0% 0%
15% 15%
Remel Remel

7B Biotech chemicals, enzymes, reagents and supplies
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
N/A 

including Phase Lock Gel tubes* etc.
*Eppendorf 20% 20% 0% 0%

J.T. Baker 20% 20% 0% 0%

Mallinckrodt 20% 20% 0% 0%

Vendor must list six different examples of items that they consider covered within 
this group:

Paper Goods, Towels, Wipes, Pad & 
Protectors
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RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

Kodak 0% 0% 0% 0%

EM Science 20% 20% 0% 0%

Promega 15% 15% 0% 0%

New England Labs 0% 0% 0% 0%

Ricca 20% 20% 32% 32%

Amresco 0% 0% 0% 0%

Corning 20% 20% 0% 0%

Nalgene 20% 20% 0% 0%

Millipore 20% 20% 0% 0%

Lab-Line 20% 20% 0% 0%

Wheaton 20% 20% 0% 0%

Perkin Elmer 0% 0% 0% 0%

Erie 20% 20% 0% 0%

Pall Life Sciences 0% 0% 0% 0%
 

Abbott 0% 0% 0% 0%

Private label 20% 20% 35- 60% 35- 60%

Other manufacturers (please specify):
1._____________________ 20% 20% 27% 27%

Thermo Thermo Aqua Solution Aqua Solution
10% 10% 5% 5%
Life Tech Life Tech GFS Chemical GFS Chemical

2. _____________________ 10% 10% 38-60% 38-60%
GE GE
10% or more 10% or more 
Medical Testing Kits Medical Testing Kits

8B Chemicals
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
N/A 

J.T. Baker 20% 20% 0% 0%

Mallinckrodt 20% 20% 0% 0%

Acros 5% 5% 0% 0%

Burdick & Jackson 20% 20% 0% 0%

New England Labs 0% 0% 0% 0%

EM Science 20% 20% 0% 0%

(HIV, ABB, Flu, Pregnancy) 
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RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

Ricca 20% 20% 32% 32%

Spex 10% 10% 0% 0%

EM Science 20% 20% 0% 0%

Pierce 5% 5% 0% 0%

Alfa Aesar 5% 5% 0% 0%

Private label 30% 30% 35-60% 35-60%

Other manufacturers (please specify): 27% 27%
1._____________________ 20% 20% Aqua Solutions

Honeywell Honeywell 5% 5%
2. _____________________ 20% 20% GFS Chemicals

Thermo Thermo
5% 5% Private Labels 
Lifetech Lifetech 38% 38%
20% 20% Fox Uhrapure 
Lab Chem Lab Chem 35% 35%

Fox Instrapure
60% 60%
Fox Pure/ACS
60% 60%
Fox HPLC
12% 12%
Inorganic Ventures 
15% 15%
NSI

9B Safety Products NO BID 

1. _______________________________________________________________ Gloves Nitrile, Latex, Vinyl, rubber or leather Gloves
2. _______________________________________________________________ Chemical Cabinet Vaplock Chemical Emmissions, Filters Bouffants
3. _______________________________________________________________ Labcoats
4. _______________________________________________________________ Gowns, PPE, Sleeves Safety Cabinets Saftety Glasses
5. _______________________________________________________________ Janitorial Supplies Smoking Recepticals Safety googles
6. _______________________________________________________________ Healthcare Supplies & Papergoods facemask

 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Johnson & Johnson 20% 20% 0% 0%

Becton & Dickinson 10% 10% 0% 0%

Sage 10% 10% 0% 0%

3M 20% 20% 0% 0%

Valco 20% 20% 0% 0%

SCBA,  Law Enforcement Suplies

Vendor must list six different examples of items that they consider covered within 
this group:

Drum Rollers 

Waste Containment System Kits - 
Justrite/ChromTech

Waste Manifolds

mailto:jessica@chromtech.com
mailto:lscabids@agilent.com
mailto:sales@foxscientific.com
mailto:jim.var@thermofisher.com


               DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION 

BID NO:  2019-036-6800   Chrom Tech, Inc. Agilent Technologies, Inc. Fox Scientific Inc
3970 John Creek Ct., Suite 500 PO Box 240248 2850 Centerville Road 8221 East FM 917
Suwanee, GA 30024 Apple Valley, MN 55124 Wilmington, DE 19808 Alvarado, TX 76009

214-924-7932 952-431-6000
412-490-9237 Fax 952-431-6345 Fax 800-227-9770 800.369.5524

Debra Morris, Contracts Specialist Jim Var Jessica Kolsky 302-993-5941 Fax 817.783.3571(Fax)

jessica@chromtech.com lscabids@agilent.com paisleygfoxscientific.com

RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

North 20% 20% 0% 0%

Uvex 20% 20% 0% 0%

Wilson 20% 20% 0% 0%

Eagle 20% 20% 0% 0%

MSA 20% 20% 0% 0%

Nalgene 20% 20% 0% 0%

Justrite 20% 20% 20% 20% 0% 0%

SciMatCo 20% 20% 0% 0%

Dalloz 0% 0% 0% 0%

American Allsafe 0% 0% 0% 0%

US Safety 0% 0% 0% 0%

Ansul 20% 20% 0% 0%

AO Safety 0% 0% 0% 0%

Scott 20% 20% 30% 30%

Haws 0% 0% 0% 0%

Private label 30% 30% 0% 0%

Other manufacturers (please specify): 5-20% 5-20%
20% 20% R3 Safety 

1._____________________ Ammex Ammex 25% 25%
10% 10% Sunrise

2._____________________ Henry Schein Henry Schein R3-3M, UVEX, MSA, Justrite, Ansell, North 
10% 10%
Moore Medical Moore Medical 

10B Other non-capital equipment not otherwise covered
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  
 Discount off each 
or package  

 Discount off case  

Vendor must list six different examples of items that they consider covered within this group: N/A 

1. _______________________________________________________________ Medical Supplies Balances 
2. _______________________________________________________________ Forensic Supplies 123-1026  DB-1 25m, 0.32mm, 0.52um Benchtop Ovens
3. _______________________________________________________________ Lab Furniture 123-5026 DB-5 25m, 0.32mm, 0.52um Hotplate Stirrers
4. _______________________________________________________________ Fixatives and Stains PH Meter
5. _______________________________________________________________ PH Probes
6. _______________________________________________________________ Microscopes 

List specific manufacturers and % off
10% 10%

5183-4491 Clear, wide opening vial, 
2ml, 1000pk Clear wide opening crimp 
top vial, 2ml, 1000 per pack 
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RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

1. _______________________________________________________________ Moore Medical Moore Medical 15% 15%
10% 10% Boekel 

2. _______________________________________________________________ Kendall / Medtronic Kendall / Medtronic 10-20% 10-20%
10% 10% Quincy Lab 

3. _______________________________________________________________ Thermo Thermo 17% 17%
20% 20% Shel Lab

4. _______________________________________________________________ Mott Mott 7-20% 7-20%
10% 10% Sartorius

5. _______________________________________________________________ Thermo Fisher Thermo Fisher 12% 12%
TBD TBD National Optical 

6. _______________________________________________________________ PAG Discounts PAG Discounts 22% 22%
Oakton

Private Label 20% 20% 0%

Any Unlisted Manufacturer 10% 10% 0%

Total for Section B

SECTION C:  Chromatography Supplies

2C Autosampler vial cap with seal Fisher/National Scientific Vendor Did not Bid on Case 
1000/cs (100/pack, 10pack/case) 06-406-19H/C4011-98B 15 cs 140.99 2,114.85 11.50 172.50 NO BID 0.00 84.29 1,264.35

150/pks /3 408063 (100pk)  $1,725.00
11mm, PTFE/Red rubber 06-406-19K/C4011-98R 15 cs 140.99 2,114.85 11.50 172.50 NO BID 0.00 84.29 1,264.35

150/pks /3 408007 (100pk)  $1,725.00
various colors 06-406-19L/C4011-98Y 15 cs 140.99 2,114.85 11.50 172.50 NO BID 0.00 84.29 1,264.35

150/pks /3 408065 (100pk)  $1,725.00
06-406-19J/C4011-98G 15 cs 140.99 2,114.85 11.50 172.50 NO BID 0.00 84.29 1,264.35

150/pks /3 408064 (100pk)  $1,725.00
06-406-19B/C4011-1A 15 cs 140.99 2,114.85 89.00 1,335.00 NO BID 0.00 89.10 1,336.50

CTC-1108
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Chrom Tech JG Finneran
Specify size bid case as indicated above CS
Specify quantity per case 100/pack (10packs/case) 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 06-406-19-HKLJB 5140-11(?) *JF

3C  Autosampler vial cap with seal 501-310 Thermo Scientific 11 cs 196.52 2,161.72 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 146.43 1,610.73
1000/cs (100/pack, 10 pack/case)
11 mm aluminum seals, silver color
PTEE/silicone septa
Preassembled with septa
14-823-377 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher JG Finneran 5150-11
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 1000/case 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 501-310 5150-11*JF

4C  Headspace Stoppers C-4020-30 Thermo Scientific 20 cs 162.72 3,254.40 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 140.01 2,800.20
1000/case
03-375-22AA (Fisher)
Gay butyl, 20mm
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher JG Finneran 5001-20ST
Specify size bid case CS
Specify quantity per case 1000/case 1000/cs

Agilent offers 10% Discount on items 
being offered 
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RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

Vendor catalog number C4020-30 5001-20ST*JF

5C Headspace Vials C-4020-2 Thermo Scientific 22 cs 312.02 6,864.44 37.55 826.10 NO BID 0.00 254.59 5,600.98
03-377-118 Fisher 220PKS / CTV-2375R
1000/cs (100/pack, 10 pack/case) Vendor Did not Bid on Case 
23 x 75 mm, 20mil
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Thermo C4020-2 Kimble 332375BMB
Specify size bid case CS (10PACK/CSE- 100 PACKS) CS
Specify quantity per case 1000/case 1000 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number C4020-2 CTV-2375R (EXACT /C4020-C) 332375BMB*KG
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VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

6C Headspace Vlal Seals  Thermo Scientific 502 370 42 pk 74.15 3,114.30 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
22-030213 (Fisher)
500/pack/ Thermo Scientific TM SUN-SRiTM Crim Caps, magnetic
20 mm, large opening magnetic
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher
Specify size bid pack
Specify quantity per case 500/pack
Vendor catalog number 502-370

7C Vial, Autosampler 5183-4491 (Agilent) 6 cs 263.71 1,582.26 127.91 767.46 151.20 907.20 87.90 527.40
50-929-232 Fisher
2ml, 12 x 32mm, Crimp top, clear glass, wide opening
1000/ case
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Fisher Agilent 5183-4491 JG Finneran 32011L-1232
Specify size bid case CS CS
Specify quantity per case 20packs/cse (100/pack) 1000 5183-4491 1000/cs
Vendor catalog number 03-375-3CC 5183-4491 V200-100

8C Cartridge Filament 5 pk 891.7 4,458.50 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
Hitachi 51E-0240, (No Substitutions)
10/pk
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Hitachi
Specify size bid: each
Specify quantity per case: 1 each
Vendor catalog number NC1493335

9C Filament Assembly 225-10340-91 Shimadzu 8 ea 377.3 3,018.40 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00
Filiment D assembly for  Shimadzu MS: QP 2010 Ultra and Plus Models
NC9793463 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Shimadzu
Specify size bid each
Specify quantity per case 1 each
Vendor catalog number NC9793463

10C
Capillary Column: Agilent DB-1, 
123-1026 Agilent

 
4 ea 498.68 1,994.72 423.82 1,695.28 466.20 1,864.80 466.20 1,864.80

0.32mm ID, 25m length, 0.52um film thickness
50-928-703 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Agilent Aligent 123.1026 Agilent Technologies, Inc. Agilent 123-1026
Specify size bid: each Each ea
Specify quantity per case: 1 each 1 N/A ea
Vendor catalog number 123-1026 (50-928-703) 123-1026 123-1026 123-1026*AG

11C Capillary Column: Agilent DB-5 123-5026 Agilent 2 ea 502.91 1,005.82 423.82 847.64 466.20 932.40 466.20 932.40
0.32mm ID, 25m length, 0.52um film thickness
50-928-719 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Agilent Aligent 123-5026 Agilent Technologies, Inc. Agilent 123-5026
Specify size bid each Each ea
Specify quantity per case 1 each 1 N/A ea
Vendor catalog number 123-5026 / 50-928-719 123-5026 123-5026 123-5026*AG

12C Capillary Column: Restek Rxi-1ms 13323 Restek 5 ea 502.75 2,513.75 458.98 2,294.90 NO BID 0.00 554.15 2,770.75
0.25-mm ID, 30m length, 0.25um film thickness
06-715-404 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Restek Resteck 13323 Restek 13323
Specify size bid each each ea
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Fisher Scientific Company LLC 
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VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

Specify quantity per case 1 each 1 ea
Vendor catalog number 13323 RTK-13323 13323*RT

13C Capillary Column: Restek RTX-BAC 18003 Restek 2 ea 543.09 1,086.18 458.19 916.38 NO BID 0.00 551.22 1,102.44
.32-mm ID, 30m length, 1.8um film thickness
06-710-339 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Restek Restek 18003 Restek 18003
Specify size bid each Each ea
Specify quantity per case 1 each 1 ea
Vendor catalog number 18003 RTK-18003 18003*RT

14C Capillary Column: Restek RTX-BAC 18002 Restek 4 cs 526.28 2,105.12 466.94 1,867.76 NO BID 0.00 560.98 2,243.92
.32-mm ID, 30m length, 1.2um film thickness
06-710-338 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Restek Restek 18002 Restek 18002
Specify size bid each each ea
Specify quantity per case 1 each 1 ea
Vendor catalog number 18002 RTK-18002 18002*RT

15C GC Capillary Colums, others Estimated Quantity : 3 columns 3 col % of each column % of each column 

Restek 10% 8%

Agilent 0% 8%

J & W Scientific 0% 8%

Any in catalog 10% 0%

List specific manufacturers 10% - Thermo  0%

16C GC Inlet Liner: 20783 Restek no substitutions 4 pk 128.60 514.40 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 311.71 1,246.84
For split injections, fully deactivated
4.0mm ID, 78.5mm length, 6.3mm OD
06-717-947 Fisher
Pack of 25 Discontinued , replacement quoted 
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Restek Restek 20783
Specify size bid each pk
Specify quantity per case each 25/pk
Vendor catalog number 06-711-033 20783*RT

17C GC Inlet Liner: 20956 Restek 60 pks 108.84 6,530.40 85.12 5,107.20 NO BID 0.00 102.44 $6,146.40
(No Substitutions)
3.5mm ID, 95 mm length, 5.0mm OD  
06-718-245 Fisher
Split/splitless with deactivated wool  
For Shimadzu GC
Pack of 5  
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Restek Restek 20956 Restek 20756
Specify size bid: pack pk pk
Specify quantity per case: 5/pack 5 5/pk
Vendor catalog number: 20956 RTK-20956 20956*RT

18C GC Inlet Liner: 20956-213.5 Restek 25 pk 174.53 4,363.25 147.96 3,699.00 NO BID 0.00 179.52 4,488.00
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               DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION 

BID NO:  2019-036-6800   Chrom Tech, Inc. Agilent Technologies, Inc. Fox Scientific Inc
3970 John Creek Ct., Suite 500 PO Box 240248 2850 Centerville Road 8221 East FM 917
Suwanee, GA 30024 Apple Valley, MN 55124 Wilmington, DE 19808 Alvarado, TX 76009

214-924-7932 952-431-6000
412-490-9237 Fax 952-431-6345 Fax 800-227-9770 800.369.5524

Debra Morris, Contracts Specialist Jim Var Jessica Kolsky 302-993-5941 Fax 817.783.3571(Fax)

jessica@chromtech.com lscabids@agilent.com paisleygfoxscientific.com

RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

(No Substitutions)
3.5mm ID, 95 mm length, 5.0mm OD
06-718-249 Fisher
Siltex fully deactivated
Split/splitless with deactivated wool
For Shimadzu GC
Pack of 5
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Restek Restek-20956-213.5 Restek 20956-213.5
Specify size bid: pack pk pk
Specify quantity per case: 5 pack 5 5/pk
Vendor catalog number 20956-213-5 RTK-20956-213.5 20956-213.5*RT

19C GC Inlet Liner 20977Restek 15 pks 164.17 2,462.55 130.10 1,951.50 NO BID 0.00 156.59 $2,348.85
(No Substitutions)
1.0mm ID, 95 mm length, 5.0mm OD
06-718-301 Fisher
Pack of 5
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid: Restek Restrk 20977 Restek 20977
Specify size bid: pack pk pk
Specify quantity per case: 5 pack 5 5/pk
Vendor catalog number 20977 RTK-20977 20977*RT

20C GC Inlet Liners, other % off each % off package
Restek - % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% N/A 8% 8%
Agilent - % off each  /  % off package 0% 0% 8% 8%
Any in catalog - % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 0% 0%
List specific manufacturers  - % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 0% 0%

Thermo 
21C

N/A 0.00 0% 0%
Pierce- % off each  / % off package (typically 10, 1mL ampoules) 5% 5%
Any in catalog - % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 0% 0%
List specific manufacturers -% off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 0% 0%

Thermo

22C Expendable GC supplies such as ferrules, o-rings, etc. 10% 10% N/A 0.00
Any in catalog - % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 0% 0%
List specific manufacturers -% off each  /  % off package Thermo 8% 8%

Restek & Agilent Restek & Agilent 

23C Headspace syringe 203084 Hamilton 3 ea 155.00 465.00 126.18 378.54 NO BID 0.00 134.07 402.21
Fixed needle, stainless steel, 23 gauge
Gas tight
2.5mL
14-685-200 Fisher
Specify manufacturer and product number of item bid Hamilton Hamilton 203084 Hamilton 203084
Specify size bid each each ea
Specify quantity per case 1 each 1 ea
Vendor catalog number 203084  203084   203084*HC  

Error in numbering missing 24c & 25C 

26C   N/A
% off each % off package % off each  % off package

Hamilton- % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 15% 15%
SGE- % off each  /  % off package 10% 10% 20% 20%
Any in catalog- % off each  /  % off pac  5% 5% 0% 0%

Derivatizing agents , other: such as MBSTFA+1%TBDMS, pentafluoropropanol, 
pentafluoropropionic acid anhydride

Syringes, autosampler
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BID NO:  2019-036-6800   Chrom Tech, Inc. Agilent Technologies, Inc. Fox Scientific Inc
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214-924-7932 952-431-6000
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Debra Morris, Contracts Specialist Jim Var Jessica Kolsky 302-993-5941 Fax 817.783.3571(Fax)

jessica@chromtech.com lscabids@agilent.com paisleygfoxscientific.com

RECOMMEND FOR AWARD ALL 

DESCRIPTION EST UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
QTY

VENDOR #4

Fisher Scientific Company LLC 

jim.var@thermofisher.com

VENDOR #3VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2

FOR THE PERIOD June 24, 2019 THROUGH June 26, 2019 with 3 
options to extend 

Annual Contract for Laboratory Items and Related Products

List specific manufacturers- % off each  /  % off package 5% 5% 0% 0%
Grace & Thermo  

 
Total Section C: 58,069.46 22,376.76 3,704.40 40,479.82

Grand Total $344,020.92 $63,583.91 $3,704.40 $253,788.37
 

N/A Any NON - exact 
part is indicated by 
applicable part # 

Is there a current price list
No No 

Primary Contact Person Jim Var - 214-924-7932 Customer Service - 952-431-6000
jim.var@thermofisher.com sales@chromtech.com Alex Kristiansen 800-227-9770

Back-up Contact Person: Molly Disney 214-641-2691 Jessica Kolsky 952-431-6000
molly.disney@thermofisher.com jessica@chromtech.com

Yes Yes

No 

Yes - Agilent Quotation 2806413 is 
attached 

N/A - Agilent Technologies, Inc. 
(Agilent) is bidding in accordance with 
the attached quotation 2806413.  Please 
refer to the quotation for detail. In 
reference to Insurance, Agilent is 
providing Memorandum of Insurance 
("MOI") for our review.  Insurance 
provisions listed on the Memorandum 
indicated the insurance coverage Agilent 
will evidence if awarded this contract.  If 
Agilent is the successful bidder, a 
Certificate of Insurance will be issued 
upon notification. 

Yes - Please see attached PAG Discounts 
covering 10,000 plus vendors. 

Please Identify any and all cost associated with services that is not otherwise included in this 
solicitation

Hazmat fee, fuel surcharge, integrity fees, ice 
fees, will apply based on order.  Any overnight 
or rush fees apply , drop ship & restocking fees 
apply some medical products non -returnable

Pricing includes standard delivery F.O.B 
Destination  / Pricing excludes : Hazmat fees, 
overnight/rush shipments and special 
refrigerated freight 

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide to participate in this 
contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, 
and pricing would apply to that entity?
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