TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Ttem#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Group 1: Multi-Purpose Copier Paper -
For use in high speed copiers, plain paper
faxes and laser printers

1. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 117 cartons/cases
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Past Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

11,700

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

2. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 11" 300
Pre-Punched, 3-Hole, Standard
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

cartons/cases

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

$ 33.60 $393,120.00

7277220272222,

L 7442222222222

30%

=2

9
500/rm

S

Sol Recyled 543-NR1120

) 4180 § 12,540.00

30%

w O
=2
o

(=]

HUSKY COPY D8§3-3161
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Itemis 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

3. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 14" 250 cartons/cases
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

4. Paper Size: 117 x 17 20 cartons/cases
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness: ’
Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

5. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 1,600 reams
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 204 Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com
Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

2277227 2

30%
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$677,621.90

53.20 $13,300.00

41.80 $836.00

4.06 $6,496.00



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Contract Period: Initial two years w/ Carrolton, TX 75006
three (1) year extensions
Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid
Reccommended for award
DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty. Total Award Amount $677,621.90

PASTEL COLORS
500

Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

DOMTAR Earth Choice: Blue 81199,
Yellow 81196, Green 81197, Ivory 81201,
Pink 81198, Lilac 81200, Goldenrod 81203,
Salmon 81206, Cherry 81205, Buff 81204,
ray 81195, Tan §1202

[

o

6. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 147 150 reams 5.46 $819.00
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

ZI 4472222202022

/74 2227277272222

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber 30%
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

500

DOMTAR Earth Choice: Blue 81091,
Yellow 81088, Green 81089, Ivory 81092,
Pink 81090, Goldenrod 81093, Cherry
81018, Buff 81017

7. Paper Size: 11" x 17" 100 reams $ 8.57 $3857.00
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Calor: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 20# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber 30%
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

500

DOMTAR Earth Choice: Blue 81012,
Yellow 81009, Green 81010, Ivory 81014,
Pink 81011, Goldenrod 81016, Cherry
81018, Buff' 8107
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
8. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 117 40 reams

Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 24# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

9. Paper Size: 11" x 17" 40 reams
Multi-Purpose Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 24# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

10. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 11" 50 Cases
High Gloss Permanent Adhesive Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 60#

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

L]

527 $210.80

FSC CERTIFIED

PASTEL COLORS
500

$ 11.07 $442.80

UL /4744444472222 2402422244/,

FSC CERTIFIED

PASTEL COLORS
500

S 127.00 $6,350.00

FSC CERTIFIED

2220244224424
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

11. Paper Size: 117 x 177 50 cartons/cases
High Gloss Permanent Adhesive Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 60#

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number:

12, Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 11" 50 - cartons/cases
Book Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recyele Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 80# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number:

13, Paper Size: 11" x 177 50 cartons/cases
Boo Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 80# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

T2 2 22 2722222222222,

G
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Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
arrolton, TX 75006

Q

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

]
=~
(=]
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pinnaker B63-09600

©“ wn

FSC CERTIFIED

— 0
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00 sheets / 10 reams per carton

B63-09771

o5
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oo

500 sheets / 8 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11943

o

$677,621.90

230.00 $ 11,500.00

47.44 52,372.00

4744 $2,372.00



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

14. Paper Size: 11" x 177 50
Book Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 100# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being propesed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

15. Paper Size: 11" x 177 15
Book Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 100# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

Westen-BRW

800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

v

oug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

10%

88

500 sheets / 4 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11943

o4

cartons/cases

10%

]
=

500 sheets / 3 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11944

“r

cartons/cases

/7247272277727,

2227

10%

=)

0
00 sheets / 4 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11944
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$677,621.90

44.76 $2,238.00

4744 §711.60



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Itemi#fs 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

16. Paper Size: 127 x 187 20

Book Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recyele Fiber Content: 30%

or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 80# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum ordezr per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

17. Paper Size: 127 x 18" 15
Book Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fibér Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 100# Gloss Book

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the
colors listed below:

Total Group 1:
Group 2: Bright/Neon Colored Bond

Paper - For use in high speed copiers,
plain paper faxes and laser printers

cartons/cases

cartons/cases

7722277777777/ 272

77
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Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren

469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

©4

0%

w0
0

500 sheets / 3 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11947

o3

10%

90
400 sheets / 3 reams per case

FLO DIGITAL 533-K11948

$677,621.90

41.31 $826.20

41.40 $621.00

$454,991.40



TABULATION SHEET °
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Western-BRW

800 Kelly Blvd
arrolton, TX 75006

(@]

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

oug Warren

469-568-5000

469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Itemis 36 &38, No Bid
Reccommended for award

2277727

DESCRIPTION: Est. \
s Qty. Total Award Amount $677,621.90
18. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 30 reams 5 6.73 $336.50

Bright/Neon Colored Bond Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 20%
or higher

Color: Various Colors

Paper Weight: 24# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment;
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Z 222222222

02222242/

222

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number for the

colors listed below:

NA
500

DOMTAR HOTS: Orange 81352, Pink
81345, Very Pink 81345, Coral NA, Teal
NA, Green 81319, Lime Green 81322, Red
81342, Purple 81336, Violet 81329, Lemon
81309, Yellow 81302, Blue 81332,

Total Group 2: $ 336.50
Group 3: Laser Paper - For use in high

speed copiers and laser printers

19. Paper Size: 8-1/27 x 117 20 reams 5 4.01 $80.20

Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 24# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

9
500

=

DOMTAR D83-5462

Page 8 of 25



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Contract Period: Initial two years w/ Carrolton, TX 75006
three (1) year extensions
Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38. No Bid
Reccommended for award
DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

G222

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

1

20. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 11" 20 Teams 5.32 $106.40
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 28# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

72222222

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

500

HUSKY D83-5463

©a

21. Paper Size: 117 x 17" 100 reams 8.36 $836.00
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

\
N
%
or higher §
Color: White \
Paper Weight: 20# Bond \
Paper Brightness: 84 or higher \
Acid Free \\\
Lint Free \
Fuzz Free \
Ream Wrapped \
Dallas County minimum order per shipment: \
One (1) ream \
Inside delivery required §

N

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber

content of the product being proposed:

Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream

of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

22, Paper Size: 11" x 17" 100 reams 3 8.56 $856.00
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

:§
%
or higher §
Color: White \
Paper Weight: 24# Bond \
Paper Brightness: 84 or higher \
Acid Free \
Lint Free \
Fuzz Free \
Ream Wrapped \
Dallas County minimum order per shipment: \
One (1) ream \
Inside delivery required \

\

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED

content of the product being proposed: §
Specify paper brightness: \\\94
Specify the total number of sheets per ream \ 500
of the product being proposed: §
N

Specify Brand/Product Number DOMTAR D33-3612

Page 9 of 25



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.
23. Paper Size: 117 x 17" 100 reams
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 28# Bond

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1)} ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

24, Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 10 reams
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 32#

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

25. Paper Size: 11" x 17" 100 reans
Laser Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 32#

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) ream

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 3:

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

o

oug Warren
69-568-5000
69-568-5016

warren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

L2222

2 & &

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

wr

1126 $1,126.00

T2z

FSC CERTIFIED

94
500

HUSKY D83-8950

g 3.38 5$33.80

L2422

FSC CERTIFIED

LYNX D83-507900

5 7.11 $711.00

77222022

FSC CERTIFIED

[
v
(=]

LYNX D83-508000

22

5 3,749.40
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Ttem#s 36 &38. No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Group 4: Perforated Paper - For use in
26. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 117 50 cartons/cases
Perforated Paper — Cut Sheet

Micro Perforation: 3-1/2” from bottom

Paper Weight: 24#

Color: White

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

Ten (10) cases/cartons

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being propesed:
Specify paper brightness:

Specify the total number of sheets per ream
Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed

Specify Brand/Product Number

27. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 11" 50 cartons/cases
Perforated Paper — Cut Sheet

Perforation: Two (2) horizontal perforations -

7-1/3" from top and 3-2/3" from top of each

sheet

Paper Weight:- 24

Color: White

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimumn order per shipment:

Ten (10) cases/cartons

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify paper brightness:

Specity the total number of sheets per ream
of the product being proposed:

Specify the number of reams per carton/case
of the product being proposed

Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 4:

Group 5: Computer Paper

28. Computer Paper 200 cartons/cases
1 Part Continuous Form

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

or higher

Sheet Size: 9-1/2" x 117, breaks to 8-1/2" x

11" after removal 14" left and nght vertical

perforations

Paper Weight: 184 Bond or better

Perforation: Clean Edge removable 14"

vertical left and right

Paper Color: White

Paper Finish Type: Smooth

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

224,

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

3040 $1.520.00

727277

FSC CERTIFIED

$ 3040 $1,520.00

FSC CERTIFIED
2
500
3
PRINTWORKS P04-4122
5 3,040.00
$ 31.20 $6.240.00

2 7



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Contract Period: Initial two years w/ Carrolton, TX 75006
three (1) year extensions
Doug Warren
469-568-5000
4

69-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

G242

Itemd#s 36 &38. No Bid
Reccommended for award
DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty. Total Award Amount §677,621.90

FSC CERTIFIED
§ 2,500.00
PRINTWORKS P04-2715

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

29. Computer Paper 50 cartons/cases 5 31.20 $1,560.00
1 Part Continuous Form

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

or higher

Sheet Size: 9-1/2" x 117, breaks to 8-1/2" x

11" after removal 12" left and right vertical

perforations

Paper Weight: 20% Bond or better

Perforation: Clean Edge removable 12”

vertical left and right

Paper Color: White

Paper Finish Type: Smooth

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED

Specify total number of sheets per $ 2,500.00

carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number PRINTWORKS P04-2715

30. Computer Paper S5 cartons/cases 5 52.80 $264.00
1 Part Continuous Form

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Sheet Size: 14-7/87 x 117

Paper Weight: 20# Bond or better
Perforation: Non — Perforated

Paper Color: Standard ' Green Bar

Paper Finish Type: Standard

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

QLZZZ22722222222222222222222727777

FSC CERTIFIED
2200

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number PRINTWORKS P04-2060

o

31. Computer Paper 5 cartons/cases 52.80 $264.00
1 Part Continuous Form

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Sheet Size: 14-7/8" x 11"

Paper Weight: 20# Bond or better
Perforation: Non — Perforated

Paper Color: Blank White

Paper Finish Type: Standard

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber FSC CERTIFIED
content of the product being proposed:

T2

7%

2500
PRINTWORKS P04-2347

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

Page 12 of 25



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

32. Computer Paper 500 cartons/cases
2 - Parts Carbonless (NCR)

Continuous Form

Sheet Size: 9-1/2" x 117, breaks to 8-1/2" x
117 after removal %" left and nght vertical
perforations

Paper Weight: 15# Bond Carbonless
Perforation: 4" vertical left and right

Paper Color: All parts White

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

33. Computer Paper 150 cartons/cases
4 - Parts Carbonless (NCR)

Continuous Form

Sheet Size: 9-1/2" x 117, breaks to 8-1/2" x

117 after removal %" left and right vertical

perforations

Paper Weight: 15# Bond Carbonless

Perforation: %" vertical left and right

Paper Color: All parts White

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) case/carton

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number
34.Continous Cpmputer Form No 7001 R Each
1-Part Form

Overall Size; 12" x 8-1/27

Paper: 20# Continuous Bond — White

Printing: Blank

Perforation: 7/16™ Margins Left and Right

Punching: 3 — '4" holes, 4-1/4” c. to c. at top

Minimum Order per release/shipment:

600,000

Boxed and labeled

Inside Delivery Required"

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number
35. Continuous Computer Form No. 7000 800,000 Each
1 — Part Form

Overall Size: 12 x 8-1/2"

Paper: 20# Continuous Bond — White

Printing: Blank

Perforation: 7/16" Margins Left and Right

Minimum Order per release/shipment:

100,000

Boxed and labeled

Inside Delivery Required "

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

3\
Western-BRW
%
\ 1800 Kelly Blvd
N

arrolton, TX 75006

%Doug Warren
%469—568—5@00

\469—568—5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

%

% Reccommended for award
\ Total Award Amount

$677,621.90

45.64 $22,820.00

2
=
=
=
=
Q
=
5
i

$ 5504 $8,256.00

% FSC CERTIFIED

0.04 $56,000.00

0.05 $40,000.00

'\2500 u



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Contract Period: Initial two years w/ Carrolton, TX 75006

three (1) year extensions

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwa rrgn@wgg ernbrw.corr

Reccommended for award

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Ttem#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty. Total Award Amount $677,621.90

GAA

37.Continuous Computer Form No. 105 300,000 Sets 0.09 $27,000.00
3— Parts, Carbonless ( NCR)
Overall Size: 8-1/2"x8-1/2"
Paper:15# Carbonless(NCR) White,
Canary, and Pink

Vertical Perforations: 7/8" left and right
vertical perforations making the form break
to 6-3/4"x8-1/2 after removal of crimped left
and right Horizontal Perforations: One
horizontal perforation every four inches (4")
from the top of the form. (Bottom portion
size: 6-3/4" x 4-1/2") Holes: Punch two
5/16" holes, 2-3/4" C-C on lefi side of form
(bottom portion only - all parts) Printing:
Blank (Non printing required) Minimum
Order per release/shipment: 50,000 Boxed
and labeled Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number ROYAL R44-3PT-485

10-12 WORK DAYS

\
\
\
N
N
N
N
\
N\
N
N
N
N
§
\

155,000 Each

o3

39.Continuous Computer Labels Form No. 0.03 $4,650.00
7010 Overall Size: Label: 7-1/4" x 3-15/16";
Carrier Size: 8” Width with 67 horizontal
perforation between each label 4"
Construction: 4 labels acorss/6 labels down
= 24 labels per

Material: Standard White Matte Label
Stock; Permanent Adhesive

Printing: Blank

Margins: 3/8" short each side

Minimum Order per release/shipment:
47,500

Boxed and labeled, Inside Delivery
Required"”

744

Page 14 of 25




TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Ttem#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify total number of sheets per
carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

40.Manila Docket Form 7008 56,000 Each
12" x 8-1/2" Continuous Form, 100# Manila

Tag, Prints 1/0 black No marginal perfs, Full

carton only, Packed 1400 per carton

Minimum Order per release/shipment:

14,000, Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

41.Continuous Computer Form Labels 800,000 Each
Form No. 7117

Overall Size: Label: 2-3/4" x 15/16"

Carrier Size: 12" width with 6" horizontal
perforation

construction: 4 labels across/6 labels down =
24 labels per 12" x 6" Carrier Section.
Vertical perforations between labels
materials: Standard white matte label stock;
permanent adhesive, Printing: Blank,
Margins: 3/8" short each side, Labels shall
be hot fuser compatible. Labels shall be Hot
Fuser Compatible.

Minimum Order per release/shipment:
120,000

Inside deliver required

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

42 .Continuous Thermal Transfer Labels 200,000 Each
with permanent adhesive backing

2 across label Size: 4" x 2.5" two label set
(4" x.5" top and 4" x 2" bottom) die cut
carrier width: 4.125"

Paper: 15# white thermal transfer w ith
permanent

adhesive backing (blank)

Rounded comers

No perforations

1" core

Media format: roll .600 hundred labels per
rall

T ahels wonnd ont

Specify total number of sheets per

Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 5:
Group 6: Cover/Index Card Stock Paper -

For use in high speed copiers and laser
printers

722727 72/,

Page 15 of 25

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
4

69-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

b
L
o
=1

ABOTT 172185
7-10 WORK DAYS

o oes

OYAL

=

-12 WORK DAYS

o

5000 LABELS
ABBOTT

7-10 RIISINFSS DAYS
b

7200 LABELS
ABBOTT

$677,621.90

0.05 §  2,520.00

1,100.00

0.00 $3,200.00

0.02 $3,000.00

$175,774.00



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
43, Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 11" 20 pkgs

Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 65#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

44. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 30 pkes
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

or lﬁgher

Paper Weight: 65# or better

Color: Various Colors

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
Specify Brand and Product Number for the
colors listed below

45. Paper Size: 117 x 177 20 pkes
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 65# or better

Color: Various Colors

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand and Product Number for the
colors listed below

7222427227220/ /2242222222222

Page 16 of 25

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

o

oug Warren
69-568-5000
69-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

4
4

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

©

FSC CERTIFIED

(%]
w
(=]

LYNX D83-634000

o

FSC CERTIFIED

< g e

Red NA

B2

FSC CERTIFIED

b}
3
S 0

LYNX D83-632621

$677,621.90

5.15 $103.00

535 $160.50

500.00

OMEAR EARTHCHOICE: Blue 82476,
ellow 82479, Green 82487, Orange NA,

10.83 $216.60



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item¥s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

46, Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 20 pkes
Caover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 80#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

47. Paper Size: 117 x 17" 20 pkgs
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 80#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

48. Paper Size: 8-1/2" x 117 20 pkgs
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 100#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

49, Paper Size: 117" x 17" 20 pkas
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 100#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

7 /40 /7444442244242

el
o]
[(=]
[+
-
~
(=}
=
N
w

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

o

oug Warren
69-568-5000
69-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

4
4

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

@

-

SC CERTIFIED

[
wn
a

LYNX D83-638800

o3

m

SC CERTIFIED

(]
w
(=]

LYNX D83-632622

©

=4

SC CERTIFIED

]
=
(=]

LYNX D83-630900

o

$677,621.90

6.33 $126.60

1332 $266.40

6.34 $120.80

16.65 $333.00



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

50, Paper Size: 117 x 177 20 pkes
Caver Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 100#

Color: Manila

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

51, Paper Size; 127 x 187 10 Cases
Cover Stock Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 100#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

52. Paper Size: 11" x 177 10 Cases
Cover-weight Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 9-Point

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber

Specify the total number of sheets per

package of the product being proposed:
. Specify Brand/Product Number

)

Western-BRW

800 Kelly Blvd
arrolton, TX 75006

w)

oug Warren

69-568-5000

69-568-5016
warren@westernbrw.com

27222

=N

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

=

SC CERTIFIED

s

250.00

LYNX D83-509001

o

49.00 $980.00

FSC CERTIFIED

1000
Domtar Earthchoice D83-81163

o

31.04 $310.40

FSC CERTIFIED
400

LYNX D83-639637
b 4320 $432.00

OD/H
250/PKG -750/CASE

FLD DIGITAL 533-K11946

22222222222
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Itemds 36 &38, No Bid
DESCRIPTION:

Est.
Qty.

53. Paper Size: 12" x 18™

Cover-weight Gloss Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Color: White

Paper Weight: 9-Point

Paper Brightness: 84 or higher

Acid Free

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1} case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

54. Paper Size: 8-1/2"x 117 20
Index Card Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 90#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

pkes

Specily the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

55. Paper Size: 117 x 17" 20
Index Card Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%
or higher

Paper Weight: 90#

Color: White

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment;
One (1) package

Inside delivery required

pkgs

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify the total number of sheets per
package of the product being proposed:
Specify Brand/Product Number

10 Cases

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-368-5000
469-368-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

o

10%

200/PKG 600/CASE

FLO DIGITAL 553-K11950

o

2422722222222/

FSC CERTIFIED

250

Domtar Earthchoice D83-81037

L]

FSC CERTIFIED

250

Domtar Earthchoice D83-81001

7222222222222
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$677,621.90

39.81 $393.10

498 $99.60

1046 $209.20



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

56. Paper Size: 117" x 177 10 pkes

Index Card Paper

Post Consumer Recycle Fiber Content: 30%

or higher

Paper Weight: 65# or better

Color: Various Colors

Lint Free

Fuzz Free

Ream Wrapped

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) package

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber

content of the product being proposed:

Specify the total number of sheets per

package of the product being proposed:

Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 6:

Group 7: Multi-Purpose Pre-Collated

57. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10 cartons/cases

Size: 8-1/2" x 117

2 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary,

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless paper must be compatible with

laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber

content of the product being proposed:

Specify total number of sheets per

Specify Brand/Product Number

58. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 70 cartons/cases

Size: 117 x 177

2 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary,

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Nallac Mannty minimom arder nar chinmants

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

/2040242222222

NI

§Ziz CERTIFIED

N\t a e

§ $3,814.50
\

\

\ 3 73.90 $739.00
\

A

§

N

N\

N

N\

\

§5ﬂ CERTIFIED

\ ;DSEOOSA 50167

§

§ 3 73.75 $5,162.50
)

)

N\

N

SFI CERTIFIED
2500
NEKOOSA 50170

w2
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
59. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10

Size: 8-1/27x 117

3 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink
Blank (No printing)

Carbonless paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment;
One (1} carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

60. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10
Size: 8-1/2" x 147

3 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink
Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

61, Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 70
Size: [1"x 17"

3 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink
Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

062, Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10
Size: 8-1/2" x 11™

4 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink,
Gold

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

N
‘\\ Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd

§lijarm]mn1 TX 75006
%Dnug Warren

69-568-5000
\ 69-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

% Reccommended for award
\\\Tmal Award Amount $677,621.90

cartons/cases §$ 83.15 $831.50

=

SFI CERTIFIED

§ TSJOSIQOOSA 50172

cartons/cases %S 106.00 $1,060.00

\ SFI CERTIFIED

cartons/cases \5 83.15 $5820.50

cartons/cases §$ 88.95 $889.50

\SFI CERTIFIED



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

63. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10
Size: 8-1/2" x 147

4 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink,
Gold

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

cartons/cases

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

64. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 70 cartons/cases
Size: 11" x 177

4 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Canary, Pink,
Gold

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number
65, Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10 cartons/cases
Size: 8-1/2" x 117

5 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Light Green,

Pink, White, Light Green

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with

laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal ;

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:

Specify total number of sheets per
Specily Brand/Product Number

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

22222

7

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

5000
NEKOOSA 36490

o

113.20 $1,132.00

702222

SFI CERTIFIED

5000
NEKOOSA 50177

$ 88.80 $6,216.00

ZUZL 7222227

SFICERTIFIED

2500
NEKOOSA 50244

222222227224

SFI CERTIFIED

5000
NEKOOSA 50178

772
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Ttem#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

66. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10 cartons/cases
Size: 8-1/2" x 147

5 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Light Green,
Pink, White, Light Green

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment;
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

67, Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10 cartons/cases
Size: 8-1/2" x 117

6 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Blue, Green,
Yellow, Pink, Gold

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with
laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:
One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
content of the product being proposed:
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

68. Pre-Collated Carbonless Paper 10 cartons/cases
Size: 8-1/2" x 147

6 Parts, Straight

Carbonless Sequence: White, Blue, Green,

Yellow, Pink, Gold

Blank (No printing)

Carbonless Paper must be compatible with

laser and color printers

Ream Wrapped

Brand: NCR or equal

Dallas County minimum order per shipment:

One (1) carton/case

Inside delivery required

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber
Specify total number of sheets per
Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 7:

Group 8: Envelopes

69. Standard No.10 Envelope 60 cartons/cases
Paper: 24# White Wove or better

Diagonal Scam

Split Seal Gum Flap

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case

Inside Delivery Required

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016

dwarren@westernbrw.com

G20

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

&

123.70  $1,237.00

SFI CERTIFIED

5000

NEKOOSA * SPECIAL MAKE 20 CASE
MINIMUM

2722222020

3 94.70 $947.00

SFI CERTIFIED

000
NEKOOSA 50283

22 2222222222222

\SFI CERTIFIED

§ iJOEOIEOOSA / SPECIAL MAKE 20 CASE

\i INIMUM

§ $26,229.00
§

%S 44.80 $2,688.00
\

\

N
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TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

70. Standard No.10 Poly Window Envelope 60
Paper: 24# White Wove or better

Diagonal Seam

Split Seal Gum Flap

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case
Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

71. Standard No.10 Poly Window Envelope 10
With Inside Security Tint

Paper: 24# White Wove or better

Diagonal Seam

Split Seal Gum Flap

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case
Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

72.Standard No.10 Envelope with Right- 6
Hand

Side Poly Window

Paper: 24# White Wove or better

Diagonal Seam

Split Seal Gum Flap

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case
Teaida Maliviam: Daniea,

A
Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

73.Envelope 6
Paper: 24# Brown Kraft or better

Size: 4-1/2" x 10-3/8" (No. 11)

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case
Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

74.Envelope 10
Paper: 24# Brown Kraft or better

Size: 4-1/2" x 10-3/8” (No. 11)

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case
Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

Doug Warren
469-568-5000
469-568-5016
dwarren@westernbrw.com

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 28439

o

cartons/cases

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 28461

w

cartons/cases

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 62003

153

cartons/cases

7 7727222222722

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 26640

o

cartons/cases

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 3987

o

cartons/cases

2500/ CASE

PRINTMASTER 3987

/722772 7222222222222
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$677,621.90

51.00 $3,060.00

56.65 $566.50

51.85 $311.10

96.20 $577.20

96.20 $962.00



TABULATION SHEET
2019-024-6788 Annual Contract for the
Purchase of Paper for Office Use

Contract Period: Initial two years w/
three (1) year extensions

Dallas County Tax Payer? Yes
Headquarters located in Dallas? Yes

Item#s 36 &38, No Bid

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

75.Envelope Open End Style 10 cartons/cases
Paper: 24# Brown Kraft or better

Size: 67 x 97

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case

Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

76.Envelope Open End Style 10 cartons/cases
Paper: 244 Brown Kraft or better

Size: 97 x 127

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case

Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case

Specify Brand/Product Number

77.Envelope Open End Style 10 cartons/cases
Paper: 24# Brown Kraft or better

Size: 10" x 137

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case

Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case
Specify Brand/Product Number

78.Envelope Open End Style 10 cartons/cases
Paper: 24%# Brown Kraft or better

Size: 12" x 15-1/2"

Split Seal Gum Flap

Diagonal Seam

Packaging: 500 per box / 5 boxes per case

Inside Delivery Required

Specify total number of rolls per carton/case
Specify Brand/Product Number

Total Group 8:

Should your firm be awarded this contract,
describe what (if any) portion of the bid
requirment will be subcontracted out:

Specify the name, telephone number and e-
mail address (if any) of the designated
account representative who will be managing
daily activities of this account:

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other
Governmental Entities decide to participate
in this contract, would you, the awarded
Contractor agree that all terms, conditions,
specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?

Western-BRW

1800 Kelly Blvd
Carrolton, TX 75006

o

oug Warren
69-568-5000
69-568-5016

warren@westernbrw.com

(=

Reccommended for award

Total Award Amount $677,621.90

©

18.82 $188.20

w
(=1
(=]

PRINTMASTER 4104

o

31.42 $314.20

L4222/

Doug Warren

N

%?ISINTMASTER 4151

% * 63.06 $630.60
N 05 5630
\

\

§

§

\ SPOROTNTMASTER 93404

\

\ $9,687.10
\

% No

) s
\ will handle
\ 100%.
N\

N

\

\

§

N

X

\

\
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