

Lowest Responsive Bidder		Price		Total		Notes	
Peerless Events and Tents 3301 E. Randol Mill Rd. Arlington, TX 76011 Terrena Jones terrena@peerlesseventsandtents.com 972-602-3303		TLC Event Rentals 4445 McEwen Rd. Farmers Branch, TX 75244 Jay Cooper jcooper@tlceventrentals.com 214-507-8192					
Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Notes	Price
Section 1: Folding Tables- Wood Tops (Natural Wood Color) with Metal Legs, Smooth finished top (no splinters or roughness)							
1	Daily Rate for 8 foot table Rental (8'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$6.99	\$1,747.50		ALL PRICES INCLUDE DELIVERY FEE
2	Weekly Rate for 8 foot table Rental (8'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$10.99	\$2,747.50		BUILT IN DUE TO NO LINE
3	Replacement for 8 foot table Rental (8'L x 30"W x 30"H)	1	each	\$90.00	\$90.00		ITEM FOR DELIVERY
4	Daily Rate for 6 foot table Rental (6'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$5.99	\$1,497.50		CHARGE ON BID FORM
5	Weekly Rate for 6 foot table Rental (6'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$9.99	\$2,497.50		
6	Replacement for 6 foot table Rental (6'L x 30"W x 30"H)	1	each	\$75.00	\$75.00		
7	Daily Rate for 4 foot table Rental (4'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$5.99	\$1,497.50		No Bid
8	Weekly Rate for 4 foot table Rental (4'L x 30"W x 30"H)	250	each	\$10.99	\$2,747.50		No Bid
9	Replacement for 4 foot table Rental (4'L x 30"W x 30"H)	1	each	\$75.00	\$75.00		No Bid
Section 2: Folding Chairs- Padded Seat and Back Area, Frame: Steel							
10	Daily Rate for Folding Chairs	600	each	\$0.90	\$540.00		
11	Weekly Rate for Folding Chairs	600	each	\$1.80	\$1,080.00		
12	Replacement for Folding Chairs	1	each	\$16.00	\$16.00		
Section 3: Cloth Table- 10' minimum length							
13	Daily Rate for Cloth Table	300	each	\$7.00	\$2,100.00		
14	Weekly Rate for Cloth Table	300	each	\$14.00	\$4,200.00		
15	Replacement for Cloth Table	1	each	\$24.00	\$24.00		
Section 4: Tents							
16	Daily Rate for Tent with Walls (10x10)	30	each	\$110.00	\$3,300.00		TENT PRICES INCLUDE COST OF MATERIALS AND
17	Weekly Rate for Tents with Walls (10x10)	30	each	\$270.00	\$8,100.00		
18	Replacement for Tents with Walls (10x10)	1	each	\$600.00	\$600.00		

					WEIGHTS AS WELL	
19	Daily Rate for Tents with Walls (10x20)	30 each	\$210.00	\$6,300.00	\$539.15	\$16,174.50
20	Weekly Rate for Tent with Walls (10x20)	30 each	\$460.00	\$13,800.00	\$769.22	\$23,076.60
21	Replacement for Tents with Walls (10x20)	1 each	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,200.00	\$3,200.00
22	Daily Rate for Tent without Walls (10x10)	30 each	\$100.00	\$3,000.00	\$350.40	\$10,512.00
23	Weekly Rate for Tents without Walls (10x10)	30 each	\$200.00	\$6,000.00	\$486.10	\$14,583.00
24	Replacement for Tents without Walls (10x10)	1 each	\$600.00	\$600.00	\$2,100.00	\$2,100.00
25	Daily Rate for Tents without Walls (10x20)	30 each	\$1,200.00	\$36,000.00	\$453.93	\$13,617.90
26	Weekly Rate for Tent without Walls (10x20)	30 each	\$400.00	\$12,000.00	\$641.40	\$19,242.00
27	Replacement for Tents without Walls (10x20)	1 each	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,700.00	\$2,700.00
Section 5: Crowd Control Items						
28	Daily Rate for Crowd Control Plastic Stanchions 41"	30 each	\$3.00	\$90.00	\$21.00	\$630.00
29	Weekly Rate for Crowd Control Plastic Stanchions 41"	30 each	\$6.00	\$180.00	\$31.00	\$930.00
30	Replacement for Crowd Control Plastic Stanchions 41"	1 each	\$24.00	\$24.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
31	Daily Rate for Crowd Control Stanchions 40"	30 each	\$9.00	\$270.00	\$75.00	\$2,250.00
32	Weekly Rate for Crowd Control Stanchions 40"	30 each	\$8.00	\$240.00	\$112.00	\$3,360.00
33	Replacement for Crowd Control Stanchions 40"	1 each	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
34	Daily Rate for Crowd Control Chrome Stanchions 41"	30 each	\$12.00	\$360.00	\$30.00	\$900.00
35	Weekly Rate for Crowd Control Chrome Stanchions 41"	30 each	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$45.00	\$1,350.00
36	Replacement for Crowd Control Chrome Stanchions 41"	1 each	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
37	Daily Rate for 6' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	10 each	\$3.00	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid
38	Weekly Rate for 6' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	10 each	\$6.00	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid
39	Replacement for 6' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	1 each	\$12.00	\$12.00	No Bid	No Bid
40	Daily Rate for 8' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	10 each	\$4.00	\$40.00	\$9.00	\$90.00
41	Weekly Rate for 8' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	10 each	\$9.00	\$90.00	\$13.50	\$135.00
42	Replacement for 8' Plastic Chains for Crowd Control	1 each	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
43	Daily Rate for 8 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	10 each	\$6.00	\$60.00	\$24.00	\$240.00
44	Weekly Rate for 8 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	10 each	\$12.00	\$120.00	\$36.00	\$360.00
45	Replacement for 8 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	1 each	\$21.00	\$21.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
46	Daily Rate for 6 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	10 each	\$6.00	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid
47	Weekly Rate for 6 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	10 each	\$12.00	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid
48	Replacement for 6 foot Black Rope for Crowd Control	1 each	\$21.00	\$21.00	No Bid	No Bid
Total				\$115,647.00		\$277,977.40