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1 IFB 2021-043-6910
2 Purchase of HVAC Maxari Energy LLC dba Energy Fundz Fastenal Company Seherlhde LLC dba Freedom Air Filtration Low Bid Vendor Name
3 10206 Briar Rose Drive 4934 Sharp Street 112 4th Street
4 Houston, Texas 77042 Dallas, Texas 75247 Downers Grove, IL 60515
5 Award Court Order: Mr. Raya Guruswamy Mr. John Bender Ms. Amy lhde
6 Buyer: James Gay info@energyfundz.com txdal@stores.fastenal.com amy@freedomairfiltration.com
7 214-653-7434 Ph# 713-715-8986 214-905-1560 877-715-8999
8 AWARD
9 Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
Lines#

1,2,4,10,11,12,14,15,16,17,18,19,21,

23,24,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,37,38,39,

41,42,45,47,48,49,50,51,52,53,54,55,

56,57,59,60,61,62,63,64,65,66,67,69, Lines#3,8,9,13,20,22,25,26,34,36,40,43,46,55,
10 70,73,74,75,76,77,78,79,80 Lines#5,6,7,35 58,68,71,72,81,82,83,84
11] ITEM Description UOM | Quantity (five-year) Unit Price Five-year Extended Price Unit Price Five-year Price Unit Price Five-year Price
12
13] 1 [Size: 20"W X 50°L X 2” thick Rolls 75 $36.25 $2,718.75 No Bid $44.70 $3,352.50 $36.25 Energy Fundz
14 )\ media, dry tackifier,
15 blue/white, MERV 7
16 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
17
18 2 |Size: 36”W X 500°L X 2” thick Rolls 150 $59.28 $8,892.00 No Bid $80.30 $12,045.00 $59.28 Energy Fundz
19 polyester media, dry tackifier,
20 blue/white, MERV 7
21 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
22
23] 3 |Size: 48"W X 50°L X 2" thick Rolls 70 $79.09 $5,536.30 No Bid $77.20 $5,404.00 $77.20 Freedom
24 polyester media, dry tackifier,
25 blue/white, MERV 7
26 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
27
28 4 [Size: 60”W X 50°L X 2” thick Rolls 30 $99.65 $2,989.50 No Bid $152.87 $4,586.10 $99.65 Energy Fundz
29 polyester media, dry tackifier,
30 blue/white, MERV 7
31 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
32
33 5 |Size: 20"W X 90’L X 1” thick Rolls 50 $36.81 $1,840.50 $33.50 $1,675.00 $49.12 $2,456.00 $33.50 Fastenal
34 polyester media, dry tackifier,
35 blue/white, MERV 7
36 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
37 Fastenal No. 4302851
38
39 6 |Size: 30"W X 90’L X 1"thick Rolls 35 $57.76 $2,021.60 $52.56 $1,839.60 $91.97 $3,218.95 $52.56 Fastenal
40 polyester media, dry tackifier,
41 blue/white, MERV 7
42 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
43 Fastenal No. 4302854
44
45 7 |Size: 60"W X90’L X 1” thick Rolls 355 $144.00 $51,120.00 $131.40 $46,647.00 $152.87 $54,268.85 $131.40 Fastenal
46 polyester media, dry tackifier,
47 blue/white, MERV 7
48 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
49 Fastenal No. 4302860
50
51 8 |[Size: 45”W X 65’L X 1” thick Rolls 35 No Bid No Bid $166.68 $5,833.80 $166.68 Freedom
52 polyester media, for Farr Model 40F
53 and 42F
54 Fastenal No. 10473-07497 or equal
55
56 9 |Size: 57"W X 65'L X 1” thick Rolls 25 No Bid No Bid $183.35 $4,583.75 $183.35 Freedom
57 polyester media, for Farr Model 50F
58 and 52F
59 Fastenal No. 10473-07496 or equal
60
61] 10 [Size, 10WX24” HX1"D Each 240 $2.52 $604.80 $2.65 $636.00 $3.38 $811.20 $2.52 Energy Fundz
62 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
63 efficiency, MERV 8
64 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
65 Fastenal No. 4300393
66
67] 11 |Size, 12’WX 12" HX1"D Each 560 $2.33 $1,304.80 $2.57 $1,439.20 $3.62 $2,027.20 $2.33 Energy Fundz
68 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
69 efficiency, MERV 8
70 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
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71 Fastenal No. 4300396

72

73] 12 |Size, 14W X 24" HX1"D Each 1200 $2.67 $3,204.00 $2.94 $3,528.00 $3.20 $3,840.00 $2.67 Energy Fundz
74 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

75 efficiency, MERV 8

76 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

77 Fastenal No. 4300405

78

79] 13 |Size, 14'W X 9.25" HX 1D Each 60 $5.88 $352.80 $5.80 $348.00 $5.02 $301.20 $5.02 Freedom
80 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

81 efficiency, MERV 8

82 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

83

84| 14 |[Size, 14W X 24" HX1"D Each 1200 $2.67 $3,204.00 $2.94 $3,528.00 $3.20 $3,840.00 $2.67 Energy Fundz
85 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

86 efficiency, MERV 8

87 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

88 Fastenal No. 4300405

89

90| 15 |[Size, 15W X 20" HX1"D Each 60 $2.41 $144.60 $2.65 $159.00 $3.02 $181.20 $2.41 Energy Fundz
91 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

92 efficiency, MERV 8

93 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

94

95] 16 |Size, 16'W X 16" HX 1"D Each 1160 $2.67 $3,097.20 $2.94 $3,410.40 $4.07 $4,721.20 $2.67 Energy Fundz
96 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

97 efficiency, MERV 8

98 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

99 Fastenal No. 4300412 or equal

100]

101] 17 |Size, 16’'W X 20” HX 1"D Each 900 $2.05 $1,845.00 $2.27 $2,043.00 $3.02 $2,718.00 $2.05 Energy Fundz
102] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

103] efficiency, MERV 8

104 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

105] Fastenal No. 4300413

106

107] 18 |Size, 16’'W X 25” HX 1"D Each 360 $3.29 $1,184.40 $3.62 $1,303.20 $3.37 $1,213.20 $3.29 Energy Fundz
108| synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
1_09' efficiency, MERV 8

110] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

111 Fastenal No. 4300543

112

113] 19 |Size, 16’'W X 25” HX 1"D Each 2760 $2.24 $6,182.40 $2.47 $6,817.20 $3.37 $9,301.20 $2.24 Energy Fundz
114] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

115] efficiency, MERV 8

116} Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

117] Fastenal No. 4300416

118

119] 20 |Size, 17’W X 30” HX 1"D Each 580 $8.96 $5,196.80 $9.41 $5,457.80 $8.35 $4,843.00 $8.35 Freedom
120 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

121 efficiency, MERV 8

122 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

123]

124] 21 |Size, 18'W X 18” HX 1"D Each 180 $2.67 $480.60 $2.94 $529.20 $4.07 $732.60 $2.67 Energy Fundz
125 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

126) efficiency, MERV 8

127] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

128] Fastenal No. 4300418

129)

130] 22 |Size, 18'W X 26” HX 1"D Each 180 $8.03 $1,445.40 $8.43 $1,517.40 $6.68 $1,202.40 $6.68 Freedom
131 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

132] efficiency, MERV 8

133 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

134] Fastenal No. 10473-07105

135)

136] 23 |Size, 20'W X 20” H X 1"D Each 2200 $2.24 $4,928.00 $2.47 $5,434.00 $3.37 $7,414.00 $2.24 Energy Fundz
137 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

138] efficiency, MERV 8
| 139] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

140) Fastenal No. 4300424

141

142] 24 |Size, 20'W X 25” HX 1"D Each 2400 $2.45 $5,880.00 $2.70 $6,480.00 $3.73 $8,952.00 $2.45 Energy Fundz
143] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

144 efficiency, MERV 8

145] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
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146) Fastenal No. 4300427

147]
[ 148] 25 |Size, 23.5"W x 21.5"Hx 1"D Each 60 $8.96 $537.60 $9.41 $564.60 $3.92 $235.20 $3.92 Energy Fundz
149) Pleated

150 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

151 efficiency, MERV 8

152 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

153

154] 26 | Size, 20'W X 30" HX 1"D Each 870 $5.19 $4,515.30 $5.44 $4,732.80 $3.75 $3,262.50 $3.75 Freedom
155 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

156) efficiency, MERV 8

157] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
| 158] Fastenal No. 4300428

159

160] 27 |Size, 12'W X 24” HX 2"D Each 6440 $2.28 $14,683.20 $2.51 $16,164.40 $3.13 $20,157.20 $2.28 Energy Fundz
161 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

162 efficiency, MERV 8

163 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

164] Fastenal No. 0492501

165

166] 28 |Size, 14'W X 20” HX 2"D Each 360 $2.28 $820.80 $2.51 $903.60 $3.57 $1,285.20 $2.28 Energy Fundz
167| synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

168 efficiency, MERV 8

169 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

170]

171] 29 |Size, 14’'W X 25” H X 2"D Each 60 $2.52 $151.20 $2.79 $167.40 $3.60 $216.00 $2.52 Energy Fundz
172 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

173] efficiency, MERV 8

174] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

175]

176] 30 |Size, 15'W X 20” H X 2"D Each 60 $2.28 $136.80 $2.51 $150.60 $3.80 $228.00 $2.28 Energy Fundz
177| synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
1_78| efficiency, MERV 8

179] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

180] Fastenal No. 0492506

181

182] 31 |Size, 16’'W X 20” H X 2"D Each 2340 $2.21 $5,171.40 $2.32 $5,428.80 $3.23 $7,558.20 $2.21 Energy Fundz
183] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

184 efficiency, MERV 8

185 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

186) Fastenal No. 0492506

187]

188] 32 |Size, 16’'W X 24” HX 2"D Each 610 $2.52 $1,537.20 $2.79 $1,701.90 $3.70 $2,257.00 $2.52 Energy Fundz
189) synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

190 efficiency, MERV 8

191 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

192] Fastenal No. 0492506

193]

194] 33 |Size, 16'W X 25" HX 2" Each 2880 $2.24 $6,451.20 $2.51 $7,228.80 $3.75 $10,800.00 $2.24 Energy Fundz
195 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

196) efficiency, MERV 8

197 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

 198] Fastenal No. 0492503

199

200] 34 |Size, 16'W X 30" HX 2"D Each 60 $12.46 $747.60 $13.08 $784.80 $3.77 $226.20 $3.77 Freedom
201 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

202 efficiency, MERV 8

| 203] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

204

205] 35 |20.5'W x8.5”"Hx2"D Each 120 $8.73 $1,047.60 $6.08 $729.60 $10.02 $1,202.40 $6.08 Fastenal
206) Pleated synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

207| efficiency, MERV 8

| 208] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

209

210] 36 |20.5'W x22"Hx2"D Each 240 $12.09 $2,901.60 $12.70 $3,048.00 $10.02 $2,404.80 $10.02 Freedom
211 Pleated synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

212 efficiency, MERV 8

213 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

214

215] 37 |Size, 20'W X 20” H X 2"D Each 2900 $2.21 $6,409.00 $2.48 $7,192.00 $3.67 $10,643.00 $2.21 Energy Fundz
216) synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

217| efficiency, MERV 8

218 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

219 Fastenal No. 0492505
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221] 38 |Size, 20'W X 24" HX 2"D Each 1240 $2.80 $3,472.00 $3.07 $3,806.80 $4.10 $5,084.00 $2.80 Energy Fundz
222 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
223| efficiency, MERV 8
224 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
225 Fastenal No. 0492507
226
227] 39 | Size, 20'W X 25" HX 2"D Each 3680 $2.52 $9,273.60 $2.79 $10,267.20 $4.18 $15,382.40 $2.52 Energy Fundz
228 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
229 efficiency, MERV 8
230 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
231
232] 40 |Size, 20'W X 30” H X 2"D Each 180 $4.76 $856.80 $5.00 $900.00 $4.18 $752.40 $4.18 Freedom
233] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
234 efficiency, MERV 8
235 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
236) Fastenal No. 4300446
237
238] 41 |Size, 24'W X 24” HX 2"D Each 13570 $2.79 $37,860.30 $3.06 $41,524.20 $4.55 $61,743.50 $2.79 Energy Fundz
ﬁ' synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
240 efficiency, MERV 8
241 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
242] Fastenal No. 0492508
243]
244] 42 |Size, 25'W X 20” H X 2"D Each 360 $2.52 $907.20 $2.79 $1,004.40 $4.18 $1,504.80 $2.52 Energy Fundz
245| synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
246 efficiency, MERV 8
247] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
248 Fastenal No. 0492504
[2:]
250] 43 |Size, 28.5 “W X 29.5”" HX 2"D Each 60 $30.47 $1,828.20 $21.34 $1,280.40 $11.68 $700.80 $11.68 Freedom
251 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
252 efficiency, MERV 8
253 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
254
255] 44 |Size, 17’W X 30” HX 1"D Each 240 $8.67 $2,080.80 $9.10 $2,184.00 $11.68 $2,803.20 $8.67 Energy Fundz
256) synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
257 efficiency, MERV 8
258 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
| 259] Fastenal No. 4300599
260
261] 45 |Size, 18W X 22" HX1"D Each 180 $3.80 $684.00 $4.32 $777.60 $11.68 $2,102.40 $3.80 Energy Fundz
262] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
263| efficiency, MERV 8
264 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
265, Fastenal No. 4300468
266
267] 46 |Size, 200'W X 30” HX 1"D Each 180 $3.83 $689.40 $4.36 $784.80 $3.75 $675.00 $3.75 Freedom
268| synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
@' efficiency, MERV 8
270 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
271 Fastenal No. 4300475
272
273] 47 |Size, 28'W X 10" HX 1"D Each 80 $6.49 $519.20 $6.82 $545.60 $6.68 $534.40 $6.49 Energy Fundz
274 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
275 efficiency, MERV 8
276 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
277
278] 48 |Size,8” W x12”"Hx2"D Each 40 $8.24 $329.60 $8.65 $346.00 $8.35 $334.00 $8.24 Energy Fundz
279 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
280 efficiency, MERV 8
281 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
282
283] 49 |Size, 12'W X 24" HX 2D Each 1020 $2.88 $2,937.60 $3.26 $3,325.20 $3.13 $3,192.60 $2.88 Energy Fundz
284 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
285 efficiency, MERV 8
286 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
287, Fastenal No. 4300482
288
[289] 50 |Size, 16'W X 20" HX 2"D Each 420 $2.88 $1,209.60 $3.26 $1,369.20 $3.23 $1,356.60 $2.88 Energy Fundz
290 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
291 efficiency, MERV 8
292 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
293 Fastenal No. 4300488
294
295) 51 |Size, 16'W X 24" HX 2"D Each 1800 $3.13 $5,634.00 $3.55 $6,390.00 $3.70 $6,660.00 $3.13 Energy Fundz
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296) synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

297| efficiency, MERV 8

ﬁ' Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

299 Fastenal No. 4300489

300]

301} 52 |[Size, 16'W X 25" HX2"D Each 1040 $3.13 $3,255.20 $3.55 $3,692.00 $3.75 $3,900.00 $3.13 Energy Fundz
302 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

303 efficiency, MERV 8

304] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

305 Fastenal No. 4300490

306

307] 53 |[Size, 16.5’'W X 21" HX2"D Each 40 $10.35 $414.00 $12.53 $501.20 $11.68 $467.20 $10.35 Energy Fundz
ﬁ' synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

309 efficiency, MERV 8

310) Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

311 Fastenal No. 4300490

312

313] 54 |[Size, 18'W X 24" HX2"D Each 420 $3.48 $1,461.60 $3.94 $1,654.80 $3.97 $1,667.40 $3.48 Energy Fundz
314 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

315 efficiency, MERV 8

316 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

317] Fastenal No. 4300495

B

319] 55 [Size, 18.5"W x 33"H x 2"D Each 20 $15.73 $314.60 $19.07 $381.40 $11.68 $233.60 $11.68 Freedom
320 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

321 efficiency, MERV 8

322] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

323]

324] 56 [Size, 20'W X 20" HX 2"D Each 300 $3.13 $939.00 $3.55 $1,065.00 $3.67 $1,101.00 $3.13 Energy Fundz
325 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

326 efficiency, MERV 8

327 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

328 Fastenal No. 4300497

329

330] 57 |[Size, 20'W X 25" HX2"D Each 1860 $3.48 $6,472.80 $3.94 $7,328.40 $4.18 $7,774.80 $3.48 Energy Fundz
331 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

332 efficiency, MERV 8

333] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

334 Fastenal No. 4300499

335

336] 58 |[Size, 12'W X 24” HX4"D Each 480 $5.01 $2,404.80 $5.27 $2,529.60 $3.13 $1,502.40 $3.13 Energy Fundz
337] synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
ﬁ' efficiency, MERV 8

339 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

340]

341] 59 |[Size, 16'W X 20" H X4"D Each 6400 $4.71 $30,144.00 $5.33 $34,112.00 $6.07 $38,848.00 $4.71 Energy Fundz
342 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

343] efficiency, MERV 8

344] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

345 Fastenal No. 4300506

346

347] 60 |[Size, 16'W X 25" H X 4"D Each 2150 $5.11 $10,986.50 $5.80 $12,470.00 $6.20 $13,330.00 $5.11 Energy Fundz
ﬁ' synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

349 efficiency, MERV 8

350 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

351 Fastenal No. 4300508

352

353] 61 [Size, 20W X 20” H X4”D Each 4180 $5.11 $21,359.80 $5.80 $24,244.00 $6.47 $27,044.60 $5.11 Energy Fundz
354§ synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

355 efficiency, MERV 8

356) Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

357] Fastenal No. 4300510
B

359] 62 [Size, 20W X 24” H X4"D Each 60 $6.09 $365.40 $6.90 $414.00 $6.53 $391.80 $6.09 Energy Fundz
360 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

361 efficiency, MERV 8

362] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

363|

364] 63 [Size, 20"W X 25” H X4"D Each 1040 $5.99 $6,229.60 $6.81 $7,082.40 $6.53 $6,791.20 $5.99 Energy Fundz
365 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%

366 efficiency, MERV 8

367 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal

368| Fastenal No. 4300512

369

370] 64 [Size, 24W X 20" HX 4"D Each 120 $6.09 $730.80 $6.90 $828.00 $6.53 $783.60 $6.09 Energy Fundz
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371 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
372 efficiency, MERV 8
373 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
374
375] 65 [Size, 24W X 24” HX 4"D Each 4240 $6.51 $27,602.40 $7.74 $32,817.60 $6.55 $27,772.00 $6.51 Energy Fundz
376 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
377 efficiency, MERV 8
378] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
379 Fastenal No. 4300513
380
381] 66 |Size: 24 x 24 x20 (6 pocket filters) Each 1600 $24.68 $39,488.00 $35.60 $56,960.00 $36.15 $57,840.00 $24.68 Energy Fundz
382 Need 320 individual filters
383] Pleated
3844 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
385 efficiency, MERV 8
386) Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
387]
388] 67 [Size: 12 x 24 x 20 (6 pocket filters) Each 220 $21.52 $4,734.40 $40.94 $9,006.80 $36.15 $7,953.00 $21.52 Energy Fundz
| 389) Need 44 individual filters
390] Pleated
391 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
392 efficiency, MERV 8
393] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
394
395] 68 [Size:24”"W x 24"H x6"D Each 20 $49.27 $985.40 $44.10 $882.00 $25.02 $500.40 $25.02 Freedom
396 Pleated
397 synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
398 efficiency, MERV 8
399) Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
400
401} 69 |[Size: 12”"W x 20"H x 2"D Each 320 $2.52 $806.40 $2.78 $889.60 $3.02 $966.40 $2.52 Energy Fundz
402| Pleated
403} Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
404 Efficiency, MERV 8
405] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
406
407] 70 |[Size: 20"W x 24"H x 2"D Each 400 $2.80 $1,120.00 $3.07 $1,228.00 $4.10 $1,640.00 $2.80 Energy Fundz
408| Pleated
4_09' Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
410} Efficiency, MERV 8
411 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
412
413] 71 |[Size: 20"W x 30"H x 2"D Each 200 $4.76 $952.00 $5.00 $1,000.00 $4.18 $836.00 $4.18 Energy Fundz
414 Pleated
415 Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
416 Efficiency, MERV 8
417] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
418
419] 72 |Size: 26”"W x 29"H x 1"D Each 120 $17.97 $2,156.40 $12.58 $1,509.60 $11.68 $1,401.60 $11.68 Freedom
420) Pleated
421 Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
422 Efficiency, MERV 8
423] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
424
425 73 |Size: 24"W X 24"H X 4D Each 600 $6.51 $3,906.00 $7.74 $4,644.00 $6.55 $3,930.00 $6.51 Energy Fundz
426 Pleated
427 Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
428 Efficiency, MERV 8
429 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
430}
431] 74 |Size: 20X20X4 Each 100 $5.11 $511.00 $5.80 $580.00 $6.47 $647.00 $5.11 Energy Fundz
432] Pleated
433 Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
434 Efficiency, MERV 8
435 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
436
437] 75 |Size: 16"W X 20"HX 1"D Each 400 $2.06 $824.00 $2.27 $908.00 $3.02 $1,208.00 $2.06 Energy Fundz
438] Pleated
4_39' Synthetic fiber media, 30-35%
440 Efficiency, MERV 8
441 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
442
443] 76 |Size 24”W x24”H x11”D Hepa Each 40 $190.31 $7,612.40 No Bid $270.48 $10,819.20 $190.31 Energy Fundz
444 microglass media, 95% DOP
445] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
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446
447] 77 _|Size: 24"W X 12” H X 11-1/2"D Each 160 $139.94 $22,390.40 $141.69 $22,670.40 $184.58 $29,532.80 $139.94 Energy Fundz
i&' microglass media, 95% DOP
449 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
450 Fastenal No. 4303030
451
452] 78 | Size: 24”W X 24” HX 11-1/2"D Each 850 $190.30 $161,755.00 $199.82 $169,847.00 $270.48 $229,908.00 $190.30 Energy Fundz
453] microglass media, 95% DOP
454] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
455
456] 79 |Size:233/8X233/8x11% Each 720 $191.64 $137,980.80 $510.19 $367,336.80 $270.48 $194,745.60 $191.64 Energy Fundz
457 Hepa microglass media, 95% DOP
| 458] Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
459
460] 80 |Size:233/8X113/8X11% Each 160 $134.95 $21,592.00 $431.82 $69,091.20 $184.58 $29,532.80 $134.95 Energy Fundz
461 Hepa microglass media, 95% DOP
462 Manufacturer: ProFitter® or equal
463
464] 81 [Size: 24”W X 12H X 12"D, fiberglass Each 330 $62.35 $20,575.50 $65.45 $21,598.50 $52.52 $17,331.60 $52.52 Feedom
465) media, single header, 85%
466 efficiency, MERV 13
467
468] 82 [Size: 24”W X 24H X 12"D, fiberglass Each 680 $76.21 $51,822.80 $80.02 $54,413.60 $70.02 $47,613.60 $70.02 Feedom
469 media, single header, 85%
470 efficiency, MERV 13
471
472] 83 |Size 12"W X 24”H x 19"D Each 120 $62.34 $7,480.80 No Bid $36.15 $4,338.00 $36.15 Feedom
473
474] 84 |[Size 24"W X 24"H X 19"D Each 480 $76.22 $36,585.60 $45.13 $21,662.40 $45.13 Feedom
475
476
477 Award Total $621,749.95 $50,891.20 $125,844.65
[476]




	Bid Tab

