TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

Addendums Returned

1. High Performance Cold Mix UPM or equal, as 100
per bid specification
Estimated Annual Quantities: 100 tons

Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plants
Location of Plant #1

Location of Plant #2
Location of Plant #3
Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

2. Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
Installed (Laid) by Contractor Hot Mix Asphaltic
Material, as per bid specifications

2.1 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
TXDOT Item 340, Type B, Installed or Laid by
Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications
Estimated Annual Quantities: 3000 tons

1500 tons or more, per job Maximum four (4) mile
haul

UOM

Location of Plant #1 3000 Ton

Location of Plant #2 3000 Ton

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7395

No

Yes

Letter from Dallas County
Purchasing Department
Yes

No Bid

Dallas Plant

11143 Goodnight Lane
Dallas, Texas 75229
972.241.2781

7am - 5 pm , Monday-Friday

South Dallas Plant

7580 S Central

Dallas, Texas

7am - 5pm, Monday-Friday

$56.00 $168,000.00

$56.00 $168,000.00

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

No
Yes
Dallas County Website

Yes

Sunnyvale

4601 Scyene Rd.
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Rapid Road Repair

Leston

4625 Leston Ave.
Dallas, Texas
214.631.7682
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Gribble

11050 Luna Road
Dallas, Texas
972.373.8526
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

$86.00 $86,000.00

$48.40 $145,200.00

$48.40 $145,200.00

VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

No
Yes
E-Mail
Yes

No Bid

No Bid

VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

No
No
Dallas County Website

Yes

No Bid

Lewisville $46.00 $138,000.00
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm

Euless $46.00 $138,000.00
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas
817-267-3132
7am - 4pm



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

Location of Plant #3

UOM

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7395

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

Sunnyvale

4601 Scyene Rd
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

$49.70  $149,100.00
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VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION:

Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

2.2 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
TXDOT Item 340, Type B, Installed or Laid by
Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications
Estimated Annual Quantities: 1500 tons

500 to 1499 tons per job Maximum four (4) mile
haul
Location of Plant #1

Location of Plant #2

Location of Plant #3

Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

2.3 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
TXDOT Item 340, Type B, Installed or Laid by
Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications
Estimated Annual Quantities: 500 tons

7.5 to 499 tons per job Maximum four (4) mile
haul
Location of Plant #1

Est.

Qty.

UOM

1500 Ton

1500 Ton

500

Ton

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7395

Dallas Plant

11143 Goodnight Lane
Dallas, Texas 75229
972.241.2781

7am - 5 pm , Monday-Friday

$56.00 $84,000.00

South Dallas Plant

7580 S Central

Dallas, Texas

7am - 5pm, Monday-Friday

$56.00 $84,000.00

Dallas Plant

11143 Goodnight Lane
Dallas, Texas 75229
972.241.2781

7am - 5 pm , Monday-Friday

$63.00 $31,500.00

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

Leston $50.00 $75,000.00
4625 Leston Ave.

Dallas, Texas

214.631.7682

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Gribble $50.00 $75,000.00
11050 Luna Rd

Dallas, Texas

972.373.8526

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Sunnyvale $51.30 $76,950.00
4601 Scyene Rd.

Dallas, Texas

972.226.7752

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Leston $52.50 $26,250.00
4625 Leston Ave.

Dallas, Texas

214.631.7682

7:00 am - 4:00 pm
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VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

No Bid

No Bid

VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

Tx Dot Item 340 Type B

Lewisville $52.50 $78,750.00
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm

Euless $52.50 $78,750.00
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas

817-267-3132

7am - 4pm

Tx Dot Item 340 Type B

Lewisville §79.00 $39,500.00
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION: Est. UOM
Qty.

Location of Plant #2 500 Ton

Location of Plant #3

Location of Plant #4

Location of Plant #5

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

2.4 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -

TXDOT Item 340, Type D, Installed or Laid by

Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications

Estimated Annual Quantities: 2,000 tons

1500 tons or more, per job Maximum four (4)

mila hanl

Location of Plant #1 2000 Ton

Location of Plant #2 2000 Ton

Location of Plant #3

Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

2.5 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
TXDOT Item 340, Type D, Installed or Laid by
Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications
Estimated Annual Quantities: 1,500 tons

500 to 1499 tons per job Maximum four (4) mile
haul

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7395

South Dallas Plant $63.00 $31,500.00
7580 S Central Dallas,

Texas 7am - 5pm Monday-

Friday

Dallas Plant $61.00 $122,000.00

11143 Goodnight Lane
Dallas, Texas 75229
972.241.2781

7am - 5 pm , Monday-Friday

South Dallas Plant $61.00 $122,000.00
7580 S Central Dallas,

Texas Tam -

5pm Monday-Friday

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

Gribble

11050 Luna Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.373.8526
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Sunnyvale

4601 Scyene Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Leston

4625 Leston Ave.
Dallas, Texas
214.631.7682
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Gribble

11050 Luna Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.373.8526
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Sunnyvale

4601 Scyene Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

$52.50 $26,250.00

$53.80  $26,900.00

No Bid
$52.20 $104,400.00
$52.20 $104,400.00
$53.60 $107,200.00

No Bid
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VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

Euless §79.00 $39,500.00
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas

817-267-3132

7am - 4pm

Tx Dot Item 340 Type B

Lewisville $60.00 $120,000.00
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm

Euless $60.00 $120,000.00
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas

817-267-3132

7am - 4pm

Tx Dot Item 340 Type D



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

BID NO. 2010-014-4736 Austin Bridge & Road LP APAC Texas Inc. Austin Asphalt LP Reynolds Asphalt Co.

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150 PO Box 224048 6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150 P.O. Box 370

Irving, Tx 75063 Dallas, Texas 75222 Irving, Tx 75063 Euless, TX 76040
OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009 Michael Landen Steven Koonce Pat Tinsley Ned Tankersley

Tel: 214.596.7300 Tel: 214.741.3531 Tel: 214.596.7300 817.267.3131
Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and Fax: 214.596.7395 Fax: 214.742.3540 Fax: 214.596.7397 817.267.1878

Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION: Est. UOM
Qty.
Location of Plant #1 1500 Ton Dallas Plant $61.00 $91,500.00 Leston $52.50 $78,750.00 Lewisville $67.00 $100,500.00
11143 Goodnight Lane 4625 Leston Ave. 617 E College St.
Dallas, Texas 75229 Dallas, Texas Lewisville, Texas
972.241.2781 214.631.7682 972-434-2004
7am - 4 pm , Monday-Friday 7:00 am - 4:00 pm 7am - 4pm
Location of Plant #2 1500 Ton South Dallas Plant $61.00 $91,500.00 Gribble $52.50 $78,750.00 Euless $67.00 $100,500.00
7580 S Central Dallas, 11050 Luna Rd. 12650 Callaway Cementery
Texas 7am - Spm Dallas, Texas Euless, Texas
Monday-Friday 972.373.8526 817-267-3132
7:00 am - 4:00 pm 7am - 4pm
Location of Plant #3 Sunnyvale $53.90 $80,850.00
4601 Scyene Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed: Tx Dot Item 340 Type D
2.6 Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - No Bid

TXDOT Item 340, Type D, Installed or Laid by
Contractor Personnel, as per bid specifications
Estimated Annual Quantities: 1,000 tons

7.5 to 499 tons per job Maximum four (4) mile

haul
Location of Plant #1 1000 Ton Dallas Plant $67.00 $67,000.00 Leston $52.90 $52,900.00 Lewisville $87.00 $87,000.00
11143 Goodnight Lane 4625 Leston Ave. 617 E College St.
Dallas, Texas 75229 Dallas, Texas Lewisville, Texas
972.241.2781 214.631.7682 972-434-2004
7am - 5 pm , Monday-Friday 7:00 am - 4:00 pm 7am - 4pm
Location of Plant #2 1000 Ton South Dallas Plant $67.00 $67,000.00 Gribble $52.90 $52,900.00 Euless, 12650 Callaway $87.00 $87,000.00
7580 S Central Dallas, 11050 Luna Rd. Cementery, Euless, Tx, 817-
Texas 7am - Spm Dallas, Texas 267-3132, 7am - 4pm
Monday-Friday 972.373.8526
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Location of Plant #3 Sunnyvale $54.30 $54,300.00
4601 Scyene Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed: Tx Dot Item 340 Type D
2.7 Hauling cost in excess of four (4) miles: From Ton
nearest nlant to inh-cite Mile
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TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

2.8 Move in Charge

Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement -
Picked-up and Loaded on County Trucks,
Material must meet specifications in
accordance with the latest TXDOT Standard
Specifications for Construction of Highways,
Streets and Bridges, Item 340.

2.9. Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - 650
TXDOT Item 340, Type B, Loaded on County

Trucks at Vendor Plant

Estimated Annual Quantities: 650 tons

Location of Plant #1

Location of Plant #2

Location of Plant #3

Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7395

UOM

$3,000.00

Ton No Bid

2.10. Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - 40000 Ton No Bid

TXDOT Item 340, Type D, Loaded on County
Trucks at Vendor Plant
Estimated Annual Quantities: 40,000 tons

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

No Charge

Initial move-in at no
charge. If work is
suspended by Owner
resulting in resources being
removed from job site and
returned later when work is
restarted, a $1,300 charge
shall apply.

Leston $37.00 $24,050.00
4625 Leston Ave.

Dallas, Texas

214.631.7682

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Gribble $37.00 $24,050.00
11050 Luna Rd.

Dallas, Texas

972.373.8526

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Sunnyvale $40.00 $26,000.00
4601 Scyene Rd.

Dallas, Texas

972.226.7752

7:00 am - 4:00 pm

VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

Austin Asphalt

11143 Goodnight Lane
Dallas, Texas 75229
972.241.2781

7:00 am - 5:00 pm, Monday-
Friday

Austin Asphalt

7580 S Central
Dallas, Tx 75216
214-681-1678

7:00 am - 5:00 pm , Monday-
Friday

No bid

$34.00 $22,100.00

$34.00 $22,100.00

DAIB115-HMACTYB
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VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

$1,200.00

Lewisville $42.00 $27,300.00
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm

Euless $42.00 $27,300.00
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas

817-267-3132

7am - 4pm

Tx Dot Item 340 Type B



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION:

Location of Plant #1

Location of Plant #2

Location of Plant #3

Location of Plant #4
Location of Plant #5
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Proposed:

Please answer the questions listed below

Is the technical and descriptive literature
included with your bid proposal all the proposed
products?

Is the testing data information included with
your bid proposal?

Is the reference information included with your
bid proposal?

Specify the name, telephone number and e-mail
address (if one) of the account representative who
will be handling this account:

Does your firm/company have the require
insurance coverage stated under SECTION 3 -
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS?

If, No will your firm be able to obtained the
required coverage within ten (10) days upon
notification of contract award?

Est.

Qty.

UOM

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Michael Landen

Tel: 214.596.7300
Fax: 214.596.7395

No

No

No

Yes

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

Leston

4625 Leston Ave.
Dallas, Texas
214.631.7682
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Gribble

11050 Luna Road
Dallas, Texas
972.373.8526
7:00 am - 4:00 pm
Sunnyvale

4601 Scyene Rd.
Dallas, Texas
972.226.7752
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Yes

Yes

Yes

Pat Brady
248-2492
phbrady@apac.com

Yes

$38.50 $1,540,000.00

$39.75  $1,660,000.00

$41.50 $1,660,000.00
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VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

Austin Asphalt, LP, 11143
Goodnight Ln., Dallas, Texas
75229 (Map 22L), 972.241.2781,
7:00 am - 4:00 pm

Austin Asphalt - 7580 S Central,
Dallas, Tx 75216, 214-681-1678,
7am - 5pm , Monday-Friday

DAID115-HMACTYD

No

No

No

Pat Tinsley
214-596-7374
ptinsley@austin-ind.com

Yes

$37.25 $1,490,000.00

$37.25 $1,490,000.00

VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

Lewisville $43.50
617 E College St.

Lewisville, Texas

972-434-2004

7am - 4pm

Euless $43.50
12650 Callaway Cementery

Euless, Texas

817-267-3132

7am - 4pm

No

Pick Up:

Bob Cuykendall
817-267-3131
beuykendall@reynoldsasphal
t.com
Laydown:
Tankersley
817-267-3131
ntankersley@reynoldsasphalt
.com

Ned

Yes

$1,740,000.00

$1,740,000.00



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-014-4736

OPENING DATE: November 2, 2009

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Road and
Highway Building Material

DESCRIPTION:

Will you allow other governmental agencies to
utilize this contract?

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc.
included with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Specify Prompt Payment Discount Terms:

Information on Provision of Health Insurance
Coverage for Employees Dallas County may

consider the provision of health insurance coverage

for employees in the bid evaluation process (see
page 4, paragraph 4). Please complete the
information below to assist in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance
coverage to its employees, does the company share
in the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only
coverage and 50% for family coverage?

¢) If your company provides health insurance
coverage to its employees, is the coverage
comparable to the services provided by Dallas
County as described in the attached summary plan
descrintion? (See Attachment - A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors
in the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage
to their employees that compares to Dallas
County’s health insurance coverage and share in
the cost?

VENDOR #1

Austin Bridge & Road LP
6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150

Irving, Tx 75063
Michael Landen
Tel: 214.596.7300
Fax: 214.596.7395

No

Net 30 days

Yes

Yes

Yes

We do not know what kind of
health insurance, if any, that our

subcontractors provide.

VENDOR #2

APAC Texas Inc.
PO Box 224048
Dallas, Texas 75222
Steven Koonce

Tel: 214.741.3531
Fax: 214.742.3540

Yes

Net 30 days

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A
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VENDOR #3

Austin Asphalt LP

6330 Commerce Dr., Ste. 150
Irving, Tx 75063

Pat Tinsley

Tel: 214.596.7300

Fax: 214.596.7397

Yes

Net 30 days

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

VENDOR #4

Reynolds Asphalt Co.
P.O. Box 370

Euless, TX 76040
Ned Tankersley
817.267.3131
817.267.1878

Yes

Net 30 days

Yes

Yes

Yes

No



