DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5

BID NO:  2010-023-0000 Aramsco, Inc. Casco Industries Inc. Fischer Scientific Company, LLC Global Protection Hagemeyer North America,Inc.

1480 Grtandview Ave. 1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118 2000 Park Lane 444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A 1460 Tobias Gadson Blvd.

Thorofare, NJ. 08086 Grand Prairie, Tx. 75050 Pittsburg, PA. 15275 West Berlin, NJ 08091 Charleston, SC. 29407
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Richard Salerno Amy Neeb 412-490-833 1-800-957-8955 843-745-1832
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 856-686-7723 972-522-0800 412-490-1116 - Fax 1-856-768-2922 - Fax 803-705-8658 - Fax

Fax# 856-686-4423 972-522-0847 - Fax Cyndi Dubrwealskie Alan Lucas
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25, 2010
CONTRACT PERIOD:
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter Website Letter Website

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

1. Justrite Safety Drum Funnel - Justrite #
08207 Ea 2 No Bid No Bid 135.1 $270.20No Bid 142.33 $284.66
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8207 8207
2. Mercury Spill Absorbent Powder - EPS Ea 2 No Bid No Bid 34.29 $68.58| No Bid 83.93 $167.86
Chemicals Merconsorb Powder - 2-1/4 # Size
- EPS #20 MSORB500
Specify Brand Being Bid: 20MSORB500 20MSORB500
3. Ansul Spill X Chemical Spill Treatment Kit  Ea 1 No Bid No Bid 388.58 $388.58| No Bid 359.41 $359.41
Multi-agent Kit - Ansul #78744
Specify Brand Being Bid: 78744 78774
4. Ansul Spill - X - Chemical Spill Csof6 1 No Bid No Bid 81.43 $81.43| No Bid 75.29 $75.29
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77255
Specify Brand Being Bid: 77255 77255
5. Ansul Spill - X - C Chemical Spill Treatment
Agent - Ansul #77261 Csof6 1 No Bid No Bid 138.02 $138.02|No Bid 127.65 $127.65
Specify Brand Being Bid: 77261 77261
6. Ansul Spill - X - S Chemical Spill Treatment Cs of 6 1 No Bid No Bid 111.37 $111.37|No Bid 102.94 $102.94
Agent - Ansul #77265
Specify Brand Being Bid: 77265 77265
7. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles  Ea 20 468 $93.60|No Bid 52 $104.00(No Bid 5.19 $103.80
duoflex temples - red, white & blue frames
gray UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: S1179 S1179 S1179
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8. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles  Ea 20 468 $93.60|No Bid 52 $104.00(No Bid 5.19 $103.80
duoflex temples - red, white & blue frames
amber UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: $1159 Uvex S$1159 $1159
9. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles ~ Pkg/10 10 1.82 $18.20|No Bid 20.25 $202.50( No Bid 2021 $202.10
replacement gray UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: S536 Uvex S536 $536
10. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectales ~ Pkg/10 10 1.82 $18.20|No Bid 20.25 $202.50( No Bid 2021 $202.10
replacement amber UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid: S537 Uvex S537 $537
11. Uvex safety cord - uvex #5497 Ea 25 No Bid No Bid 5.76 $144.00|No Bid 1.38 $34.50
Specify Brand Being Bid: 497 S501
12. Baush & Lomb Permanent Plastic Lens Ea 2 No Bid No Bid 84.47 $168.94|No Bid 20.26 $40.52
Cleaning Station - B&L #8653
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8563P Comes with tissues & cleaner 8563P
13. Baush & Lomb Lens Cleaning Tissues ~ Pkg/280 60 No Bid No Bid 154 $92.40|No Bid 1.28 $76.80
B&L #8566
Specify Brand Being Bid: 8566 8566
14. Baush & Lomb Sight Savers Liquid Cs/10 4 No Bid No bid 31.09 $124.36| No Bid 26.42 $105.68
Cleaner - B & L #68 - 16 oz Spray Bottle -
Silicone
Specify Brand Being Bid: 68
15. Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash Ea 10 5.24 $52.40{No Bid 5.82 $58.20{No Bid 5.81 $58.10
Goggles - Uvex #S345C
Specify Brand Being Bid: S345C S345C S345C
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16. Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash Ea 20 3.30 $66.00{No Bid 3.67 $73.40{No Bid 3.66 $73.20
Goggles - Replacement Lens - Uvex #S780C
Specify Brand Being Bid: S780C S780C S780C
17. U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield  Ea 5 No Bid No Bid 18.92 $94.60{No Bid 16.41 $82.05
U. S. Safety #483000
Specify Brand Being Bid: 483000 483000
18. U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield ~ Ea 10 No Bid No Bid 3.65 $36.50|No Bid 3.21 $32.10
Replacement Window - U.S. Safety #494400
Specify Brand Being Bid: 494400 494400
19. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/100 20 9.23 $184.60{No Bid 10.35 $207.00 9.55 §$ 191.00 10.18 $203.60
size medium - Safeskin #55082
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55082 55082 55082 55082
20. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/100 100 9.23 $923.00{No Bid 10.35 $1,035.00 9.55 §$ 955.00 10.81 $1,081.00
size large - Safeskin #55083
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55083 55083 55082 55083
21. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam
Glove Pkg/90 200 9.23 $1,846.00(No Bid 10.35 $2,070.00 9.55 §$ 1,910.00 10.18 $2,036.00
size X-large - Safeskin #55084
Specify Brand Being Bid: 55084 55084 55084 55084
22. Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, size 10-  Pr/12 20 No Bid No Bid 14.33 $286.60|No Bid 10.91 $218.20
Ansell #37 145 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: 37-14510 37145-10
23. Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, Size 11 Pr/12 20 No Bid No Bid 14.33 $286.60|No Bid 10.91 $218.20

Ansell #37 145 11
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Specify Brand Being Bid: 37-14511 37145-11
24. Ansell Neox Gloves - size 10 Pr/12 2 No Bid No Bid 74.74 $149.48(No Bid 73.55 $147.10
Ansell # 9 924
Specify Brand Being Bid: 9-92410 9924
25. Ansell Petroflex Gloves - size large Pr/12 20 No Bid No Bid 25.85 $517.00|No Bid 25.69 $513.80
Ansell # 12 254
Specify Brand Being Bid: 12-25410 12254
26. Ansell PVA Gloves - size large Pr/12 2 No Bid No Bid 223.52 $447.04(No Bid 219.95 $439.90
Ansell # 15 552 9
Specify Brand Being Bid: 15-5529 15552-9
27. North Silver Shield/4H Gloves Laminate ~ Pkg/10 1 29.03 $29.03No Bid 37.77 $37.77 3291 § 3291 37.55 $37.55
Gloves - size 10 - North #SSG 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: SSG10 SSG/10 SSG SSG10
28. North Silver Shield/4H Gloves Laminate ~ Pkg/10 1 29.03 $29.03No Bid 37.77 $37.77 3291 § 3291 37.55 $37.55
Gloves - size 11/12 - North #SSG 11
Specify Brand Being Bid: SSG11 SSG/11 SSG SSG11
29. North Viton Gloves - Size 10 Ea 5 68.64 $343.20No Bid 80.41 $402.05 70.73 $ 353.65 75.42 $377.10
North #F124 10
Specify Brand Being Bid: F124/10 F124/10 F124 F124-10
30. North Viton Gloves - Size 11 Ea 5 68.64 $343.20{No Bid 80.44 $402.20 70.73 $ 353.65 75.42 $377.10
North #F124 11
Specify Brand Being Bid: F124/11 F124/11 F124 F124-11
31. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 10 55.14 $551.40 $108.00 $1,080.00 81.59 $815.90 7208 $ 720.80 74.62 $746.20
elastic wrists and ankles - size - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG417-LG NG127SWH & XL002500 NG125SWHLG002500 NG1255 NG125SWHLG
32. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 50 55.14 $2,757.00 $108.00 $5,400.00 81.59 $4,079.50 7208 $ 3,604.00 74.62 $3,731.00
elastic wrists and ankles - size - X- large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG417-XL NG127SWHL & 6002500 NG125SWHXL002500 NG1255 NG125SWHXL
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33. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 25 55.14 $1,378.50 $114.00 $2,850.00 81.59 $2,039.75 7208 $ 1,802.00 74.62 $1,865.50
elastic wrists and ankles - size - XX-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG417-2XL NG127SWH & 2X002500 NG125SWH2X002500 NG1255 NG125SWH2X
34. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 10 57.9 $579.00 $120.00 $1,200.00 86.47 $864.70 764 $ 764.00 79.09 $790.90
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG417-3XL NG127SWH & 3X002500 NG125SWH3X002500 NG1255 NG125SWH3X
35. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 5 61.37 $306.85 $129.00 $645.00 93.39 $466.95 8251 § 412.55 85.42 $427.10
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 4X - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG417-4XL NG127SWH & 4X002500 NG125SWH4X002500 NG1255 NG125SWH4X
36. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 137.38 $686.90 $121.00 $605.00 75.39 $376.95 66.61 $ 333.05 68.96 $344.80
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 05428-LG QC12713YLL & G001200 QC127SYLLG001200 QC1275 QC127SYLLG
37. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 137.38 $686.90 $121.00 $605.00 75.39 $376.95 66.61 $ 333.05 68.96 $344.80
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 05428-XL QC127BYLX & L001200 QC127SYLXL001200 QC1275 QC127SYLXL
38. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 144.25 $721.25 $128.00 $640.00 79.91 $399.55 7061 $ 353.05 73.09 $365.45
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 05428-2XL QC127BYL & 2X001200 QC127SYL2X001200 QC1275 QC127SYL2X
39. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 152.91 $764.55 $135.00 $675.00 84.71 $423.55 7484 $ 374.20 77.48 $387.40
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 05428-3XL QC127BYL & 3X001200 QC127SYL3X001200 QC1275 QC127SYL3X
40. DuPont Saranex - 23P - Coated Tyvek  Cs/12 5 127.32 $636.60 $173.00 $865.00 145.51 $727.55 119.06 $ 595.30 133.09 $665.45
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 44417-LG SL125BWHL SL125BWHLG001200 SL235T SL125BWHLG
41. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek Csl/12 5 127.32 $636.60 $173.00 $865.00 145.51 $727.55 119.06 $ 595.30 133.09 $665.45

Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - X-large
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Specify Brand Being Bid: 44417-XL G001200 & XL001200 SL125BWHXL001200 SL125T SL125BWHXL
42. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek Csl/12 5 133.69 $668.45 $183.00 $915.00 154.24 $771.20 126.19 § 630.95 141.08 $705.40
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 44417-2XL 1273WHZ400 SL125BWH2X001200 SL125T SL125BWH2X
43. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek Csl/12 5 141.71 $708.55 $193.00 $965.00 163.5 $817.50 13376 $ 668.80 149.55 $747.75
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: 44417-3XL SL125BWH & 3XPD1200 SL125BWH3X001200 SL125T SL125BWH3X
44. DuPont Proshield 3 Shoe Covers Cs/200 20 56.52 $1,130.40(No Bid 85.01 $1,700.20 1009 $ 2,018.00 104.46 $2,089.20
Specify Brand Being Bid: CTL901-X/XL P3450SGY000200LG NG4405 NG451SWHLG
45. DuPont NexGen Protective Aprons Cs/100 25 58.1 $1,452.50 $93.00 $2,325.00 82.84 $2,071.00 7315 § 1,828.75 75.78 $1,894.50
44" length
Specify Brand Being Bid: TG603 NG273BWH NG273BWH00010000 NG2738 NG273BWH
46. DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) ~ Ea 1 541.8 $541.80|No Bid 717.03 $717.03 59461 $ 594.61 750.75 $750.75
Suit - Size X-Large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TK650 RS562TBDXL RS550T TK555TXL5C
47. DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight) ~ Ea 1 568.89 $568.89|No Bid 760.04 $760.04 630.19 $ 630.19 795.79 $795.79
Suit - Size 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: TK650 RS562TDB2X RS550T TK555T2X5C
48. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with Csl/12 1 111.18 $111.18|No Bid 99 $99.00 90.88 $ 90.88 90.55 $90.55
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - Size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C55428-XL QC127BYUSL001200 C11275 QC127BYLXL
49. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with Csl/12 1 116.74 $116.74|No Bid 104.92 $104.92 9.33 $ 96.33 95.98 $95.98
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C55428-2XL QC127BYL2X001200 C11275 QC127BYL2X
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50. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with Csl/12 123.74 $123.74|No Bid 111.23 $111.23 10211 § 102.11 101.74 $101.74
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C55428-3XL QC127BYL2X001200 C11275 QC127BYL3X
51. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with Csl/12 101.51 $101.51|No Bid 147.13 $147.13 160.66 $ 160.66 134.59 $134.59
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C44428-XL SL127BWHXL001200 C2127B SL127BWHXL
52. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with Csl/12 106.58 $106.58|No Bid 155.98 $155.98 1703 § 170.30 142.67 $142.67
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C44428-2XL SL127BWH2X001200 C2127B SL127BWH2X
53. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with Csl/12 112.98 $112.98|No Bid 165.33 $165.33 18051 § 180.51 151.22 $151.22
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
bound seams - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C44428-3XL SL127BWH3X001200 C2127B SL127BWH3X
54. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with Csl6 152.81 $152.81 $305.00 $305.00 263.53 $263.53 21439 $ 214.39 241.05 $241.05
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C3T150-XL C3122TINK & X000600 C3122TTNXL000600 C3127T C3122TTNXL
55. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with Csl6 160.46 $160.46 $323.00 $323.00 279.34 $279.34 22725 $ 227.25 255.52 $255.52
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C3T150-2XL C3122TTN2 & X000600 C3122TTN2X000600 C3127T C3122TTN2X
56. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with Csl6 168.48 $168.48 $342.00 $342.00 296.12 $296.12 240.88 $ 240.88 270.86 $270.86
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: C3T150-3XL C3122TTN3 & X000600 C3122TTN3X000600 C3127T C3122TTN3X
57. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with Csl6 214.14 $214.14{No Bid 307.96 $307.96 27598 $ 275.98 83.55 $83.55

attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
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and strapped seams - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: BR130-XL LV127TODXL00200 C4127T LV127TODXL
58. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with Csl6 1 224.85 $224.85(No Bid 326.42 $326.42 29252 $ 292.52 88.56 $88.56
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and strapped seams - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: BR130-2XL LV127TOD2X00200 C4127T LV127TOD2X
59. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with Csl6 1 236.09 $236.09|No Bid 345.99 $345.99 31007 $ 310.07 93.88 $93.88
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and strapped seams - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid: BR130-3XL LV127TOD3X00200 C4127T LV127TOD3X
60. Bata Hazmax Boots - 16: Knee boots ea 5 51.96 $259.80|No Bid 67.58 $337.90 56.56 $ 282.80 63.53 $317.65
sizes 6-15 - Bata 870120600 - 870121500
Specify Brand Being Bid: 87012 8701206-8701215 87012 87012
61. DSC Haz Mat Booteis - size X-large - ea 50 No Bid No Bid 37 $185.50 243§ 121.50 291 $145.50
DSC #LB1250YD
Specify Brand Being Bid: LB1250Y-D 97591 LB1250Y
62. DSC Haz Mat Booties - size 2X-large - ea 25 No Bid No Bid 3.38 $84.50 243 § 60.75 291 $72.75
DSC #LB1250Y E
Specify Brand Being Bid: LB1250Y-E 97591 LB1250Y
63. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black ea 1 184.63 $184.63 $190.00 $190.00 213.21 $213.21|No Bid 197.66 $197.66
silicone - size small - MSA #480263
Specify Brand Being Bid: 480263 MSA 480263 480263
64. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black ea 1 184.63 $184.63 $190.00 $190.00 213.21 $213.21|No Bid 197.66 $197.66
silicone - size medium - MSA #480259
Specify Brand Being Bid: 480259 MSA 480259 480259
65. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black ea 2 184.63 $369.26 $190.00 $380.00 213.21 $426.42(No bid 197.66 $395.32
silicone - size large - MSA #480267
Specify Brand Being Bid: 480267 MSA 480267 480267




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5
BID NO:  2010-023-0000 Aramsco, Inc. Casco Industries Inc. Fischer Scientific Company, LLC Global Protection Hagemeyer North America,Inc.
1480 Grtandview Ave. 1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118 2000 Park Lane 444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A 1460 Tobias Gadson Blvd.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086 Grand Prairie, Tx. 75050 Pittsburg, PA. 15275 West Berlin, NJ 08091 Charleston, SC. 29407
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Richard Salerno Amy Neeb 412-490-833 1-800-957-8955 843-745-1832
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 856-686-7723 972-522-0800 412-490-1116 - Fax 1-856-768-2922 - Fax 803-705-8658 - Fax
Fax# 856-686-4423 972-522-0847 - Fax Cyndi Dubrwealskie Alan Lucas
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25, 2010
CONTRACT PERIOD:
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter Website Letter Website
66. MSA Comfo Cartridges Csl6 25 49.23 $1,230.75 $55.00 $1,375.00 56.85 $1,421.25(No Bid 52.71 $1,317.75
MSA #815182
Specify Brand Being Bid: 815182 MSA 815182 815182
67. Msa Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815178  Cs/6 2 45.58 $91.16 $55.00 $110.00 52.64 $105.28|No Bid 4838 $97.60
Specify Brand Being Bid: 815178 MSA 815178 815178
68. MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815181  Cs/6 2 48.02 $96.04 $55.00 $110.00 55.46 $110.92|No Bid 51.41 $102.82
Specify Brand Being Bid: 815181 MSA 815181 815181
69. MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815180  Cs/6 2 45.58 $91.16 $55.00 $110.00 52.64 $105.28|No Bid 4838 $97.60
Specify Brand Being Bid: 815180 MSA 815180 815180
70. MSA Confidence Plus Germicidal Ea 24 20.45 $490.80 $22.00 $528.00 23.62 $566.88|No Bid 21.89 $525.36
Cleaner - 32 oz. size - MSA #10009971
Specify Brand Being Bid: 10009971 MSA 10009971 10009971
71. EM Science - colorpHast - pH indicator ~ Pkg/100 150 No Bid No Bid 11.99 $1,798.50|No Bid 24.94 $3,741.00
strips - pH range 0-14
Specify Brand Being Bid: 9590-3EMD 9590
72. Polyethylene Siphon Pump - 2 inch NPT Ea 20 No Bid No Bid 12.97 $259.40(No Bid 10.59 $211.80
thread for 55 gal. Drums
Specify Brand Being Bid: PUMP-PSPI PDI4005
73. 17 inch x 19 inch Universal Sorbent Pads Pkg/100 50 27.56 $1,378.00No Bid 50.16 $2,508.00No Bid 91.47 $4,573.50
Specify Brand Being Bid: GPB100H UP100 UNV1719
74. Barrel Top Universal Sorbent Pad Pkg/25 4 32.67 $130.68|No Bid 52.22 $208.88|No Bid 62.94 $251.76
22 inch diameter with 2 inch opening
Specify Brand Being Bid: GTOP S2-76 DTA25
75. Disposable Uncorded Earplugs Pkg/200 3 14.29 $42.87|No Bid 12.39 $37.17|No Bid 14.49 $43.47
Specify Brand Being Bid: 280205 280003 2070100
76. Cotton String Knit Glove - standard weight Pr/12 150 1.63 $244.50|No Bid 3.88 $582.00|No Bid No Bid

with heat-sealed seam - men's size




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5
BID NO:  2010-023-0000 Aramsco, Inc. Casco Industries Inc. Fischer Scientific Company, LLC Global Protection Hagemeyer North America,Inc.
1480 Grtandview Ave. 1517 W. N. Carrier Suite #118 2000 Park Lane 444 Kelley Dr, Unit 3A 1460 Tobias Gadson Blvd.
Thorofare, NJ. 08086 Grand Prairie, Tx. 75050 Pittsburg, PA. 15275 West Berlin, NJ 08091 Charleston, SC. 29407
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Richard Salerno Amy Neeb 412-490-833 1-800-957-8955 843-745-1832
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 856-686-7723 972-522-0800 412-490-1116 - Fax 1-856-768-2922 - Fax 803-705-8658 - Fax
Fax# 856-686-4423 972-522-0847 - Fax Cyndi Dubrwealskie Alan Lucas
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25, 2010
CONTRACT PERIOD:
M/WBE STATUS NO NO NO NO NO
TAXPAYER STATUS OTHER OTHER OTHER OTHER DALLAS
BID NOTIFICATION OTHER Letter Website Letter Website
Specify Brand Being Bid: 706S 19048622A
77. Potassium lodide Starch Test Paper Pkg/100 50 No Bid No Bid 65.47 $3,273.50No Bid 7.99 $399.50
Specify Brand Being Bid: 260 2351600
78. MSA Cover Lens for Ultravue Facepiece -
MSA# 456975 Pkg/25 50 34.2 $1,710.00 $37.00 $1,850.00 39.49 $1,974.50No Bid 36.61 $1,830.50
Specify Brand Being Bid: 456975 MSA 456975 456975
79. Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # J53122 Sizes Small-XXXL
Size: S-XL 5 27.88 $139.40(No Bid 32.51 $162.55 3203 § 160.15 31.84 $159.20
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 28.87 $144.35 33.67 $168.35 317§ 165.85
Specify Brand Being Bid: J53122-7 J53122 J53122
80. Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket -
Tingley # 053122 Sizes Small-XXXL
Size: S-XL 5 12.87 $64.35(No Bid 15.01 $75.05 1478 § 73.90
Size: 2XL-3XL 5 13.84 $69.20 16.17 $80.85 1592 § 79.60 15.28 $76.40
Specify Brand Being Bid: 53122 53122 53122
TOTAL: $27,567.34 $25,448.00 $43,980.01 $ 23,394.15 $41,742.07




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

1. Justrite Safety Drum Funnel - Justrite # 08207
Specify Brand Being Bid:

2. Mercury Spill Absorbent Powder - EPS
Chemicals Merconsorb Powder - 2-1/4 # Size - EPS #20 MSORB500
Specify Brand Being Bid:

3. Ansul Spill X Chemical Spill Treatment Kit
Multi-agent Kit - Ansul #78744
Specify Brand Being Bid:

4. Ansul Spill - X - Chemical Spill
Treatment Agent - Ansul #77255
Specify Brand Being Bid:

5. Ansul Spill - X - C Chemical Spill Treatment Agent - Ansul #77261
Specify Brand Being Bid:

6. Ansul Spill - X - S Chemical Spill Treatment
Agent - Ansul #77265
Specify Brand Being Bid:

7. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles
duoflex temples - red, white & blue frames
gray UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

8. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles
duoflex temples - red, white & blue frames
amber UD lens

Specify Brand Being Bid:

9. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectacles
replacement gray UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Ea

Ea

Ea

Csof 6

Csof 6

Csof 6

Ea

Ea

Pkg/10

20

20

NO
DALLAS
Website

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

585 §

SPRS1179

585 §

SPRS1159

235§

SPRS536

117.00

117.00

23.50

NO
OTHER
OTHER

$139.95 §
JTR 08027

$16.95 §

JTR 520500

$399.95 §

ANE 78774

$14.95 §

ANE77255

$24.95 §
ANE77261

$19.95 §

ANE 77265

$4.95 §

UVXS1179

$4.95 §

UVXS1159

$2.50 $§

UVXS536

279.90

33.90

399.95

14.95

24.95

19.95

99.00

99.00

25.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

10. Uvex Astrospec 3000 Series Spectales
replacement amber UD lens
Specify Brand Being Bid:

11. Uvex safety cord - uvex #5497
Specify Brand Being Bid:

12.Baush & Lomb Permanent Plastic Lens
Cleaning Station - B&L #8653
Specify Brand Being Bid:

13. Baush & Lomb Lens Cleaning Tissues
B&L #8566
Specify Brand Being Bid:

14. Baush & Lomb Sight Savers Liquid
Cleaner - B & L #68 - 16 0z Spray Bottle - Silicone
Specify Brand Being Bid:

15. Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash
Goggles - Uvex #S345C
Specify Brand Being Bid:

16. Uvex Futura 9301 Chemical Splash
Goggles - Replacement Lens - Uvex #S780C
Specify Brand Being Bid:

17.U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield
U. S. Safety #483000
Specify Brand Being Bid:

18. U. S. Safety Double Matrix Face Shield
Replacement Window - U.S. Safety #494400
Specify Brand Being Bid:

19. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam Glove
size medium - Safeskin #55082
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pkg/10

Ea

Ea

Pkg/280

Cs/10

Ea

Ea

Ea

Ea

Pkg/100

10

25

60

20

20

NO
DALLAS
Website
235§

SPRS537

169 §
SPRS501

59.00 $

MSP800PS

59.00 $

MSPM60S

2400 $

MSP716MP

670 §

SPR345C

425 §

SPRS780C

No Bid

No Bid

105 §

BES7705PFT-M

23.50

42.25

118.00

3,540.00

96.00

67.00

85.00

210.00

NO
OTHER
OTHER
$2.50 $§

UVXS537

$1.95 §
UVXS501

$20.95 §

BLB653

$1.95 §

B57 8566

$29.95 §

B57 68

$5.95 §

UVX 5345C

$3.95 §

UVX5780C

$17.95 §

48300

$3.95 §

494400

$9.95 §

K4555082

25.00

48.75

41.90

117.00

119.80

59.50

79.00

89.75

39.50

199.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

20. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam Glove
size large - Safeskin #55083
Specify Brand Being Bid:

21. Kimberly Clark Safeskin Nitrile Exam Glove
size X-large - Safeskin #55084
Specify Brand Being Bid:

22. Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, size 10 -
Ansell #37 145 10
Specify Brand Being Bid:

23. Ansell Sol-Vex Nitrile Gloves, Size 11
Ansell #37 145 11
Specify Brand Being Bid:

24. Ansell Neox Gloves - size 10
Ansell # 9 924
Specify Brand Being Bid:

25. Ansell Petroflex Gloves - size large
Ansell # 12 254
Specify Brand Being Bid:

26. Ansell PVA Gloves - size large
Ansell # 15 552 9
Specify Brand Being Bid:

27. North Silver Shield/4H Gloves Laminate
Gloves - size 10 - North #SSG 10
Specify Brand Being Bid:

28. North Silver Shield/4H Gloves Laminate
Gloves - size 11/12 - North #SSG 11
Specify Brand Being Bid:

29. North Viton Gloves - Size 10

Pkg/100

Pkg/90

Pr/12

Pr/12

Pr/12

Pr/12

Pr/12

Pkg/10

Pkg/10

Ea

100

20

20

20

NO

DALLAS

Website

105 §

BES7705PFT-L

105 §

BES7705PFT-XL

1265 $

BES717-10

1265 $

BES717-11

1%

BES6784 R

225 §

BES7712R

No Bid

192 §

NORSSG-10

192 §

NORSSG-11

1,050.00

2,100.00

253.00

253.00

142.00

450.00

192.00

192.00

260.00

NO

OTHER

OTHER

$9.95 §

K4555083

$9.95 §

K4555084

$0.95 §

NOSLA11SEB

$0.95 §

NOSLA11SEB

$7.95 §

ANE9-924

$1.95 §

64056413

$19.95 §

ANE 15 522

$29.95 §

NOSSSG

$29.95 §

NOSSSG

$59.95 §

995.00

1,990.00

19.00

19.00

15.90

39.00

39.90

29.95

29.95

299.75




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/MWBE STATUS NO NO

TAXPAYER STATUS DALLAS OTHER

BID NOTIFICATION Website OTHER

North #F124 10

Specify Brand Being Bid: BES892-10 B13892-09

30. North Viton Gloves - Size 11 Ea 5 52 § 260.00 $59.95 § 299.75
North #F124 11

Specify Brand Being Bid: BES892-11 B13892-11

31. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 10 79 770.00 $54.95 § 549.50
elastic wrists and ankles - size - large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKCTL417-LG WEC3402

32. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 50 79 3,850.00 $54.95 § 2,747.50
elastic wrists and ankles - size - X- large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKCTL417-XL WEC3402

33. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 25 79 1,925.00 $54.95 § 1,373.75
elastic wrists and ankles - size - XX-large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKCTL417-2X WEC3402

34. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 10 79 % 790.00 $54.95 § 549.50
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X - large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKCTL417-3X WEC3402

35. DuPont NexGen Protective Coveralls with Cs/25 5 81§ 405.00 $54.95 § 274.75
elastic wrists and ankles - size - 4X - large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKCTL417-4X WEC3402

36. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 51§ 255.00 $59.95 § 299.75
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKC5428LG-S QC125SYL

37. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 51§ 255.00 $59.95 § 299.75
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKC5428XL-S QC125SYL

38. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached Cs/12 5 54 $ 270.00 $64.95 $ 324.75
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - 2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid: LAKC54282X-S QC125SYL




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

39. DuPont Tyvek QC Coveralls with attached
hood, elastic wrists and ankles - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

40. DuPont Saranex - 23P - Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

41. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

42. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - 2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

43. DuPont Saranex - 23P Coated Tyvek
Protective Coveralls with elastic wrists and
ankles - size - 3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

44. DuPont Proshield 3 Shoe Covers
Specify Brand Being Bid:

45. DuPont NexGen Protective Aprons
44" length
Specify Brand Being Bid:

46. DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight)
Suit- Size X-Large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

47. DuPont Responder Level A (gas tight)
Suit - Size 2X-large

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/200

Cs/100

Ea

Ea

20

25

NO
DALLAS
Website
57 §

LAKC54283X-S

125 §

LAKC44417-L

125 §

LAKC44417XL

130 §

LAKC44417-2X

141§

LAKC44417-3X

185 §
LAKCTL9046/XL

75 $

LAKTG603

560 $

LAKTK640-XL

590 $

285.00

625.00

625.00

650.00

705.00

3,700.00

1,875.00

560.00

590.00

NO
OTHER
OTHER
$64.95 §

QC1258YL

$124.95

-

SL125BWH

$124.95

-

SL125BWH

$129.95

-

SL125BWH

$134.95

-

SL125BWH

$99.95 §
NG451SWH

DISCONTINUED

DISCONTINUED

DISCONTINUED

324.75

624.75

624.75

649.75

674.75

1,999.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

Specify Brand Being Bid:

48. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - Size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

49. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

50. DuPont Tychem CPF1 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

51. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

52. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and bound seams - size - 2X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

53. DuPont Tychem CPF2 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
bound seams - size - 3X-large

Specify Brand Being Bid:

54. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

55. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Cs/12

Csl6

Csl6

NO

DALLAS
Website
LAKTK640-2X

69 §

LAKC55428XL-S

73 %

LAKC55428-2X

76 $

LAKC55428-3X

130 §

LAKC44428XL

136 §

LAKC44428-2X

145 §

LAKC44428-3X

220 $

LAKC3T160-X

230 $

69.00

73.00

76.00

130.00

136.00

145.00

220.00

230.00

NO
OTHER
OTHER

$84.95 §

C11258

$89.95 §

C11258

$94.95 §

C11258

$124.95

-

C2120B

$129.95

-

C2120B

$134.95

-

C2120B

$239.95

-

C3123T

$249.95

-

84.95

89.95

94.95

124.95

129.95

134.95

239.95

249.95




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

56. DuPont Tychem CPF3 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and attached sock boots - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

57. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and strapped seams - size - X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

58. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and strapped seams - size - 2X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

59. DuPont Tychem CPF4 Coveralls with
attached hood, elasticized ankles and wrist
and strapped seams - size - 3X-large
Specify Brand Being Bid:

60. Bata Hazmax Boots - 16: Knee boots
sizes 6-15 - Bata 870120600 - 870121500
Specify Brand Being Bid:

61. DSC Haz Mat Booteis - size X-large -
DSC #LB1250YD
Specify Brand Being Bid:

62. DSC Haz Mat Booties - size 2X-large -
DSC #LB1250Y E
Specify Brand Being Bid:

63. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black
silicone - size small - MSA #480263

Csl6

Csl6

Csl6

Csl6

ea

ea

ea

ea

50

25

NO
DALLAS
Website

LAKC3T160-2X

245§

LAKC3T160-3X

260 $

LAKBR130-XL

270 $

LAKBR130-2X

280 $

LAKBR130-3X

51.96 $§

87012

38§

GLBB260-XL

38§

GLB260-2X

227§

245.00

260.00

270.00

280.00

259.80

190.00

95.00

210.00

NO
OTHER
OTHER

C3123T

$259.95

-

C3123T

$79.95 §

C4127T

$84.95 §

C4127T

$89.95 §

C4127T

$64.95 §

BAS87012

No Bid

No Bid

$199.95 §

259.95

79.95

84.95

89.95

324.75

199.95




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/MWBE STATUS NO NO

TAXPAYER STATUS DALLAS OTHER

BID NOTIFICATION Website OTHER

Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA480263 480263

64. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black ea 1 227§ 210.00 $199.95 § 199.95
silicone - size medium - MSA #480259

Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA480259 480259

65. MSA Ultra - Twin Respirator - Black ea 2 227§ 420.00 $199.95 § 399.90
silicone - size large - MSA #480267

Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA80267 480267

66. MSA Comfo Cartridges Csl6 25 61 § 1,525.00 $54.95 § 1,373.75
MSA #815182

Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA815182 815182

67. Msa Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815178 Csl6 2 57 § 114.00 $4995 § 99.90
Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA815178 815178

68. MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815181 Csl6 2 59 § 118.00 $54.95 § 109.90
Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA815181 815181

69. MSA Comfo Cartridges - MSA #815180 Csl6 2 57 § 114.00 $4995 § 99.90
Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA815180 815180

70. MSA Confidence Plus Germicidal Ea 24 2% $ 576.00 $2495 § 598.80
Cleaner - 32 oz. size - MSA #10009971

Specify Brand Being Bid: MSA10009971 10009971

71. EM Science - colorpHast - pH indicator Pkg/100 150 No Bid $2295 § 3,442.50
strips - pH range 0-14

Specify Brand Being Bid: 132103311

72. Polyethylene Siphon Pump - 2 inch NPT Ea 20 No Bid No Bid

thread for 55 gal. Drums

Specify Brand Being Bid:

73.17 inch x 19 inch Universal Sorbent Pads Pkg/100 50 54§ 2,700.00 $49.95 § 2,497.50
Specify Brand Being Bid: CEPUP100 SORGP100




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

BIDNO: 2010-023-0000

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 25,2010

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Lone Star Safety and Supply
2631 Freewood Drive
Dallas, Texas 75220

Tara Berry

2143573807 ||

Fax# 214-351-1747

Performance SafetyGroup, |
4187 Cresent Dr.

St. Louis, MO. 63129

Aaron Sanders
877-774-4568
877-774-1329 - Fax

M/MWBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

74. Barrel Top Universal Sorbent Pad Pkg/25
22 inch diameter with 2 inch opening

Specify Brand Being Bid:

75. Disposable Uncorded Earplugs Pkg/200
Specify Brand Being Bid:

76. Cotton String Knit Glove - standard weight Pr/12
with heat-sealed seam - men's size

Specify Brand Being Bid:

77. Potassium lodide Starch Test Paper Pkg/100
Specify Brand Being Bid:

78. MSA Cover Lens for Ultravue Facepiece - MSA# 456975 Pkg/25
Specify Brand Being Bid:
79. Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket - Tingley # J53122 Sizes Small-XXXL

Size: S-XL
Size: 2XL-3XL

Specify Brand Being Bid:

80. Tingley Comfort-Brite Rainwear jacket - Tingley # 053122 Sizes Small-XXXL

Size: S-XL
Size: 2XL-3XL

Specify Brand Being Bid:

TOTAL:

150

50

50

NO
DALLAS
Website
7% %

CEP-UDTP25

20 $
3M3121252

25§

GLBS55

No Bid

43 8

MSA456975

348
35§

J53122

16
17§

-

53122

300.00

60.00

375.00

2,150.00

170.00
175.00

80.00
85.00

39,787.05

NO
OTHER
OTHER
$49.95 §

SORDTA25

$19.95 §
64051810

$2.95 §

64057181

No Bid

$39.95 §

465975

$34.95 §

J53122

$19.95 §

53122

199.80

59.85

442.50

1,997.50

17475

99.75

30,895.35




