
TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Jayden Graphics, Inc. Integrated Document Solutions Accurate Forms & Supplies 
2705 Katie Trail 2205 Hutton Drive, Ste. 110 1550 Norwood Drive #412 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Melissa, TX 75454 Carrollton, TX 75006 Hurst, TX 76054­3654 
Robert ives Mike Dodson Cheryl Salinas 
972.838.9225 214.630.6030 817.498.4840 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.200.7334 ­ Fax 214.638.4805 ­ Fax 817.427.4816 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 WITHDREW BID RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS:6, 
9 & 15 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 2­5, 7­ 
8, 10­11, 13­14, 16­19, 22, 26­27 & 29­ 
30 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No N/A No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website 

1. Certificate of Appointment as Deputy Voter 
Registrar, Size: 8.5" x 11", 2­part form, as per 
bid specifications 

2,000 M No Bid 79.61 $159.22 82.25 $164.50 

2. Poll List Request Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 2­ 
part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M No Bid 61.03 $610.30 57.25 $572.50 

3. Oath of Office/Statement of Election 
Expense, 8­1/2" x 11", 4­part form, 3 hole 
punhed on left side, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M No Bid 139.33 $1,393.30 96.00 $960.00 

4.  Trip Ticket, 8­1/2" x 11" 3­part form, 3­ 
hole punched on left side, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M No Bid 112.68 $563.40 96.25 $481.25 

5.  Receipt for Ballots & Election Equipment, 
8­1/2" x 6, 3 part form, no top stub, as per 
bid specifications 

5,000 M No Bid 85.47 $427.35 71.20 $356.00 

6.  Cancellation of Voter Ballot, 8­1/2 x 11" 
no top stub, 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M No Bid 64.29 $321.45 65.20 $326.00 

7.  Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 6", 3­part 
form, with 1/2" tear stub at top, as per bid 
specifications 

10,000 M No Bid 154.11 $1,541.10 35.04 $350.40 

8.  Combination Form/Signature Roster 
(Regular, ADA, Provisional), 8­1/2" x 14­1/2" 
4­part form, as per bid specifications 

200,000 M No Bid 120.55 $24,110.00 71.90 $14,380.00 

*151.47 if perf runs 14­1/2 
Dimension 

9.  Voter Registration Information Inquiry 
Forms, 4­1/4" x 5­1/2", as per bid 
specifications 

2,000 M No Bid 36.75 $73.50 43.00 $86.00 

10.  List of Provisional Voter Form, 8­1/2" x 
11", 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

25,000 M No Bid 221.04 $5,526.00 66.20 $1,655.00 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Jayden Graphics, Inc. Integrated Document Solutions Accurate Forms & Supplies 
2705 Katie Trail 2205 Hutton Drive, Ste. 110 1550 Norwood Drive #412 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Melissa, TX 75454 Carrollton, TX 75006 Hurst, TX 76054­3654 
Robert ives Mike Dodson Cheryl Salinas 
972.838.9225 214.630.6030 817.498.4840 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.200.7334 ­ Fax 214.638.4805 ­ Fax 817.427.4816 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 WITHDREW BID RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS:6, 
9 & 15 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 2­5, 7­ 
8, 10­11, 13­14, 16­19, 22, 26­27 & 29­ 
30 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No N/A No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website 
11.  Early Voting Substation Daily Report 
Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 3­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M No Bid 98.03 $490.15 85.78 $428.90 

12. Substation Daily Event Log, 8­1/2" x 11", 
3­part form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M No Bid 107.63 $269.08 108.75 $271.88 

13. Early Voting List of Provisional Voters, 8­ 
1/2" x 11", 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications. 

5,000 M No Bid 119.21 $596.05 65.90 $329.50 

14. Early Voting Personal Appearance 
Application, 9­1/2" x 11", Continuous Pin 
Feed, 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

250,000 M No Bid 82.49 $20,622.50 59.40 $14,850.00 

15. Receipt for Early Voting Election 
Equipment Form, 8­1/2" x 5­1/2" 3­part 
form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M No Bid 72.53 $181.33 89.00 $222.50 

16. Early Voting Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 
5­1/2", 3­part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M No Bid 56.17 $561.70 40.28 $402.80 

Envelopes 

17. Ballot Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 8­1/4" x 
11­1/2" wide, as per bid specifications 

100,000 M 77.92 $7,792.00 No Bid 80.60 $8,060.00 

18. Carrier Envelope (Regular Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

70,000 M 99.60 $6,972.00 No Bid 82.50 $5,775.00 

19. Cararier Envelope (Military Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

30,000 M 99.60 $2,988.00 No Bid 90.85 $2,725.50 

20. Mailing Envelope (Regular Mail), 29# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 123.12 $2,462.40 No Bid 168.00 $3,360.00 

21. Mailing Envelopes (Military Mail), 28# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 123.12 $2,462.40 No Bid 174.00 $3,480.00 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Jayden Graphics, Inc. Integrated Document Solutions Accurate Forms & Supplies 
2705 Katie Trail 2205 Hutton Drive, Ste. 110 1550 Norwood Drive #412 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Melissa, TX 75454 Carrollton, TX 75006 Hurst, TX 76054­3654 
Robert ives Mike Dodson Cheryl Salinas 
972.838.9225 214.630.6030 817.498.4840 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.200.7334 ­ Fax 214.638.4805 ­ Fax 817.427.4816 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 WITHDREW BID RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS:6, 
9 & 15 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 2­5, 7­ 
8, 10­11, 13­14, 16­19, 22, 26­27 & 29­ 
30 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No N/A No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website 

22. Envelope, Election Returns, White, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 93.85 $1,877.00 No Bid 155.48 $3,109.60 

23. Envelope, Election returns, Yellow, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 99.10 $1,982.00 No Bid 238.00 $4,760.00 

24. Envelope, Election returns, Pink, 15" 10", 
as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 99.10 $1,982.00 No Bid 238.00 $4,760.00 

25. Envelope, Election returns, Green, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 99.10 $1,982.00 No Bid 238.00 $4,760.00 

26. Affidavit for Provisional Voter Envelopes, 
28# White Kraft, 9­1/2" x 13' 

50,000 M 121.35 $6,067.50 No Bid 104.16 $5,208.00 

27. Ballot Secrecy Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 
9" x 12", as per bid specifications 

5,000 M 98.56 $492.80 No Bid 94.00 $470.00 

28. Application Signature Window Envelopes, 
28# Brown Kraft, 5" x 12" as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 93.50 $1,870.00 No Bid 118.50 $2,370.00 

29. Application Mailing Envelopes, #14 
business envelopes (no window), as per bid 
specifications 

50,000 M 48.36 $2,418.00 No Bid 47.50 $2,375.00 

30. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Military, 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11", as 
per bid specifications 

10,000 M 55.85 $558.50 No Bid 89.90 $899.00 

31. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Regular 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11" 

10,000 M 55.85 $558.50 No Bid 78.32 $783.20 

Specify delivery after receipt of Dallas County 
Purchase Order 

Varies from 5 working days to 4 
weeks depending on product 

7­12 work days ARP As requested. 

*Prices are based upon minimum 
amounts (as shown) being ordered.  For 
example: Item 29: Bid shows 50,000 if 
anything less than 50,000 is ordered 
different pricing would apply.* 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Jayden Graphics, Inc. Integrated Document Solutions Accurate Forms & Supplies 
2705 Katie Trail 2205 Hutton Drive, Ste. 110 1550 Norwood Drive #412 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Melissa, TX 75454 Carrollton, TX 75006 Hurst, TX 76054­3654 
Robert ives Mike Dodson Cheryl Salinas 
972.838.9225 214.630.6030 817.498.4840 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.200.7334 ­ Fax 214.638.4805 ­ Fax 817.427.4816 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 WITHDREW BID RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS:6, 
9 & 15 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 2­5, 7­ 
8, 10­11, 13­14, 16­19, 22, 26­27 & 29­ 
30 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No N/A No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website 
Is this an all or none bid? Yes No No 

Did your company check the website for any 
addendums, updates, and/or changes to the 
bid solicitaion? 

Yes Yes Yes 

Does your firms/company have the required 
insurance coverage stated under Section 3 
Insurance Requirements and agree to comply 
with these requirements throughout the 
duration of this contract? 

Yes Yes Yes 

If no, will your firm be able to obtain the 
required coverage within ten (10) days upon 
notification of contract award? 

Information on provision of health insurance 
coverage for employees. 

Dallas County may consider the provision of 
health insurance coverage for employees in 
the bid evaluation process (see page 4, 
paragraph 4).  Please complete the 
information below to assist in this evaluation. 

a) Does your company provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees? 

N/A Yes Yes 

b) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, does the 
company share in the cost a minimum of 
75% for employee only coverage and 50% for 
family coverage? 

N/A No No 

c) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, is the 
coverage comparable to the services provided 
by Dallas County as described in the 
attached summary plan description? 

N/A Yes Yes 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Jayden Graphics, Inc. Integrated Document Solutions Accurate Forms & Supplies 
2705 Katie Trail 2205 Hutton Drive, Ste. 110 1550 Norwood Drive #412 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Melissa, TX 75454 Carrollton, TX 75006 Hurst, TX 76054­3654 
Robert ives Mike Dodson Cheryl Salinas 
972.838.9225 214.630.6030 817.498.4840 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.200.7334 ­ Fax 214.638.4805 ­ Fax 817.427.4816 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 WITHDREW BID RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS:6, 
9 & 15 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 2­5, 7­ 
8, 10­11, 13­14, 16­19, 22, 26­27 & 29­ 
30 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No N/A No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website 
d) If your company plans to utilize 
subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid, 
does each of the subcontractors provide 
health insurance coverage to their employees 
that compares to Dallas County's health 
insurance coverage and share in the cost? 

Yes Yes Yes 

Should other Governmental Entities decide to 
participate in this contract, would you, the 
vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, 
specifications, and pricing would apply? 

Yes Yes Yes *Quantities must be the same or 
higher 

Specify payment terms. Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days 

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. 
included with your bid proposal, if applicable: 

d) Stock used and quantity 
needed must be same as in this 
contract to qualify. (1) Quoting on 
envelopes only.  All or None (2) No 
Employees therefore no 
workmans comp. 

AFS is a distributor, therefore 100% of 
this contract will be subcontracted. 

Specify the name, telephone number, and 
email adderss of the account representative 
who will be handling and managing this 
account. 

Harriet Antine (972) 838.9099 Cheryl Salinas (817) 498.4840 
Salinas@accuratesupplies.com 

Page 5 of 15



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 
Election Works, Inc. Dallas Independent School 

District ­ Graphics Department 
Advantage Resources Services 

3N 840 Trotter Lane 2525 South Ervay St. P. O. Box 702732 
BID NO. 2011­042­5465 St. Charles, IL 60175 Dallas, TX 75215 Dallas, TX 75370 

Sandy Hed Gabriel L. Guerra Sam Oladipo 
630.377.1973 972.925.4448 972.880.1905 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 630.377.9268 ­ Fax 972.925.4809 ­ Fax 972.687.9120 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 RECOMMENDED AWARD 
ITEMS: 1,12 & 28 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 
21 & 31 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 23­24 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No N/A 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website & Letter 

1. Certificate of Appointment as Deputy Voter 
Registrar, Size: 8.5" x 11", 2­part form, as per 
bid specifications 

2,000 M 68.27 $136.54 0.08886 $177.72 220.95 $441.90 

2. Poll List Request Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 2­ 
part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 68.27 $682.70 0.08935 $893.50 84.86 $848.60 

3. Oath of Office/Statement of Election 
Expense, 8­1/2" x 11", 4­part form, 3 hole 
punhed on left side, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 120.84 $1,208.40 0.14372 $1,437.20 140.44 $1,404.40 

4.  Trip Ticket, 8­1/2" x 11" 3­part form, 3­ 
hole punched on left side, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 99.67 $498.35 0.11501 $575.05 176.25 $881.25 

5.  Receipt for Ballots & Election Equipment, 
8­1/2" x 6, 3 part form, no top stub, as per 
bid specifications 

5,000 M 83.54 $417.70 0.08671 $433.55 113.12 $565.60 

6.  Cancellation of Voter Ballot, 8­1/2 x 11" 
no top stub, 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 68.58 $342.90 0.07204 $360.20 104.19 $520.95 

7.  Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 6", 3­part 
form, with 1/2" tear stub at top, as per bid 
specifications 

10,000 M 83.54 $835.40 0.08091 $809.10 74.79 $747.90 

8.  Combination Form/Signature Roster 
(Regular, ADA, Provisional), 8­1/2" x 14­1/2" 
4­part form, as per bid specifications 

200,000 M 130.86 $26,172.00 0.17495 $34,990.00 128.09 $25,618.00 

Specify Quantity Per Case: 
Specify Brand/Product Number: 

9.  Voter Registration Information Inquiry 
Forms, 4­1/4" x 5­1/2", as per bid 
specifications 

2,000 M 63.67 $127.34 0.57025 $1,140.50 197.41 $394.82 

10.  List of Provisional Voter Form, 8­1/2" x 
11", 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

25,000 M 118.66 $2,966.50 0.11653 $2,913.25 106.19 $2,654.75 

11.  Early Voting Substation Daily Report 
Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 3­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 98.38 $491.90 0.10737 $536.85 136.90 $684.50 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 
Election Works, Inc. Dallas Independent School 

District ­ Graphics Department 
Advantage Resources Services 

3N 840 Trotter Lane 2525 South Ervay St. P. O. Box 702732 
BID NO. 2011­042­5465 St. Charles, IL 60175 Dallas, TX 75215 Dallas, TX 75370 

Sandy Hed Gabriel L. Guerra Sam Oladipo 
630.377.1973 972.925.4448 972.880.1905 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 630.377.9268 ­ Fax 972.925.4809 ­ Fax 972.687.9120 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 RECOMMENDED AWARD 
ITEMS: 1,12 & 28 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 
21 & 31 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 23­24 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No N/A 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website & Letter 

12. Substation Daily Event Log, 8­1/2" x 11", 
3­part form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M 98.38 $245.95 0.12106 $302.65 218.66 $546.65 

13. Early Voting List of Provisional Voters, 8­ 
1/2" x 11", 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications. 

5,000 M 67.96 $339.80 0.11490 $574.50 119.95 $599.75 

14. Early Voting Personal Appearance 
Application, 9­1/2" x 11", Continuous Pin 
Feed, 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

250,000 M 87.43 $21,857.50 No Bid 67.41 $16,852.50 

15. Receipt for Early Voting Election 
Equipment Form, 8­1/2" x 5­1/2" 3­part 
form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M 93.37 $233.43 0.09140 $409.70 183.80 $459.50 

16. Early Voting Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 
5­1/2", 3­part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 93.37 $933.70 0.06653 $665.30 75.14 $751.40 

Envelopes 

17. Ballot Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 8­1/4" x 
11­1/2" wide, as per bid specifications 

100,000 M 109.50 $10,950.00 0.17573 $17,573.00 89.56 $8,956.00 

18. Carrier Envelope (Regular Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

70,000 M 170.80 $11,956.00 0.12622 $8,835.40 145.80 $10,206.00 

19. Cararier Envelope (Military Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

30,000 M 203.52 $6,105.60 0.16388 $4,916.40 153.63 $4,608.90 

20. Mailing Envelope (Regular Mail), 29# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 247.30 $4,946.00 0.18934 $3,786.80 170.88 $3,417.60 

21. Mailing Envelopes (Military Mail), 28# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 229.63 $4,592.60 0.16438 $3,287.60 178.12 $3,562.40 

22. Envelope, Election Returns, White, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 179.23 $3,584.60 0.21734 $4,346.80 178.29 $3,565.80 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 
Election Works, Inc. Dallas Independent School 

District ­ Graphics Department 
Advantage Resources Services 

3N 840 Trotter Lane 2525 South Ervay St. P. O. Box 702732 
BID NO. 2011­042­5465 St. Charles, IL 60175 Dallas, TX 75215 Dallas, TX 75370 

Sandy Hed Gabriel L. Guerra Sam Oladipo 
630.377.1973 972.925.4448 972.880.1905 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 630.377.9268 ­ Fax 972.925.4809 ­ Fax 972.687.9120 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 RECOMMENDED AWARD 
ITEMS: 1,12 & 28 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 
21 & 31 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 23­24 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No N/A 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website & Letter 
23. Envelope, Election returns, Yellow, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 221.60 $4,432.00 0.19685 $3,937.00 189.31 $3,786.20 

24. Envelope, Election returns, Pink, 15" 10", 
as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 221.60 $4,432.00 0.19685 $3,937.00 189.31 $3,786.20 

25. Envelope, Election returns, Green, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 221.60 $4,432.00 0.19685 $3,937.00 189.31 $3,786.20 

26. Affidavit for Provisional Voter Envelopes, 
28# White Kraft, 9­1/2" x 13' 

50,000 M 130.08 $6,504.00 0.19085 $9,542.50 190.47 $9,523.50 

27. Ballot Secrecy Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 
9" x 12", as per bid specifications 

5,000 M 261.74 $1,308.70 0.23937 $1,196.85 215.89 $1,079.45 

28. Application Signature Window Envelopes, 
28# Brown Kraft, 5" x 12" as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 78.50 $1,570.00 0.12838 $2,567.60 144.87 $2,897.40 

29. Application Mailing Envelopes, #14 
business envelopes (no window), as per bid 
specifications 

50,000 M 56.89 $2,844.50 0.07313 $3,656.50 56.02 $2,801.00 

30. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Military, 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11", as 
per bid specifications 

10,000 M 130.98 $1,309.80 0.09293 $929.30 165.33 $1,653.30 

31. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Regular 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11" 

10,000 M 110.53 $1,105.30 0.07408 $740.80 163.21 $1,632.10 

Specify delivery after receipt of Dallas County 
Purchase Order 

15­20 business days 3­4 weeks.  Depends on delivery of 
custom make carbonless paper sets 
and custom envelopes. 

14 Days 

Is this an all or none bid? No No No 

Did your company check the website for any 
addendums, updates, and/or changes to the 
bid solicitaion? 

Yes Yes Yes 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 
Election Works, Inc. Dallas Independent School 

District ­ Graphics Department 
Advantage Resources Services 

3N 840 Trotter Lane 2525 South Ervay St. P. O. Box 702732 
BID NO. 2011­042­5465 St. Charles, IL 60175 Dallas, TX 75215 Dallas, TX 75370 

Sandy Hed Gabriel L. Guerra Sam Oladipo 
630.377.1973 972.925.4448 972.880.1905 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 630.377.9268 ­ Fax 972.925.4809 ­ Fax 972.687.9120 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 RECOMMENDED AWARD 
ITEMS: 1,12 & 28 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 
21 & 31 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 23­24 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No N/A 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website & Letter 
Does your firms/company have the required 
insurance coverage stated under Section 3 
Insurance Requirements and agree to comply 
with these requirements throughout the 
duration of this contract? 

Yes Yes Yes 

If no, will your firm be able to obtain the 
required coverage within ten (10) days upon 
notification of contract award? 

Information on provision of health insurance 
coverage for employees. 

Dallas County may consider the provision of 
health insurance coverage for employees in 
the bid evaluation process (see page 4, 
paragraph 4).  Please complete the 
information below to assist in this evaluation. 

a) Does your company provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees? 

No Yes Yes 

b) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, does the 
company share in the cost a minimum of 
75% for employee only coverage and 50% for 
family coverage? 

Yes Yes 

c) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, is the 
coverage comparable to the services provided 
by Dallas County as described in the 
attached summary plan description? 

Yes Yes 

d) If your company plans to utilize 
subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid, 
does each of the subcontractors provide 
health insurance coverage to their employees 
that compares to Dallas County's health 
insurance coverage and share in the cost? 

Yes N/A N/A 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 
Election Works, Inc. Dallas Independent School 

District ­ Graphics Department 
Advantage Resources Services 

3N 840 Trotter Lane 2525 South Ervay St. P. O. Box 702732 
BID NO. 2011­042­5465 St. Charles, IL 60175 Dallas, TX 75215 Dallas, TX 75370 

Sandy Hed Gabriel L. Guerra Sam Oladipo 
630.377.1973 972.925.4448 972.880.1905 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 630.377.9268 ­ Fax 972.925.4809 ­ Fax 972.687.9120 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 RECOMMENDED AWARD 
ITEMS: 1,12 & 28 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 
21 & 31 

RECOMMENDED AWARD ITEMS: 23­24 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes No 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No N/A 
How were you notified? Letter from Dallas County Dallas County Website & Letter 
Should other Governmental Entities decide to 
participate in this contract, would you, the 
vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, 
specifications, and pricing would apply? 

Yes Yes 

Specify payment terms. 100% 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days 

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. 
included with your bid proposal, if applicable: 

Specify the name, telephone number, and 
email adderss of the account representative 
who will be handling and managing this 
account. 

Sandy Hed (630) 377.1973 
Shed@electionworks.com 

Gabriel L. Guerra (972) 925.4448 
gguerra@dallasisd.org 

Sam Oladipo (972) 880­1905 
mapdallas@msn.com 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 
Nilvac Enterprises, Inc. dba 
Zip Copy Center 
4070 N. Beltline Rd., #110 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Irving, TX 75038 
Wilayatali Sajjani 
972.871.9300 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.871.9301 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? N/A 

1. Certificate of Appointment as Deputy Voter 
Registrar, Size: 8.5" x 11", 2­part form, as per 
bid specifications 

2,000 M 337.00 $674.00 $0.00 

2. Poll List Request Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 2­ 
part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 297.00 $2,970.00 $0.00 

3. Oath of Office/Statement of Election 
Expense, 8­1/2" x 11", 4­part form, 3 hole 
punhed on left side, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 553.00 $5,530.00 $0.00 

4.  Trip Ticket, 8­1/2" x 11" 3­part form, 3­ 
hole punched on left side, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 614.00 $3,070.00 $0.00 

5.  Receipt for Ballots & Election Equipment, 
8­1/2" x 6, 3 part form, no top stub, as per 
bid specifications 

5,000 M 297.00 $1,485.00 $0.00 

6.  Cancellation of Voter Ballot, 8­1/2 x 11" 
no top stub, 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 235.00 $1,175.00 $0.00 

7.  Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 6", 3­part 
form, with 1/2" tear stub at top, as per bid 
specifications 

10,000 M 230.00 $2,300.00 $0.00 

8.  Combination Form/Signature Roster 
(Regular, ADA, Provisional), 8­1/2" x 14­1/2" 
4­part form, as per bid specifications 

200,000 M 355.00 $71,000.00 $0.00 

Specify Quantity Per Case: 
Specify Brand/Product Number: 

9.  Voter Registration Information Inquiry 
Forms, 4­1/4" x 5­1/2", as per bid 
specifications 

2,000 M 151.00 $302.00 $0.00 

10.  List of Provisional Voter Form, 8­1/2" x 
11", 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

25,000 M 327.00 $8,175.00 $0.00 

11.  Early Voting Substation Daily Report 
Form, 8­1/2" x 11", 3­part form, as per bid 
specifications 

5,000 M 428.00 $2,140.00 $0.00 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 
Nilvac Enterprises, Inc. dba 
Zip Copy Center 
4070 N. Beltline Rd., #110 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Irving, TX 75038 
Wilayatali Sajjani 
972.871.9300 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.871.9301 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? N/A 
12. Substation Daily Event Log, 8­1/2" x 11", 
3­part form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M 457.00 $1,142.50 $0.00 

13. Early Voting List of Provisional Voters, 8­ 
1/2" x 11", 2­part form, as per bid 
specifications. 

5,000 M 254.00 $1,270.00 $0.00 

14. Early Voting Personal Appearance 
Application, 9­1/2" x 11", Continuous Pin 
Feed, 4­part form, as per bid specifications 

250,000 M 279.00 $69,750.00 $0.00 

15. Receipt for Early Voting Election 
Equipment Form, 8­1/2" x 5­1/2" 3­part 
form, as per bid specifications 

2,500 M 286.00 $715.00 $0.00 

16. Early Voting Service Call Report, 8­1/2" x 
5­1/2", 3­part form, as per bid specifications 

10,000 M 222.00 $2,220.00 $0.00 

Envelopes 

17. Ballot Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 8­1/4" x 
11­1/2" wide, as per bid specifications 

100,000 M 203.00 $20,300.00 $0.00 

18. Carrier Envelope (Regular Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

70,000 M 305.00 $21,350.00 $0.00 

19. Cararier Envelope (Military Mail), 28# 
Brown Kraft, 9" x 12", as per bid 
specifications 

30,000 M 305.00 $9,150.00 $0.00 

20. Mailing Envelope (Regular Mail), 29# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 745.00 $14,900.00 $0.00 

21. Mailing Envelopes (Military Mail), 28# 
Green Wove, 10" x 13", as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 715.00 $14,300.00 $0.00 

22. Envelope, Election Returns, White, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 718.00 $14,360.00 $0.00 

23. Envelope, Election returns, Yellow, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 559.00 $11,180.00 $0.00 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 
Nilvac Enterprises, Inc. dba 
Zip Copy Center 
4070 N. Beltline Rd., #110 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Irving, TX 75038 
Wilayatali Sajjani 
972.871.9300 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.871.9301 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? N/A 

24. Envelope, Election returns, Pink, 15" 10", 
as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 559.00 $11,180.00 $0.00 

25. Envelope, Election returns, Green, 15" x 
10", as per bid specifications 

20,000 M 559.00 $11,180.00 $0.00 

26. Affidavit for Provisional Voter Envelopes, 
28# White Kraft, 9­1/2" x 13' 

50,000 M 256.00 $12,800.00 $0.00 

27. Ballot Secrecy Envelope, 28# White Kraft, 
9" x 12", as per bid specifications 

5,000 M 742.00 $3,710.00 $0.00 

28. Application Signature Window Envelopes, 
28# Brown Kraft, 5" x 12" as per bid 
specifications 

20,000 M 348.00 $6,960.00 $0.00 

29. Application Mailing Envelopes, #14 
business envelopes (no window), as per bid 
specifications 

50,000 M 126.00 $6,300.00 $0.00 

30. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Military, 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11", as 
per bid specifications 

10,000 M 173.00 $1,730.00 $0.00 

31. Official Election Balloting Material ­ 
Regular 28# Brown Kraft, 4­3/4" x 11" 

10,000 M 190.00 $1,900.00 $0.00 

Specify delivery after receipt of Dallas County 
Purchase Order 

Is this an all or none bid? Yes 

Did your company check the website for any 
addendums, updates, and/or changes to the 
bid solicitaion? 

Yes 

Does your firms/company have the required 
insurance coverage stated under Section 3 
Insurance Requirements and agree to comply 
with these requirements throughout the 
duration of this contract? 

No 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 
Nilvac Enterprises, Inc. dba 
Zip Copy Center 
4070 N. Beltline Rd., #110 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Irving, TX 75038 
Wilayatali Sajjani 
972.871.9300 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.871.9301 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? N/A 
If no, will your firm be able to obtain the 
required coverage within ten (10) days upon 
notification of contract award? 

Yes 

Information on provision of health insurance 
coverage for employees. 

Dallas County may consider the provision of 
health insurance coverage for employees in 
the bid evaluation process (see page 4, 
paragraph 4).  Please complete the 
information below to assist in this evaluation. 

a) Does your company provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees? 

No 

b) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, does the 
company share in the cost a minimum of 
75% for employee only coverage and 50% for 
family coverage? 

No 

c) If your company does provide health 
insurance coverage to its employees, is the 
coverage comparable to the services provided 
by Dallas County as described in the 
attached summary plan description? 

No 

d) If your company plans to utilize 
subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid, 
does each of the subcontractors provide 
health insurance coverage to their employees 
that compares to Dallas County's health 
insurance coverage and share in the cost? 

No 

Should other Governmental Entities decide to 
participate in this contract, would you, the 
vendor, agree that all terms, conditions, 
specifications, and pricing would apply? 

No 

Specify payment terms. 50% 3 Days Net 30 Days 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 
Nilvac Enterprises, Inc. dba 
Zip Copy Center 
4070 N. Beltline Rd., #110 

BID NO. 2011­042­5465 Irving, TX 75038 
Wilayatali Sajjani 
972.871.9300 

OPENING DATE: 07­MAR­2011 972.871.9301 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for Printing of Various 
Forms for Elections 

Contract Effective Period: 

BUYER: MARY STEPHENS 214­653­7690 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? N/A 
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. 
included with your bid proposal, if applicable: 

Specify the name, telephone number, and 
email address of the account representative 
who will be handling and managing this 
account. 

Wilayat Ali Sajjani (972) 871.9300 
Zipcc@sbcglobal.net 
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