DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-054-5502

ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND

COURIER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

BUYER: GLORIA TORRES

Award: 12 months plus three extension options
M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

Daily Delivery and Courier Services
(Cost per round-trip and pick-up return service)

1. Irving Office

841 W. Irving Blvd., Irving 75060
Mapsco 31 BW

JP 4-2 and Constable 4

2. North Dallas Government Center
10056 Marsh Lane, Dallas 75229
Mapsco 23R

JP 3-3 and Constable 3

JP Collections & Truancy Court North

3. Richardson Office

1411 Beltline Road, Richardson 75080
Mapsco 16B

JP 3-2 and Constable 3

(2 separate pick-up and delivery sites)

4. Garland Office

140 N. Garland Ave., Garland 75040
Mapsco 19Y

JP 2-1 and Constable 2

5. Mesquite Office

823 N. Galloway, Mesquite 75149
Mapsco 49 -A Z

JP2-2

6. Grand Prairie Office

630 W. Main Street, Grand Prairie 75060
Mapsco 51G

JP 4-1 and Constable 4

7. Lancaster Office

107 Texas Street, Lancaster 75146
Mapsco 86G

JP 1A, JP 1-2 and Constable 5

8. Beckley Courthouses
410 S. Beckley Avenue, Dallas 75203

VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5
Action Courier & Logistics C&D Couriers, Inc. Guaranteed Express Inc. Jet Couriers DFW File Courier Service
Woodrow Clayton David E. Miller Jennifer Blakeney Kelly Atkins Genise Chevalier

P.O. Box 219256

Houston, TX 77218
713.682.3322

Fax: 713.682.3364
wclayton@actioncourier.com

www.actioncourier.com

13707 Gamma Road
Dallas, TX 75244
972.458.2342

Fax: 972.458.2343
dmiller@cdcouriers.com

www.cdcouriers.com

1720 Regal Row, Suite 150
Dallas, TX 75235
214.631.8054

Fax: 214.631.8069

Wwww.gxcourier.com

1705 Wallace Dr, Suite 106
Carrollton, TX 75006
972-245-5544

Fax: 972.245.6333
kelly.atkins@jetcouriers.us

www.jetcouriers.us

2002 Rock Island #1036
Irving, TX 75060
214.541.5837

dfwfilecourierservice@yahoo.com

Est.

Days

260

260

260

260

260

260

260

260

Non NCTRCA

Other County Taxpayer
BidSync.com

WBEA 2005112839
HUB 1261471037900

21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00
32.48 8,444.80
21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
MWBE notification
MBE DL09387

HUB 1752970577800

22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40
22.24 5,782.40

NCTRCA

Other County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
WBE 2005113323
HUB 1752018951900

Recommend for Award

10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
No

15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00
30.00 7,800.00
15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
No

48.00 12,480.00

48.00 12,480.00

56.00 14,560.00

48.00 12,480.00

48.00 12,480.00

48.00 12,480.00

48.00 12,480.00

48.00 12,480.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NO. 2011-054-5502

ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND
COURIER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

BUYER: GLORIA TORRES

Award: 12 months plus three extension options
M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
Mapsco 54H
JP's 5-1 & JP 5-2 and Constable 5

9. South Dallas Government Center
7201 S. Polk, Dallas 75237
Mapsco 64X
JP 1-1, Truancy Court South and Constable 1
10. East Dallas Government
3443 St. Francis, Dallas 75228
Mapsco 48F
JP 3-1 and Constable 3
TOTAL

Daily cost to add new location/designation site

Portion of bid which will be subcontracted

Cooperative Purchasing?
References submitted?

Specify the Name and Telephone Number of the Account

Representative who will be handling Dallas County Account

Specify any additional comments

Est.

260

260

VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5
Action Courier & Logistics C&D Couriers, Inc. Guaranteed Express Inc. Jet Couriers DFW File Courier Service
Woodrow Clayton David E. Miller Jennifer Blakeney Kelly Atkins Genise Chevalier

P.O. Box 219256

Houston, TX 77218
713.682.3322

Fax: 713.682.3364
wclayton@actioncourier.com

www.actioncourier.com

13707 Gamma Road
Dallas, TX 75244
972.458.2342

Fax: 972.458.2343
dmiller@cdcouriers.com

www.cdcouriers.com

1720 Regal Row, Suite 150
Dallas, TX 75235
214.631.8054

Fax: 214.631.8069

Wwww.gxcourier.com

1705 Wallace Dr, Suite 106
Carrollton, TX 75006
972-245-5544

Fax: 972.245.6333
kelly.atkins@jetcouriers.us

www.jetcouriers.us

2002 Rock Island #1036
Irving, TX 75060
214.541.5837

dfwfilecourierservice@yahoo.com

Non NCTRCA

Other County Taxpayer
BidSync.com

WBEA 2005112839
HUB 1261471037900

21.65 5,629.00
21.65 5,629.00
$ 59,105.80
Bid shows $59,103.80

21.65

Action Courier uses independent
contractors. Independent contractors
are qualified and deemed to be in
compliance prior to receiving any
contract for courier work

Yes
Yes

Darlene Clayton

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
MWBE notification
MBE DL09387

HUB 1752970577800

22.24 5,782.40

22.24 5,782.40

$ 57,824.00
Bid shows $222.40
22.24

NCTRCA

Other County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
WBE 2005113323
HUB 1752018951900

10.50 2,730.00
10.50 2,730.00
27,300.00
Bid shows $27,300
10.50

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
No

15.00 3,900.00
15.00 3,900.00
42,900.00
Bid shows $42,900
15.00
Yes
Yes

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing
No

48.00 12,480.00
48.00 12,480.00
126,880.00
488.00
$48 per new location
Yes
No

30 day advancement upon award
of bid for office space & overhead

to meet all DC requirements




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-054-5502

ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND
COURIER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

BUYER: GLORIA TORRES

Award: 12 months plus thiee extension options

VENDOR #6 VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 VENDOR #10
Executive Process LLC KB Services Meteor Couriers, Inc. Metro 1 Courier Nomenclature LL.C
dba EZ Messenger Shameeka Johnson Garth Wilkins Mark Courson Roy Decker Allen

Stephen A. Ezell

2107 Young Street

Dallas, TX 75204
214.748.4200

Fax: 214.748-4206
sezell@executiveprocess.com

www.ezemessenger.com

3773 Cripple Creek Drive
Dallas, TX 75224
972.365.4669

Fax: 1.800.458.5369
kbser@switched.com

PO Box 833427
Richardson, TX 75083
972.235.5050

Fax: 214.751.6200
garth@meteorlx.com

www.meteorlx.com

PO Box 142913

Irving, TX 75014-2913
972.221.1983

Fax: 214.742.5076
mark@metro1courier.com

www.metro1courier.com

3100 Main Street

Dallas, TX 75226
214.908.7087

Fax: 214.321.5775
nomenclaturellc@yahoo.com

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION Est.
Days
Daily Delivery and Courier Services

(Cost per round-trip and pick-up return service)

1. Irving Office

841 W. Irving Blvd., Irving 75060
Mapsco 31 BW

JP 4-2 and Constable 4

260

2. North Dallas Government Center 260
10056 Marsh Lane, Dallas 75229

Mapsco 23R

JP 3-3 and Constable 3

JP Collections & Truancy Court North

3. Richardson Office

1411 Beltline Road, Richardson 75080
Mapsco 16B

JP 3-2 and Constable 3

(2 separate pick-up and delivery sites)

260

4. Garland Office

140 N. Garland Ave., Garland 75040
Mapsco 19Y

JP 2-1 and Constable 2

260

5. Mesquite Office

823 N. Galloway, Mesquite 75149
Mapsco 49 -A Z

JP2-2

260

6. Grand Prairie Office

630 W. Main Street, Grand Prairie 75060
Mapsco 51G

JP 4-1 and Constable 4

260

7. Lancaster Office

107 Texas Street, Lancaster 75146
Mapsco 86G

JP 1A, JP 1-2 and Constable 5

260

8. Beckley Courthouses 260

410 S. Beckley Avenue, Dallas 75203

Not Submitted

Dallas County Taxpayer
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Email notification

HUB 1522394389-47994

20.00 5,200.00
20.00 5,200.00
33.00 8,580.00
18.00 4,680.00
18.00 4,680.00
18.00 4,680.00
18.00 4,680.00
18.00 4,680.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer

Email notification

No
25.00 6,500.00
25.00 6,500.00
35.00 9,100.00
30.00 7,800.00
25.00 6,500.00
25.00 6,500.00
30.00 7,800.00
25.00 6,500.00

Non NCTRCA

Other County Taxpayer

Dallas County Website

No
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00

20473
Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing

13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00



DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-054-5502

ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND

COURIER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

BUYER: GLORIA TORRES

Award: 12 months plus thiee extension options
M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
Mapsco 54H
JP's 5-1 & JP 5-2 and Constable 5

9. South Dallas Government Center

7201 S. Polk, Dallas 75237

Mapsco 64X

JP 1-1, Truancy Court South and Constable 1
10. East Dallas Government

3443 St. Francis, Dallas 75228

Mapsco 48F

JP 3-1 and Constable 3

Daily cost to add new location/designation site

Portion of bid which will be subcontracted

Cooperative Purchasing?
References submitted?

Specify the Name and Telephone Number of the Account

Representative who will be handling Dallas County Account

Specify any additional comments

VENDOR #6 VENDOR #7 VENDOR #8 VENDOR #9 VENDOR #10
Executive Process LLC KB Services Meteor Couriers, Inc. Metro 1 Courier Nomenclature LL.C
dba EZ Messenger Shameeka Johnson Garth Wilkins Mark Courson Roy Decker Allen

Stephen A. Ezell

2107 Young Street

Dallas, TX 75204
214.748.4200

Fax: 214.748-4206
sezell@executiveprocess.com

www.ezemessenger.com

3773 Cripple Creek Drive
Dallas, TX 75224
972.365.4669

Fax: 1.800.458.5369
kbser@switched.com

PO Box 833427
Richardson, TX 75083
972.235.5050

Fax: 214.751.6200
garth@meteorlx.com

www.meteorlx.com

PO Box 142913

Irving, TX 75014-2913
972.221.1983

Fax: 214.742.5076
mark@metro1courier.com

www.metro1courier.com

3100 Main Street

Dallas, TX 75226
214.908.7087

Fax: 214.321.5775
nomenclaturellc@yahoo.com

Est.

260

260

TOTAL

Not Submitted

Dallas County Taxpayer
12.00 3,120.00
12.00 3,120.00
31,200.00

Bid shows $31,200
12.00

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Email notification

HUB 1522394389-47994

18.00 4,680.00
18.00 4,680.00
51,740.00
Bid shows $52,260
9.00
100%

Non NCTRCA

Dallas County Taxpayer
Email notification

No

25.00 6,500.00

25.00 6,500.00

70,200.00

270.00

Meteor drivers are independent

contractors so all driving will be

subcontracted.

Will need to increase our
insurance for WC and Workers

Dishonesty policy

Non NCTRCA
Other County Taxpayer
Dallas County Website
No
41.00 10,660.00
41.00 10,660.00
106,600.00
41.00
Yes
Yes

20473
Dallas County Taxpayer
Letter from Purchasing

13.00 3,380.00
13.00 3,380.00
33,800.00
33,800.00
0%

Yes

Two references submitted




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #11 VENDOR #12

BID NO. 2011-054-5502 Reliable Couriers Smart Delivery Service Inc
Elizabeth Ann Rodriguez Shawn Benjamin
ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND 2797 Irving Blvd #110 1901 Central Dr., Suite 809
COURIER SERVICE Dallas, TX 75207 Bedford, TX 76021-5858
214.637.4800 817.540.0000
OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011 Fax: 214.637.4803 Fax: 817.545.0800
CONTRACT PERIOD; courier2@swbell.net sbenjamin@shipsmartnow.com
BUYER: GLORIA TORRES www.reliable.com www.shipsmartnow.com
Award: 12 months plus three extension options
M/WBE STATUS HFDB47369Y1111 Non NCTRCA
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas County Taxpayer Other County Taxpayer
BID NOTIFICATION Dallas County Website D/FW Development Council
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION State 17523716700 D/FW MSDC #DL11355
DESCRIPTION Est.
Days

Daily Delivery and Courier Services
(Cost per round-trip and pick-up return service)
1. Irving Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
841 W. Irving Blvd., Irving 75060
Mapsco 31 BW
JP 4-2 and Constable 4
2. North Dallas Government Center 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
10056 Marsh Lane, Dallas 75229
Mapsco 23R
JP 3-3 and Constable 3
JP Collections & Truancy Court North
3. Richardson Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
1411 Beltline Road, Richardson 75080
Mapsco 16B
JP 3-2 and Constable 3 - -
(2 separate pick-up and delivery sites)
4. Garland Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
140 N. Garland Ave., Garland 75040
Mapsco 19Y
JP 2-1 and Constable 2
5. Mesquite Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
823 N. Galloway, Mesquite 75149
Mapsco 49 -A Z
JP2-2
6. Grand Prairie Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
630 W. Main Street, Grand Prairie 75060
Mapsco 51G
JP 4-1 and Constable 4
7. Lancaster Office 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
107 Texas Street, Lancaster 75146
Mapsco 86G
JP 1A, JP 1-2 and Constable 5
8. Beckley Courthouses 260 10.75 2,795.00 14.00 3,640.00
410 S. Beckley Avenue, Dallas 75203




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-054-5502

ANNUAL CONTRACT OF DELIVERY AND
COURIER SERVICE

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

BUYER: GLORIA TORRES

Award: 12 months plus three extension options

M/WBE STATUS

TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION
Mapsco 54H
JP's 5-1 & JP 5-2 and Constable 5

9. South Dallas Government Center

7201 S. Polk, Dallas 75237

Mapsco 64X

JP 1-1, Truancy Court South and Constable 1
10. East Dallas Government

3443 St. Francis, Dallas 75228

Mapsco 48F

JP 3-1 and Constable 3

Daily cost to add new location/designation site

Portion of bid which will be subcontracted

Cooperative Purchasing?
References submitted?

Specify the Name and Telephone Number of the Account

Representative who will be handling Dallas County Account

Specify any additional comments

TOTAL

Est.

260

260

VENDOR #11 VENDOR #12
Reliable Couriers Smart Delivery Service Inc
Elizabeth Ann Rodriguez Shawn Benjamin

2797 Irving Blvd #110
Dallas, TX 75207
214.637.4800

Fax: 214.637.4803
courier2@swbell.net

www.reliable.com

1901 Central Dr., Suite 809
Bedford, TX 76021-5858
817.540.0000

Fax: 817.545.0800
sbenjamin@shipsmartnow.com

www.shipsmartnow.com

HFDB47369Y1111
Dallas County Taxpayer
Dallas County Website
State 17523716700

10.75 2,795.00
10.75 2,795.00
27,950.00

10.75

Non NCTRCA
Other County Taxpayer
D/FW Development Council
D/FW MSDC #DL11355
14.00 3,640.00
14.00 3,640.00
36,400.00
Bid shows $140
14.00

None of this contract will
be subcontracted out




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #8

BID NO. 2008-078-3590

Annual Contract of Delivery and Courier Service

OPENING DATE: May 5, 2008

BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified

MLW Contractor

161 Hunter St.

Cedar Hill, Texas 75104
Milton Warren
972-639-2146
214-331-4563

mlw1961@yahoo.com

Nomenclature

3100 Main

Dallas, Texas 75226
Roy Dexter
214-908-7087
214-321-5775 - Fax

nomenclaturepaint@yahoo.com

Reliable Couriers
2797 Irving Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207
Liz Rodriguez
214-637-4800
214-637-4803 - Fax
www.reliablec.com

Yes

DESCRIPTION

Daily Delivery and Courier Services
(Cost per round-trip and pick-up return service)

1. Irving Office

841 W. Irving Blvd.
Irving, Texas 75060
Mapsco 31 B W

JP 4-2 and Constable 4

2. North Dallas Government Center
10056 Marsh Lane

Dallas, Texas 75229

Mapsco 23R

JP 3-3 and Constable 3

JP Collections & Truancy Court North

3. Richardson Office

1411 Beltline Road

Richardson, Texas 75080

Mapsco 16B

JP 3-2 and Constable 3

(2 separate pick-up and delivery sites)

4. Garland Office

140 N. Garland Ave.
Garland, Texas 75040
Mapsco 19Y

JP 2-1 and Constable 2

5. Mesquite Office

823 N. Galloway
Mesquite, Texas 75149
Mapsco 49 -A Z

6. Grand Prairie Office

630 W. Main Street

Grand Prairie, Texas 75060
Mapsco 51G

Est. Days

260

260

260

260

260

260

260

$ 3400 $

$ 3400 $

$ 53.00 $

$ 2650 $

$ 53.00 $

$ 3400 $

$ 3400 $

8,840.00

8,840.00

13,780.00

6,890.00

13,780.00

8,840.00

8,840.00

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

$ 121.00 $

31,460.00

31,460.00

31,460.00

31,460.00

31,460.00

31,460.00

31,460.00

$ 2500 $

$ 2500 $

$ 2500 $

$ 10.00 $

$ 2500 $

$ 2500 $

$ 2500 $

6,500.00

6,500.00

6,500.00

2,600.00

6,500.00

6,500.00

6,500.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #8

BID NO. 2008-078-3590

Annual Contract of Delivery and Courier Service

OPENING DATE: May 5, 2008

BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified

JP 4-1 and Constable 4

7. Lancaster Office

107 Texas Street

Lancaster, Texas 75146
Mapsco 86G

JP 1A, JP 1-2 and Constable 5

8. Beckley Courthouses

410 S. Beckley Avenue

Dallas, Texas 75203

Mapsco 54H

JP's 5-1 & JP 5-2 and Constable 5

9. South Dallas Government Center

7201 S. Polk

Dallas, Texas 75237

Mapsco 64X

JP 1-1, Truancy Court South and Constable 1

10. East Dallas Government
3443 St. Francis

Dallas, Texas 75228
Mapsco 48F

JP 3-1 and Constable 3

TOTAL

Daily Delivery and Courier Services Daily Rate
(Cost per one way and round trip)

1. Access Language Center

1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 217
Ricahrdson, Texas 75080

One Way

Round Trip

2. KX & Associates

260

260

260

260

200
50

MLW Contractor

161 Hunter St.

Cedar Hill, Texas 75104
Milton Warren
972-639-2146
214-331-4563

mlw1961@yahoo.com

$ 53.00 $ 13,780.00

$ 3400 $ 8,840.00
$ 3400 $ 8,840.00
$ 3400 $ 8,840.00

$ 110,110.00
No Bid

Nomenclature

3100 Main

Dallas, Texas 75226
Roy Dexter
214-908-7087
214-321-5775 - Fax

nomenclaturepaint@yahoo.com

Reliable Couriers
2797 Irving Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207
Liz Rodriguez
214-637-4800
214-637-4803 - Fax
www.reliablec.com

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

$ 121.00 $ 31,460.00 [$ 25.00 $ 6,500.00

$ 121.00 $ 31,460.00 [$ 25.00 $ 6,500.00

$ 121.00 $ 31,460.00 [$ 25.00 $ 6,500.00

$ 121.00 $ 31,460.00 [$ 25.00 $ 6,500.00
$ 346,060.00 $ 67,600.00

$ 75.00 $ 15,000.00 |$ 15.00 $ 3,000.00

$ 150.00 $ 7,500.00 [$ 28.00 $ 1,400.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #6

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #8

BID NO. 2008-078-3590

Annual Contract of Delivery and Courier Service

OPENING DATE: May 5, 2008

BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified

8500 N. Stemmons Frwy., Suite 3015
Dallas, Texas 75247

One Way

Round Trip

3. Carsons Reporting & Associates
The Meadows Building

5640 Milton Street, Suite 240
Dallas, Texas 75206

One Way

Round Trip

4. Earl Cabel Federal Buidling
1100 Commerce St.

Dallas, Texas 75242

One Way

Round Trip

TOTAL

TOTAL PART 1:
TOTAL PART 2:

GRAND TOTAL

Did your company read and complete the Dallas County M/\WBE
Specifications for Bids/RFP's Section of the bid package?

Specify the name and Telephone Number of the Account
Representative who will be handling Dallas County Account

Specify any additional comments costs/ect. Included with
your bid proposal, if applicable:

MLW Contractor

161 Hunter St.

Cedar Hill, Texas 75104
Milton Warren
972-639-2146
214-331-4563

mlw1961@yahoo.com

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 110,110.00
No Bid

$ 110,110.00

Milton Warren
972-639-2146

Nomenclature

3100 Main

Dallas, Texas 75226
Roy Dexter
214-908-7087
214-321-5775 - Fax

nomenclaturepaint@yahoo.com

Reliable Couriers
2797 Irving Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207
Liz Rodriguez
214-637-4800
214-637-4803 - Fax
www.reliablec.com

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

$ 65.00 $ 12.00

$ 130.00 $ 20.00

$ 75.00 $ 12.00

$ 150.00 $ 20.00

$ 45.00 $ 10.00

$ 90.00 $ 18.00

$ 780.00 $ 135.00
$ 346,060.00 $ 67,600.00
$ 22,500.00 $ 4,400.00
$ 368,560.00 $ 72,000.00

Yes Yes

Roy Dexter Liz Rodriguez

214-908-7087

214-637-4800




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #9

BID NO. 2008-078-3590

Annual Contract of Delivery and Courier Service

OPENING DATE: May 5, 2008

BUYER: JENNIFER TURNER (214) 653-7437

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified

US Courier & Logistics-Dallas LLP
P.O. Box 542983

Dallas, Texas 75354

Mary Ellen DiTucci

214-358-0804

972-956-8586 - Fax
Wwww.uscouriertexas.com

DESCRIPTION

Daily Delivery and Courier Services
(Cost per round-trip and pick-up return service)

1. Irving Office

841 W. Irving Blvd.
Irving, Texas 75060
Mapsco 31 BW

JP 4-2 and Constable 4

2. North Dallas Government Center
10056 Marsh Lane

Dallas, Texas 75229

Mapsco 23R

JP 3-3 and Constable 3

JP Collections & Truancy Court North

3. Richardson Office

1411 Beltline Road

Richardson, Texas 75080

Mapsco 16B

JP 3-2 and Constable 3

(2 separate pick-up and delivery sites)

4. Garland Office

140 N. Garland Ave.
Garland, Texas 75040
Mapsco 19Y

JP 2-1 and Constable 2

5. Mesquite Office

823 N. Galloway
Mesquite, Texas 75149
Mapsco 49 -A Z

Est. Days

260

260

260

260

260

260

$15.00 $ 3,900.00

15.00 $ 3,900.00

18.00 $ 4,680.00

10.00 $ 2,600.00

18.00 $ 4,680.00

16.00 $ 4,160.00




6. Grand Prairie Office

630 W. Main Street

Grand Prairie, Texas 75060
Mapsco 51G

JP 4-1 and Constable 4

7. Lancaster Office

107 Texas Street

Lancaster, Texas 75146
Mapsco 86G

JP 1A, JP 1-2 and Constable 5

8. Beckley Courthouses

410 S. Beckley Avenue

Dallas, Texas 75203

Mapsco 54H

JP's 5-1 & JP 5-2 and Constable 5

9. South Dallas Government Center

7201 S. Polk

Dallas, Texas 75237

Mapsco 64X

JP 1-1, Truancy Court South and Constable 1

10. East Dallas Government
3443 St. Francis

Dallas, Texas 75228
Mapsco 48F

JP 3-1 and Constable 3

TOTAL PART ONE:

Daily Delivery and Courier Services Daily Rate
(Cost per one way and round trip)

1. Access Language Center

1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 217
Ricahrdson, Texas 75080

One Way

Round Trip

2. KX & Associates

8500 N. Stemmons Frwy., Suite 3015
Dallas, Texas 75247

One Way

Round Trip

3. Carsons Reporting & Associates
The Meadows Building
5640 Milton Street, Suite 240

260

260

260

260

260

200
50

No Bid

No Bid

20.00

16.00

16.00

16.00

16.00

5,200.00

4,160.00

4,160.00

4,160.00

4,160.00

45,760.00




Dallas, Texas 75206
One Way
Round Trip

4. Earl Cabel Federal Buidling
1100 Commerce St.

Dallas, Texas 75242

One Way

Round Trip

TOTAL

TOTAL PART 1:
TOTAL PART 2:

GRAND TOTAL

Did your company read and complete the Dallas County M/\WBE
Specifications for Bids/RFP's Section of the bid package?

Specify the name and Telephone Number of the Account
Representative who will be handling Dallas County Account

Specify any additional comments costs/ect. Included with
your bid proposal, if applicable:

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$
$
Yes

Mary Ellen DiTucci
214-358-0804

45,760.00
No Bid

45,760.00




