

DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION	VENDOR #1	VENDOR #2	VENDOR #3																																																																										
BID NO: 2014-052-6434 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR Food Trays Buyer: Charles Price (214) 653-6223 Annual contract w/3 extension options CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/1/2014 through 6/30/15	Cooks Direct Inc Teri Teclaw 27725 Diehl Rd Warrenville, IL 60555 800-956-5571 Fax: 800-956-6822 bids@cooksdirect.com www.cooksdirect.com	Calico Industries Michael Heverly 9045 Junction dr Annapolis Junction, MD 20701 800.638.0828 Fax: 301.575.0131 bids@calicoindustries.com -	Oliver Packaging&Equipment Company Chadd Floria 3236 Wilson Dr NW Walker, MI 49534 616-356-2950 Fax: 616-913-9392 cfloria@oliverquality.com www.oliverquality.com																																																																										
M/WBE STATUS OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION TAXPAYER STATUS	None None Other County Tax Payer Letter from Dallas County Purchasing	None None Other County Taxpayer Onvia	NO None Other County Taxpayer Letter from Dallas County Purchasing Department																																																																										
BID NOTIFICATION																																																																													
<table border="0"> <tr> <td style="text-align: center;">DESCRIPTION</td> <td style="text-align: center;">EST QTY</td> <td></td> <td style="text-align: center;">Price</td> <td style="text-align: center;">EXT</td> <td></td> <td style="text-align: center;">Price</td> <td style="text-align: center;">EXT</td> <td style="text-align: center;">Price</td> <td style="text-align: center;">EXT</td> </tr> </table>	DESCRIPTION	EST QTY		Price	EXT		Price	EXT	Price	EXT				<table border="0"> <tr> <td style="vertical-align: top;"> 3 Compartment Hot Disposable Trays - Paper based dual ovenable trays - Reheating of sealed trays, up to 180° F - Polyester film lining provides a liquid barrier - Dimensions: W 8.625" x L 6.5" x D 1.5" - Entrée compartment 15.5 oz - Two side compartment 6.5 oz each - Similar to Oliver Item # 51451 (w/o film) Specify the Amount per case </td> <td style="vertical-align: top; text-align: center;">300 cases</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No Bid</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 155.00</td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 46,500.00</td> </tr> </table>	3 Compartment Hot Disposable Trays - Paper based dual ovenable trays - Reheating of sealed trays, up to 180° F - Polyester film lining provides a liquid barrier - Dimensions: W 8.625" x L 6.5" x D 1.5" - Entrée compartment 15.5 oz - Two side compartment 6.5 oz each - Similar to Oliver Item # 51451 (w/o film) Specify the Amount per case	300 cases		No bid			No Bid		\$ 155.00	\$ 46,500.00				<table border="0"> <tr> <td style="vertical-align: top;"> 3 Compartment Entrée Dish Trays Silicon Flex Trays Dimension: 8-7/16" x 6-3/8" x 1-7/8" Must withstand oven temperatures of 400+ degrees F Must nest/stack with current cold tray inventory from Design Specialties Similar to Cooks Correctional Item # 630-410GR Color: Green, Orange Specify the Amount per case </td> <td style="vertical-align: top; text-align: center;">750 cases</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 122.40</td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 91,800.00</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	3 Compartment Entrée Dish Trays Silicon Flex Trays Dimension: 8-7/16" x 6-3/8" x 1-7/8" Must withstand oven temperatures of 400+ degrees F Must nest/stack with current cold tray inventory from Design Specialties Similar to Cooks Correctional Item # 630-410GR Color: Green, Orange Specify the Amount per case	750 cases		\$ 122.40	\$ 91,800.00		No Bid							<table border="0"> <tr> <td style="vertical-align: top;"> 5 Compartment Food Trays Color: Beige 14" L x 10-1/2" W x 1-1/4" D. Tray must be compatible to accommodate existing County entrée's dishes Similar to T-500 Trays of Design Specialty Specify the Amount per case </td> <td style="vertical-align: top; text-align: center;">400 cases</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 68.84</td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">\$ 27,536.00</td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	5 Compartment Food Trays Color: Beige 14" L x 10-1/2" W x 1-1/4" D. Tray must be compatible to accommodate existing County entrée's dishes Similar to T-500 Trays of Design Specialty Specify the Amount per case	400 cases		No bid			\$ 68.84	\$ 27,536.00						<table border="0"> <tr> <td style="vertical-align: top;"> Woolite • 0.25 oz fabric wash packets • 500 per case Specify the amount per case </td> <td style="vertical-align: top; text-align: center;">300 cases</td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td style="vertical-align: top;">No bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Woolite • 0.25 oz fabric wash packets • 500 per case Specify the amount per case	300 cases		No bid			No bid							Should you firm be awarded this contract what portion to be subcontracted				Product in stock	Not indicated We will obtain products upon award/Some in stock	not indicated We will obtain products upon award	not indicated We do have the products in stock
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY		Price	EXT		Price	EXT	Price	EXT																																																																				
3 Compartment Hot Disposable Trays - Paper based dual ovenable trays - Reheating of sealed trays, up to 180° F - Polyester film lining provides a liquid barrier - Dimensions: W 8.625" x L 6.5" x D 1.5" - Entrée compartment 15.5 oz - Two side compartment 6.5 oz each - Similar to Oliver Item # 51451 (w/o film) Specify the Amount per case	300 cases		No bid			No Bid		\$ 155.00	\$ 46,500.00																																																																				
3 Compartment Entrée Dish Trays Silicon Flex Trays Dimension: 8-7/16" x 6-3/8" x 1-7/8" Must withstand oven temperatures of 400+ degrees F Must nest/stack with current cold tray inventory from Design Specialties Similar to Cooks Correctional Item # 630-410GR Color: Green, Orange Specify the Amount per case	750 cases		\$ 122.40	\$ 91,800.00		No Bid																																																																							
5 Compartment Food Trays Color: Beige 14" L x 10-1/2" W x 1-1/4" D. Tray must be compatible to accommodate existing County entrée's dishes Similar to T-500 Trays of Design Specialty Specify the Amount per case	400 cases		No bid			\$ 68.84	\$ 27,536.00																																																																						
Woolite • 0.25 oz fabric wash packets • 500 per case Specify the amount per case	300 cases		No bid			No bid																																																																							

Cooperative Purchasing
Specify Prompt/early payment discount
Does your Company provide health insurance
Does Company share in the cost a min 90%/65%
Does the company share cost min. 75% employees/50%Family

Is it comparable to service provided by Dallas County
If subcontracting, Does subcontractor provide health insurance

Yes
N/A
yes
No/No
yes
No
N/A

Yes
not indicated
yes
No/No
yes
yes
no subcontractors

Yes
O
yes
Not indicated/yes
Yes
Yes
Yes