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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper,

Trash Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Toilet Paper

Specify sheet size

Specify number of sheets per Roll
Specify Number of rolls per Case

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill

Specify number of covers per pack
Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,

Specify Roll Length

Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels
brand Similar: Goergia Pacific
Specify Number Towels Per Pack:

Specify Number Packs Per Case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Multifold Paper Towels
Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304

Estimated Annual

Quantity

10,600

150

3200

1230

7500

cases

cases

cases

cases

cases

Vendor 1

Medwaste Solutions Inc
Maureen Brenner

B &L FoodLLC
Lester Zhou

Vendor 2

Vendor 3

Pollock Paper

Empire Paper

Vendor 4
Empire Paper

Eleanor Czajka Aaron Wright ALTERNATE A
8615 Edgemere Rd suite C 1206 E. 6th st 1 Pollock Place 2708 Central Frwy E
Dallas, TX 75225 Los Angelas, CA 90021 Grand Prarie, TX 75050 Wichita Falls, TX 76301
Ph: 214-696-5248 PH: 213.284.5301 PH:972.263.0205 PH: 940-766-3216
Fax: 214-696-6748 FAX: 213-988-8868 FAX: FAX: 940-766-3867
sales@medwastesolutions.com |vincent@grandfoodlic.com tommy.wallis@pollockpaper.co |aaron.wright@empirepaper.com
Yes Yes No No
Yes No No Yes
Yes Other Yes Other
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
36.82 $ 390,292.00 $36.54 $387,324.00 $32.45 $343,970.00 $31.35 $332,310.00 $29.48 $312,488.00
4.5x4.5 4.2x3.54 Price is for 8,833 cases 4.0x4.05 4.5x4.05 4.0x4.4
500 500 Please order by even Pallet 550 550 500
80 96 80 80 96
Atlas APM 280 Green
Golden Gate/500J GP19880/1 GPC 19880 sca
317 $ 4,755.00 NO BID $49.15 $7,372.50 $29.35 $4,402.50
250 250 250
20 20 20
Boardwalk
BWKK5000 HOSHG5000 Hospeco #DS5000
RECOMMEDED FOR AWARD
27.92 $ 89,344.00 NO BID $17.41 $55,712.00 $16.94 $54,208.00 $14.83 $47,456.00
350 350 350 350
12rolls 12 12 12
GP MFG 26401 GP26401 GPC26401 sca
RECOMMEDED FOR AWARD
24.95 $ 30,688.50 NO BID $15.41 $18,954.30 $14.99 $18,437.70 $13.90 $17,097.00
250 250 250 250
16 16 16 16
GP MFG 23504 GP23504 GPC23504 sca
RECOMMEDED FOR AWARD
23.29 $ 174,675.00 NO BID $15.10 $113,250.00 $14.58 $109,350.00 $14.48 $108,600.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper,
Trash Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

Specify Number Towels per Pack

Specify Number Packs Per Case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll

Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

Additional Cost Associated Bid/ Altenate Products Bid

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing

Prompt or Early payment discount

Does your Company provide Health insurance
Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%

Does Company share in cost 75/50%

Comparable to services provided by Dallas County
Does Subcontractor have Health Insurance

5400

cases

Vendor 1

Medwaste Solutions Inc
Maureen Brenner

8615 Edgemere Rd suite C
Dallas, TX 75225

Ph: 214-696-5248

Fax: 214-696-6748

sales@medwastesolutions.com

250

16
GP MFG 23304

216 $ 116,640.00

25

250
GEN 404614

5 business days

$ 806,394.50

Not indicated
Yes
Yes

not indicated

Yes
yes/no
Yes
yes
Not indicated

full time only

B &L FoodLLC
Lester Zhou

1206 E. 6th st

Vendor 2

Los Angelas, CA 90021
PH: 213.284.5301
FAX: 213-988-8868

vincent@grandfoodlic.com

$22.91
50

$250.00
Grand Food/100
10 days

Not indicated
yes
yes
0%30

no

Not indicated
Not indicated
not indicated

$123,714.00

$511,038.00

not indicated

Vendor 3

Pollock Paper

Eleanor Czajka

1 Pollock Place

Grand Prarie, TX 75050
PH:972.263.0205

FAX:

tommy.wallis

ollockpaper.co

250
16
GP23304
25.25 $136,350.00
25
250
Heritage
z8048HNLR2
1-3 days
$675,608.80
0%
Yes
Yes
N/a
Yes
yeslyes
yes
yes
N /A

Empire Paper

Aaron Wright

2708 Central Frwy E

Wichita Falls, TX 76301

PH: 940-766-3216

FAX: 940-766-3867
aaron.wright@empirepaper.com

250

16
GPC23304

19.34 $104,436.00

25

10

Heritage 12 Micron

1-7Days
Liners May Increase with 30 day notice
Paper items are valid until 9/30/15

$623,144.20

None
Yes

None
0%30

Yes
No/No
No

Yes

No Sub

Vendor 4
Empire Paper

ALTERNATE A

16
sca
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4.1

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Toilet Paper
Specify sheet size

Specify number of sheets per Roll
Specify Number of rolls per Case

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill
Specify number of covers per pack
Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,

Specify Roll Length
Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels

Estimated Annual

Quantity

10,600

150

3200

1230

cases

cases

cases

cases

Central Poly Bag Corp

Andrew Hoffer
2400 Bedle Place

Linden, NJ. 07036
PH:908.862.7570

FAX: 908.862.9019
bids@centralpoly.com

No
No
Other

Vendor 6
Interboro Packaging Corp

Pessy Striovic
114 Bracken Rd

Montgomery, NY 12549
PH:845.457.2700

interboro@frontiernet.net

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE A

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE B

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE C

**AWARD
RECOMMENDATION**

Cost EXT

$35.66
4.1x3.2
550
80

$377,996.00

Vondrehie

$31.14

250
20

$4,671.00

Sanicover TSCR20250

$16.99 $54,368.00
350
12
Putney P720N
$16.98 $20,885.40

Yes

No

Other

Cost EXT

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

30f 19
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4.2

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

brand Similar: Goergia Pacific

Specify Number Towels Per Pack:
Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Multifold Paper Towels

Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304
Specify Number Towels per Pack

Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

Estimated Annual

Quantity

7500 cases

5400 cases

Central Poly Bag Corp

Vendor 6
Interboro Packaging Corp

Interboro Packaging Corp

Interboro Packaging Corp

Interboro Packaging Corp

Andrew Hoffer Pessy Striovic ALTERNATE A ALTERNATE B ALTERNATE C
2400 Bedle Place 114 Bracken Rd *AWARD
RECOMMENDATION**
Linden, NJ. 07036 Montgomery, NY 12549
PH:908.862.7570 PH:845.457.2700
FAX: 908.862.9019
bids@centralpoly.com interboro@frontiernet.net
No Yes
No No
Other Other
Cost EXT
Cost EXT
334
12
Putney P6003
$17.01 $127,575.00 No Bid
250
16
Putney P200N
$17.01 $91,854.00 $21.48 $115,992.00 $18.98 $102,492.00 $16.32 $88,128.00 $15.48 $83,592.00
25
250 INT-4048 Xheavy INT 4048H INT 4048MED INT 4048MED
Central Poly
CP15923N10 10--14 day ARO 10-14 Days ARO 10-14 Days $41,926.00
10-21 days
$677,349.40 $115,992.00

40f19
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Additional Cost Associated Bid/ Altenate Products Bid

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing

Prompt or Early payment discount

Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%

Does Company share in cost 75/50%

Comparable to services provided by Dallas County

Does Subcontractor have Health Insurance

Estimated Annual

Quantity

Central Poly Bag Corp

Andrew Hoffer
2400 Bedle Place

Linden, NJ. 07036
PH:908.862.7570

FAX: 908.862.9019
bids@centralpoly.com

Vendor 6
Interboro Packaging Corp

Pessy Striovic
114 Bracken Rd

Montgomery, NY 12549
PH:845.457.2700

interboro@frontiernet.net

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE A

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE B

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE C

**AWARD
RECOMMENDATION**

No Yes
No No
Other Other
Cost EXT
Cost
None None
No Yes
Yes Yes
0%30 0%30
Yes No
No/No N/A
No N/A
No N/A
Not indicated N/A

50f 19
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Estimated Annual

Quantity

Vendor 5

Central Poly Bag Corp

Andrew Hoffer
2400 Bedle Place

Linden, NJ. 07036
PH:908.862.7570

FAX: 908.862.9019
bids@centralpoly.com

No
No
Other

Vendor 6
Interboro Packaging Corp

Pessy Striovic
114 Bracken Rd

Montgomery, NY 12549
PH:845.457.2700

interboro@frontiernet.net

Yes
No
Other

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE A

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE B

Interboro Packaging Corp

ALTERNATE C

**AWARD
RECOMMENDATION**

Cost

EXT

Cost EXT

6 of 19
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4.1

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Toilet Paper
Specify sheet size

Specify number of sheets per Roll
Specify Number of rolls per Case

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill
Specify number of covers per pack
Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,

Specify Roll Length
Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels

Estimated Annual

Quantity

10,600

150

3200

1230

cases

cases

cases

cases

Vendor 7
Complete Supply

David Bahcall
9011 John Carpenter FRWY

Dallas, TX. 75247
PH:214.231.3631

FAX: 214.231.3636
bids@c-supply.com

Yes
No
Other

Vendor 8
Aleph Industry

Solomon Torkieh
106 Lexington ave

Brooklyn NY 11238
PH: 718-399-6311

FAX: 718-399-7175
storkieh@gmail.com

no
no
Other

Cost EXT

$33.79 $358,174.00
4.5x4.05
550
80

GP19880/1

$26.70 $4,005.00
250
20

TX 5000

$18.10 $57,920.00
4200
12

GP26401

$16.03 $19,716.90

Cost

70f19

EXT

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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4.2

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Estimated Annual

Quantity

Description

brand Similar: Goergia Pacific

Specify Number Towels Per Pack:
Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Multifold Paper Towels 7500
Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304

Specify Number Towels per Pack

Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size 5400

Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

cases

cases

Vendor 7
Complete Supply

David Bahcall
9011 John Carpenter FRWY

Dallas, TX. 75247
PH:214.231.3631

FAX: 214.231.3636

Vendor 8
Aleph Industry

Solomon Torkieh
106 Lexington ave

Brooklyn NY 11238
PH: 718-399-6311

FAX: 718-399-7175

bids@c-supply.com storkieh@gmail.com
Yes no
No no
Other Other
Cost EXT
Cost EXT
250
16
GP23504
$15.87 $119,025.00 No Bid
250
16
GP23304
20.28 $109,512.00 $18.75 $101,250.00
25 25 roll, 10roll
250 250
Republic
N404814CR 40x48
"Sure" 7-14days
$668,352.90 $101,250.00

8 of 19
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Additional Cost Associated Bid/ Altenate Products Bid

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing

Prompt or Early payment discount

Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%

Does Company share in cost 75/50%

Comparable to services provided by Dallas County

Does Subcontractor have Health Insurance

Estimated Annual

Quantity

Vendor 7
Complete Supply

David Bahcall
9011 John Carpenter FRWY

Dallas, TX. 75247
PH:214.231.3631

FAX: 214.231.3636

Vendor 8
Aleph Industry

Solomon Torkieh
106 Lexington ave

Brooklyn NY 11238
PH: 718-399-6311

FAX: 718-399-7175

bids@c-supply.com storkieh@gmail.com
Yes no
No no
Other Other
Cost EXT
Cost EXT
Not indicated None
most we stock/other we will Yes
Yes (min orders may apply) Yes
N/a Not indicated
Yes No
No/No no/no
No Not indicated
Yes "It is obama care approved" |Not indicated
N /A Not indicated

9of 19
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags.and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Estimated Annual

Quantity

Vendor 7
Complete Supply

David Bahcall
9011 John Carpenter FRWY

Dallas, TX. 75247
PH:214.231.3631

FAX: 214.231.3636

Vendor 8
Aleph Industry

Solomon Torkieh
106 Lexington ave

Brooklyn NY 11238
PH: 718-399-6311

FAX: 718-399-7175

bids@c-supply.com storkieh@gmail.com
Yes no
No no
Other Other
Cost EXT
Cost EXT

10 of 19
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

1 Toilet Paper

4.

[N

Specify sheet size

Description

Specify number of sheets per Roll
Specify Number of rolls per Case

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill

Specify number of covers per pack

Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,

Specify Roll Length

Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels

Goergia Pacific

Specify Number Towels Per Pack:

Specify Number Packs Per Case

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

10,600  cases

150 cases

3200 cases

1230 cases

Vendor 9

Advantage Supply
Larry Vrana

P.O. Box 471103

FT Worth TX. 76147
PH:866-280-1846

Fax: 817-377-8095

Advantage Supply

ALTERNATE A

Vendor 10

Interline Brands/ JanPak
Fred Brano

701 San Marco blvd 14th floor

Jacksonville FL, 32207
PH:904-421-1400

FAX: 800-476-5848
institutionalgovernmentbidsteam@int

Vendor 11
Unisource Worldwide, Inc

Kevin Carrier
7016 A C Skinner Parkway

Jacksonville, FL 32256
PH: 800.631.1955 ext. 4

FAX: 800.224.8799
carol.kelsay@unisourceworldwide.c

erlinebrands.com

om

Yes No No
No Yes Yes
Other Other Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
$39.46 $418,276.00 $32.90 $348,740.00 $37.61 $398,666.00
2 ply 4.5x4.5 4.0x4.05
500 500 550
80RL 80 80
BWK24Green GP19880 GP 19880/01
$26.32 $3,948.00 $22.47 $3,370.50 $26.04 $3,906.00
250 250 250/20
20 20 5000
BWKK 5000 Renown 3801 Rochester 25177673
NO BID $17.66 $56,512.00 $19.10 $61,120.00
350 feet 350
12 12
GP 26401 GP 26401
NO BID $15.62 $19,212.60 $16.90 $20,787.00
250 250
16 4000
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4.

S}

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Multifold Paper Towels

Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304
Specify Number Towels per Pack

Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

Other Cost Associated with Bid/ Alternate Prices

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

7500

5400

cases

cases

Vendor 9

Advantage Supply
Larry Vrana

Advantage Supply

Vendor 10

Interline Brands/ JanPak
Fred Brano

Vendor 11
Unisource Worldwide, Inc

ALTERNATE A Kevin Carrier
P.O. Box 471103 701 San Marco blvd 14th floor 7016 A C Skinner Parkway
FT Worth TX. 76147 Jacksonville FL, 32207 Jacksonville, FL 32256
PH:866-280-1846 PH:904-421-1400 PH: 800.631.1955 ext. 4
Fax: 817-377-8095 FAX: 800-476-5848 FAX: 800.224.8799
institutionalgovernmentbidsteam@int |carol.kelsay@unisourceworldwide.c
erlinebrands.com om
Yes No No
No Yes Yes
Other Other Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
GP 23504 GP 23504
NO BID $15.30 $114,750.00 $16.56 $124,200.00
250 250
4000 4000
GP23304 GP23304

$28.27 $152,658.00 $21.53 $116,262.00 $23.08 $124,632.00 No Bid

10RL 10rl/ct 25 667217.1

25 bags 25bags 250

I1BSS404814N 1BSS404814N Prenown 14516
Next Day Next day
$574,882.00 $667,217.10 $608,679.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing
Prompt or Early payment discount
Does Company provide Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%
Does provide coverage 75%/50%
Is it Comparable to Dallas County

Does Subcontractors Provide Insurance

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

Vendor 9

Advantage Supply
Larry Vrana

P.O. Box 471103

FT Worth TX. 76147
PH:866-280-1846

Fax: 817-377-8095

Advantage Supply

ALTERNATE A

Vendor 10

Interline Brands/ JanPak
Fred Brano

701 San Marco blvd 14th floor

Jacksonville FL, 32207
PH:904-421-1400

FAX: 800-476-5848
institutionalgovernmentbidsteam@int

Vendor 11
Unisource Worldwide, Inc

Kevin Carrier
7016 A C Skinner Parkway

Jacksonville, FL 32256
PH: 800.631.1955 ext. 4

FAX: 800.224.8799
carol.kelsay@unisourceworldwide.c

erlinebrands.com

om

Yes No No
No Yes Yes
Other Other Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
USSCO stock all items and
del. Co will deliver None None
Yes Not indicated No
yes Yes(restriction
Yes may apply)
Net 30 Net 30 0/30%
No Yes Yes
No/No No/No Yes/Yes
No Yes
Yes
No
Yes N/A
No
N/A N/A
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

1 Toilet Paper

4.

[N

Specify sheet size
number of sheets per Roll
Number of rolls per Case

Speci
Speci

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill
Specify number of covers per pack
Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,
Specify Roll Length
Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels
Goergia Pacific

Specify Number Towels Per Pack:
Specify Number Packs Per Case

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

10,600

150

3200

1230

cases

cases

cases

cases

Vendor 12
Mans Distributors Inc

Mans Distributors Inc

M & R Medical Supply
Mary Crockhom

Sadhna Patel ALTERNATE A
3120 Kellway Dr #108 6326 N. Jim Miller Rd
Carrollton, TX 75006 Dallas, TX
PH:972.930.0330 PH: 214.321.3314
FAX: 972.248.6267 FAX: 214.935.1063
sadhna@mans.us marycrockham@sbcglobal.net
Yes Yes
No Yes
Yes Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT
RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
$31.81 $337,186.00 $59.99 $635,894.00
4.5x4.5 4.5x4.050
500/roll 550
80rolls 80
Mans 45x45 Cascade 4028
$24.25 $3,637.50 $18.25 $2,737.50
250/pack 250
20 packs 4
Boardwalk(BWKK
RMC 7673 1000)
$24.52 $78,464.00 $17.00 $54,400.00 $86.95 $278,240.00
350 350 350 feet
12 rolls 12ROLLS 12
GP 26401 Prime 4322 GP 26401
$20.14 $24,772.20 $46.95 $57,748.50
250 250
16 16
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4.

S}

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Multifold Paper Towels

Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304
Specify Number Towels per Pack

Specify Number Packs Per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid

Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

Other Cost Associated with Bid/ Alternate Prices

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

7500

5400

cases

cases

Vendor 12
Mans Distributors Inc

Sadhna Patel
3120 Kellway Dr #108

Carrollton, TX 75006
PH:972.930.0330

FAX: 972.248.6267
sadhna@mans.us

Mans Distributors Inc

ALTERNATE A

M & R Medical Supply
Mary Crockhom

6326 N. Jim Miller Rd

Dallas, TX

PH: 214.321.3314

FAX: 214.935.1063
marycrockham@sbcglobal.net

Yes Yes
No Yes
Yes Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT
RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
GP 23304 GP 23504
$21.25 $159,375.00 $34.59 $259,425.00
250 250
16 16
GP 23304 GP 23304
$20.05 $108,270.00 $47.94 $258,876.00
25
250 250
Berry 4048 14N HC 404816C
10 days 7--14 days
$711,704.70 $1,492,921.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing
Prompt or Early payment discount
Does Company provide Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%
Does provide coverage 75%/50%
Is it Comparable to Dallas County

Does Subcontractors Provide Insurance

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

Vendor 12
Mans Distributors Inc

Sadhna Patel
3120 Kellway Dr #108

Carrollton, TX 75006
PH:972.930.0330

FAX: 972.248.6267
sadhna@mans.us

Mans Distributors Inc

ALTERNATE A

Vendor 13

M & R Medical Supply
Mary Crockhom

6326 N. Jim Miller Rd

Dallas, TX
PH: 214.321.3314

FAX: 214.935.1063
marycrockham@sbcglobal.net

Yes Yes
No Yes
Yes Yes
Cost EXT Cost EXT
RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
Mans will do 100% of
No Sub work on contract 0%
No No
Yes Yes

Not indicated

No

response not clear
response not clear
response not clear

response not clear

2% 10 days
no(both owners have own insurance

Not indicated
Not indicated

Not indicated

Not indicated
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

1 Toilet Paper

4.

[N

Specify sheet size
Specify number of sheets per Roll
Specify Number of rolls per Case

Specify Brand and Product number being Bid

Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refill
Specify number of covers per pack
Specify number of packs per case

Specify Brand/Product

Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll,
Specify Roll Length
Specify Number of Rolls per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid:

Single fold Paper Towels
Goergia Pacific

Specify Number Towels Per Pack:
Specify Number Packs Per Case

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

10,600

150

3200

1230

cases

cases

cases

cases

Vendor 14

All American Poly
Nikki Klein
40 Turner Place

Piscataway, NJ 08854
PH:732-752-3200

Fax: 732-752-2305
zeke@allampoly.com

Vendor 15

Boritex INC
Jose Ramos

P.0. BOX 171088

Arlington, TX 76003
PH:817-467-1237

FAX: 817-752-0544
Jramos@boritex.com

Vendor 16
Limitless Office Products

Nita Guha
1106 Commerce Dr

Richardson, TX 75081
PH: 214-764-4092

FAX: 214-206-1860
mg@limitlessofficeproducts.com

Vendor 17
Zenith Supplies Inc

Shlomo Steif
750 Chestnut Ridge Rd

Chestnut Ridge, NY 10977
PH:845-533-4123

FAX: 845-738-1012
info@zenithinc.net

No No Yes No
Yes No No No
Other Other Other Other
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
No Bid No Bid $45.58 $483,148.00 $43.36 $459,616.00
4.5x4.5 4.5x4.5
500 500/roll
96 80rolls
BWK6155 APM 280 Green
No Bid No Bid $27.31 $4,096.50 $40.96 $6,144.00
250 250/pack
20 20 packs
BWKK 5000 HG5000
No Bid No Bid $27.35 $87,520.00 $25.98 $83,136.00
350 350
12 12 rolls
GP 26401 GP 26401
No Bid No Bid $23.95 $29,458.50 $27.90 $34,317.00
250 250
4000 16
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4.

S}

Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash
Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Estimated
Description Annual
Quantity
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Multifold Paper Towels 7500 cases
Brand: Georgia Pacific (Fort James) 23304
Specify Number Towels per Pack
Specify Number Packs Per Case
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Plastic Trash Bags/Liners 40x48 size 5400 cases

Specify Number Bags/Liners per Roll
Specify Number Bags/Liners per Case

Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchasing Order

TOTAL

Other Cost Associated with Bid/ Alternate Prices

Vendor 14

All American Poly
Nikki Klein
40 Turner Place

Piscataway, NJ 08854
PH:732-752-3200

Fax: 732-752-2305
zeke@allampoly.com

Boritex INC
Jose Ramos

P.0. BOX 171088

Vendor 15

Arlington, TX 76003

PH:817-467-1237

FAX: 817-752-0544
Jramos@boritex.com

Vendor 16
Limitless Office Products

Nita Guha
1106 Commerce Dr

Richardson, TX 75081
PH: 214-764-4092

FAX: 214-206-1860
mg@limitlessofficeproducts.com

Vendor 17
Zenith Supplies Inc

Shlomo Steif
750 Chestnut Ridge Rd

Chestnut Ridge, NY 10977
PH:845-533-4123

FAX: 845-738-1012
info@zenithinc.net

No No Yes No
Yes No No No
Other Other Other Other
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
GP 23504 23504
No Bid No Bid $22.29 $167,175.00 $26.99 $202,425.00
250 250
4000 16
GP23304 GP 23304
$31.37 $169,398.00 $24.76 $133,704.00 35.08 $189,432.00 No Bid
250 bags per case 25 25/roll
250 bags per case 250 250
All American Poly
40484 AEP HD4048AN Bwk404617
5-20 days 7-14 days 285 cases min. order  |7-10 days 40x46 17micro
$169,398.00 $133,704.00 $960,830.00 $785,638.00
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Tabulation Sheet

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sanitary Paper, Trash

Bags,and related Items

Bid # 2015-004-6456

Bid Opening: October 30, 2014

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)

EEO-1

Dallas County Taxpayer?

Description

Anything Subcontracted out

Do you have Product in stock

Cooperative Purchasing
Prompt or Early payment discount
Does Company provide Health Insurance

Does Company Share in cost 90%/65%
Does provide coverage 75%/50%
Is it Comparable to Dallas County

Does Subcontractors Provide Insurance

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

Vendor 14

All American Poly
Nikki Klein
40 Turner Place

Piscataway, NJ 08854
PH:732-752-3200

Fax: 732-752-2305
zeke@allampoly.com

Vendor 15

Boritex INC
Jose Ramos

P.0. BOX 171088

Arlington, TX 76003
PH:817-467-1237

FAX: 817-752-0544
Jramos@boritex.com

Vendor 16
Limitless Office Products

Nita Guha
1106 Commerce Dr

Richardson, TX 75081
PH: 214-764-4092

FAX: 214-206-1860
mg@limitlessofficeproducts.com

Vendor 17
Zenith Supplies Inc

Shlomo Steif
750 Chestnut Ridge Rd

Chestnut Ridge, NY 10977
PH:845-533-4123

FAX: 845-738-1012
info@zenithinc.net

No No Yes No
Yes No No No
Other Other Other Other
Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT Cost EXT
Not indicated
None None N/A
Manfacteurs Not indicated No Yes
yes
Yes Yes Yes
19610 Net 30 0/30% 0%30
No Yes No No
Not indicated No/No N/A N/A
- Yes
Not indicated N/A N/A
Not indicated Yes N/A N/A
No Sub N/A N/A N/A
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