DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies
2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900

469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

SECTION I: County Buidlings with Fire Alarms

1. Adminstration Building
411 Elm Street

Dallas, Texas 72502

As per Bid specifications

2. Adult Probation - Cockrell Hill
4909 So. Cockrell Hill Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75236

3. Crowley Courts Bldg.
133 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

4. Crowley Parking Garage "C"
188 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

5. Crowley Parking Garage "D"
199 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

6. Dallas County Fire/Rescue
1937 South Beltline Rd.
Dallas, Texas

7. Decker Detention Center
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

8. Duncanville Tax Office
100 East Wheatland
Duncanville, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
DC
Web-Site

1,275.00 $

200.00 $

4,389.00 $

200.00 $

200.00 $

200.00 $

5,700.00 $

200.00 $

1,275.00

200.00

4,389.00

200.00

200.00

200.00

5,700.00

200.00

No
Other
Web-Site

2,820.00 2,820.00
376.00 376.00
9,588.00 9,588.00
376.00 376.00
376.00 376.00
376.00 376.00
7,896.00 7,896.00
376.00 376.00

Yes

Letter from DC

1,043.00 $

395.00 $

3,013.00 $

395.00 $

395.00 $

395.00 $

8,800.00 $

395.00 $

1,043.00

395.00

3,013.00

395.00

395.00

395.00

8,800.00

395.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies
2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900

469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

9. East Dallas Government Center
3443 St. Francis St.
Dallas, Texas

10. Forensic Sciences Complex
5230 Medical Center Drive
New Bldg. 2355 N. Stemmons Frwy. Dallas

11. French Settlement - Cook Chill Facility
2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas

12. French Settlement - Non Secure Area
2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas

13. Garland Government Center
140 N. Garland Rd.
Garland, Texas

14. George Allen Courts Building
600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

15. Government Center Jail
600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas

16. Health and Human Services
2377 Stemmons Frwy
Dallas, Texas

17. H.H.S. Clinic
2774 Valwood Pkwy.
Farmers Branch, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
1

Yes
DC
Web-Site

200.00 $

42500 $

540.00 $

200.00 $

1,650.00 $

6,369.00 $

3,120.00 $

1,160.00 $

200.00 $

200.00

425.00

540.00

200.00

1,650.00

6,369.00

3,120.00

1,160.00

200.00

No
Other
Web-Site
564.00 564.00
564.00 564.00
1,504.00 1,504.00
564.00 564.00
2,256.00 2,256.00
11,656.00 11,656.00
3,948.00 3,948.00
2,068.00 2,068.00
376.00 376.00

Yes

Letter from DC

506.00 $

605.00 $

983.00 $

395.00 $

1,043.00 $

4,402.00 $

1,594.00 $

1,003.00 $

395.00 $

506.00

605.00

983.00

395.00

1,043.00

4,402.00

1,594.00

1,003.00

395.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies

2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900
469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

18. Henry Wade Juvenile Center
2600 Lone Star
Dallas, Texas

19. Household Hazoardous Waste
11234 Plano Rd.
Dallas, Texas

20. Irving Tax Office
530 North O'Conner
Irving, Texas

21.JJ.AE.P.
1673 Terre Colony Ct.
Dallas, Texas

22. Judical Treatment Center - System # 1
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

23. Judical Treatment Center - System # 2
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

24. Juvenile Probation - Investment Bldg.
414 South R.L. Thorton Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

25. Lancaster Sub-Courts
107 Texas St.
Lancaster, Texas

26. Letot Juvenile Shelter Center
10505 Harry Hines
Dallas, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
1

Yes
DC
Web-Site

6,480.00

200.00

200.00

200.00

780.00

1,110.00

270.00

200.00

300.00

6,480.00

200.00

200.00

200.00

780.00

1,110.00

270.00

200.00

300.00

No
Other
Web-Site

7,708.00 $ 7,708.00

376.00 $ 376.00
376.00 $ 376.00
940.00 $ 940.00

1,128.00 $ 1,128.00

1,316.00 $ 1,316.00

752.00 $ 752.00
376.00 $ 376.00
940.00 $ 940.00

Yes

Letter from DC

4,868.00 $

395.00 $

395.00 $

395.00 $

1,348.00 $

1,984.00 $

522.00 $

395.00 $

663.00 $

4,868.00

395.00

395.00

395.00

1,348.00

1,984.00

522.00

395.00

663.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies

2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900
469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

27. Medlock Juvenile Detention
1500 Blk. Of Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas

28. Mesquite Tax Office
823 N. Galloway
Mesquite, Texas 75149

29. North Dallas Government Center
10056 Marsh Lane
Dallas, Texas

30. Oak Cliff Sub-Courthouse
410 S. Beckly
Dallas, Texas

31. Old Red Court House
100 S. Houston
Dallas, Texas

32. Plaza Parking Garage \
606 Elm St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

33. Records Building
509 Main St.

Dallas, Texas 75202

34. Richardson Tax Office
516 Twilight
Richardson , Texas

35. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "A" (West Tower)

111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
1

Yes
DC
Web-Site

1,069.00 $

200.00 $

640.00 $

250.00 $

1,210.00 $

200.00 $

1,359.00 $

200.00 $

1,530.00 $

1,069.00

200.00

640.00

250.00

1,210.00

200.00

1,359.00

200.00

1,530.00

No
Other
Web-Site

3,008.00 $ 3,008.00
376.00 $ 376.00
940.00 $ 940.00
376.00 $ 376.00

2,632.00 $ 2,632.00
376.00 $ 376.00

1,880.00 $ 1,880.00
376.00 $ 376.00

3,008.00 $ 3,008.00

Yes

Letter from DC

971.00 $

395.00 $

1,171.00 $

605.00 $

1,067.00 $

395.00 $

2,211.00 $

395.00 $

1,223.00 $

971.00

395.00

1,171.00

605.00

1,067.00

395.00

2,211.00

395.00

1,223.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies

2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900
469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

36. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "B" (Intake/Release) 1
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas
37. Sterrett Jail - North Tower 1
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas
38. South Dallas Government Center - Prect. #1 1
7201 South Polf
Dallas, Texas
39. Voter Warehouse 1
1500 E. Langdon Rd.
Hutchins, Texas
40. Wayback House Restitution Center 1
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.
Dallas, Texas
41. Youth Village Complex 1
1508 East Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas
TOTAL SECTION I:
SECTION Il Parts and Materials:
1. Case of Canned Smoke for Testing: Cases 2
2. Smoke Dectector Plastic Covers for Dust Protection Ea 50
3. Pull Station Covers Ea 20

Yes
DC
Web-Site

8,340.00 $

21,150.00 $

480.00 $

200.00 $

700.00 $

429.00 $

127.00 $

8,340.00

21,150.00

480.00

200.00

700.00

429.00

73,925.00

2,540.00

No
Other
Web-Site
13,912.00 $ 13,912.00
61,100.00 $ 61,100.00
752.00 $ 752.00
$ 376.00 $ 376.00
940.00 $ 940.00
752.00 $ 752.00
$ 150,400.00
96.00 $ 192.00
1.00 $ 50.00
105.00 $ 2,100.00

Yes

Letter from DC

4,045.00 $

17,313.00 §$

470.00 $

$ 395.00 $

1,114.00 $

804.00 $

1200 $
N/A $

120.00 $

4,045.00

17,313.00

470.00

395.00

1,114.00

804.00

68,253.00

24.00

2,400.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies

2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110
Carrollton, Texas 75006

Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900
469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

4. Panel Type Batteries

TOTAL SECTION II:

These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Additional Repair parts and/or Materials

Pull Station Covers:
Manual Pull Stations
lon Detectors

Photo Detectors

Duct Detectors

These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Testing and Inspection Hourly Rate:

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 A.M. - 6:00 P.M.)

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Ea 20

TOTAL SECTION | and II:

Yes
DC
Web-Site

21.00 §$

$

$

67.00
55.00
75.00
75.00

120.00

65.00

65.00

420.00

2,960.00

76,885.00

No
Other
Web-Site

1750 $ 350.00

$ 2,692.00

$ 153,092.00

105.00
72.00
38.50
48.50

155.75

75.00

92.00

Yes

Letter from DC

2500 $

$

$

No Bid

30.00
100.00
100.00

100.00

130.00

95.00

500.00

2,924.00

71,177.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

BID NO: 2009-038-4220
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

API Systems Group
2609 National Circle
Garland, Texas 75041
Brian Brown

214-291-1200
214-291-1340 - Fax

Convergint Technologies

2855 Trinity Square - Suite # 110

Carrollton, Texas 75006
Mike Ridgley

469-568-7900
469-568-7901 - Fax

mike.ridgley@convergient.com

DSS Fire

10265 Miller Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75238
Bobby Churchman

214-553-6120
214-553-6130 - Fax

bchurchman@dssfire.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 P.M. - 6:00 A.M.)

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Saturday, Sunday and Holiday's)

Cost of Materials: Supplier Cost Plus:

Trip Charge Fee:

Yes
DC
Web-Site

65.00

97.50

25% Markup

2 Hour Min
Service Call

No
Other
Web-Site

138.00

184.00

20% Markup

40.00

Yes

Letter from DC

142.50

70% Markup

2 Hour Min Service Call




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

SECTION I: County Buidlings with Fire Alarms

1. Adminstration Building 1
411 Elm Street

Dallas, Texas 72502

As per Bid specifications

2. Adult Probation - Cockrell Hill 1
4909 So. Cockrell Hill Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75236

3. Crowley Courts Bldg. 1
133 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

4. Crowley Parking Garage "C" 1
188 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

5. Crowley Parking Garage "D" 1
199 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

6. Dallas County Fire/Rescue 1
1937 South Beltline Rd.
Dallas, Texas

7. Decker Detention Center 1
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

1,03542 §$ 1,035.42
280.00 $ 280.00
7,413.00 $ 7,413.00
280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00
4,565.75 $ 4,565.75

No
Other
Other

650.00 $

250.00 $

1,300.00 $

260.00 $

250.00 $

250.00 $

650.00

250.00

1,300.00

260.00

250.00

250.00

No
No
web-site

5795.90 $

671.56 $

20408.51 $

710.06 $

710.66 $

599.36 $

1937349 $

5,795.90

671.56

20,408.51

710.06

710.66

599.36

19,373.49




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Dallas, Texas
8. Duncanville Tax Office 1
100 East Wheatland
Duncanville, Texas
9. East Dallas Government Center 1
3443 St. Francis St.
Dallas, Texas
10. Forensic Sciences Complex 1
5230 Medical Center Drive
New Bldg. 2355 N. Stemmons Frwy. Dallas
11. French Settlement - Cook Chill Facility 1
2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas
12. French Settlement - Non Secure Area 1
2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas
13. Garland Government Center 1
140 N. Garland Rd.
Garland, Texas
14. George Allen Courts Building 1

600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00
487.67 $ 487.67
280.00 $ 280.00

1,26525 §$ 1,265.25

10,402.00 $10,402.00

No

Other

Other

250.00 $

250.00 $

350.00 $

350.00 $

225.00 $

475.00 $

3,500.00 $

250.00

250.00

350.00

350.00

225.00

475.00

3,500.00

No

No

web-site

62342 $

1031.97 $

1297.27 $

364392 $

594.20 $

6262.03 $

34040.78 $

623.42

1,031.97

1,297.27

3,643.92

594.20

6,262.03

34,040.78




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

15. Government Center Jail
600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas

16. Health and Human Services
2377 Stemmons Frwy
Dallas, Texas

17. H.H.S. Clinic
2774 Valwood Pkwy.
Farmers Branch, Texas

18. Henry Wade Juvenile Center
2600 Lone Star
Dallas, Texas

19. Household Hazoardous Waste
11234 Plano Rd.
Dallas, Texas

20. Irving Tax Office
530 North O'Conner
Irving, Texas

21.JJ.AE.P.
1673 Terre Colony Ct.
Dallas, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

2,157.87 $ 2,157.87

669.43 $ 669.43

280.00 $ 280.00

9,314.67 $ 9,314.67

280.00 $ 280.00

280.00 $ 280.00

280.00 $ 280.00

No
Other
Other

2,500.00 $

500.00 $

250.00 $

3,500.00 $

250.00 $

250.00 $

275.00 $

2,500.00

500.00

250.00

3,500.00

250.00

250.00

275.00

No
No
web-site

8083.88 $

5158.72 $

527.16 $

26021.08 $

671.56 $

599.36 $

2364.48 $

8,083.88

5,158.72

527.16

26,021.08

671.56

599.36

2,364.48




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

22. Judical Treatment Center - System # 1
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

23. Judical Treatment Center - System # 2
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

24. Juvenile Probation - Investment Bldg.
414 South R.L. Thorton Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

25. Lancaster Sub-Courts
107 Texas St.
Lancaster, Texas

26. Letot Juvenile Shelter Center
10505 Harry Hines
Dallas, Texas

27. Medlock Juvenile Detention
1500 Blk. Of Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas

28. Mesquite Tax Office
823 N. Galloway
Mesquite, Texas 75149

29. North Dallas Government Center

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

1

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

587.77 $ 587.77
830.67 $ 830.67
280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00
280.00 $ 280.00

1,26525 §$ 1,265.25

280.00 $ 280.00

54553 § 545.53

No
Other
Other

400.00 $

450.00 $

400.00 $

250.00 $

400.00 $

650.00 $

250.00 $

300.00 $

400.00

450.00

400.00

250.00

400.00

650.00

250.00

300.00

No
No
web-site

2813.14 $

3366.66 $

1941.04 $

695.62 $

1689.49 $

6378.64 $

671.56 $

2558.16 $

2,813.14

3,366.66

1,941.04

695.62

1,689.49

6,378.64

671.56

2,558.16




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

10056 Marsh Lane
Dallas, Texas

30. Oak Cliff Sub-Courthouse
410 S. Beckly
Dallas, Texas

31. Old Red Court House
100 S. Houston
Dallas, Texas

32. Plaza Parking Garage \
606 Elm St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

33. Records Building
509 Main St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

34. Richardson Tax Office
516 Twilight
Richardson , Texas

35. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "A" (West Tower)
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

36. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "B" (Intake/Release)
111 W. Commerce

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

280.00 $ 280.00

1,982.40 $ 1,982.40

280.00 $ 280.00

1,963.50 $ 1,963.50

280.00 $ 280.00

1,087.92 §$ 1,087.92

7,732.67 $ 7,732.67

No
Other
Other

250.00 $

700.00 $

450.00 $

800.00 $

300.00 $

2,500.00 $

6,750.00 $

250.00

700.00

450.00

800.00

300.00

2,500.00

6,750.00

No
No
web-site

1056.61 $

5137.52 $

1008.48 $

5199.40 $

695.62 $

37113.57 $

29354.07 $

1,056.61

5,137.52

1,008.48

5,199.40

695.62

37,113.57

29,354.07




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

Dallas, Texas

37. Sterrett Jail - North Tower
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

38. South Dallas Government Center - Prect. #1
7201 South Polf
Dallas, Texas

39. Voter Warehouse
1500 E. Langdon Rd.
Hutchins, Texas

40. Wayback House Restitution Center
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.

Dallas, Texas

41. Youth Village Complex

1508 East Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas

TOTAL SECTION I:

SECTION Il Parts and Materials:

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

33,064.03 $33,064.03

35268 $ 35268

$ 280.00 $ 280.00
455.00 $ 455.00

310.33 $ 310.33

$92,053.39

No
Other
Other
15,000.00 $ 15,000.00
350.00 $ 350.00
$ 300.00 $ 300.00
300.00 $ 300.00
300.00 $ 300.00
$ 46,335.00

No

No

web-site

1314549 $

2428.37 $

81595 $

225476 $

1850.79 $

$

13,145.49

2,428.37

815.95

2,254.76

1,850.79

259,364.31




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

1. Case of Canned Smoke for Testing: Cases 2
2. Smoke Dectector Plastic Covers for Dust Protectior Ea 50
3. Pull Station Covers Ea 20
4. Panel Type Batteries Ea 20

TOTAL SECTION II:

TOTAL SECTION | and II:

These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Additional Repair parts and/or Materials

Pull Station Covers:
Manual Pull Stations
lon Detectors

Photo Detectors

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

10748 $ 214.96

2.00 $ 100.00

4485 $ 897.00

18.00 $ 360.00
$ 1,571.96
$93,625.35

44.85

66.30

55.90

56.55

No
Other
Other
90.00 $
60.00 $
50.00 $
25.00 $
$
$
25% Above Cost
25% Above Cost
25% Above Cost

25% Above Cost

180.00
3,000.00
1,000.00

500.00

4,680.00

51,015.00

No
No
web-site
132.00 $ 264.00
50.00 $ 2,500.00
70.00 $ 1,400.00
24.00 $ 480.00
$ 4,644.00
$ 264,008.31
See List
See List
See List
See List




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Great Southwestern Fire and Safety
310 N. Commerce

Dallas, Texas 75208

Guy Brown

214-653-1100

214-653-1374 - Fax

guybrown@greatswfire.com

PAC Systems

751 109 ST.

Arlington, Texas 76011
Bruce Hatchell
817-640-2223
817-640-2223 - Fax

bruceh@pac-systems.com

Risktec Solutions, Inc.

1110 NASA Pkwy. Suite # 203
Houston, Texas 77058

Kris Smith

281-333-5080

281-333-5089 - Fax

greg.moore@risktec.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Duct Detectors

These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Testing and Inspection Hourly Rate:

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 A.M. - 6:00 P.M.)

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 P.M. - 6:00 A.M.)

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Saturday, Sunday and Holiday's)

Cost of Materials: Supplier Cost Plus:

Trip Charge Fee:

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

154.38

70.00

80.00

120.00

120.00

30% Markup

35.00

No
Other
Other

25% Above Cost

90.00

90.00

90.00

90.00

25% Markup

2 Hour Minium No Trip Charge

No

No

web-site

See List

144.90

77.00
90.00
90.00

No Markup

No Trip Charge




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION

SECTION I: County Buidlings with Fire Alarms

1. Adminstration Building
411 Elm Street

Dallas, Texas 72502

As per Bid specifications

2. Adult Probation - Cockrell Hill
4909 So. Cockrell Hill Rd.
Dallas, Texas 75236

3. Crowley Courts Bldg.
133 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

4. Crowley Parking Garage "C"
188 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

5. Crowley Parking Garage "D"
199 N. Industrail Blvd.
Dallas, Texas 75207

6. Dallas County Fire/Rescue
1937 South Beltline Rd.

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

1,903.00 $

268.00 $

11,013.00

310.00 $

310.00 $

150.00 $

1,903.00

268.00

11,013.00

310.00

310.00

150.00

798.00 $

300.00 $

3,073.00 $

300.00 $

300.00 $

300.00 $

798.00

300.00

3,073.00

300.00

300.00

300.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Dallas, Texas
7. Decker Detention Center 1
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.
Dallas, Texas
8. Duncanville Tax Office 1
100 East Wheatland
Duncanville, Texas
9. East Dallas Government Center 1
3443 St. Francis St.
Dallas, Texas
10. Forensic Sciences Complex 1
5230 Medical Center Drive
New Bldg. 2355 N. Stemmons Frwy. Dallas
11. French Settlement - Cook Chill Facility 1
2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas
12. French Settlement - Non Secure Area 1

2121 French Settlement
Dallas, Texas

8,705.00 $

234.00 $

385.00 $

451.00 $

1,044.00 $

230.00 $

8,705.00

234.00

385.00

451.00

1,044.00

230.00

5,260.00 $

300.00 $

300.00 $

300.00 $

540.00 $

300.00 $

5,260.00

300.00

300.00

300.00

540.00

300.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

13. Garland Government Center 1
140 N. Garland Rd.
Garland, Texas
14. George Allen Courts Building 1
600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas 75202
15. Government Center Jail 1
600 Commerce St.
Dallas, Texas
16. Health and Human Services 1
2377 Stemmons Frwy
Dallas, Texas
17. H.H.S. Clinic 1
2774 Valwood Pkwy.
Farmers Branch, Texas
18. Henry Wade Juvenile Center 1

2600 Lone Star
Dallas, Texas

826.00 $

8,136.00

522.00 $

1,434.00 $

222.00 $

7,834.00 $

826.00

8,136.00

522.00

1,434.00

222.00

7,834.00

1,155.00 $

4,683.00 $

3,120.00 $

812.00 $

300.00 $

6,480.00 $

1,155.00

4,683.00

3,120.00

812.00

300.00

6,480.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS
OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

19. Household Hazoardous W aste
11234 Plano Rd.
Dallas, Texas

20. Irving Tax Office
530 North O'Conner
Irving, Texas

21. JJ.AE.P.
1673 Terre Colony Ct.
Dallas, Texas

22. Judical Treatment Center - System # 1
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

23. Judical Treatment Center - System # 2
200 Green Rd.
Wilmer, Texas

24. Juvenile Probation - Investment Bldg.
414 South R.L. Thorton Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

25. Lancaster Sub-Courts

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

1

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

247.00

254.00

540.00

998.00

1,298.00

330.00

271.00

$

247.00

254.00

540.00

998.00

1,298.00

330.00

271.00

No
Other
Other

300.00 $

300.00 $

300.00 $

616.00 $

889.00 $

455.00 $

300.00 $

300.00

300.00

300.00

616.00

889.00

455.00

300.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION

107 Texas St.
Lancaster, Texas

26. Letot Juvenile Shelter Center
10505 Harry Hines
Dallas, Texas

27. Medlock Juvenile Detention
1500 BIk. Of Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas

28. Mesquite Tax Office
823 N. Galloway
Mesquite, Texas 75149

29. North Dallas Government Center
10056 Marsh Lane
Dallas, Texas

30. Oak Cliff Sub-Courthouse
410 S. Beckly
Dallas, Texas

31. Old Red Court House
100 S. Houston

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

626.00 $

2,225.00

268.00 $

866.00 $

421.00 $

1,824.00

626.00

2,225.00

268.00

866.00

421.00

1,824.00

300.00 $

1,470.00 $

300.00 $

448.00 $

300.00 $

847.00 $

300.00

1,470.00

300.00

448.00

300.00

847.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.
3033 Kellway, Ste. 122

Carrollton, Texas 75006

Doug Berry

972-416-8377

972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION

Dallas, Texas

32. Plaza Parking Garage \
606 EIm St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

33. Records Building
509 Main St.
Dallas, Texas 75202

34. Richardson Tax Office
516 Twilight
Richardson , Texas

35. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "A" (West Tower)
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

36. Sterrett Jail - Bldg "B" (Intake/Release)
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

37. Sterrett Jail - North Tower
111 W. Commerce
Dallas, Texas

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

366.00 $

1,5693.00

271.00 $

2,030.00 $

9,344.00 $

95,029.00

366.00

1,5693.00

271.00

2,030.00

9,344.00

95,029.00

300.00 $ 300.00

952.00 $ 952.00

300.00 $ 300.00

1,530.00 $ 1,530.00

8,340.00 $ 8,340.00

28,560.00 $ 28,560.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD:

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.
3033 Kellway, Ste. 122

Carrollton, Texas 75006

Doug Berry

972-416-8377

972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

38. South Dallas Government Center - Prect. #1 1
7201 South Polf
Dallas, Texas

39. Voter Warehouse 1
1500 E. Langdon Rd.

Hutchins, Texas

40. Wayback House Restitution Center 1
899 N. Stemmons Frwy.

Dallas, Texas

41. Youth Village Complex 1

1508 East Langdon Rd.
Dallas County, Texas

TOTAL SECTION I:

SECTION Il Parts and Materials:

1. Case of Canned Smoke for Testing: Cases 2

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

718.00 $ 718.00

300.00 $ 300.00
792.00 $

792.00

604.00 $ 604.00

$ 165,192.00

160.00 $ 320.00

No
Other
Other

336.00 $ 336.00

300.00 $ 300.00
427.00 $

427.00

315.00 $ 315.00

$ 76,306.00

120.00 $ 240.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE

ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.

3033 Kellway, Ste. 122
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Doug Berry
972-416-8377
972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:
M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

2. Smoke Dectector Plastic Covers for Dust Protection Ea 50 TBD 5.00 $ 250.00
3. Pull Station Covers Ea 20 100.00 $ 2,000.00 100.00 $ 2,000.00
4. Panel Type Batteries Ea 20 14.00 $ 280.00 25.00 $ 500.00
TOTAL SECTION II: $ 2,600.00 $ 2,990.00
TOTAL SECTION I and li: $ 167,792.00 $ 79,796.00
These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Additional Repair parts and/or Materials
Pull Station Covers: No Bid No Bid
Manual Pull Stations No Bid No Bid
lon Detectors No Bid No Bid
Photo Detectors No Bid No Bid




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #7

VENDOR #38

BID NO: 2009-038-4220

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INPECTIONS AND/OR SERVICE OF FIRE
ALARM SYSTEMS

OPENING DATE: MARCH 2, 2009

Simplex Grinnell LP
1125 E. Collins Blvd.
Richardson, Texas 75081
JH Patterson
972-587-5200
972-437-7901 - Fax

Texas Fire Protection Specialist, Inc.
3033 Kellway, Ste. 122

Carrollton, Texas 75006

Doug Berry

972-416-8377

972-416-8379 - Fax

DougBerry@tfpsinc.com

CONTRACT PERIOD:

M/WBE STATUS Yes No
TAXPAYER STATUS Yes Other
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from DC Other

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Duct Detectors

These Items are not included in the Final Bid Tab
Testing and Inspection Hourly Rate:

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 A.M. - 6:00 P.M.)

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Monday - Friday / 6:00 P.M. - 6:00 A.M.)

Repairs Hourly Rate Per Tech:
(Saturday, Sunday and Holiday's)

Cost of Materials: Supplier Cost Plus:

Trip Charge Fee:

No Bid

100.00

108.00

162.00

216.00

38% Markup

No Charge

No Bid

85.00

85.00

127.50

170.00

50% Markup

2 Hour Minium




