DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3

BID NO. 2010-032-4935 FISHER SCIENTIFIC LLC REMEL, INC.

Greg Swdenski, Senior Quoter Erin Evans, Contract Manager
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF COMMERCIALLY 4500 A Turnberry Drive 12076 Santa Fe Trail Drive
PREPARED MEDIA AND REAGENTS Hanover Park, IL 60133 Lenexa, 66215

800-766-7000 800-255-6730
BUYER: GLORIA TORRES Fax: 800-926-1166 Fax: 800-447-5750

www.fishersci.com remel@remel.com
OPENING DATE: MARCH 8, 2010 www.remel.com
CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD
M/WBE STATUS Not submitted
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department

DESCRIPTION EST QTY

01130 BHI AGAR 2 PACKS 24.19 48.38 9.68 19.36 0.00 0.00
01200 10/PACK BLOOD AGAR 96 PACKS 3.60 345.60 3.60 345.60 0.00 0.00]
01202 100/CS BLOOD AGAR (TSA w/5% SB) 800 PLATES 3438 275.04 36.00 288.00, 0.00 0.00
01245 BURKHOLDERIA CEPACIA SELECTIVE AGAR 2 PACKS 60.42 120.84 13.45 26.90 0.00 0.00]
01242 BORDET GENGOU AGAR WITH METHICILLIN 10 PACKS 68.14 681.40 0.00 NLA| 0.00 0.00]
01258 BRUCELLA AGAR 2 PACKS 54.27 108.54] 24.79 49.58 0.00 0.00
01274 CAMPYLOBACTER SELECTIVE MEDIUM 10 PACKS 36.57 365.70 24.12 241.20 0.00 0.00]
01300 10/PK CHOCOLATE AGAR 12 PACKS 3.60 43.20 3.60 43.20 0.00 0.00
01302 100/CASE CHOCOLATE AGAR 36 CASES 36.00 3,600.00 36.00 1,296.00 0.00 0.00]
01342 BUFFERED CYE AGAR 10 PACKS 53.90 539.00, 53.90 539.00, 0.00 0.00
01346 CYSTEINE HEART AGAR 12 PACKS 33.52 402.24 33.52 402.24 0.00 0.00
01400 EMB LEVINE AGAR 5 PACKS 27.38 136.90 27.38 136.90 0.00 0.00]
01481 15/PK HEKTOEN ENTERIC (HE) AGAR 1245 PLATES 7.50 622.50 7.50 622.50 0.00 0.00]
01525 LPM AGAR 4 PACKS 53.90 215.60 53.90 215.60 0.00 0.00
01551 15/PK MACCONKEY AGAR 1245 PACKS 5.40 448.20 5.40 448.20 0.00 0.00]
01556 MACCONKEY AGAR WITH SORBITOL 4 PACKS 31.19 124.76 31.19 124.76 0.00 0.00]
01583 MANNITOL SALT AGAR W/4 MCG OX 20 PACKS 53.90 1,078.00 53.90 1,078.00 0.00 0.00]
01584 MANNITOL EGG YOLK POLYMYXIN AGAR 2 PACKS 44.45 88.90] 44.45 88.90 0.00 0.00]
01613 OXFORD AGAR MODIFIED 4 PACKS 44.45 177.80 44.45 177.80 0.00 0.00]
01620 MUELLAR HINTON AGAR 4 PACKS 31.19 124.76 31.19 124.76 0.00 0.00]
01626 10/PK M.HINTON W/4% NACL & 6MCG OX 120 PACKS 37.62 451.44 37.62 451.44 0.00 0.00]
01881 15/PK THAYER MARTIN MODIFIED 12 PACKS 6.69 80.28 6.69 80.28 0.00 0.00]
01884 10/PK THAYER MARTIN IMPROVED 12 PACKS 4.99 59.88 4.99 59.88 0.00 0.00]
01885 15/PK THAYER MARTIN IMPROVED 255 PLATES 32.67 490.05 13.44 201.60 0.00 0.00]
01886 100/CS THAYER MARTIN IMPROVED 60 CASES 49.90 2,994.00 49.90 2,994.00 0.00 0.00]
01980 XLD AGAR 4 PACKS 31.19 124.76 31.19 124.76 0.00 0.00
01998 YERSENIA SELECTIVE AGAR 2 PACKS 34.18 68.36 12.85 25.70 0.00 0.00]
060192 ARYLSULFATASE BROTH 2 PACKS 148.94 297.88 29.04 58.08 0.00 0.00]
060232 BHI AGAR SLANTS 2 PACKS 77.21 154.42 16.96 33.92 0.00 0.00
060272 BHI BROTH 2 PACKS 80.95 161.90] 16.72 33.44] 0.00 0.00
060312 20/PK BLOOD AGAR SLANT 8 PACKS 25.66 205.28 25.66 205.28 0.00 0.00]
060322 BRUCELLA BROTH 2 PACKS 90.65 181.30] 44.72 89.44 0.00 0.00
060482 CHOCOLATE AGAR SLANTS 1 PACK] 106.15 106.15 22.68 22.68 0.00 0.00
060752 DECARBOXYLASE BROTH BASE CONTROL 4 PACKS 76.50 306.00 76.50 306.00 0.00 0.00]
060756 DECARBOXYLASE BROTH ARGININE 4 PACKS 76.50 306.00 76.50 306.00 0.00 0.00]
060760 DECARBOXYLASE BROTH LYSINE 4 PACKS 95.59 382.36 no bid 0.00] 0.00 0.00]
061012 HEART INFUSION AGAR SLANTS 4 PACKS 76.50 306.00 76.50 306.00 0.00 0.00]
061300 100/CS LYSINE IRON AGAR SLANT 400 TUBES| 496.45 1,985.80 82.50 330.00 0.00 0.00]
061302 20/PK LYSINE IRON AGAR SLANT 1 EACH] 21.62 21.62 21.62 21.62 0.00 0.00]
061470 100/CS MUELLER HINTON BROTH, 1 ml. 2 CASES 280.40 560.80 280.40 560.80 0.00 0.00]
061480 MUELLER HINTON BROTH 2 PACKS 88.20 176.40 42.80 85.60) 0.00
061532 NITRATE BROTH, 5 ML 4 PACKS 76.50 306.00 76.50 306.00 0.00 0.00]
061536 NITRATE BROTH, 7 ML, DT 3 PACKS 91.94 275.82 91.94 275.82 0.00 0.00]
061903 OF KING MEDIUM BASE CONTROL 4 PACKS 114.78 459.12 114.78 459.12 0.00 0.00]
061951 OF KING MEDIUM WITH MALTOSE 4 PACKS, 114.78 459.12 114.78 459.12 0.00 0.00
061991 OF KING MEDIUM WITH SUCROSE 4 PACKS 114.78 459.12 114.78 459.12 0.00 0.00]
064500 100/CS SELENITE BROTH 9 ml 1100  TUBES 199.47 2,194.17 90.30 993.30 0.00 0.00
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064502 20/PK SELENITE BROTH 9 ml 60 TUBES| 4434 133.02 44.34 133.02 0.00 0.00]
064622 STUART TRANSPORT MEDIUM 10 PACKS 91.58 915.80 22.96 229.60 0.00 0.00]
064850 100/CS TRIPLE SUGAR IRON (TSI) 400 TUBES| 492.85 1,971.40 83.10 332.40 0.00 0.00]
064852 20/PK TRIPLE SUGAR IRON (TSI) 1 EACH] 21.62 21.62 21.62 21.62 0.00 0.00]
065212 20/PK UREA AGAR (CHRISTENSENS) 2 PACKS 27.56 55.12 27.56 55.12 0.00 0.00]
07092 BUFFERED CYE AGAR 2 PACKS 145.22 290.44 60.36 120.72 0.00 0.00]
07096 100/CS DIAMOND'S MEDIA 4 CASES 349.75 1,399.00 292.00 1,168.00 0.00 0.00]
07162 TETRATHIONATE BROTH 2 PACKS 96.52 193.04 96.52 193.04 0.00 0.00]
08500 100/CS LOWENSTEIN JENSEN SLANT 36 CASES 101.80 3,664.80 101.80 3,664.80 0.00 0.00]
110241 CT-SORBITOL MACCONKEY 3 PACKS 53.90 161.70, 53.90 161.70 0.00 0.00]
110300 OXFORD AGAR 4 PACKS 53.90 215.60 53.90 215.60 0.00 0.00]
110322 PLET AGAR 2 PACKS 45.90 91.80 13.88 27.76 0.00 0.00]
114350 IODINE FOR TETRATHIONATE (TT) 1 BOTTL| 50.58 50.58 50.58 50.58 0.00 0.00]
12011 10/PK TRANSGROW W/CO2 12 PACKS 47.03 564.36 47.03 564.36 0.00 0.00]
12500 CS/72 M43 TRANSPORT 3 ML 3 CASES 105.80 317.40 no bid 0.00] 0.00 0.00]
12520 CS/72 M4-2, GLASS DRAM, 2 ML 3 CASES 168.06 504.18 no bid 0.00] 0.00 0.00]
20410 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 0.5 1 EACH] 18.76 18.76 18.76 18.76 0.00 0.00]
20411 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 1.0 1 EACH] 29.80 29.80] 23.29 23.29 0.00 0.00]
20412 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 2.0 1 EACH] 29.79 29.79 23.28 23.28 0.00 0.00]
20413 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 3.0 1 EACH] 29.52 29.52 23.06 23.06 0.00 0.00]
20414 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 4.0 1 EACH] 30.01 30.01 23.44 23.44) 0.00 0.00]
20415 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD 5.0 1 EACH] 29.98 29.98 23.41 23.41 0.00 0.00]
20421 MCFARLAND TURBIDITY STANDARD SET 1 SET] 113.93 113.93 127.75 127.75 0.00 0.00]
21135 MUG DISK 2 VIAL| 47.80 95.60 47.80 95.60 0.00 0.00]
21237 MINERAL OIL, 50 ML 4 BOTTL| 22.71 90.84 22.71 90.84 0.00 0.00]
21239 NITRATE A 2 PACKS 15.55 31.10 15.55 31.10] 0.00 0.00]
21242 NITRATE B 2 PACKS 15.55 31.10 15.55 31.10] 0.00 0.00]
21518 INDIA INK REAGENT 1 PACK 59.85 59.85 59.85 59.85 0.00 0.00]
21540 OIDASE, BACTIDROP SPOT TEST 2 PACKS 59.85 119.70, 59.85 119.70 0.00 0.00]
21550 INDOLE, BACTIDROP, KOVAC'S SPOT TEST 2 PACKS 72.66 14532 72.66 145.32 0.00 0.00]
24250 RIM E.COLI 0157:H7 LATEX 1 BOX] 112.81 112.81 112.81 112.81 0.00 0.00]
261605 BETA LACTAMASE DISK FOR F.TULARENSIS 2 VIAL| 29.06 58.12 29.06 58.12 0.00 0.00]
33880 GENTAMYCIN DISKS, 10 MCG 2 PACKS 43.64 87.28 27.58 55.16 0.00 0.00]
38145 MICRO ID SYSTEM 2 EACH] 78.58 157.16 66.23 132.46 0.00 0.00]
40052 GRAM CRYSTAL VIOLET 250 ml 5 EACH] 19.73 98.65 11.41 57.05 0.00 0.00]
40053 5/PK GRAM CRYSTAL VIOLET 250 ml 6 PACKS 41.48 248.88 41.48 248.88 0.00 0.00]
40056 GRAM IODINE 250 ml BOTTLE 5 EACH] 21.17 105.85 10.42 52.10] 0.00 0.00]
40057 5/PK GRAM IODINE 250 ml 6 PACKS 37.90 227.40 37.90 227.40 0.00 0.00]
40058 GRAM SAFRANIN 250 ml BOTTLE 5 EACH] 24.00 120.00, 2234 111.70 0.00 0.00]
40059 5/PK GRAM SAFRANIN 250 ml 6 PACKS 42.59 255.54 42.59 255.54 0.00 0.00]
40073 GRAM CRYSTAL VIOLET GALLON 8 GAL 82.47 659.76 82.47 659.76 0.00 0.00]
40077 GRAM IODINE GALLON 8 GAL 93.89 751.12 93.89 751.12 0.00 0.00]
40079 GRAM SAFRANIN GALLON 8 GAL 82.47 659.76 82.47 659.76 0.00 0.00]
40190 5/PK TB AURAMINE-RHODAMINE T 30 PACKS 187.95 1,127.70 187.95 5,638.50 0.00 0.00]
40192 5/PK TB POTASSIUM-PERMANGANATE 15 PACKS 89.16 267.48 89.16 1,337.40 0.00 0.00]
40207 5/PK TB DECOLORIZER 30 PACKS 51.74 1.552.20 51.74 1,552.20 0.00 0.00]
40225 ENHANCED GRAM CRYSTAL VIOLET, 250 ML 1 PACK 58.44 58.44 58.44 58.44] 0.00 0.00]
40228 ENHANCED GRAM DECOLORIZER, 250 ML 1 PACK 50.66 50.66 50.66 50.66 0.00 0.00]
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40234 ENHANCED GRAM IODINE, 250 ML 1 PACK] 152.11 152.11 53.75 53.75 0.00 0.00|
40237 ENHANCED GRAM SAFRANIN, 250 ml 1 PACK] 59.93 59.93 59.93 59.93 0.00 0.00|
450411 GCMI ENRICHMENT 2 PACKS 88.97 177.94 88.97 177.94 0.00 0.00|
45050 YERSINIA SELECTIVE AGAR 2 PACKS 39.14 78.28 28.81 57.62 0.00 0.00|
451201 YEAST EXTRACT, FOR TSA MEDIUM 1 E 45.28 45.28 no bid 0.00 0.00 0.00
452402 BISMUTH SULFITE FOR SALMONELLA 1 BOTTL| 95.99 95.99 95.99 95.99 0.00 0.00|
452472 BHI BROTH 1 BOTTL| 75.93 75.93 75.93 75.93 0.00 0.00|
452672 BUFFERED PEPTONE WATER 500 GRAMS 60.15 60.15 50.17 50.17 0.00 0.00|
453322 EC BROTH 1 BOTTL| 62.53 62.53 62.53 62.53 0.00 0.00|
453522 HEART INFUSION AGAR, 500 GMS 1 EACH 72.98 72.98 74.95 74.95 0.00 0.00|
453652 LACTOSE BROTH 1 BOTTLE 53.04 53.04 53.04 53.04 0.00 0.00|
454182 NUTRIENT AGAR, 500 GMS 1 EACH 123.94 123.94 71.27 71.27 0.00 0.00|
456091 RAPPAPORT VASSILIADIS BROTH 1 BOTTLE 43.41 43.41 28.20 28.20 0.00 0.00|
456092 RAPPAPORT VASSILIADIS R10 BROTH 500 GRAMS 102.06 102.06 60.07 60.07 0.00 0.00|
663141 LISTERIA SELECTIVE ENRICHMENT SUPPL. 1 PACK 61.02 61.02 45.43 45.43 0.00 0.00|
668972 BUFFERED LISTERIA ENRICHMENT BROTH BASE 1 BOTTLE 72.16 72.16 53.69 53.69 0.00 0.00|
681001 PACK-ANAERO 2 PACKS 54.01 108.02 54.01 108.02 0.00 0.00|
681007 PACK-CO2 2 PACKS 54.01 108.02 54.01 108.02 0.00 0.00|
683001 ANAEROBIC INDICATOR 2 PACKS 29.26 58.52 14.24 28.48 0.00 0.00|
GRAND TOTAL 42,736.67 36,576.41

Specify price discount (%) for items not specifically listed 10% pricing only valid for one year No consistent discount offered
Specifications require a warehouse located within D/FW metro area
Provide the location for the warehouse Remel, KS 900 Alpha Drive, #420, Richardson 75081

Have product in stock? Will be required to obtain upon award

Specity any additional comments
Do you accept PO's via email?
Accept Cooperative Purchasing?

Have product in stock

Yes @
Yes

Have product in stock

Yes @ remel@remel.com
No




