TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris
DESCRIPTION:

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE)
How were you notified ?

Section 1: Written Translation Services, as per
the requirements set forth in this solicitation
rannact

A. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-See languages listed below (or vice
versa). Cost per word

Spanish (Mexico, U.S.)

Other Languages

French (Canadian French):

French (Western Europe):

Russian

German

Polish

Cantonese-Chinese

Mardarin-Chinese

Japanese

Vietnamese

Croatian

Hungarian

Ukrainian

Armenian

Other Languages average cost

Total

B. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-Latin America and Caribbean (or vice
versa).

Latin American and Caribbean languages to
include Portuguese (Brazilian), French (French
Creole), Spanish (Latin and South America)

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Latin America and Caribbean language (or vice
versa)

C. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-Near East (or vice versa).

Near East languages to include Arabic (Egyptian,
Palestinian), Dari, Farsi (Iranian), Hebrew, Hindi,
Parshto, Punjabi, Turkish and Urdu.

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Near East Language (or vice versa)

D. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Western Europe (or vice versa).

West Europe languages to include Danish, Dutch,
English, Finnish, Flemish, Greek, Italian,
Norwegian, Portuguese (Continental, Azorean),
Spanish (Castilian), and Swedish.

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Western Europe Language (or vice versa)

E. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Africa (or vice versa).

Africa languages to include Afrukaans, Amharic,
Arabic, French, Ibo, Portugues, Spanish Swahili,
and Yoruba

quantity of
words

213750

19000

VENDOR #1

Tizoc's International Language
and Marketing Consultants
2730 N. Stemmons Freeway

Suiite # 200 - West Tower
Dallas, Texas 75207

Acela G. Garrett
214 634-8400
214-393-6971 fax
acela@tizoc.com

Yes
No
Letter from DC

price per word

$0.13

$0.15

$0.15

972
972

No
Yes

extension

$27,787.50

$2,850.00

$30,637.50

VENDOR #2

Access Language Center
1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 261
Richardson, Texas 75080

Greda D. Stendell

808-0100
808-0108 fax

translator@accesslc.net

email from DC

price per word

$0.16

$0.16

$0.16

817
817

No
Yes

extension

$29,925.00

$3,040.00

$32,965.00
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VENDOR #3

Teno Linguistics Company, LLC

3901 W. Vickery Blvd., Suite 8
Ft. Worth, Texas 76107

Hana Laurenzo
-441-9974
-735-9328 fax
hana@tlctranslation.com

Dallas County website

price per word

$0.15

$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16
$0.16

$0.16

$0.17

$0.18

extension

$32,062.50

$3,040.00

$35,102.50

VENDOR #4

MasterWord Services, Inc.
303 Stafford, Suite 204
Houston, Texas 77079

Leticia Sifuentes
281-589-0810

281-589-110 fax
masterword@masterword.com

No
No
Prime Vendor

price per word

$0.16

$0.18
$0.18
$0.18
$0.18
$0.19
$0.24
$0.24
$0.26
$0.22
$0.20
$0.24
$0.20
$0.25
$0.21

$0.16

$0.25

0.18/ per word if Italian,
Portuguese, Greek , Spanish

.025 per word  if Danish, Dutch,
Norwegian, Swedish

if $50.00 per hour British English

extension

$34,200.00

$4,033.85

$38,233.85

VENDOR #5

Cetra Language Solutions
7804 Montgomery Ave., Suite B
Elkins Park, PA 19027

Matt Richmon
215-635-7090
215-635-6610 fax

matt@cetra.com

No
No
Find RFP

price per word

$0.21

$0.25
$0.25
$0.25
$0.25
$0.25
$0.27
$0.27
$0.27
$0.27
$0.25
$0.25
$0.25
$0.30
$0.26

$0.21

$0.27

$0.25

extension

$44,887.50

$4,940.00

$49,827.50




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Africa Language (or vice versa)

F. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Asia (or vice versa).

Asia languages to include Bahasa Indoesia,
Bahasa Malay, Burmese, Cambodian, Hindi,
Hmong, Indonesian, Khmer, Korean, Laotian,
Malay, Mongolian, Nepali, Tagalog, and Thai

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Asia Language (or vice versa)

G. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Central Europe (or vice versa).

Central Europe languages to include Albanishm
Bulgarian, Bosnian, Czech, Estonian, Latvian,
Lithuanian, Macedonian, Romanian, Serbian, and
Slovak

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Central Europe Language (or vice versa)

H. Emergency Written Translation Services

Specify additional fee or surcharge (if applicable)
to rates stated above for each language for
emergency written translation services: (per word)

Specify minimum service fee/charge for
emergency written translation (if applicable): flat
rate

Section 2: Sign Language for Deaf and Hearing
as per the requi set forth in
thie enliritatinn rennact
Fees proposed for these services must be all
inclusive, incorporating travel time to and from
Dallas County departments and courts, parking,
toll fees, mileage and all other cost associated
with providing these services

A. General Sign Language for the Deaf and
Hearing i ical & i

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed during normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding Dallas
County holidays:

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed after normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am), weekends,
and Dallas County holidays:

Specify minimum service fee/charge for American

Sign Language Services: flat rate

B. Legal (level 3 or higher) Sign Language for
the Deaf and Hearing Impaired

VENDOR #1

Tizoc's International Language
and Marketing Consultants
2730 N. Stemmons Freeway

Suiite # 200 - West Tower
Dallas, Texas 75207

Acela G. Garrett
214 634-8400
214-393-6971 fax

$0.15

$0.15

$0.15

0.01 /per word

$25.00 minimum Spanish to English
$35.00 minimum charge Other to English

quantity of
hours

NO BID THIS SECTION

75

VENDOR #2

Access Language Center
1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 261
Richardson, Texas 75080

Greda D. Stendell
972 808-0100
972 808-0108 fax

translator@accesslc.net

$0.16

$0.16

$0.16

$0.16 / per word

$64.00 flat rate

NO BID THIS SECTION

VENDOR #3

Teno Linguistics Company, LLC
3901 W. Vickery Blvd., Suite 8
Ft. Worth, Texas 76107

Hana Laurenzo
817-441-9974
817-735-9328 fax
hana@tlctranslation.com

$0.18

$0.17

$0.17

0.03 per word

n/a

NO BID THIS SECTION
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VENDOR #4

MasterWord Services, Inc.
303 Stafford, Suite 204
Houston, Texas 77079

Leticia Sifuentes
281-589-0810

281-589-110 fax
masterword@masterword.com

.18 / per word if French,
Portugues

.16 if Spanish, Latin American
.18 Spanish Castillian

.25 Arabic

.26 Afrikanns, Amharic, Ibo,
Swahhili, and Yoruba

$0.25

$0.20

50% per word rate request

minimum charge $75.00 per
European $100.00 per Asian,
Indian, African & Arabic Additional
50% is add to emergency

NO BID THIS SECTION

VENDOR #5

Cetra Language Solutions
7804 Montgomery Ave., Suite B
Elkins Park, PA 19027

Matt Richmon
215-635-7090
215-635-6610 fax
matt@cetra.com

$0.30

$0.30

$0.25

add 50% surcharge per word

$150 per assignment

$60.00

per hour

$72.00
per hour

120.00
flat rate

$4,500.00




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed during normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding Dallas
County holidays:

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed after normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am), weekends,
and Dallas County holidays:

Specify minimum service fee/charge for American
Sign Language Services: flat rate

Specify the number of Level 3 or higher ASL
interpreter you have on staff:

C. Real-time Captioning Services for the Deaf and
Hearing Impaired

Specify hourly rate forReal-time Captioning
Services performed during normal business hours
(Monday through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding
Dallas County holidays:

Specify hourly rate for Real-time Captioning
Services performed after normal business hours
(Monday through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am),
weekends, and Dallas County holidays:

Specify minimum service fee/charge for Real-time
Captioning Services: flat rate
Total

Specify in detail your business or firm
cancellation policy and procedures and any
charges related to cancellation (if applicable):

Specify the name and telephone number
of the account representative who will be
handling this account:

Specify the name, telephone, and pager number
of the person or persons to contact for emergency
and after hour's service request:

Does your firm or business accept procurement
card (credit card) for payment ?

VENDOR #1

Tizoc's International Language
and Marketing Consultants
2730 N. Stemmons Freeway

Suiite # 200 - West Tower
Dallas, Texas 75207

Acela G. Garrett
214 634-8400
214-393-6971 fax

Modification or cancellation of any
pending service request shall be made
with as much advance notice as possible.
The translation process begins as soon
as the order is confirmed. In the event a
translation is cancelled, the minimum
charge will apply or the total word count
already translated will be assessed.

Acela Garrett
214-634-8400

Acela Garrett call or SMS text
214-642-4816 email acela@tizoc.com
Ruth Perez - SMS text 214-557-9439 or
email info@tizoc.com

Yes

VENDOR #2

Access Language Center
1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 261
Richardson, Texas 75080

Greda D. Stendell
972 808-0100
972 808-0108 fax

translator@accesslc.net

Given the nature of written
translations, an assignment may be
cancelled at no cost at any time of
no actual translation work has
begun. If any translation work has
begun, then the higher of either the
minimum charge or the contracted
rate per word for the language at
hand will be charged for all work
completed before the cancellation
request was received. To cancel an
assignment Access Language Center
must be notified either by fax at (972
8008-0108) or by email to
translator@accesslc.net during
normal business hours (8am to 5
pm Central time) on normal
workdays (non-holiday, weekends).
Then cancellation notification should
consist of the attacked form,
properly filled out and fax or email to
Access Language Center as per the
above paragraph. The form itself is
not mandatory if the requisite
information id included in the fax or
email.

George Stendell
972-808-0100

George Stendell 972 808-0100

VENDOR #3

Teno Linguistics Company, LLC
3901 W. Vickery Blvd., Suite 8
Ft. Worth, Texas 76107

Hana Laurenzo
817-441-9974
817-735-9328 fax
hana@tlctranslation.com

If a translation order is cancelled
while it is already being
processed, the client is
responsible for payment for work
already completed.

Hana Laurenzo
817-441-9974
800-385-1571

Staff on duty 1-800-385-1571

30f8

VENDOR #4

MasterWord Services, Inc.
303 Stafford, Suite 204
Houston, Texas 77079

Leticia Sifuentes
281-589-0810

281-589-110 fax
masterword@masterword.com

Should the County of Dallas
Cancel a project prior to starting
the translation, there will be no
charge. Should the County of
Dallas cancel any project in the
middle of completion translation
the County will be charged per the
number of words already
translated.

Leticia Sifuentes 281-589-0810
Olga Daggs 281-589-0810

Leticia Sifuentes 281-589-0810
Olga Daggs 281-589-0810

VENDOR #5

Cetra Language Solutions
7804 Montgomery Ave., Suite B
Elkins Park, PA 19027

Matt Richmon
215-635-7090
215-635-6610 fax
matt@cetra.com

108.00
per hour

$122.00 / hour

$216.00 flat rate

3 (freelance- IV and V)

$108.00 / hour

$122.00 / hour

$216.00 flat rate

Request cancelled with less than
2 full business days of the
scheduled appointment are fully
accountable for the contracted
time. In cases where the clients
do not sow up for the
appointment the requestor is still
responsible for the full amount.
Assignments running over the
contracted time will be billed in
1/2 hour increments. The above
rates apply to requests made
with at least 3 working days
notice. An additional 20% is
incurred for request made one
day or 2 days(24-48 hours). same
day notices will be billed at
double the rates quotes above.
All legal assignments and any
over one hour length require (2)
interpreter. Fees for all the
services above must include
travel cost as part of the time
contracted (portal-to-portal).

Matt Richman
215-635-7090

CETRA on-call staff 215-635-7090

$1,188.00

$5,688.00




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris

Does your firm or business offer some type of
rebate (cash or credit) for utilizing procurement
card as a form of payment ?

Is a copy of your cancellation policy and
procedures enclosed with this bid?

Is a copy of your ordering or service request form
enclosed with this bid?

Specify any additional comments /etc.. Included
with your bid proposal (if applicable):

Payment Terms:

VENDOR #1

Tizoc's International Language
and Marketing Consultants
2730 N. Stemmons Freeway

Suiite # 200 - West Tower
Dallas, Texas 75207

Acela G. Garrett
214 634-8400
214-393-6971 fax

No

All fees quoted are for translation of
documents to and from various
languages. For transcription of bilingual
audio material, an additional charge of
0.03 cents per word will be assessed.
Minimum charge is changed to rush
orders an late cancellation only. We are a
local company with a long business
history in Dallas Co. and are the leading
experts in the translation of "street lingo”
much used in testimony letters and other
kinds of documents. We have a native
speaker from Mexico, Central and South
America that will proofread and edit a
document for accuracy in this kind of
terminology.

Net 30 days

VENDOR #2

Access Language Center
1221 W. Campbell Rd., Suite 261
Richardson, Texas 75080

Greda D. Stendell
972 808-0100
972 808-0108 fax

translator@accesslc.net

No

Minimum fee (nonemergency) is$39.
Material in electronic format must be
in PC-compatible, MS-Windows Word
format; material submitted or
requested in other formats may
incur extra charges. Delivery is
assumed to be via e-mail or via U.S.
post; if products need to be
delivered via courier (e.g., UPS, Fed
Ex, etc.), the courier charge will be
included in our invoices to the
County. Rates citied above assume
translation from written documents;
if the source is other than written
(e.g., audiotapes, videotapes, etc.),
there will be an additional charge of
$.03 per word. All charges based on
word courts will be based on the
word count of the target language
(i.e., the language into which the
material is translated). Changes to a
translation, requested by the client
and not due to errors or omissions
on this contractor's part, are
charged by the word as delineated
above and minimum fees apply.
Proofreading a translation that was
not prepared by this contractor or
its staff costs $50/hour, with a 1-
hour minimum and then in

Net 30 days

VENDOR #3

Teno Linguistics Company, LLC
3901 W. Vickery Blvd., Suite 8
Ft. Worth, Texas 76107

Hana Laurenzo
817-441-9974
817-735-9328 fax
hana@tlctranslation.com

No

No - electronic submission system
(see bid)

Net 30 days
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VENDOR #4

MasterWord Services, Inc.
303 Stafford, Suite 204
Houston, Texas 77079

Leticia Sifuentes
281-589-0810

281-589-110 fax
masterword@masterword.com

No

Desktop Publishing/Formatting
for Spanish, Portugese, Russian,
Eastern and Western European
languages $50.00 oer hour

For Induian, Arabic, Asian and
African Languages $75.00 per
hour

Incorporastion of changes for
Spanish, Portugese, Russian,
Eastern and Western European
languages $50.00 oer hour

For Induian, Arabic, Asian and
African Languages $75.00 per
hour

Editing as a single activity or
Spanish, Portugese, Russian,
Eastern and Western European
languages $50.00 oer hour

For Induian, Arabic, Asian and
African Languages $75.00 per
hour

Proofreading as a single activity or
Spanish, Portugese, Russian,
Eastern and Western European
languages $50.00 oer hour

For Induian, Arabic, Asian and
African Languages $75.00 per
hour

Net 30 days

VENDOR #5

Cetra Language Solutions
7804 Montgomery Ave., Suite B
Elkins Park, PA 19027

Matt Richmon
215-635-7090
215-635-6610 fax
matt@cetra.com

No

Yes, for ASL interpretation
please see Section 2C

N/A Document translation
services are requested by
contacting Angele Surault
(Direcctor of Translation Services)
at angele@cetra.com or 215-635
7090. ASL interpretation
services are requested by
contacting Tony Guerra ( Director
of Interpretation Services) at
tony(@cetra.com or 214-635-
7090.

NONE




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris
DESCRIPTION:

Dallas County Taxpayer
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE)
How were you notified ?

Section 1: Written Translation Services, as per
the requirements set forth in this solicitation
rannact

A. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-See languages listed below (or vice
versa). Cost per word

Spanish (Mexico, U.S.)

Other Languages

French (Canadian French):

French (Western Europe):

Russian

German

Polish

Cantonese-Chinese

Mardarin-Chinese

Japanese

Vietnamese

Croatian

Hungarian

Ukrainian

Armenian

Other Languages average cost

Total

B. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-Latin America and Caribbean (or vice
versa).

Latin American and Caribbean languages to
include Portuguese (Brazilian), French (French
Creole), Spanish (Latin and South America)

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Latin America and Caribbean language (or vice
versa)

C. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English -to-Near East (or vice versa).

Near East languages to include Arabic (Egyptian,
Palestinian), Dari, Farsi (Iranian), Hebrew, Hindi,
Parshto, Punjabi, Turkish and Urdu.

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Near East Language (or vice versa)

D. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Western Europe (or vice versa).

West Europe languages to include Danish, Dutch,
English, Finnish, Flemish, Greek, Italian,
Norwegian, Portuguese (Continental, Azorean),
Spanish (Castilian), and Swedish.

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Western Europe Language (or vice versa)

E. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Africa (or vice versa).

Africa languages to include Afrukaans, Amharic,
Arabic, French, Ibo, Portugues, Spanish Swahili,
and Yoruba

VENDOR # 6

Deaf Action Center
3115 Crestview Drive
Dallas, Texas 75235

Angela Fisher
214-521-0407
214-521-3658 fax

dir om

Yes
No
Letter from DC

quantity of
words price per word
No Bid on this section
213750
19000

extension

VENDOR # 7

American Language Technologies, Inc.
3941 Legacy Dr., # 204 - PMB 199A
Plano, Texas 75023

Roseann Rossetti
972-517-2700
469-429-0020 fax
roseann@americanlt.com

No
No
Letter from DC

price per word

$0.12

$0.22
$0.22
$0.24
$0.22
$0.24
$0.28
$0.28
$0.30
$0.27
$0.27
$0.27
$0.27
$0.27
$0.26

$0.24

$0.28

$0.24

VENDOR # 8

Languages Translation Services
34726 31st CT SW
Federal Way, WA 98023

Daniel Shamebo Sabore
253-835-0107
775-993-7988 fax

-translation.info

No
No

extension

$25,650.00

$4,896.15

$30,546.15

50f8

Find RFP.com

price per word

$0.15

$0.15

$0.15

extension

$27,787.50

$2,835.38

$30,622.88

VENDOR # 9

Interlingua USA
16300 Addison Rd., Suite 222
Addison, Texas 75001

Rosa Hernandez
972-818-3455
972-818-3742 fax
rosa@interlinguausa.com

Yes
Yes
email from DC

price per word

$0.12

$0.15

$0.15

extension

$25,650.00

$2,850.00

$28,500.00




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

VENDOR # 6

Deaf Action Center
3115 Crestview Drive
Opening Date: April 5, 2010 Dallas, Texas 75235
For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Angela Fisher
214-521-0407
214-521-3658 fax

dir om

Buyer: Debra Morris

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Africa Language (or vice versa)

F. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Asia (or vice versa).

Asia languages to include Bahasa Indoesia,
Bahasa Malay, Burmese, Cambodian, Hindi,
Hmong, Indonesian, Khmer, Korean, Laotian,
Malay, Mongolian, Nepali, Tagalog, and Thai

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Asia Language (or vice versa)

G. Written Translation Services: Source and
Target Languages:

English-to-Central Europe (or vice versa).

Central Europe languages to include Albanishm
Bulgarian, Bosnian, Czech, Estonian, Latvian,
Lithuanian, Macedonian, Romanian, Serbian, and
Slovak

Specify cost per word from English to designated
Central Europe Language (or vice versa)

H. Emergency Written Translation Services

Specify additional fee or surcharge (if applicable)
to rates stated above for each language for
emergency written translation services: (per word)

Specify minimum service fee/charge for
emergency written translation (if applicable): flat
rate

Section 2: Sign Language for Deaf and Hearing
as per the requi set forth in
thie enliritatinn rennact
Fees proposed for these services must be all
inclusive, incorporating travel time to and from
Dallas County departments and courts, parking,
toll fees, mileage and all other cost associated
with providing these services

A. General Sign Language for the Deaf and .
Hearing - ieal & . quantity of
hours

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language

performed during normal business hours (Monday

through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding Dallas

County holidays: 75 $70.00

per hour
Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed after normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am), weekends,
and Dallas County holidays: $110.00
per hour

$150.00 / hour M-F 8am - 5pm
$180.00 / hour M-F 5pm - 8am
$210.00 / hour Weekends
$250.00/ hour Hoildays

Specify minimum service fee/charge for American
Sign Language Services: flat rate

B. Legal (level 3 or higher) Sign Language for
the Deaf and Hearing Impaired

$5,250.00

VENDOR # 7

American Language Technologies, Inc.
3941 Legacy Dr., # 204 - PMB 199A
Plano, Texas 75023

Roseann Rossetti
972-517-2700
469-429-0020 fax
roseann@americanlt.com

VENDOR # 8

Languages Translation Services
34726 31st CT SW
Federal Way, WA 98023

Daniel Shamebo Sabore
253-835-0107
775-993-7988 fax

-translation.info

$0.24

$0.24

$0.24

A 50% rush fee will be applied for
tanslation services in all languages with
less than twenty-four (24 hours)
production/turnaround time.

$160.00
$160.00 for the first hour
$80.00 for each additional hour
Minimum service fee $160.00

$12,000.00

$240.00 for the first hour
$120.00 for each additional hour

Minimum service fee $240.00

60f8

$0.15

$0.16

$0.15

0.16 / per word

$60.00 flat rate

NO BID THIS SECTION

VENDOR # 9

Interlingua USA
16300 Addison Rd., Suite 222
Addison, Texas 75001

Rosa Hernandez
972-818-3455
972-818-3742 fax
rosa@interlinguausa.com

$0.15

$0.15

$0.15

$0.02 per word

$0.02 per word

$110.00
per hour

$120.00 per hour

$220.00 flat rate

$8,250.00




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed during normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding Dallas

County holidays: 11

Specify hourly rate for American Sign Language
performed after normal business hours (Monday
through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am), weekends,
and Dallas County holidays:

Specify minimum service fee/charge for American
Sign Language Services: flat rate

Specify the number of Level 3 or higher ASL
interpreter you have on staff:

C. Real-time Captioning Services for the Deaf and
Hearing Impaired

Specify hourly rate forReal-time Captioning
Services performed during normal business hours
(Monday through Friday, 8am-5pm), excluding
Dallas County holidays:

Specify hourly rate for Real-time Captioning
Services performed after normal business hours
(Monday through Friday, 5:01 pm - 7:59 am),
weekends, and Dallas County holidays:

Specify minimum service fee/charge for Real-time
Captioning Services: flat rate
Total

Specify in detail your business or firm
cancellation policy and procedures and any
charges related to cancellation (if applicable):

Specify the name and telephone number
of the account representative who will be
handling this account:

Specify the name, telephone, and pager number
of the person or persons to contact for emergency
and after hour's service request:

Does your firm or business accept procurement
card (credit card) for payment ?

VENDOR # 6

Deaf Action Center
3115 Crestview Drive
Dallas, Texas 75235

Angela Fisher
214-521-0407
214-521-3658 fax

dir om

$115.00
per hour

$145.00 / hour

$150.00 / hour M-F 8am - 5pm
$180.00 / hour M-F 5pm - 8am
$210.00 / hour Weekends
$250.00/ hour Hoildays

see attachement B

Laura Mortimer

Laura Mortimer

$1,265.00

$6,515.00

VENDOR # 7

American Language Technologies, Inc.
3941 Legacy Dr., # 204 - PMB 199A
Plano, Texas 75023

Roseann Rossetti
972-517-2700
469-429-0020 fax
roseann@americanlt.com

$200.00
$200.00 for the first hour
$100.00 for each additional hour
Minimum service fee $200.00

$300.00 for the first hour

$150.00 for each additional hour

Minimum service fee $300.00

$260.00 for the first hour
$130.00 for each additional hour
Minimum service fee $260.00

$330.00 for the first hour
$165.00 for each additional hour
Minimum service fee $330.00

see attachement 1

Roseann Rossetti
972-517-2700

Roseann Rossetti 972-339-8070

VENDOR # 8

Languages Translation Services
34726 31st CT SW
Federal Way, WA 98023

Daniel Shamebo Sabore

253-835-0107

775-993-7988 fax
) -translation.info

$2,200.00

$14,200.00

If the job is cancelled after we start doing
it we need to get paid for the only part
that is completed. We don't charge for the
entire job.

Daniel Shamebo Sabore or T. Hailegnaw
253-835-0107

Daniel Shamebo Sabore or
T. Hailegnaw
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VENDOR # 9

Interlingua USA
16300 Addison Rd., Suite 222
Addison, Texas 75001

Rosa Hernandez
972-818-3455
972-818-3742 fax
rosa@interlinguausa.com

$120.00

per hour

$130.00 per hour

$240.00 flat rate

$120.00 per hour

$130.00 per hour

$240.00 flat rate

Interlingua USA reserves the
right to charge a 2 hour
minimum in case of cancellation
within 24 hours before
assignment is scheduled to
begin.

Rosa Hernandez
972-818-3455

Rosa Hernandez 972-818-3455

$1,320.00

$9,570.00




TABULATION SHEET

Annual Contract for Written and Sign Language
Translation

2010-039-4981

Opening Date: April 5, 2010

For the Period June 15, 2010 - June 14, 2011

Buyer: Debra Morris

Does your firm or business offer some type of
rebate (cash or credit) for utilizing procurement
card as a form of payment ?

Is a copy of your cancellation policy and
procedures enclosed with this bid?

Is a copy of your ordering or service request form
enclosed with this bid?

Specify any additional comments /etc.. Included
with your bid proposal (if applicable):

Payment Terms:

VENDOR # 6

Deaf Action Center
3115 Crestview Drive
Dallas, Texas 75235

Angela Fisher
214-521-0407
214-521-3658 fax

om

No

Net 30 days

VENDOR # 7

American Language Technologies, Inc.
3941 Legacy Dr., # 204 - PMB 199A
Plano, Texas 75023

Roseann Rossetti
972-517-2700
469-429-0020 fax
roseann@americanlt.com

No

No

minimim charge per tranlation request is
$100.00

Net 30 days

VENDOR # 8

Languages Translation Services
34726 31st CT SW
Federal Way, WA 98023

Daniel Shamebo Sabore

253-835-0107

775-993-7988 fax
) -translation.info

No

N/A

Net 30 days
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VENDOR # 9

Interlingua USA
16300 Addison Rd., Suite 222
Addison, Texas 75001

Rosa Hernandez
972-818-3455
972-818-3742 fax
rosa@interlinguausa.com

No

No

parking and toll fees may apply

Net 30 days




