DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

BID NO: 2010-040-4982

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR
PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES

OPENING DATE: April 5, 2010

for the period of June 1, 2010 thru May 31, 2011

Southpoint Photo Imaging Supplies, Inc.
Sean Souri

9008 Governors Row

Dallas, Texas 75247

972-239-0330

Fax 972-239-2160

Tax ID 75-2739198-5

sean@southpointphoto.com

M/WBE STATUS
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

Section I Print Processing Chemistry
Chemistry: Fuji Replenish

Cartridge CP48-S (2 roll per/box)
Fuji/Hunt #819843 No Substitutions

Chemistry: Super Conditioning
Tablets (4 bottles per box)
Fuji/Hunt #819034 No Substitutions

Total Section I

Section II Paper

Epson Stylus Pro 9600

Epson Premium Luster Photo Paper

# S04 1463  44”x100° No Substitutions

Epson Stylus Pro 7880

Epson Premium Luster Photo Paper

# S04 2081 24”x100° No Substitutions
Specify Minimum order

Epson Stylus Pro 4880

Epson Premium Luster Photo Paper (260)
#S04 2079 16”x100° No Substitutions
Specify Minimum order

Epson Premium SemiMatte Photo Paper
(250) # SO41657

No Substitutions

Specify Minimum order

Fuji Type II 5" x 610" Lustre
Cat# 07103278

Specify Brand/Manufacturer
Specify Minimum order

Fuji Type II 8" x 295

Luster Cat# 07105988
Specify Brand/Manufacturer
Specify Minimum order

Total Section I1

Section III Epson Ink

EST
QTY

20 boxes

5 boxes|

10 rolls

5 rolls

5 rolls

10 rolls

30 rolls

300 rolls

Epson Stylus Pro 9600 Printer Ink Cartridge Ultra Chrome

No Substitutions
T544100 Photo Black

T54420 Cyan

5 each

5 each

Non M/WBE
yes
letter from Dallas County

$82.00 $1,640.00
$28.00 $140.00
$1,780.00

$155.00 $1,550.00
$90.00 $450.00
$68.00 $340.00
$155.00 $1,550.00
$50.84 $1,525.20
$40.00 $12,000.00
$17,415.20

$83.30 $416.50
$83.30 $416.50

B&H Photo-Video
Michael Friedman
420 Ninth Avenue
New York, NY 10001
800-947-8003

Fax 800-858-5517
Tax ID 132768071

Non M/WBE
Other County Taxpayer
letter from Dallas County

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$84.95

$84.95

michelf@bhphotovideo.com

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$424.75

$424.75




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

BID NO: 2010-040-4982

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR
PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES

OPENING DATE: April 5, 2010

for the period of June 1, 2010 thru May 31, 2011

Southpoint Photo Imaging Supplies, Inc.
Sean Souri

9008 Governors Row

Dallas, Texas 75247

972-239-0330

Fax 972-239-2160

Tax ID 75-2739198-5

sean@southpointphoto.com

T544300 Magenta
T544400 Yellow
T544500 Light Cyan
T544600 Light Magenta
T544700 Light Black

Epson Stylus Pro 7880 Printer Ink K3 Cartridge
No Substitutions

T603900 Light Light Black
T603600 Vivid Light Magenta
T60350 Light Cyan

T603700 Light Black
T603100 Photo Black
T603200 Cyan

T603300 Vivid Magenta
T603400 Yellow

Epson Stylus Pro 4880 Printer Ink K3 Cartridge
No Substitutions

T606100 Photo Black
T606200 Cyan
T606300 Vivid Magenta
T606400 Yellow
T606500 Light Cyan
T606600 Vivid Light Magenta
T606700 Light Black
T606900 Light Light Black
Total Section III
Section IV Miscellaneous
Photowipes; 13-1/2" x 17-5/7 x 50/box, Premier

Specify Brand/Manufacture

Cleaning Gas; Falcon Dust Off Plus
Specify Brand/Manufacture

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

5 each

6 boxes|

20 each

$83.30 $416.50
$83.30 $416.50
$83.30 $416.50
$83.30 $416.50
$83.30 $416.50
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85
$74.37 $371.85

$8,865.10
no bid $0.00
no bid $0.00

B&H Photo-Video
Michael Friedman
420 Ninth Avenue
New York, NY 10001
800-947-8003

Fax 800-858-5517
Tax ID 132768071

$84.95

$84.95

$84.95

$84.95

$84.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

$76.95

no bid

no bid

michelf@bhphotovideo.com

$424.75

$424.75

$424.75

$424.75

$424.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$384.75

$9,129.25

$0.00

$0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

BID NO: 2010-040-4982

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR
PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES

OPENING DATE: April 5, 2010

for the period of June 1, 2010 thru May 31, 2011

Southpoint Photo Imaging Supplies, Inc.

Sean Souri

9008 Governors Row
Dallas, Texas 75247
972-239-0330

Fax 972-239-2160
Tax ID 75-2739198-5

sean@southpointphoto.com

Rexton Anti-Static Film Cleaner
16 oz. bottle, Product No. FC-16AP
No Substitutions

Epson Replacement Ink Maintenance Tank
# C12C890071
No Substitutions

Panasonic CR-123A
CR123 Lithium Batteries (4per/pkg)
No Substitutions

Lenmar Pro415 2300mAh: Ni-MH
“AA” Rechargeable Batteries (4per/pkg)
No Substitutions

3M Scotch Positionable Mounting
Adhesive 24” X 50” Scotch # S56824X50
No Substitutions

Photographic Black Tape 3/4" x 60 yds., Scotch #235
Specify Brand/Manufacture
Total Section IV

Section V Mat Board and Gatorboard

Photo Mat Board 11”x14”x100/box,RPS #15402
Specify Brand/Manufacture

Photo Mat Board 16" x 20" x 100/box, RPS #15404
Specify Brand/Manufacture

Photo Mat Board 20" x 24" x 50/box RPS #15405
Specify Brand/Manufacture

Gatorboard 3/16” x 48”x96” Black
No Substitutions

Gatorboard % “ x 48”x96” Black
No Substitutions

Gatorboard 3/16 “ x 48”x96” White
No Substitutions

Gatorboard % “ x 48”x96” White
No Substitutions

Total Section V
COMMENTS

6 bot.

3 each

10 pkg.

10 pkg.

30 rolls

5 rolls

20 boxes

20 boxes

10 boxes

30 sheet

5 sheets

5 sheets

5 sheets

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

B&H Photo-Video
Michael Friedman
420 Ninth Avenue
New York, NY 10001
800-947-8003

Fax 800-858-5517
Tax ID 132768071

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$89.90

$16.50

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

michelf@bhphotovideo.com

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$2,697.00

$82.50

$2,779.50

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00




