TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

1. Heavy Duty Storage Box with Removable Lid, as 30,000 each
per general & technical bid specification requirements

M inimum order per shipment: 10,000 Boxes w/Lids

Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)

1 nside delivery required - Palletized on wooden
pallet

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order
2. Custom Die Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box Only 10,000 each
(No lid), as per general and technical bid specification
requirements
M inimum Order per shipment: 10,000 boxes
Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)
I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden
pallet
Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order

3. Replacement Removable Lids Only for Custom Die 1,000  each
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box, as per general and
technical bid specification requirements
Dallas County minimum order per shipment: 1,000
lids
Bu ndle in quantities of twenty (20) flat
I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden

Sp;cify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:

VENDOR #1
Taylor Packaging
Bernice Williams

8802 LaPorte Rd.
Houston, TX 77012
713-921-7877
713-921-7878 - fax

No
No
Letter from DC

1.22 $36,600.00

Generally in excess of 35%
02BX15129S
2-3 weeks ARO

0.80 $8,000.00

General in excess of 35%
02BX15129B
2-3 weeks ARO

1.40 $1,400.00

General in excess of 35%

VENDOR #2

Accurate Forms & Supplies

Cheryl Salinas

1550 Norwood Dr. #412
Hurst, TX 76054
817-498-4840
817-427-4816 - Fax

No
Yes
Letter from DC

None
Custom Box

7-10 work days*

1.54

None
Custom Box Bottom

7-10 work days*

0.74

None
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$56,700.00

$15,400.00

$740.00

VENDOR #3

Tab Products Co., LLC
605 Fourth Street
Mayville, WI 53050

920-387-3131
920-387-1821 - Fax

No
No
Letter from DC

1.67 $50,100.00

0% NEW

Custom Cut
2 weeks

1.38 $13,800.00

0% NEW
Custom Cut

2 weeks

0.29 $290.00

0%

VENDOR #4
Sturdi Packaging, Inc.

7100 Oakmont Blvd., Ste.

102

Ft. Worth, TX 76132
817-368-7205
817-370-1867 - Fax

No
No
Letter from DC

5.28

0%
Sturdi Cube
7 days

4.44

0%
Sturdi Cube "Box only"
7 days

1.20

0%

$158,400.00

$44,400.00

$1,200.00



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION:

Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order

Grand Total
Please answer the questions listed below:

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included
with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms:

Please answer the questions listed below

Is this an all of non bid?

Is the required record storage box and lid sample
included with your bid proposal?

If no, please state the reason why the sample was not
provided with the bid proposal.

Did your company check Dallas County website for
any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the bid
solicitation?

Specify the name and telephone number of the account
representative who will be handling this account:

Est.

Qty.

VENDOR #1
Taylor Packaging
Bernice Williams

8802 LaPorte Rd.
Houston, TX 77012
713-921-7877
713-921-7878 - fax

02BX15122T
2-3 weeks ARO

Cutting die included in cost of each
item.

No
Yes

Cost for all-in-one items are as
follows: Item#1- $$1.21 ea.
Extended $36,248.71, Qty of 30,000.
Ttem #2 - $0.76 ea. Extended
$7,618.54 - Qty of 10,000 ea. Item
#3 -$0.71 ea. Extended $711.01,
Qty of 1,000 ea.

Yes

Samantha Green (713) 921-7877

$46,000.00

VENDOR #2
Accurate Forms & Supplies
Cheryl Salinas

1550 Norwood Dr. #412
Hurst, TX 76054
817-498-4840
817-427-4816 - Fax

Custom Lid
7-10 work days

*Normal production time on
repeat orders 7-10 work days.
Initial/First order production
time is 10-15 work days.

0% 30 Days

Cheryl Salinas (817) 498-4840
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VENDOR #3
Tab Products Co., LLC
605 Fourth Street

Mayville, WI 53050
920-387-3131
920-387-1821 - Fax

Custom Cut
2 weeks

$64,190.00

Amy Woodwawrd (214) 732-
4172

VENDOR #4

Sturdi Packaging, Inc.
7100 Oakmont Blvd., Ste.
102

Ft. Worth, TX 76132
817-368-7205
817-370-1867 - Fax

Sturdi Cube "Lid only"
7 days

$204,000.00

The Sturdi Cube is the best
quality box available for
these specifications. It is
currently being used by other
Texas counties as the official
permenent record box for
record. It's ability to resist
moisture, be reused and
stackability provide the best
value for the county.

Net 30

No
Yes

Sample is blue, final box will
be white as per specs.

No, check with office.

Craig McAlpine (817) 368-
7205



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION:

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe
what (if any) portion of the bid requirements will be
subconstracted out.

Does your firm/company have the require insurance
coverage stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE
REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these
requirements during the duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to obtained the required
coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of
contract award?

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental
Entities decide to participate in this contract, would
you, the awarded Contractor agree that all terms,
conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?

Information on Provision of Health Insurance
Coverage for Employees

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance
coverage to its employees, does the company share in
the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only
coverage and 50% for family coverage?

¢) Ifyour company provides health insurance
coverage to its employees, is the coverage comparable
to the services provided by Dallas County as described
in the attached summary plan description? (See
Attachment A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in
the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to
their employees that compares to Dallas County’s
health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

Est.

Qty.

VENDOR #1
Taylor Packaging
Bernice Williams

8802 LaPorte Rd.
Houston, TX 77012
713-921-7877
713-921-7878 - fax

Manufacturer Name - Tharco Box
Co.

VENDOR #2
Accurate Forms & Supplies
Cheryl Salinas

1550 Norwood Dr. #412
Hurst, TX 76054
817-498-4840
817-427-4816 - Fax

We are a broker/sole distributor

of this product. 100% of
services performed will be
subcontracted.

Yes

Yes * quantities must be the
same.
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VENDOR #3
Tab Products Co., LLC
605 Fourth Street

Mayville, WI 53050
920-387-3131
920-387-1821 - Fax

None

N/A

VENDOR #4

Sturdi Packaging, Inc.
7100 Oakmont Blvd., Ste.
102

Ft. Worth, TX 76132
817-368-7205
817-370-1867 - Fax



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010
EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

1. Heavy Duty Storage Box with Removable Lid, as 30,000 each
per general & technical bid specification requirements

M inimum order per shipment: 10,000 Boxes w/Lids

Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)

1 nside delivery required - Palletized on wooden
pallet

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order
2. Custom Die Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box Only 10,000 each
(No lid), as per general and technical bid specification
requirements
M inimum Order per shipment: 10,000 boxes
Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)
I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden
pallet
Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order

3. Replacement Removable Lids Only for Custom Die 1,000  each
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box, as per general and
technical bid specification requirements
Dallas County minimum order per shipment: 1,000
lids
Bu ndle in quantities of twenty (20) flat
I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden

Sp;cify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the
product being bid:

VENDOR #5
Election Works, Inc.

Sandra S. Hed
3N840 Trotter Lane
St. Charles, IL 60175

630-377-1973
630-377-9268

Yes
No
Letter from DC

1.86 $55,800.00

56%
N/A - Custom Box Lid

4-5 weeks ARO

1.57 $15,700.00

56%
N/A - Custom Box

4-5 weeks ARO

0.79 $790.00

56%

VENDOR #6
Mission City Container, Inc.

Joe Wesch
1810 South Laredo
San Antonio, TX 78207

210-225-8732
210-226-6968 - Fax

N/A
No
Vendor

1.35

90%
MCC Stock #200153

1 to 2 weeks

0.94

90%
MCC Stock #200153

1 to 2 weeks

0.41

90%
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$40,500.00

$9,400.00

$410.00

VENDOR #7

National Bankers Supply,
Inc.

Marguerite Kell

P. O. Box 810087

Dallas, TX 75381-0087
972-418-7500
972-418-5600 - Fax

Yes
Yes
Letter from DC

1.5034 $45,102.00

Average of 20%

DC 15-12-91316T

10 Business Days
1.137 $11,370.00
Average of 20% NEW

DC 15-12-91316 BX
7-10 Business Days

0.5965 $596.50

Average of 20%

VENDOR #8
Oak CIiff Office Products

Ken Caldwell

1876 Lone Star Dr.
Dallas, TX 75212
214-943-7421
214-943-7560 - Fax

No
No
Letter from DC

1.99

65% recycled, 59% post
cons.

Fellows - FEL-7150001
7-10 days

No Bid

No Bid

$59,700.00

No Bid

No Bid



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010
EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION: Est.

Qty.

Specify Brand/Product Number:
Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase
Order

Grand Total
Please answer the questions listed below:

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included
with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms:

Please answer the questions listed below

Is this an all of non bid?

Is the required record storage box and lid sample
included with your bid proposal?

If no, please state the reason why the sample was not
provided with the bid proposal.

Did your company check Dallas County website for
any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the bid
solicitation?

Specify the name and telephone number of the account
representative who will be handling this account:

VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6

Election Works, Inc. Mission City Container, Inc.
Sandra S. Hed Joe Wesch

3N840 Trotter Lane 1810 South Laredo

St. Charles, IL 60175 San Antonio, TX 78207

630-377-1973
630-377-9268

210-225-8732
210-226-6968 - Fax

N/A - Custom Lid
4-5 weeks ARO

MCC Stock #200153
1 to 2 weeks

$72,290.00

1) Pricing includes bundling (string
tying, or plastic banding) each item is
sets of twenty, then wrapping with
stretch film & palletizing (does not
include "boxing" of the bundles). 2)
Orders must be in increments of
10,000. 3) Pricing guaranteed for 30
days. Any increase in pricing will
only reflect increase in material cost
after the 30 days. Long term pricing
cannot be guaranteed based on
unstable market.

Net 30 100% 30 Days

Sandy Hed or Gay Hed (630) 377-
1973

Joe Wesch (210) 225-8732
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$50,310.00

VENDOR #7

National Bankers Supply,
Inc.

Marguerite Kell

P. O. Box 810087

Dallas, TX 75381-0087
972-418-7500
972-418-5600 - Fax

DC 15-12-91316LD
7-10 Business Days

$57,068.50

No additional delivery fees
to be incurred.

N/A

Marguerite Kell (972) 418-
7500 - mkell@nbsinc-tx.com
- Kelley May (972) 418-
7500 - kmay(@ nbsinc-tx.com

VENDOR #8
Oak CIiff Office Products

Ken Caldwell

1876 Lone Star Dr.
Dallas, TX 75212
214-943-7421
214-943-7560 - Fax

This box is sold as complete
units only.

Ken Caldwell - Office (214)
943-7421 - Cell (972) 978-
0764

$59,700.00



TABULATION SHEET

BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010
EFFECTIVE: JUNE 29, 2010 - JUNE 28, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION:

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe
what (if any) portion of the bid requirements will be
subconstracted out.

Does your firm/company have the require insurance
coverage stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE
REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these
requirements during the duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to obtained the required
coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of
contract award?

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental
Entities decide to participate in this contract, would
you, the awarded Contractor agree that all terms,
conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?

Information on Provision of Health Insurance
Coverage for Employees

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance
coverage to its employees, does the company share in
the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only
coverage and 50% for family coverage?

¢) Ifyour company provides health insurance
coverage to its employees, is the coverage comparable
to the services provided by Dallas County as described
in the attached summary plan description? (See
Attachment A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in
the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to
their employees that compares to Dallas County’s
health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

VENDOR #5
Election Works, Inc.

Sandra S. Hed
3N840 Trotter Lane
St. Charles, IL 60175
630-377-1973
630-377-9268

Est.
Qty.

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

VENDOR #6
Mission City Container, Inc.

Joe Wesch

1810 South Laredo
San Antonio, TX 78207
210-225-8732
210-226-6968 - Fax

Yes

No, no family coverage by
employer for employees.
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VENDOR #7

National Bankers Supply,
Inc.

Marguerite Kell

P. O. Box 810087

Dallas, TX 75381-0087
972-418-7500
972-418-5600 - Fax

National Bankers Supply,
Inc. is a distributor. Our
boxes, such as coin boxes,
are manufactured by a
company with whom we
have a 30 year business
relationship.

*Our supplier carries this
insurance. They deliver the
boxes.

VENDOR #8
Oak CIiff Office Products

Ken Caldwell

1876 Lone Star Dr.
Dallas, TX 75212
214-943-7421
214-943-7560 - Fax

None



TABULATION SHEET
BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 28, 2010 - JUNE 29, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable

Lids

DESCRIPTION:

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Wbe)
Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

1. Heavy Duty Storage Box with Removable Lid, as
per general & technical bid specification requirements

M inimum order per shipment: 10,000 Boxes w/Lids

Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)

1 nside delivery required - Palletized on wooden

pallet

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the

product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:

Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase

Order

2. Custom Die Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box Only
(No lid), as per general and technical bid specification

requirements

M inimum Order per shipment: 10,000 boxes

Bu ndled in quantities of twenty (20 flat)

I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden

pallet

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the

product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:

Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase

Order

Est.
Qty.

30,000

10,000

3. Replacement Removable Lids Only for Custom Die 1,000

Cut Heavy Duty Storage Box, as per general and

technical bid specification requirements

Dallas County minimum order per shipment: 1,000

lids
Bu ndle in quantities of twenty (20) flat

I nside Delivery Required — Palletized on wooden

Specify the post consumer recycle fiber content of the

product being bid:
Specify Brand/Product Number:

each

each

each

VENDOR #9

Berndt Business Forms, Inc.

Walter L. berndt

P. O. Box 13787
Arlington, TX 76094
817-261-3183
817-274-6342 - Fax

No
No
Letter from DC

1.155

12-100%

200 CF White
15 Business Days

0.989

12-100%

200 CF White
15 Business Days

0.595

12-100%

200 Cf White

VENDOR #10

Comade, Inc.

Tomas Gonzalez

17915 Sky Park Circle, Ste. B
Irvine, CA 92614
949-474-0160

949-474-0161

N/A
No
Dallas County Website

$34,650.00 1.246 $37,380.00

Georgia Pacific
30 Days

$9,890.00 0.97 $9,700.00

Georgia Pacific
30 Days

$595.00 0.49 $490.00

Georgia Pacific
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VENDOR #11

Limitless Office Products
Mita Guha

5100 W. El Dorado Pkwy.
#102 - 903

McKinney, TX 75070
214-764-4092
214-206-1860 - Fax

Yes
No
Dallas County Wesbite

2.85

59%
UNV 95225

7-10 Business Days

No Bid

No Bid

$85,500.00

No Bid

No Bid

VENDOR #12
Your Box Lady
Marion Grayson
P.0O.Box 11
Belton, TX 76513
254-718-7878
254-939-0468 - Fax

No
Texas ESBD

2.00 $60,000.00

Note: 7500 = Truck Load

25% Minimum
Custom Made
7-10 Business Days after

initial order

1.65 $16,500.00

25% Minimum
Custom Made
7-10 Business Days after

initial order

0.60 $600.00

25% Minimum

Custom Made



TABULATION SHEET
BID NO. 2010-050-5034

Opening Date: May 10, 2010
EFFECTIVE: JUNE 28, 2010 - JUNE 29, 2011

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION:

Specify Delivery Timeframe After Receipt of Purchase

Order
Grand Total
Please answer the questions listed below:

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included
with your bid proposal, if applicable:

Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms:

Please answer the questions listed below

Is this an all of non bid?

Is the required record storage box and lid sample
included with your bid proposal?

If no, please state the reason why the sample was not
provided with the bid proposal.

Did your company check Dallas County website for
any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the bid
solicitation?

Specify the name and telephone number of the account

representative who will be handling this account:

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe
what (if any) portion of the bid requirements will be
subconstracted out.

VENDOR #9

Berndt Business Forms, Inc.

Walter L. berndt

P. O. Box 13787
Arlington, TX 76094
817-261-3183
817-274-6342 - Fax

15 Days

0% 30

1.000

$45,135.00

VENDOR #10

Comade, Inc.

Tomas Gonzalez

17915 Sky Park Circle, Ste. B
Irvine, CA 92614
949-474-0160

949-474-0161

30 Days

I have included a cost for tooling

and setup charges, in the price.

0.05% 10 Days

No
No

This product has to be produced,
therefore it isn't cost efficient to
pay for a setup fee for a single
piece of product. I can and will
produce a sample if this
Procurement Office wants to
have a sample for testing or
ECT.

Yes

Tomas Gonzalez - Project

These boxes will be produced at
one of the biggest box
manufacture in the State's. They
will be housed at our location
and distributed to your locations
on as needed basis.
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VENDOR #11

Limitless Office Products
Mita Guha

5100 W. El Dorado Pkwy.
#102 - 903

McKinney, TX 75070
214-764-4092
214-206-1860 - Fax

$85,500.00

Bundled in 12's and not 20's
flat.

No
No

We will provide the sample
as soon as we are requested
to, if our bid is under
consideration for award.

Mita Guha

None - we are a women
owned, Hub and NCTRCA
certified company.

VENDOR #12
Your Box Lady
Marion Grayson
P.0O.Box 11
Belton, TX 76513
254-718-7878
254-939-0468 - Fax

7-10 Business days after
initial order

Cutting die required for
custom box $1,299.00.
Cutting die required for
custom lid $1,054.00, Dies
will become the property of
Dallas County.

1% 10 Days

Marion Grayson, owner
(254) 718-7878

100%. Your Box Lady is a
packaging broker, and the
boxes will be manufactured
by Englander Container in
Waco, TX.

$77,100.00



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #9
Berndt Business Forms, Inc.

P. O. Box 13787

BID NO. 2010-050-5034 Walter L. berndt
Opening Date: May 10, 2010 Arlington, TX 76094
EFFECTIVE: JUNE 28, 2010 - JUNE 29, 2011 817-261-3183

817-274-6342 - Fax

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Custom Die
Cut Heavy Duty Storage Boxes with Removable
Lids

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.

Does your firm/company have the require insurance Yes
coverage stated under SECTION 3 - INSURANCE

REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these

requirements during the duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to obtained the required

coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of

contract award?

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Yes
Entities decide to participate in this contract, would

you, the awarded Contractor agree that all terms,

conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to

that entity?

Information on Provision of Health Insurance

Coverage for Employees

a) Does your company provide health insurance Yes
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance No
coverage to its employees, does the company share in

the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only

coverage and 50% for family coverage?

¢) Ifyour company provides health insurance Yes
coverage to its employees, is the coverage comparable

to the services provided by Dallas County as described

in the attached summary plan description? (See

Attachment A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in Yes
the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the

subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to

their employees that compares to Dallas County’s

health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

VENDOR #10 VENDOR #11

Comade, Inc. Limitless Office Products
Tomas Gonzalez Mita Guha

17915 Sky Park Circle, Ste. B 5100 W. El Dorado Pkwy.
Irvine, CA 92614 #102 - 903

949-474-0160
949-474-0161

McKinney, TX 75070
214-764-4092
214-206-1860 - Fax

N/A

N/A

N/A
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VENDOR #12
Your Box Lady
Marion Grayson
P.0O.Box 11
Belton, TX 76513
254-718-7878
254-939-0468 - Fax

No. Your Box Lady does
not, but Englander Does.

Your Box Lady is a sole
prop, and we have no

employees.

Yes

Your Box Lady is sole pro,
and we have no employees.

Yes, or very close



