
TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Ennis Paint Allstates Coatings Company The Sherwin Williams Company 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 P. O. Box 404 100 N. Lee Dr. 1001 Nebula Rd. 
Ennis, TX 75119 Gladewater, TX 75647 Manchester, GA 31816 
Dane Alsabrook Tracey A. Charlson John Palomba 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 800­331­8118 903­845­6436 706­846­2221 
800­555­0217 903­845­5626 ­ Fax 706­846­224 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic Paint contracts@ennistraffic.com tac@allstatescoatings.com brandy.recl@sherwin.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. Qty Recommended Award: Item: 4 Recommended Award: 
Items 1 & 2 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) No No No 
M/WBE EEO1 Form Yes Yes No 
Dallas County Taxpayer? No Yes No 
How were you notified? Letter from DC Letter from DC Onvia 

Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic Paint  (TX DOT – DMS 8200), as per bid 
specifications 
1.   55 – Gallon Drum 
Color: White WPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Ten (10) drums. 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

50 drums 542.878 $27,143.90 508.750 $25,437.50 602.800 $30,140.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 1 yr. 1 yr. 12 months 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Ennis Paint Inc. 984351 ALT­100 Sherwin­Wiliams TM2472 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 5­14 days ARO 30 days ARO 30 days 

2.  55 – Gallon Drum 
Color: Yellow YPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Ten (10) drums 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

50 drums 534.023 $26,701.15 517.000 $25,850.00 603.900 $30,195.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 1 yr. 1 yr. 12 months 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Ennis Paint 984352 ALT­101 Sherwin­Williams TM2473 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 5­14 days ARO 30 days ARO 30 days 

3.  5 – Gallon Pails 
Color: White WPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Four (4) pails 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

15 pails 52.503 $787.55 75.000 $1,125.00 58.500 $877.50 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 1 yr. 1 yr. 12 months 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Ennis Paint Inc. 984351 ALT­100 Sherwin­Williams TM2472 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 5­14 days ARO 30 days ARO 30 days 

4.   5 – Gallon Pails 
Color: Yellow YPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Four (4) pails 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment 

15 pails 51.698 $775.47 76.250 $1,143.75 55.950 $839.25 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 1 yr. 1 yr. 12 months 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Ennis Paint Inc. 984352 ALT­101 Sherwin­Willims TM2473 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 5­14 days ARO 30 days ARO 30 days 

Zone Marking Paint (Lead Free Waterborne), as per bid specifications 

1.  5­Gallon Pails 60 pails 10.500 $630.00 73.750 $4,425.00 No Bid 
Various Colors: White, Yellow, Red, Black & blue Withdrew bid, incorrect pricing 

submitted. 
Specify Minimum Shelf Life 1 yr 

Specify Manufacture/Brand/Product Number Being Proposed White ALT­632, Yellow ALT­ 
633, Black ALT­631, Blue 
ALT­634, Red ALT­628 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Ennis Paint Allstates Coatings Company The Sherwin Williams Company 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 P. O. Box 404 100 N. Lee Dr. 1001 Nebula Rd. 
Ennis, TX 75119 Gladewater, TX 75647 Manchester, GA 31816 
Dane Alsabrook Tracey A. Charlson John Palomba 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 800­331­8118 903­845­6436 706­846­2221 
800­555­0217 903­845­5626 ­ Fax 706­846­224 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic Paint contracts@ennistraffic.com tac@allstatescoatings.com brandy.recl@sherwin.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. Qty Recommended Award: Item: 4 Recommended Award: 
Items 1 & 2 

Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 30 days ARO 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 
Ennis Paint Allstates Coatings Company The Sherwin Williams Company 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 P. O. Box 404 100 N. Lee Dr. 1001 Nebula Rd. 
Ennis, TX 75119 Gladewater, TX 75647 Manchester, GA 31816 
Dane Alsabrook Tracey A. Charlson John Palomba 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 800­331­8118 903­845­6436 706­846­2221 
800­555­0217 903­845­5626 ­ Fax 706­846­224 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic Paint contracts@ennistraffic.com tac@allstatescoatings.com brandy.recl@sherwin.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. Qty Recommended Award: Item: 4 Recommended Award: 
Items 1 & 2 

Curb Marking Paint, as per bid specifications 60 pails 10.500 $630.00 No Bid No Bid 
1.  5 ­ Gallon Pails Withdrew bid, incorrect pricing 
Various Colors: White, Yellow, Red, Green & Blue submitted. 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life 

Specify Manufacture/Brand/Product Number Being Proposed 

Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 

2.  Traffic Spray Aerosol upside down 18 oz can 72 ea No Bid No Bid $0.00 
Various Colors 

Please answer the questions listed below: 

  S pecify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid 
proposal, if applicable: 

Specify Prompt Payment Discount Terms: Net 30 Days 0% 30 Days 

  S pecify the name, telephone number and e­mail address (if any) of the 
account representative who will be handling this account 

Stacy Slik 214 ­ 874­7235 ­ 
Stacy.salik@ennistraffic.com 

  Does y our firm/company have the required insurance coverage stated 
under SECTION 3 ­ INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with 
these requirements during the duration of this contract? 

Yes Yes Yes 

If, No will your firm be able to obtained the required coverage within ten (10) 
days upon notification of contract award? 

  Inf ormation on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for Employees 

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance coverage for 
employees in the bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 4).  Please 
complete the information below to assist in this evaluation. 
a)  Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees? Yes Yes Yes 

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its employees, 
does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only 
coverage and 50% for family coverage? 

Yes Yes Yes 

c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is 
the coverage comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as 
described in the attached summary plan description? (See Attachment ­ A) 

Yes Yes Yes 

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of this 
bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to 
their employees that compares to Dallas County’s health insurance coverage 
and share in the cost? 

N/A No ­ No Subs N/A 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 
Texas Paint & Wallpaper Co. 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 4410 Ross Ave. 
Dallas, TX 75204 
Rober Solomon 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 214­824­4574 
214­823­1951 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic 
Paint 

R.solomon@texaspaint.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

Recommended Award: Items: 
3, Zone Marking 1 & Curb 
Marking 1 & 2 

NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE) Yes 
M/WBE EE01 Form Yes 
Dallas County Taxpayer? Yes 
How were you notified? Letter from DC 

Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic Paint  (TX DOT – DMS 8200), as per bid 
specifications 
1.   55 – Gallon Drum 
Color: White WPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Ten (10) drums. 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

50 drums 556.000 $27,800.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 2 yrs. Under normal cond. 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Coronado 66­101 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 days 

2.  55 – Gallon Drum 
Color: Yellow YPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Ten (10) drums 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

50 drums 682.000 $34,100.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 2 yrs 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Coronado 66­156 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 days 

3.  5 – Gallon Pails 
Color: White WPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Four (4) pails 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment. 

15 pails 51.800 $777.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 2 yrs 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Coronado 66­101 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 days 

4.   5 – Gallon Pails 
Color: Yellow YPT­12 
Dallas County Minimum order per shipment: Four (4) pails 
All bid pricing must be based on the minimum order per shipment 

15 pails 63.800 $957.00 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life: 2 yrs 
Specify Manufacturer, Brand and Product Number being Proposed Coronado 66­156 
Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 days 

Zone Marking Paint (Lead Free Waterborne), as per bid specifications 

1.  5­Gallon Pails 60 pails 70.000 $4,200.00 
Various Colors: White, Yellow, Red, Black & blue 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life 2 yrs 

Specify Manufacture/Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Coronado 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 
Texas Paint & Wallpaper Co. 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 4410 Ross Ave. 
Dallas, TX 75204 
Rober Solomon 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 214­824­4574 
214­823­1951 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic 
Paint 

R.solomon@texaspaint.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

Recommended Award: Items: 
3, Zone Marking 1 & Curb 
Marking 1 & 2 

Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 days 

Curb Marking Paint, as per bid specifications 60 pails 70.000 $4,200.00 
1.  5 ­ Gallon Pails 
Various Colors: White, Yellow, Red, Green & Blue 

Specify Minimum Shelf Life 2 yrs 

Specify Manufacture/Brand/Product Number Being Proposed Coronado 

Specify Delivery Time after Receipt of Purchase Order 7­10 Days 

2.  Traffic Spray Aerosol upside down 18 oz can 72 ea 5.450 $392.40 
Various Colors 

Please answer the questions listed below: 

  Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid 
proposal, if applicable: 

Specify Prompt Payment Discount Terms: 2% 15 days from invoice date. 

  Specify the name, telephone number and e­mail address (if any) of the 
account representative who will be handling this account 

Fran Jenkins 214­824­4574 Ext. 
222 

  Does your firm/company have the required insurance coverage stated 
under SECTION 3 ­ INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with 
these requirements during the duration of this contract? 

Yes 

If, No will your firm be able to obtained the required coverage within ten 
(10) days upon notification of contract award? 

  Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for 
Employees 
Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance coverage for 
employees in the bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 4).  Please 
complete the information below to assist in this evaluation. 
a)  Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees? Yes 

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for 
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage? 

Yes 

c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is 
the coverage comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as 
described in the attached summary plan description? (See Attachment ­ A) 

Yes 
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TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #4 
Texas Paint & Wallpaper Co. 

BID NO. 2011­018­5318 4410 Ross Ave. 
Dallas, TX 75204 
Rober Solomon 

OPENING DATE: 29­Nov­2010 214­824­4574 
214­823­1951 ­ Fax 

Annual Contract for the Purchase of Waterborne (Lead Free) Traffic 
Paint 

R.solomon@texaspaint.com 

Contract Effective Period: January 25, 2011 ­ January 24, 2012 

DESCRIPTION: Est. 
Qty. 

Recommended Award: Items: 
3, Zone Marking 1 & Curb 
Marking 1 & 2 

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of this 
bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to 
their employees that compares to Dallas County’s health insurance 
coverage and share in the cost? 

No 
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