DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND

RELATED PRODUCTS
BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?
TAXPAYER STATUS
A 1and2 itted?

DESCRIPTION

SECTION A
MANUFACTURER: BRADLEY CORPORATION

1|Screw. 8-32 X 1-1/4". NO. 160-313

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

w

TIMER ASSEMBLY. NO. $27-254

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

o

BACK PLATE. NO. 269-613

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

@

DIAPHRAM. NO. 269-612

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

~

DIVIDER PLATE. NO. 269-662

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

®

O-RING. 1.260 ID X .059W. NO. 125-001DT

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

WATER DIAPHRAM REPAIR KIT, NO. $65-110

TUBE CONNECTOR, 10-32 X 1/8”, NO. 169-890

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

25 each

925 each

80 each

~
a

each

15 each

o

each

o

each

100 each

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com
No/Yes
yes

UNIT EXTENSION

PRICE

$1.37 $34.25
ves
$16.99 $15.715.75
ves
$18.79 $1.503.20
ves
$9.50 $712.50
ves
$6.55 $98.25
ves
$5.76 $86.40
ves
$4.10 $61.50
ves
$2.38 $238.00
ves

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.

P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Katie Manley
800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

800.476.5848 email: @) m email: ) m email: @ i m email: @; i m
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
no bid 0 $1.73 $43.25 $1.41 $35.25 1.52 $38.00 no bid
no no
no
30 davs 7-10 davs 5-7 davs
$17.62 FALSE $23.60 $21.830.00 $22.71 $21.006.75 15.50 $14.337.50 no bid
p/n SC 241950
ves ves ves
ves #25416 #73819
$19.10 $1.528.00 $26.11 $2.088.80 $19.42 $1.553.60 18.79 $1.503.20 no bid
p/n SX-470704
ves ves
ves #05616 no
7-10-davs
$9.75 $731.25 $13.20 $990.00 $9.82 $736.50 9.90 $742.50 no bid
#5X-236190
ves
#05618 no no
7-10-davs 5-7 davs
NO BID $9.10 $136.50 $6.77 $101.55 6.83 $102.45 no bid
ves ves
#24818 no
7-10-davs
$5.92 $88.80 $7.99 $119.85 $6.25 $93.75 6.00 $90.00 no bid
SX-342410
ves ves ves
ves #25605 #73823
no bid $5.70 $85.50 $5.95 $89.25 4.27 $64.05 no bid
ves ves
#28426 no
7-10-davs
no bid $0.10 $10.00 $2.46 $246.00 247 $247.00 no bid
ves
#00638 no no
7-10-davs 5-7 davs
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DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Bra

nds Inc. dba Sexauer

701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,

Jacksonville,

132207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls

800.476.5830

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: m email: m email: m email: m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9| VALVE BODY. NO. 118-247 35 each $3.96 $138.60 no bid $5.50 $192.50 $4.09 $143.15 4.12 $144.20 no bid
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves #28427 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
10|SPRING AIR VALVE. NO. 135-052 25 each $1.37 $34.25 no bid $1.90 $47.50 $1.41 $35.25 1.42 $35.50 no bid
ves ves
ves #28429 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
11|MAGNET ASSEMBLY. NO. 269-660 20 each $42.84 $856.80 no bid $59.51 $1.190.20 $43.03 $860.60 44.62 $892.40 no bid
(vendor ext $857.40)
ves ves
ves #28430 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
12| AIR DIAPHRAM. NO. 269-659 25 each $6.84 $171.00 no bid $9.50 $237.50 $7.07 $176.75 712 $178.00 no bid
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves #28431 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
13 |SPRING DIAPHRAM. NO. 135-051 25 each $1.30 $32.50 no bid $1.80 $45.00 $1.34 $33.50 1.35 $33.75 no bid
ves ves
ves #28432 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
14| VALVE COVER REMOTE. NO. 269-657 35 each $5.11 $178.85 no bid $7.10 $248.50 $5.28 $184.80 5.32 $186.20 no bid
ves
ves #28433 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
15| WASHER. #8. SPLIT-LOCK. NO. 142-002CR 15 each $1.37 $20.55 no bid $1.90 $28.50 $1.42 $21.30 1.42 $21.30 no bid
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves #28442 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
16 |[FLOW METER WASHER. NO. 132-024 50 each $1.37 $68.50 $1.40 $70.00 $1.73 $86.50 $1.42 $71.00 1.42 $71.00 no bid
SX-470518
ves ves no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
17 |FLOW METER WASHER. NO. 269-059 50 each $2.74 $137.00 $2.80 $140.00 $3.46 $173.00 $2.83 $141.50 2.85 $142.50 no bid
#SX-470519
ves
ves ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs 7-10-davs
18 |FLOW CONTROL ASSEMBLY. 2.5 GPM. No. S8 3 each $18.14 $54.42 no bid $22.98 $68.94 $184.01 $552.03 18.90 $56.70 no bid
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves no #75080 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs
a percentage discount off manufacturer's c:
19 | published list price 35% min 26% max n/a 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 20% min 25% max no bid
SUB TOTAL - SECTION A $20,142.32 $2,558.05 $27,622.04 $26,082.53 $18,886.25

x 114174

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.

P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Katie Manley
800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682
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DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley

800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: @ m email: bids@ m email: @ i m email: m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SECTION B:
MANUFACTURER: WILLOUGHBY INDUSTRIES
20 |METERING VALVE MOTOR. NO. 380997 2 each $164.88 $329.76 $168.50 $337.00 $229.05 $458.10 $170.38 $340.76 203.36 $406.72 no bid
#SX 284109
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves ves #28637 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs
COMPLETE DIAPHRAGM PUMP ASSEMBLY,
21|NO. 600208 2 each $77.54 $155.08 $78.85 $157.70 $124.26 $248.52 $80.13 $160.26 95.91 $191.82 no bid
#SX 352468
Is this a stock item? no
Yes ves ves #10564 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 10 davs 7-10-davs 7 davs
DIAPHRAGM ASSEMBLY KIT, PVK-2DD, NO.
22380216 24 each $57.38 $1,377.12 $58.95 $1,414.80 $79.72 $1,913.28 $60.95 $1,462.80 68.14 $1,635.36 no bid
#SX 350959
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves #29048 #75084 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7 davs
METERING VALVE WITH FLOW CONTROL,
23 |NO. WPMI1-0.5 3 each $307.93 $923.79 $295.98 $887.94 | no bid $318.20 $954.60 379.90 $1,139.70 no bid
#SX 355214
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs
METERING VALVE LESS FLOW CONTROL,
24 |NO. WPMI-NFC 3 each $307.93 $923.79 $273.25 $819.75 | no bid $318.20 $954.60 379.90 $1,139.70 no bid
#SX 355222
Is this a stock item?
Yes ves ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs
25|PNEUMATIC PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY. NO. { 6 each $77.54 $465.24 $80.25 $481.50 $109.53 $657.18 $80.13 $480.78 95.91 $575.46 no bid
SX 284042
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves ves #28632 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs
26 |SQUARE HOLE ADAPTER, NO. SHA 4 each $ 16.80 $67.20 20.25 $81.00 28.64 $114.56 20.25 $81.00 24.23 $96.92 no bid
Is this a stock item? SX 355172 ves
Yes ves ves #10506 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs
For all non-listed Willoughby items, vendor shall
specify a percentage discount off manufacturer's
27 | current published list price 1% min 4% max n/a 0% min 0% max 0% min 5% max 0% min 0% max no bid
SUB TOTAL - SECTION B $4,241.98 $4,179.69 $3,391.64 $4,434.80 $5,185.68
They do not publish price list
SECTION C:
MANUFACTURER: ZURN INDUSTRIES
AQUA VANTAGE DIAPHRAM KIT, 3.5 GPF,
28 |NO. P6000-ECA-WS-CS 800 each $15.90 $12,720.00 $16.50 $13,200.00 $24.85 $19,880.00 $15.18 $12,144.00 19.52 $15,616.00 14.50 $11,600.00
#8X 327353 excludes "CS"
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves #27661 #71388 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5davs

3or1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Marks Plumbing
PO Box 121554
Ft. Worth, Texas
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232
fax 817-244-6275

Parts

76121

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley

800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: m email: bids@ m email: @ i m email: @ i m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
AQUA VANTAGE HYDRAULIC ACTIVATED
29 |[FLUSHMETER, NO. ZH6603AV-MBP-WS1 2 each $185.63 $371.26 $206.55 $413.10 $187.56 $375.12 $179.25 $358.50 220.00 $440.00 200.00 $400.00
#8X 453901
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves ves #05353 no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 7 davs 3 davs
AQUA VANTAGE DIAPHRAM KIT, 1.0 GPF,
30 |NO. P6000-ECA-WSI-CS 2 each $15.90 $31.80 $16.50 $33.00 $24.85 $49.70 $16.99 $33.98 19.52 $39.04 19.00 $38.00
SX 327361 excludes"CS"
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves ves #27652 no
#71389
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 3 davs
AQUA VANTAGE FLUSHMETER DIAPHRAGM,|
NO. P6000-ECA-WS1
31 40 each $15.90 $636.00 $16.50 $660.00 $22.09 $883.60 $16.99 $679.60 19.52 $780.80 14.25 $570.00
SX 327361
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes NO ves ves # 27652 ves no
#71389
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 3 davs
32 |HYDRAULIC PLUNGER ASSEMBLY. NO. PH60| 10 each $27.61 $276.10 $27.10 $271.00 $37.56 $375.60 $27.55 $275.50 32.00 $320.00 23.00 $230.00
S$X 351080
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves #26852 ves ves
#71898
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
REPAIR KIT FOR HYDRAULIC PLUNGER
33 | ASSEMBLY. NO. PH6000-HYM1 1 10 each 14.77 $147.70 14.75 $147.50 20.09 $200.90 14.75 $147.50 17.00 $170.00 13.75 $137.50
SX 355354
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #126853 no ves
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
For all non-listed Zurn items, vendor shall specify a
percentage discount off manufacturer's current
34 | published list price 30% min 44% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 30% min 40% max 35% min 40% max
SUB TOTAL - SECTION C $14,182.86 $14,724.60 $21,764.92 $13,639.08 $17,365.84 $12,975.50
All Zurn concealed valves & parts
SECTION D:
MANUFACTURER: DELANY PRODUCTS
35 |FLUSH VALVE CAPS. NO. F159A0 35 each $25.48 $891.80 $26.18 $916.30 535.40‘ $1.239.00 $31.59 $1.105.65 47.18 $1.651.30 |no bid
SX 098780
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #06504 ves
#70128
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
36 |FLUSH VALVE STOP. NO. 44-4A-R 50 each $17.42 $871.00 $17.90 $895.00 $25.47 $1.273.50 $19.50 $975.00 32.27 $1.613.50 |no bid
SX 099739
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves ves # 06565 ves no
#70188
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7 davs
37 |CLOSET DIAPHRAM KIT. NO. F141KC 250 each $6.80 $1.700.00 $6.99 $1.747.50 $9.99 $2.497.50 $8.89 $2.222.50 13.79 $3.447.50 | no bid
SX 234153
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves #06546 ves
#71040
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
VACUUM BREAKER SUPPLY ELBOW, NO.
38 |445A-9W 50 each $27.11 $1,355.50 |no bid $22.07 $1,103.50 $31.13 $1,556.50 49.90 $2,495.00 no bid
no
ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs 7-10-davs

4or1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND

RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,

Jacksonville,

132207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls

800.476.5830

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: ) m email: ) m email: m email: ) m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
39 |FLUSH VALVE STEM. NO. 368N 35 each $2.42 $84.70 $2.50 $87.50 $3.54 $123.90 $2.05 $71.75 4.48 $156.80 |no bid
SX 099291
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes ves ves # 06556 #71752
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
40 | AUXILIARY VALVE, NO. F20 100 each $5.59 $559.00 $5.25 $525.00 $8.17 $817.00 $2.19 $219.00 10.36 $1,036.00 |no bid
#35X 092692
ves ves ves
ves ves # 06508 #70008
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
41|OPERATION STEM, 1-7/8", NO. F223-2 100 each $2.00 $200.00 $2.06 $206.00 $3.21 $321.00 $2.19 $219.00 4.06 $406.00 | no bid
SX 092908 (vendor ext $907.90)
ves ves
ves ves #70018
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
42 |RUBBER HANDLE FLEXER, NO. F222-3 100 each $0.56 $56.00 $0.68 $68.00 $1.04 $104.00 $0.39 $39.00 2.10 $210.00 | no bid
sx 092890
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes ves ves #06532 #70033
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
For all non-listed Delany items, vendor s
a percentage discount off manufacturer's current
43 published list price 30% min 49% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 20% min 25% max no bid
SUB TOTAL - SECTION D $5,718.00 $4,445.30 $7,479.40 $6,408.40 $11,016.10
(vendor ext $8,066.65)
SECTION E:
MANUFACTURER: SYMMONS INDUSTRIES
44 |OEM TEMPERATURE CONTROL CARTRIDGE,|
NO. 5-200NW 2 each $458.68 $917.36 $377.30 $754.60 $435.95 $871.90 $389.49 $778.98 445.00 $890.00 | no bid
SX 191536 (vendor ext $907.90)
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves ves #22580
#12754
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
STOPS FOR TEMPERATURE CONTROL
45| CARTRIDGES, 6 each $101.48 $608.88 $94.98 $569.88 $128.55 $771.30 $104.87 $629.22 105.71 $634.26 | no bid
NO. TT-50AN-200 SX 302752 (pair)
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves ves no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
For all non-listed Symmons items, vendor shall
specify a percentage discount off manufacturer's
46 |current published list price 15% min 26% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 20% min 25% max no bid
SUB TOTAL - SECTION E $1,526.24 $1,324.48 $1,643.20 $1,408.20 $1,524.26
(vendor ext $1,679.20)
SECTION F:
MANUFACTURER: SLOAN VALVE COMPANY
VACUUM BREAKER ASSEMBLY, 1-1/2" X 13-
47 |1/2", ROUGH BRASS NO. 0323142 100 each $19.46 $1,946.00 $19.58 $1,958.00 $28.45 $2,845.00 $20.12 $2,012.00 21.25 $2,125.00 no bid
SX 265918
ves ves
ves ves #12506 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR KIT, FOR
48 |MODEL V-551-A, NO. 101338 75 each $1.36 $102.00 $1.20 $90.00 $1.88 $141.00 $1.29 $96.75 1.75 $131.25 | no bid
SX 093385
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #06215 #70783

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

x 114174

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850
Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley
800-523-5130
fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

5015




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer

701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207
John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Marks Plumbing
PO Box 121554
Ft. Worth, Texas
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232
fax 817-244-6275

Parts

76121

Plumbmaster, Inc.

P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Katie Manley
800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: ) m email: ) m email: @ i m email: @; i m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
49 | VACUUM BREAKER. NO. V-651-A 150 each $1.40 $210.00 52.15‘ $322.50 $1.95 $292.50 $2.41 $361.50 1.85 $277.50 | no bid
SX 309252
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes ves ves #24598 #70490
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
50 |HANDLE REPAIR KIT. NO. B-50-A 200 each $1.51 $302.00 51.65‘ $330.00 $2.10 $420.00 $1.50 $300.00 1.98 $396.00 | no bid
SX 090498
ves ves ves
ves ves #06258 #70618
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
51 |INSIDE PLASTIC COVER. NO. A-71 30 each $1.31 $39.30 51.35‘ $40.50 $1.91 $57.30 $1.36 $40.80 3.98 $119.40 | no bid
SX 092221
ves ves ves
ves ves #06207 #70618
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, 7-3/4" L DIM,
52|C9AT734, No. COA 2 each $63.05 $126.10 $63.70 $127.40 $92.16 $184.32 $65.15 $130.30 72.00 $144.00 | no bid
SX 265983
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #12021 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
53 |O-RING. NO. H-553 75 each $0.07 $5.25 50.03‘ $2.25 $0.10 $7.50 $0.05 $3.75 0.59 $44.25 |no bid
sx 061309
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes ves ves #00642 #35759
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
54 | WATER CLOSET REPAIR KIT (3301041). 1.6 GP| 20 each $10.97 $219.40 $11.52 ‘ $230.40 $15.24 $304.80 $18.05 $361.00 15.95 $319.00 | no bid
SX 225888
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes ves ves #11967 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
55|FLUSHOMETER KIT. NO. A-156-AA 100 each $4.90 $490.00 55.34‘ $534.00 $8.95 $895.00 $5.19 $519.00 7.50 $750.00 | no bid
SX 098483
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #06220 #83185
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
SOLENOID VALVE ASSEMBLY, NO. ETF-370A
56 3 each $50.39 $151.17 $50.40 $151.20 $73.88 $221.64 $49.99 $149.97 55.90 $167.70 | no bid
SX 470771
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves ves #12182 #71783 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7 davs
57 |BRASS ELBOW. 1-1/2 X 8. C/E W/4. NO. F25A 15 each $42.42 $636.30 NO BID $41.60 $624.00 $29.60 $444.00 27.40 $411.00 | no bid
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves #12262 no ves
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
For all non-listed Sloan items, vendor shall specify a
percentage discount off manufacturer's current
58 | published list price 30% min 42% max NA 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 40% min 50% max no bid
SUB TOTAL - SECTION F $4,227.52 $3,786.25 $5,993.06 $4,419.07 $4,885.10
SECTION G:
MANUFACTURER ACORN ENGINEERING CO.
59 | DIRECT ACTING ASSEMBLY. NO. 2563-000-00;] 60 each $51.74 $3,104.40 NO BID $79.18 $4,750.80 $58.90 $3,534.00 59.38 $3,562.80 51.00 $3,060.00
ves ves ves
ves #28503 no
6ot 15

If No. specify delivery timeframe:




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND

RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley

800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: @ m email: bids@ m email: @ i m email: @ i m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
days after receint of order 7-10-davs
60 |FLOW CONTROL. .5 GPM. NO. 2312-003-001 100 each $6.48 $648.00 $5.40 $540.00 $8.99 $899.00 $4.99 $499.00 6.75 $675.00 6.35 $635.00
SX 150433
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes ves ves #11148 #97363
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
61 |SHOWER NOZZLE. NO. 1244-001-001 15 each $104.66 $1.569.90 no bid $132.57 $1.988.55 $108.15 $1.622.25 119.13 $1.786.95 103.00 $1.545.00
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes ves no #7771 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe: 30 davs
days after receint of order 5-7 davs
62 | PENAL SHOWER HEAD. NO. 1244-005-002 5 each $109.94 $549.70 no bid $139.26 $696.30 $113.61 $568.05 114.52 $572.60 108.00 $540.00
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 30 davs 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
SINGLE TEMPERATURE PUSH BUTTON|
63 | ASSEMBLY. NO. 2566-050-001 2 each $55.30 $110.60 $29.98 $59.96 $20.62 $41.24 $27.19 $54.38 28.00 $56.00 27.00 $54.00
SX 341321
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes ves ves # 25582 #97732 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs
WATER DIAPHRAGM ASSEMBLY, NO. 2563-
641010-001 140 each $4.86 $680.40 $5.40 $756.00 $8.99 $1,258.60 $4.99 $698.60 6.50 $910.00 6.40 $896.00
SX 234708
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes ves ves # 16598 #97367
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
COMP. CHECK STOP STRAINER ASSEMBLY,
65 |NO. 2570-000-001 2 each $93.07 $186.14 $77.48 $154.96 $131.46 $262.92 $87.99 $175.98 96.95 $193.90 91.00 $182.00
SX 350702
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #24845 #75300
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
PLASTIC AIR CONTROL CHECK STOP
66 | ASSEMBLY. NO. 2570-011-001 50 each $14.48 $724.00 $14.99 $749.50 $20.12 $1,006.00 $13.88 $694.00 15.90 $795.00 14.25 $712.50
sx 350728
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes ves ves #28874 #75308
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
67 | TIMER ASSEMBLY, NO. 2564-000-001 15 each $10.99 $164.85 $12.25 $183.75 $15.27 $229.05 $10.99 $164.85 12.59 $188.85 11.00 $165.00
sx 234724
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #11145 #97380
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, NO. 2566-025-001
68 25 each $20.15 $503.75 $23.75 $593.75 $29.45 $736.25 $20.82 $520.50 22.98 $574.50 20.00 $500.00
SX 341842
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves ves
Yes ves YES #1141 #77084
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
ELECTRONIC PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, 60
69 | SECOND. NO. 2566-373-002 5 each $96.43 $482.15|NO BID no bid $100.54 $502.70 112.60 $563.00 95.00 $475.00
ves no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs 5-7 davs

7or1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30
Myersville, Md 21773

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th Fir.,

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554
Ft. Worth, Texas 76121

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850
Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.
Chula Vista, CA 91910

Secure Detention Products
31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.) Jacksonville, F1 32207 Lee Hickey Katie Manley Gene Darby Lance Phillips
BUYER: SAM COOPER 800-448-6710 John McDonald, Sr VP Sls 817-710-2232 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
fax 900-700-2378 800.476.5830 x 114174 fax 817-244-6275 fax 800-259-31435 fax 619-420-3825 fax 951-639-3682
OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: m email: bi m email: i i m email: i m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
ELECTRONIC PUSHBUTTON
70 | W/CONNECTORS. NO. 2566-370-002 5 each $96.43 $482.15|NO BID no bid $100.54 $502.70 112.60 $563.00 95.00 $475.00
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves no no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs 5-7 davs
71|ESCUTCHEON RETAINER ADAPTER. NO. VAS 15 each $13.73 $205.95 |NO BID no bid $17.01 $255.15 19.05 $285.75 16.25 $243.75
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
PUSH ROD, FOR ELECTRONIC
72 |PUSHBUTTON, NO. VA500042-199 10 each $2.69 $26.90 [NO BID no bid $1.69 $16.90 1.87 $18.70 1.70 $17.00
vendor extension §
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
ELECTRONIC PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, 15
73| SECOND. NO. VA500043-001 2 each $121.44 $242.88 |NO BID no bid $129.80 $259.60 145.38 $290.76 123.00 $246.00
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
74 |ELECTRONIC PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, 60
SECOND, NO. VA500044-001 2 each $125.62 $251.24 |NO BID no bid $129.80 $259.60 145.38 $290.76 123.00 $246.00
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
PENTATROL SEAT GASKET, BLACK, NO.
750439-000-001 20 each $6.74 $134.80 |NO BID $6.97 $139.40
Is this a stock item? ves
Yes NO ves no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10-davs 5-7 davs
76 |SERVOMOTOR METERING ASSEMBLY. No. 25| 5 each $72.12 $360.60 $74.25 $371.25 $79.81 $399.05 $74.50 $372.50 75.00 $375.00 71.00 $355.00
compare to 2563-020-|
SX 234591 002
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes NO ves ves no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order 7-10-davs
SINGLE TEMP 2.5 GPM VALVE ASSEMBLY
77 |METERING MTD ON PLATE. NO. 2590-003-001 15 each $113.77 $1,706.55 $169.15 $2,537.25 $185.05 $2,775.75 $111.87 $1,678.05 118.51 $1,777.65 111.00 $1,665.00
SX 341586
Is this a stock item? ves ves
Yes NO ves ves #128882 #77017 no ves
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order 5-7 davs
78 |PENATROL VALVE O-RING, NO. 0401-011-000 150 each $6.48 $972.00 no bid $0.10 $15.00 $0.05 $7.50
Is this a stock item? ves ves ves
Yes NO ves #00601 #35723 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order 5-7 davs

Bor1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND

RELATED PRODUCTS
BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th Fir.,

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?

TAXPAYER STATUS

land2 itted?

<

9

@
3

@

@

2

@
@

@
R

@
a

@
)

@
&

DESCRIPTION

PENETROL VALVE O-RING, NO. 0401-117-000

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order

PENATROL VALVE GASKET DISK. NO. 0439-0((

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order

PENATROL VALVE U PACKING. NO. 0408-001-

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order

PENATROL VALVE BACK UP RING. No. 0409-0|

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order

FLOW CONTROL, 1.6 GPM, NO. 0469-016-000

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receint of order

CHECK STOP ASSEMBLY. LESS BONNET. No.
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order

9 VOLT SOLENOID, NO. 2563-326-001

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order

PLASTIC MOUNTING TEE, NO. 2570-041-000

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order

COLD PUSHBUTTON, NO. 2566-027-000

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order

HOT PUSHBUTTON, NO. 2566-026-000

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
davs after receipt of order

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
100 each

150 each

150 each

800 each

300 each

5 each

20 each

20 each

10 each

10 each

Marks Plumbing
PO Box 121554
Ft. Worth, Texas

Parts

76121

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850
Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.
Chula Vista, CA 91910

Secure Detention Products
31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479

No/Yes
yes
UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE
$6.48 $648.00
ves
$13.22 $1,983.00
ves
$21.58 $3,237.00
ves
$6.48 $5,184.00
ves
$2.26 $678.00
ves
$36.62 $183.10
ves
$41.98 $839.60
ves
$5.99 $119.80
ves
$5.78 $57.80
ves
$5.78 $57.80
ves

Jacksonville, F1 32207 Lee Hickey Katie Manley Gene Darby Lance Phillips
John McDonald, Sr VP Sls 817-710-2232 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
800.476.5830 x 114174 fax 817-244-6275 fax 800-259-31435 fax 619-420-3825 fax 951-639-3682
800.476.5848 email: m email: bi email: i i m email: i m
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$6.60 $660.00 $0.11 $11.00 $0.67 $67.00 0.75 $75.00
sx 400165
ves ves ves ves
ves #00654 #73632
$1.36 $204.00 $10.34 $1,551.00
SX 317834
ves
ves #73787 no no
5-7 davs 5-7 davs
$2.75 $412.50 $18.22 $2,733.00
SX 317818
ves ves
ves #11131 #73790 no no
5-7 davs 5-7 davs
$6.60 $5,280.00 $5.07 $4,056.00
SX 471001
ves
ves #11126 #74662 no no
5-7 davs 5-7 davs
no bid $2.50 $750.00 $2.35 $705.00 260 $780.00 220 $660.00
ves
no no no
30 dav 7-10 davs 5-7 davs
$44.26 $221.30 $40.59 $202.95 $37.84 $189.20 38.15 $190.75 36.00 $180.00
SX 106104 compare to 2755-05-002
ves ves
no #73658 no
30 dav 5-7 davs
$284.65 $5,693.00 $46.52 $930.40 $43.38 $867.60 43.73 $874.60 41.00 $820.00
sx 350637
ves ves
ves no no
30 dav 5-7 davs
$4.75 $95.00 $8.75 $175.00 $8.66 $173.20 6.86 $137.20 5.90 $118.00
SX 341149
yes yes
ves ves #76374 no
#28469
5-7 davs
$5.95 $59.50 $8.45 $84.50 $5.98 $59.80 6.63 $66.30 5.75 $57.50
SX 341875
yes yes yes
ves # 16546 #97767 no
5-7 davs
$5.95 $59.50 $8.45 $84.50 $5.98 $59.80 6.63 $66.30 5.75 $57.50
SX 341883
yes yes yes
ves # 16547 #77139 no
5-7 davs

sor1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,

Jacksonville,

132207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls

800.476.5830

x 114174

Marks Plumbing
PO Box 121554
Ft. Worth, Texas
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232
fax 817-244-6275

Parts

76121

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley

800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: m email: bids@ m email: @ i m email: @ i m
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
BUBBLER ADAPTER, 1/4" MIP X
89 | COMPRESSION. No. 1895-002-000 40 each $1.54 $61.60 $6.85 $274.00 $3.44 $137.60 $1.59 1.86 $74.40 1.50 $60.00
SX 350553
Is this a stock item? yes yes yes
Yes ves ves #28890 #97749 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs
HOT AND COLD TRIM PACK, WITH TUBING,|
90 |No. 4016-100-001 10 each $68.71 $687.10 no bid $97.06 $970.60 $71.02 $710.20 77.58 $775.80 67.00 $670.00
Is this a stock item? yes no
Yes NO ves #28477 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10 davs 5-7 davs 5-7 davs
HOT AND COLD PNEUMATIC VALVE
91| ASSEMBLY. NO. 2590-050-001 10 each $198.34 $1,983.40 $237.96 $2,379.60 $280.15 $2,801.50 $204.95 $2,049.50 224.60 $2,246.00 190.00 $1,900.00
SX 341750
Is this a stock item? yes yes
Yes ves ves #28476 #77018 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs 5-7 davs
PLASTIC VALVE BODY, LH, NO. 2570-027-000
92 5 each $17.74 $88.70 $19.75 $98.75 $25.92 $129.60 $18.33 20.48 $102.40 17.25 $86.25
SX 341115
Is thi yes yes
Yes ves ves #25152 #75315 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs 5-7 davs
PLASTIC VALVE BODY, RH, NO. 2570-026-000
93 5 each $17.74 $88.70 $19.75 $98.75 $25.92 $129.60 $18.33 20.48 $102.40 17.25 $86.25
SX 341107
Is this a stock item? yes yes
Yes NO ves ves #25153 #75314 no no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs 5-7 davs
QUICK CLOZ CARTRIDGE ASSEMBLY, LESS|
94 | BONNET. NO. 2304-001-001 100 each $41.23 $4,123.00 $45.75 $4,575.00 $60.27 $6,027.00 $16.82 $1,682.00 45.20 $4,520.00 40.00 $4,000.00
S$X 106070
Is this a stock item? yes yes
Yes ves ves #16572 #73642 no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 5-7 davs
95| 0-RING. NO. 0401-016-000 130 each $6.48 $842.40 $0.03 $3.90 $0.10 $13.00 $0.67 6.75 $87.75 6.50 $84.50
13 packs/ sold
in packs of 10
SX 069013 13 packs of 10 each
Is this a stock item? yes yes yes yes
Yes NO ves ves # 00636 #75309
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order
PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY, No. 2566-370-001
96* 10 each $97.30 $973.00 no bid no bid $120.91 $1.209.10 | no bid 100.00 $1.000.00
not a good number
Is this a stock item?
Yes ves No no
If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order 7-10 davs 5-7 davs
*addendum no. 2 ed for this item
For all non-listed Acorn items, vendor shall specify a
percentage discount off manufacturer's current Acorn Penal
97 | published list price 1% min 4% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 5% max 40% min 50% max |fixtures 35% min 35% max
Acorn parts
48% min 48% max
SUB TOTAL - SECTION G $34,942.96 $26,061.22 $29,047.58 $28,972.11 $24,798.72 $22,998.25
vendor extension
$22.388.95
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DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?
TAXPAYER STATUS
A 1and2 itted?

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
SECTION H:
MANUFACTURER: METCRAFT INDUSTRIES, INC.
98 |NON-METERING CARTRIDGE KIT, NO. 19811 70 each
Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

For all non-listed Metcraft items, vendor shall
specify a percentage discount off manufacturer's
current published list price

©
)

SUB TOTAL - SECTION H

SECTION I:
MANUFACTURER: T&S BRASS & BRONZE WORKS

FLOW CONTROL TOWER, F-07, 0.7 GPM, NO.

100|001641-45

5]

260 each

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

1

o

LEFT HAND STEM (SPINDLE). NO. 812-25 10 each

Is this a stock item?
Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

1

9
N}

RIGHT HAND STEM (SPINDLE), NO. 811-25 10 each
Is this a stock item?

Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

STEM LEFT HAND ASSEMBLY (REMOVABLE

103 | INSERT). NO. 789-20 10 each
Is this a stock item?

Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

STEM RIGHT HAND ASSEMBLY

104 |(REMOVABLE INSERT). NO. 788-20 10 each
Is this a stock item?

Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

1

=]

5 | VACUUM BREAKER KIT. NO. B-0969-RK01 10 each
Is this a stock item?

Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

For all non-listed T&S Brass items, vendor shall
specify a percentage discount off manufacturer's
6 | current published list price

1

o

SUB TOTAL - SECTION I

SECTION J:
MANUFACTURER: PARKER HANNIFIN CORPORATION
107

SOLENOID VALVE REPAIR KIT. NO. 24F24012¢] 5 each

Is this a stock item?

Yes

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com
No/Yes
yes
UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE
$50.28 $3,519.60
ves
0% min 0% max
$3,519.60
$ 242 $629.20
ves
$ 3.50 $35.00
ves
$ 3.50 $35.00
ves
$ 3.73 $37.30
ves
$ 3.73 $37.30
ves
$ 15.67 $156.70
ves
30% min 40% max
$930.50
$ 180.00 $900.00
ves

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.

P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850

Katie Manley
800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.

Chula Vista, CA 91910
Gene Darby

800-451-3076

fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

800.476.5848 email: m email: m email: m email: m
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$44.95 $3,146.50 $56.64 $3,964.80 |Bid withdrawn. Vendor unable to 42.47 $2,972.90 no bid
SX 342766 honor price.
ves
ves #22313 no
5-7 davs
na 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max no bid
$3,146.50 $3,964.80 $0.00 $2,972.90
no price list is available
no bid $3.54 $920.40 $2.51 $652.60 $2.94 $764.40 no bid
ves No ves
#14737
7-10 davs
$4.35 $43.50 $5.48 $54.80 $1.69 $16.90 $7.43 $74.30 no bid
SX 200865
ves ves ves
ves #02030 # 16097
$ 4.60 $46.00 5.48 $54.80 1.69 $16.90 7.43 $74.30 no bid
S$X 200857
ves ves ves
ves #02029 # 16096
3.87 $38.70 5.37 $53.70 1.19 $11.90 7.27 $72.70 no bid
S$X 200881
ves ves ves
YES #00924 #17003
4.22 $42.20 5.37 $53.70 1.19 $11.90 7.27 $72.70 no bid
$X200873
ves ves ves
ves #00909 17002
15.54 $155.40 21.77 $217.70 17.5 $175.00 20.40 $204.00 no bid
sx217018
ves ves ves
ves #22888 30186
na 0% min 0% max 0% min 20% max 40% min 45% max
$325.80 $1,355.10 $885.20 $1,262.40
vendor extension $498.00
no bid no bid $184.11 $920.55 | no bid no bid
no
7-10 davs

o 1s




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

VENDOR #5

VENDOR #6

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.
PO Box 30

Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer
701 San Marco Blvd

Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr.,
Jacksonville, FI 32207

John McDonald, Sr VP Sls
800.476.5830 x 114174

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?
TAXPAYER STATUS

1and2 itted?

1

o
&

DESCRIPTION
SOLENOID VALVE REPAIR KIT. NO. 16F24012]

Is this a stock item?
Yes NO

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

For all non-listed Parker Hannifin brass items,
vendor shall specify a percentage discount off
turer's current published list price

SUB TOTAL - SECTION J

SECTION K:
UFACTURER: RADIATOR SPECIALTY CORPORATION

MAN

1

0

1

1

UNIVERSAL SLIP JOINT WASHER, No. W551

Is this a stock item?
Yes No

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

isted Radiator Specialty items, vendor
'y a percentage discount off’
manufacturer's current published list price

SUB TOTAL - SECTION K

SECTION L:

MAN

1

2

1

3

UFACTURER: INSINKERATOR
HOT WATER DISPENSER. CHROME. NO. F-GN

Is this a stock item?
Yes No

If No. specify delivery timeframe:
days after receint of order

For all non-listed Insinkerator items, vendor shall
specify a percentage discount off manufacturer's

current published list price

SUB TOTAL - SECTION L

Specify any additional comments, if applicable

Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms (if
% Days. Payment terms|

discount are Net 30 days, upon receipt of proper
invoice and verification that the and|
products have

been completed in accordance with specification
requirements in the Dallas County Auditor's Office.
The

award of this bid will not be based on prompt/carly
payment discounts.

services

Did your company check Dallas County website for
any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the bid
solicitation? YES

Is this an all or none bid? YES
NO

Specify the telephone number for ordering products
covered under this solicitation. ~ Telephone
Number:

Specify the name, telephone number, and e-mail
address of the account representative who will be
handling this account:

Contact Name:

Telephone NO.

E-Mail Address:

Specify the Alternative (Back-Up) Contact Person:
Contact Name:

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
5 each

560 each

40 each

Marks Plumbing Parts
PO Box 121554

Ft. Worth, Texas 76121
Lee Hickey
817-710-2232

fax 817-244-6275

Plumbmaster, Inc.
P.O. Box 850

Concordville, PA 19331-0850
Katie Manley

800-523-5130

fax 800-259-31435

Valley Industrial Specialties
110 N. Glover Ave.
Chula Vista, CA 91910

Gene Darby
800-451-3076
fax 619-420-3825

Secure Detention Products

31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Lance Phillips

951-639-3500

fax 951-639-3682

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: m email: m email: m email: m
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$ 180.00 $900.00 no bid no bid 321.81 $1,609.05 |no bid no bid
ves no
7-10 davs
0% min 0% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 15% max 0% min 0% max no bid
$1,800.00 $2,529.60 $0.00
$0.24 $134.40 $0.38 $212.80 $0.23 $128.80 $0.07 $39.20 0.26 $145.60 no bid
SX 063396
yes yes yes
yes yes #04157 # 36655
0% min 0% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max no bid
$ 134.40 $212.80 $128.80 $39.20 $145.60
$177.60 $7,104.00 no bid no bid $189.10 $7,564.00 |no bid no bid
(vendor ext $26,284.80) we stock the commercial grade model
yes no
7-10 davs
0% min 0% max na 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max 0% min 0% max no bid
Insinkerator does not have a
$7,104.00 $7,564.00 $0.00
Refer to vendors attached sheet nothing noted Marks' Part numbers are included for As refelected SDP stocks many of the
0% 1% 10 net 30 0% n/a
yes yes yes yes yes
no no No no no
800-448-6710 800.476.5830 ext 114174 or 115095 972-466-4104 / 817-731-6211 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
Keli Rousseau Ambush James Cumbo Lee Hickev Gary Suaas Gene Darby Javme Yapp
800-448-6710 ext 1758 214.287-5048 817-710-2232 817-994-2507 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
i com i com com net i com i com
Missy Bauaher Donnie Georae Mario Boale Katie Manley Dave Youna Lance Phillios
800-448-6710 ext 1754 800.476.5830 x 114174 817-710-2251 800-323-2630 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
i com interli com m. com i .com i net com
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DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

Best Plumbing Speci
PO Box 30
Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

lties, Inc.

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?
TAXPAYER STATUS
A 1and2 itted?

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY
Have you included current manufacturer's price
sheets for non-listed items for each category type?
Yes No

Does your firm have a local Warehouse Distribution
Center within the Dallas County or surrounding
Counties and are capable of providing the goods
listed herein at the time of bid submission?

Yes No

If yes, please provide the name, address, and
telephone number of the warchouse/distribution
centers below:

Warchouse Distribution Center (Physical
Address):

Citv. State. and Zip Code:

Telephone Number:

Toll-Free Telephone Number:

Warehouse Distribution Center (Physical

Citv. State. and Zip Code:
Business Telephone Number:
Toll-Free Telephone Number:

Will Dallas County authorized personnel be allowed
to pick-up products from this warehouse/distribution
center?

Yes No

Does your firm offer hot-shot service for parts
delivery?
Yes No

is there a fee or charge for this service?
No

If yes, what is the fee or charge per delivery?

Briefly describe your return goods policy for
parts:

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe
what (if any) portion of the bid requirements will be
subcontracted out:

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other
Governmental Entities decide to participate in this
contract, would

you, the awarded Contractor agrees that all terms,
conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply
to

that entity?

Yes NO,
Note: All purchases by Governmental Ent
other than Dallas County will be billed di
to that

Governmental Entity and paid by that
Governmental Entity. Dallas County will not be
resnonsible

for other Governmental Entitv’s debt.

ies
ctly

Does your firm/company have the required
insurance coverage stated under SECTION 3 —
INSURANCE

REQUIREMENTS and agree to comply with these
requirements during the duration of this contract?

Yes, NO

If No, will your firm be able to acquire the required
coverage within ten (10) days upon notification of
contract award?

Yes NO,
NOTE: Any vendor that conducts business with
Dallas Countv. whether it is for zoods and/or
services, must maintain lawful worker's
compensation/self insured employee coverage
requirements
and adequate li
Paragraph 3

ity limitations. SEE Page 3,

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com
No/Yes
yes
UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE
no
no
no
no
na

Returns can be made by contacting our office.
No returns will be accepted after 60 days of the

VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6
Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer Marks Plumbing Parts Plumbmaster, Inc. Valley Industrial Specialties Secure Detention Products
701 San Marco Blvd PO Box 121554 P.O. Box 850 110 N. Glover Ave. 31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr., Ft. Worth, Texas 76121 Concordville, PA 19331-0850 Chula Vista, CA 91910 Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Jacksonville, F1 32207 Lee Hickey Katie Manley Gene Darby Lance Phillips
John McDonald, Sr VP Sls 817-710-2232 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
800.476.5830 x 114174 fax 817-244-6275 fax 800-259-31435 fax 619-420-3825 fax 951-639-3682
800.476.5848 email: @) m email: bids@) m @vi m @ m
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

no No no we send price list as requested yes
yes Yes no no no
3115 N. Great SW Pkwy Suite 100 3312 Ramona Drive
Grand Prairie. Tx 75050 Ft. Worth. Texas 76116
214.287.5048 817-731-6211
800.476.5830 x 114174 or 115388 817-244-6275

2720 Commodore, Suite 13

Dallas. Texas 75007

972-466-4104

972-466-4104

Yes no no no
ves

No no yes no
no

ves

not indicated

none except shipping UPS or
common carrier

13015

see attached

None

No material will be accepted for return|
without prior authorization, or after

none

UPS Next Day or 3 Day Service
Charge

30 day return policy with up to
25% restock depending on the

none

see attached return policy

none




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2011-103-5732

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND
RELATED PRODUCTS

BUYER: SAM COOPER

OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011
CONTRACT PERIOD:

VENDOR #1

Best Plumbing Speci
PO Box 30
Myersville, Md 21773

Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.)
800-448-6710

fax 900-700-2378

email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com

lties, Inc.

Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed?
TAXPAYER STATUS
A 1and2 itted?

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental
Entities decide to participate in this contract, would
you, the awarded Contractor agree that all terms,
conditions, specifications and pricing would apply to
that entity? Yes No

Information on Provision of Health Insurance
Coverage for Emplovees

Dallas County may consider the provision of
health insurance coverage for employees in the
bid

evaluation process (see page 5, paragraph 4) and
attachment A. Please comnlete the information
below to assist in this evaluation .

Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its emplovees?

Yes No

If your company does provide health insurance
coverage to its employees, does the company share
in

the cost a minimum of 75% for employee only
coverage and 50% for family coverage?

Yes No

If your company provides health insurance coverage
to its emplovees. is the coverage comparable to

the services provided by Dallas County as described
i the attached summary plan description? (See
Attachment A)

Yes No

If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in
the fulfillment of this bid. does each of the

subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to
their emplovees that compares to Dallas County’s
health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

Yes No

In the event Dallas County elects to give a
preference to a bidder who provides comparable
health insurance, that bidder and any
subcontractors will be required to provide
additional documentation of the declared health
insurance coverage.

For statistical purposes:
Please indicate to Dallas County whether the
principal company owner is a: (Please check
one)

[ ] Dallas County Tax Payer
[ ] Other County Tax Payer

Please indicate whether your company is certified
through an agency "other than" North Central Texas
Regional Certification Agency (NCTRCA)?
(Example: Statewide Historically Underutilized
Business (HUB) Program, MBE, WBE, DBE, SBA,
SBA. Veteran. 8(a)

Yes No

If yes, please provide the agency name and the
applicable certification number below:

Certifving Agency Name:

Registration or Certification Number
Expiration Date:

No/Yes

yes

UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE

VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6
Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer Marks Plumbing Parts Plumbmaster, Inc. Valley Industrial Specialties Secure Detention Products
701 San Marco Blvd PO Box 121554 P.O. Box 850 110 N. Glover Ave. 31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr., Ft. Worth, Texas 76121 Concordville, PA 19331-0850 Chula Vista, CA 91910 Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Jacksonville, F1 32207 Lee Hickey Katie Manley Gene Darby Lance Phillips
John McDonald, Sr VP Sls 817-710-2232 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
800.476.5830 x 114174 fax 817-244-6275 fax 800-259-31435 fax 619-420-3825 fax 951-639-3682
800.476.5848 email: lee@) email: bids@ email @vi email @
email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
other other other
yes yes yes yes
UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
yes
Yes
ves ves ves ves
No
ves ves ves n/a
No
ves ves ves n/a
na n/a no
Dallas County other
Tarrant County yes other
No
no ves ves
OSBCR-california Small Business | State of CA - Small / Micro
none # 12944 45018
10/13/2011 11/30/2011
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DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6
BID NO. 2011-103-5732 Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc. Interline Brands Inc. dba Sexauer Marks Plumbing Parts Plumbmaster, Inc. Valley Industrial Specialties Secure Detention Products
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PLUMBING MATERIALS AND PO Box 30 701 San Marco Blvd PO Box 121554 P.O. Box 850 110 N. Glover Ave. 31630 Railroad Canyon Rd., # 14
RELATED PRODUCTS Myersville, Md 21773 Att: Bid Team, 14th FIr., Ft. Worth, Texas 76121 Concordville, PA 19331-0850 Chula Vista, CA 91910 Canyon Lake, CA 92587-9479
Keli Rousseau Ambush (Sls. Mgr.) Jacksonville, F1 32207 Lee Hickey Katie Manley Gene Darby Lance Phillips
BUYER: SAM COOPER 800-448-6710 John McDonald, Sr VP Sls 817-710-2232 800-523-5130 800-451-3076 951-639-3500
fax 900-700-2378 800.476.5830 x 114174 fax 817-244-6275 fax 800-259-31435 fax 619-420-3825 fax 951-639-3682
OPENING DATE: September 12, 2011 email: kambush@bestplumbingonline.com 800.476.5848 email: ) email: bids@) email @vi email @;
CONTRACT PERIOD: email: dogeorge@interlinebrands.com _ _
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? No/Yes No/Yes No/Yes Yes No/Yes No/Yes
TAXPAYER STATUS other other other
A 1and2 itted? yes yes yes yes yes
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Please indicate the manner in which you were
notified of this so n:
[ ] Daily Commercial Record
[ ] Dallas County Website yes
[ ] Letter from Dallas County Purchasing Department letter yes

[ ] Other: specify

Thank you.

150 15

Find RFP Notification




