TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

NCTRCA Certified Vendor
Certifed By Other Agency
EEO1

Dallas County Taxpayer?
How were you notified?

Vehicle Class - Option 1. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

\Did not return form
N\ No

N\ Pid not return form
\ No Response

N\ Other: Bidnet

7777777777777

N 2013 Ford Taurus

>
e
=
o

$686.00

8,232.00

$
$8,232.00

2013 Ford Taurus

>
e
=
o

$589.00

7,068.00

$
$14,136.00

2013 Ford Taurus

V77777777777 /77

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

o
o
S

o o

N
N
Y
Yes
N

o Comments

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger
$0.20

$714.95

8,579.40

$
$8,579.40

N2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

$0.20

$674.95

8,099.40

$
$16,198.80

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

V77777777 /7777 /77 /77777 /7777777

Page 1 of 17

ENDOR #3
AN Holding LLC

7
o<

%
0

200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

odd Burkman
14.688.8320
66.346.2174 fax

S|

ther: St. Louis County
§ Letter from DC

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

[}

o
es
ther: Missouri
Letter from DC

N
N
Y
O

N 2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$486.57

5,838.84
5,838.84

$
$
2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$408.81

4,905.72

$
$9,811.44

2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

V222



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 15,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Forty-Eight (48)
Months with 15,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Sixty (60) Months
with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

»*
e
=
o

$578.00

6,936.00

$
$20,808.00

N2013 Ford Taurus

$0.09

$565.00

6,780.00

$
$27,120.00

2013 Ford Taurus

6,588.00

$
$32,940.00

V7777777 /7 /2

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

»*
o
)
S

$634.95

7,619.40

$
$22,858.20

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger
$0.20

$614.95

7,379.40

$
$29,517.60

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

>
o
)
S

$589.95

7,079.40

$
$35,397.00

V77777777777 /7 /7777

Page 2 of 17

V7772222222222

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

*
1

At

LB

At

P

At

At

P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

$0.10

$389.95

4,679.40

$
$14,038.20

2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$401.96

4,823.52

$
$19,294.08

2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

4,537.44
22,687.20

V22
&h LA



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Vehicle Class - Option 1 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:
Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months

with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

\

\

V7777777777 /777 /777

VENDOR #1

<

erchants Automotive Group

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
Greg McIntyre

N 800.391.1576
N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Chevy Impala LT

$

$

$
$

0.09

1,077.00

12,924.00
12,924.00

2012 Chevy Impala LT

$
$

9,516.00
19,032.00

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

N2012 Camry

8,279.40

$
$8,279.40

\N2012 Camry

>
o
)
S

$649.95

7,799.40

$
$15,598.80

V7777777777 /7777 /7777

Page 3 of 17

V7222222222222

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

At

P

At

At

P

N

N

V72

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313

214.351.6533 (fax)

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

7,594.44

$
$7,594.44

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

5,736.24

$
$11,472.48



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 15,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Forty-Eight (48)
Months with 15,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 1 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Sixty (60) Months
with 15,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Chevy Impala LT

$0.09

\ $696.00

8,352.00
25,056.00

$
$
2012 Chevy Impala LT

$0.09

$635.00

7,620.00

$
$30,480.00

\N2012 Chevy Impala LT

V7777777 77777777/

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

2012 Camry

>
o
)
S

7,379.40

$
$22,138.20

N2012 Camry

$594.95

7,139.40

$
$28,557.60

\N2012 Camry

V777777777 777 777777/ /777

Page 4 of 17

V7222222222222 2Z{Z

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

At

P

At

P

At

At

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE
$0.10

$420.22

5,042.64

$
$15,127.92

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

$387.66

4,651.92

$
$18,607.68

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
heel Drive SE

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWWWWWW/



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

$35,460.00

N\ 2013 Ford Taurus SE

>
e
=
o

$711.00

8,532.00

$
$8,532.00

2013 Ford Taurus SE

>
e
=
o

\ $614.00

7,368.00

$
$14,736.00

N 2013 Ford Taurus SE

V77777777 /777 /77 7/ /7 /%777

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

$33,897.00

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

$0.20

$724.95

8,699.40

$
$8,699.40

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

$0.20

$689.95

8,279.40

$
$16,558.80

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger

V77777777777 /22

Page 5 of 17

V7722222222222 272

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

At

At

P

At

At

P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

$21,100.80

2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$531.92

6,383.04

$
$6,383.04

N 2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S
$0.10

$441.44

5,297.28

$
$10,594.56

N 2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

V2



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 20,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Forty-Eight (48)
Months with 20,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2. Full Size Four (4)
Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Sixty (60) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

»*
e
=
o

$599.00

7,188.00

$
$21,564.00

N 2013 Ford Taurus SE

$0.09

$590.00

7,080.00

$
$28,320.00

N 2013 Ford Taurus SE

6,888.00

$
$34,440.00

V777777777 /7 /2,

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

»*
o
)
S

$649.95

7,799.40

$
$23,398.20

2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
Charger
$0.20

$624.95

7,499.40

$
$29,997.60

N2011 or 2012 Taurus, Impala,
\\ Charger

\ $0.20

$599.95

7,199.40

$
$35,997.00

V777777777 7777/ /7%

Page 6 of 17

V7222222222222 22222272/

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

*
1

At

LB

At

P

At

At

@ P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

$0.10

$421.05

5,052.60

$
$15,157.80

2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$442.36

5,308.32
21,233.28

$
$
N 2012 Nissian Maxima 3.5 S

$0.10

$414.21

4,970.52

$
$24,852.60

V2



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Vehicle Class - Option 2 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Chevy Impala LT

>
e
=
o

$1,102.00

13,224.00

$
$13,224.00

N\ 2012 Chevy Impala LT

>
e
=
o

\ $818.00

9,816.00

$
$19,632.00

N 2012 Chevy Impala LT

V7777777 777 /7 /7 /777777
&+
=

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

2012 Camry

8,399.40
8,399.40

$
$
\N2012 Camry

$0.20

\ $659.95

7,919.40

$
$15,838.80

2012 Camry

$0.20

V777777777 777/ /A7

Page 7 of 17

7724

V7222222222222

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
\N214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

At

*
1

P

At

P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

$678.22

8,138.64

$
$8,138.64

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

$527.60

6,331.20

$
$12,662.40

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

V2



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 20,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Forty-Eight (48)
Months with 20,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 2 Alternate Vehicle: Full
Size Four (4) Door Sedan

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Sixty (60) Months
with 20,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

$719.00

8,628.00

$
$25,884.00

2012 Chevy Impala LT

7,908.00

$
$31,632.00

N2012 Chevy Impala LT

7,392.00

$
$36,960.00

Y,

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
N\ David Cox
214-630-6555
N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

V77777777777 77/ /77777
&+
2
S

$624.95

7,499.40

$
$22,498.20

2012 Camry

7,259.40

$
$29,037.60

\N2012 Camry

7,019.40

$
$35,097.00

Page 8 of 17

V7722222222222 2272

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

At

At

P

At

P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

$469.83

5,637.96

$
$16,913.88

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

5,136.72

$
$20,546.88

2013 Ford Taurus 4dr Front
Wheel Drive SE

$0.10

4,653.24

$
$23,266.20

V7



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Vehicle Class - Option 3. Full Size Four (4)
Door 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Six (6) Months with
12,500 mileage allowance during the six (6)
months lease or rental period

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 3. Full Size Four (4)
Door 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 3. Full Size Four (4)
Door 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Silverado 1500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)

$0.09

$1,019.00

6,114.00

$
$6,114.00

2012 Silverado 1500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)

$0.09

$766.00

9,192.00

$
$9,192.00

2012 Silverado 1500 Crew 4 x 2
\ (Subject to Availability)

$0.09

V77777777777 7777/ /7 /7 /2

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

Engine 2WD

5,325.00

$
$5,325.00

Engine 2WD

10,170.00

$
$10,170.00

Engine 2WD

$0.20

V7777777 77777/ /2

Page 9 of 17

2011 or 2012 Silverado, F150, Gas

2011 or 2012 Silverado, F150, Gas

2011 or 2012 Silverado, F150, Gas

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
\N214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

7724

2011 or newer Ford F150 or
\equivalent

4,230.00
4,230.00

No Bid

At

P

No Bid

V7222222272222

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

No Bid

At

At

P

2012 Ford F-150 XLT 4 x 2
Supercrew

$0.10

$382.32

4,587.84

$
$4,587.84

2012 Ford F-150 XLT 4 x 2
Supercrew

$0.10

V22



VENDOR #3 \ VENDOR #4
EAN Holding LLC Enterprise FM Trust

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012 \ Greg Mclntyre
N 800.391.1576

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313

8555 John Carpenter Fwy. 8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247 \ Dallas, Texas

N\ David Cox N\ Todd Burkman
214-630-6555 \N214.688.8320

7%

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 3. Full Size Four (4)
Door 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 25,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 4. Full Size Four (4)
Door 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Six (6) Months with
12,500 mileage allowance during the six (6)
months lease or rental period

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

N 703.753.7131 fax

$705.00

8,460.00

$
$16,920.00

2012 Silverado 1500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)

7,968.00

$
$23,904.00

2012 Silverado 2500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)

>
e
=
o

$1,035.00

6,210.00

$
$6,210.00

V777777777 7/ 77/ /2 /7777777
&+
=

77222

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

$797.50

9,570.00

$
$19,140.00

\
2011 or 2012 Silverado, F150, Gas \No Bid

Engine 2WD

At

8,850.00

$
$26,550.00

P

\
011 or 2012 Silverado, Gas Enginei

2
2WD \Nequivalent

>
o
)
S

$0.20

$887.50 $1,050.00

5,325.00
5,325.00

$ $6,300.00
$ $6,300.00

V777777777777 //z/A \/z[zu>p/LX’
3
~
4
(=]
27/

Page 10 of 17

866.346.2174 fax

2011 or Newer Ford F250 or

\214.351.6533 (fax)

$428.11

5,137.32

$
$10,274.64

2012 Ford F-150 XLT 4 x 2
Supercrew

$0.10

$409.91

4,918.92

$
$14,756.76

No Bid

V7



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Vehicle Class - Option 4. Full Size Four (4)
Door 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 4. Full Size Four (4)
Door 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 4. Full Size Four (4)
Door 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Silverado 2500 Crew 4 x 2
N (Subject to Availability)

9,288.00

$
$9,288.00

2012 Silverado 2500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)

8,376.00

$
$16,752.00

2012 Silverado 2500 Crew 4 x 2
(Subject to Availability)
$0.09

N Y,

VENDO

7%

N\ 866.669.

10,170

$
$10,170

$
$19,140

77777777/ /7 /7727 /727727 2227/ /777 /27777777777

\2WD
\ $0.20

mmm

R #2

Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
\ David Cox
214-630-6555

7199 fax

011 or 2012 Silverado, Gas Engine

.00
.00

011 or 2012 Silverado, Gas Engine

9,570.00

.00

N2011 or 2012 Silverado, Gas Engine

Page 11 of 17

N

\
\

7724

N

N

V7722222222722

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

No Bid

At

P

No Bid

At

P

No Bid

$-

\ VENDOR #4
N Enterprise FM Trust

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313

\
\
\
N\
§Po Box 800089
N\
\
N\
§214.351.6533 (fax)
N
\

6,101.52
6,101.52

Z
» &

6,105.00
12,210.00

7%
» »

§2012 Ram 2500 Crewcab



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 25,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle

Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 5. Sport Utility Vehicle
(sU¥)
Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Six (6) Months with
12,500 mileage allowance during the six (6)
months lease or rental period

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 5. Sport Utility Vehicle
(sU¥)

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twelve (12) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 5. Sport Utility Vehicle
(sU¥)

VENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

$667.00

8,004.00

$
$24,012.00

2012 Chevy Traverse LS FWD
(Subject to Availabilty)
$0.09

$1,049.00

6,294.00

$
$6,294.00

2012 Chevy Traverse LS FWD
(Subject to Availabilty)

>
e
=
o

$1,029.00

12,348.00

$
$12,348.00

Y

VENDOR #2
Capps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247

N\ David Cox

214-630-6555

N\ 866.669.7199 fax

7%

$737.50

8,850.00

$
$26,550.00

2012 4-Runner or Similar GAS
Engine 2WD
$0.20

$914.50

5,487.00

$
$5,487.00

2012 4-Runner or Similar GAS
Engine 2WD

10,494.00

$
$10,494.00

V7777777777777 77 /7 777/ /772

Page 12 of 17

V7722222722222 222222222 2ZxLo ¢/

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

2011 or newer Ford Explorer or
equivalent
$0.20

$805.00

4,830.00

$
$4,830.00

No Bid

At

At

P

\ VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Michael F. Maguire
214.351.0313
\N214.351.6533 (fax)

$493.29

5,919.48

$
$17,758.44

No Bid

At

P

Nissan Pathfinder S 4 x 2

$0.10

$476.62

5,719.44

$
$5,719.44

777



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Twenty (24) Months
with 25,000 mileage allowance per year - Rate per
Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Vehicle Class - Option 5. Sport Utility Vehicle
(sU¥)

Specify Make and Model Type Proposing

Excess Mileage Charge During Lease/Rental
Period:

Lease/Rental Term Duration: Thirty-Six (36)
Months with 25,000 mileage allowance per year -
Rate per Month

Annual Cost/Per Vehicle
Total Cost - Duration of Lease/Rental Terms/Per
Vehicle

Specify Monthly Cost for Automobile Insurance
Coverage (Liability - Combined single limit bodily
injury and property damage of not less than
$400,000.00, Collision and Comprehensive) for
the following types of vehicles:

Vehicle Type: Full Size Four (4) Door Sedan
Deductible: $250.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $500.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $1,000.00/per month/per vehicle

<

ENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

2012 Chevy Traverse LS FWD
(Subject to Availabilty)

9,348.00

$
$18,696.00

2012 Chevy Traverse LS FWD
(Subject to Availabilty)

$0.09

$698.00

8,376.00

$
$25,128.00

250.00
200.00
175.00

Y
@+ LB~

<

ENDOR #2
apps Van & Truck Rental

Q

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
David Cox

214-630-6555
866.669.7199 fax

[

012 4-Runner or Similar GAS
ngine 2WD

es!

9,894.00

$
$19,788.00

[

012 4-Runner or Similar GAS
ngine 2WD

es!

9,174.00

$
$27,522.00

o Bid
o Bid

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWWMM
&+

Page 13 of 17

167.50

N

V7222222222227 A

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.

Dallas, Texas
Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

No Bid

At

At

P

No Bid

At

At

P

included in the price
included in the price
included in the price

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

N\ PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
\Michael F. Maguire
N214.351.0313

214.351.6533 (fax)

4

Nissan Pathfinder S 4 x 2

$0.10

$441.43

5,297.16

$
$10,594.32

Nissan Pathfinder S 4 x 2

$0.10

$458.26

5,499.12

$
$16,497.36

150.00
145.00
140.00

V24
@+ LB~



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Vehicle Type: Full Size Four (4) Door 1/2 Ton
Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Deductible: $250.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $500.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $1,000.00/per month/per vehicle

Vehicle Type: Full Size Four (4) Door 3/4 Ton
Crew Cab Pick-up Truck

Deductible: $250.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $500.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $1,000.00/per month/per vehicle

Vehicle Type: Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV)
Deductible: $250.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $500.00/per month/per vehicle
Deductible: $1,000.00/per month/per vehicle

Service Charge for Early Lease/Rental
Termination other than funding non-appropriation
stated below: Note:
Lease/Rental Agreements or any continuing
contracts are solicited and awarded based on
governmental fiscal funding. If for any reason,
funds are not appropriated to continue the
lease/rental agreement, the said
agreement/contract shall be automatically
terminated on the expiration date or date in which
the funds have been eliminated. Any/all
services/leased/rental vehicles and/or equipment
will be removed from the respective county
department/facilities without penalty or additional
charge to Dallas County. Any/all charges incurred
as a result of this action are the responsibility of

<

ENDOR #1

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

250.00
200.00
175.00

@ LB P

250.00
200.00
175.00

@ LB L

$250.00
$200.00
$175.00

\early termination

Y,

erchants Automotive Group

See attached for details regarding

Q<

o Bid
o Bid

w Z Z

o Bid
o Bid

w Z Z

o Bid
o Bid

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWWM
&+

ENDOR #2
apps Van & Truck Rental

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
David Cox
214-630-6555
866.669.7199 fax

Page 14 of 17

167.50

167.50

167.50

$100.00 per month/per vehicle

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

Dallas, Texas
Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

\Nincluded in the price
included in the price
included in the price

included in the price
included in the price
\Nincluded in the price

\Nincluded in the price
\Nincluded in the price
included in the price

$0.00

V77227227222 22/ /Z22/2 2 2x<2}V /22272222722

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

N PO Box 800089

4

\Michael F. Maguire
N214.351.0313
214.351.6533 (fax)

LRI LR

LRI

Agreement

V2

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089

150.00
145.00
140.00

150.00
145.00
140.00

150.00
145.00
140.00

See Master Walkaway Lease



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

<

ENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

<

ENDOR #2
apps Van & Truck Rental

Q

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

4

1278 Hooksett Rd. 8555 John Carpenter Fwy. 8200 John Carpenter Frwy. N PO Box 800089
Hooksett, NH 03106 Dallas, Texas 75247 Dallas, Texas Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012 \ Greg Mclntyre David Cox Todd Burkman \ Michael F. Maguire
N 800.391.1576 214-630-6555 214.688.8320 \N214.351.0313
N 703.753.7131 fax 866.669.7199 fax 866.346.2174 fax \N214.351.6533 (fax)

72272222

72

Specify any additional comments, deviations, cost,
etc. included with your bid proposal, if applicable:

See attachments regarding 1) Full
Maintenance Program Covered \monted tool box

No charge for use of pick-up bed 1) Would like to bid on any 6

month needs for Fullsize Cars

any):

\ \

§ §

N\ N\

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

\ \

§Items § 2011 or newer Chevy Impala or §for 1 million combined single

§ § %Equiv.alent at $67Q.00/per month §limit. 2) Prices inclludc? exemt

§ § §Z)In lieu of providing auto physical § and non-exempt plates in Dallas

§ § %damage insurance, Contractor shall§County, Tx. Plates, if needed,

§ § § provide damage waiver for rentals §out—of—county will be billed at

§ § %hereunder which shall, subject to §actua1 cost. 3) See Exhibit A

§ § %compliance with the terms of the §(Master Walkway Lease

§ § § rental agreement contractually §Agreement, Maintenance

§ § %waive the City's and Renter's §Agreement, Master Walkway

§ § § ibility for all th ts of %L A t Addend 4

N \ § responsibility for all the costs o \ ease Agreemen endum) 4)

§ § §damage to loss, or theft of the §Submission is based on

§ § %rental vehicle and related costs §successfu1 execution of submitted

§ § %regardless of fault or negligence. §contact.

§ § §Our damage waiver is included in §

§ § §the price with $0.00 deducttible. §

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ N\ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ N\ \

\ \ \ \

. \ \ .

\ \ N\ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ N\ \

\ \ N\ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \
Should your firm be awarded this contract, §No Comments §None §No §Utilizing local maintenance/repair
describe what (if any) portion of the bid § § § §shops. List available upon
requirements will be subcontracted out: § § § §request.

\ \ \ \

\ \ \ \

\ \ N\ \

\ \ \ \
Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms (if §Net 30 Days §No Comments §0% §0%

\ \ \ \

Page 15 of 17



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Specify Location(s) and Operational Hours of
Lease/ Rental Agency Pick-up and Drop-off Sites
(if additional space is required a separate
attachments page is allowed).

Please answer the questions listed below:

Did your company check Dallas County website
(http://www.dallascounty.org/department/purchasi
ng/currentbids.html) for any addendums,

updates, and/or changes to the bid solicitation?

Specify the name, telephone number and email
address of the account representative who will be
handling and managing this account:

Note: It is the responsibility of the awarded bidder
to notify Dallas County of any account
representative and/or contact person

changes.

Does your firm/company have the required
insurance coverage stated under SECTION 3 -
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and agree
to comply with these requirements during the
duration of this contract?

If No, will your firm be able to acquire the
required coverage within ten (10) days upon
notification of contract award?

<

ENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

=~
2

o
3

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWWMM

\ See attach for the list of providers

Greg Mclntyre, 571.261.3500,
regmcintyre@merchantsleasing.c

<

ENDOR #2
apps Van & Truck Rental

Q

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
David Cox

214-630-6555

866.669.7199 fax

N\ 1) Capps, 8555 John Carpenter
N Frwy., Dallas, Tx 75247,

///////////////////////////////////////////////////////////////ﬁ

N\ Sun 10-2 2) Capps, 12235 Self
Plaza Dr., Dallas, Tx 75218,

7777

N\ Sun 10-2.

1) Joel Garza, 214.630.6555,

N\ Bryan Hughes, 214.630.6555,
\ hughes@gocapps.com

V7777777777 777/

Page 16 of 17

214.630.6555, M-F 730-6, Sat 9-1,

\N214.638.8267, M-F 730-6 Sat 9-1,

garza@gocapps.com, 2) Alternative:

VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas
Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

////////////////////////////////////////////////////////////////

\ 1) Enterprise Rent A Car, 1920
\Elm St., Dallas, Tx 75201,

7

\ Saturday 9am - 12 noon, closed

7%

N 2820 Oaklawn Ave., Dallas, Tx
75219, 2820 Oaklawn Ave.,
\Dallas, Tx 75219, 214.522.0395,

724

- 12noon, closed Sunday

kristy.n.stephens@ehi.com, 2)
Daniel Prohaska, 214.688.0900,
daniel.j.prohaska@ehi.com

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWWW

N214.939.2192, M-F 730am - 6pm,

\ Sunday 2) Enterprise Rent-A-Car,

M-F 730am-600pm, Saturday 9am

) Kristy Stephens, 817.829.3788,

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

N PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
\Michael F. Maguire
\N214.351.0313

214.351.6533 (fax)

////////////////////////////////%

1) Enterprise Fleet Management,
1341 W. Mockingbird Ln.,
N#1000E, Dallas, Tx 75247,
214.351.0313, 8am - Spm M-F
§ 2) Enterprise Rent A Car, (See
Exhibit B for listing of locations
\ & hours)

7

7

M

\ 1) Kenni Dwyer,

\214 351.0392x137,
Kenni.L.Dwyer@efleets.com 2)
\ Brian McGhee,
\N214.351.0392x164,

\ Brian.McGhee@fleets.com

W/WWWWWWWW

V7



TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2012-041-5917 Annual Contract for
Short and Long Term Lease of Vehicles

Opening Date: 13-Feb-2012

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other
Governmental Entities decide to participate in this
contract, would you, the awarded Contractor
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and
pricing would apply to that entity?

Information on Provision of Health Insurance
Coverage for Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health
insurance coverage for employees in the bid evaluation
process (see page 5, paragraph 5). Please complete the
information below to assist in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance
coverage to its employees, does the company share in
the cost a minimum of:

90% for employee only coverage?

65% for family coverage?

¢) If your company provides health insurance coverage
to its employees, is the coverage comparable to the
services provided by Dallas County as described in the
attached summary plan description? (See Attachment -
A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the
fulfillment of this bid, does each of the subcontractors
provide health insurance coverage to their employees
that compares to Dallas County’s health insurance
coverage and share in the cost?

<

ENDOR #1
erchants Automotive Group

<

1278 Hooksett Rd.
Hooksett, NH 03106
\ Greg Mclntyre

N 800.391.1576

N 703.753.7131 fax

nformation

4

~
&

< =<
2 g

~
&

WWWWWWWWWWWWWWW
o

\\ Yes - Subject to review of financial

N,

<

ENDOR #2
apps Van & Truck Rental

Q

8555 John Carpenter Fwy.
Dallas, Texas 75247
David Cox

214-630-6555
866.669.7199 fax

=~
2

~
&

z zZ
o °

~
&

Z
>
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VENDOR #3
EAN Holding LLC

8200 John Carpenter Frwy.
Dallas, Texas

Todd Burkman
214.688.8320
866.346.2174 fax

VENDOR #4
Enterprise FM Trust

N\ PO Box 800089

Kansas City, MO 64180-0089
\Michael F. Maguire
N214.351.0313

N\ 214.351.6533 (fax)

4

=<

~
&

No Comments

V772



