DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Crackers Saltine — Kell or Keebler
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cracker — Ritz Type

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Crackers — Sandwich Type
Flavor: Peanut Butter

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.5 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Crackers — Sandwich Type
Flavor: Toast-Peanut Butter
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.5 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Crackers — Sandwich Type
Flavor: Cheese-Peanut Butter
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.5 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE

None

Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

14.59 43.77
2 count
500/2 count
Kellogg/Sunshine 816033

33.50 33.50
40z
20
Ritz 817411

27.36 273.60

1.38 oz
144
Frito 815860

No bid 0.00

27.36 410.40

1.38 oz
144




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

M/WBE STATUS Non M/WBE
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION None
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Specify Brand Being Bid: Frito 815894
Crackers — Honey Graham 2 cases 23.74 47.48
One serving
Individual Wrapped
Size: 1.5 oz. bags
Specify Size Being Proposed: 2 count
Specify Quantity per Case: 200
Specify Brand Being Bid: Keebler 818062
Crackers — Cheddar Cheese 2 cases 28.14 56.28
One serving
Individual Wrapped
Size: 1.5 oz.
Specify Size Being Proposed: 5 count
Specify Quantity per Case: 24
Specify Brand Being Bid: Austin 815886
Crackers-Sandwich Type — Cheese/Peanut Butter 2 cases 23.74 47.48
Size: 1.5 oz
Individual Wrapped
Specify Size Being Proposed: 2 count
Specify Quantity per Case: 200
Specify Brand Being Bid: Frito 815894
Potato Chips — Plain 50 cases 28.5 1,425.00
One serving bag
Size: 1.5 oz. bags
Specify Bag Size Being Proposed: 1.50z
Specify Quantity per Case: 64
Specify Brand Being Bid: Lay's 816769
Potato Chips — BBQ 70 cases 28.3 1,981.00
One serving bag
Size: 1.5 oz. bags




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Potato Chips — Sour Cream

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Potato Chips — Baked

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Corn Chips — Plain

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Corn Chips — BBQ

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Doritos Chips - Bake Nachos Cheese
Size: 64 pack
Specify Size Being Proposed:

20 cases

10 cases

20 cases

20 cases

2 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

1.50z
64
Lay's 816744

28.50
Sour cream & Onion

1.50z
64
Lay's 816785
19.15

0.875 0z
60
Lay's 816884

28.50
20z
64

Fritos 816942

No Bid

27.34

.750z

570.00

191.50

570.00

0.00

54.68




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cheese Twists or Cheetos Crunch
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cheese Twists or Cheetos Baked
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Tortilla Chips — Nacho Cheese Flavor
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Tortilla Chips — Ranch Flavor
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Tortilla Chips — Baked Nacho Cheese Flavor
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:

20 cases

20 cases

20 cases

20 cases

10 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

88
Doritos 816066

29.35

20z

64

Cheetos 816991

31.60

.875 0z

104

Cheetos 816876

31.60

10z

104

Doritos 816926

28.50

1.75 0z

64

Doritos 816892

27.72

1.37 oz

587.00

632.00

632.00

570.00

277.20




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Tortilla Chips — Corn Plain

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Round or Triangle Nacho Chips
Size: 2-4 pound box (bulk package)
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pretzel — Twist

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Popcorn — Un-popped , Yellow Bulk
Size: 35 - 50 pounds (maximum)
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Popcorn — Plain Butter Flavor
One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

64
Doritos 816587

No bid

8.24
3 pound
2
Cardona 908350

27.34
10z
88
Rold Gold 817049
30.72
50 pounds
1

Packer 875690

No bid

0.00

82.40

136.70

30.72

0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE

None

Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Popcorn — Cheese Flavor 5 cases

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cracker Jacks

One serving bag

Size: 1.5 oz. bags

Specify Bag Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Granola Bar

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.6 oz. bar

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Quaker Granola Bar Chewy Chocolate Chip
Size: 12 pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Quaker Granola Bar — Peanut Butter Chocolate Chip
Size: 12 pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

31.97

.625 oz
104
Lay's 817445

No bid

29.06

8 count

Peanut Butter, Choc Chip
12

Quaker 8143227

37.06
.89 oz
120
Quaker 814442

29.06
8 count

12
Quaker 814327

159.85

0.00

145.30

74.12

29.06




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

BID NO: 2012-088-6129 CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Fort Worth, TX 76106
STAPLE FOODS 254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507

elutton@cd-hartnett.com

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options

M/WBE STATUS Non M/WBE
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION None
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer

BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Cookies — Sandwich Type 10 cases 16.84 168.40
Flavor: Vanilla Créeme
One serving
Individual Wrapped
Size: 1.8 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed: 2120z

Specify Quantity per Case: 60

Specify Brand Being Bid: Grandma's 818609

Cookies — Sandwich Type 10 cases |No bid 0.00
Flavor: Lemon Créme

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.8 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies — Sandwich Type 10 cases 27.22 272.20
Flavor: Chocolate w/Vanilla Creme
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.8 oz. package

Specify Size Being Proposed: 2 count

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies — Sandwich Type
Flavor: Peanut Butter

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.8 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

120
Oreos 817569

No bid

0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies — Chocolate Chips
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 1.8 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies — Fig Newton

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 2.0 oz. package
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies — Vanilla Wafers

in a moisture proof lined container
Size: 10 — 16 0z. box (maximum)
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cookies - Nabisco Oreo
Size: 120 pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Snack Cake — Oatmeal Créme
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:

No bid

No bid

12.74

13.3 0z
6
Keebler 816124

41
4 pack
120

Oreo 817544

No bid

0.00

0.00

12.74

82.00

0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Snack Cup Cake — Chocolate
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Snack Cup Cake — Vanilla
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Honey Bun

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pecan Pie

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Cinnamon Roll

One serving

Individual Wrapped

Specify Size Being Proposed:

5 cases

5 cases

2 cases

2 cases

2 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

No bid

No bid

5.22

1
9
Mrs. Freshley 912949

No bid

No bid

0.00

0.00

10.44

0.00

0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

BID NO: 2012-088-6129 CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Fort Worth, TX 76106
STAPLE FOODS 254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012 elutton@cd-hartnett.com
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13

Annual Contract with 2 extension options

M/WBE STATUS Non M/WBE
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION None
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Donuts - Gems 1 case |No bid 0.00
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 3.0 oz.

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Donuts — Powdered 1 case [No bid 0.00
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 3.0 oz. package

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Donuts - Plain 1 case |No bid 0.00
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 3.0 oz. package

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Donuts — Chocolate Covered 1 case |No bid 0.00
One serving

Individual Wrapped

Size: 3.0 oz. package

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

BID NO: 2012-088-6129 CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Fort Worth, TX 76106
STAPLE FOODS 254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507

elutton@cd-hartnett.com

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options

M/WBE STATUS Non M/WBE
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION None
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer

BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Pastry - Muffins 10 cases 18.40 184.00
One serving
Individual Wrapped

Size: 4.0 oz. package
Otis Spunkmeyer or equal
Wild Blueberry/910562; Banana/912089;

Cheese Streusel/910539; Banana
Bread/913558; Chocolate Chunk/913640; Triple

Specify Flavor Available: Berry/913657

Specify Size Being Proposed: 40z

Specify Quantity per Case: 24

Specify Brand Being Bid: Otis Spunkmeyer

Sugar Pure Cane — Individual Packets 60 cases 18.32 1,099.20
Specify Size Being Proposed: 3 gram

Specify Quantity per Case: 2000

Specify Brand Being Bid: CD Hartnett 805473

Sugar Substitute - Individual Packets 20 cases 21.74 434.80
Sweet & Low Bid shows $1304.40

Specify Size Being Proposed: 1 gram

Specify Quantity per Case: 2000

Specify Brand Being Bid: Sweet n Low 806166

Sugar Substitute - Individual Packets 5 cases 34.32 171.60
Splenda

Specify Size Being Proposed: 1 gram

Specify Quantity per Case: 2000

Specify Brand Being Bid: Splenda 808030

Creamer — Non Dairy 50 cases 38.59 1,929.50
Individual Packets

Specify Size Being Proposed: 2.5gram

Specify Quantity per Case: 200

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Restaurants Pride 845438




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Folgers Coffee Auto Drip
33.9 oz can

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pizza - Sausage

Size: 4.78 oz, 96 per case
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Pizza - Pepperoni

Size: 4.65 oz, 96 per case
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Blue Bell Ice Cream - Vanilla and Chocolate
Size: 3 oz cup, 36 per case

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Popcorn Yellow, 50 Ibs ea
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Kellogg Corn Flakes — % oz
96 per case

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

2 cases

3 cases

2 cases

6 cases

4 cases

4 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE

None

Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

70.10 140.20

3390z
6
Folgers 811174

48.70 146.10

4.78 oz
96
Tony's 940585

48.20 96.40

4.65 oz
96
Tony's 939348

11.95 71.70
Bid shows 23.90
3oz
36
Blue Bell Vanilla/944694; Chocolate 944702

30.72 122.88
See ltem #24

36.82 147.28
30 grams
96

General Mills 808543




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Beverages

Gatorade Thirst Quencher

Bottle Size: 20 oz. (maximum)
Flavor: Assorted

Specify Bottle Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Gatorade Thirst Quencher

Bottle Size: 32 oz. (maximum)
Flavor: Assorted

Specify Bottle Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Gatorade X-Factor Variety

Bottle Size: 32 oz. (maximum)
Flavor: Assorted

Specify Bottle Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Gatorade Drink Mix

Size: Mix 2 %, gallon yield

Flavors: Fruit Punch, Glacier Freeze, Riptide Rush, Lemon
Lime

400 cases

50 cases

50 cases

100 gallong

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE

None

Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

2219 8,876.00

833699 Raspberry Blue
833715 Lemon Lime
833723 Orange

833731 Fruit Punch
834135 Fierce Grape

24

Gatorade

No bid 0.00
No bid 0.00
No bid 0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Specify Bottle Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered Mix
Flavor: Lemonade

Yield: Two (2) Gallon

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered Mix
Flavor: Pink Lemonade

Yield: Two (2) Gallon

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered Mix
Flavor: Fruit Punch

Yield: Two (2) Gallon

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Drink Mix — Concentrated Powdered Mix
Flavor: Iced Tea

Yield: Two (2) Gallon

Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Drink Mix — Instant Gatorade Sport
Thirst Quencher Powdered Mix

30 cases

70 cases

70 cases

70 cases

50 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

27.96

24 oz
12
Restaurants Pride 825919

27.96

24 oz

12

Rest. Pride 825836

27.96

24 oz

12

Rest. Pride 825901

No bid

No bid

838.80

1,957.20

1,957.20

0.00

0.00




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF
STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS

OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS

BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

Yield: Two and half (2.5) Gallons
Flavor: Assorted

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Flavors Available:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Soda — Sprite

Size: 24 Pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Soda - Coke

Size: 24 Pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Soda - Dr Pepper

Size: 24 Pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Soda - Diet Coke

Size: 24 Pack

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Bottled Water

Size: 8 0z

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

5 cases

5 cases

5 cases

5 cases

5 cases

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507

Ed Lutton, District Manager

elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE
None
Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

11.07
120z
24
Sprite 825158

11.07
120z
24
Coke Classic 825091

9.8

120z
24

Dr. Pepper 825497

11.07
120z
24
Diet Coke 825141
8.47
8oz
48

55.35

55.35

49.00

55.35

42.35




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NO: 2012-088-6129

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF

STAPLE FOODS

OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13
Annual Contract with 2 extension options
M/WBE STATUS
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION
TAXPAYER STATUS
BID NOTIFICATION

DESCRIPTION

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Bottled Water

Size: 10 oz

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Glacier Clear Water Purified
Size: 16.9 oz

Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

Bottle Water

Size: One gallon, 6 gallons per case
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Oil - Corn 100% Pure

Container Size: 35 — 50 pounds (maximum)
Specify Size Being Proposed:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Brand Being Bid:

Shortening — All Vegetable
Container Size: One (1) Gallon
Specify Size Being Proposed:
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Brand Being Bid:

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

65 cases

2 cases

20 cases

40 cases

1 case

TOTAL

Describe what portion of the requirements will be subcontrated

VENDOR #1

VENDOR #2

VENDOR #3

VENDOR #4

CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
Fort Worth, TX 76106
254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
elutton@cd-hartnett.com

Non M/WBE

None

Other County Taxpayer

Letter from Purchasing Department

Nestle Pure Life 833228

4.39 285.35
10 oz
24
Glacier Clear 833426

4.79 9.58
16.9 oz
24
Glacier Clear 833269
No Bid 0.00
No Bid 0.00
No Bid 0.00

28,332.01




DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3 VENDOR #4

BID NO: 2012-088-6129 CD HARTNETT CO

Ed Lutton, District Manager
4151 Blue Mound Road
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF Fort Worth, TX 76106
STAPLE FOODS 254-715-5004

Fax: 817-626-2507
OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 27, 2012 elutton@cd-hartnett.com
CONTRACT PERIOD: 11/6/12 through 11/5/13

Annual Contract with 2 extension options

M/WBE STATUS Non M/WBE
OTHER MINORITY CERTIFICATION None
TAXPAYER STATUS Other County Taxpayer
BID NOTIFICATION Letter from Purchasing Department
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED
QUANTITY
Have Product in Stock? Yes
Additional Comments Sometimes we need time to procure certain items
especially when large quantities are ordered




