TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #1
Bob Barker
Company Inc.
134 N. Main St.

Fuquay, NC

27523

800-334-9880
800-322-7537 fax

Nenna Mann
nennamann@bobbarker.com

VENDOR #2
BT Clothing LLC

4690 West El Dorado Parkway
#116

McKinney, Texas

75070

469-288-2433

Anthony Palmer
btclothingllc@gmail.com

VENDOR #3
Carolina Textiles

P.O. Box 11211

Charlotte, NC
28220
704-525-1272
704-525-0607 fax
Bob Jones

carolinatextiles@n

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Whbe) No Yes No
Certified By Other Agency No No
EEO1 Form Completed Yes No No
Dallas County Taxpayer? No No No
How were you notified? DC Website Letter from DC Email
Sample provided (Boxer shorts) Yes No No
samples for all garments quoted Yes No No
1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the followina sizes:
a. Size: 28 -small 8 dz. 13.88 $111.04 10.98 $87.84/10.72 $85.76
b. Size: 30 - small 8 dz. 13.88 $111.04 10.98 $87.84/10.72 $85.76
c. Size: 32 -med 30 dz. 13.88 $416.40 10.98 $329.40(10.72 $321.60
d. Size:34 - med 500 dz. 13.88 $6,940.00 10.98 $5,490.00{10.72 $5,360.00
e. Size: 36 - large 1,062 dz. 13.88 $14,740.56 10.98 $11,660.76/10.72 $11,384.64
f. Size: 38 - large 1,062 dz. 13.88 $14,740.56 10.98 $11,660.76/10.72 $11,384.64
g. Size: 40 - x large 1,060 dz. 13.88 $14,712.80 10.98 $11,638.80(10.72 $11,363.20
h. Size: 42 - x large 1,060 dz. 15.20 $16,112.00 10.98 $11,638.80(10.72 $11,363.20
i. Size: 44 - 2 xlarge 500 dz. 15.20 $7,600.00 10.98 $5,490.00{10.72 $5,360.00
j. Size: 46 - 2 x large 500 dz. 16.68 $8,340.00 10.98 $5,490.00{10.72 $5,360.00
k. Size: 48 - 3 x large 300 dz. 16.68 $5,004.00 10.98 $3,294.00{10.72 $3,216.00
I. Size: 50 -3 x large 100 dz. 18.20 $1,820.00 10.98 $1,098.00{11.30 $1,130.00
m. Size: 52 -4 x large 100 dz. 18.20 $1,820.00 10.98 $1,098.00{11.30 $1,130.00
n. Size: 54 -4 x large 50 dz. 20.44 $1,022.00 10.98 $549.00{11.30 $565.00
0. Size: 56 -5 x large 50 dz. 20.44 $1,022.00 10.98 $549.00{11.30 $565.00
p. Size: 58 -5 x large 50 dz. 22.00 $1,100.00 10.98 $549.00(14.17 $708.50
q. Size: 60 -5 x large 1 dz. 22.00 $22.00 10.98 $10.98|14.17 $14.17
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC Item # Hanes Boxers
EBXLSQ see
attached specs
Section Total $95,634.40 $70,722.18 $69,397.47
vendor total $70,766.10)
sold by Alpha Sizing only small thru 10xIg - with
inseams 3 1/2 " thru 5 3/4"and outseam 15" thru 19
172"
3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green, Light Blue, Navy,
Ash and Yellow
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes:
a. Size: Small 10 dz. 31.20 $312.00 9.12 $91.20|no bid
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. 31.20 $312.00 9.12 $91.20|no bid
c. Size: Large 20 dz. 31.20 $624.00 9.12 $182.40|no bid
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. 31.20 $780.00 9.12 $228.00|no bid
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. 47.88 $957.60 10.00 $200.00{no bid
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. 47.88 $239.40 10.00 $50.00|no bid
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. 47.88 $239.40 11.20 $56.00|no bid
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Port Authority Hanes
ZPC61 see attached
specs
Section Total $3.464.40 $898.80 no bid
3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: Small 10 dz. no bid 24.70 $247.00{no bid
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. no bid 24.70 $247.00(no bid
c. Size: Large 20 dz. no bid 24.70 $494.00{no bid
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. no bid 24.70 $617.50{no bid
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. no bid 27.10 $542.00{no bid
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. no bid 27.10 $135.50{no bid
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. no bid 27.10 $135.50{no bid
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Hanes
Section Total no bid $2,418.50 no bid
Total for 3A & 3B award all or none $3,317.30
Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B
Men’s V-Neck T-Shirts will be awarded on all
none basis
4. Crew Neck Pullover Sweatshirts, as per bid specifications.
Colors: Gold and Gray
a. Size: Small 20 each 5.50 $110.00 7.48 $149.60(5.52 $110.40
b. Size: Medium 50 each 5.50 $275.00 7.48 $374.00(5.52 $276.00
c. Size: Large 100 each 5.50 $550.00 7.48 $748.00(5.52 $552.00
d. Size: X-Large 150 each 5.50 $825.00 7.48 $1,122.00|5.52 $828.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 50 each 6.80 $340.00 8.07 $403.50(7.00 $350.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 20 each 6.80 $136.00 8.07 $161.40(7.00 $140.00
g. Size: 4X-Large 20 each 8.00 $160.00 8.07 $161.40(7.00 $140.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Hanes Gildan for Jerzee
Section Total Gold and Gray $2,396.00 $3,119.90 $2,396.40
vendor extension vendor extension
$2,286.00 $2,970.30
5. Women’s Panties, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: 5 140 dz. 6.90 $966.00 8.20 $1,148.00(8.21 $1,149.40
b. Size: 6 140 dz. 6.90 $966.00 8.20 $1,148.00(8.21 $1,149.40
c. Size: 7 140 dz. 8.20 $1,148.00(8.21 $1,149.40
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #1
Bob Barker
Company Inc.
134 N. Main St.

Fuquay, NC
27523
800-334-9880
800-322-7537 fax
Nenna Mann

nennamann@bobbarker.com

VENDOR #2
BT Clothing LLC

4690 West El Dorado Parkway

#116

McKinney, Texas
75070
469-288-2433

Anthony Palmer

btclothingllc@gmail.com

VENDOR #3
Carolina Textiles

P.O. Box 11211

Charlotte, NC
28220
704-525-1272
704-525-0607 fax
Bob Jones

carolinatextiles@n

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
d. Size: 8 140 dz. 6.90 $966.00 8.20 $1,148.00|8.21 $1,149.40
e. Size: 9 140 dz. 7.70 $1,078.00 9.40 $1,316.00/9.32 $1,304.80
f. Size: 10 140 dz. 7.70 $1,078.00 9.40 $1,316.00/9.32 $1,304.80
g. Size: 11 100 dz. 7.70 $770.00 9.40 $940.00(9.32 $932.00
h. Size: 12 100 dz. 8.20 $820.00 9.40 $940.00(9.99 $999.00
i. Size: 13 100 dz. 8.20 $820.00 10.60 $1,060.00/9.99 $999.00
j. Size: 14 100 dz. 9.70 $970.00 10.60 $1,060.00/9.99 $999.00
k. Size: 16 100 dz. 9.70 $970.00 10.60 $1,060.00/9.99 $999.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC Item # Just my size - Hanes FMC
ELBLCTN see
attached specs
Section Total $10,370.00 $12,284.00 $12,135.20
6. Sport Bras, as per bid specifications
Color: White and/or Black
Brand: Champion or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes
a. Size: Small 125 dz. 19.53 $2,441.25 19.52 $2,440.00|22.83 $2,853.75
b. Size: Medium 125 dz. 19.53 $2,441.25 19.52 $2,440.00|22.83 $2,853.75
c. Size: Large 125 dz. 19.53 $2,441.25 19.52 $2,440.00|22.83 $2,853.75
d. Size: X-Large 125 dz. 19.53 $2,441.25 19.52 $2,440.00|22.83 $2,853.75
e. Size: 2X- 3X 300 dz. 20.22 $6,066.00 19.52 $5,856.00/24.33 $7,299.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC item # Champion FM
EBASPLS see
attached specs
Section Total $15.831.00 $15.616.00 $18.714.00
7. Over the Calf Style (Tube) Socks, as per bid 400 dz 5.54 $2,216.00| no bid 5.32 $2,128.00
specifications,
Color: White
Brand: Champion or equal
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC item # FM
SKTW22 see
attached specs
Section Total $2.216.00 no bid $2.128.00
8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications
Colors: White and Gray
Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal
8A. Size (Men) 10-13 33 dz. 4.90 $161.70 7.07 $233.31(5.20 $171.60
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC item # Champion Cotton Plus
SKTW22 see
attached specs
8B. Size (Women) 9-11) 167 dz. 4.90 $818.30 9.12 $1,523.04(5.20 $868.40
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid BBC item # Champion Cotton Plus
SKTW22 see
attached specs
Section Total $980.00 $1,756.35 $1,040.00
Bid Total $130,891.80 $106,815.73 $105,811.07
Total Award $2,396.00
Is this an all or none bid? No No Response No
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchase 5-30 days ARO 30- 45 days 30
order:
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with n/a none
your bid proposal, if applicable:
Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide to| Yes Yes Yes
participate in this contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agrees
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?
Specify the name and telephone number of the account representative | Trish Powell 800-334-9880 Anthony Palmer 469- Bob Jones 704-525-

who will be handling this account:

Specify Payment Terms

Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for
Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance coverage
for employees in the bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 5).
Please complete the information below to assist in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage?

c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its
employees, is the coverage comparable to the services provided by
Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan description?
(See Attachment - A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of
this bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance
coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas County’s health
insurance coverage and share in the cost?

trishpowell@bobbarker.com

0%-Net 30 days

Yes

No -Employee
Yes - Family

Yes
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288-2433 btclothingllc@gmail.com

0%day

No

1272 carolinatextiles@netzero.com

net 30

No - I have no
employees
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #4
Charm-Tex

1618 Coney Island Ave.

Brooklyn, NY
11230
718-252-8100
718-258-8303 fax
Stan Denzger

stan@charm-

VENDOR #5
JNC Supplies, Inc.

367 Windsor
Hiahway,  Suite
New Windor, NY
12553

845-402-8900
845-402-8901 fax
Joe Walter
joe@incsupplies.com

VENDOR #6
Murray and
Company

PO Box 220586

Charlotte, NC
282222
704-333-5274
704-332-7263 fax
Murray Rosen
murrco@bellsouth.net

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Whbe) No No No
Certified By Other Agency No No No
EEO1 Form Completed Yes Yes No
Dallas County Taxpayer? No No No
How were you notified? DC website Letter from DC Internet
Sample provided (Boxer shorts) No Yes No
samples for all garments quoted Yes Yes No
1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the followina sizes:
a. Size: 28 -small 8 dz. no bid 11.23 $89.84 16.00 $128.00
b. Size: 30 - small 8 dz. no bid 11.23 $89.84 16.00 $128.00
c. Size: 32 -med 30 dz. no bid 11.23 $336.90 16.00 $480.00
d. Size:34 - med 500 dz. no bid 11.23 $5,615.00 16.00 $8,000.00
e. Size: 36 - large 1,062 dz. no bid 11.23 $11,926.26 16.00 $16,992.00
f. Size: 38 - large 1,062 dz. no bid 11.23 $11,926.26 16.00 $16,992.00
g. Size: 40 - x large 1,060 dz. no bid 11.23 $11,903.80 16.00 $16,960.00
h. Size: 42 - x large 1,060 dz. no bid 11.23 $11,903.80 16.00 $16,960.00
i. Size: 44 - 2 xlarge 500 dz. no bid 11.27 $5,635.00 16.00 $8,000.00
j. Size: 46 - 2 x large 500 dz. no bid 12.18 $6,090.00 18.00 $9,000.00
k. Size: 48 - 3 x large 300 dz. no bid 12.24 $3,672.00 18.00 $5,400.00
I. Size: 50 -3 x large 100 dz. no bid 13.25 $1,325.00 20.00 $2,000.00
m. Size: 52 -4 x large 100 dz. no bid 13.38 $1,338.00 20.00 $2,000.00
n. Size: 54 -4 x large 50 dz. no bid 14.15 $707.50 22.00 $1,100.00
0. Size: 56 -5 x large 50 dz. no bid 14.35 $717.50 22.00 $1,100.00
p. Size: 58 -5 x large 50 dz. no bid 15.05 $752.50 24.00 $1,200.00
. Size: 60 -5 x large 1 dz. no bid 25.00 $25.00 24.00 $24.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid INC BXR
Section Total no bid $74,054.20 $106.464.00
32 thru 46 inseam 4" thru 4 1/2" / outseam 16 1/2" thru
3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green, Light Blue, Navy,
Ash and Yellow
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes:
a. Size: Small 10 dz. no bid no bid 25.00 $250.00
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. no bid no bid 25.00 $250.00
c. Size: Large 20 dz. no bid no bid 25.00 $500.00
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. no bid no bid 25.00 $625.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. no bid no bid 35.00 $700.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. no bid no bid 36.00 $180.00
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. no bid no bid 36.00 $180.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Hanes 5180
Section Total no bid no bid $2,685.00
3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: Small 10 dz. no bid no bid 24.00 $240.00
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. no bid no bid 24.00 $240.00
c. Size: Large 20 dz. no bid no bid 24.00 $480.00
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. no bid no bid 24.00 $600.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. no bid no bid 36.00 $720.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. no bid no bid 36.00 $180.00
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. no bid no bid 36.00 $180.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Fruit 3RVR
Section Total no bid no bid $2,640.00
Total for 3A & 3B award all or none $5,325.00
Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B
Men’s V-Neck T-Shirts will be awarded on all
none basis
4. Crew Neck Pullover Sweatshirts, as per bid specifications.
Colors: Gold and Gray
a. Size: Small 20 each no bid 5.83 $116.60 7.00 $140.00
b. Size: Medium 50 each no bid 5.83 $291.50 7.00 $350.00
c. Size: Large 100 each no bid 5.83 $583.00 7.00 $700.00
d. Size: X-Large 150 each no bid 5.83 $874.50 7.00 $1,050.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 50 each no bid 8.45 $422.50 8.00 $400.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 20 each no bid 8.55 $171.00 8.00 $160.00
g. Size: 4X-Large 20 each no bid 8.65 $173.00 8.00 $160.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Gildan or Jerzee Gildan F180
Section Total no bid $2,632.10 $2,960.00
5. Women’s Panties, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: 5 140 dz. 6.90 $966.00 7.78 $1,089.20 14.00 $1,960.00
b. Size: 6 140 dz. 6.90 $966.00 7.78 $1,089.20 14.00 $1,960.00
c. Size: 7 140 dz. 7.78 $1,089.20 14.00 $1,960.00

PYe 3 of 6 51,005.20
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #4
Charm-Tex

1618 Coney Island Ave.

Brooklyn, NY
11230
718-252-8100
718-258-8303 fax
Stan Denzger

stan@charm-

VENDOR #5
JNC Supplies, Inc.

367 Windsor
Hiahway,  Suite
New Windor, NY
12553

845-402-8900
845-402-8901 fax
Joe Walter
joe@incsupplies.com

VENDOR #6
Murray and
Company

PO Box 220586

Charlotte, NC
282222
704-333-5274
704-332-7263 fax
Murray Rosen
murrco@bellsouth.net

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
d. Size: 8 140 dz. 7.18 $1,005.20 7.78 $1,089.20 14.00 $1,960.00
e. Size: 9 140 dz. 8.18 $1,145.20 7.78 $1,089.20 14.00 $1,960.00
f. Size: 10 140 dz. 8.36 $1,170.40 8.34 $1,167.60 14.00 $1,960.00
g. Size: 11 100 dz. 8.36 $836.00 8.34 $834.00 15.00 $1,500.00
h. Size: 12 100 dz. 8.54 $854.00 8.34 $834.00 15.00 $1,500.00
i. Size: 13 100 dz. 9.36 $936.00 8.34 $834.00 15.00 $1,500.00
j. Size: 14 100 dz. 9.90 $990.00 8.34 $834.00 15.00 $1,500.00
k. Size: 16 100 dz. 9.90 $990.00 8.34 $834.00( no hid - not available
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Charm-Tex CL INC Fruit D22130
ISBRA

Section Total $10,864.00 $10,783.60 $17,760.00
6. Sport Bras, as per bid specifications
Color: White and/or Black
Brand: Champion or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes
a. Size: Small 125 dz. 19.36 $2,420.00 19.26 $2,407.50 25.89 $3,236.25
b. Size: Medium 125 dz. 19.36 $2,420.00 19.26 $2,407.50 25.89 $3,236.25
c. Size: Large 125 dz. 19.36 $2,420.00 19.26 $2,407.50 25.89 $3,236.25
d. Size: X-Large 125 dz. 19.36 $2,420.00 19.26 $2,407.50 25.89 $3,236.25
e. Size: 2X- 3X 300 dz. 19.36 $5,808.00 19.26 $5,778.00 27.50 $8,250.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid JNC SPB

Section Total $15.488.00 $15.408.00 $21.195.00
7. Over the Calf Style (Tube) Socks, as per bid 400 dz 4.72 $1,888.00 5.08 $2,032.00 6.00 $2,400.00
specifications,
Color: White
Brand: Champion or equal
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid JNC 10150HS

Section Total $1.888.00 $2.032.00 $2.400.00
8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications
Colors: White and Gray
Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal
8A. Size (Men) 10-13 33 dz. no bid 4.80 $158.40 6.00 $198.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid JNC R2525
8B. Size (Women) 9-11) 167 dz. no bid 4.80 $801.60 6.00 $1,002.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid INC R2525

Section Total no bid $960.00 $1.200.00

Bid Total $28,240.00 $105,869.90 $157,304.00
Total Award $15,408.00

Is this an all or none bid? No No No
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchase 7-30 days ARO 30 days - Boxers 30 days
order: shorts 60 days
Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with we don't subcontract none
your bid proposal, if applicable:
Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide to| Yes Yes No
participate in this contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agrees
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?
Specify the name and telephone number of the account representative | Estell Ashenberg Joe 845-402-8900 x 101 Carl Rosen

who will be handling this account:

Specify Payment Terms

Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for
Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance coverage
for employees in the bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 5).
Please complete the information below to assist in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage?

c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its
employees, is the coverage comparable to the services provided by
Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan description?
(See Attachment - A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of
this bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance
coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas County’s health
insurance coverage and share in the cost?

718-252-8100
estelle@charm-tex.com

Net 30

No
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joe@jncsupplies.com

No

704-560-2532
murrco@bellsouth.net

Net 30

Yes - Employee
Yes - Family


mailto:stan@charm-tex.com
mailto:joe@incsupplies.com
mailto:murrco@bellsouth.net

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #7

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

P.O. Box 127116

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716

480-368-9316
480-368-8556 fax
Emily Pelligreen

emily@umidirect.c

VENDOR #8
Walkenhorst's

540 Technology Way
Napa, CA 94558
707-261-4096
707-261-4021 fax

Josh Walkenhorst
josh@walkenhorst.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/Whbe) No No
Certified By Other Agency No No
EEO1 Form Completed Yes Yes
Dallas County Taxpayer? No No
How were you notified? DC website DC website
Sample provided (Boxer shorts) Yes Yes
samples for all garments quoted Yes Yes
1. Men’s Boxer Shorts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the followina sizes:
a. Size: 28 -small 8 dz. 10.40 $83.20| no bid
b. Size: 30 - small 8 dz. 10.40 $83.20 31.70 $253.60
c. Size: 32 -med 30 dz. 10.40 $312.00 31.70 $951.00
d. Size:34 - med 500 dz. 10.84 $5,420.00 31.70 $15,850.00
e. Size: 36 - large 1,062 dz. 10.84 $11,512.08 31.70 $33,665.40
f. Size: 38 - large 1,062 dz. 11.28 $11,979.36 31.70 $33,665.40
g. Size: 40 - x large 1,060 dz. 11.28 $11,956.80 31.70 $33,602.00
h. Size: 42 - x large 1,060 dz. 11.53 $12,221.80 31.70 $33,602.00
i. Size: 44 - 2 xlarge 500 dz. 11.53 $5,765.00 31.70 $15,850.00
j. Size: 46 - 2 x large 500 dz. 11.91 $5,955.00 39.04 $19,520.00
k. Size: 48 - 3 x large 300 dz. 11.91 $3,573.00 39.04 $11,712.00
I. Size: 50 -3 x large 100 dz. 12.35 $1,235.00 39.04 $3,904.00
m. Size: 52 -4 x large 100 dz. 12.35 $1,235.00 39.04 $3,904.00
n. Size: 54 -4 x large 50 dz. 15.00 $750.00( no bid
0. Size: 56 -5 x large 50 dz. 15.00 $750.00( no bid
p. Size: 58 -5 x large 50 dz. 16.20 $810.00| no bid
. Size: 60 -5 x large 1 dz. 16.20 $16.20| no bid
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMI #330-1WT Fruit of the Loom
595
Section Total $73.657.64 $206.479.40

small thru 10 xIg inseam 2.75" thru 8.75" / outseam

14.75" thru 20.75"

small thru 3 xlg inseam 4 1/2 " thru 5" / outseam 15"
thru 17 1/2"

3A. Men’s Crew-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications

Colors: White, Orange, Brown, Hunter Green, Light Blue, Navy,

Ash and Yellow
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes:

a. Size: Small 10 dz. 38.69 $386.90 29.16 $291.60
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. 38.69 $386.90 29.16 $291.60
c. Size: Large 20 dz. 38.69 $773.80 29.16 $583.20
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. 38.69 $967.25 29.16 $729.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. 61.20 $1,224.00 43.90 $878.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. 61.20 $306.00 43.90 $219.50
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. 61.20 $306.00 43.90 $219.50
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Gildan #2000 Jerzee's 363M
white only prices size 5xlg $43.90
s-xlg $26.35
2X - 4x $44.35
Section Total $4,350.85 $3,212.40
3B. Men’s V-Neck T- Shirts, as per bid specifications
Color: White
Brand: Hanes #5180 Beefy-T or equal
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: Small 10 dz. 21.06 $210.60 31.60 $316.00
b. Size: Medium 10 dz. 21.06 $210.60 31.60 $316.00
c. Size: Large 20 dz. 21.06 $421.20 31.60 $632.00
d. Size: X-Large 25 dz. 17.25 $431.25 31.60 $790.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 20 dz. 17.25 $345.00 41.28 $825.60
f. Size: 3X-Large 5 dz. 37.15 $185.75 41.28 $206.40
g. Size: 4X-Large 5 dz. 38.39 $191.95 41.28 $206.40
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMI / Hanes/ FOL Fruit of the Loom
HD TEE
Section Total $1,996.35 $3,292.40
Total for 3A & 3B award all or none $6,347.20 $6,504.80
Note: 3A Men’s Crew Neck T-Shirt and 3B white, orange,
Men’s V-Neck T-Shirts will be awarded on all brown, hunter
none basis green, light blue,
navy, ash yellow
and all standard
colors
4. Crew Neck Pullover Sweatshirts, as per bid specifications.
Colors: Gold and Gray
a. Size: Small 20 each 6.99 $139.80 6.10 $122.00
b. Size: Medium 50 each 6.99 $349.50 6.10 $305.00
c. Size: Large 100 each 6.99 $699.00 6.10 $610.00
d. Size: X-Large 150 each 6.99 $1,048.50 6.10 $915.00
e. Size: 2X-Large 50 each 9.09 $454.50 7.20 $360.00
f. Size: 3X-Large 20 each 9.09 $181.80 7.20 $144.00
g. Size: 4X-Large 20 each 9.09 $181.80 7.20 $144.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid Gildan #18000 7515-130 Jerzee's
562M
Gray pricing
s-x| $6.70
2x - 4x $8.15
Section Total $3,054.90 $2,600.00
vendor extension
$2,478.00
5. Women’s Panties, as per bid specifications
Color: White
To be furnished in the following sizes:
a. Size: 5 140 dz. 7.20 $1,008.00 14.56 $2,038.40
b. Size: 6 140 dz. 7.20 $1,008.00 14.56 $2,038.40
c. Size: 7 140 dz. 7.20 $1,008.00 14.56 $2,038.40

e
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2013-049-6345

Annual Contract for Apparel, Hosiery and
Undergarments
Opening Date: July 15, 2013

Contract Period:

Buyer: Debra Morris
code: 201.20186 - female / 201.20187 male

VENDOR #7

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.

P.O. Box 127116

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716

480-368-9316
480-368-8556 fax
Emily Pelligreen
emily@umidirect.c

VENDOR #8
Walkenhorst's

540 Technology Way
Napa, CA 94558
707-261-4096
707-261-4021 fax

Josh Walkenhorst
josh@walkenhorst.com

DESCRIPTION: Est.
Qty.
d. Size: 8 140 dz. 7.40 $1,036.00 14.56 $2,038.40
e. Size: 9 140 dz. 7.40 $1,036.00 14.56 $2,038.40
f. Size: 10 140 dz. 7.40 $1,036.00 14.56 $2,038.40
g. Size: 11 100 dz. 7.40 $740.00 19.64 $1,964.00
h. Size: 12 100 dz. 7.40 $740.00 19.64 $1,964.00
i. Size: 13 100 dz. 7.40 $740.00 19.64 $1,964.00
j. Size: 14 100 dz. 7.40 $740.00| no bid
k. Size: 16 100 dz. 7.40 $740.00( no bid
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMI #300-1 - all 6030-047 Fruit of
standard colors the Loom D22030
Section Total $9.832.00 $18.122.40
6. Sport Bras, as per bid specifications
Color: White and/or Black
Brand: Champion or equal
To be furnished in the followina sizes
a. Size: Small 125 dz. 21.25 $2,656.25 35.58 $4,447.50
b. Size: Medium 125 dz. 21.25 $2,656.25 35.58 $4,447.50
c. Size: Large 125 dz. 21.25 $2,656.25 35.58 $4,447.50
d. Size: X-Large 125 dz. 21.25 $2,656.25 35.58 $4,447.50
e. Size: 2X- 3X 300 dz. 25.25 $7,575.00 35.58 $10,674.00
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMI #340-12 6030-170 Best Form
5006703
Section Total $18.200.00 $28.464.00
7. Over the Calf Style (Tube) Socks, as per bid 400 dz 4.44 $1,776.00 7.40 $2,960.00
specifications,
Color: White
Brand: Champion or equal
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMI #500-1 21017-004 UNI
Hosiery Co., Inc.
1512
Section Total $1.776.00 $2.960.00
8. Ankle Socks, as per specifications
Colors: White and Gray
Brand: Terry Sport, Champion or Equal
8A. Size (Men) 10-13 33 dz. 4.73 $156.09 8.90 $293.70
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid umMi 21017-004 UNI
Hosiery Co., Inc.
BK185 5213
8B. Size (Women) 9-11) 167 dz. 4.73 $789.91 8.90 $1,486.30
Specify Brand/Product Number Being Bid UMl 21017-004 UNI
Hosiery Co., Inc.
BK185 5211
Section Total $946.00 $1.780.00
Bid Total $113,813.74 $266,910.60
Total Award $92,558.84
Is this an all or none bid? No No
Specify Delivery after receipt of Dallas County Purchase 30 days ARO 30 days maximum

order:

Specify any additional comments/cost/etc. included with
your bid proposal, if applicable:

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide to
participate in this contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agrees
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to
that entity?

Specify the name and telephone number of the account representative
who will be handling this account:

Specify Payment Terms

Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for
Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance coverage
for employees in the bid evaluation process (see page 4, paragraph 5).
Please complete the information below to assist in this evaluation.

a) Does your company provide health insurance
coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage?

c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its
employees, is the coverage comparable to the services provided by
Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan description?
(See Attachment - A)

d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of
this bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance
coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas County’s health
insurance coverage and share in the cost?

n/a UMl is sole/
primary contractor

Emily Pelligreen
480-368-9316
emily@umidirect.com

30 days

Yes

Yes
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Patty Cole
707-261-4096 patty@walkenhorsts.com

0% / net 30

Yes

Yes - Employee
No- Family
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