
DALLAS COUNTY BID TABULATION VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2
BID NO. 2013-051-6353  Good Earth Corporation Enviromental Landscape Management, a 

Division of Native Contractors Inc.
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR RIGHT-OF-WAY MOWING 
SERVICES

8020 Heinen Corporation 12820 Hillcrest Road, c-207

 Dallas, TX. 75227 Dallas, TX. 75230
OPENING DATE: JULY 29, 2013 Gedorge Belk, COO  Sam Evans  

Phone: 214-381-5899 972-239-7107
BUYER: STEVEN WILLIAMS Fax: 214-381-9315 972-233-7478

CONTRACT PERIOD:  August 20, 2013 to August 19, 2014 
with 3 possible extensions

gbelk@goodearth-inc.com+ sam@envirogrenlm.com

www.goodearth-inc.com NA
Certified M/WBE/EEO1 completed? Yes  NA
TAXPAYER STATUS Dallas County NA

    

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE EXT. UNIT PRICE EXT.
 QUANTITY Times per Year   

1 Right-of-Way Mowing Services for Road and Bridge District #2, 
County Jurisdiction Type A, as per bid specification 
requirements and mowing location listed 

4.3060 Miles 6 $95.00 $2,454.42 $0.00 $0.00

No Bid

2 Right-of-Way Mowing Services for Road and Bridge District #2, 
Sachse C/L Jurisdiction Type B, as per bid specification 
requirements and mowing location listed 

7.042 Miles 6 $95.00 $4,013.94 $0.00 $0.00

No Bid

3 Litter/Debris Collection: Contractor shall provide equipment and 
personnel to collect, remove and dispose of any and all litter  
from the mowing area. Contractor’s personnel shall also pickup 
and dispose of any litter that is discovered during or after  
mowing operations and shall take all actions necessary to prevent 
damage to mowing equipment or the traveling public  during 
mowing operations. Collected litter shall be disposed in an 
approved land fill at the end of each day by the Contractor  at the 

 

      

 
Specify Additional Cost Per Mile 1 Mile When 

Requested
$45.00 $45.00 $0.00 $0.00

No Bid
4 Trimming and Edging Services: Contractor’s personnel shall trim 

and edge during mowing and cutting service when  authorized by 
the designated Project Coordinator. Edging and trimming shall 
include removing all grasses and weeds along  walls, fence, 
foundations, curbs, sidewalks, paths, drives, shrubs, trees, poles, 
stakes, guy wires or any other object or  structure within or 
bordering the turf area to control grass and vegetative growth. 
Contractor is responsible for all damage  caused by trimming and 

       

         
Specify Additional Cost Per Mile 1 Mile When 

Requested
$65.00 $65.00  

5 Right-of-Way Mowing Services for Road and Bridge District #3, 
as per bid specification requirements and mowing location listed 

83.097 Mile 6 $95.00 $47,365.29 $0.00 $0.00

 
Total possible annual  amount of contact for Right of Way 
Mowing Services

$53,833.65 NO BID $0.00

Specifiy any additional comments/cost/etc. included with 
your bid proposal, if applicable:

No Answer No Bid

 

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe what (if any) 
portioin of the bid requirements will be subcontracted out:

No Answer No Bid

mailto:gbelk@goodearth-inc.com+
mailto:sam@envirogrenlm.com
http://www.goodearth-inc.com/
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Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities 
decide to participate in this contract, would 

Yes No Bid

you, the awarded Contractor agrees that all terms, conditions, 
specifications, and pricing would apply to 
that entity?

 

Note: All purchases by Governmental Entities other than 
Dallas County will be billed directly to that Governmental 
Entity Governmental Entity. and paid by that 
Governmental Entity.  Dallas County will not be responsible 
for other

Yes No Bid

Governmental Entity’s debt.

Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms (if any) : ______ 
%                Days.  Payment terms with no 

0% No Bid

discount are Net 30 days, upon receipt of proper invoice and 
verification that the services and products have 
been completed in accordance with specification requirements in 
the Dallas County Auditor's Office.  The 

  

award of this bid will not be  based on prompt/early payment 
discounts.

0% No Bid

Information on Provision of Health Insurance Coverage for 
Employees

Dallas County may consider the provision of health 
insurance coverage for employees in the bid
evaluation process (see page 5, paragraph 4) and attachment 
A.  Please complete the information below to assist in this 
evaluation .
 

Does  your firm/company have the required insurance  coverqage 
stated under SECTION 3- INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS and 
agree to comply with these requirements during the duration of 
this contract?

Yes No Bid

Dallas County may consider the provision of health 
insurance coverage for employees in the bid
evaluation process (see page 5, paragraph 4) and attachment 
A.  Please complete the information below to assist in this 
evaluation .

  
Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees?

No No Bid
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If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of
 NA No Bid
90% for employee only coverage ?

65% for family coverage? NA No Bid

If your company provides health insurance coverage to its 
employees, is the coverage comparable to 
the services provided by Dallas County as described in the 
attached summary plan description?

NA No Bid

Please indicate the manner in which you were notified of this 
solicvittion

Was notified, but method unknown.

Daily Commerical Record

Dallas County Website X

Letter from Dallas County X

Ither: specify
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