TABULATION SHEET ::jvendor #1 Vendor #2
Bid No. 2014-016-6398 : Target Specialty Products Univar USA
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MOSQUITO : Mike Nichols - Vector Business Manager |Doug Gibbs - Outside Sales Rep
LARVICIDE DUNKS, GRANULES AND :
ANCILLARY PRODUCTS -
: :J10539 Maybank Drive 11076 Grader Street
Opening Date: 1/13/2014 :IDallas, TX 75220 Dallas, TX 75238
: 214-357-5741 214-503-7556
DESCRIPTION: : :J214-357-1024 Fax 214-503-7903 Fax
::Imike.nichols@target-specialty.com doug.gibbs@univarusa.com
NCTRCA Certified Vendor (M/WBE)? ::INo No
Dallas County Taxpayer? ‘Jyes No
How were you notified? : Letter from DC Univar Representative
Addendum Returned? N/A N/A
:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:;.;.;.;.;.;.;.1:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f-5:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f:f
ITEM /DESCRIPTION R Unit Cost Per Extended Price Unit Cost | Cost Per Case Extended Price
Projected Qty
Cost Case
Mosquito Dunks - 2PK 0 $3.76 |$45.12 $0.00 $7.54 $90.48 $0.00
(12 per case) (12 per case)
Mosquito Dunks - 6pk 0 $6.30 $75.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(12 per case) NO BID
Mosquito Dunks - 20pk 0 $13.00 $65.00 $0.00 $13.53 $67.67 $0.00
(5 per case) (5 per case)
Mosquito Bits 80oz. Bottle 0 $5.91 $70.92 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(12 per case) NO BID
Mosquito Briquets - 2pk 0 $0.00 $0.00 $7.54 $90.48 $0.00
NO BID (12 per case)
Mosquito Briquets - 6pk 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID NO BID
Mosquito Briquets - 20pk 0 $0.00 $0.00 $13.53 $67.67 $0.00
NO BID (5 per case)
GRAND TOTAL: $0.00 $0.00
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