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A B C E H I J K L M N
TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
 BID NO. 2015-034-6488 Professional Coating 

Technologies
 Aggregates Now Vulcan Materials Company

 Contract for Aggregate  and Other Highway Materials  1001 Mt. Lebanon Rd. P.O. Box 794254 545 E. John Carpenter Frwy, Suite 
950

Buyer:  James Gay 214-653-7434 Cedar Hill, Texas Dallas, Texas 75379 Las Colinas, Texas 75062
Contract Period:  July 7, 2015 through September 30, 2015 (972) 291-7474 ext 107 (972) 364-9084 (469) 904-4524

(972)291-6224 fax (972)364-9022 Fax
Aaron Bland Rikki Rutchik Kevin Boyd
aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com admin@aggregatesnow.com boydke@vmcmail.com

NCTRCA Certified Vendor No comment No No Comment
Certified By Other Agency
EE01 Submitted Yes Yes Yes
Other County Taxpayer
Dallas County Taxpayer?   
AWARD: PARTIAL

 AWARD #5-6 AWARD# 1-4  Delivery/Pickup

Item # Description Estimated Annual Quantities
Unit Price Extended

Unit Price  Extended Unit Price

Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,
Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat) 2,000 tons $ NO BID  /ton $____________ $30.50/ ton  $            61,000.00 $20.00/ton

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location to the
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project Job Site
Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,
Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)

Loaded on Vendor's Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas - Specify Cost  per Ton Delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Martin Marietta
927 County Rd 1536 Chico, Tx 76431 1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap Tx,  

Address:  
#940-644-2687 # 817-596-8730

Phone:  
$  NO BID $___________ $20.00 FOB/ 

$35.86 Delivered
Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m. 5:30 am to 3:30 a.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, $ NO BID $_____________
Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas - Specify Cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   

Address:  

1

1.1

mailto:aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com
mailto:admin@aggregatesnow.com
mailto:boydke@vmcmail.com
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A B C E H I J K L M N

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
 $___20.00____ 

Name and Location of Plant 2:   NO BID $31.25/ ton.  $            62,500.00  $___35.18_______ 
Delivered

Address:  Martin Marietta
927 Couty Rd 1536 Chico Texas 76431

Phone:  #940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  
6:30 am- 4:30 p.m.

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location to the
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project Job Site

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:   
1.3 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,

Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)
Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Various Project / Job 
Sites within Dallas County-Specify Cost per ton:

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project/Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County $__NO BID__ $________ $34.50  $            69,000.00 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County $  NO BiD $__________
$36.50  $            73,000.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$ NO BID $__________ $37.15  $            74,300.00 
31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area: $__________ $__________ $40.50  $            81,000.00 

Name and Location of Plant 1:   
$  NO BID $__________

Address:  Tractor Trailer Loads price per ton
Vulcan

Phone:   1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap, Tx  

Hours of Operation:  #817-596-8730

Name and Location of Plant 2:   5:30 a.m. to 3:30 a.m.

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

1.2
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Hours of Operation:  

1.4 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone,

Grade 3 (Chat Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plant)
Specify Cost per Ton
Name and Location of Plant 1:   NO BID /ton $__________ $12.50/ton  $            25,000.00 

Address:  Martin Marietta 927 County Road 1536, 
Chico Texas 76431

Phone:  940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   NO BID/ ton $__________ $_20.00/ ton   FOB_________

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 4,000 TONS

NO BID/ ton $__________ $30.50 /ton $122,000 $20.00/ ton  

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location $35.86 /per ton   Delivered
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project / Job Site

2.1 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify Cost per Ton Delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Vulcan
Martin Marietta

Address:  927 County Rd 1536 Chico, Texas 76431

Phone:  #940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   
Vulcan

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

2
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Address:   

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

2.2 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify Cost per ton delivered
NO BID/ ton $__________ $31.25/  ton $125,000  $20.00__/ ton 

Name and Location of Plant 1:    $_35.18_per ton  
Delivered

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:   

Hours of Operation:  
2.3 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and delivered by Vendor to Various Project 
Job

Sites within Dallas County – specify cost per ton delivered

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID/ ton $__________ $34.50 /ton $138,000 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID/ ton ___________ $36.50/ ton $146,000 

31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID/ ton $__________ $37.15 / ton $148,600 

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   NO BID/ ton $__________ $40.50 /ton $162,000 
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Vulcan
Address:  111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap ,Tx

Phone:  817-596-8730

Hours of Operation:  5:30 a.m. to 3.30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
2.4 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plan. Specify Cost per ton. $12.50 $50,000 $__20.00 FOB________

Name and Location of Plant 1:   
Martin Marietta

927 County Rd 1536 Chico Tx 76431
Address:  

Phone:  940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4.30 p.m.
95 miles

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  85 miles

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  
3 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard 1,000 tons

Specifications for Constructions of Highways, Street, and

Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate

NO BID/ ton $__________ $29.75 /ton $29,750.00 NO BID

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to the
Road and Bridge Districts and / or Project / Job Site
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3.1 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials

Address:  100200 County Rd 2138 Kemp , Tx 75143

Phone:  
903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

3.2 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard

Specifications for Constructions of Highways, Street, and

Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate
Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to the
Road and Bridge Districts and / or Project / Job Site

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

NO BID/ ton $____________ $32.50/ ton $32,500 

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials NO BID

Address:  10020 County Rd 2138 Kemp, Tx 75143

Phone:  #903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  
6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  
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A B C E H I J K L M N

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

3.3 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered by Vendor to Various Projects /

Job Sites within Dallas County – Specify cost per ton delivered
Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project / Job 
Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $33.75/ ton  $            33,750.00 
NO BID

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $35.75/ ton  $            35,750.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $36.90/ ton  $            36,900.00 

31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID $___________ $39.75/ ton  $            39,750.00 

Specify Brand / Product Number Being Proposed:  

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials

Address:  10020 County Rd 2138
Kemp Tx 75143

Phone:  
#903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Specify Demurrage / Detention Charge (after one (1) hour) for 3.1 thru 3.3: $1.75 / per minute

 / per minute

Specify cancellation charge within three (3) hours of delivery (if any):

4 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard Specifications for Construction of NO BID/ ton $19.25 / ton $19,250 NO BID
Highways, Streets, and Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate
Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plant – Specify cost per ton
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Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress materials

Address:   10020 County Rd 2138, Kemp Tx 75143

Phone:  #903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  51 miles
65 miles

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  
Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes 10,000 gallons
Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface. NO BID
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching $4.54/gal  $                          45,400.00 No Bid

Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc PHPM-50

5.1 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3 Tanker: 4,000 gal  minimum
1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Specify cost per gallon delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001 MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:   8 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   No Bid

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation: 

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:   

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

5.2 Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes Tanker: 4,000 gal minimum
$4.54/ gallon

$18,160 NO BID NO BID

Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface.
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching

5

$_$______ / gallon
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Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc PHPM-50
Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4
4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001  MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  8:00 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
5.3 LOADED ON VENDOR’S TRUCK AND DELIVERED to Various Project / LTL -Drums or Totes: Not tankers NO BID NO BID

Job Sites within Dallas County – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project/Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
$__ _____/gal $ 8.50_____/gal  $                          85,000.00 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$_______/gal $_8.50___/gal  $                          85,000.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$________/gal $_8.50____/gal  $                          85,000.00 
31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$________/gal $__8.50____/gal  $                          85,000.00 
Specify Brand / Product Number Being Proposed:  PHPM 50

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCI

Address:  1001 MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:   972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Specify Demurrage / Detention Charge (after one (1) hour) for 5.1 thru 5.3:



Page 10 of 26

515
516
517
518

519
520
521
522
523
524
525
526
527
528
529
530
531
532
533
534
535
536

537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551
552
553

554
555

556
557

558
559
560
561
562

563
564

565
566

567
568

569
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 / per minute

Specify cancellation charge within three (3) hours of delivery (if any):

6 Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes 10,000 gallons No Container provided Product
loaded into County Distributor truck

 $                          43,400.00 NO BID NO BID

Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface. $___4.34_______ / gallon
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching
Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc, PHPM-50
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR’S PLANT

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001 Mt. Lebanon Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  8:00 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Sub Total 5-6  $                        446,960.00  $       1,565,050.00 

Please answer the questions listed below

Did your company check Dallas County 
website(http://www.dallascounty.org/department/purchasing/currentbids
.html) for any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the Solicitation?

Yes Yes

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe what (if any) 
portion of the bid requirements will be subcontracted out.

Freight if shipping utilized: 
Everything else is done by our 
own in-house staff

No N/A

Bidders are required to indicate whether they have the required products 
on hand at the time of the bid or whether they will be required to obtrain 
such upon award.
Please indicate by checking the appropriate box:
I/We do have the products in stock Yes Yes Yes
I/We will be required to obtain the products upon award of bid.

Specity any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid 
proposal, if applicable:

*Any deviations to the Dallas County bid specifications may result in 
rejection of the Bidders Proposal if found unacceptable by Dallas 
County.

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide 
to participate in this contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agree 
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to that 
entity?

Yes No Yes

Note: All purchases by Governmental Entities other than Dallas 
County will be billed directly to that Governmental Entity and paid 
by that Government Entity.  Dallas County will not be responsible 
for other Governmental Entity's debt
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Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms (if any) no comment no comment

INFORMATION ON PROVISION OF HEALTH INSURANCE 
COVERAGE FOR EMPLOYEES

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance 
coverage for employees in the bid evaluation process(see page 5, 
paragraph 5).  Please complete the information below to assist in 
this evaluation.

Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees No N/A- No employees Yes

If you company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of:
90% for employee only coverage Yes
65% for Family coverage Yes

If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for 
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage?

Yes

If your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is 
the coverage comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as 
described in the attached summary plan description?(See Attachment A)

Yes

If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of this 
bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance coverage 
to their employees that compares to Dallas County's Health insurance 
coverage and share in the cost?

No

Specify the name, telephone number and email address of the account 
representative who will be handling and managing this account:  Note: It 
is the responsibility of the awarded bidder to notify Dallas County of any 
account representative and/or contact person changes. 

Aaron Bland #214-673-4703 
email: 
aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com 
Secondary Contact: Denise 
Winlelman 972-291-7474 ext 104 
email: 
denise.winkelman@pctworldwide.
com

Kirk Rovinsky #214-282-7980 
sales@aggregatesnow.com  Rikki Rutchik 

#972-364-9084  email: 
admin@aggregatesnow.com

Kevin Boyd  (469)904-4524  
boydke@vmcmail.com

FOR INFORMATION PURPOSES PLEASE INDICATE THE 
MANNER IN WHICH YOU WERE NOTIFIED OF THIS 
SOLICITATION:

Daily Commercial Record
Dallas County Website  Yes
Letter from Dallas County Purchasing Department
Other: specify Email

Specify your firm's Texas Secretary of State Filing Number, 
Jurisdiction and Formation Date:

Conflict of Interest Questionnaire:
for vendor or other person doing business with local governmental 
entity:

(1) Name of person doing business with local governmental entity: N/A N/A
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(2) Check this box if you are filing an update to a previously filed 
questionnaire.

N/A

(3) Describe each affiliation or business relationship with an employee or 
contractor of the local governmental entity who makes 
recommendations to a local government officer of the local 
governmental entity with respect to expenditure of money

None

(4) Describe each affiliation or business relationship with a person who 
is a local government officer of the local governmental entity that is the 
subject of this questionnaire.

N/A

(5) Name of local government office with whom filer has affilation or 
business relationship

No No

(6) Describe any other affiliation or business relationship that might 
cause a conflict of interest.

N/A
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A B C E H I J K L M N O
TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
 BID NO. 2015-034-6488 Professional Coating 

Technologies
 Aggregates Now Vulcan Materials Company

 Contract for Aggregate  and Other Highway Materials  1001 Mt. Lebanon Rd. P.O. Box 794254 545 E. John Carpenter Frwy, Suite 
950

Buyer:  James Gay 214-653-7434 Cedar Hill, Texas Dallas, Texas 75379 Las Colinas, Texas 75062
Contract Period:  July 7, 2015 through September 30, 2015 (972) 291-7474 ext 107 (972) 364-9084 (469) 904-4524

(972)291-6224 fax (972)364-9022 Fax
Aaron Bland Rikki Rutchik Kevin Boyd
aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com admin@aggregatesnow.com boydke@vmcmail.com

NCTRCA Certified Vendor No comment No No Comment
Certified By Other Agency
EE01 Submitted Yes Yes Yes
Other County Taxpayer
Dallas County Taxpayer?   
AWARD: PARTIAL

 AWARD #5-6 AWARD# 1-4  Delivery/Pickup

Item # Description Estimated Annual Quantities
Unit Price Extended

Unit Price  Extended Unit Price Extend

Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,
Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat) 2,000 tons $ NO BID  /ton $____________ $30.50/ ton  $            61,000.00 $20.00/ton $40,00  

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location to the
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project Job Site
Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,
Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)

Loaded on Vendor's Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas - Specify Cost  per Ton Delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Martin Marietta
927 County Rd 1536 Chico, Tx 76431 1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap Tx,  

Address:  
#940-644-2687 # 817-596-8730

Phone:  
$  NO BID $___________ $20.00 FOB/ 

$35.86 Delivered
Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m. 5:30 am to 3:30 a.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, $ NO BID $_____________
Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas - Specify Cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   

Address:  

1

1.1

mailto:aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com
mailto:admin@aggregatesnow.com
mailto:boydke@vmcmail.com
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Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
 $___20.00____  $                            

Name and Location of Plant 2:   NO BID $31.25/ ton.  $            62,500.00  $___35.18_______  $                            
Delivered

Address:  Martin Marietta
927 Couty Rd 1536 Chico Texas 76431

Phone:  #940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  
6:30 am- 4:30 p.m.

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location to the
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project Job Site

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:   
1.3 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302,

Type/B, Crushed Stone, Grade 3 (Chat)
Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Various Project / Job 
Sites within Dallas County-Specify Cost per ton:

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project/Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County $__NO BID__ $________ $34.50  $            69,000.00 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County $  NO BiD $__________
$36.50  $            73,000.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$ NO BID $__________ $37.15  $            74,300.00 
31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area: $__________ $__________ $40.50  $            81,000.00 

Name and Location of Plant 1:   
$  NO BID $__________

Address:  Tractor Trailer Loads price per ton
Vulcan

Phone:   1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap, Tx  

Hours of Operation:  #817-596-8730

Name and Location of Plant 2:   5:30 a.m. to 3:30 a.m.

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

1.2
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Hours of Operation:  

1.4 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone,

Grade 3 (Chat Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plant)
Specify Cost per Ton
Name and Location of Plant 1:   NO BID /ton $__________ $12.50/ton  $            25,000.00 

Address:  Martin Marietta 927 County Road 1536, 
Chico Texas 76431

Phone:  940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   NO BID/ ton $__________ $_20.00/ ton   FOB_________ $40,00  

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 4,000 TONS

NO BID/ ton $__________ $30.50 /ton $122,000 $20.00/ ton  $80,000

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location $35.86 /per ton   Delivered $143,4
Road and Bridge Districts and/or Project / Job Site

2.1 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify Cost per Ton Delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Vulcan
Martin Marietta

Address:  927 County Rd 1536 Chico, Texas 76431

Phone:  #940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   
Vulcan

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

2
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Address:   

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

2.2 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify Cost per ton delivered
NO BID/ ton $__________ $31.25/  ton $125,000  $20.00__/ ton  $                            

Name and Location of Plant 1:    $_35.18_per ton   $                          
Delivered

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
NO BID/ ton $__________

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:   

Hours of Operation:  
2.3 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and delivered by Vendor to Various Project 
Job

Sites within Dallas County – specify cost per ton delivered

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID/ ton $__________ $34.50 /ton $138,000 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID/ ton ___________ $36.50/ ton $146,000 

31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID/ ton $__________ $37.15 / ton $148,600 

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   NO BID/ ton $__________ $40.50 /ton $162,000 
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Vulcan
Address:  111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap ,Tx

Phone:  817-596-8730

Hours of Operation:  5:30 a.m. to 3.30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
2.4 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4

Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plan. Specify Cost per ton. $12.50 $50,000 $__20.00 FOB________  $                            

Name and Location of Plant 1:   
Martin Marietta

927 County Rd 1536 Chico Tx 76431
Address:  

Phone:  940-644-2687

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4.30 p.m.
95 miles

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  85 miles

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  
3 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard 1,000 tons

Specifications for Constructions of Highways, Street, and

Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate

NO BID/ ton $__________ $29.75 /ton $29,750.00 NO BID

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to the
Road and Bridge Districts and / or Project / Job Site
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3.1 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials

Address:  100200 County Rd 2138 Kemp , Tx 75143

Phone:  
903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

3.2 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard

Specifications for Constructions of Highways, Street, and

Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate
Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to the
Road and Bridge Districts and / or Project / Job Site

Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4

NO BID/ ton $____________ $32.50/ ton $32,500 

4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per ton delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials NO BID

Address:  10020 County Rd 2138 Kemp, Tx 75143

Phone:  #903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  
6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  
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Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

3.3 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered by Vendor to Various Projects /

Job Sites within Dallas County – Specify cost per ton delivered
Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project / Job 
Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $33.75/ ton  $            33,750.00 
NO BID

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $35.75/ ton  $            35,750.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County NO BID $___________ $36.90/ ton  $            36,900.00 

31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
NO BID $___________ $39.75/ ton  $            39,750.00 

Specify Brand / Product Number Being Proposed:  

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress Materials

Address:  10020 County Rd 2138
Kemp Tx 75143

Phone:  
#903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m.- 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Specify Demurrage / Detention Charge (after one (1) hour) for 3.1 thru 3.3: $1.75 / per minute

 / per minute

Specify cancellation charge within three (3) hours of delivery (if any):

4 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard Specifications for Construction of NO BID/ ton $19.25 / ton $19,250 NO BID
Highways, Streets, and Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate
Loaded on County Trucks at Vendor Plant – Specify cost per ton
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Name and Location of Plant 1:   Congress materials

Address:   10020 County Rd 2138, Kemp Tx 75143

Phone:  #903-498-1100

Hours of Operation:  6:30 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  51 miles
65 miles

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Miles to Plant from 1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas:  

Miles to Plant from 4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas:  
Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes 10,000 gallons
Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface. NO BID
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching $4.54/gal  $                          45,400.00 No Bid

Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc PHPM-50

5.1 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3 Tanker: 4,000 gal  minimum
1506 E Langdon, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Specify cost per gallon delivered to Road and Bridge District #3

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001 MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:   8 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   No Bid

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation: 

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:   

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

5.2 Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes Tanker: 4,000 gal minimum
$4.54/ gallon

$18,160 NO BID NO BID

Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface.
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching

5

$_$______ / gallon
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Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc PHPM-50
Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #4
4403 W Illinois, Dallas, Texas – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001  MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  8:00 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  
5.3 LOADED ON VENDOR’S TRUCK AND DELIVERED to Various Project / LTL -Drums or Totes: Not tankers NO BID NO BID

Job Sites within Dallas County – Specify cost per gallon delivered

Note: Bidder shall supply material from plant location closest to Project/Job Site

1-10 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County
$__ _____/gal $ 8.50_____/gal  $                          85,000.00 

11-20 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$_______/gal $_8.50___/gal  $                          85,000.00 

21-30 Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$________/gal $_8.50____/gal  $                          85,000.00 
31+ Miles from Vendor Plant Site to Project / Job Sites within Dallas County

$________/gal $__8.50____/gal  $                          85,000.00 
Specify Brand / Product Number Being Proposed:  PHPM 50

List All Plant Locations Serving This Solicitation within the DFW Region Area:

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCI

Address:  1001 MT. Lebanon  Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:   972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Specify Demurrage / Detention Charge (after one (1) hour) for 5.1 thru 5.3:
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 / per minute

Specify cancellation charge within three (3) hours of delivery (if any):

6 Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes 10,000 gallons No Container provided Product
loaded into County Distributor truck

 $                          43,400.00 NO BID NO BID

Promotes adhesion for the patch mix and the existing surface. $___4.34_______ / gallon
Compatible with both cold and hot mix patching
Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc, PHPM-50
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR’S PLANT

Name and Location of Plant 1:   PCT

Address:  1001 Mt. Lebanon Rd. Cedar Hill Tx 75104

Phone:  972-291-7474 ext 104

Hours of Operation:  8:00 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Name and Location of Plant 2:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Name and Location of Plant 3:   

Address:  

Phone:  

Hours of Operation:  

Sub Total 5-6  $                        446,960.00  $       1,565,050.00  $                          

Please answer the questions listed below

Did your company check Dallas County 
website(http://www.dallascounty.org/department/purchasing/currentbids
.html) for any addendums, updates, and/or changes to the Solicitation?

Yes Yes

Should your firm be awarded this contract, describe what (if any) 
portion of the bid requirements will be subcontracted out.

Freight if shipping utilized: 
Everything else is done by our 
own in-house staff

No N/A

Bidders are required to indicate whether they have the required products 
on hand at the time of the bid or whether they will be required to obtrain 
such upon award.
Please indicate by checking the appropriate box:
I/We do have the products in stock Yes Yes Yes
I/We will be required to obtain the products upon award of bid.

Specity any additional comments/cost/etc. included with your bid 
proposal, if applicable:

*Any deviations to the Dallas County bid specifications may result in 
rejection of the Bidders Proposal if found unacceptable by Dallas 
County.

Cooperative Purchasing: Should other Governmental Entities decide 
to participate in this contract, would you, the awarded Contractor agree 
that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply to that 
entity?

Yes No Yes

Note: All purchases by Governmental Entities other than Dallas 
County will be billed directly to that Governmental Entity and paid 
by that Government Entity.  Dallas County will not be responsible 
for other Governmental Entity's debt
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Specify Prompt/Early Payment Discount Terms (if any) no comment no comment

INFORMATION ON PROVISION OF HEALTH INSURANCE 
COVERAGE FOR EMPLOYEES

Dallas County may consider the provision of health insurance 
coverage for employees in the bid evaluation process(see page 5, 
paragraph 5).  Please complete the information below to assist in 
this evaluation.

Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees No N/A- No employees Yes

If you company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of:
90% for employee only coverage Yes
65% for Family coverage Yes

If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its 
employees, does the company share in the cost a minimum of 75% for 
employee only coverage and 50% for family coverage?

Yes

If your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is 
the coverage comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as 
described in the attached summary plan description?(See Attachment A)

Yes

If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of this 
bid, does each of the subcontractors provide health insurance coverage 
to their employees that compares to Dallas County's Health insurance 
coverage and share in the cost?

No

Specify the name, telephone number and email address of the account 
representative who will be handling and managing this account:  Note: It 
is the responsibility of the awarded bidder to notify Dallas County of any 
account representative and/or contact person changes. 

Aaron Bland #214-673-4703 
email: 
aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com 
Secondary Contact: Denise 
Winlelman 972-291-7474 ext 104 
email: 
denise.winkelman@pctworldwide.
com

Kirk Rovinsky #214-282-7980 
sales@aggregatesnow.com  Rikki Rutchik 

#972-364-9084  email: 
admin@aggregatesnow.com

Kevin Boyd  (469)904-4524  
boydke@vmcmail.com

FOR INFORMATION PURPOSES PLEASE INDICATE THE 
MANNER IN WHICH YOU WERE NOTIFIED OF THIS 
SOLICITATION:

Daily Commercial Record
Dallas County Website  Yes
Letter from Dallas County Purchasing Department
Other: specify Email

Specify your firm's Texas Secretary of State Filing Number, 
Jurisdiction and Formation Date:

Conflict of Interest Questionnaire:
for vendor or other person doing business with local governmental 
entity:

(1) Name of person doing business with local governmental entity: N/A N/A
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(2) Check this box if you are filing an update to a previously filed 
questionnaire.

N/A

(3) Describe each affiliation or business relationship with an employee or 
contractor of the local governmental entity who makes 
recommendations to a local government officer of the local 
governmental entity with respect to expenditure of money

None

(4) Describe each affiliation or business relationship with a person who 
is a local government officer of the local governmental entity that is the 
subject of this questionnaire.

N/A

(5) Name of local government office with whom filer has affilation or 
business relationship

No No

(6) Describe any other affiliation or business relationship that might 
cause a conflict of interest.

N/A



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1  VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
BID NO. 2015-034-6488  Annual Contract for Aggregate  and other Highway Materials Professional Coating 

Technologies
 Aggregates Now Vulcan Materials

ITEM # 1  Aggregate for Surface TXDot 302, Type B Crushed Stone No Bid
61,000.00$                                         40,000.00$                                         County Pickup

ITEM# 1.1 No Bid
40,000.00$                                         County Pickup

ITEM# 2 No Bid
62,500.00$                                         80,000.00$                                         County Pickup

ITEM# 3 No Bid

ITEM# 1.4 No Bid
25,000.00$                                         

ITEM# 2  Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 No Bid
122,000.00$                                      

ITEM# 2.1 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 No Bid
N/A

ITEM# 2.2 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 No Bid
125,000.00$                                      

ITEM# 2.3 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 No Bid
138,000.00$                                      

ITEM# 2.4 Aggregate for Surface, TX DOT Item 302, Type B, Crushed Stone, Grade 4 No Bid
50,000.00$                                         

ITEM# 3 Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate No Bid
29,750.00$                                         No Bid

ITEM# 3.1   Bridges, Item 421, (5), Table 2, Fine Aggregate No Bid
No Bid

ITEM# 3.2  Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard No Bid
32,500.00$                                         No Bid

ITEM# 3.3 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered by Vendor to Various Project / No Bid
146,150.00$                                      No Bid

ITEM# 4 Washed Sand, TX DOT, Standard Specifications for Construction of No Bid
19,250.00$                                         No Bid

ITEM# 5 Brand: Professional Coating Technologies Inc PHPM-50 $45,400
No BID No BID

ITEM# 5.1 Loaded on Vendor’s Truck and Delivered to Road and Bridge District #3
No BID No BID



TABULATION SHEET VENDOR #1  VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
BID NO. 2015-034-6488  Annual Contract for Aggregate  and other Highway Materials Professional Coating 

Technologies
 Aggregates Now Vulcan Materials

ITEM# 5.2 Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes $18,160
No BID No BID

ITEM# 5.3 LOADED ON VENDOR’S TRUCK AND DELIVERED to Various Project / $340,000
No BID No BID

ITEM# 6  Liquid Geo-Tech Membrane for Potholes $43,400
No BID No BID

Total
1,565,050.00$                                   
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