
TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2

Bid No. 2018-005-6698
Invitation for Bid for Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes
Bid Open: November 6, 2017

Contract Period March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 817-454-41983 877-786-4681
Debra Morris, Buyer fax- 817-796-1091 fax 214-389-7111
214-653-7933
debra.morris@dallascounty.org

www.blaggtire.com www.smtires.com

NCTRCA Certified Vendor No No
Certified by other Agency No No
1295 Yes Yes
EEO1 Yes Yes
2270 Verification Yes Yes
Dallas County Taxpayer? No No
How were you notified?
Addendum # 1 Yes Yes

Recommend for Award

DESCRIPTION:
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Extension  Unit Cost Extension  

SECTION A:  POLICE PURSUIT AND PERFORMANCE TIRES

1 Type: Police Pursuit Tires , Size P235/55R17 600 Each 102.99 $61,794.00 110.00 $66,000.00
Brand: Firestone Firehawk GT Z Pursuit, part no.077325 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed W W
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 304AAA 340AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

2 Type: Police Pursuit Tires , Size P235/55R17 600 Each 101.89 $61,134.00 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RSA, part no. 732002500 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed W
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 206AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

3 Type: Police Pursuit Tires , Size: P225/60R16 300 Each 89.24 $26,772.00 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RSA, part no. 732354500 (No Substitutes)  
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 206AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

4 Type: Police Pursuit Tires , Size: P225/60R18 300 Each 113.99 $34,197.00 116.00 $34,800.00
Brand: Firestone Firehawk GT Z Pursuit, part no. 005254 (No Substitute) 
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V W
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 340AAA 340AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

5..  Type: Police Pursuit Tires, Size: P225/60R18 300 Each 106.99 $32,097.00 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RSA, part no. 732312500 (No Substitute) 
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed W
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 260AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

6 Type: Police Pursuit Tires , Size: 265/60R17 40 Each 119.99 $4,799.60 123.00 $4,920.00
Brand: Firestone Firehawk GT Z Pursuit, part no. 023189 (No Substitute) 
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 340AA 340AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 023189

7 Police Pursuit Tires , Size: 265/60R17 60 Each 105.99 $6,359.40 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear, part no. 732301500 (No Substitute) 
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 260AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

8 Type: Performance Tires , Size 215/60R16 30 Each 77.99 $2,339.70 78.13 $2,343.90
Brand: Firestone Firehawk Wide Oval, part no. 138542 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 460AA 460AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

9 Type: Performance Tires , Size 215/60R16 25 Each 75.74 $1,893.50 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear, part number 738571571 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 460AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

10 Type: Performance Tires , All Terrain  ,Size P235/50R18 XL  12 Each 116.74 $1,400.88 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RS-A No. 732276500 (No substitute)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed XL
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

11 Type: Performance Tires , All Terrain , Size P235/50R18 XL  12 Each 121.99 $1,463.88 138.00 $1,656.00
Brand: Firestone gt-pursuit No. 23308 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed XL XL
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 023308 023308

12 Type: Performance Tires , Size: P245/55R18  40 Each 115.99 $4,639.60 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RS-A, part no. 732026500 (No Substitute)  
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 732026500

13 Type: Performance Tires , Size: P265/70R17 40 Each 113.99 $4,559.60 No Bid
Brand: Goodyear SR-A part no. 183106436 (No Substitute)  
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 18310636

14 Type: Performance Tires , Size: P265/70R17 40 Each 111.99 $4,479.60 113.74 $4,549.60
Brand: Firestone LE2 part no. 097912 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T

Item:#1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,14,15,17,18,20,21,22,23,24,25,
26,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,34,36,37,38,39,40,41,42,43,44,45, 
46,47,49, 
52,53,54,55,56,57,58,59,61,62,64,65,67,68,69,71,72,78,79,81,84,8
9,90

Item # 16,19,35,48,50, 63,66,70,73,74,75,76,80,82,86,87,88 - and 
All Section H 

Blagg Tire & Service Southern Tire Mart LLC
604 S. Main Street 800 Highway 98
Grapevine, Texas 76051 Columbia, MS 39429

Perry Leonard Richard Cornwell
pleonard@careconceptsinc.com rconwill@stmtires.com

DC-email-current vendor Email-DC

5254

77325 part no. 077325 discontinued/ replacment no. 003874

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z PURSUIT

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

500AB

260AA
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FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
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FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
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GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
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FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT PURSUIT

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z
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FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT V PURSUIT

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK AS
NO. 138542 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 0014505

FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GTZ
023189

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
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FIRESTONE FIREHAWK WIDE OVAL
138542

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE FUEL MAX

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

T

V
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mailto:pleonard@careconceptsinc.com
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TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2

Bid No. 2018-005-6698
Invitation for Bid for Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes
Bid Open: November 6, 2017

Contract Period March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 817-454-41983 877-786-4681

Blagg Tire & Service Southern Tire Mart LLC
604 S. Main Street 800 Highway 98
Grapevine, Texas 76051 Columbia, MS 39429

Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 097912 097912

Total Section A $247,929.76 $114,269.50
Section A - Award Total $247,929.76

SECTION B: PASSENGER TIRES 

15 Type: Passenger, Highway Tread , Size P205/60R16   60 Each 71.99 $4,319.40 78.00 $4,680.00
Brand: Bridgeport Insignia SE200, part no. 124551 or  Goodyear Eagle LT, part no. 738057571 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed H H
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 738057571

16 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P205/65R15 6 Each 52.99 $317.94 60.55 $363.30
Brand: Firestone part no. 147705 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 407478374

17 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P205/70R15 16 Each 62.99 $1,007.84 57.17 $914.72
Brand: Firestone FR710, part no. 047150 (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed S T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE FR710
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 47150

18 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread  , Size P215/65R17 8 Each 71.99 $575.92 130.49 $1,043.92
Brand: Goodyear, part no. 183678418  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed S S
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 183678418 183678418

19 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P215/75R15 8 Each 61.19 $489.52 74.15 $593.20
Brand: Toyo Extensa, part no. 147430  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T S
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 407792374 147430

20 Type: Passenger Tires , Highway Tread, Size P225/65R16   12 Each 63.75 $765.00 71.55 $858.60
Brand: Goodyear No. 407786374, Firestone No. 148079  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed SL
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed 407786374 15335
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed

21 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P225/65R17 8 Each 69.75 $558.00 130.53 $1,044.24
Brand: Goodyear No. 407285374  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 600AB 600AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 407285374 407285374

22 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P225/70R15 8 Each 77.75 $622.00 137.19 $1,097.52
Brand: Goodyear No. 183482418  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed S S
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 500AB 500AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 183482418 183482418

23 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P235/50R17 8 Each 103.50 $828.00 171.40 $1,371.20
Brand: Goodyear No. 109064366  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed W W
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 560AA 560AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 109064366 109064366

24 Type: Passenger Tires, All Terrain  , Size P235/50R18   6 Each 75.99 $455.94 250.93 $1,505.58
Brand: Goodyear Eagle RS-A No. 732483500, Toyo No. 195550  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed W SL
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 560AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 732483500 732483500

25 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P235/60R16 8 Each 68.99 $551.92 136.69 $1,093.52
Brand: Goodyear No. 407784374  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 600AB 600AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 407784374 407784374

26 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P235/60R17 8 Each 83.74 $669.92 89.05 $712.40
Brand: Firestone No. 079042  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T H
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 560AB 600AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 079042

27 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P245/45R20 6 Each 127.49 $764.94 166.19 $997.14
Brand: Goodyear RS-A No. 732603500  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 260AA 260AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 732603500 732603500

28 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size P255/45R20 6 Each 134.49 $806.94 265.35 $1,592.10
Brand: Goodyear RS-A No. 732007741  (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed V V
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 260AA 260AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 732007741 732007741

29 Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size:P245/70R17 16 Each 97.99 $1,567.84 100.15 $1,602.40
Firestone Destination LE2, part no. 097827  or Goodyear Wrangler part no. 183114470   (No Substitute)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 097827 097827

30  Type: Passenger , Highway Tread , Size 255/70R16 24 Each 102.99 $2,471.76 172.44 $4,138.56
Brand: Goodyear CS Fuel Max, part no. 755276383 or Cooper (Starfire) No. 51037 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 600AB 600AB

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

*147705 ID DISCONTINUED REPLACEMENT

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

*147430 DISCONTINUED REPLACEMENT

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE

600AB

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE FUEL MAX

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE

FIRESTONE FR710

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE

580AA 600AA

520AB 520AB

600AB 620AB

500AB 500AB

560AB

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE 

N/A
GOODYEAR ASSURANCE FIRESTONE CHASMPION FUEL FIGHTER

GOODYEAR EAGLE SPORT GOODYEAR EAGLE SPORT AS

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

TOYO EXTENSA A/S

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE AS

GOODYEAR WRANGLER 

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE AS

FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER 
NO. 079042 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 015352

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2 FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

BRIDGESTONE ECOPIA EP422
NO. 124551 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 001863

FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER 
NO. 147705 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 015199

FIRESTONE CHAMPION FUEL FIGHTER 
NO. 047150 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 014808

H

600AB

600AA



TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2

Bid No. 2018-005-6698
Invitation for Bid for Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes
Bid Open: November 6, 2017

Contract Period March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 817-454-41983 877-786-4681

Blagg Tire & Service Southern Tire Mart LLC
604 S. Main Street 800 Highway 98
Grapevine, Texas 76051 Columbia, MS 39429

Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 755276383 755276383

Total Section B $16,772.88 $23,608.40
Section B-Award Total $15,965.42 $956.50

SECTION C: LIGHT TRUCK TIRES  

31 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread, Size: P235/75R16 32 Each 174.93 $5,597.76 185.00 $5,920.00
Brand: Continental Vanco 4 Season No. 0451092 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed C/10 R
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed NA NA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 0451092 0451092

32 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size: : P235/75R16 32 Each 99.99 $3,199.68 102.55 $3,281.60
Brand: Firestone Destination LE2, part no. 140378 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed XL T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 104378 104378

33 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size: P235/75R17 32 Each 119.99 $3,839.68 130.87 $4,187.84
Brand: BFGoodrich No. 34949 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 580AB 580AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 34949 34949

34 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread, Size: P215/70R16 32 Each 85.99 $2,751.68 86.43 $2,765.76
Brand: Firestone LE2 No. 097725 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed H H
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 097725 097725

35 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread  , Size: P225/60R17 32 Each 79.99 $2,559.68 79.80 $2,553.60
Brand: Firestone LE2 No. 024991 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed H T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 024991 024991

36 Type: Light Truck, Size: 235/70R16  16 Each 103.99 $1,663.84 104.17 $1,666.72
Brand: Bridgeport Dueler, part no. 042577 or Firestone Destination LE2, part no. 097759 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 097759 097759

37 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size: P245/65R17 16 Each 99.99 $1,599.84 138.14 $2,210.24
Brand: Bridgestone Dueler, part no. 042594 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed H H
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 600AA 800AA
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 042594

38 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size: P255/65R17 68 Each 100.50 $6,834.00 106.47 $7,239.96
Brand: Firestone Destination LE2, part no. 098048 or Goodyear RSA part no. 183579418 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed S T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 500AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 183579418 098048

39 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread, Size: P255/70R17 32 Each 113.99 $3,647.68 114.93 $3,677.76
Brand: Firestone LE2 No. 136043 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 520AB 520AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 136043 136043

40 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread  , Size: P265/60R18 32 Each 88.99 $2,847.68 155.21 $4,966.72
Brand: Goodyear No. 183558436 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Speed Rating Being Proposed T T
Specify Tire UTQG, Temperature and Traction Rating Being Proposed 500AB 500AB
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 183558436 183558436

41 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size LT225/75R16   20 Each 103.24 $2,064.80 195.91 $3,918.20
Brand: Goodyear Wrangler HT, part no. 744830900 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 744830900 744830900

42 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size LT235/75R15  36 Each 99.99 $3,599.64 100.46 $3,616.56
Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 189837 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E C
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 189837 189837

43 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size LT235/85R16   30 Each 114.79 $3,443.70 115.71 $3,471.30
Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 189718 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 189718 189718

44 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size LT245/70R17   20 Each 119.99 $2,399.80 121.20 $2,424.00
Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 191316 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 191316 191316

45 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread , Size LT245/75R16   132 Each 108.99 $14,386.68 110.97 $14,648.04
Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 189769 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 189769 189769

46 Type: Light Truck ,Highway Tread , Size LT245/75R17   24 Each 119.99 $2,879.76 122.08 $2,929.92
Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 225425 or  Cooper (Starfire) No. 90000019679 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 225425 225425

47 Type: Light Truck , All Terrain  , Size LT265/75R16   14 Each 126.19 $1,766.66 127.25 $1,781.50

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

BRIDGESTON DUELER

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE CF FUEL MAX

CONTINENTAL VANCO 4 SEASON

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

BF GOODRICH LONG TRAIL T/A TOUR

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

CONTINENTAL VANCO 4 SEASON

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

BRIDGESTON H/L ALENZA PLUS
NO. 042594 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 000442

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE CF FUEL MAX

BF GOODRICH LONG TRAIL T/A TOUR

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2



TABULATION SHEET Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2

Bid No. 2018-005-6698
Invitation for Bid for Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes
Bid Open: November 6, 2017

Contract Period March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 817-454-41983 877-786-4681

Blagg Tire & Service Southern Tire Mart LLC
604 S. Main Street 800 Highway 98
Grapevine, Texas 76051 Columbia, MS 39429

Brand: Firestone Transforce HT, part no. 189786 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 189786 189786

48 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread   , Size LT265/70R17   12 Each 159.99 $1,919.88 155.00 $1,860.00
Brand: Bridgestone Dueler A/T, part no. 211682 or Goodyear No. 748535189 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 748535189

49 Type: Light Truck , Highway Tread ,SizeLT265/70R17   34 Each 132.99 $4,521.66 135.27 $4,599.18
Brand: Firestone No. 200156 or  Goodyear No. 179535492 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 200156 200156

50 Type: Light Truck, All Terrain, Size LT275/65R18   30 Each 158.99 $4,769.70 150.93 $4,527.90
Brand: Bridgestone Dueler A/T Revo 2, part no. 212056 or Goodyear No. 748965571 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 212056

51 Type: Light Truck, All Terrain , Size 265/65R18   4 Each 122.99 $491.96 162.60 $650.40
Brand: Goodyear Wrangler Silent Armor No. 758051188 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed SL 112
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 054018 000449

52 Type: Light Truck , All Terrain,Size Size P225/75R15   16 Each 84.99 $1,359.84 167.23 $2,675.68
Brand: Goodyear Wrangler SR-A No. 183064418 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed SL SL
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 183064418 183064418

53 Type: Light Truck, Size P235/70R17   8 Each 101.74 $813.92 102.00 $816.00
Brand: Goodyear Wrangler SR-A No. 183783418 or  Firestone Destination LE2, part no. 097776 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed XL XL
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 097776 097776

54 Type: Light Truck, G647 RSS Size P225/70R19.5 24 Each 221.99 $5,327.76 278.00 $6,672.00
Brand: Goodyear G647 RSS ,part no. 139172053 (No Substitutes
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 139172053 248698

Total Section C $84,287.28 $93,060.88
Section C-Award Total $74,546.06 $8,941.50

SECTION D: MEDIUM AND COMMERCIAL TRUCK TIRES 

55 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires ,Position: All-Position Steer , Sidewall protector ribs, Size: 1022.5 60 Each 317.99 $19,079.40 299.00 $17,940.00
Brand: Dunlop SP348, part no. 271124004 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 271124004 248596

56 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires , Position: All-Position Steer ,Sidewall protector ribs, Size: 11R22.5 60 Each 337.99 $20,279.40 310.00 $18,600.00
Brand: Dunlop SP348, part no. 271124000 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 271124000 248324

57
Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires ,Position: All-Position Steer, Protector ribs on both sidewalks ,           
Size: 11R24.5 90 Each 356.99 $32,129.10 289.00 $26,010.00
Brand: Dunlop SP 348, part no. 271124001 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 271124001 156582

58 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires , Position: All-Position Steer, Size: 12R22.5  4 Each 289.99 $1,159.96 310.00 $1,240.00
Brand: Dunlop SP348, part no. 271124006 or Firestone FS560 Plus, No. 156-523 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 156523

59
Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires ,Position: All-Position Steer, Protector ribs on both sidewalks ,  Size: 
225/70R19.5 30 Each 204.99 $6,149.70 291.25 $8,737.50
Brand: Continental HSR, part no. 0568555000 Dunlop SP348, part no. 271124002 or Cooper (Roadmaster) No.
71826 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 27724002 0512218

60 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires , Position: Steer , Size: 245/70R19.5 20 Each 219.99 $4,399.80 245.00 $4,900.00
Brand: Cooper RM170, part no. 95801 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 169964 540040

61 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires Trailer , Size: 255/70R22.5 42 Each 329.99 $13,859.58 304.50 $12,789.00
Brand: Goodyear G316, part no. 756067263 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 756067263 216568

62 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: : 225/70R19.5 8 Each 221.99 $1,775.92 270.01 $2,160.08
Brand: Goodyear G647, RSS, part no. 139172053 or approved equal
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 139172053 248681

63 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: 225/70R19.5 HDR 12 Each 289.06 $3,468.72 205.00 $2,460.00
Brand: Continental HDR part no. 0522146 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 0522146 0522146

64 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: 255/80R22.5 XRV 12 Each 479.99 $5,759.88 No Bid
Brand: Michelin XRV No. 59634 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 59634

CONTINENTAL HDR

MICHELIN XRV

FIRESTONE FS560

GOODYEAR G316

GOODYEAR G647

DUNLOP SP348 H

FIRESTONE FS560 PLUS

DUNLOP SP348

*95801 NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT

DUNLOP SP348

DUNLOP SP348

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

BRIDGESTONE DUELER AT REVO 2

BRIDGESTONE DUELER 

*7580511188 DISCONTINUED 

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SILENT ARMOR PRO GRADE

GOODYEAR G647 BRIDGESTONE R238

FIRESTONE FS561

TOYO M920

BRIDGESTONE R250ED

BRIDGESTONE R238

CONTINENTAL HDR

FIRESTONE FS560 PLUS

FIRESTONE FS560

BRIDGESTONE DUELER AT REVO 2
NO. 212056 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 102230

FIRESTONE FS561
NO. 156523 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 248494

CONTINENTAL HSR

BRIDGESTONE DUELER A/T REVO 2

GOODYEAR WRANGLER SRA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

BRIDGESTIONE DULER A/T REVO 2
NO. 211682 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 206531

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
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Bid No. 2018-005-6698
Invitation for Bid for Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes
Bid Open: November 6, 2017

Contract Period March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019 with Three (3) additional 
options to extend 817-454-41983 877-786-4681

Blagg Tire & Service Southern Tire Mart LLC
604 S. Main Street 800 Highway 98
Grapevine, Texas 76051 Columbia, MS 39429

65 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: 385/65R22.5 12 Each 589.99 $7,079.88 430.50 $5,166.00
Brand: Goodyear G296 MSA, part no. 756315365 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed J K
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 756315365 247780

66 Type: Inner Tube, Size: 10:00R20 32 Each 424.99 $13,599.68 235.00 $7,520.00

Brand: Samson part no. 87460 (No Substitutes)

Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed SAMSON DOUBLECOIN RR150
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 88072-2 1133281026

67 Type: Inner Tube, Size: 10:00R20 30 Each 25.00 $750.00 17.00 $510.00
Brand: Carlisle part no. 322080 (No Substitutes)
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed CARLISLE
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed CW120650

68 Type: : Inner Tube Size: 10:00/15 40 Each 20.00 $800.00 17.77 $710.80
Brand: Carlisle part no. 322250 (No Substitutes)
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed CARLISLE
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed CW140825

69 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires,  Size: 315/80R22.5 4 Each 426.99 $1,707.96 427.00 $1,708.00
Brand: Firestone FS400, No. 240623 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed L L
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE FS400 FIRESTONE FS400
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 240623 004168

70 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: : 285/75R24.5 4 Each 284.99 $1,139.96 284.50 $1,138.00
Brand: Firestone FS591, No. 238498 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE FS591 FIRESTONE FS591
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 238498 238498

71 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires, Size: 295/75R22.5 4 Each 279.99 $1,119.96 283.00 $1,132.00
Brand: Firestone FS560, No. 156566 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE FS560
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 156566 156566

72 Type: Medium and Commercial Truck Tires Size: 9R22.5 6 Each 239.99 $1,439.94 255.25 $1,531.50
Brand: Firestone FS560, No. 193016 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed F F
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE FS560 FIRESTONE FS561
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 193016

Total Section D $135,698.84 * VENDOR TOTAL $115,381.60 $114,252.88
Section D-Award Total $113,090.68 $3,598.00

SECTION E: OFF ROAD/CONSTRUCTION/AGRICULTURE/INDUSTRIAL/SPECIALTY EQUIPMENT TIRES

73 Type: Off-Road/Construction Equipment , Skid Steer Loader Tire , Size: 12-16.5NHS 18 Each 219.99 $3,959.82 380.51 $6,849.18
Brand: Titan 43H34R, SuperMax OTR G-2 RG, part no. OTR-4052AMD or Samson No. 161622 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed G G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 6H0326 43H34R

74 Type: Off-Road/Construction Equipment Tire, Compactor Roller, TL, Size: 10-16.5NHS 16 Each 139.99 $2,239.84 334.00 $5,344.00
Brand: Titan 43H3R8, SuperMax OTR G-2 RG, part no. OTR-4050AMD or Samson No. 704700 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 10PLY E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 51S3J7 43H3R8

75 Type: Off-Road/Construction Equipment Tire Compactor Roller, TL 12 Each 169.99 $2,039.88 195.49 $2,345.88
Brand: Carlisle 58R3A2, Titan Road Roller II, part no. 3GR3A2, BKT Pacmaster, Code 94002603 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 6PLY C
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 101111441 3GR3A2

76
Type: Off-Road/Construction Equipment Tire Road Grader Tire Tread Type: Traction Non-Directional, G2/L2 Size: 
14.00R24 28 Each 899.99 $25,199.72 621.08 $17,390.24
Brand: Bridgestone VUT, part no. 293954, Double Coin REM1, part no. 1107114241 Triangle TB515 G-2 T2 or 
Samson No. 41401 (No Substitutes)  
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 1* 1*
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed BRIDGESTONE VUT
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 293954 10135150080

77 Type: Loader Tire Tread Type: Traction, TL Size: 10.00-16.5    10 Each 139.99 $1,399.90 121.80 $1,218.00
Brand: Deestone D304, part no. DS6105 or or  Samson No. 704700 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 10PLY E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GALAXY TL R-4
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 570140 111260

78 Type: Loader/Grader Tire  Tread Type: Traction, TL Size: 23.5-25    4 Each 1,349.99 $5,399.96 1,582.08 $6,328.32
Brand: Firestone SGG LD, part no. 405221 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H L
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 405221 404969

79 Type: Roller Tire  Compactor Tire – Bias, TT Tread Type: Smooth Finish Size: 7.50-15  26 Each 169.99 $4,419.74 153.53 $3,991.78
Brand: Carlisle 60127 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 12 F
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 60127 60127

Total Section E $44,658.86 $43,467.40
Section E-Award Total $5,399.96 $35,921.08

SECTION F: TRAILER TIRES 

80 Type: Loader Tire Size: 15-19.5 NHS 4 Each 349.99 $1,399.96 298.00 $1,192.00
Brand: Destone D304, Product No. DS6120, Titan No. 412336 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 14PLY G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed TITAN
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 511702 412,373

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

CARLISLE ROAD ROOLLER

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

CARLISLE TRAC CHIEF 

FIRESTONE SGGLD

SOLIDEAL SMOOTH

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

322100 PART # CHANGED

322250

*BRANDS LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

CARLISLE ULTRA GUARD MX

*BRANDS LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

CARLISLE TRAC CHIEF

GOODYEAR G296MSA

*TUBE AND FLAP INCLUDED WITH THIS CODE 87460 NOT 
AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

TRIANGLE TB515 G2 TL

FIRESTONE SGG

CARLISLE ROAD ROOLLER

CARLISLE TRAC CHIEF XT

NO. 193016 DISCONTINUED REPLACED NO. 248562

TITAN H/E ND SKID STEER 

TITAN NHS

TITAN ROAD ROLLER II

FIRESTONE FS818

COUNTRYWIDE TR78A

COUNTRYWIDE TR78A

FIRESTONE FS560 PLUS
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81 Type: Trailer , Bias Size: 9.50 - 16.5    16 Each 116.99 $1,871.84 120.65 $1,930.40
Brand: Goodyear Workhorse Rib part no. 312218090 or Firestone Transforce HT no. 189-820 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 189820 189820

82 Type: Trailer , Radial, Size: ST225/75R15    20 Each 79.99 $1,599.80 60.99 $1,219.80
Brand: Gladiator QR25-TS, part no. 1942002253, Carlisle No, 5151411 
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GLADIATOR QR-25
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 724857519 1942002253

83 Type: Trailer ,Radial  Size: : ST205/75R15 24 Each 61.99 $1,487.76 52.11 $1,250.64
Brand: Gladiator QR25-TS, part no. 1142002052, Carlisle No. 5151381, (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed D D
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GLADIATOR QR-25
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 724861519 1942002052

84 Type: Trailer, Size: ST205/75R14 12 Each 58.99 $707.88 49.55 $594.60
Brand: Gladiator QR25-TS, part no. 1142002041, Carlisle No. 5151351 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 8PLY C
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GLADIATOR QR-25
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 6H04551 1142002041

85 Type: Trailer, low profile, 16 ply, bias ply, tube type black sidewall  Size: 10:00-15 12 Each 224.99 $2,699.88 195.00 $2,340.00
Brand: Samson Product No. 11207 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 16 J
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed DEESTONE
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 11207-2 DS6366

86 Type: Trailer Tire, radial, Size: ST235/80R16 12 Each 88.99 $1,067.88 68.00 $816.00
Brand: Gladiator QR-25, No. GL1142002863 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed D E
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GLADIATOR QR-25
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 6H01441 114002863

87 Type: Trailer Tire, radial, Size: ST205/90D15 12 Each 89.99 $1,079.88 64.00 $768.00
Brand: Carlisle 6h01441 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed E D
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed CARLISLE
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 724858519 6H01411

88 Type: Trailer Tire, radial, Size: 235 X 75 X R17.5 12 Each 159.99 $1,919.88 150.00 $1,800.00
Brand: Samson /GL283A (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed 16 G
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed SAMSON
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 880112 GL283A

89 Type: Trailer Tire, radial, Size: 10.00 X R17.5 12 Each 343.99 $4,127.88 458.00 $5,496.00
Brand: Goodyear G114  or Samson 10175 (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed H H
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed GOODYEAR F114
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 135349002 135,349,002

90 Type: Tubes Size: 7.00/7.50R-15 20 Each 13.00 $260.00 14.00 $280.00
Brand: Carlisle TR440 Long Stem Valve (No Substitutes)
Specify Tire Load Range Being Proposed NA N/A
Specify Manufacturer Being Proposed FIRESTONE
Specify Manufacturer Part Number/Product Number Being Proposed 322450 556,556

Total Section F $18,222.64 $17,687.44
Section F-Award TotaL $6,259.72 $5,198.40

Total Section A, B, C, D, E & F $537,829.04 $406,346.50
* VENDOR TOTAL $336,925.62

AWARD TOTAL $463,191.60 $63,375.48

SECTION G: DISCOUNT FOR TIRES/TUBES THAT ARE NOT SPECIFICALLY LISTED ON THE BID
(Note: This Section may have multiple awards based on the manufacturer listed) 

Category Type: Police Pursuit Tires

MANUFACTURER / BRAND NAME 

MINIMUM DISCOUNT 
PERCENTAGE OFF 
MANUFACTURES'S 
LIST PRICE 

NAME OF MANUFACTURES'S LIST 
PRICE

Bridgestone % off 

Firestone % off 20 % BFS GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 49.5% GY GVT PRICE CAT
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 
BF Goodrich % off 
Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Performance/High Speed Tires

Bridgestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT

Firestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Dunlop % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Michelin % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
BF Goodrich % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Uniroyal % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Continental % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
General  % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Passenger Tires 

CARLISLE TR440

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

CARLISLE RADIAL TRAIL HD

SAMSON TRAILER EXPRESS

GOODYEAR ENDURANCE

SAMSON G283A

GOODYEAR G114

CARLISLE  SPORT TRAIL LH

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

GOOYEAR ENDURANCE

*CODES LISTED NOT AVAILABLE REPLACEMENT 

GOOYEAR ENDURANCE

*CARLISLE PART NUMBER CHANGED
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Bridgestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 

Firestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Dunlop % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Michelin % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
BF Goodrich % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Uniroyal % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Continental % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
General  % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Light Truck  - Radial 

Bridgestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 

Firestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Dunlop % off 45 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Michelin % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
BF Goodrich % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Uniroyal % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Continental % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
General  % off 49 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Light Truck  - Bias 

Bridgestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT
Firestone % off 20 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT
Goodyear % off 
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 
BF Goodrich % off 
Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Medium and Commercial Duty Truck Tires 

Bridgestone % off 39 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 

Firestone % off 36 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 51 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Dunlop % off 51 % GY GVT PRICE CAT
Michelin % off 60 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
BF Goodrich % off 60 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Uniroyal % off 50 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
Continental % off 31 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
General  % off 31 % CONTI GVT PRICE CAT
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Off the Road - Radial Tires

Bridgestone % off 37 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Firestone % off 37 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT
Goodyear % off 
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 40 % MAST GVT PRICE CAT
BF Goodrich % off 
Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Off the Road – Bias  Tires

Bridgestone % off 37 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 

Firestone % off 37 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT 20 % 2017 GOVERNMENT CATALOG 
Goodyear % off 
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 
BF Goodrich % off 
Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Farm/Agriculture Tires

Bridgestone % off 
Firestone % off 23 % BFS  GVT PRICE CAT
Goodyear % off 
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 
BF Goodrich % off 
Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

Category Type: Specialty Tires

Bridgestone % off 
Firestone % off 
Goodyear % off 
Dunlop % off 
Michelin % off 
BF Goodrich % off 
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Uniroyal % off 
Continental % off 
General  % off 
Carlisle % off 
Other (Specify Manufacturer.Brand Name) % off 

SECTION H:  USED AND SCRAP TIRES REMOVAL, PICK-UP AND DISPOSAL SERVICES 
(This Section will be awarded on an all or none basis) 

Type: Passenger/Automotive Tires 3000 Each 3.50 $10,500.00 2.00 $6,000.00

Type: Light Trucks Tires 815 Each 3.50 $2,852.50 2.00 $1,630.00

Type: Medium Duty Tires 115 Each 10.00 $1,150.00 4.00 $460.00

Type: Commercial Trucks Tires 150 Each 10.00 $1,500.00 4.00 $600.00

Type: Off Road/Construction Tires 35 Each 25.00-100.00 875.00-3,500.00 25.00-100.00 875.00-3,500.00

Type: Farm/Agriculture Tires 20 Each 25.00-100.00 875.00-3,500.00 25.00-100.00 875.00-3,500.00

Type: Trailer Tires 35 Each 3.50 $122.50 2.00 $70.00

Total Section H $16,125.00 $8,760.00
Total Award - Section H $8,760.00

Specify any additional discounts, cost, services not included

Specify additional comments

a)  Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees? Yes Yes
b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its employees, does the company 
share in the cost a minimum of: 
95% for employee only coverage? No No
85% for employee +children No No
73% for employee +spouse No No
71% for employee+family coverage No No
c) If your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is the coverage 
comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan 
description? Yes No
d) If your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the fulfillment of this bid, does each of the 
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas 
County’s health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

NA
No

Primary Contact Person Perry Leonard 817-454-4183 Rick Spigelmeyer 817-401-6700

Secondary Contact Person Scott South 817-538-3840 Johnny Johnson 713-417-4802
scott@blaggtire.com

On scrap we would like to schedule timely pickup to avoid 
large amounts of scrap tires that can become infested with 
insects and water due to being outside, with normal pick up 
when new tires are delivered this can satisfy this issue.  It 
becomes a better facility process for the County as well as 
BLagg Tire.  We can schedule with each warehouse based 
on convenience. 

rspigelmyer@stmtires.com

jjohnson@stmtires.com

pleonard@carconcetsinc.com
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