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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Deliver: / DAYS ARO

TCP Lamp 10Watt LED A 19 60 watt cqual LAMP 27K,

TCP bulb LED 12 Watt A19 Snow Cone,
TCP No. LED 12E26A 1927K or equal
Specify Manubicturer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

TCP Lamp 14 Want PAR 30 LED dimmable, flood,
TCP No. LED 14E26P3030KFL or equal
Specily Manufacturer::

Specify Product No./Order Cocle:

Specily Quantity per Case
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

TCP Lamp LEDI7W Par 38 LED Lamp,
TCP No. LED 17E26P3H30KFL

TCP lamp LED 17 Watt E26 lamp Narrow Flood, par38,

TCP No. LED 17EZ6P3830KNFL or equal
Specify Manufacturer::

Specily Product No./Order Code:

TCP hulb LED 9 watt pur2() 40 degree ilood,
TCP No. LED 9E26P2027KFL or equal
Specify Manulacturer::

per Case:
Speeily Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

TCP bulb LED 9Watt PAR20 Lamp Dimmable 40 degree (lood

TCP No. LED 9E26P2030KFL or equal
Specily Manufacturer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Cast:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

TCP lamp LED 50 watt g

Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

TCP bulb Frosted LED 2 WATT WHITE (3000K),replacement

Specily Quantity per Case:

alent PAR20 flood Dimmable

150

150

150

150

150

150

150

150

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
W\ 512-862-7974

N3 Days A.R.O.

$1.45

/ Megaman

LG4509D-E26-2700K

/7

2222

$1.90

E
2684

wNo

w

.90

Philips

467886

12

3 Days A.R.Q.
$5.50

T zz447240d

GE
89992

w

3 Days A.R.O.
$6.25

Philips
467704

12

3 Days A.R.O.

T4

$5.25
Philips
463646

12

3 Days A.R.O.
$5.25

Philips

463646

T zzzzzzzz22:4

N
/

12

3 Days A.R.O.
B2k

Philips
463646

12

3 Days AR.O,
No Bid

720002044024

2 of 60

S 217:50

$285.00

$885.00

$825.00

$937.50

$787.50

$787.50

78750

iz

ﬂe.m:n_n_. #2

Chatsworth, CA
NN 800-284-2024
W\ 2 DAYS

2.99 $448.50

22722

SYLVANIA
LED10A19DIM0O930UB

DAYS
99 $448.50

Mo

SYLVANIA
LED10A19DIM0O930UB

2 DAYS
11.69 $1,753.50

SYLVANIA

7z

7

N LED12.5PAR3OLN/HD/D
N IM/930/FL40 [79568]

2

2 DAYS
11.69 $1,753.50

SYLVANIA
LED12.5PAR30LN/HD/D

2 DAYS
11.69 $1,753.50

SYLVANIA
LED12,5PAR30LNHDDI

/ M930NFL25 [79565]

G274

2 DAYS
8.39 $1,258.50

w.

SYLVANIA
LEDBPAR20/HDODIM/9

30/FL40 [79565]
2 DAYS
8.39 $1,258.50
SYLVANIA

LED8PAR20/HD/DIM/93
0/FL40 [79567]

04744

2 DAYS
7.28 $1,092.00

TCP
LED8P20D41KFL [TCP]

2 DAYS
12.60 $3,780.00
SATCO

2W/GBF/LED/12V
[59005]

i
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2018-004--6687

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Product No/Order Cocle:

4 1/XPISS/ECO3,21TW, T8 me
or equal

/Order Code:

y per Case:
1/ DAYS ARO

No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS A RO

Lamp, FO32/841/XPS/ECQ3.32 Watt, T8, Medium base
ia No. 21681 or cqual

Speily Product No./Order Code;

Specily Quantity per Case

Specify Deliver: / DAYS ARO

¥4 1/HO/SS/ECO,50W, T8, Medium base
64 or cqual

y y per Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS AR.O

up, T8 QHEZx32T8/UNV/DIM/TC 50736 High Elliciency 2 Lamp Universal Voltape electronic ballast,

Specify Product No,/Order Code:

ty per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Sylvania lamp, fluorescent ballast QHE-2X32TR/UNV-ISL-SC , (2 Lamp T8 Unv Low Power)
0. 49863 or equal
Specify Manuficturer::

Sylvani

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Sylvania lamp, QHE-3X32T8/UNV-ISL-5C (3 Lamp T8 Uny Low Power)

Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO

Lamps and Ballast

1000

40,000

40,000

300

300

1000

300

\ Vendor # 1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
W\ 512-862-7974

4

N
\
\
Each / No Bid
\
\
N
\
Each Wﬂup i $52,400.00
Nt
W/ 72866
\
Wu Days AR.Q,
Each Mzo Bid
W
X
\
N
\
Each I No Bid
/
X
N
N\
N
\
Each / No Bid
N
W
N
\
/
Each /ﬁq.mm $7,650.00
\
”mﬁ&:.m
”Ammmu
” Wocm«.m A.R.O.
N
Each r/rﬂﬁm.mm T $2,685.00
ﬂ i
”mé...w
/k_mmmm
W wm__umﬁ A.R.O,

I,

T4z

N\ Vendor # 2
Regency Lighting
/ 9261 Jordan Ave
./ Chatsworth, CA

N\ 800-284-2024
A 2W/GBF/LED/12V
[S9005]

2/

2 DAYS

2,72

SYLVANIA
FO25/21W/841/XP/SS/
ECO3 [22396]

2 DAYS

747224

1.80
SYLVANIA

FO28/841/XV/SS/ECO
[21421]

2 DAYS
2.84
SYLVANIA

N F032/841/XPS/ECO
[21681]

2 DAYS

473

SYLVANIA
FP54/50W/HO/SS/ECO
[20964]

2 DAYS

32.74

SYLVANIA
QHE2X32T8/UNV/DIM/
TC [50736]

2 DAYS

sl

72

SYLVANIA
QHE2X32TBUNVISLSC

[49863]

4

2 DAYS

9.83

SYLVANIA
QHE3X32TBUNVISLSC

N (49865]
N2 DAYS
N

2424

7

$2,720.,00

$72,000.00

$113,600.00

$1,419.00

$9,822.00

$8,720.00

$2,949.00
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

jod 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Contract

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS ARO

Sylvania Metal Halide Ballast, M320/MULTI-PS-KIT , (MH REPL BAL 47676)320 watt,

Sylvania No. 47676 or equal

rder Code:

Specily Deliver::/ DAYS A RO

Sylvania Lamp, 50 watt, MSO/MULTI-KIT (MAG HID BALLAST 4700 )

Specily Product No./Order Codle;

1y per Casie:
ver: / DAYS ARO

SYL Lamp, 70 watts, Metal Halide, MTO/MULTL-KIT (MAG HID BALLAST 47013)Multi tap

Sylvania No. 47013 or cqual
Specily Manufacturer::

Speify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Spucify Deliver: / DAYS A.RO

o0./Onler Code:

y per Case:

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Sylvania Bulb, 50 Watt, ED 17, MP50/U/MED (HID LAMP 64587}, Mctal Halide

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O

Sylvania Bulb, 70 walt.E 17, MP70/U/MED (70 Watt Med. Base Metal Halide Lamp) Pulse Start

Sylvania No. 64547 or cqual

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Sylvania Lamp, 150 Walt, E17, Metal Halide MP150/U/MED (HID LAMP 64402)

150

150

150

300

300

300

300

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
W\ 512-862-7974

3

v

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

T4

T iizzzzzzz24

T izzzzzzzzzéddéd

7

=
o

=
&

it
=
=}
ol

Sylvania
84417

10

3 Days A.R.O.
11.85
Sylvania

4402
0

W= gy

Days A.R.O.
11.59

Sylvania
64587

3 Days A.R.O.

iy
B
u
=]

Sylvania
64547

W3 Days A.R.O.

6 of 60

$3,285.00

$3,555.00

43,477.00

$3,750.00

\ Vendor # 2
Regency Lighting
9261 Jordan Ave
Chatsworth, CA

N\ 800-284-2024

N SYLVANIA™

s,

[47690]

2DAYS

a
|5+
w
Al

SYLVANIA
M320/MULTI [47676]

2 DAYS

w
o
~i
o

SYLVANIA
MS0/MULTI-KIT
(47007

W/}W/M/m/

2 DAYS

w
~
N
~

SYLVANIA
M70/MULTI-KIT

&
~
o
=
w
—_

2 DAYS

20.82

SYLVANIA
MC200/PS/U/ET18/940
[64917]

2 DAYS

o
(i
~
)

D 7777270247242424

J7zz7zz2774dd

72272 %:

SYLVANIA
MP100/U/MED [64417]

2 DAYS

[

6.20
SYLVANIA
MP1500/U/MED
[64402]

2 DAYS

iy

4.47

SYLVANIA
MP150/U/MED [64587]

2 DAYS

SYLVANIA
MP70/U/MED [64547]

2 DAYS

N

M200/MULTI-PS-KIT

$9,442.50

§5,668.50

$5,665.50

$6,246.00

$3,816.00

$4,860.00

$4,341.00

$2,952.00
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2018-004--6697
l.amps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Venture Ballast 875 watt , pulse start, metal halide dry capacior ignitor and bracket

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

LED, LEDZ4WPT30KMED-G7, HID Replacement 24W-3,000LM, 3000K, BOCRI, NON-DIM, 126, UNIV BURRN POS, 100-277V
EIKO No. 19634 or equal

Specily Manulacturer::
Specily Product No /Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

IKMOG-GT, LED 111 REPLACEMEN T, 27W-3,510LM, 3000K, S0CRI NON-DIM, X35, UNIV BURN POS, 100-277V
or equal

Specify Manufacturer:

Specify Product No./Ornler Code:

DAYS ARO

(T2TND20-27TV G2
. 473652 or equal

Specily Manulicturer::

Specify Product No./Onder Code:

ESPAN REPLACEMENT, RUW 10,

Im 4K, RICRI EX39 UNIBURN 120-277V

Specify Manufacturer::

Total Section €

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
NN 512-862-7974

No Bid

w
~
fe=]
pv=}

$3,289.00

Philips

T zz72404444

473595
4.00
3 Days

Y]
=3
o
wm

$2,865.00

o
&

9634

W= o

Days

w
B
o
S

$3,400.00

m
=
=]

10227 /LED27WPT30KM
0G-8

T vz77724444

iy
o
o

3 Days

%
=
o~
[}

$5,745.00

473652

Days

a
5
[t=
[t

$6,591.00

Liteway

%%

02226-40K

W

Days

$3,289.00

22222

N\ Philips

8 of 60

RSP X CRY

.

N Vendor # 2

Regency Lighting

9261 Jordan Ave

Chatsworth, CA

71 800-284-2024

328.73 $32,873.00

Yo,

ADVANCED
71AG4F8500T [ADV]

2 DAYS

$3,750.00
PHILIPS

20EDZ3.5/LEDf 7 2/7fND

120-277V G2 4/1

[47359-5]

2 DAYS

46.78 $4,678.00

SATCO
N\ 20W/LED/HID/WP/3K/E
/ 26/100-277V [58904]

2 DAYS
56.9 $5,690.00

SATCO

30W/LED/HID/WP/3K/E
39/100-277V [S8908]

2 DAYS

@
B
0

$6,250.00

PHILIPS
SHEDABLED) £ 2/fNDf 1

20-277V G2 4/1 [47365-

7z zz7zz/zz24

\

e

2 DAYS

[re]
e
]
@

$9,488.00

b
a
o

2 DAYS

w
~
wn

43,750.00

72772740404

PHILIPS

w

117$193,645/5071

8OW/LED/HID/4000K/100-277V/EX39 [S29675]
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Manuficturer::

Specily Praduct No./Order Code:
Specify Qi ¢ per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

LEDSW2PLIGIR27-GT

No./Order Code:
er Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS A.RO

No./Order Code:
iy per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO

HID REP

Specify Manuficturer:

Speily Product No./Order Code:

y por Case:
1/ DAYS ARO

1 MNo./Order Cade:

Specify Quantity per Case:

SWWIESP21 2001, Horizontal burn

CEMENT, LED120WPTSOKMOG-G6, LED Litespan, 120W 15,9601m 5K SICREEX3Y univ burn 120-277V

LT LED26V-3500 1F 4P TPK 1041

4P IPK 101

[LiH}

500

500

100

500

500

100

%eﬁ:nnq #1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785

Round Raock, TX 78681

W 512-862-7974

N

/ Philips
532416

20

3 DAYS

GG

Each

=]
=]
=]

EIKO
10172/LEDSW2P/G23/8

27DM-G7B

u
o

3 DAYS

Each

0
=)
S

Philips

853
i
Bl
ey

3 DAYS

Each

b
o
=)

7/ pzzz22z4444

PHILIPS
532417

]
o

3 DAYS

Each

@
o
o
«

LITEWAY

02227-50K
DAYS

Each

b
=)
=)

PHILIPS

8422

W= h
ow;

DAYS

Each

o
=}
=}

2727 470

PHILIPS

8380

[T
ou

DAYS
Each

PHILIPS
5418/0/1318-

6U/MAS/24-
840/IF21/P10/1
W10

2%

10 of 60

$3,000.00

$4,500.00

$4,500.00

$8,865.00

$4,500.00

$4,500.00

$1,175.00

A Vendor # 2

Regency Lighting
9261 Jordan Ave
Chatsworth, CA
\\ 800-284-2024

10

MAXLITE
6PLG24QLED35 [MXT]

2 DAYS

o
[
=

MAXLITE
6PLGX26LED27 [MXT]

2 DAYS

B
W
~

MAXLITE
6PLGX23LED35 [MXT]

[¥]
=]
=
-
w

~
=)
~

/2744244224

MAXLITE
/m_u_umxmu_-moum [MXT]

]
=
£
w

134.12

4

ATCO
ZUW/LED{HID/50UUK/

00-277V/EX39
[529397]

=

2 DAYS

9
i
5

MAXLITE
12PLG24QVLED35

MXT]
2 DAYS

0
o
h

MAXLITE
12PLG24QHLED35

3

2 DAYS

frd
b
=

T 77274444404000dd4

=
g
g

U13T8DF240 [MXT]

224

$3,685.00

$3,685.00

$3,685.00

$13,412.00

$4,125.00

$4,125.00

$1,260.00

/4444444444444
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794
Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend
EIKO No. 08594 or equal

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Speify Deliver: / DAYS ARO

150, 30 deg beam, 3W - 1231m, Noo-Dinimable, 000K, 75 CRI, 12V DEAC

INSTART T8, 7T8/MAS/24-840/TF 112 1071, G13

Philips No, 541839 or equal

Specify Manuf:

Irer::

Specify Product No,/Order Code,

1, HORIZONTAL BURN

2P AP 10/, 2G11

200

150

200

500

300

300

200

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 1

LED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
512-862-7974

EIKO
08894
10

3 DAYS

o
~
ol

PHILIPS

467829/12PAR30L/F25/
830/DIM
12

N

3 DAYS

zzzzqzqz247222

m @
n
gc

900

wu o
o @

DAYS

(el
0
=]

PHILIPS

541839

W
o

DAYS

@
@
(=]

PHILIPS
532374

=]
(=}

3 DAYS

T zzz2z77z44474440000d

£
o
S

PHILIPS
529578

B vy

: =]

® =

e
w

w
(%)
o

2472727 i

12 of 60

$750.00°

$1,275.00

41,780.00

$4,400.00

$1,440.00

$3,555.00

§700.00

I,

\ Vendor # 2

Regency Lighting

9261 Jordan Ave
Chatsworth, CA

W\ 800-284-2024

SATCO
3MR11/LED/25/3000K/
12v [59281]

2 DAYS

fult
2
W
=)

SYLVANIA

LED10PAR30LNDIMB27
NFL25GL3WRP [78251]

2 DAYS

Py
[
@
=]

SATCO

2W/GBF/LED/12V
[S9005]

2 DAYS

~
w0
o

SYLVANIA
LEDST8L24FG8415UBG

7 [75522]

/444

~N

DAYS

o
w
~

MAXLITE
6PLGX23LED35 [MXT]

2 DAYS

~
w
~

MAXLITE
6PLGX23LED35 [MXT]

2 DAYS

Q
Ny
¥}

SYLVANIA
LED17TT5DLFG8355UB

W66 [71181]

T /7777722420474224044

NN

w

Bg
=
w

74

SYLVANIA

$2,072.0

$1,890.00

$1,518.00

$3,685.00

7

2724224400400

$2,211.00

$2,937.00,

$464.00
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Product Ne/Order Code: W//.moumwo\rmuuopwm\mé_‘“
”u DAYS
50 Each Mm.cc $100.00
M EIKO
” 09865
MW_ DAYS
500 Each W 4.50
N
W PHILIPS
1/// 455683
N
3 DAYS
N
1000  Each W 7.75
N
M PHILIPS
et No./Order Code: /
/ 473990
ity per Case: ” 10
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O ” 3 DAYS
© SECTION DTOTAL: i M i AL TR0
PLEASE INCLUDE ALL OTHER BRANDS/MANUFACTURER % OFF DISCOUNTS THAT YOU WOULD LIKE TO y/
INCLUDE IN YOUR PROPOSAL: escription % off Discount
MU % off Di
/ N/A
N
X
M N/A
I// N/A
N
W. N/A
” N/A
GRAND TOTAL: / $260,742.50
N
Award Total /// $71,177.00
\
Specify any additional comments / cost / etc. not included with your bid proposal, if applicable ”
| N
/
\
\
Specify additional comments ”_._E
Cooperative Purchasing W Yes
14 0f 60 _

X Vendor # 1

NILED LYSI Lighting

797 Sam Bass Rd #785
Round Rock, TX 78681
NN 512-862-7974

I

Vendors Total: $150,911.00

225

=]

Tz

~
]
3]
=]

ﬁcm:nnq #2

Chatsworth, CA
NN 800-284-2024
O LED8.5A19F82710YVRP

[73885]

T

2 DAYS

L)
£
w

$174.50

Tz

SATCO
2.5T6/LED/CL/27K/EL12/
120V [S9872]

2 DAYS

S

.65 $2,325.00

SYLVANIA
LED14A19F82710YVRP
[79292]

2 DAYS

ay
o
w

$6,250.00

SYLVANIA
LED10T8/L48/FG/B41/S
UB/G7 [79546]

N

[¥]
o
=
<
w

Description % off Discount

=
=
=

$642,728.50
$54,881.50

72244

$174,7605077
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Staci Eudy, Contract Specialist
214-653-7725
i dallascaunty.

SBE Certified Vendor
Certified by other Agency
1295

EEO1

2270 Verification Form

DESCRIPTION:
Section .» ,M..m_u.m. 0
11 Wait AR-111 12 Volt LED G53 Base 3200K. 25 Degree B

Satco No.
Specify Man

Specify Product No./Order Code:

fy Quantity per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O

Sylvania No. 78639 or equal
Specily Manuli

Speeify Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO

Lamp, LED1SPAR3S/DIM/BIFLAQ, 18 wal

No.Order Coue,

per Case:

Specily Delivers: / DAYS ARO

TCP bulb LED 2 Wan GBF R

TCP No. LEZWGBF or equal
cturer:

TCP No. LED 17P38D30KFL or cqual

Sp urer::

Hours Light Bulb ,

Vendor # 3

VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

website
DALLAS@VOSSLIGHTING.COM
972-432-8367

fax 972-432-0206

*%*RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD **#*
SEC B: 19, 29, 32

SEC C: 39, 50, 51, 53, 55

Recommend for Award SEC D: 75, 101

Estimated

Quantity Unit Cost Extension

300 Each 19.22 $5,766.00

SIGNIFY

458554
6
7 DAYS

150 Each  5.80 $870.00
SIGNIFY
529743
6
2 DAYS
150  Each 5.80 $870.00
SIGNIFY
529743
6
7 DAYS
150 Each

6.91 $1,036.5

o

/7777

7

SIGNIFY
529594

6
7 DAYS

500 Each 938 $4,690.00
Tcp
LED2WGBFV2
12
7 DAYS

150  Each 13.50 42,025.00

SIGNIFY

471011

6

16 of GO

N Vendor # 4
MAVICH
525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX
FATTH GORDAN
website
SALES@NMAVICH.COM
62-503-4484
X 682-503-6576

o

7T *#%¥RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD ¥
i SEC B: 23, 28, 34 y

SECC: 36,42
SECD: 69,77,97

7

Unit Cost Extension

25.29 $7,587.00

GE LIGHTING
50AR111/SP4
1

CA
5 DAYS

M

62.94 $9,441.00
GE LIGHTING

CMH39/PAR30L/FL25

1CA
5 DAYS

6.15 $922.50

9]

E LIGHTING
ED10/DR303/827W
A

DAYS

Ul

25.10 43,765.00
GE LIGHTING
LED18D38W3930/40
2CA
5 DAYS

5.37 $2,685.00
GE LIGHTING
QS0MR16/CG/FL 9EXN)
1CA
5 DAYS

17.10 $2,565.00
TCP

LED17P38D30KFL

SN 1CA
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2018-004--6897
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No, 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Total Section A i

Section B: Lamps

Lamp, CFITELMINITWIST/
S ia No, 29378 ar equal
Specify Manufacturer:;

i No./Order Code:

300

Lamp, Mini Twist, 13 watis, T4 bulb, 1000
Sylvania No. 29376 or equal

Specify Manufacturer::

1 No./Order Codle:

y per Case:
Specily Deliver: / DAYS A RO

Lamp, CFZIEL/MINLA
Sylvania No. 29397 or
Specify Man

23 watt, medium base 300

1y per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO
Lanp, CFAOELTWIST/S27/RP, 40 watt, medium base 100

Sylvania No. 29786 or equal
Specify Many

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:

Specily Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Lamp, CEESELTWIST, 65 watt, mein
Sylvania No. 29508 or cqual

100

500

Vendor # 3

VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

X Vendor # 4
MAVICH
525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX
3 FAITH GORDAN

0

7 DAYS
1$26,149.00
Each  1.40 $420.00 5.47
SIGNIFY
413996 LUMAPRO
6 2CUT3
7 DAYS 6 (MULTIPLES OF 6)
/m DAYS
- W
5 DAYS
Each 245 $735.00 NO BID
TCP
1R2014
Each
5 DAYS
Each  3.70 $1,110.00 13.34
TCP LUMAPRO
2p3819 2CUV8
6CA (MUS | BE
ORDERED IN
12 MULTIPLES OF 6)
7 DAYS /m DAYS
Each  5.36 $536.00 8.66
TCP GE LIGHTING
48942 40A15CF/STG CD2
2 (MUST BE ORDERED
12 IN MULTIPLES OF 2)
7 DAYS 5 DAYS
Each  10.38 E.Sm.oa/u.mm
TCP %Ez%za
28968 452M07 (100 WATTS)
6 1CA
7 DAYS /m DAYS
Each 2.12 %romo.oo/“_..:
SIGNIFY 7
18 of 60

L §4T09850

$1,641.00

$4,002.00

$866.00

$368.00

2 ,..mm.mmbc.
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

ly per Case:
eri f DAYS ARO

32 ot, T8, QHE4X32TS/UNV-ISN-SC-B , 4
33 QHES-2X32T8/UNV-PSN-SC-B (2L T8
Specify Manufacturer::
Specily Product No./Order Co
34 1, T8 QTEB1LS50-LP-120/277 1-Lamp-Emergency low profile
35 FL-YW/TWIST/2TK
36
Sylvania No. 47682 or equal
Specily M
37 e MISOAUMED, 150 watt, med
38 JULTI-PS-KIT M136

2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

QHE-4X32T8/UNV-ISL-5C (4 Lamp T8 Uny Low Power)

300

300

300

100

300

Total Sectlon B

300

300

300

Vendor # 3
VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING

11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234
JAMES MCCLURE

Each  9.39
SIGNIFY
10PA4P32LWN351
10
7 DAYS

Each 9.39
SIGNIFY
10PA4P32N351
10
7 DAYS

Each  12.02
SIGNIFY
10P2PSP32N351
10
7 DAYS

Each  56.98
EXITRONICS
XEB7BLM
6 .
7 DAYS

Each  3.05

TCP

4891355

2
7 DAYS

Each 33.51

SIGNIFY
71A5492001D
1
7 DAYS

Each  10.83
SIGNIFY
354621
12
7 DAYS

Each  58.78

20 of 60

X Vendor # 4
MAVICH

525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX
/m>_.:._ GORDAN

$2,817.00 16.99 $5,097.00

7/

GE LIGHTING
GE432MAXP-L-ULTRA
1CA

5 DAYS

$2,817.00 17.75 $5,325.00

7

E LIGHTING

CA

m
mmm_ww_,;}xﬂ.z.c_-._ﬁ..y
H
5 DAYS

W

$3,606.00 13.01 $3,903.00
GE LIGHTING
GE232-MV-PS-N

$5,698.00 7.70 T T 770,00

ed

$915.0

(=1

11.10 $3,330.00

HAT-R-SHEILD
FL-EL 14W/MLNL

TWIST/27K (14
WATTS)

10 {(MUST ORDER IN
MULTIPLES OF 10)
5 DAYS

cw

7

=

.$205,475.01 |1$278,140.00

o

77777

$10,053.0 2y AT Ry 7$5,289.00

GE LIGHTING .
LU150/MED/ECO

1CA

5 DAYS
2

$3,249.0/

o

9.13 $8,739.00

GE LIGHTING
MXR150/U/MED
1CA

DAYS

$17,634.00 NO BID

7/
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M. .

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Sylvania Lamp, Metal Halide, 175 watt, MS200/PS/BU-ONLY/BT28
Sylvania No. 64838 or equal

Specily M: furer:;

Specify Product No.Order Code;
Specify O per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.OQ

le, BT28, MS320/PS/BU-HOR,

1 Lamp, 200 wart, metal
No. 51992 or equal

bise, T8, QHE-1X200MH

Iy Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Ventul ip, MHLZ00W/HTS/ED28/PS/740 (200w Pulse Start meta
Venture No. 60375 or cqual

le, unprotected double are tube, mogul base

t No,

der Con

ity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

Venture bulb MPST5W/BU/BT37/PS 875W pulse Ml
Venture No. 58953 or equal

Specify Deliver: \Gxﬁm ;mo

/HT3/T15/PS 200W Pulse Start Horizo
qual

Venture lamp M52
Venture No. 70764
Specily Manufacturer::

, Lamp E39 Mogul

Specify Product No./Qrder Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Venture lamp MSBTSW/HT5/BT37/PS/740, mogul base
Venture No. 74892 or equal

Venture ballast B76W PULSE START METAL HALIDE BALLAST PRE-WIRED, W/ CAPACITOR & BRACKET KIT,
Venture No. V90DR6 12K or equal

Specify Deliver: / DAYS ARO

300

300

300

300

100

300

100

100

Vendor # 3 /<m_.=_cﬂ #4
VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING MAVICH
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304 525 COMMERCE ST
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234 SOUTHLAKE, TX
JAMES MCCLURE I// FAITH GORDAN
N
Each 38.41 $11,523.00 /um 50 $11,850.00
LEDVANCE /mm LIGHTING
64044 MVR320/VBU/HO/PA
6 1CA
14 DAYS 5 DAYS
Each  16.67 4$5,001.00 18.68 $5,604.00
SIGNIFY GE LIGHTING
383810 MVR250/C/U
6 1CA
7 DAYS 5 DAYS
Each  220.73 $66,219.00 NO BID
LEDVANCE
51992
10
14 DAYS /
Each 126.35 $7,905.00 NO BID
VENTURE
mouwm
Ha DAYS
Each 51.81 2 ©$5,181,00 NO BID
VENTURE
60735 replicad with
90195
12
114 DAYS
Each  17.69 $5,307.00 NO BID
FHENONCOMPLIANT: P/N & MANUF NOT NOTED***
12
14 DAYS
Each 51,81 $5,181.00 NO BID
VENTURE %
90195 /
6
84 DAYS /
Each  51.60 Hm_umc.cc/ NO BID
FHENONCOMPLIANT: P/N & MANUF NOT NOTED***
1
14 DAYS V
22 of 60
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

62 1K BOCRI NON-DIN 277V 100
Specify Manulcturer:
Specify Product No./Order Code:
per Case:
1/ DAYS ARO
63 NT43W-6075L JK BOCRI NON-DIM EE26 UNIV BURN POS 100
64 K BOHCRI NON-DIM 126 UNIV 100
Specify Manufacturer::
Spexily Product No,Orcler Cade:
Specify Qu ity per Casc:
Specify D 1/ DAYS ARO
65 3 Replacement 80 120277V 100
() al
Specify Manufacturer::
ct No./Order Conle:
66 4K B0CRIEX39 univ bum 120277V 100
67 2071, Vertical hum 500
68 500

2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

Vendor # 3

VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

473587

4

7 DAYS
Each  31.84

LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN

LEDBO39ES7A
Ak
10 DAYS

Each  48.29

LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN

LEDB0Z4ES7A
1
10 DAYS
Each  48.29

LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN

LED8024E40A
Wo DAYS
Each  77.32
LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN

LED8046MS57A
1
10 DAYS

Each  77.32
LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN
LEDB046M40A
10 DAYS

Each 6.45

*Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

7 DAYS

Each  5.38

24 of 60

N Vendor # 4
MAVICH

525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX
FAITH GORDAN

LED-8087E40-A (30
WATTS)

1CA

5 DAYS

$3,184.00 62.88 $6,288.00

LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN

7,

LED-8029E57-A

1
5 DAYS
$4,829.00 81.18 $8,118.00
LIGHT EFFICIENT
DESIGN
LED-8024E57-A
1CA
5 DAYS
$4,829.00 NO BID
$7,732.00 117.71 $11,771.00

GE LIGHTING

LEDBOED23.5/740

on

1CA

5 DAYS
$7,732.00 NO BID
ﬁ_mmm%/ NO BID
$2,690.00 NO BID

V/
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2018-004—-8697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-D30-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Deliver::

13120-277V G2 CT /1 100

Philips Na, 476051 or equal

anulacturer::

500
Specify Quantity per Case:
Spevily Deliver:: / DAYS ARO
2PLC7 500
Philip No. 476085 or cyual
Specify Product No/Order Code:
Specify Quantity per Case:
1/ DAYS ARO
LS UM LIBLL, LHUIUAUN AL BUKN, {W- 500
LW, I 200
Specify Product No./Order Code:
per Cas
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O
PAR3S LED, 12PAR3S 200
200
114, 120 deg beann, 4W - 160km, Non-Dimmable, 3000K, 801CRI, 12VACDC 200

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

7 DAYS

Vendor # 3
VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

48.39
*Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

4
7 DAYS

7.20

“Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

10
7 DAYS

6.45
*Non-Compliant No

Manuf/Model listed

10
7 DAYS

6.62
SIGNIFY
532333
20/CA

7 DAYS

6.72

SIGNIFY

529529
6/CA
7 DAYS

5.91

6/CA
7 DAYS

2.66

6CA
7 DAYS

8.58

26 of 60

N Vendor # 4
MAVICH

525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX

h, FAITH GORDAN

$4,839.00 NO BID

/7

~
=]
-

$3,600.00

oy

E LIGHTING

13DBX/841/ECO/4P
0 (MUST ORDER IN
ULTIPLES OF 10)
DAYS

=Ty

(=]

Iy

$3,225.0 NQ BID

$3,310.00 NO BID

$1,344.00 NO BID

7

$1,182.00 NO BID

7

/77

$532.00 NO BID

$1,716.00 NN~ NO BID

$3,585.00
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TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specily Product No./Order Code:

91
92 M 1071
Spexily Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO
93 SIAMIYE22-2T/E26/CL/GL/WGD
requal
cturer
Specify Product No,Order Code:
Iy per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A RO
94
Specify Manufcturer::
Produet No,/Order Code:
per Case:
/DAYS ARO
95
96
97

2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

300

500

100

200

300

250

500

Vendor # 3

VOSS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

6 CASE
7 DAYS
Each 5.91

*Non-Compliant No
ManuffModel listed

6CA
7 DAYS

Each 8.06

*Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

10 CA
7 DAYS

Each 3.76
SIGNIFY
470807
GCA
7 DAYS

Each 6.72

Manuf/Madel listed

10 CA
7 DAYS

Each  3.66

*Non-Compliant No
ManuffModel listed

10CA
7 DAYS

Each 5.91
*Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

10CA
7 DAYS

Each 148

*Non-Compliant No
Manuf/Model listed

28 of 60

W Vendor # 4
MAVICH

525 COMMERCE ST
SOUTHLAKE, TX
FAITH GORDAN

N,

$1,773.00 1532 $4,596.00

PHILIPS

7

529636
1CA
5 DAYS

$4,030.00 17.08 $8,540.00

7

PHILIPS
467142
10 CA (MUST ORDER
IN MULTIPLES OF 10)
5 DAYS

7

$376.00 NO BID

P

$1,344.00 17.92 $3,584.00

PHILIPS

539874
10 CA (MUST ORDER
5 DAYS

"

$1,098.00

o

.78 $2,034.00
PHILIPS

462523
1CA
5 DAYS

$1,477.50 14.67 $3,667.50

PHILIPS
929001881004
1CA

5 DAYS

/77

$740.00 1.25 $625.00

%

PHILIPS |

A
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

a) Does your campany provide health insurance coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its employees, does the company
share in the cost a minimum of:

95% for employee only coverage?

85% for employee -+children

73% for employee +spouse

71% for employee+family coverage

¢) Lt your company provides health insurance coverage to Its employees, 15 the coverage
comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan
description?

d) It your company plans to utilize subcentractors in the rulriiment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas
County's health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

Primary Contact Person

Secondary Contact Person

Vendor # 3

V0SS ELECTRIC DBE VOSS LIGHTING
11420 FERRELL DR STE 304
FARMERS BRANCH, TX 75234

JAMES MCCLURE

Yes

Yes

Yes

Neyda Navarro
neyda.navarro@apfelbaumind.com

Bertha Munoz
bertha.munoz@afelbaumind.com

30 of 60

915-845-2009

915-613-3190

A Vendor # 4
/Z><HﬁI
25 COMMERCE ST
OUTHLAKE, TX
AITH GORDAN

7

/// Faith Gordan

sales@mavich.com

Vinecent Manfredini
/ sales@mavich.com

682-503-4484

682-503-4484
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2018-004-6687
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

TCP Lamp 10Watt LED A 19 60 watt equal LAMP 27K,

TCP No. LED 10A19D27K or equal
facturce::

Specify ct No/Order Code:
Specify Qu Case:

/DAYS A.RO

Specify Deliv

TCP bulb LED 12 Wall AlD'S
TCP No. LED 12E26A1927K or
Specily Manufacturer:;

TCP Lamp 14 Watt PAR 30 LED dimmable,
TCP No. LED 14E26F3030KFL or cqual
Specify Manufacturer::

Specify Product No/Order Coce:

Specify Quan
Specify D

per Case:
/DAYS ARO

TCP Lamp LEDI7W Par 38 LED Lamp,

TCP No. LED 17E26P3830KNFL or equal
Specify Manulicturer::

per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

TCP bulb LED 9 watt par20 40 degree llood,

uct No./Orcler Code:

r Case:
ver: / DAYS ARO

TCP bulb Frosted LED 2 WATT WHITE (3000K) replacement

TCP No, LEF 2W1383 or equal

Specily Manufacturer::
1 No,/Order Cade:

Spexily Quantity per Case:

od,

150

150

150

150

150

150

150

150

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

N Vendor # 5
DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO
PO BOX 2676
WACO, TX 76702
S\ CHRIS LANHAM
N 20 DAYS

2.35

3.75

6.50

Y]
&
0
=

20 DAYS

EIKO
09990
249 CA
20 DAYS

11.95
PHILIPS
34859

2CA
0 DAYS

oo

7.45

m
i
=
o

10088

g

20 DAYS

12CA
20 DAYS

7.45

PHILIPS
535310
12CA
10 DAYS

N

I

7.45

EIKO

08896
50 CA

32 of 60

//“ Vendor # 6

Simba Industries
PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099
NN W.F. KASTEN
N7 DAYS

%

$352.50

EIKO
10283
12CA
7 DAYS

7/

$562,50 TR

EIKO
10285
12 CA
7 DAYS

$975.00 462

EIKO

09162
12 CA
W7 DAYS,

?ENS/

G440

7/

EIKO
09990
12CA
7 DAYS

N

$1,792.50

=
S

09162

7 DAYS.

[
N
=
=

$1,117.50

EIKO

iz 272224

$1,117.50

re 2
o =

28 &
o

-
=
N
tn
=}

8.37

Frs
—_

'

-
o mo
O
Qo
m
]
a
o
»n
o
B
=
=
m
!

7 DAYS

272

$2,235.00
EIKO

08896
W12 CA

724

147

i

,&.rmu.. e .,..“..mww.a.n_
- ) numaoo
e

195

$1,255.50

$220.50

220050

Lz

77

7z

pzzzzzz2z24

T

77722

$1,581.00
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specily Product No,/Order Code:

it No,/Orider Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Lamp, FO28/84 1/XV/S8/ECO,28W, T8, modium hase
Sylvania No, 21421 or cqual

Specily Manufacturer::

Specify Product Mo,/ Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

F032/841/XPS/ECO3,32 Watt, T8, Mediwn
No. 21681 or equal

No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:

Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Lamp, FP54/50W/84 1/HO/SS/ECO,50W, T8, Madium base

Specify Manufacturer::

Specify Product No.Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case;
-/ DAYS A.RO

p, T8 QHE2x32T8/UNV/DIM/TC 50736 High Efliciency 2 Lamp Universal Voltage clectronic ballast,

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

Sylvania lamp, Muorescent ballast, QHE-2X32T8/UNV-ISL-5C , (2 Lamp T8 Unv Low Power)
No. 49863 or equal

Specify Manufacturr;

Specily fuct No,Order Code:

Specify ty per Case:
Speify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

1000

40,000

40,000

300

300

1000

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Mswsn_o_. #5

/_um?mxmmrmﬂ_.ag_. mcv_uzno
PO BOX 2676

/s.sﬁo, TX 76702

N CHRIS LANHAM

N

N 280058

80 CA

N 10 DAYS

7007,

=
A
o)

EIKO

49583

AN,

e

20 DAYS

T -
= 8
E
o
w

)
@
purd
o
w
o

[
@
[

iz

(g
=)
o]

EIKO

81159
30CA

N
\
\
N\
N\
N
N
\
N
/ 14 DAYS
N
X
\
N
\
\
N
\

w
~
~
[

34 of 60

\ Vendor # 6

Simba Industries

PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099
NN W.F. KASTEN

0,

22407

S
o
3
wn

$2,150.00\ 156

$78,000.005N\1.68

/7777772224477

70244244

2474

$74,000.00 N 1.30

m
=
(o]

49589

30 CA
7 DAYS

$885.00NN 1,527

X

EIKO

81159
60 CA
7.DAYS

N

$11,325.00 0 43.28

SYLVANIA
50736
10CA
7 DAYS

$7,750.008\) 8.42

m
=2
Pl
o

07872
10 CA
7 DAYS

$2,685.009.55

SYLVANIA

49865
10 CA
7 DAYS

N

$1,580.00

$67,200.00

A

7z

©7$52,000.00

TTTE4S6100

$12,984.0

o

$8,420.00

$2,865.00
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify M

ct No./Order Code:

Specily Pr

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Sylvania Metal Halide Ballast, M320/MULTI-PS-KIT , (MH REPL BAL 47G76)320 watt,

Sylvania No. 47676 or equal

No. 64917 or equal

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Sylvania bulb, 100 watt,E17 Metal Halide P100/U/MED , (100W Mh Pulse Start Unv Bumn)
Sylvania No. 64417 or equal

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

No. 64402 or equal

4587 or equal

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Sylvania Bulb, 70 watt,E 17, MP7O/U/MED (70 Walt Med. Base Metal Halide Lamp) Pulse Start

h 200 watts, ET 18 MC200/PS/U/ET 18/940 (HID Lamp 64917)

Lamp, 150 Wat, EI7, Metal Halide MP150/U/MED (HID LAMP 64402)

Bulb, 50 Wat, ED 17, MPSO/U/MED (HID LAMP 64587), Metal Halide

150

150

150

300

300

300

300

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

/ﬂ. Vendor # 5

DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO
PO BOX 2676

WACO, TX 76702

O\ CHRIS LANHAM

N ADVANCE

L

Tz

T zzzzzzzzzzzzzz2d4

1A56920010

= N
8

0 DAYS

[
bl
f
[

ADVANCE
71A58920010

g

10 DAYS

s
=~
i
n

ADVANCE

71A5181001D

g

10 DAYS

w
(=2
[}
(=]

ADVANCE
71A5292001d
1CA

10 DAYS
18.75
VENTURE
70764

12CA

20 DAYS
8.50

EIKO

49514

12CA

20 DAYS

10.75

m
=
Qo

49519
12CA
20 DAYS

[
=
o
(=]

PHILIPS
429944

10 DAYS

m o
=
3 &

49509

N
Sk
o
>)>
=
w

22

36 of 60

ol

X Vendor # 6

Simba Industries

PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099

=
ES
o
=

$7,837.50N\81.38

SYLVANIA
47676

g

7 DAYS
$7,087.50N%60.00
SYLVANIA

47007

Zp 2744444222474

— ~N =

o

) UQ

in =
=

~No@|

7

B
=3
(=}
(=3
(=}

SYLVANIA
/Awgw
1CA

7 DAYS
$5,625.00 W 60.00
SYLVANIA

4917

~N =
g9
w

$2,550.00 0\ 6,22
SYLVANIA
64417
12CA

g
o
=
=
n

Zzzzzzzzzzz40400dd

$3,225.00 07,29

[=2]
~
(=]
o
=}

77/ ////4/724472

-
]
-
o
n
a

/!

SYLVANIA
64587
12CA

7 DAYS
$2,565.00\\7.12
EIKO
49509
12CA

N

w

7 DAYS

eI 8701

$12,207.00

$9,000.0

(=]

sz

sz

s

$17,935.50

$18,000.00

$1,866.00

o

$3,765.00

7

$2,136.00
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Seetion D: LED Lumps

HIED23.S/LEDT2TND 120277V G2 4/
No, 473593 or equal
Speeify Manuficturer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Speeity Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS AR.O

Specify Manufacturer::

Specify Product No./Onler Code:

Specily Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Casc:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO

Specify Manufacturer::

uct No./Order Cade:

y por Cise:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

TA0ND 120-277V G2 4/1

Speeify Manulacturer::

bracket

JUDOK, SUCRIL NON-DIM, E26, UNIV BUE

Total Section n :

0-277V

F4UKMOG-G6, 4000K LED LITESPAN REPLACEMENT, 80W 10,4001m 4K, S0CRI EX39 UNI BURN 120-277V

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

W/WZ&’WW

//,, Vendor # 5

DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO
PO BOX 2676

WACO, TX 76702

CHRIS LANHAM

i

b

=

79.75
UNIVERSAL
PB7NLTAC5MS00K

10 CA
14 DAYS

26.75

PHILIPS

73595

= b
8

0 DAYS

Pl

m
—
=
O

09634

-
(X
2

4 DAYS

w
N
~
wu

m
=
A
o

10227
12 CA
14 DAYS

48,95

PHILIPS

473652

e
(=
e

0 DAYS

27.75

PHILIPS

T 77z

473579

“
onN
o
=8
w“

w0200

PHILIPS

38 of 60

,ﬂ<m:n_o_. #6

Simba Industries
PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099
NN W.F, KASTEN

G

$7,975.00 W\ 65.00

VENTURE
Vo0Y8620

frd
Q
p-d

7 DAYS

$127,370.00

$2,675.00N\ 23,37

m
—_
=
(s

09633

e

7DAYS .

Tz 277244044

$2,675.00
*NQ UNIT PRICE GIVEN

m
=
=
o

09634
12CA
7 DAYS

W
N
0
5]

$3,275.00

m
i
=
o

Y

10227
12 CA

~
2
-
w0

S
&
@
(%}
2
=
=]
o)
&8
N
e

PHILIPS

473652

~N =
~
2

DAYS

$2,775.00\72.28

EIKO

oy
(=]
N
a
o

12 CA
7 DAYS

T/zzzzzzzzz4244044

$3,350.00 023,37

V777222

EIKO

$6,500.00

I

TE214,270150

"742,337.00

$0.00

I

"$3,255.0

=

N,

$5,973.0

[=}

$7,228.00

$2,337.00

I
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.
Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specily Manufacturer

Ortler Code:

ps No. 332374
Specify Manu

Spexify Product

Specify Manufacturer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR

4 or cqual

Spevify Manuficturer::

Specily Product No. Order Codle:

H26V-3500 IF 4P 1PK 10/1

(Order Code:

Specify Praduct

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O

26113500 1F 4P 1PK 171

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O

LED, 13T8 LED/24-4000 I1-6L1 10/1
No469395 orequal

Specify Product NoOrder Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:

EMENT, LED | 20WI T S0KMOG-G6, LED Litespan, 120%W 15,9600 5K 80CRIEX39 univ bum 120277V

500

500

500

100

500

500

100

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CQO
PO BOX 2676

/ WACDO, TX 76702

N CHRIS LANHAM

N

GL500005

 PHILIPS
532416

70000

77z iz
3 ¢

g

10 DAYS

mU‘\
w
3 &

10172

14 DAYS

o
&
(=)

N PHILIPS
532374

N20 CA

10 DAYS

600
N

72

QL

PHILIPS
532317
20 CA

20 DAYS

6.75

PHILIPS

PHILIPS
458380
10 CA
10 DAYS
10.50
PHILIPS

Amwwmm
10 CA

V7ZzzZ2z72222z407272277400444004d

\ Vendor # 6

Simba Industries

PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099

ylé.m KASTEN

74

o

T2z,

724

$2,975.0 5.76

m
]
=
Q

43,600,000\ 9.57

PHILIPS
532374

12 CA

7 DAYS

$3,000,008N8.37

PHILIPS
532317

12 CA

7 DAYS

$0,250.00NN 85337

X

PHILIPS EIKO

10259
/:9

7 DAYS

$3,375.000\9.50

PHILIPS
58422

~N =
~
e

DAYS

9]
~
4
o
=

i zzzzzzzzzzzz4224

A
o
10
un
o

0

PHILIPS

458380
12 CA
7 DAYS

$1,050.008\)10.76

m
=
o

10063
12 CA

$8,533.00

$2,880.0

=1

I a s s s

7

7 A

$4,785.00

$4,185.00

$4,750.00

$4,750.00

$1,076.00
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

EIKO No. 0BR94 or equal

Speify Irer:

Specify Product No./Ordur Code;

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver: / DAYS A RO

ULW/A20V 6/1F13, E26

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Speeily Quantity por Casce:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS ARO

LGI3

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quantity per Case:

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A R.O

D/ L3V/BISAFS/PAP 20/1, VERTICAL BURN

Specily Deliver: / DAYS ARO

L3R ISAES P2 20/1, HORIZONTAL BURN

261

Specify Product No,/Order Code:
Specily Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

ER/R27-22
479428 or equal

WG BT, 26

Specify Manufacturer::

200

150

200

500

300

300

200

%e.m..aoq #5

/_umﬁmxmm_.mQEQ_.mcEEno
PO BOX 2676

/sSno, TX 76702

N CHRIS LANHAM

N

WEIKO

08394

24 CA
14 DAYS

Gz

Each

[t
ey
(o]

PHILIPS

529719

S

10 DAYS

Each

W
%)
[=}

EIKO

20 DAYS

Each 6.75

)
E
=
=
=]
{72}

541839

o
o
S

~
X
=

Each

Each

Each /. i
Mu::.:.m

532903
10CA
10 DAYS

Each 1.95

42 of 60

ﬂeqm_.z_o_. #6

Simba Industries
PO BOX 3141
GRAPEVINE, TX 76099
N W-F. KASTEN

7/

m
=
=
o

9884

~N = O
LS
S

DAYS
$1,190.000\Y7.47 $1,494.0
PHILIPS
29719

5i
12.00
7 DAYS

L
wm
2
w
(=}
o

Q2777242

[l
o
(=)

$444.00

NEIKO
M *Please note, several of c..m”
./// catalog numbres specified ma/
/ 10073 discontinued by the amscﬂmnﬂcﬂmﬂﬂ
/ 12ca /
”u days y/

mfmmo.cow,m.m.\. ﬁ_umA.ooW
Wﬂ.xﬁnm /m
W/mﬁmwm ”
”HN ca ”

WS.% W

i au_mg_o.oﬁ 9,55 i,dm.ccw
N N\
m W
.//zuw days

§1,200.008N5.08 $1,524.00

PHILIPS EIKO
529578

12 CA

7 DAYS

Q74

7 7777/7720442404

$2,625.00 N Z.07 T i i THT$2,121000

EIKO
60462
12 CA
7 DAYS

$390.00N813677 j (27200

EIKO.
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2018-004-—-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Product No.uOrder Code:

Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

50 Each

Specify Manufacturer::

Specify Product No, Order Code:

500 Each

INSTAFTL I8, 10T8 LEDAS-4000 IF 1PK 1071 1000 Each

Philips No. e eyual

Specify Ma

Specify Product No./Order Code

Specily Quantity per Case:
Specily Deliver: / DAYS A.R.O

i SECTION B TOTALL

PLEASE INCLUDE ALL OTHER BRANDS/MANUFACTURER % OFF DISCOUNTS THAT YOU WOULD LIKE TO
INCLUDE IN YOUR PROPOSAL:

GRAND TOTAL:

Award Total

Specify any additional comments / cost / etc. not included with your bid proposal, if applicable

Specify additional comments

Cooperative Purchasing

fﬂ Vendor # 5
DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO
PO BOX 2676

/ssno. TX 76702
N

CHRIS LANHAM

QL

=

55501
CA
0 DAYS

= o b

iy

95
EIKO
09865

24 CA
20 DAYS

N

7]

PHILIPS
455683
6 CA

10 DAYS

6.00

PHILIPS
473990

0 CA
0 DAYS

Description

BUYBOARD CONTRACT
527-17 MAY BE USED

N
\
N\
N\
N
N\
N
\
z//
N\
\
\
N\
/
N\
N
N\
N
N\
N
N
N
N
N
N
\
\
N\
N\
N
\
N
N\
\
/
N\
N\
N\
N
\.
/
\
\
N
\
N\
N\
N
N
N
\
N
N
\
\

Z

44 of 60

T

% off Discount

$486,225.00

$64,950.00

/Je.m:no_. #6

Simba Industries
PO BOX 3141
/m_ub_umSme TX 76099
W.F. KASTEN

74/

iz

N

$97.50

m
=
o

e

09865

2.99

EIKO
10269

12CA
7 DAYS

3.898/ 5.54
W EIKO

10262

77222z

744

22727
e

Description

T $137,760.00

'$546,601.50

Please note, several of the of the catalog numbers
specified are discontinued by the manufacturer and limited
stock is available,

$76.00

$1,495.00

" 45,540.00

/L

% off Discount

7

$133,501.00

L/ zzzzz7z727272722272727272z22272722222424
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2018-004—-6697
Lamps and Ballast

12

]

TABULATION SHEET
Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast
Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Staci Eudy, Contract Specialist

214-653-7725
staci.eudy@dallascounty.or

SBE Certified Vendor
Certified by other Agency
1295

EEO1

2270 Verification Form

DESCRIPTION:

Secti

Recommend for Award

Lamp, 11 Watt AR-111 12 Volt LED G53 Base 3200K 25 Degree Beam 50,000 Hours Light Bulh

Satco No. 58761 or equal
Specily Manufaciurer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Lamp, LED13PARIOLN/DIMAINFLAY, Dimmable 13 Wait Flood,

Sylvania No. 78430 or equal

Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

Mo. 74639 or equal

Specily Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O

p, LEDIBPAR3S/DIM/SI0FLAO, 18
nia No. 78641 or equal

TCP bulb LED 2 Watt GBF Rep
TCP No. LE2WGEF or equal

TCP bulb LED 17P38DI0OKFL 1 TW par38 3(
TCP No. LED 17P38D30KFL or equal

p, LELH SPARIOLN/DIM/ABIOFLAL, 15 wat

medium base Serew In Dimmable

lium screw, oodl

46 of 60

Estimated
Quantity

300

150

150

150

500

150

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS

2703 N BELTLINE RD
IRVING, TX 75062
MIGUEL YAN

website
SALES@BATTPLUS.NET
972-256-2073

fax

972-252-3775

#*¥*NON-COMPLIANT**#*

MISSING/INCOMPLETE INFORMATION: MANUF,
PRODUCT NO./DESCRIPTION

Unit Cost

34.29

SORAA

15 DAYS
8.28

SATCO

15 DAYS
14.58

TCP

15 DAYS
11.78

TCP

15 DAYS
20.34

PLT

15 DAYS
11.78

TCP

Extension

£10,287.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

$1,242.00

$2,187.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

$1,767.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

$10,170.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

$1,767.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Oper: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend
Deliver:: / DAYS A.RO

_ Total Section A~

Section B: Lamps

Lamp, CF1IEL/MINITW 300
Sylvania No. 29378 or equal

Specily Manufacturer::
Specily Product No./Order C

Specify Quantity per Case:

| Fwatts, Medium Screw

1000

Lamp, CF14ELR20830, 14 watts medium base, 300
Sylvania NO. 29634 or equal
Specify Manu

Specify Product No, Order Code:

300

300

Specily Product No./Order Code:

Specily Quanity per Case:

Specify Deliver:/ DAYS ARO

Lamp, CFAUELTWIST/827/RP, 40 wall, medi 100
Sylvania No. 29786 or equal

Specily Manufacturer::

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per C:

ver:: / DAYS ARO

Lamp, CFGSEL/TWIST, 63 watt, medium base 100
Sylvania No. 29508 or equal

500

Lamp, FO17/15W/841/XP/SS/ECO3,15W,
Sylvania No. 22407 or equal

48 of 80

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS
2703 N BELTLINE RD

IRVING, TX 75062

MIGUEL YAN
15 DAYS
~441,910.00
1.40 $420.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
1.60 $1,600.00
#YENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
$0.00
*NC UNIT PRICE GIVEN'
15 DAYS
3.55 $1,065.00
+YENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
NQ BID
6.31 $631.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
11.70 $1,170.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
$0.00
SYLVANIA *NO UNIT PRICE GIVEN
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

QHE-4X32THUNV-ISL-8C (4 Lamip T8 Unv Low Power)

Specify Product No./Order Code:

Specify Quantity per Casc:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

Syl 51, TH, QHEAXI2TS/UNV-ISN-5C-B , 4 lamp
Sylvania No. 49857 or equal

-Emergency low |

Shat-R- Shicld, bulh, 9 wat, BallastCFL-9W/ TWIST/27IK
¥ Na 87616T or equal

Total Section B
Section C: Lamps and Ballast

Lanp, M150/MULTI-PS-KIT,150
Sylvania No. 47682 or equal

AULTI-PS-KIT M136
Sylvania No. 47690 or

50 of 60

300

300

100

300

300

300

300

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS
2703 N BELTLINE RD

TRVING, TX 75062

MIGUEL YAN

13.26 $3,978.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

GE

15 DAYS

11.48 $3,444.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

GE-ULT

15 DAYS

8.68 $2,604.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

SYLVANIA

15 DAYS

50.86 $5,086.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

FULHAM

15 DAYS

NO BID

15 DAYS

136,285,903.00

31.57 $9,471.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

PLUSRITE

15 DAYS

NO BID

42.55 $12,765.00
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TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

62 100
63 K BUCRI NON-DIM E26 UNIV BURN POS 100-277V 100
64 RINON-DIM 126 UNIV BURN POS 100
Specify Manufacturer::
Specily Product No/Order Cod
ity per Case:
65 100
Specify Quantity per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS ARO
66 L 4K BOCRIEX3Y univ bum 120-277V 100
EIKO No. 09343 or equal
Specify Manufacturer::
Specify Product No./Order Code:
67 500
68 P 20¢1, Horizontal bum 500

5 Nov, 532416 or equal

2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast 54 of 60

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS
2703 N BELTLINE RD

IRVING, TX 75062

MIGUEL YAN
15 DAYS
32.13 $3,213.00
*#VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
44.70 $4,470.00
F#VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
44.70 $4,470.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
TCP
15 DAYS
102.18 $10,218.00
“*Vendor Ext. Total Differs
TCP
15 Days
287.49 $28,749.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs
EIKO
4 CA
21 DAYS
14.36 $7,180.00
“Vendor Ext. Total Differs
PHILIPS
20 CA
15 DAYS
14.36 47,180.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

78

79

80

8l

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS A RO

ED7A0ND 120-277V G2 CT 401 100

-

2/ DAYS AROQ

500
500
BALLAN T CAUIMITALLE LAY AL BUKIN, /W= mco
200
200
per Case:
DAYS A.RO
200
Specify Product No./Order Conle:
Specify Qu per Case:
Speeily Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O
MWMR T 1/120/830-GS, LED GENS MRLLGUA, 120 degt beam, 4W Non-Di 12VACDC 200

56 of 60

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS

2703 N BELTLINE RD
IRVING, TX 75062
MIGUEL YAN

15 DAYS

51.57

GREEN CREATIVE

6 CA
15 DAYS

24.47

GREEN CREATIVE

6 CA
15 DAYS

24.47

GREEN CREATIVE
6 CA

15 DAYS

13.82

GREEN CREATIVE

15 DAYS

11.78

TCP

15 DAYS
9.78

SATCO

15 DAYS
2,52

TCP

15 DAYS

591

$5,157.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$12,235.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$12,235.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$6,910.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$2,356.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$1,956.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

4504.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$1,182.00
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2018-004-6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Sylvania Lamp, Metal Halide, 175 watt, MS200/PS/BU-ONLY/BT28 300 Each
Sylvania No. 64838 or equal
facturer;:
300 Each
y per Case;
=/ DAYS AR.O
st, medinm base, T8, QF 300 Each
hise 300 Each
Specily Product No/Order Code:
Spi Qi ty per Case:
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS A.R.O
Venure bulb MPRTSW/BU/BTIT/PS §75W pulse M 100 Each
Venture No. 58953 ar equal
300 Each
Venture lamp MS875W/H75/BT37/PS/740, mogul base 100 Each
Venture No. 74892 or equal
Specify Deliver:: / DAYS AR.O
Venture ballast B75W PULSE START METAL HALIDE BALLAST PRE-WIRED, W/ CAPACITOR & BRACKET KIT, 100 Each
Venture No. VYODB6 12K ar equal
Specify Manufacturer::
52 of 60

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS
2703 N BELTLINE RD

IRVING, TX 75062

MIGUEL YAN

NO BID

a7.14 $14,142.00

*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

15 DAYS

42.55 $12,765.00

SYLVANIA

15 DAYS

45.41 $13,623.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

VENTURE

12 CA
21 DAYS

103.49 $10,349.00
*VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS

VENTURE
G CA
21 DAYS

50.82 $15,246.00

“VENDOR EXT TOTAL DIFFERS
VENTURE

12 CA
21 DAYS
77.69 $7,769.00

VENTURE

6 CA
21 DAYS

NO BID
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

Specify Product No./Order Code:

W, 126 300

Specily Oy y per Case:
Specily Deliver:: / DAYS AR.Q

LEDT1

24T5HOME-B

500

Mo 467142 or cqual

100

200

300

250

500

58 of 60

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS

2703 N BELTLINE RD
IRVING, TX 75062
MIGUEL YAN

15 DAYS

4.49

IRT

15 DAYS

7.62

TCP

15 DAYS

3.38

PLT

15 DAYS

5.69

PLT

15 DAYS

NO BID

15 DAYS

4.68

IRT

15 DAYS

1.33

Tce

$1,347.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$3,810.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$338.00
*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

41,138.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

1,170.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs

$665.00

*Vendor Ext. Total Differs
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2018-004--6697
Lamps and Ballast

TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2019-030-6794

Invitation for Bid for a Term Contract for the Purchase of Lamps and Ballast

Bid Open: March 11, 2019, 2:00 P.M.

Contract Period 6/18/2019 thru 6/19/2020 with Three (3) additional options to extend

a) Does your company provide health insurance coverage to its employees?

b) If your company does provide health insurance coverage to its employees, does the company
share in the cost a minimum of:

95% for employee only coverage?

85% for employee -+children

73% for employee +spouse

71% for employee+family coverage

) 1t your company provides health insurance coverage to its employees, is the coverage
comparable to the services provided by Dallas County as described in the attached summary plan
description?

d) 1t your company plans to utilize subcontractors in the ruliilliment of this bid, does each of the
subcontractors provide health insurance coverage to their employees that compares to Dallas
County's health insurance coverage and share in the cost?

Primary Contact Person

Secondary Contact Person

60 of 60

Vendor # 7

TKC ENTERPRISES DBA BATTERIES PLUS
2703 N BELTLINE RD

IRVING, TX 75062

MIGUEL YAN

XES
60/40
NO
NO

NO
NO

NO

NO
NONE LISTED

NONE LISTED



