Bid Tabulation 2021-047-6914
Purchase of Linens and Textiles
3 year agreement, no renewal options

Bob Barker Company, Inc
7925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC 27526
Ryan McNeill
919-346-2172
ryanmenneill @bobbarker.com
Awarded lines: 2,64

Awarded lines: Awarded lines:

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL 36801
Alan Fenster
334-745-6762
tabb@textilegroup.net
.2,2.2,2.3,3.2,4.1,4.2,4.3

4.4,45,51,52,53

Victory Supply, Inc.
7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant, TN 38474
Katheen Trommer
888-376-1205
bids@victorysupplyinc.com
Awarded lines: Awarded lines:

2

Marina Textiles, Inc.

3675 Crestwood Parkway, Suite 222

Duluth, GA 30096
Faheem Adam

888-627-4621 - ext. 101
bids@marinatextiles.com

RADG Holdings, LLC
3125. Gay Street, Suite 200
Knoxville, TN 37902
Brant Eric Enderle
8003337777
bidding@tradgroup.com

Paradise Pillow, Inc.
2207 W. Glenwood Ave.
Philadelphia, PA 19132

Freddy Halfon
718-497-2100
tonia@paradisepillow.com

Description

Estimated Amounts
(3 year totals)

Unit of Measure

Brand/Manufacturer
Number

Price | Extended Price

Brand/Manufacturer

Number

Price Extended Price

Brand/Manufacturer
Number

price | Extended Price

Brand/Manufacturer
Number

Price

Extended Price

Brand/Manufacturer

Number

price | Extended Price

Brand/Manufacturer
Number

Price | Extended Price

Section 1 - Towels and Wash Cloths

Item ath Towels

Size: 22" x 44"

100% Cotton dense looped with border
Color: white

25,000

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

$18.22
812244

$455,500.00

TABB / BT150

$1233 $308,250.00

VS| BTWH2244 $1114 | $278,500.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 1.2 - Wash Cloths

Size: 12/ x12

100% Cotton dense looped with border
Color: white

40,000

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

342 | $136,800.00
4040 $ $

TABB / WC110

$1.78 $71,200.00

VS| WCWH1212 $2.23 $89,200.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Section 2 - Blankets

Item 2.1 - Thermal Blankets
Size:
Pre.shrunk cotton

Heavy weight
Machine washable
Color: White

1,500

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

$92.88
VSBE6IOWH

$139,320.00

TABB / TB190

$66.12 $99,180.00

VS| LNBLSNWHITE $6936 |  $104,040.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 2.2 - Wool Blankets
Size: 6671 90"

80% Wool (minimum)

Heavy weight

Machine washable

Color: Gray

2,500

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

$137.04
WGB6690

$342,600.00

TABB / WB120

$56.40 $141,000.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

't

Size: 547 1 50°
Machine washable
Color:Green

500

Each

Bob Barker Co.

$80.32
$B5480

$40,160.00

TABB /18100

$72.00 $36,000.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

llows and Pillow Cases

Item 3.1 - Pillows
Size:Standard (approximately 20° x 26" x2')
Cotton Core

Hypo-Allergenic

15,000

Dozen

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 3.2 - Pillow Cases
Size:Standard (approximately 20° x 267)
Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Muslin

(Color: Dark Brown and White

2,000

Dozen

No Bid

WHITE: TABB / PC107W | $7.85

$15,700.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

lat and Fitted Sheets

Item 4.1 - Flat Sheets (54" x 90"
Muslin 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend
Size: 547 x 90

Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Color: white

250

Dozen

No Bid

TABB / MS130

$23.85 $5,962.50

VS| SHT5490 $ 2398 $5,995.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 4.2 - Flat Sheets (66" x 104"
Muslin 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend
Size: 66" x 104"

Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Color: white

Dozen

No Bid

TABB / MS190

$31.90 $1,914.00

VSI SHT661042 $ 33.97 $2,038.20

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 4.3 - Flat Sheets (65" x 88"
Muslin 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend
65" x5

Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Color: whit

4,250

Dozen

No Bid

TABB / MS171

$27.00 $114,750.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 4.4 - Flat Sheets (66" x 115"
Muslin 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend
667 x 115"

Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Color: white

Dozen

No Bid

TABB / MS275

$35.75 $2,145.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 4.5 - Fitted Sheets (36" x 84" x 8"
Muslin 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend

Size: Twin Mattress 36" x 84" &'

Thread Count 130 (minimum)

Color: white

Dozen

No Bid

TABB / FT220EN

$37.00 $1,850.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Section 5 - Mattress Covers

)

Mattress Covers (76" x 36"

Industral Laundry Grade Fabric

Size: Must it 76" x 36" 6" mattress
Color: Dark Brown and White

Each

No Bid

TABB / FT210EN $8.00

$2,000.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 5.2 - Mattress Covers (74" x 27" x 4']
Industral Laundry Grade Fabric

68 0z cotton/polyester blend

Heavy Weight

Size: Must it 74" x 27" 4" mattress

(Color: Dark Brown and White

250

Each

No Bid

TABB / MC210

$7.00 $1,750.00

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 5.3 - Mattress Covers (66" x 115",

Flat Sheet Style

Heavy Weight, Industrial Laundry Grade, Cotton Duck Canvas Fabric
100% cotton

Size: 66 inches x 115 inches.

Color: Dark Brown

140,000

Each

No Bid

TABB / MC1158

$10.55 $1,477,000.00

VSITBD $1533 | $2,146,200.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Section 6: Laundry Bags and Shower Mats

Item 6.1 - Laundry Net Bags (15" x 20"
100% Polyester

Open Mesh

Drawstring closure (sewn n)

Each

Bob Barker Co. $1.25 $62.50
E1520

TABB / LB100

$1.54 $77.00

VSI/HBD LB1520DC | $ 1.62 $81.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

500

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

$42.96 | $21,480.00

TABB / LB200

$34.00 $17,000.00

VSI/HBD LB2436DC-WH | $ 31.41 $15,705.00

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Orawstring closure (sewn n)
Size:18" 20"
Color: white

250

Dozen

Bob Barker Co.

$22.62
E1824.

$5,655.00

TABB / LB300

$27.42 $6,855.00

$27.89 $6,972.50

VSI/HBD LB1824DC-WH

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Item 6.4 - Shower Mats

Heavy Weight, Industrial Grade

750

Each

Bob Barker Co.

$3.98 $2,985.00
0405-06

No Bid

No Bid

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

NON-RESPONSIVE

Bob Barker Company, Inc. (Awarded lines: 6.1, 6.2, 6.3)

Total

$8,702.50.

Victory Supply, Inc. (Awarded lines: 1.1, 2.1, 6.2)

Total

$398,245.00

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. (Awarded lines: 1.2,2.2,2.3,3.2,4.1,4.2,43,
4.4,45,51,52,53)

Total $1,871,271.50
Grand Total $2,278,219.00




