
Bid # 2022-017-6932

Contract for the Purchase of New Mattresses

Item # Description: Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Unit 
Cost

Extended
Total

Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Unit 
Cost

Extended
Total

Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Unit Cost Extended
Total

Estimated 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Unit Cost Extended
Total

Award Recommeded Line(s) #1 Award Recommeded Line(s) #5 Award Recommeded Line(s) #2, 3, 4

Each 39.92$  487,024.00$    

Each No Bid -$                

Each 41.97$  512,034.00$     

30

Mattress 25" W x 75" L x 4" H
Durable, antimicrobial, antistatic, flame resistant, stain, odor, and fluid resistant.
5 inches compressed into a 4 inch thickness, 
Color: Dark Green-
Stitching: Double-needle, lock-stitch-sewn seams 
Cleaning: Wipes clean with soap and water, or properly diluted disinfectant
Flammability: Cover and Batting meet or exceed flame resistance standards including DOC Federal
Flammability (FF-4-72) and California Technical Bulletin 129 and 603.
Durability: Resistant to delaminating from flexing action.
Stitching: Sewn with double locking stitch.
Thread: 100% bonded nylon for added strength and durability.
Construction: Constructed with a single piece of vinyl. Two sides are closed with a double-needle locking stitch.
Core Specs
Material: 100% Polyester Pad
No chemicals or additional ingredients added, core is non-allergenic 
Composition: Mixture of polyester fibers, low melt fibers, and virgin fibers 
Cover Specs
General Description: PVC Vinyl with non-cracking properties. Envelope style cover.
Color: Dark Green
Material: Vinyl
Thickness: 17 - 20 mil
Weight: 12 oz. per sq yard
Flammability: Flame Resistant, Passes Cigarette Ignition Std. Passes NFPA-701 Large Scale.
Strength: 3-ply vinyl-laminate cover (two layers of vinyl bonded to a tough synthetic scrim)
Water Resistant:  Liquid, body waste and hospital medications cannot penetrate.
Tear Strength: Punctures will not produce running rips.
Warp* – 124 lbs.
Fill** – 99 lbs.
Breaking Strength: Construction designed for ticking fabrics (vinyl fabrics).
Warp* – 236 lbs./in.
Fill** – 219 lbs. /in.
*Warp is the scrim running length of the fabric.
**Fill is the scrim running the width of the fabric.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).

12,2001

2 Mattress 37" W x 75" L x 6" H
Durable, antimicrobial, antistatic, flame resistant, stain, odor, and fluid resistant.
5 inches compressed into a 4 inch thickness, 
Color: Dark Green-
Stitching: Double-needle, lock-stitch-sewn seams 
Cleaning: Wipes clean with soap and water, or properly diluted disinfectant
Flammability: Cover and Batting meet or exceed flame resistance standards including DOC Federal
Flammability (FF-4-72) and California Technical Bulletin 129 and 603.
Durability: Resistant to delaminating from flexing action.
Stitching: Sewn with double locking stitch.
Thread: 100% bonded nylon for added strength and durability.
Construction: Constructed with a single piece of vinyl. Two sides are closed with a double-needle locking stitch.
Core Specs
Material: 100% Polyester Pad
No chemicals or additional ingredients added, core is non-allergenic 
Composition: Mixture of polyester fibers, low melt fibers, and virgin fibers 
Cover Specs
General Description: PVC Vinyl with non-cracking properties. Envelope style cover.
Color: Dark Green
Material: Vinyl
Thickness: 17 - 20 mil
Weight: 12 oz. per sq yard
Flammability: Flame Resistant, Passes Cigarette Ignition Std. Passes NFPA-701 Large Scale.
Strength: 3-ply vinyl-laminate cover (two layers of vinyl bonded to a tough synthetic scrim)
Water Resistant:  Liquid, body waste and hospital medications cannot penetrate.
Tear Strength: Punctures will not produce running rips.
Warp* – 124 lbs.
Fill** – 99 lbs.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).
Breaking Strength: Construction designed for ticking fabrics (vinyl fabrics).
Warp* – 236 lbs./in.
Fill** – 219 lbs. /in.
*Warp is the scrim running length of the fabric.
**Fill is the scrim running the width of the fabric.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).

30 -$                  

12,20012,200

30Each No Bid

Each 47.00$    573,400.00$ 

Each 180.00$  5,400.00$     

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
4925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC 27526
Angela DeBoeser
800-334-9880

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
PO Box 21056
Waco, TX 76702
Lacy Key
254-751-1566

MTJ American
4276 Helena Street
Granite Falls, NC 28630
Rick A Detter
828-396-6700

Charm-Tex, Inc.
1618 Coney Island Ave
Brooklyn, NY 11230
Stan Danzger
718-252-8100

58.90$    718,580.00$   

30 Each 111.90$  3,357.00$       

12,200 Each



3 Each No Bid -$                

Each No Bid -$                

Mattress 38 1/2" W x 74 1/2" L x 6" H
Durable, antimicrobial, antistatic, flame resistant, stain, odor, and fluid resistant.
5 inches compressed into a 4 inch thickness, 
Color: Dark Green-
Stitching: Double-needle, lock-stitch-sewn seams 
Cleaning: Wipes clean with soap and water, or properly diluted disinfectant
Flammability: Cover and Batting meet or exceed flame resistance standards including DOC Federal
Flammability (FF-4-72) and California Technical Bulletin 129 and 603.
Durability: Resistant to delaminating from flexing action.
Stitching: Sewn with double locking stitch.
Thread: 100% bonded nylon for added strength and durability.
Construction: Constructed with a single piece of vinyl. Two sides are closed with a double-needle locking stitch.
Core Specs
Material: 100% Polyester Pad
No chemicals or additional ingredients added, core is non-allergenic 
Composition: Mixture of polyester fibers, low melt fibers, and virgin fibers 
Cover Specs
General Description: PVC Vinyl with non-cracking properties. Envelope style cover.
Color: Dark Green
Material: Vinyl
Thickness: 17 - 20 mil
Weight: 12 oz. per sq yard
Flammability: Flame Resistant, Passes Cigarette Ignition Std. Passes NFPA-701 Large Scale.
Strength: 3-ply vinyl-laminate cover (two layers of vinyl bonded to a tough synthetic scrim)
Water Resistant:  Liquid, body waste and hospital medications cannot penetrate.
Tear Strength: Punctures will not produce running rips.
Warp* – 124 lbs.
Fill** – 99 lbs.
Breaking Strength: Construction designed for ticking fabrics (vinyl fabrics).
Warp* – 236 lbs./in.
Fill** – 219 lbs. /in.
*Warp is the scrim running length of the fabric.
**Fill is the scrim running the width of the fabric.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).

50

4 Sealed Seam Mattress 36" W x 75" L x 5" H
Durable, antimicrobial, antistatic, flame resistant, stain, odor, and fluid resistant.
Heat Sealed Seam to help prevent Bed Bugs
6 inches compressed into a 5 inch thickness, 
Color: Dark Green- 
Weight: 18 lbs.
Cleaning: Wipes clean with soap and water, or properly diluted disinfectant 
Fabric to  provide physical barrier to prevent contaminants from entering 
Breathable vents that cannot be ripped apart 
Flammability: Cover and Batting meet or exceed flame resistance standards including DOC Federal
Flammability (FF-4-72) and California Technical Bulletin 129 and 603.
Durability: Resistant to delaminating from flexing action.
Construction: Constructed with a single piece of vinyl. All side heat sealed 
Core Specs
Material: 100% Bonded Polyester Fiber
Thermally bonded polyester fiber. 
No chemicals or additional ingredients added, core is non-allergenic.
Mold, mildew and flame resistant 
Cover Specs
PVC Vinyl with non-cracking properties.
Heat Sealed Seams to prevent Bed Bugs and tampering 
Color: Dark Green
Material: Vinyl
Thickness: 17 - 20 mil
Weight: 12 oz. per sq. yard
Strength: 3-ply vinyl-laminate cover (two layers of vinyl bonded / tough synthetic scrim)
Water Resistant: Liquid, body waste and hospital medications cannot penetrate.
Tear Strength: Punctures will not produce running rips.
Warp* – 124 lbs.
Fill** – 99 lbs.
Breaking Strength: Construction designed for ticking fabrics (vinyl fabrics).
Warp* – 236 lbs. /in.
Fill** – 219 lbs. /in.
*Warp is the scrim running length of the fabric.
**Fill is the scrim running the width of the fabric.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).

200

5050 Each No Bid -$                  

200 Each No Bid -$                  200 200 Each 97.90$    19,580.00$     

Each 185.00$  9,250.00$     

Each 175.00$  35,000.00$   

112.90$  5,645.00$       50 Each



Grand Total 487,024.00$    4,200.00$         28,582.00$     

Each No Bid -$                5 400Sealed Seam Pillow 17" x 25"
Durable, antimicrobial, antistatic, flame resistant, stain, odor, and fluid resistant.
Heat Sealed Seam to help prevent Bed Bugs
2 inch thickness / Firm  
Color: Dark Green- 
Size: 17” x 25” 
Weight: 2.2 lbs.
Cleaning: Wipes clean with soap and water, or properly diluted disinfectant 
Flammability: Cover and Batting meet or exceed flame resistance standards including DOC Federal
Flammability (FF-4-72) and California Technical Bulletin 129 and 603.
Durability: Resistant to delaminating from flexing action.
Construction: Constructed with a single piece of vinyl. All side heat sealed 
Core Specs
Material: 100% Bonded Polyester Fiber  10oz 
No chemicals or additional ingredients added, core is non-allergenic.
Mold, mildew and flame resistant 
Cover Specs
PVC Vinyl with non-cracking properties.
Heat Sealed Seams to prevent Bed Bugs and tampering 
Color: Dark Green
Material: Vinyl
Thickness: 17 - 20 mil
Weight: 12 oz. per sq. yard
Strength: 3-ply vinyl-laminate cover (two layers of vinyl bonded / tough synthetic scrim)
Water Resistant: Liquid, body waste and hospital medications cannot penetrate.
Tear Strength: Punctures will not produce running rips.
Warp* – 124 lbs.
Fill** – 99 lbs.
Breaking Strength: Construction designed for ticking fabrics (vinyl fabrics).
Warp* – 236 lbs. /in.
Fill** – 219 lbs. /in.
*Warp is the scrim running length of the fabric.
**Fill is the scrim running the width of the fabric.
Delivered in sealed dust proof plastic bags (required) and boxes (optional).

400 Each 10.50$  4,200.00$         400 10.89$    4,356.00$       400 EachEach 13.80$    5,520.00$     


