
Description Estimated Amounts Unit of Measure Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total Unit Cost Price Extension Total

1. Soft Sweep Magnetic Brooms with Wooden Handle 2,500 EACH $6.88 $17,200.00 $3.92 $9,800.00 $5.38 $13,450.00 $17.31 $43,275.00 $21.00 $52,500.00 $8.62 $21,550.00 $7.53 $18,825.00 $16.01 $40,025.00 $8.54 $21,350.00

2. Corn Warehouse Brooms 120 EACH $14.17 $1,700.40 $7.87 $944.40 $5.73 $687.60 $16.67 $2,000.40 $22.00 $2,640.00 $9.27 $1,112.40 $59.88 $7,185.60 $8.86 $1,063.20 $31.04 $3,724.80 $11.31 $1,357.20 $12.50 $1,500.00 $7.50 $900.00

3. Correctional/Jail Facility Brooms 100 EACH $12.69 $1,269.00 $6.89 $689.00 $7.98 $798.00 $17.57 $1,757.00 $19.00 $1,900.00 $19.31 $1,931.00

4. Push Broom Heads 600 EACH $15.13 $9,078.00 $8.46 $5,076.00 $15.89 $9,534.00 $22.30 $13,380.00 $20.00 $12,000.00 $8.31 $4,986.00 $196.08 $117,648.00 $7.27 $4,362.00 $18.90 $11,340.00 $14.44 $8,664.00 $30.16 $18,096.00

5. Cut End Wet Mop Heads 53,040 EACH $5.58 $295,963.20 $2.95 $156,468.00 $4.51 $239,210.40 $4.63 $245,575.20 $3.00 $159,120.00 $4.02 $213,220.80 $52.80 $2,800,512.00 $3.52 $186,700.80 $3.75 $198,900.00 $5.11 $271,034.40 $4.65 $246,636.00

6. Quick Change Plastic Mop Head with 60" Wood Handle 600 EACH $10.44 $6,264.00 $6.13 $3,678.00 $6.95 $4,170.00 $21.09 $12,654.00 $9.89 $5,934.00 $106.00 $63,600.00 $12.78 $7,668.00 $7.76 $4,656.00 $7.16 $4,296.00 $16.79 $10,074.00

7. Wavebrake Institutional Mop Bucket with Wringer-Combo (No Substitution) 150 EACH $145.87 $21,880.50 $85.62 $12,843.00 $167.03 $25,054.50 $12.99 $1,948.50 $140.68 $21,102.00 $59.49 $8,923.50 $233.21 $34,981.50 $88.23 $13,234.50

8. Floor Squeegee 72 PACK $7.24 $521.28 $3.15 $226.80 $11.87 $854.64 $27.91 $2,009.52 $9.85 $709.20 $13.22 $951.84 $11.55 $831.60 $43.92 $3,162.24 $25.31 $1,822.32 $12.23 $880.56

9. Tapered Wood Handle 72 EACH $2.93 $210.96 $1.56 $112.32 $3.70 $266.40 $7.08 $509.76 $9.99 $719.28 $4.24 $305.28 $77.04 $5,546.88 $3.70 $266.40 $7.77 $559.44 $2.86 $205.92 $3.81 $274.32 $5.04 $362.88

10. Color Coded Fiberglass Handle - Self Locking 60 EACH $13.67 $820.20 $4.26 $255.60 $14.70 $882.00 $7.12 $427.20 $8.06 $483.60 $9.42 $565.20 NO BID $0.00

11. Broom Handles with Metal Threaded Tip  600 EACH $4.80 $2,880.00 $2.80 $1,680.00 $3.45 $2,070.00 $6.39 $3,834.00 $10.25 $6,150.00 $4.49 $2,694.00 $52.32 $31,392.00 $3.93 $2,358.00 $0.85 $510.00 $2.85 $1,710.00 $3.81 $2,286.00 $5.05 $3,030.00

12. Commercial Lobby Broom 12 EACH $8.24 $98.88 $5.02 $60.24 $3.64 $43.68 $6.55 $78.60 $19.25 $231.00 $5.12 $61.44 $97.08 $1,164.96 $4.47 $53.64 $8.26 $99.12 $4.53 $54.36 $3.75 $45.00 $11.66 $139.92

13. Commercial Lobby Dust Pan 12 EACH $13.24 $158.88 $8.49 $101.88 $8.85 $106.20 $23.56 $282.72 $8.25 $99.00 $11.28 $135.36 $128.16 $1,537.92 $9.86 $118.32 $21.38 $256.56 $23.85 $286.20 $9.12 $109.44 $12.15 $145.80

Total for Group I $335,344.60 Total for Group I $201,537.34 Total for Group I $284,289.52 Total for Group I $351,292.70 Total for Group I $244,378.18 Total for Group I $245,017.12 Total for Group I $0.00 Total for Group I $3,049,689.36 Total for Group I $0.00 Total for Group I $214,578.96 Total for Group I $0.00 Total for Group I $277,583.26 Total for Group I $0.00 Total for Group I $0.00 Total for Group I $346,121.90 Total for Group I $287,923.02 Total for Group I $14,652.60

14. Black Stripping Floor Pads 1,000 EACH $2.96 $2,960.00 $2.62 $2,620.00 $12.14 $12,140.00 $12.99 $12,990.00 $3.11 $3,110.00 $19.47 $19,470.00 $2.71 $2,712.00 $3.69 $3,690.00 $20.71 $20,710.00 $2.63 $2,626.00 $14.54 $14,540.00

15. Black Stripping Floor Pads 1,000 EACH $4.04 $4,040.00 $2.62 $2,620.00 $14.87 $14,870.00 $13.99 $13,990.00 $4.05 $4,050.00 $19.47 $19,470.00 $3.54 $3,544.00 $3.69 $3,690.00 $31.48 $31,480.00 $2.63 $2,626.00 $20.71 $20,710.00

16. Red Buffing Pads 50 EACH $2.96 $148.00 $2.45 $122.50 $7.71 $385.50 $6.77 $338.50 $3.11 $155.50 $19.47 $973.50 $2.71 $135.60 $5.13 $256.50 $15.84 $792.00 $2.63 $131.30 $14.55 $727.50

Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $7,148.00 Total for Group II $5,362.50 Total for Group II $27,395.50 Total for Group II $27,318.50 Total for Group II $7,315.50 Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $39,913.50 Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $6,391.60 Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $7,636.50 Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $0.00 Total for Group II $52,982.00 Total for Group II $5,383.30 Total for Group II $35,977.50

17. Natural Rubber Latex Disposable Gloves - General Purpose

17.1 Size: Small 25,000 EACH $0.09 $2,250.00 $0.05 $1,365.00 $0.04 $1,067.50 $0.13 $3,250.00 $0.89 $22,250.00 $6.36 $159,000.00 $17.00 $425,000.00 $73.47 $1,836,750.00 $0.06 $1,550.00 $5.68 $142,000.00 $0.08 $2,100.00 $0.04 $950.00 $0.12 $2,940.00 $7.92 $198,000.00 $0.06 $1,587.50

17.2 Size: Medium 50,000 EACH $0.09 $4,500.00 $0.05 $2,730.00 $0.04 $2,135.00 $0.13 $6,500.00 $0.89 $44,500.00 $6.36 $318,000.00 $17.00 $850,000.00 $73.47 $3,673,500.00 $0.06 $3,100.00 $5.68 $284,000.00 $0.08 $4,200.00 $0.04 $1,900.00 $0.12 $5,880.00 $7.92 $396,000.00 $0.06 $3,175.00

17.3 Size: Large 350,000 EACH $0.09 $31,500.00 $0.05 $19,110.00 $0.04 $14,945.00 $0.13 $45,500.00 $0.89 $311,500.00 $6.36 $2,226,000.00 $17.00 $5,950,000.00 $73.47 $25,714,500.00 $0.06 $21,700.00 $5.68 $1,988,000.00 $0.08 $29,400.00 $0.04 $13,300.00 $0.12 $41,160.00 $7.92 $2,772,000.00 $0.06 $22,225.00

17.4 Size: X-Large 25,000 EACH $0.09 $2,250.00 $0.05 $1,365.00 $0.04 $1,067.50 $0.13 $3,250.00 $0.89 $22,250.00 $6.36 $159,000.00 $17.00 $425,000.00 $73.47 $1,836,750.00 $0.06 $1,550.00 $5.68 $142,000.00 $0.08 $2,100.00 $0.04 $950.00 $0.12 $2,940.00 $7.92 $198,000.00 $0.06 $1,587.50

18. Latex Exam Disposable Gloves - Medical Examination

18.1 Size: Small 30,000 EACH $0.10 $3,000.00 $0.06 $1,764.00 $0.07 $2,148.00 $0.14 $4,200.00 $0.89 $26,700.00 $17.00 $510,000.00 $0.09 $2,670.00 $6.28 $188,400.00 $0.09 $2,550.00 $0.04 $1,200.00 $0.07 $2,001.00 $8.62 $258,600.00

18.2 Size: Medium 30,000 EACH $0.10 $3,000.00 $0.06 $1,764.00 $0.07 $2,148.00 $0.14 $4,200.00 $0.89 $26,700.00 $17.00 $510,000.00 $0.09 $2,670.00 $6.28 $188,400.00 $0.09 $2,550.00 $0.04 $1,200.00 $0.07 $2,001.00 $8.62 $258,600.00

18.3 Size: Large 50,000 EACH $0.10 $5,000.00 $0.06 $2,940.00 $0.07 $3,580.00 $0.14 $7,000.00 $0.89 $44,500.00 $17.00 $850,000.00 $0.09 $4,450.00 $6.28 $314,000.00 $0.09 $4,250.00 $0.04 $2,000.00 $0.07 $3,335.00 $8.62 $431,000.00

18.4 Size: X-Large 50,000 EACH $0.10 $5,000.00 $0.06 $2,940.00 $0.07 $3,580.00 $0.14 $7,000.00 $0.89 $44,500.00 $17.00 $850,000.00 $0.09 $4,450.00 $0.09 $4,250.00 $0.04 $2,000.00 $0.07 $3,335.00 $8.62 $431,000.00

Total for Group III $56,500.00 Total for Group III $33,978.00 Total for Group III $30,671.00 Total for Group III $80,900.00 Total for Group III $542,900.00 Total for Group III $2,862,000.00 Total for Group III $10,370,000.00 Total for Group III $33,061,500.00 Total for Group III $42,140.00 Total for Group III $3,246,800.00 Total for Group III $51,400.00 Total for Group III $23,500.00 Total for Group III $63,592.00 Total for Group III $0.00 Total for Group III $4,943,200.00 Total for Group III $28,575.00 Total for Group III $0.00

19. Multi-Purpose Plastic Spray Bottle 3,000 EACH $1.65 $4,950.00 $2.52 $7,560.00 $1.92 $5,760.00 $0.89 $2,670.00 $3.01 $9,030.00 $10.92 $32,760.00 $2.63 $7,890.00 $2.62 $7,860.00 $0.09 $267.00 $2.31 $6,930.00 $2.83 $8,490.00 $1.44 $4,320.00

20. Utility Pail- 10 Quart Capacity 12 EACH $7.32 $87.84 $9.74 $116.88 $7.76 $93.12 $1.00 $12.00 $9.09 $109.08 $111.60 $1,339.20 $7.94 $95.28 $9.30 $111.60 $8.42 $101.04 $7.07 $84.84 $5.55 $66.60 $7.53 $90.36

21. 32 Gallon Plastic Trash Can 10 EACH $57.10 $571.00 $22.08 $220.80 $33.02 $330.20 $99.00 $990.00 $36.04 $360.40 $40.96 $409.60 $31.51 $315.10 $35.00 $350.00 $31.86 $318.60 $27.24 $272.40 $22.75 $227.50 $44.39 $443.90

22. Wall Mounted Soap Dispenser 5 EACH $42.89 $214.45 $0.01 $0.05 $40.42 $202.10 $20.00 $100.00 $56.22 $281.10 $49.14 $245.70 $58.00 $290.00 $61.57 $307.85 $47.31 $236.55 $53.07 $265.35 $68.61 $343.05

23. Scrub Brush 6 EACH $3.71 $22.26 $2.20 $13.20 $1.09 $6.54 $6.70 $40.20 $25.00 $150.00 $6.79 $40.74 $44.28 $265.68 $5.93 $35.58 $3.51 $21.06 $6.00 $36.00 $1.12 $6.72

24. Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge 1,000 EACH $0.72 $723.50 $0.73 $734.20 $3.01 $3,010.00 $0.50 $500.00 $13.98 $13,980.00 $16.17 $16,170.00 $12.22 $12,220.00 $1.29 $1,290.00 $16.54 $16,540.00 $2.64 $2,640.00 $19.02 $19,020.00

25. Toilet Brush and Caddy 5 EACH $2.59 $12.95 $6.42 $32.10 $3.17 $15.85 $7.98 $39.90 $9.23 $46.15 $7.60 $38.00 $6.65 $33.25 $7.92 $39.60 $5.36 $26.80 $3.88 $19.40 $7.19 $35.95

26. Disposable Bouffant Hair Cap Net 10,000 EACH $0.04 $400.00 $0.05 $519.00 $0.03 $323.00 $0.06 $600.00 $9.87 $98,700.00 $3.33 $33,300.00 $48.94 $489,400.00 $2.91 $29,100.00 $3.73 $37,300.00 $4.12 $41,200.00 $22.40 $224,000.00 $0.05 $492.00 $22.74 $227,400.00

27. Disposable Beard Cover with Elastic String 5,000 EACH $0.04 $200.00 $0.06 $288.50 $0.03 $152.00 $0.91 $4,550.00 $4.59 $22,950.00 $3.13 $15,650.00 $44.00 $220,000.00 $2.74 $13,700.00 $2.87 $14,350.00 $40.68 $203,400.00 $0.04 $176.00 $48.15 $240,750.00

28. Rolled-Rim Paper Cone Cups for Igloo Cooler 250 EACH $0.34 $83.93 $0.01 $3.13 $0.50 $125.00 $8.55 $2,137.50 $56.60 $14,150.00 $0.03 $7.50 $110.94 $27,735.00 $5.57 $1,392.50 $4.69 $1,172.50 $75.59 $18,897.50

29. Facial Tissue 5,000 EACH $0.01 $35.50 $0.85 $4,250.00 $0.02 $100.00 $7.89 $39,450.00 $0.87 $4,350.00 $20.94 $104,700.00 $0.76 $3,805.00 $0.70 $3,500.00 $0.87 $4,360.00 $1.28 $6,400.00 $1.09 $5,430.00 $23.39 $116,950.00

30. All-Purpose Cleaning Rags 80,000 EACH $0.08 $6,728.00 $0.14 $11,200.00 $0.14 $11,200.00 $0.99 $79,200.00 $43.56 $3,484,800.00 $16.28 $1,302,400.00 $0.09 $7,472.00 $17.43 $1,394,400.00 $0.07 $5,280.00 $38.60 $3,088,000.00

31. Lysol Disinfectant Spray 12 CASE $6.20 $74.40 $8.23 $98.76 $8.67 $104.04 $9.41 $112.92 $9.89 $118.68 $2.42 $29.04 $94.64 $1,135.68 $2.12 $25.39 $9.66 $115.92 $70.37 $844.44 $3.75 $45.00 $8.86 $106.32 $8.13 $97.50 118.23 $1,418.76

32. Lysol Disinfecting Wet Wipes 800 EACH $0.10 $80.00 $0.03 $23.04 $3.77 $3,016.00 $0.36 $288.00 $4.89 $3,912.00 $10.25 $8,200.00 $22.97 $18,376.00 $8.96 $7,168.00 $6.34 $5,072.00 $3.60 $2,880.00 $31.00 $24,800.00 $4.21 $3,368.00 $4.88 $3,904.00 46.23 $36,984.00

33. Clorox Bleach Germicidal Wipes 1,500 EACH $10.38 $15,570.00 $9.73 $14,588.25 $0.16 $240.00 $4.89 $7,335.00 $11.69 $17,535.00 $10.22 $15,322.50 $7.76 $11,640.00 $31.84 $47,760.00 $5.82 $8,730.00 $4.88 $7,320.00 $66.85 $100,275.00

34. Dawn Liquid Dish Detergent 52 EACH $17.11 $889.72 $17.89 $930.22 $18.63 $968.76 $11.00 $572.00 $66.86 $3,476.72 $24.61 $1,279.72 $20.16 $1,048.32 $24.26 $1,261.52 $17.58 $914.16

35. Dial Gold Antimicrobial Liquid Hand Soap 12 EACH $28.93 $347.16 $14.96 $179.52 $15.97 $191.64 $23.99 $287.88 $11.00 $132.00 $56.98 $683.76 $15.03 $180.36 $19.04 $228.48 $4.93 $59.16 $8.27 $99.18 $65.72 $788.64

36. Clorox Germicidal Bleach 121 Oz. Bottle 12 EACH $5.99 $71.88 $6.53 $78.36 $6.37 $76.44 $5.89 $70.68 $19.75 $237.00 $7.74 $92.88 $7.55 $90.64 $7.85 $94.20 27.2 $326.40

Total for Group IV $1,136.77 Total for Group IV $31,079.94 Total for Group IV $43,490.95 Total for Group IV $28,024.52 Total for Group IV $259,046.01 Total for Group IV $102,903.36 Total for Group IV $0.00 Total for Group IV $4,387,903.64 Total for Group IV $0.00 Total for Group IV $89,955.80 Total for Group IV $0.00 Total for Group IV $1,385,900.64 Total for Group IV $134,640.17 Total for Group IV $24,845.00 Total for Group IV $1,867,330.89 Total for Group IV $36,617.46 Total for Group IV $3,856,007.61

37. Toilet Paper 848,000 EACH $0.47 $399,238.40 $0.49 $415,520.00 $1.03 $873,440.00 $0.39 $330,720.00 $0.50 $424,000.00 $36.99 $31,367,520.00 $0.45 $379,056.00 $0.57 $483,360.00 $0.65 $547,723.20 $0.49 $415,520.00 $0.57 $484,208.00 $40.05 $33,962,400.00

38. Jumbo Toilet Paper 1,200 EACH $1.70 $2,040.00 $2.47 $2,964.00 $2.90 $3,480.00 $0.49 $588.00 $2.03 $2,436.00 $28.00 $33,600.00 $22.80 $27,360.00 $1.78 $2,133.96 $2.27 $2,724.00 $3.00 $3,600.96 $2.14 $2,568.00 $2.11 $2,532.00 $26.38 $31,656.00

39. Disposable Toilet Seat Cover Refills 3,000 EACH $1.87 $5,610.00 $2.05 $6,144.00 $2.39 $7,170.00 $39.00 $117,000.00 $3.20 $9,600.00 $48.97 $146,910.00 $2.80 $8,404.50 $3.18 $9,540.00 $32.70 $98,100.00 $1.60 $4,800.00 $3.03 $9,075.00 $81.89 $245,670.00

40. Non-Perforated Paper Towel Roll 38,400 EACH $2.22 $85,248.00 $5.16 $198,144.00 $3.10 $119,040.00 $0.43 $16,512.00 $1.86 $71,424.00 $30.00 $1,152,000.00 $21.88 $840,192.00 $1.63 $62,465.28 $2.79 $107,136.00 $2.38 $91,361.28 $34.93 $1,341,312.00 $2.01 $77,184.00 $24.60 $944,640.00

41. Paper Hand Towels - Multi-Fold 120,000 EACH $1.34 $160,800.00 $1.44 $172,800.00 $2.00 $240,000.00 $0.43 $51,600.00 $1.26 $151,200.00 $35.00 $4,200,000.00 $24.95 $2,994,000.00 $1.13 $135,228.00 $0.01 $600.00 $1.46 $175,728.00 $2.18 $261,600.00 $1.20 $144,000.00 $20.10 $2,412,000.00

42. Toilet Paper, Coreless, 800 sheet, 36 roll, 2-Ply, Manufacturer and Part Number: Scott Essential 07001 17,460 ANNUAL $55.67 $4,859,991.00 $55.16 $4,815,468.00 $26.54 $2,316,942.00 $36.22 $3,162,006.00

Total for Group V $0.00 Total for Group V $5,512,927.40 Total for Group V $795,572.00 Total for Group V $6,058,598.00 Total for Group V $2,833,362.00 Total for Group V $658,660.00 Total for Group V $5,385,600.00 Total for Group V $35,375,982.00 Total for Group V $0.00 Total for Group V $587,287.74 Total for Group V $0.00 Total for Group V $3,765,366.00 Total for Group V $916,513.44 Total for Group V $0.00 Total for Group V $2,025,800.00 Total for Group V $716,999.00 Total for Group V $37,596,366.00

43. Plastic Trash Bags/Liners (Large) 1,350,000 EACH $0.09 $122,310.00 $0.13 $171,315.00 $0.21 $283,500.00 $0.31 $418,500.00 $0.10 $135,000.00 $30.99 $41,836,500.00 $0.08 $113,940.00 $0.11 $149,445.00 $0.13 $174,285.00 $0.16 $217,620.00 $0.16 $216,000.00 $0.14 $191,700.00 $48.78 $65,853,000.00

44. Plastic Trash Bags/Liners (30 Gal.) 11,100 EACH $0.09 $1,034.52 $0.05 $584.97 $0.10 $1,110.00 $38.00 $421,800.00 $0.05 $555.00 $17.72 $196,692.00 $0.04 $450.66 $0.12 $1,286.49 $0.12 $1,377.51 $0.10 $1,065.60 $0.13 $1,443.00 $0.16 $1,776.00 $19.60 $217,560.00

45. Trash Can Bags/Liners (10 Gal.) 100,000 EACH $0.02 $1,640.00 $0.02 $1,810.00 $0.23 $23,000.00 $0.27 $27,000.00 $0.03 $3,000.00 $0.01 $1,440.00 $0.02 $1,930.00 $0.03 $2,500.00 $0.03 $0.00 $0.08 $8,000.00 $0.02 $2,320.00 $30.41 $3,041,000.00

 Total for Group VI $0.00  Total for Group VI $124,984.52  Total for Group VI $173,709.97  Total for Group VI $307,610.00  Total for Group VI $867,300.00  Total for Group VI $138,555.00  Total for Group VI $0.00  Total for Group VI $42,033,192.00  Total for Group VI $0.00  Total for Group VI $115,830.66  Total for Group VI $152,661.49  Total for Group VI $178,162.51  Total for Group VI $218,685.60  Total for Group VI $0.00  Total for Group VI $225,443.00  Total for Group VI $195,796.00  Total for Group VI $69,111,560.00

46. Description: Janitorial Chemicals Various (requested percent based off entire catalog) $109,019.38 Estimated Spend $109,019.38 (30% off catalog) $76,313.57 $109,019.38 (+ 10%  catalog) $109,019.10 $109,019.38 (38% off catalog) $67,592.02

47. Description: Non-Chemicals Various (requested percent based off entire catalog) $169,733.15 Estimated Spend 169,733.15 (30%  off catalog) $118,813.21 169,733.15 (+10% catalog) $169,733.25 169,733.15 (25% off catalog) $127,299.86

Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $195,126.78 Total for Group VII $278,752.35 Total for Group VII Total for Group VII Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $194,891.88 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00 Total for Group VII $0.00

Total BID Total BID $392,981.37 Total BID $6,106,781.98 Total BID $1,611,848.29 Total BID $6,853,820.72 Total BID $4,774,304.69 Total BID $4,014,450.98 Total BID $15,755,600.00 Total BID $117,948,180.50 Total BID $42,140.00 Total BID $4,260,844.76 Total BID $204,061.49 Total BID $5,638,148.91 Total BID $1,333,431.21 Total BID $219,736.88 Total BID $9,460,877.79 Total BID $1,271,293.78 Total BID $110,614,563.71

Total RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD Award Total $398,727.80 Award Total $2,833,362.00 Award Total $194,891.88

Estimated Amount of Sevice Price Agreement $3,426,981.68
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Group VII: Zep products (no substitution                                                                                                                                  

Group VI: Trash Can Liners

Group IV: General Janitorial Products

Group III: Gloves

Group II: Stripping/Buffing Floor Pads

Group I: Brooms, Mops, and Accessories

Group V: Paper Products
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Complete Supply Inc                                      
1624 Crosby Road #144                              

Carrollton, TX 75006                                       
Robbie Coppernoll                                         

jprany@c-supply.com                                      
PH# 214-231-3631

Pollock Paper Distributors                                      
1 Pollock Place                                                         

Grand Prairie, TX 75050                                               
Eleanor M Czajka                                           

supportservices@pollock.com                                  
PH# 972-337-3606

Empire Paper Company                                      
2709 Central FWY E                                    

Wichita Falls, TX 76301                                       
Michelle Sheeder                                     

bids@empirepaper.com                                    
PH# 940-766-3216
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Mersi Distribution LLC 3411                              
Chestnut Street                                           

Philadelphia, PA 19104                                            
Faris Mersi                            

faris@mersidistribution.com                              
PH# 267-303-4314

Wedge Supply, LLC                                             
3309 W. Kingsley Road                                  

Garland, TX 75041                                          
Alton Dunn                                 

alton@wedgesupply.com                                
PH# 972-272-2293

NO BID

NO BID
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NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Interboro Packaging Corporation                                               
114 Bracken Road                                                             

Montgomery, NY 12549                                                      
Abraham Jeremias                                            

abraham@interboropackaging.com                                          
PH# 845-457-2700

EnergyFundz                                                   
10206 Briar Rose Drive                               

Houston, TX 77042                                           
Raya Guruswamy                                       

info@energyfundz.com                                     
PH# 713-715-8986

Competitive Choice                                                       
9303 Kirby Drive                                                       

Houston, TX 77054                                                          
Aundrea Young                                     

bids@competitivechoice.net                                           
PH# 713-838-1144

Acuity Specialty Products, Inc dba Zep Sales & Service                        
3330 Cumberland Boulevard # 700                                                  

Atlanta, GA 30339                                                                                       
Maureena Fabien-Watson                                                    

zepbids@zep.com                                                                               PH# 
877-428-9937                                                                 ***Recommended 

for: Group VII***

Malor & Company                                                    
550 West 54th Street #1220                                        

New York, NY 10019                                               
Garly Benoit                                           

garly.b@malorcompany.com                                      
PH# 845-598-3057                            

***Recommended for: Group V***

Dent Enterprises                                                    
LLC 512 N. Hampton Road #405                               

Desoto, TX 75115                                                          
Ray Dent                                             

ray@dententerprisesllc.com                               
PH# 214-404-2299

Bid Tabulation  2022-022-6937                                                                                                                                                                                     Purchase of 
Janitorial Supplies, Sanitary Paper, Trash Bags and Related Products                                                                                                          5 year 

agreement, no renewal options

NO BID

Brocktree Solutions                                                 606 
Oak Creek Drive                                                 Cedar 
Hill, TX 75104                                                         Eric 

Hurst                                                    
brocktreesolutions1@gmail.com                                     

PH# 469-765-5435

Dow-Caide Custodial Supply, Inc.                                                
312 Clover Ct                                                                        

Glenn Heights, TX 75154                                                       
Michael Downs                                           

mike@dowcaidesupply.com                                                 
PH# 972-421-8662

ICS Jail Supplies, INC.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  
PO Box 21056                                                                              

Waco, TX 76702                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            
Jennifer Johnson                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               

bids@icswaco.com                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         
PH# 254-751-1566

MANS DISTRIBUTORS, INC                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          
3120 Kellyway Drive                                                                                                                                                                                                             
Carrollton, TX 75006                                                  

Sadhna Patel                                                                           
sadhna@mans.us                                                       
PH# 972-930-0330                                      

***Recommended for: Group I, Group II, Group III, 
Group IV and Group VI***

Brady Industries                                                        
7055 Lindell Road                                                      

Las Vegas, NV 89118                                                           
Joshua Claudio                                                                                      

bids@bradyindustries.com                                             
PH# 702-876-3990

Stanford Precision LLC 3327                                       
Garden Brooks Drive                                             

Farmers Branch, TX 75234                                    
Cynthia Jones                                         

admin@stanfordpm.net                                             
PH# 972-243-7686
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