Bid Tab
IFB 2022-046-6961 Ashphalt, Aggregates, Concrete, and
Related Highway Material

James Gay 214-653-7434
james.gay@dallascounty.org

Vendor No .1
Austin Asphalt, Inc.
6330 Commerce Dr.

Suite 150
Irving, Tx 75063
Mr. Steve Waczak
swaczak@austin-ind.com

Ph# 469-673-4318

Vendor No. 2
Crafco Inc.
6165 W. Detroit St.
Chandler, Az 85226
Ms. Debby Eddy
Phi 602-276-0406

Vendor No.3

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

11612 RM 2244, Building 1,
Suite 250
Austin, Tx 78738

Mr. Pat Doyle
pat.doyle@ergon.com
Ph#512-469-9292

Vendor No.4
Professional Coating Technologies, Inc.
1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx 75104
Mr. Aaron Bland
aaron.bland@pctworldwide.com
Ph# 214-673-4703

Vendor No.5
Texas Materials Group, Inc.
420 Decker Drive
Suite 200
Irving, Tx 75062
Mr. James Connor

james.connor@texasbit.com
Ph# 214-741-3531

#7,

5,16, 17

#28

#18, 19,

20, 23, 24, 30

#21,

22, 25, 26,27, 29

#8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14

Description

Estimated Five-year
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Extended Five-

Unit Price year Total

Plant Location
and Address

Hours of
Operation

Unit
Price

Extended Five-
year Total

Plant Location and
Address

Hours of
Operation

Unit
Price

Extended Five-
year Total

Plant
Location and
Address

Hours of
Operation

Unit
Price

Extended Five-
year Total

Plant Location
and Address

Hours of
Operation

Unit
Price

Extended Five-
year Total

Plant Location
and Address

Hours of
Operation

GROUP A

No.

AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 302, TYPE B,
CRUSHED STONE, GRADE 3 (CHAT) LOADED ON COUNTY
' TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

5,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No.

AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 302, TYPE B,
CRUSHED STONE, GRADE 3 (CHAT) DELIVERED TO ROAD
& BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE

7,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No.

AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 302, TYPE B,
CRUSHED STONE, GRADE 4 LOADED ON COUNTY
' TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

6,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No.

AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 302, TYPE B,
CRUSHED STONE, GRADE 4 DELIVERED TO ROAD &
BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE

10,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No.

'WASHED SAND, TX DOT, STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS
FOR CONSTRUCTION OF HIGHWAYS, STREETS AND
BRIDGES, ITEM 421, (5)

FINE AGGREGATE

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

6,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GROUP B

No.

CEMENT TREATED BASE (SCALPING MIX WITH 5-1/2%
CEMENT
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

100,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX, AS PER BID
SPECIFICATION, RAPID ROAD REPAIR R3 OR EQUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

2500

$125.00 $ 312,500.00

11143 Goodnight
Ln. Dallas, Tx
75229

Monday -Friday
7 :00am- 5:00 pm

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No.

Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, Txdot item 340, Type B,
installed or laid by contractor personnel, as per bid specifications
1,500 tons or more per job

10,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$104.65

$ 1,046,500.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m|

No.

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT
ITEM 340, TYPE B, INSTALLED OR LAID BY CONTRACTOR
PERSONNEL, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS 500-1499 tons
per iob

7,500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$104.65

$ 784,875.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 am.-3:00 p.m

No 10

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT
ITEM 340 TYPE, B, INSTALLED OR LAID BY CONTRACTOR
PERSONNEL, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS 7.5-499 Tons
per Job

5,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$130.57

$  652,850.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m|

Hot mix asphaltic concrete pavement, txdot item 340, Type C,
installed or laid by contractor personnel, as per bid specifications
1.500 tons or more per job

7,500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$111.66

$  837.450.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 am.-3:00 p.m

Hot mix asphaltic concrete pavement, txdot item 340, Type D,
installed or laid by contractor personnel, as per bid specifications
1,500 tons or more per job

50,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$117.83

$ 5,891,500.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m|

Hot mix asphaltic concrete pavement, Txdot item 340, Type D,
installed or laid by contractor personnel, as per bid specifications
500-1499 tons per iob

12,500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$117.83

$ 1,472,875.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 am.-3:00 p.m

Hot mix asphaltic concrete pavement, Txdot item 340, type D,
installed or laid by contractor personnel, as per bid specifications
7.5-499 tons per job

5,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$141.50

$  707,500.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m|

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT 340,
TYPE B LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR
PLANT

20,000

$66.25 $ 1,325,000.00

11143 Goodnight
Ln. Dallas, Tx
75229

7:00 a.m.-5:00 p.m.|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 78.00

$ 1,560,000.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 am.-3:00 p.mJ

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT 340,
TYPE D LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR
PLANT

200,000

$75.95 $ 15,190,000.00

11143 Goodnight
Ln. Dallas, Tx
75229

7:00 a.m.-5:00 p.m|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 89.00

$ 17,800,000.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m|

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT
ITEM 340, TYPE D DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOB SITES
\WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY

200,000

$86.95 $ 17.,390,000.00

11143 Goodnight
Ln. Dallas, Tx
5229

7:00 a.m.-5:00 p.m.|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 96.00

$ 19,200,000.00

11050 Luna Rd
Dallas, Tx

7:30 am.-3:00 p.mJ

GROUP C

ASPHALT EMULSION PRIME, AS PER BID
SPECIFICATIONS, MARTIN ASPHALT COMPANY AE-P OR
EQUAL

DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS
COUNTY

90,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$ 403

$ 362,700.00

600 Minton
Rd
Saginaw. Tx

8:00-5:00
M-F

No Bid

No Bid

ASPHALT EMULSION, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8), AS
PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2 OR
EQUAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

30,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$ 280

$  84,000.00

600 Minton
Rd
Saginaw. Tx

M-F

No Bid

No Bid

. 20

ASPHALT EMULSION, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8), AS
PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2 OR
EQUAL

DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITH DALLAS
COUNTY

400,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$ 298

$ 1,192,000.00

600 Minton
Rd
Saginaw. Tx

8:00-5:00
M-F

No Bid

No Bid

. 21

ASPHALT EMULSION, MEDIUM SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8),
AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING
" TECHNOLOGIES MCS-600C OR EQUAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

30,000

Galllon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 670

$ 201,000.00

1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m/

No Bid

ASPHALT EMULSION, MEDIUM SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8),
AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING
" TECHNOLOGIES MCS-600C OR EQUAL

DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHING DALLAS
COUNTY

30,000

Galllon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 670

$ 201,000.00

1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m/

No Bid

N
]

ASPHALT EMULSION POLYMER MODIFIED, RAPID

SETTING (TABLE 9), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2P OR EQUAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

10,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$ 320

$  32,000.00

600 Minton
Rd
Saginaw, Tx

8:00-5:00
M-F

No Bid

No Bid

. 24

ASPHALT EMULSION POLYMER MODIFIED, RAPID
SETTING (TABLE 9), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2P OR EQUAL DELIVERED TO
PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY

30,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$ 338

$_101,400.00

600 Minton
Rd
Saginaw, T

8:00-5:00
M-F

No Bid

No Bid

. 25

ASPHALT ROADER SEALER, AS PER BID
SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING
TECHNOLOGIES COS-50 OR EQUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS

5,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6.50

$  32,500.00

1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m/

No Bid

REJUVENATING AGENT, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
PROFESSIONAL COATING TECHNOLOGIES ARE-68 OR

EQUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

30,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6.90

$ 207,000.00

1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m/

No Bid

REJUVENATING AGENT, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
PROFESSIONAL COATING TECHNOLOGIES ARE-68 OR
EQUAL

DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS
COUNTY

60,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 6.90

$ 414,000.00

1002 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m/

No Bid

N
@

|JOINT SEALANT, HOT POURED RUBBER, AS PER BID
SPECIFICATIONS, CRAFCO POLYFLEX TYPE 3 OR EQUAL
DELIVERED TO ROAD AND BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE

475,000

Lb

No Bid

$ 085

$ 403,750.00

Naples Sealant Plant -|
TRUCKLOADS

210 Johnson St
Naples, TX 75568

6a.m.-4 pm.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

.29

LIGUID GEO-TECH MEMBRANE FOR POTHOLE REPAIR,
AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING
' TECHNOLOGIES PHPM-50 OR EQUAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCK AT VENDOR Plant location
DELIVERED AND SPREAD BY SUPPLIER AT PROJECT
SITE(S) WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY

50,000

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 720

$ 360,000.00

1001 Mt. Lebanon
Cedar Hill, Tx

8:00 a.m.- 4:00 p.m}

No Bid

GROUP D

CSS-1H, CATIONIC, WATER-BASED ASPHALT EMULSION
PRODUCT USED PRIMARILY FOR TACK COAT AND FOG
SEAL-AASHTO MW08, Txdot STD

SPECIFICATION —ITEM 300

100,000

No Bid

No Bid

$ 285

$ 285,000.00

600 Minton
Rd

Saginaw, Tx

8:00-5:00

No Bid

No Bid

. 31

Portland Cement, Item 421, Hydraulic Cement Concrete, TXDOT,
Item 421, Table 5, Class C
DELIVERED TO JOB SITE

2500

Cubic Yard

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Total $ 34,217,500.00

$ 403,750.00

$ 2,057,100.00

$ 1,415,500.00

$ 49,953,550.00

Award Total| $ 34,217,500.00

$ 403,750.00

$ 2,057,100.00

$ 1,415,500.00

$ 11,393,550.00




