
Bid Tab

5-year Term

Diagnostic Labor Rate   500 hours  $                   159.95 79,975.00$                No Bid No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Bid No Bid
Mechanical Labor Rate   2,500 hours  $                   159.95 399,875.00$              NoBid No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) 74.95$                     No Bid No Bid
Diagnostic Labor Rate (Compressed  Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel)  

50 hours

No  Bid No Bid No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mechanical Labor Rate (Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel) 

125 hours
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
Vehicle Annual State Inspection (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each 

 $                     25.50 25,500.00$                No Bid No Bid
6 Vehicle Emission (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each  $                     25.50 25,500.00$                No Bid No Bid

Specify any other charges not included above (e.g. shop 
supplies, etc.), if applicable, in the spaces below.  You must 
include description, estimated quantity for a 5-year period, 
and unit of measure: No Charge No Bid No Bid

Parts and Material shall be priced at the Dealer’s verified 
invoiced Cost Plus+ Mark-up:%  A copy of the  
Dealership’s invoice(s) from his/her supplier including 
dealership internal source for such parts, supplies and  
materials shall be submitted with the Contractor’s invoice 
for payment.  Failure to provide the required 
documentations will result in non-payment and/or delay 
payment. All freight/transportation charges (when 
applicable) associated with this category will be treated as 
pass thru cost with no mark-up.  

Contractor Cost Plus + %  $      10,000.00 % (-)10% 10,000.00$                No Bid No Bid
Total Group 1 $540,850.00

 Total-Ford Vehicles Only

Diagnostic Labor Rate   500 hours 90.00$                                             45,000.00$                   No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge $0 No Bid
Mechanical Labor Rate   2,500 hours 90.00$                                             225,000.00$                 No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge $0 No Bid

3
Diagnostic Labor Rate (Compressed  Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel)  50 hours

No Bid No Bid

4 Mechanical Labor Rate (Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel) 125 hours No Bid No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge No Bid

5 Vehicle Annual State Inspection (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each 25.75$                                             $25,750 No Bid
6 Vehicle Emission (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each 

Specify any other charges not included above (e.g. shop 
supplies, etc.), if applicable, in the spaces below.  You must 
include description, estimated quantity for a 5-year period, 
and unit of measure: 

  

No Charge  No Bid

Parts and Material shall be priced at the Dealer’s verified 
invoiced Cost Plus+ Mark-up:%  A copy of the  
Dealership’s invoice(s) from his/her supplier including 
dealership internal source for such parts, supplies and  
materials shall be submitted with the Contractor’s invoice 
for payment.  Failure to provide the required 
documentations will result in non-payment and/or delay 
payment. All freight/transportation charges (when 
applicable) associated with this category will be treated as 
pass thru cost with no mark-up.  

Contractor Cost Plus + % $10,000.00 % 5.00% 10,000.00$                   
Total Group 2 305,750.00$                

Total-General Motors Vehicles Only No Bid No Bid

Diagnostic Labor Rate   500 hours 85.00$                                        42,500.00$                 
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) $0
Mechanical Labor Rate   2,500 hours 85.00$                                        212,500.00$               
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge $0

3
Diagnostic Labor Rate (Compressed  Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel)  

50 hours

No Bid
Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge

4
Mechanical Labor Rate (Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) 
Dedicated and Bi-Fuel) 

125 hours
No Bid

Specify Minimum Charge (if any) No Charge

5
Vehicle Annual State Inspection (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each 

25.50$                                        25,500.00$                 
6 Vehicle Emission (Set by the State of Texas) 1,000 each No Charge $0

Specify any other charges not included above (e.g. shop 
supplies, etc.), if applicable, in the spaces below.  You must 
include description, estimated quantity for a 5-year period, 
and unit of measure: No Charge

8

Parts and Material shall be priced at the Dealer’s verified 
invoiced Cost Plus+ Mark-up:%  A copy of the  
Dealership’s invoice(s) from his/her supplier including 
dealership internal source for such parts, supplies and  
materials shall be submitted with the Contractor’s invoice 
for payment.  Failure to provide the required 
documentations will result in non-payment and/or delay 
payment. All freight/transportation charges (when 
applicable) associated with this category will be treated as 
pass thru cost with no mark-up.  

Contractor Cost Plus + %  $      10,000.00 % No Bid No Bid 5.00% 10,000.00$                 
TOTAL-Dodge Motors Vehicles Only Total Group 3 $290,500.00

1
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7

7
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GROUP THREE/DODGE VEHICLES ONLY
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7
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GROUP TWO/GENERAL MOTORS VEHICLES ONLY
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GROUP ONE/FORD VEHICLES ONLY

 

Park Cities Ford 
Michael McConnaughey
Ph# 214-358-8836
3333 Inwood Road
Dallas, Texas 75235 

 Ed Morse Automotive, LLC dba Freedom Chevrolet by Ed 
Morse 
Brian Condley 
Ph# 903-641-7273 
8008 Marvin D. Love Freeway 
Dallas, Texas  75237 

 Ed Morse Automotive, LLC dba Freedom Dodge by Ed 
Morse
Brian Condley
Ph# 903-641-7273
815  Camp Wisdom Road 
Dallas, Texas 75116 
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BID NO. 2024-006- 6993
Purchase of Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Parts and Repair Services

DESCRIPTION
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