Dallas County Bid Tab Vendor No. 1 Vendor No. 2 Vendor No. 3 Vendor No.4 Vendor No.5 Vendor No. 6 Vendor No.7
f Window Air Ce nits and Best Buy Stores, L.P. Sid Tool Co., Inc. dba MSC Attn: Matt Goldkamp FlexSolv Networks Property Relief LLC ‘Amalgamated Services, Absccold a
Portable Space Heaters Attn: Matt Van Der Bosch Industrial Supply Co. Phit 800-843-3714 Attn: Mohammed Ali Attn: Byron Butler Inc. division of Indoff
Phi#612-292:0227 Attn: Durham Alexander matt goldkamp@indoff.c PH# 972-889-3539 Phit 512-618-5482 Attn: Derrick Bovino nc
Matt.VanDerBosch@bestbuy.c Phit 469-304-8627 1@gmail Phit 708-289-3138 Attn: Sherry
om durh 11816 Lackiand Road orks.com com gsa@am-serviceinc.com Turner
3-year 7601 Penn Avenue South. ect.com St. Louis, Mo 63146 2425 N Central 14013 Cimarron Dr. 21024 S. 80th Ave Phit 800-843-3714
estimated | Richfield, MN 55423-3645 3002 Princewood Drive Expressway, suite 241 Balch Springs, TX 75180) Frankfort, 1 60423 PO Box 1545
Exhibit | quantity Garland, TX 75040 Richardson, Texas 75080 Richmond, IN
Manufacturer Part
No. Description Number Warranty | Unit of Measure Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Unit cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended UnitCost | Extended
Whirlpool Enery Star 6000
BTU 115 Volt Window-Mounted Air Conditioner with Remote, Energy
'WHAWO061CW 1 Each 1950 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Star, Digital Display, Dehurnidifier, Timer, 250 sq. ft. v <
1 |Meet or Exceed $ 217.00 | $ 423,150.00 | Non-responsive Non-responsive | $ 287.00 | $ 559,650.00 | $ 31538 | $ 614,991.00 | $ 318.00 | $ 620,100.00
Phoenix portable heater
model: ,120V,1500W, 5,000 Bwu/h,
- )-f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dimensions: 5SHx19 Lx 3.6 W, 12.5 A HS-1500-PHX 1yr Each 50 o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bt o Bi lo Bi
2_|Meet or Exceed $ 10505 |5 78787.50 s 11330 |$ 8497500 | 5 140.00 | §105,000.00
(All items must be bid and shipped F.0.B. destination (Freight Grand Total
included in price). $ 423,150.00 S 78,787.50 $ 559,650.00 $ 699,966.00 $ 725,100.00
Award Total $423,150.00 $78,787.50
*No Bid*

Vendors did not bid line items in Bid Sync

*Non-responsive*

Vendor did not meet specifications




