
No. Description Three-Year 
Estimated Quantity 

Unit of 
Measure

Unit Price Extended Total Brand and Item 
Number

Unit Price Extended Total Brand and Item 
Number

Unit Price Extended Total Brand and Item Number

1

Milk, White, Grade A Homogenized and Pasteurized
Type: 1% - Low Fat
Size: ½ pint carton 
Specify Quantity per Case: 50
Specify Brand and Item Number:

9,627 Case $15.95 $153,502.52 Oak Farms/12904 $18.75 180,506.25$       DairyPure/52129 $21.50 $206,980.50 Hiland  1%/9171

2

Milk, White, Skim, ½ Pint, Grade A
Homogenized and Pasteurized
Type: Skim
Size: ½ pint carton 
Specify Quantity per Case: 50
Specify Brand and Item Number: 

794 Case $15.95 $12,660.33 Oak Farms/12906 $18.75 14,887.50$          DairyPure/52130 $21.50 $17,071.00 Hiland Skim/9173

3

Milk, Chocolate, Grade A 
Homogenized and Pasteurized
Type: Fat Free / Skim 
Size: ½ pint carton 
Specify Quantity per Case: 50
Specify Brand and Item Number: 

8,344 Case $15.95 $133,045.08 Trumoo/12919 $18.75 156,450.00$       Trumoo/45837 $21.50 $179,396.00 Hildand Chocolate/9178

4

Milk, Strawberry, Grade A
Homogenized and Pasteurized
Type:  Fat Free / Skim instead   
Size: ½ pint carton 
Specify Quantity per Case: 50
Specify Brand and Item Number: 

842 Case $15.95 $13,425.69 TruMoo/12920 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.50 $18,103.00 Hiland Strawberry/9177

5

Sherbet, Individual Serving Cup
Cup Size: 4 oz., 24 per package                                                                    
2 packages per case                                                                              
Flavors: Assorted

85 Case $15.00 $1,275.00 70901/3 oz.cups NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6

Silk Soy
Type: Soy
Size: Quart 32 oz.
Specify Quantity per Case: 6
Specify Brand and Item Number:

15 Case $23.94 $359.10 10740/Plain Soy Milk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Grand Total Grand Total Grand Total

Hiland Dairy Foods Company, LLC	                                                                                                  
5327 Botham Jean Blvd.

Dallas, TX 75215                                                                                          
Brenda Pride

214-666-8394
 pride@hilanddairy.com

Bid Tab                                                                                                                                                                                      
2024-013-7000                                                                                                                                                            

IFB Milk and Dairy Products                                                                                                                                            
3 year agreement with no renewal options

Hill Country Dairies, Inc.                                                                                           
920 Dividend Dr                                                                                                            
Dallas, TX 75247                                                                                     

Chris Boyle                                                                                                                                   
972-832-1179                              

chrisb@hillcountrydairies.com

Oak Farms Inc.                                                                                      
3114 S Haskell Ave

          Dallas, TX 75223                                                                                                      
Don Salik                                                                                                                                      

214-824-8163 ext. 64390          
don.salik@dfamilk.com

$314,267.72 $351,843.75 $421,550.50


