Caldwell Country Chevrolet Sames Bastrop Ford, Inc Southwest Ford, LLC
PO Box 27 3701 E. Saunders 3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Attachment A Bid Sheet Caldwell, Texas 77836 Laredo, Texas 78041 Weatherford, Texas 76087
2024-014-7001
IFB Purchase of Vehicles for Various Dallas County Departments
Description Year Model Color Engine Terrain Estimated Extended Total Estimated Estimated Extended
. Cost ) Cost Extended Total N Cost
Quantity Quantity Quantity Total
Group |
Chevolet Tahoe (Driver side led 2025 PPV Summit White 5.3 liter V-8 2-Wheel Drive
spot light) - Sheriff Dept 6 $53,345.00| $ 320,070.00 6 NO BID 6 NO BID
Chevolet Tahoe (Driver side led 2025 PPV Silver 5.3 liter V-8 2-Wheel Drive
spot light) - Sheriff Dept 1 $53,345.00| $  53,345.00 1 NO BID 1 NO BID
Chevolet Tahoe (Driver side led 2025 PPV Black 5.3 liter V-8 2-Wheel Drive
spot light) - Sherrif Dept 2 $53,345.00| $  106,690.00 2 NO BID 2 NO BID
Chevrolet Blazer - ASC 2025 EV PPV 9C1 White Electric 2-Wheel Drive 4 $57,470.00| $ 229,880.00 4 NO BID 4 NO BID
Chevrolet Malibu - Sheriff Dept 2025 LS 1 white 1.5L Turbo V-4 4-Wheel Drive 1 $26,045.00| $  26,045.00 1 NO BID 1 NO BID
Chevrolet Malibu - Sheriff Dept 2025 LS 1 silver 1.5L Turbo V-4 4-Wheel Drive 1 $26,045.00| $ 26,045.00 1 NO BID 1 NO BID
Chevrolet Silverado - ASC 2025 EVWT White Electric 2-Wheel Drive 4 $74,900.00 $299,600.00 4 NO BID 4 NO BID
Group Il
Ford F-150 - ASC 2025 Lightning PRO SSV White Dual Electric Motors 2-Wheel Drive 5 $57,235.00 $286,175.00 5 $54,975.00 $274,875.00 5 $54,170.75 $270,853.75
Ford Interceptor (no spot light) 2025 PPV Grey 3.0L Eco boost AWD
Sheriff Dept 1 $52,060.00 $52,060.00 1 $48,750.00 $48,750.00| 1 NO BID
Ford Interceptor (Driver side led (2025 PPV White 3.0L Eco boost AWD
spot light) - Sheriff Dept 9 $52,460.00 $472,140.00 9 $50,611.00 $455,499.00 9 NO BID
Ford Interceptor - Constables 2026 PPV White 3.3L direct injection V-6 [4-Wheel Drive 14 $48,780.00 $682,920.00 14 $47,133.00 $659,862.00) 14 NO BID
Ford Transit - Sheriff Dept 2025 Cargo van w/ rear AC/Heat |Oxford White 3.5 Eco boost V-6 2-Wheel Drive
4 $58,712.00 $234,848.00 4 $50,677.00 $202,708.00 4 $58,641.57 $234,566.28|

Ford Transit - Sheriff Dept 2025 Cargo van Oxford White 3.5 Eco boost V-6 2-Wheel Drive 1 $58,712.00 $58,712.00 1 $51,392.00 $51,392.00) 1 $58,641.57 $58,641.57
Ford Transit - ASC 2025 350 15 pasenger XL Oxford White 3.5L V-6 Eco boost 2-Wheel Drive 1 $59,425.00 $59,425.00 1 $56,927.00 $56,927.00] 1 $57,595.57 $57,595.57
Ford E Series -Tax Office 2025 Cut away 450 Boxed Truck [White 7.3LV-8 Dual Rear Wheel

DRW 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ford Transit - Sheriff Dept 2025 350 - 12 passenger van White 3.5L V-6 Eco boost 2-Wheel Drive

Front, middle and rear

partitions (1st partition

behind driver’s seat, 2nd

partition behind 1st row

seat and 3rd partition in

rear back seat). 1 NO BID 1 $64,040.00 $64,040.00 1 $57,595.57 $57,595.57|

Total Recommended
Amount
Recommended Amount $1,061,675.00 $1,475,138.00 $328,449.32 $2,865,262.32




