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George Allen Courts Building
600 Commerce Street

Suite B60
Dallas  TX 75202

Mailroom and Supply  
Dept. 

Designated Mail 
Clerk

760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 

12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  

14 866 6848$               

253 12.02$      3,041.06$    253 12.07$      3,053.71$   253 12.12$      3,066.36$   

9 161 13$                    

253 14.50$      3,668.50$    253 14.50$      3,668.50$   253 14.10$      3,567.30$   

10,904.30$                  

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 253 12.00$      3,036.00$      253 11.45$      2,896.85$    253 11.45$      2,896.85$      

8 829 70$                    

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 

14,997.84$                  

253 15.05$      3,807.65$     253 16.11$      4,075.83$    253 17.23$      4,359.19$    

12,242.67$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      

19,931.34$                  

253 25.88$      6,547.64$     253 27.17$      6,874.01$    253 28.53$      7,218.09$    

20,639.74$                  

253 24.24$      6,132.72$      253 24.24$      6,132.72$    253 25.25$      6,388.25$      

18,653.69$                  

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid

No Bid

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

South Dallas Gov ernment Court
8301 S. Polk St

Dallas  TX 75232

Constable Gulley
Judge Jones 1-1

Constable Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 
12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  
14 866 6848$               

253 15.04$      3,805.12$    253 15.09$      3,817.77$   253 15.14$      3,830.42$   
11,453.31$                  

253 15.00$      3,795.00$    253 15.10$      3,820.30$   253 15.10$      3,820.30$   
11,435.60$                  

253 17.19$      4,349.07$      253 17.19$      4,349.07$    253 17.19$      4,349.07$      
13,047.21$                  

253 11.45$      2,896.85$      253 15.00$      3,795.00$    253 15.00$      3,795.00$      
10,486.85$                  

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 
14,997.84$                  

253 15.05$      3,807.65$     253 16.11$      4,075.83$    253 17.23$      4,359.19$    
12,242.67$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      
19,931.34$                  

253 25.88$      6,547.64$     253 27.17$      6,874.01$    253 28.53$      7,218.09$    
20,639.74$                  

253 15.15$      3,832.95$      253 15.15$      3,832.95$    253 16.16$      4,088.48$      
11,754.38$                  

253 110.55$    27,969.15$   253 149.24$    37,757.72$  253 201.47$    50,971.91$   
116,698.78$                

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Main Post Office
401 I-30

Dallas, TX
75260

Drop Off only  postage 
mail for 

JP 1-1 & JP 1-2
N/A 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 

12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  

14 866 6848$               

253 6.55$       1,657.15$    253 6.60$       1,669.80$   253 6.65$       1,682.45$   

5 009 40$                    

253 15.00$      3,795.00$    253 15.10$      3,820.30$   253 15.10$      3,820.30$   

11,435.60$                  

253 14.85$      3,757.05$      253 14.85$      3,757.05$    253 14.85$      3,757.05$      

11,271.15$                  

253 8.70$       2,201.10$      253 8.70$       2,201.10$    253 8.70$       2,201.10$      

6 603 30$                    

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 

14,997.84$                  

253 17.56$      4,442.68$     253 18.79$      4,753.87$    253 20.10$      5,085.30$    

14,281.85$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      

19,931.34$                  

253 25.88$      6,547.64$     253 27.17$      6,874.01$    253 28.53$      7,218.09$    

20,639.74$                  

253 53.53$      13,543.09$    253 53.53$      13,543.09$  253 54.54$      13,798.62$    

40,884.80$                  

253 110.55$    27,969.15$   253 149.24$    37,757.72$  253 201.47$    50,971.91$   

116,698.78$                

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Garland Office
140 N. Garland Av e.
Garland  TX 75040

Constable Gipson
Judge O’Brien 2-1

JP Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 
12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  
14 866 6848$               

253 43.51$      11,008.03$  253 43.56$      11,020.68$ 253 43.61$      11,033.33$ 
33,062.04$                  

253 27.00$      6,831.00$    253 27.10$      6,856.30$   253 27.10$      6,856.30$   
20,543.60$                  

253 45.66$      11,551.98$    253 45.66$      11,551.98$  253 45.66$      11,551.98$    
34,655.94$                  

253 44.00$      11,132.00$    253 44.00$      11,132.00$  253 44.00$      11,132.00$    
33,396.00$                  

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 
14,997.84$                  

253 27.59$      6,980.27$     253 29.53$      7,471.09$    253 31.59$      7,992.27$    
22,443.63$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      
19,931.34$                  

253 41.40$      10,474.20$   253 43.47$      10,997.91$  253 45.64$      11,546.92$   
33,019.03$                  

253 45.45$      11,498.85$    253 45.45$      11,498.85$  253 46.46$      11,754.38$    
34,752.08$                  

253 190.95$    48,310.35$   253 257.78$    65,218.34$  253 348.00$    88,044.00$   
201,572.69$                

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mesquite Office
823 N. Gallow ay

Mesquite  TX 75149

Constable Gipson
Judge Whitfield 2-2

JP Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 
12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  
14 866 6848$               

253 30.11$      7,617.83$    253 30.16$      7,630.48$   253 30.21$      7,643.13$   
22,891.44$                  

253 27.00$      6,831.00$    253 27.10$      6,856.30$   253 27.10$      6,856.30$   
20,543.60$                  

253 30.26$      7,655.78$      253 30.26$      7,655.78$    253 30.26$      7,655.78$      
22,967.34$                  

253 31.50$      7,969.50$      253 31.50$      7,969.50$    253 31.50$      7,969.50$      
23,908.50$                  

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 
14,997.84$                  

253 18.81$      4,758.93$     253 20.13$      5,092.89$    253 21.54$      5,449.62$    
15,301.44$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      
19,931.34$                  

253 34.80$      8,804.40$     253 36.54$      9,244.62$    253 38.37$      9,707.61$    
27,756.63$                  

253 25.25$      6,388.25$      253 25.25$      6,388.25$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      
19,420.28$                  

253 130.65$    33,054.45$   253 176.38$    44,624.14$  253 238.11$    60,241.83$   
137,920.42$                

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

North Dallas Gov ernment Court
6820 LBJ Freew ay
Dallas  TX 75240

Constable Adamcik
Judge Cercone 3-1
Judge Seider 3-2

Constable Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 
12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  
14 866 6848$               

253 25.42$      6,431.26$    253 25.47$      6,443.91$   253 25.52$      6,456.56$   
19,331.73$                  

253 27.00$      6,831.00$    253 27.10$      6,856.30$   253 27.10$      6,856.30$   
20,543.60$                  

253 26.57$      6,722.21$      253 26.57$      6,722.21$    253 26.57$      6,722.21$      
20,166.63$                  

253 26.75$      6,767.75$      253 26.75$      6,767.75$    253 26.75$      6,767.75$      
20,303.25$                  

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 
14,997.84$                  

253 25.09$      6,347.77$     253 26.84$      6,790.52$    253 28.72$      7,266.16$    
20,404.45$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      
19,931.34$                  

253 29.41$      7,440.73$     253 30.88$      7,812.64$    253 32.42$      8,202.26$    
23,455.63$                  

253 30.30$      7,665.90$      253 30.30$      7,665.90$    253 31.31$      7,921.43$      
23,253.23$                  

253 130.65$    33,054.45$   253 176.38$    44,624.14$  253 238.11$    60,241.83$   
137,920.42$                

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grand Prairie Office
106 West Church St.

Grand Prairie  TX 75050

Constable Wright
Judge Jones 4-1

Judge Moreno 4 2
Constable Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 

12,903.00$                  
253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  

14 866 6848$               
253 22.74$      5,753.22$    253 22.79$      5,765.87$   253 22.84$      5,778.52$   

17,297.61$                  
253 24.00$      6,072.00$    253 24.10$      6,097.30$   253 24.10$      6,097.30$   

18,266.60$                  
253 22.89$      5,791.17$      253 22.89$      5,791.17$    253 22.89$      5,791.17$      

17,373.51$                  
253 23.45$      5,932.85$      253 23.45$      5,932.85$    253 23.45$      5,932.85$      

17,798.55$                  
253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 

14,997.84$                  
253 27.59$      6,980.27$     253 29.53$      7,471.09$    253 31.59$      7,992.27$    

22,443.63$                  
253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      

19,931.34$                  
253 26.32$      6,658.96$     253 27.64$      6,992.92$    253 29.02$      7,342.06$    

20,993.94$                  
253 28.28$      7,154.84$      253 28.28$      7,154.84$    253 29.29$      7,410.37$      

21,720.05$                  
253 130.65$    33,054.45$   253 176.38$    44,624.14$  253 238.11$    60,241.83$   

137,920.42$                
253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

East Dallas Gov ernment Court
3443 St. Francis Av e.

Dallas  TX 75228
Judge Martinez 5-1 JP Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 

12,903.00$                  
253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  

14 866 6848$               
253 18.05$      4,566.65$    253 18.10$      4,579.30$   253 18.15$      4,591.95$   

13,737.90$                  
253 20.50$      5,186.50$    253 20.50$      5,186.50$   253 20.50$      5,186.50$   

15,559.50$                  
253 18.20$      4,604.60$      253 18.20$      4,604.60$    253 18.20$      4,604.60$      

13,813.80$                  
253 19.00$      4,807.00$      253 19.00$      4,807.00$    253 19.00$      4,807.00$      

14,421.00$                  
253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 

14,997.84$                  
253 26.34$      6,664.02$     253 28.18$      7,129.54$    253 30.16$      7,630.48$    

21,424.04$                  
253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      

19,931.34$                  
253 25.88$      6,547.64$     253 27.17$      6,874.01$    253 28.53$      7,218.09$    

20,639.74$                  
253 24.24$      6,132.72$      253 24.24$      6,132.72$    253 25.25$      6,388.25$      

18,653.69$                  
253 76.38$      19,324.14$   253 103.11$    26,086.83$  253 139.20$    35,217.60$   

80,628.57$                  
253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Oak Cliff Gov ernment Court
Constable Office

702 East Jefferson Boulev ard
Dallas  TX 75203 

Constable Villarreal 
Judge Jasso 5-2

Constable Office 760 Day 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 253 17.00$      4,301.00$ 

12,903.00$                  

253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$     253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$ 253 19.5872$  4,955.5616$  

14 866 6848$               

253 10.01$      2,532.53$    253 10.06$      2,545.18$   253 10.11$      2,557.83$   

7 635 54$                    

253 18.00$      4,554.00$    253 18.10$      4,579.30$   253 18.10$      4,579.30$   

13,712.60$                  

253 15.80$      3,997.40$      253 15.80$      3,997.40$    253 15.80$      3,997.40$      

11,992.20$                  

253 15.00$      3,795.00$      253 15.00$      3,795.00$    253 15.00$      3,795.00$      

11,385.00$                  

253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 253 19.76$      4,999.28$ 

14,997.84$                  

253 15.05$      3,807.65$     253 16.11$      4,075.83$    253 17.23$      4,359.19$    

12,242.67$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 26.26$      6,643.78$      

19,931.34$                  

253 25.88$      6,547.64$     253 27.17$      6,874.01$    253 28.53$      7,218.09$    

20,639.74$                  

253 26.26$      6,643.78$      253 26.26$      6,643.78$    253 27.27$      6,899.31$      

20,186.87$                  

253 32.16$      8,136.48$     253 43.42$      10,985.26$  253 58.62$      14,830.86$   

33,952.60$                  

253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Attorney  General
400 S. Zang Blv d. 11th Floor

Dallas, TX 75208

Pickup Attorney  General 
office 11th floor. Deliv er 

back to George Allen Mail 
room/Supply .Tuesday  

600 Commerce St. 
Dallas, TX 75202

160 Day 53 17.00$      901.00$    53 17.00$      901.00$    53 17.00$      901.00$    

2 703 00$                    

53 19.5994$  1,038.7682$     53 19.59$      1,038.2700$ 53 19.5994$  1,038.7682$  

3,115.8064$                

53 12.02$      637.06$       53 12.07$      639.71$     53 12.12$      642.36$     

1 919 13$                    

53 12.85$      681.05$       53 12.85$      681.05$     53 13.00$      689.00$     

2 051 10$                    

53 14.50$      768.50$        53 14.50$      768.50$      53 14.50$      768.50$        

2 305 50$                    

53 12.00$      636.00$        53 12.00$      636.00$      53 12.00$      636.00$        

1 908 00$                    

53 94.46$      5,006.38$ 53 94.46$      5,006.38$ 53 94.46$      5,006.38$ 

15,019.14$                  

53 6.27$       332.31$       53 6.71$       355.63$       53 7.18$       380.54$       

1 068 48$                    

53 26.26$      1,391.78$      53 26.26$      1,391.78$    53 26.26$      1,391.78$      

4 175 34$                    

53 14.00$      742.00$       53 14.70$      779.10$       53 15.43$      817.79$       

2 338 89$                    

53 20.30$      1,075.90$      53 20.30$      1,075.90$    53 21.31$      1,129.43$      

3 281 23$                    

53 37.19$      1,971.07$     53 50.21$      2,661.13$    53 67.78$      3,592.34$    

8 224 54$                    

53 No Bid No Bid 53 No Bid No Bid 53 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grand Total 118 830 00$             136,915.9696$             141,499.23$                144,996.10$                147,593.28$                149,040.15$                149,999.70$                154,095.53$                183,557.40$                210,762.82$                212,560.30$                971,537.22$                No Bid

The supplier emailed and called regarding adjusting the price on the cost sheet. He stated 
it was a typo, but the submitted cost sheet matched the bid submitted amount on BidSync.

Supplier #1: 
TDS Logistics, Inc dba Freedom Express

Address:9875 E Admiral Pl Tulsa, OK 74116
Email: silas@freedomexpress.com

Phone: 918-877-0111
Contact: Silas Bolufem

Supplier #2: 
C & D Couriers, Inc.

Address:10575 Newkirk St #740 Dallas, TX 75220
Email:dmiller@cdcouriers.com

Phone: 214-878-6997
Contact: David E. Miller

Supplier #3: 
VM Essentials Logistics

Address:5560 Hunters Bend Ln
Dallas, TX 75249

Email: info@vmessentialslogistics.com
Phone: 972-322-4773
Contact: Tiara Harden

In reviewing the SBE document as requested we noticed that the bid spreadsheet is in error. The extended price 
for year # 1 is correct at $228,476.05.

However, the extended price for year #2 should be $236,472.71, which is a Cost Of Living Adjustment (“COLA”) 
of 3 ½%. Similarly, year #3 should be $244,749.26. Again, reflecting a 3 ½% COLA over year #2. Instead, the 
sheet is showing a 35% increase for year two over year one and another 35% increase for year three over year 

two.
This is obviously a typographical error as it isn’t logical or reasonable that we would be seeking a 35% year over 
year. As such, I respectfully ask that our bid sheet be corrected to reflect the correct numbers. Please give me a 
call on Monday at your earliest convenience to discuss further as needed. I’ve included a corrected bid sheet for 

your convenience and perusa

Supplier #4: 
KB Services

Address:P.O. Box 764203, Dallas, TX 75376
3773 Cripple Creek Dr., Dallas, TX 75224

Email: kber@switched.com
Phone: 972-365-4669
Contact: Vicki Walton

Supplier #5: 
Veterans Standard America, Inc.  

Address: 709 Keswick Drive; Desoto, TX 75115
Email: twilson@veteransstandard-america.com

Phone: 972-220-9026/ 972-974-3627
Contact:Terrance Wilson

Supplier #6: 
GNS Enterprises, LLC

Address: MBR 1306 Wheelwright Dr. Forney, TX 75126
Email: kavasha@gnsenterprisess.com

Phone: 843-902-7892
Contact: Kavasha Stanley

Supplier #7: 
AJM Cargo LLC 

Address: 1500 Klondike Rd. Ste. A103, Conyers, GA 30094
Email:operations@ajmcargo.com

Phone: 404-668-8934
Contact: Franco R Veasley

Supplier #8:
Name: Homeland Security and Management Solutions, Inc. dba Dantli Corp

Address:  324 Main Street, Unit #1143, Laurel, MD 20707
Email:  tpinckney@dantlicorp.com

Phone: (301) 769-6933 ext. 5
Contact:  Dr. Trisha Pinckney, President

Bid Tabulation
2024-020-7007 Daily Delivery Courier Services

Three Year Term
Dhestini Bizor

Reason: After careful consideration, we have determined that our current operational focus and resources 
do not align with the requirements of Bid #2024-020-7007 for Daily Delivery Courier Services. At this time, 

we are concentrating our efforts on our core logistics services and existing client commitments. We 
appreciate the opportunity to participate and look forward to future opportunities that align more closely with 

our service offerings. 

Supplier #9: 
Risk Management Armored Security

Address: 8909 County Road 109, Alavrado, TX 76009
Email: riskmanagmentarmored@gmail.com
Phone: 817-989-8704 (202-389-2893)

Contact: Joseph Kelly

Supplier #10:
Name: Deliveries on Demand

Address: 2225 Collier Court, Lancaster, Texas 75146
Email: deliveriesondemand@yahoo.com

Phone: 817-798-5338
Contact: Angela Chester

Supplier #11: 
Cummings Consulting LLC

Address:5301 Alpha Rd. Ste. 80 #6043 Dallas, TX 75240
Email: reginacummings002@gmail.com

Phone: 509-502-2301
Contact: Regina Cummings

Supplier #12:
MEI Mail Services

Address: 13714 Gamma Rd Farmers Branch, TX 75244
Email: bids@meimailservices.com

Phone: 972-645-0903
Contact: Mr. Leslie Marshall

Supplier #13: 
JCHC Transport LLC dba Resilient Freight Solutions

Address:
Email: haydee@resilientfrieght.com

Phone: 214-210-9976
Contact: Haydee Clark


