Sames Bastrop Ford, Inc. Sames Automotive , Inc. Sam Packs Five Star Ford Triple Crown Ford Lincoln LLC Virtuous Enterprises SNG Millwork
Attachment A Bid Sheet 1115 Highway 71 W 6310 Bob Bullock Loop 1635 IH 35E 2975 West Washington 902 Southwestern Blvd. 2201 120 Birdbrook Dr.
2024-029-7016 Bastrop, Texas 78602 Laredo, Texas 78041 Carrollton, Texas 75006 Stephenville, Texas 76401 Dallas, Texas 75214 Anna, Texas 75409
2024-029-7016 Purchase of various vehicles for CSCD
Description Year |Model Color Engine [Terrain ; ; " " " "
Estimated Cost Extended Total [ EStmated Cost Extended Total [ EStimated Cost | ExtendedTotal | EStimated Cost Extended Estimated Cost |ExtendedTotal| CStimated Cost | Extended Total
Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Total Quantity Quantity
Honda CR-V X 2WD 2024 |Honda CRV X _|Platinum Pearl |L5L 14 16 Valve DOHC |2-Wheel Drive
2wo White \w/ Turbocharger
NO BID 9 $31,905.00| $ _ 287,145.00 NO BID 9 $32,418.75| $ 291,768.75 9 S 32,140.87 [$ 289,267.83 NON RESPONSIVE
Ford Interceptor PPV V-6 2025 |Ford Interceptor |White 3.3L Direct Injection V-6 |2-Wheel Drive
PPVV-6 6 $45,680.00| $  274,080.00 NO BID 6 $45,711.00) $ _274,266.00 6 |s46418.75 |$ 278,512.50 5 $ 5146176 [$ 30877056 NON RESPONSIVE
Ford Super Duty F-350 XL [2024 |Ford Super Duty F-|White 73-lterv-8 Gasoline _|2-Wheel Drive
350 XL engine 1 $65,762.00| $  65,762.00 NO BID 1 $73,677.00| $  73,677.00 1 $73,51875 |$ 73,518.75 1 S 77,00226 S  77,042.26 NON RESPONSIVE
Total Recommended Amount $ 339,842.00 $ 287,145.00
Total Award Amount  $ 626,987.00




