

Bid Tabulation 2024-030-7017 Purchase of Linens and Textiles Five-year agreement				Encompass Group, LLC 615 Mason Street McDonough, GA 30253											Jonahs Enterprises Inc. 383 Kingston Avenue Unit 316 Brooklyn, NY 11203											ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. PO Box 21056 Waco, TX 75702				
Description		Unit of Measure	Five Year Estimated Quantities	Brand/Manufacture r Number	Year One Unit Price	Year One Extended Price	Year Two Unit Price	Year Two Extended Price	Year Three Unit Price	Year Three Extended Price	Year Four Unit Price	Year Four Extended Price	Year Five Unit Price	Year Five Extended Price	5-Year Grand Total	Brand/Manufacture r Number	Year One Unit Price	Year One Extended Price	Year Two Unit Price	Year Two Extended Price	Year Three Unit Price	Year Three Extended Price	Year Four Unit Price	Year Four Extended Price	Year Five Unit Price	Year Five Extended Price	5-Year Grand Total	Year Five Extended Price	5-Year Grand Total	
Section 1 - Towels and Wash Cloths																														
Item 1.1 - Bath Towels Size: 22" x 44" 100% Cotton dense looped with border Color: White Victory Supply #BWN244 or EQUAL		Dozen	25,000	52634-662	\$13.56	\$67,800.00	\$14.04	\$70,200.00	\$14.52	\$72,600.00	\$15.00	\$75,000.00	\$15.60	\$78,000.00	\$363,600.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- BT00001	\$10.20	\$51,000.00	\$10.61	\$53,040.00	\$11.03	\$55,161.60	\$11.47	\$57,368.06	\$11.93	\$59,862.79	\$276,232.45	\$79,900.00	\$399,500.00	
Item 1.2 - Wash Cloths Size: 12" x 12" 100% Cotton dense looped with border Color: White Tabl Textiles # WC110 or EQUAL		Dozen	40,000	52628-612	\$2.04	\$16,320.00	\$2.16	\$17,280.00	\$2.28	\$18,240.00	\$2.40	\$19,200.00	\$2.52	\$20,160.00	\$91,200.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- WS00002	\$3.60	\$28,800.00	\$3.74	\$29,952.00	\$3.89	\$31,150.08	\$4.05	\$32,396.08	\$4.21	\$33,691.93	\$155,990.09	\$16,000.00	\$80,000.00	
														Grand Total Group 1						Grand Total Group 1				\$432,222.54	Grand Total Group 1	\$479,500.00				
Section 2 - Blankets																														
Item 2.1 - Thermal Blankets Size: 66" x 90" Pre-shrunk cotton Heavy weight Machine washable Color: White Victory Supply #NLBNL9NWHITE or EQUAL		Dozen	1,500	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- TB00004	\$118.80	\$35,640.00	\$123.55	\$37,065.60	\$128.49	\$38,548.22	\$133.63	\$40,090.15	\$138.98	\$41,693.76	\$193,037.73	\$26,712.00	\$133,560.00		
Item 2.2 - Fleece Blankets Size: 66" x 90" 80% Wool (minimum) Heavy weight Machine washable Color: Gray Tabl Textiles # WB120 or EQUAL		Dozen	2,500	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- WB00005	\$72.00	\$36,000.00	\$74.88	\$37,440.00	\$77.88	\$38,937.60	\$80.99	\$40,495.10	\$84.23	\$42,114.91	\$194,987.61	\$52,620.00	\$263,100.00		
Item 2.3 - Isoblen Quilted Cover Blanket Size: 34" x 82" Machine washable Color: Green Tabl Textiles # BT100 or EQUAL		Each	500	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- ICB00006	\$64.80	\$6,480.00	\$67.39	\$6,739.20	\$70.09	\$7,008.77	\$72.89	\$7,289.12	\$75.81	\$7,580.68	\$35,097.77	\$5,945.00	\$29,725.00		
														Grand Total Group 2						Grand Total Group 2				\$423,123.11	Grand Total Group 2	\$426,385.00				
Section 3 - Pillows and Pillow Cases																														
Item 3.1 - Pillows Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26" x 2") Cotton Core Hypo-Allergenic Bob Barneet CMV2026 or EQUAL		Dozen	15,000	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI-P00007	\$105.60	\$316,800.00	\$109.82	\$329,472.00	\$114.22	\$342,650.88	\$118.79	\$356,356.92	\$123.54	\$370,611.19	\$1,715,890.99	\$451,800.00	\$2,259,000.00		
Item 3.2 - Pillow Cases Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26") Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # PC107W or EQUAL		Dozen	2,000	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- PC00008	\$71.40	\$28,560.00	\$74.26	\$29,702.40	\$77.23	\$30,890.50	\$80.32	\$32,126.12	\$83.53	\$33,411.16	\$154,690.17	\$4,556.00	\$22,780.00		
Item 3.3 - Pillow Cases Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26") Thread Count 130 (minimum) Machine Color: White Tabl Textiles # PC107W or EQUAL		Dozen	2,000	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- PC00009	\$71.40	\$28,560.00	\$74.26	\$29,702.40	\$77.23	\$30,890.50	\$80.32	\$32,126.12	\$83.53	\$33,411.16	\$154,690.17	\$3,912.00	\$19,560.00		
														Grand Total Group 3						Grand Total Group 3				\$2,025,271.33	Grand Total Group 3	\$2,301,340.00				
Section 4 - Flat and Fitted Sheets																														
Item 4.1 - Flat Sheets (24" x 36") Main: 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 34" x 36" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS130 or EQUAL		Dozen	250	53767-081	\$31.08	\$1,554.00	\$32.16	\$1,608.00	\$33.36	\$1,668.00	\$34.56	\$1,728.00	\$35.76	\$1,788.00	\$8,346.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- FS00009	\$21.36	\$1,068.00	\$22.21	\$1,110.72	\$23.10	\$1,155.15	\$24.03	\$1,201.35	\$24.99	\$1,249.41	\$5,784.63	\$1,543.50	\$7,717.50	
Item 4.2 - Flat Sheets (36" x 104") Main: 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 104" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS190 or EQUAL		Dozen	60	53765-104	\$46.80	\$561.60	\$48.48	\$581.76	\$50.28	\$603.36	\$52.08	\$624.96	\$54.00	\$648.00	\$3,019.68	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- FS20010	\$31.90	\$382.80	\$33.18	\$398.11	\$34.50	\$414.04	\$35.88	\$430.60	\$37.32	\$447.82	\$2,073.37	\$576.72	\$2,883.60	
Item 4.3 - Flat Sheets (36" x 104") Main: 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 104" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS190 or EQUAL		Dozen	4,250	53765-104	\$46.80	\$39,780.00	\$48.48	\$41,208.00	\$50.28	\$42,738.00	\$52.08	\$44,268.00	\$54.00	\$45,900.00	\$213,894.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- FS30011	\$27.00	\$22,950.00	\$28.08	\$23,868.00	\$29.20	\$24,822.72	\$30.37	\$25,815.63	\$31.59	\$26,848.25	\$124,304.60	\$40,851.00	\$204,255.00	
Item 4.4 - Flat Sheets (36" x 114") Main: 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 114" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS275 or EQUAL		Dozen	60	53765-115	\$51.24	\$614.88	\$53.04	\$636.48	\$54.96	\$659.52	\$57.00	\$684.00	\$59.04	\$708.48	\$3,303.36	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- FS40012	\$35.75	\$429.00	\$37.18	\$446.16	\$38.67	\$464.01	\$40.21	\$482.57	\$41.82	\$501.87	\$2,323.60	\$650.76	\$3,253.80	
Item 4.5 - Fitted Sheets (36" x 64" x 8") Main: 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: Twin Mattress 36" x 64" x 8" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # FT200EN or EQUAL		Dozen	50	53766-084	\$40.44	\$404.40	\$41.88	\$418.80	\$43.44	\$434.40	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$46.68	\$466.80	\$2,174.40	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- FS50013	\$37.00	\$370.00	\$38.48	\$384.80	\$40.02	\$400.19	\$41.62	\$416.20	\$43.28	\$432.85	\$2,004.04	\$573.60	\$2,868.00	
														Grand Total Group 4						Grand Total Group 4				\$136,490.24	Grand Total Group 4	\$220,977.90				
Section 5 - Mattress Covers																														
Item 5.1 - Mattress Covers (76" x 36" x 6") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric Heavy Weight 100% Cotton Size: Must fit 76" x 36" x 6" mattress Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # FT210EN or EQUAL		Each	250	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- MC00014	\$8.00	\$400.00	\$8.32	\$416.00	\$8.65	\$432.64	\$9.00	\$449.95	\$9.36	\$467.94	\$2,166.53	\$272.50	\$1,362.50		
Item 5.2 - Mattress Covers (76" x 36" x 6") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric Heavy Weight 100% Cotton Size: Must fit 76" x 36" x 6" mattress Color: White Tabl Textiles # FT210EN or EQUAL		Each	250	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- MC00014	\$8.00	\$400.00	\$8.32	\$416.00	\$8.65	\$432.64	\$9.00	\$449.95	\$9.36	\$467.94	\$2,166.53	\$239.00	\$1,195.00		
Item 5.3 - Mattress Covers (76" x 36" x 4") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric 6.8 oz. cotton/polyester blend Heavy Weight Size: Must fit 74" x 27" x 4" mattress Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # MC210 or EQUAL		Each	250	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- MC20015	\$7.00	\$350.00	\$7.28	\$364.00	\$7.57	\$378.56	\$7.87	\$393.70	\$8.19	\$409.45	\$1,895.71	\$272.50	\$1,362.50		
Item 5.4 - Mattress Covers (76" x 36" x 4") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric 6.8 oz. cotton/polyester blend Heavy Weight Size: Must fit 74" x 27" x 4" mattress Color: White Tabl Textiles # MC210 or EQUAL		Each	250	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- MC20015	\$7.00	\$350.00	\$7.28	\$364.00	\$7.57	\$378.56	\$7.87	\$393.70	\$8.19	\$409.45	\$1,895.71	\$239.00	\$1,195.00		
Item 5.5 - Mattress Covers (60" x 31.5") Flat Sheet Style Heavy Weight, Industrial Laundry Grade, Cotton Duck Canvas Fabric 100% cotton Size: 60 inches x 119 inches Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # MC115B or EQUAL		Each	40,000	No Bid											JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- MC30016	\$10.20	\$81,600.00	\$10.61	\$84,864.00	\$11.03	\$88,258.56	\$11.47	\$91,788.90	\$11.93	\$95,460.46	\$441,971.92	\$99,680.00	\$498,400.00		
														Grand Total Group 5						Grand Total Group 5				\$450,096.40	Grand Total Group 5	\$503,515.00				
Section 6: Laundry Bags and Shower Mats																														
Item 6.1 - Laundry Bags (119" x 24") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawing closure (sewn in) Size: 19" x 20" Color: White Bob Barneet E1020 or EQUAL		Each	50	182800	\$5.03	\$50.30	\$5.21	\$52.10	\$5.40	\$54.00	\$5.60	\$56.00	\$5.80	\$58.00	\$270.40	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- LNB00017	\$1.25	\$12.50	\$1.30	\$13.00	\$1.35	\$13.52	\$1.41	\$14.06	\$1.46	\$14.62	\$67.70	\$16.20	\$81.00	
Item 6.2 - Laundry Bags (104" x 36") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawing closure (sewn in) Size: 24" x 36" Color: White Victory Supply LBN3MDC-WH or EQUAL		Dozen	500	182801D	\$59.16	\$5,916.00	\$61.32	\$6,132.00	\$63.60	\$6,360.00	\$65.88	\$6,588.00	\$68.28	\$6,828.00	\$31,824.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- LNB200018	\$27.12	\$2,712.00	\$28.20	\$2,820.48	\$29.33	\$2,933.30	\$30.51	\$3,050.63	\$31.73	\$3,172.66	\$14,689.07	\$4,048.00	\$20,240.00	
Item 6.3 - Laundry Bags (104" x 36") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawing closure (sewn in) Size: 18" x 24" Color: White Bob Barneet E1024 or EQUAL		Dozen	250	182800	\$60.36	\$3,018.00	\$62.52	\$3,126.00	\$64.80	\$3,240.00	\$67.20	\$3,360.00	\$69.60	\$3,480.00	\$16,224.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- LNB300019	\$21.48	\$1,074.00	\$22.34	\$1,116.96	\$23.23	\$1,161.64	\$24.16	\$1,208.10	\$25.13	\$1,256.43	\$5,817.13	\$1,480.50	\$7,402.50	
Item 6.4 - Shower Mats Vinyl Size: 14" x 22 1/2" Color: White Heavy Weight, Industrial Grade Bob Barneet 0405-06 or EQUAL		Each	750	BMT06	\$9.17	\$1,375.50	\$9.50	\$1,425.00	\$9.84	\$1,476.00	\$10.20	\$1,530.00	\$10.57	\$1,585.50	\$7,392.00	JONAHS ENTERPRISES INC / JEI- LNB400020	\$3.92	\$588.00	\$4.08	\$611.52	\$4.24	\$635.98	\$4.41	\$661.42	\$4.59	\$687.88	\$3,184.80	\$403.50	\$2,017.50	
														Grand Total Group 6						Grand Total Group 6				\$23,758.70	Grand Total Group 6	\$29,741.00				
Grand Total for full Award			\$ 1,976,438.08																											

Bid Tabulation 2024-030-7017 Purchase of Linens and Textiles Five-year agreement			R&R Textile Mills Inc. 1101 N Lombard Road Lombard, IL 60148											Sunset Survival & First Aid, Inc. 18935 Algonquin, Ste 142 Huntington Beach, CA 92649															
Description	Unit of Measure	Five Year Estimated Quantities	Brand/Manufacturer r Number	Year One Unit Price	Year One Extended Price	Year Two Unit Price	Year Two Extended Price	Year Three Unit Price	Year Three Extended Price	Year Four Unit Price	Year Four Extended Price	Year Five Unit Price	Year Five Extended Price	5-Year Grand Total	Brand/Manufacturer r Number	Year One Unit Price	Year One Extended Price	Year Two Unit Price	Year Two Extended Price	Year Three Unit Price	Year Three Extended Price	Year Four Unit Price	Year Four Extended Price	Year Five Unit Price	Year Five Extended Price	5-Year Grand Total			
Section 1 - Towels and Wash Cloths																													
Item 1.1 - Bath Towels Size: 22" x 44" 100% Cotton dense looped with border Color: White Victory Supply #BWHV244 or EQUAL	Dozen	25,000	NL-62270-R	\$11.25	\$56,250.00	\$11.25	\$56,250.00	\$11.25	\$56,250.00	\$11.25	\$56,250.00	\$11.25	\$56,250.00	\$281,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 1.2 - Wash Cloths Size: 12" x 12" 100% Cotton dense looped with border Color: White Tabl Textiles # WC110 or EQUAL	Dozen	40,000	NL-61210-R	\$1.80	\$14,400.00	\$1.80	\$14,400.00	\$1.80	\$14,400.00	\$1.80	\$14,400.00	\$1.80	\$14,400.00	\$72,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 1		\$353,250.00														
Section 2 - Blankets																													
Item 2.1 - Thermal Blankets Size: 66" x 86" Pre-shrunk cotton Heavy weight Machine washable Color: White Victory Supply #NLBLSNWHITE or EQUAL	Dozen	1,500	NL-XS1000-R	\$76.25	\$22,875.00	\$76.25	\$22,875.00	\$76.25	\$22,875.00	\$76.25	\$22,875.00	\$76.25	\$22,875.00	\$114,375.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 2.2 - Fleece Blankets Size: 66" x 86" 80% Wool (minimum) Heavy weight Machine washable Color: Gray Tabl Textiles # WB120 or EQUAL	Dozen	2,500	NL-XS2000-R	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	\$75.00	\$37,500.00	\$187,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 2.3 - Isoblen/Suicore Unit Blanket Size: 34" x 82" Machine washable Color: Green Tabl Textiles # B100 or EQUAL	Each	500	NL-ISL510-R	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$78.00	\$7,800.00	\$39,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 2		\$340,875.00														
Section 3 - Pillows and Pillow Cases																													
Item 3.1 - Pillows Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26" x 2") Cotton Core Hypo-Allergenic Bob Barneff CMV2026 or EQUAL	Dozen	15,000	NL-X11600-R	\$85.00	\$255,000.00	\$85.00	\$255,000.00	\$85.00	\$255,000.00	\$85.00	\$255,000.00	\$85.00	\$255,000.00	\$1,275,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 3.2 - Pillow Cases Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26") Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # PC107W or EQUAL	Dozen	2,000	NL-X30001-R	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$19,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 3.3 - Pillow Cases Size: Standard (approximately 20" x 26") Thread Count 130 (minimum) Mudlin Color: White Tabl Textiles # PC107W or EQUAL	Dozen	2,000	NL-X30001-R	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$9.50	\$3,800.00	\$19,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 3		\$1,313,000.00														
Section 4 - Flat and Fitted Sheets																													
Item 4.1 - Flat Sheets (104" x 104") Mainst 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 54" x 86" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS130 or EQUAL	Dozen	250	INT-100440	\$29.85	\$1,492.50	\$29.85	\$1,492.50	\$29.85	\$1,492.50	\$29.85	\$1,492.50	\$29.85	\$1,492.50	\$7,462.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 4.2 - Flat Sheets (106" x 104") Mainst 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 104" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS190 or EQUAL	Dozen	60	INT-100446	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$2,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 4.3 - Flat Sheets (106" x 106") Mainst 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 86" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS171 or EQUAL	Dozen	4,250	NL-ISL210-R	\$35.00	\$29,750.00	\$35.00	\$29,750.00	\$35.00	\$29,750.00	\$35.00	\$29,750.00	\$35.00	\$29,750.00	\$148,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 4.4 - Flat Sheets (106" x 114") Mainst 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: 66" x 114" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # MS275 or EQUAL	Dozen	60	NL-ISL215-R	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$3,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 4.5 - Flat Sheets (106" x 116") Mainst 50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend Size: Twin Mattress 36" x 84" 8" Thread Count 130 (minimum) Color: White Tabl Textiles # FT200EN or EQUAL	Dozen	50	NL-ISL220-R	\$48.50	\$485.00	\$48.50	\$485.00	\$48.50	\$485.00	\$48.50	\$485.00	\$48.50	\$485.00	\$2,425.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 4		\$165,237.50														
Section 5 - Mattress Covers																													
Item 5.1 - Mattress Covers (10" x 30" x 36") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric Heavy Weight 100% Cotton Size: Must fit 10" x 36" x 6" mattress Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # FT210EN or EQUAL	Each	250	NL-XA2102-R	\$7.95	\$397.50	\$7.95	\$397.50	\$7.95	\$397.50	\$7.95	\$397.50	\$7.95	\$397.50	\$1,987.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 5.2 - Mattress Covers (10" x 30" x 36") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric Heavy Weight 100% Cotton Size: Must fit 10" x 36" x 6" mattress Color: White Tabl Textiles # FT210EN or EQUAL	Each	250	NL-ISL310-R	\$7.88	\$394.00	\$7.88	\$394.00	\$7.88	\$394.00	\$7.88	\$394.00	\$7.88	\$394.00	\$1,970.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 5.3 - Mattress Covers (12" x 30" x 36") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric 6.8 oz. cotton/polyester blend Heavy Weight Size: Must fit 12" x 27" x 4" mattress Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # MC210 or EQUAL	Each	250	NL-ISL310-R	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$1,745.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 5.4 - Mattress Covers (12" x 30" x 36") Industrial Laundry Grade Fabric 6.8 oz. cotton/polyester blend Heavy Weight Size: Must fit 12" x 27" x 4" mattress Color: White Tabl Textiles # MC210 or EQUAL	Each	250	NL-ISL310-R	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$6.98	\$349.00	\$1,745.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 5.5 - Mattress Covers (10" x 31.5") Flat Sheet Style Heavy Weight, Industrial Laundry Grade, Cotton Duck Canvas Fabric 100% cotton Size: 66 inches x 119 inches Color: Dark Brown Tabl Textiles # MC115B or EQUAL	Each	40,000	NL-ISL315-R	\$9.50	\$76,000.00	\$9.50	\$76,000.00	\$9.50	\$76,000.00	\$9.50	\$76,000.00	\$9.50	\$76,000.00	\$380,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 5		\$387,447.50														
Section 6: Laundry Bags and Shower Mats																													
Item 6.1 - Laundry Bags (110" x 24") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawstring closure (sewn in) Size: 15" x 20" Color: White Bob Barneff E1020 or EQUAL	Each	50	NL-ISL510	\$1.85	\$18.50	\$1.85	\$18.50	\$1.85	\$18.50	\$1.85	\$18.50	\$1.85	\$18.50	\$92.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 6.2 - Laundry Bags (104" x 36") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawstring closure (sewn in) Size: 24" x 36" Color: White Victory Supply L1824MDC-WH or EQUAL	Dozen	500	NL-ISL515	\$34.95	\$3,495.00	\$34.95	\$3,495.00	\$34.95	\$3,495.00	\$34.95	\$3,495.00	\$34.95	\$3,495.00	\$17,475.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 6.3 - Laundry Bags (104" x 36") 100% Polyester Open Mesh Drawstring closure (sewn in) Size: 18" x 24" Color: White Bob Barneff E1024 or EQUAL	Dozen	250	NL-ISL520	\$38.65	\$1,932.50	\$38.65	\$1,932.50	\$38.65	\$1,932.50	\$38.65	\$1,932.50	\$38.65	\$1,932.50	\$9,662.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Item 6.4 - Shower Mats Vinyl Size: 14" x 22 1/2" Color: White Heavy Weight, Industrial Grade Bob Barneff 0405-06 or EQUAL	Each	750	NL-ISL525	\$15.55	\$2,332.50	\$15.55	\$2,332.50	\$15.55	\$2,332.50	\$15.55	\$2,332.50	\$15.55	\$2,332.50	\$11,662.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
													Grand Total Group 6		\$38,892.50														
Grand Total for full Award		\$ 1,976,438.08																											