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3 Compartment Hot Disposable Trays Paper •based 
dual ovenable trays
•  Reheating of sealed trays, up to -40° F-400 degree,  
800 per case.
•  Polyester film lining provides a liquid barrier
•  Dimensions: W 8.625” x L 6.5” x D 1.5”
•  Entrée compartment 15.5 oz.
•  Two side compartment 6.5 oz. each
•  Equal to: Oliver Packing Item # 51451 (w/o film)

4800 Case 1600 230.00$         368,000.00$    238.75$    382,000.00$    248.30$    397,280.00$              1,147,280.00$           No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $275.00 $440,000.00 $275.00 $440,000.00 $275.00 $440,000.00 Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive 

3 Compartment Entrée Dish Trays Silicon Flex Trays
•  Dimension: 8-7/16” x 6-3/8” x 1-7/8”
•  Must withstand oven temperatures of 400+ degrees 
F 24 per case.
•  Must nest/stack with current cold tray inventory 
from Design Specialties
Equal to: Cooks Correctional Item # 630-410 COLOR: 
GREEN,RED follow link for 3 compartment description.
 https://www.oliverquality.com/product/3-c-meal-tray-
plant-fiber/ 

750 Case 250 $277.20 $69,300.00 $277.20 $69,300.00 $277.20 $69,300.00 207,900.00$              $229.00 $57,250.00 $235.95 $58,987.50 $254.06 $63,515.00 $179,752.50 $332.08 $83,020.00 $343.70 $85,925.00 $355.72 $88,930.00 $399.97 $99,992.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $375.00 $93,750.00 $375.00 $93,750.00 $375.00 $93,750.00 Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive 

5 Compartment Food Trays                                                                                
• Color: Beige
•  14” L x 10-1/2” W x 1-1/4” D.
•  Tray  must  be  compatible  to accommodate 
existing County entrée's dishes 24 per case.
•  Equal to: T-500 -Design Specialty Inc.

420 Case 140 79.40$           11,116.00$      79.40$     11,116.00$      79.40$      11,116.00$                33,348.00$                $108.00 $15,120.00 $108.00 $15,120.00 $114.58 $16,041.20 $46,281.20 $129.83 $18,176.20 $133.32 $18,664.80 $136.93 $19,170.20 $87.92 $12,308.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 $36,400.00 $260.00 $36,400.00 $260.00 $36,400.00 Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive 

2 Compartment Silicone Flex Trays                                                              
•  Silicone Flex Trays
•  Dimension: 8 7/16” x 6 3/8” 1 7/8”
•  Must withstand oven temperature of 440+ degrees 
F.
•  Tray to meet NSF/ANSI Standard 36 for direct food 
contact and NSF approved
•  Two compartment tray with a capacity of 23 oz. and 
10 oz. compartment sizes
•  Compartments with minimum wall thickness of 
2.5mm with structural reinforcements between 
compartments. 24 per case. Color: Geen, Red 

420 Case 140 $277.20 $38,808.00 $277.20 $38,808.00 $277.20 $38,808.00 116,424.00$              $257.00 $35,980.00 $264.75 $37,065.00 $272.65 $38,171.00 $111,216.00 $360.08 $50,411.20 $373.70 $52,318.00 $385.72 $54,000.80 $297.48 $41,647.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $275.00 $38,500.00 $275.00 $38,500.00 $275.00 $38,500.00 Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive 

Notes Deemed Non Responsive due to not meeting specifications Deemed Non Responsive due to not meeting specifications 

Subtotal 487,224.00$    501,224.00$    516,504.00$              108,350.00$    $111,172.50 $117,727.20 151,607.40$          $156,907.80 $162,101.00 153,948.50$            $608,650.00 $608,650.00 $608,650.00

Recommended Award Amount 1,180,628.00$        $290,968.50

Lowest Bid on Lines 1 and 3 Lowest Bid on Lines 2 and 4

Veterans Alliance Partners
536 E. Portalnd St. Apt. 4
Phoenix Arizona 85004

Cook's Direct, Inc.
2250 75th St. Suite 200
Woodridge Illinois 60517

Pasco Brokerage, Inc.
6465 Chase Oaks Blvd.

Plano Texas 75023

Flossy Bossy ND Boss Man                             
2215 South St.

Duluth Minnesota 55812

Powers Davis, LLC
5050 Quorum Drive, Suite 700-296

Dallas Texas 75254

Wasomi Solutions, LLC
400 Sagebrush Drive
Aledo Texas 76008

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
5804 Franklin Ave., Service Rd.

Waco Texas 76710


