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ASC 321 Northgate Drive Desoto, TX 75115
Console 52 0 32.00$           

1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   
29.00$      

1,508.00$          29.00$      1,508.00$       29.00$            1,508.00$             29.00$                1,508.00$                  
40.00$           

2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             
10.00$                     

520.00$               10.00$               520.00$                                 
10.00$          

520.00$                  
10.00$                 

520.00$               
12.00$             

624.00$             12.60$        655.20$               13.23$            687.96$              13.89$           722.28$                   
Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

North Dallas Government Center 6820 Lyndon B. Johnson Freeway Dallas, TX 75240
Console 156 0 JP 2 offices, Constable, 1 lg Tax 10.66$           

1,662.96$        10.66$              1,662.96$              10.66$              1,662.96$           10.66$          1,662.96$                   
10.00$      

1,560.00$          10.00$      1,560.00$       10.00$            1,560.00$             10.00$                1,560.00$                  
13.33$           

2,080.00$     13.73$           2,142.40$          14.15$             2,206.88$        14.57$               2,273.44$             
10.00$                     

1,560.00$            10.00$               1,560.00$                              
10.00$          

1,560.00$               
10.00$                 

1,560.00$             
12.00$             

1,872.00$          12.60$        1,965.60$            13.23$            2,063.88$           13.89$           2,166.84$                
Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

North Dallas Government Center 6820 Lyndon B. Johnson Freeway Dallas, TX 75240 95 Gallon Bin 0 52 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   30.00$      1,560.00$          30.00$      1,560.00$       30.00$            1,560.00$             30.00$                1,560.00$                  40.00$           2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     1,040.00$            20.00$               1,040.00$                              20.00$          1,040.00$               20.00$                 1,040.00$             14.00$             728.00$             14.70$        764.40$               15.43$            802.36$              16.21$           842.92$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Housing Var. Dept. 1300 w Mockingbird Lane Dallas, TX 75247 Console 156 0 10.66$           1,662.96$        10.66$              1,662.96$              10.66$              1,662.96$           10.66$          1,662.96$                   10.00$      1,560.00$          10.00$      1,560.00$       10.00$            1,560.00$             10.00$                1,560.00$                  13.33$           2,080.00$     13.73$           2,142.40$          14.15$             2,206.88$        14.57$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,560.00$            10.00$               1,560.00$                              10.00$          1,560.00$               10.00$                 1,560.00$             12.00$             1,872.00$          12.60$        1,965.60$            13.23$            2,063.88$           13.89$           2,166.84$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Housing Var. Dept. 1300 w Mockingbird Lane Dallas, TX 75247 95 Gallon Bin 0 104 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   20.00$      2,080.00$          20.00$      2,080.00$       20.00$            2,080.00$             20.00$                2,080.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     2,080.00$            20.00$               2,080.00$                              20.00$          2,080.00$               20.00$                 2,080.00$             14.00$             1,456.00$          14.70$        1,528.80$            15.43$            1,604.72$           16.21$           1,685.84$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

East Dallas Government Center 3443 St. Francis Avenue Dallas, TX 75228 Console 104 0 JP, Constable 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   17.00$      1,768.00$          17.00$      1,768.00$       17.00$            1,768.00$             17.00$                1,768.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,040.00$            10.00$               1,040.00$                              10.00$          1,040.00$               10.00$                 1,040.00$             12.00$             1,248.00$          12.60$        1,310.40$            13.23$            1,375.92$           13.89$           1,444.56$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Elections Administrative BLDG 1520 Round Table Drive Dallas, TX 75247 95 Gallon Bin 0 104 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   22.00$      2,288.00$          22.00$      2,288.00$       22.00$            2,288.00$             22.00$                2,288.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     2,080.00$            20.00$               2,080.00$                              20.00$          2,080.00$               20.00$                 2,080.00$             14.00$             1,456.00$          14.70$        1,528.80$            15.43$            1,604.72$           16.21$           1,685.84$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Frank Crowley Courts Building 133 N. Riverfront Drive Dallas, TX 75207 Console 728 0 9.00$             6,552.00$        9.00$                6,552.00$              9.00$                6,552.00$           9.00$            6,552.00$                   10.00$      7,280.00$          10.00$      7,280.00$       10.00$            7,280.00$             10.00$                7,280.00$                  8.00$             5,824.00$     8.20$             5,969.60$          8.45$               6,151.60$        8.70$                 6,333.60$             10.00$                     7,280.00$            10.00$               7,280.00$                              10.00$          7,280.00$               10.00$                 7,280.00$             12.00$             8,736.00$          12.60$        9,172.80$            13.23$            9,631.44$           13.89$           10,111.92$              Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Frank Crowley Courts Building 133 N. Riverfront Drive Dallas, TX 75207 95 Gallon Bin 0 1,040 12.00$           12,480.00$      12.00$              12,480.00$            12.00$              12,480.00$          12.00$          12,480.00$                 10.00$      10,400.00$        10.00$      10,400.00$     10.00$            10,400.00$           10.00$                10,400.00$                12.00$           12,480.00$    12.36$           12,854.40$        12.73$             13,239.20$      13.11$               13,634.40$           20.00$                     20,800.00$          20.00$               20,800.00$                             20.00$          20,800.00$             20.00$                 20,800.00$           14.00$             14,560.00$         14.70$        15,288.00$           15.43$            16,047.20$         16.21$           16,858.40$              Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Garland Government Center 140 N. Garland Road Garland, TX 75040 Console 104 0 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   17.00$      1,768.00$          17.00$      1,768.00$       17.00$            1,768.00$             17.00$                1,768.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,040.00$            10.00$               1,040.00$                              10.00$          1,040.00$               10.00$                 1,040.00$             12.00$             1,248.00$          12.60$        1,310.40$            13.23$            1,375.92$           13.89$           1,444.56$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

George Allen, Sr. Courts Building 600 Commerce Street Dallas, TX 75202 Console 780 0 9.00$             7,020.00$        9.00$                7,020.00$              9.00$                7,020.00$           9.00$            7,020.00$                   10.00$      7,800.00$          10.00$      7,800.00$       10.00$            7,800.00$             10.00$                7,800.00$                  8.00$             6,240.00$     8.20$             6,396.00$          8.45$               6,591.00$        8.70$                 6,786.00$             10.00$                     7,800.00$            10.00$               7,800.00$                              10.00$          7,800.00$               10.00$                 7,800.00$             12.00$             9,360.00$          12.60$        9,828.00$            13.23$            10,319.40$         13.89$           10,834.20$              Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

George Allen, Sr. Courts Building 600 Commerce Street Dallas, TX 75202 95 Gallon Bin 0 260 12.00$           3,120.00$        12.00$              3,120.00$              12.00$              3,120.00$           12.00$          3,120.00$                   10.00$      2,600.00$          10.00$      2,600.00$       10.00$            2,600.00$             10.00$                2,600.00$                  12.00$           3,120.00$     12.36$           3,213.60$          12.73$             3,309.80$        13.11$               3,408.60$             20.00$                     5,200.00$            20.00$               5,200.00$                              20.00$          5,200.00$               20.00$                 5,200.00$             14.00$             3,640.00$          14.70$        3,822.00$            15.43$            4,011.80$           16.21$           4,214.60$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Grand Prairie Government Center 106 W. Church Street Grand Prairie, TX 75050 Console 156 0 10.66$           1,662.96$        10.66$              1,662.96$              10.66$              1,662.96$           10.66$          1,662.96$                   10.00$      1,560.00$          10.00$      1,560.00$       10.00$            1,560.00$             10.00$                1,560.00$                  13.33$           2,080.00$     13.73$           2,142.40$          14.15$             2,206.88$        14.57$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,560.00$            10.00$               1,560.00$                              10.00$          1,560.00$               10.00$                 1,560.00$             12.00$             1,872.00$          12.60$        1,965.60$            13.23$            2,063.88$           13.89$           2,166.84$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Grand Prairie Government Center 106 W. Church Street Grand Prairie, TX 75050 95 Gallon Bin 0 52 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   30.00$      1,560.00$          10.00$      1,560.00$       10.00$            1,560.00$             10.00$                1,560.00$                  40.00$           2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     1,040.00$            20.00$               1,040.00$                              20.00$          1,040.00$               20.00$                 1,040.00$             14.00$             728.00$             14.70$        764.40$               15.43$            802.36$              16.21$           842.92$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Health & Human Services 2377 Stemmons Freeway Dallas, TX 75202 Console 416 0 9.00$             3,744.00$        9.00$                3,744.00$              9.00$                3,744.00$           9.00$            3,744.00$                   10.00$      4,160.00$          10.00$      4,160.00$       10.00$            4,160.00$             10.00$                4,160.00$                  8.00$             3,328.00$     8.20$             3,411.20$          8.45$               3,515.20$        8.70$                 3,619.20$             10.00$                     4,160.00$            10.00$               4,160.00$                              10.00$          4,160.00$               10.00$                 4,160.00$             12.00$             4,992.00$          12.60$        5,241.60$            13.23$            5,503.68$           13.89$           5,778.24$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Health & Human Services 2377 Stemmons Freeway Dallas, TX 75202 95 Gallon Bin 0 208 12.50$           2,600.00$        12.50$              2,600.00$              12.50$              2,600.00$           12.50$          2,600.00$                   12.00$      2,496.00$          12.00$      2,496.00$       12.00$            2,496.00$             12.00$                2,496.00$                  12.00$           2,496.00$     12.36$           2,570.88$          12.73$             2,647.84$        13.11$               2,726.88$             20.00$                     4,160.00$            20.00$               4,160.00$                              20.00$          4,160.00$               20.00$                 4,160.00$             14.00$             2,912.00$          14.70$        3,057.60$            15.43$            3,209.44$           16.21$           3,371.68$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Health & Human Services Immunization Clinic 2774 Valwood Pkwy Farmers Branch, TX 75234 Console 52 0 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   29.00$      1,508.00$          29.00$      1,508.00$       29.00$            1,508.00$             29.00$                1,508.00$                  40.00$           2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     520.00$               10.00$               520.00$                                 10.00$          520.00$                  10.00$                 520.00$               12.00$             624.00$             12.60$        655.20$               13.23$            687.96$              13.89$           722.28$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Henry Wade Juvenile Justice Center 2600 Lone Star Drive Dallas, TX 75212 Console 104 0 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   10.00$      1,040.00$          10.00$      1,040.00$       10.00$            1,040.00$             10.00$                1,040.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,040.00$            10.00$               1,040.00$                              10.00$          1,040.00$               10.00$                 1,040.00$             12.00$             1,248.00$          12.60$        1,310.40$            13.23$            1,375.92$           13.89$           1,444.56$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Henry Wade Juvenile Justice Center 2600 Lone Star Drive Dallas, TX 75212 95 Gallon Bin 0 104 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   20.00$      2,080.00$          20.00$      2,080.00$       20.00$            2,180.00$             20.00$                2,180.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     2,080.00$            20.00$               2,080.00$                              20.00$          2,080.00$               20.00$                 2,080.00$             14.00$             1,456.00$          14.70$        1,528.80$            15.43$            1,604.72$           16.21$           1,685.84$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Institute of Forensic Sciences (SWIFS) 2355 Stemmons Freeway Dallas, TX 75207 Console 260 0 9.00$             2,340.00$        9.00$                2,340.00$              9.00$                2,340.00$           9.00$            2,340.00$                   12.00$      3,120.00$          12.00$      3,120.00$       12.00$            3,120.00$             12.00$                3,120.00$                  8.00$             2,080.00$     8.24$             2,142.40$          8.49$               2,206.88$        8.74$                 2,273.44$             10.00$                     2,600.00$            10.00$               2,600.00$                              10.00$          2,600.00$               10.00$                 2,600.00$             12.00$             3,120.00$          12.60$        3,276.00$            13.23$            3,439.80$           13.89$           3,611.40$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Mesquite Sub-Courthouse 823 N. Galloway Avenue Mesquite, TX 75150 Console 104 0 16.00$           1,664.00$        16.00$              1,664.00$              16.00$              1,664.00$           16.00$          1,664.00$                   17.00$      1,768.00$          17.00$      1,768.00$       17.00$            1,768.00$             17.00$                1,768.00$                  20.00$           2,080.00$     20.60$           2,142.40$          21.22$             2,206.88$        21.86$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     1,040.00$            10.00$               1,040.00$                              10.00$          1,040.00$               10.00$                 1,040.00$             12.00$             1,248.00$          12.60$        1,310.40$            13.23$            1,375.92$           13.89$           1,444.56$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Mesquite Tax Office 210 Grubb Drive Mesquite, TX 75150 95 Gallon Bin 0 52 Tax 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   35.00$      1,820.00$          35.00$      1,820.00$       35.00$            1,820.00$             35.00$                1,820.00$                  40.00$           2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     1,040.00$            20.00$               1,040.00$                              20.00$          1,040.00$               20.00$                 1,040.00$             14.00$             728.00$             14.70$        764.40$               15.43$            802.36$              16.21$           842.92$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Oak Cliff Government Center 702 E. Jefferson Blvd Dallas, TX 75203
Console 156 0 JP 2 offices, Constable, 1 lg Tax 10.66$           

1,662.96$        10.66$              1,662.96$              10.66$              1,662.96$           10.66$          1,662.96$                   
10.00$      

1,560.00$          10.00$      1,560.00$       10.00$            1,560.00$             10.00$                1,560.00$                  
13.33$           

2,080.00$     13.73$           2,142.40$          14.15$             2,206.88$        14.57$               2,273.44$             
10.00$                     

1,560.00$            
10.00$               

1,560.00$                              
10.00$          

1,560.00$               
10.00$                 

1,560.00$             
12.00$             

1,872.00$          12.60$        1,965.60$            13.23$            2,063.88$           13.89$           2,166.84$                
Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Oak Cliff Government Center 702 E. Jefferson Blvd Dallas, TX 75203
95 Gallon Bin 0 52 32.00$           

1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   
30.00$      

1,560.00$          30.00$      1,560.00$       30.00$            1,560.00$             30.00$                1,560.00$                  
40.00$           

2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             
20.00$                     

1,040.00$            
20.00$               

1,040.00$                              
20.00$          

1,040.00$               
20.00$                 

1,040.00$             
14.00$             

728.00$             14.70$        764.40$               15.43$            802.36$              16.21$           842.92$                   
Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Records Building Complex 509 Main Street Dallas, TX 75202 Console 884 0 9.00$             7,956.00$        9.00$                7,956.00$              9.00$                7,956.00$           9.00$            7,956.00$                   10.00$      8,840.00$          10.00$      8,840.00$       10.00$            8,840.00$             10.00$                8,840.00$                  8.00$             7,072.00$     8.20$             7,248.80$          8.45$               7,469.80$        8.70$                 7,690.80$             10.00$                     8,840.00$            10.00$               8,840.00$                              10.00$          8,840.00$               10.00$                 8,840.00$             12.00$             10,608.00$         12.60$        11,138.40$           13.23$            11,695.32$         13.89$           12,278.76$              Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Records Building Complex 509 Main Street Dallas, TX 75202 95 Gallon Bin 0 312 12.50$           3,900.00$        12.50$              3,900.00$              12.50$              3,900.00$           12.50$          3,900.00$                   10.00$      3,120.00$          10.00$      3,120.00$       10.00$            3,120.00$             10.00$                3,120.00$                  12.00$           3,744.00$     12.36$           3,856.32$          12.73$             3,971.76$        13.11$               4,090.32$             20.00$                     6,240.00$            20.00$               6,240.00$                              20.00$          6,240.00$               20.00$                 6,240.00$             14.00$             4,368.00$          14.70$        4,586.40$            15.43$            4,814.16$           16.21$           5,057.52$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

South Dallas Government Center 8301 S. Polk Street Dallas, TX 75232 Console 208 0 JP  2, Constable, Sheriff, Tax 9.00$             1,872.00$        9.00$                1,872.00$              9.00$                1,872.00$           9.00$            1,872.00$                   10.00$      2,080.00$          10.00$      2,080.00$       10.00$            2,080.00$             10.00$                2,080.00$                  10.00$           2,080.00$     10.30$           2,142.40$          10.61$             2,206.88$        10.93$               2,273.44$             10.00$                     2,080.00$            10.00$               2,080.00$                              10.00$          2,080.00$               10.00$                 2,080.00$             12.00$             2,496.00$          12.60$        2,620.80$            13.23$            2,751.84$           13.89$           2,889.12$                Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

South Dallas Government Center 8301 S. Polk Street Dallas, TX 75232 95 Gallon Bin 0 52 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   30.00$      1,560.00$          30.00$      1,560.00$       30.00$            1,560.00$             30.00$                1,560.00$                  40.00$           2,080.00$     41.20$           2,142.40$          42.44$             2,206.88$        43.72$               2,273.44$             20.00$                     1,040.00$            20.00$               1,040.00$                              20.00$          1,040.00$               20.00$                 1,040.00$             14.00$             728.00$             14.70$        764.40$               15.43$            802.36$              16.21$           842.92$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Household Hazardous Waste Under construction  (2025) Dallas, TX Console 52 0 Office Area 32.00$           1,664.00$        32.00$              1,664.00$              32.00$              1,664.00$           32.00$          1,664.00$                   29.00$      1,508.00$          29.00$      1,508.00$       29.00$            1,508.00$             29.00$                1,508.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00$                     520.00$               10.00$               520.00$                                 10.00$          520.00$                  10.00$                 520.00$               12.00$             624.00$             12.60$        655.20$               13.23$            687.96$              13.89$           722.28$                   Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Notes: 

Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Totals 4472 2392 83,195.84$      83,195.84$            83,195.84$          83,195.84$                 83,512.00$        83,512.00$     83,512.00$           83,512.00$                85,904.00$    88,368.80$        91,033.80$      93,758.60$           92,560.00$          92,560.00$                             92,560.00$             92,560.00$           87,152.00$         91,509.60$           96,073.12$         100,890.40$            Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Grand Total 332,783.36$               Grand Total 334,048.00$               Grand Total 359,065.20$          Grand Total 370,240.00$         Grand Total 375,625.12$            

Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive Non-responsive

Texas Shred
990 Security Row

Richardson, Texas 75081

Note: The original bidder, Data Shredding Services of Texas, Inc., was acquired by VRC Companies, LLC dba 
Vital Records Control during the IFB process.

P&G Davis dba Proshred
2081 Hutton Dr., Suite 119

Carrollton, Texas 75006 

Vital Records Control
5384 Poplar Ave.

Memphis, Tennessee 38119

Data Shredding Services of Texas, Inc. / VRC Companies, LLC dba Vital Records Control
801 Hanover Dr., Suite #300

Grapevine, Texas 76051
Action Shred of Texas

1420 S. Barry Ave.
Dallas, Texas 75223 

Circular Services dba Balcones Shred
13921 Senlac, Suite 200

Dallas, Texas 75234

Note: Texas Shred deemed non-responsvie due to not meeting specifications.


