|FB 2025-003-7028 Purchase of Hygiene Kits, Multi-Ethnic Products Phoenix Supply 1CS Jail Supplies, Inc. VidlSourcing, LLC MaevesPads, LLC Victory Supply, LLC M and B Services Strands of Faith
and Other Related Products 1401 W 94th Street 5804 Franklin Ave. 1220 Rosecrans St. Ste 857 4545 Spring Valley Rd. 7025 Industrial Park Rd. 1029 Aries St. 135 Fairmont Plaza
Bloomington, MN 55431 Waco, TX 76710 San Diego CA 92106 Farmers Branch, TX, 75244 Mount Pleasant, TN 38474 Cedar Hill, TX 75104 Pearl, MS 39208
Year
{tems: Supplier Item Three-Year Supplier Item Three-Year Supplier Item | Manufacturer Three-Year Three-Year Three-Year Year Year Three
me: Name: Estimated Three-Year Name: Estimated UnitOf  |Three-Year Extended Name: Part Number Estimated Unit Of Three-Year Year Three Year Three Three-Year Estimated Unit Of Year One Year One Estimated Unit Of Three-Year Extended Three Three | Extended | Three-Year Extended
Quantity Extended Total Quantity Measure Total Quantity Measure Extended Total Price Extended Total Extended Total Quantity Measure Qty Price Quantity Measure Total Qty Price Total Total
Group One: Hygiene Kits
1. Sheriff's Hygiene Kit Components:
5 inch Comb, 20z Shampoo/Body KIT-DallasTx-2 KIT-DAL5 KIT-DALS CK-1219
Wash, Fingertip Toothbrush, .60z (Silver Tube)
Toothpaste, .50z Deodorant. All in a clear zip style bag
1800 $  277,404.00 1800 Cases No Bid 1800 Cases $ 186,696.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1800 Cases 600 $ 307,605.60 Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 600 Non Resp| Non Resp| Non Responsive
2. CSCD Women Hygiene Kit Components:
) (.0850z), Soap/Body Wash (i
wrapped .50z or Clear, 20z), Shampoo (20z), Deodorant (stick, (el
clear, .50z), Disposable Razors (single edge), Comb/Hairbrush; KIT-DallasTX3 KIT-DAL44 Womens CK-1220
Sanitary napkins; sufficient for one month (Products must be FDA- Hygiene Kit
Approved), Hand sanitizer (20z, Products must be FDA-Approved) .
Allin a clear zip style bag 930 $ __ 227,168.00 930 Cases | NoBid 930 Cases | $ 114,390.00 Wl NoBid No Bid No Bid 930 Cases 310 $  451,239.72 M Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 310 | Non Resp| Non Resp| Non Responsive
3..CSCD Men Hygiene Kit Components:
) (.0850z), Soap/Body Wash (i
wrapped .50z or Clear, 20z), Shampoo (20z), Deodorant (stick, KIT-DallasTx4 KIT-DALS Mens Hygiene CK-1221
clear, .50z), Disposable Razors (single edge), Comb/Hairbrush; Kit
Hand sanitizer (20z, Products must be FDA-Approved) . Allin a clear
zip style bag 2250 $ 532,372.50 2250 Cases No Bid 2250 Cases $ 240,217.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2250 Cases 750 $ 627,380.44 Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 750 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group One Grand Total for Group One $ 1,036,944.50 Grand Total for Group One No Bid Grand Total for Group One $ 541,303.50 Grand Total for Group One No Bid $ 1,386,225.76 Grand Total for Group One Non Responsive Grand Total for Group One Non Responsive
Group Two: Soap & Body Wash
; ; DL-SOAP-UW-
4. Soap (Dial White Unwrapped) - 1.25 OZ (500/ CS) . . . . . . . . . .
42 No Bid 125 42 Cases $ 5,557.44 42 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 42 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Responq Non Responsive 14 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
DV-SOAP-ORIG-
5. Soap (Dove, original scent) - 2.6 OZ (36/BAR-Pack) ) . . ) . . ) . . .
30 No Bid 2.6 30 Pack $ 1,408.50 30 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
GD-SOAP-UN-
6. Unwrapped Oatmeal Soap (Good Day) - (1000/CS) . . . . . . . . . .
30 No Bid 34 30 Cases $ 1,628.40 30 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Responq Non Responsive 10 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
. FS-LIQ-SBW-
7. Shampoo & Body Wash (Dawn Mist)- Packets .25 OZ (500/CS) PKT
60 No Bid 60 Cases $ 2,805.00 60 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 60 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 20 Non Resp| Non Resp] Non Responsive
FS-LIQ-SBW-
8. Shampoo Body Wash (Freshscent) -(4/CS) GAL 9
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 338.85 9 Gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 3 Non Resp] Non Resp] Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Two Grand Total for Group Two Grand Total for Group Two
P Grand Total for Group Two No Bid P $ 11,738.19 Grand Total for Group Two No Bid Grand Total for Group Two No bid d Total for Group No bid P Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Two Non Responsive
Group Three: Deodorant
9- Women's Deodorant (Degree) - 0.5 OZ (36/CS) 42 $ 1,922.06 42 Cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 42 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 14 | Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
10. Deodorant (Freshscent) 1.60Z (12/CS)
30 $ 279.70 30 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
11. Roll-On Antiperspirant - 1.50Z (96/CS)
24 $ 866.88 24 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 24 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 8 Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
12. Men's Deodorant (Old Spice or Degree) - 0.5 0Z (24/CS) 42 $ 1,922.06 42 Cases | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 42 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 14 | Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Three Grand Total for Group Three Grand Total for Group Three
$ 4,990.70 No Bid No Bid Grand Total for Group Three No bid Grand Total for Groz_/g Three No bid No bid Non Responsive Non Resgonsive
Group Four: Toothbrushes & Toothpaste
13. Toothbrushes (Short) - 37/8 in (144/BX) TBSH
285 No Bid 285 Box $ 1,946.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 285 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 95 Non Resp| Non Resp Non Responsive
14. Toothbrushes (Fingertip) (100/BG) 1800 No Bid TBFT 1800 Each $ 4,330.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 1800 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 60 Non Resp| Non Resp Non Responsive
15. Toothbrushes (Thumbprint Handle) (1440/BX) TB5118
30 No Bid 30 Box $ 2,160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
16. Toothpaste (Freshmint) - 4.6 OZ (24/CS) TP46
30 No Bid 30 Cases $ 1,195.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp| Non Resp Non Responsive
17. Toothpaste (Colgate) - 1.0 OZ (24 CS) TP-COLGATE-1 . . . ; ; . .
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 216.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 3 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
TP-COLGATE-
18. Toothpaste (Colgate) - .150Z (1000/CS/PKS)
60 No Bid PKT 60 Cases $ 9,285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 60 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 20 Non Resp| Non Resp Non Responsive
19.Toothpaste (Frescent/Gel) - .250Z (1000/CS/PKS) GTPPKT
24 No Bid 24 Cases $ 1,369.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 24 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 8 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive




Grand Total for Group Four Grand Total for Group Four Grand Total for Group Four

Grand Total for Group Four No Bid $ 20,503.95 Grand Total for Group Four No Bid Grand Total for Group Four No bid No bid Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Four Non Responsive
Group Five: Hair Products
20. Blue Magic Hair Dress - 4.0 OZ (12/CS) 15 No Bid 1094 15 Cases $ 312.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
21. Palmers Hairdress - 5.25 OZ (6/CS) MISC
15 No Bid 15 Cases $ 684.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
22. Shampoo (Freshscent) - Packets (1000 CS) . FS-LIQ-SC-PKT . . . . . . . "
39 No Bid 39 Cases $ 1,911.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 39 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 13 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
23. Shampoo (Olive Oil) - 13.5 OZ (6/CS) MISC
15 No Bid 15 Cases $ 452.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
24. Moisturizing Coconut Shampoo (VOS5 Island) - 15FL OZ(6/CS) . TVO5 . . . . . . . .
30 No Bid 30 Cases $ 412.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
25. Argan Oil Shampoo (Cream of Nature) - 1207 (12/CS) 60 No Bid MISC 60 Cases $ 5,117.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 60 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 20 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
26. Moisturizing Coconut Conditioner (VOS5 Island) - 15FL OZ(6/CS) MISC _ _ _ , _ _ , , ,
60 No Bid 60 Cases $ 825.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 60 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 20 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
27. Argan Oil Intensive Conditioner (Cream of Nature) 120Z (12/CS) . MISC . . . . . . . .
45 No Bid 45 Cases $ 3,838.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 45 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 15 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
28. Conditioner, Leave-In, Palmers - 8.5 OZ ( 6/CS) 15 No Bid MISC 15 Cases $ 848.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
29. Bergamot, Conditioner - 4 0Z (12/CS) 15 No Bid T095 15 Cases $ 287.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
30. Styling Gel (Let's Jam!) - 4.40Z (6/CS) 15 No Bid MISC 15 Cases $ 1,179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
31. Clear Hair Styling Gel (Super Wet) - 8.80Z (24/CS) 15 No Bid MISC 15 Cases $ 1,513.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
32. Luster Pink Hair Lotion, Original - 8 OZ (12/CS) MISC . . . . . . . . .
15 No Bid 15 Cases $ 1,558.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5 Non Resp{ Non Resp Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Five Grand Total for Group Five Grand Total for Group Five
Grand Total for Group Five No Bid $ 18,941.55 Grand Total for Group Five No Bid Grand Total for Group Five No bid Grand Total for Group Five No bid Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Five Non Responsive
Group Six: Body Lotion
33. Hand Lotion (Freshscent) - Packets (1000 CS) PKL PKL
63 $ 2,962.05 63 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 63 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 21 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
34. Hand and Body Lotion - 4 OZ (60/CS) FL4
30 $ 754.50 30 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
35. Cocoa Butter Lotion 4 OZ (60/CS) FLCB4
30 $ 952.50 30 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 30 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 10 Non Resp] Non Resp| Non Responsive
i Grand Total for Group Six
Grand Totalfor Group six Grand Total for Group Six $  4,669.05 g No Bid Grand Total for Group Six No Bid Grand Total for Group Six___| No bid Grand Total for Group Six No bid Grand Total for Group Six Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Six
Group Seven: Combs & Brushes
36. Flex Combs - (144 BX) 9 No Bid 4567 9 Box $ 230.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 8 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
37. Small Pocket Combs- 5inch (Unbreakable, Black) (2160/CS) . COMB-5 . . . . . . . . . . .
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 346.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive Cases Non Responsive 3 Non Resp] Non Resp] Non Responsive
38. Shampoo Combs - 8.25inch (12/CS) ) HCOMB-85 ) ) . . . . . . . . .
15 No Bid 15 Cases $ 308.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive Cases Non Responsive 5 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
39. Men Military Brushes - (12/CS) 9 No Bid THBO3 9 Cases $ 64.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive Cases Non Responsive g Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
40. Hair Brush- Standard Brislte, 8inch (12/CS) 24 No Bid T125 24 Cases $ 83.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 24 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive Cases Non Responsive 8 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Seven Grand Total for Group Seven Grand Total for Group Seven
Grand Total for Group Seven No Bid $ 1,033.86 Grand Total for Group Seven No Bid Grand Total for Group Seven No bid Grand Total for Group Seven No bid Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Seven Non Responsive
Group Eight: Sanitary Napkins
) . MT100-W-REG-
41. Sanitary Napkins - Bulk Maxi Pads, Regular (288/CS) . . . . . .
12 No Bid 288 12 Cases $ 269.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Cases $ 8,272.16 12 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 4 Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
MT100-W-SUP-
42. Sanitary Napkins - Bulk Maxi Pads w/ wings, Super (250/CS) . . . . . . .
12 No Bid 250 12 Cases $ 342.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Cases $ 8,272.16 12 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 4 Non Resp| Non Resp] Non Responsive
MT100-W-SUP-
43. Sanitary Napkins - Maxi Pad Thin, Long-Super w/ wings (288/CS) 250
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 257.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Cases $ 4,707.63 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 3 Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
44. Sanitary Napkins - Super Bulk Maxi Pad, Individual Wrapped, MT100-SUP-250
(250/CS) 9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 193.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Cases $ 4,653.09 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 3 Non Resp| Non Resp] Non Responsive
45, Sanitary Napkins - Regular Bulk Maxi Pads (288/CS) MT100-REG-288 . . . . . .
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 208.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Cases $ 4,730.58 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 3 Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
46. Sanitary Napkins - Individual Wrapped Pads (573/CS) . MT100-REG-576 . . . . . .
9 No Bid 9 Cases $ 391.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Cases $ 4,653.09 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 3 Non Resp| Non Resp] Non Responsive
47. Sanitary Napkins - Super, Overnight Protection Maxi Pad HS-1005/12
15 No Bid 15 Box $ 822.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15 Box $ 13,391.75 15 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 5} Non Respf Non Resp] Non Responsive
48. Panty Shields, Contoured (22/BX) . DT433113 . . . . . .
9 No Bid 9 Box $ 326.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Box $ 4,133.52 9 No bid No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 3 Non Resp| Non Resp] Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Eight Grand Total for Group Eight
Grand Total for Group Eight No Bid $ 2,811.66 Grand Total for Group Eight No Bid Grand Total for Group Eight $ 52,813.98 Grand Total for Group Eight No bid Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Eight Non Responsive
Group Nine: Hydration & Head Covering
49. Pomade Sportin' Wave Reg MISC
15 No Bid 15 Each $ 663.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15 Each No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 5 Non Resp] Non Resp] Non Responsive
50. Petroleum Jelly (Careall)- 2 OZ (144/CS) 36 No Bid TP)-2 36 Cases $ 2,860.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 Cases No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respond Non Responsive 12 Non Resp{ Non Resp| Non Responsive
51. Lip Balm - .150Z, Individual Size (12/CS) 9 No Bid 111530 9 Cases $ 71.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 Cases No bid No bid Non Responsive | Non Respong Non Responsive 3 Non Resp] Non Resp] Non Responsive
Grand Total for Group Nine Grand Total for Group Nine No Bid Grand Total for Grotp Nine $ 3,523.20 Grand Total for Group Nine No Bid Grand Total for Group Nine No Bid Grand Total for Group Nine No bid Grand Total for Group Nine Non Responsive Grand Total for Group Nine Non Responsive
Grand Total for Award Group 3 &6 Award 2,4,5,7,8,9 Groups Grand Total: Grand Total for Award Group 1
$ 541,303.50
Grand Total for full Award:
$ 609,515.66




